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(iv) OP towers have been erected. 

(v) Binoculars, goggles, twin telescopes, PNV binoculars and hand held 
search lights have been provided for enhanced vigilance on the border. 

(vi) Boats/Motors Boats have been provided for patrolling 
riverine/creek area. 

(vii) Border roads/tracks are being constructed/developed   for vehicular 
patrolling. 

(viii) Coastal Security has been strengthened. 

(ix) Gearing up of the intelligence machinery & sharing of intelligence 
among concerned  agencies. 

(x) Greater functional integration through an institutional frame work at 
all level. 

(xi) Upgradation and modernisation of Central paramilitary forces and 
Police. 

Petro-Dollars for Funding Militancy in J&K 

2223. DR. GOPALRAO VITHALRAO PATIL: Will the Minister of 
HOME AFFAIRS be pleased to state: 

(a) whether Government are aware that pumping in of petro-dollars in 
J&K, through remittances by Indians Working abroad, has aroused the 
suspicion of counter-insurgency agencies operating in the State that the 
money is being used to fund militancy; and 

(b) if so, what action has been taken or is proposed to be taken by 
Government in this regard? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS 
(SHRI CH. VIDYASAGAR RAO): (a) and (b)There are inputs to suggest 
that money is pumped into Jammu and Kashmir from various countries 
through different channels including hawala transactions to fund militancy. 
However there are no specific inputs to suggest that petro dollars being 
remitted by Indians working abroad, are used for the purpose to fund 
militancy in J&K. 

Lawyer missing from Tis-Hazari 

2224. SHRI S. SIVA SUBRAMANIAN: Will the Minister of HOME 
AFFAIRS be pleased to state: 

(a) whether Government's attention has been drawn to the news-item 
captioned, 'Lawyer Missing from Tis-Hazari', appearing in the Times of India 
dated November, 30, 1999; and 

(b) if so, the details of action taken/proposed to be taken in the matter, till 
date? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS 
(SHRI CH. VIDYASAGAR RAO): (a) and (b) Yes, Sir. On the complaint of 
the wife of the 
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missing advocate, a case was registered on 22nd November, 1999 at Subzi 
Mandi Police Station. All out efforts are being made by the police to trace 
him but no clue has been found as yet. 

Negotiations with DHD 

2225. SHRI PRAKANTA WARISA: Will the Minister of HOME 
AFFAIRS be pleased to state: 

(a) whether Government have received any representation from North 
Cachar Hills, Autonomous Council Haflong, Assam in the recent past 
regarding tackling of terrorist organisation (DHD) through negotiations and 
to bring them in the social and democratic mainstream; and 

(b) if so, what initiatives have been taken so far by Government to solve 
the problem? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS 
(SHRI CH. VIDYASAGAR RAO): (a) Yes, Sir. 

(b) The Government of India have made appeals to all the militant groups 
which include DHD to give up the path of violence and to come forward for 
talks without conditions. Government are also committed to the speedy 
economic development of the North Cachar Hills. 

Massacre in Lotto Village in Palamu 

2226. SHRIMATI KAMLA SINHA: Will the Minister of HOME 
AFFAIRS be pleased to state: 

(a) whether Government are aware of the recent massacre of members of 
two minority community families in Lotto Village in South Bihar's Palamu 
district; 

(b) if so, whether Government have obtained any factual report of the 
gruesome incident; and 

(c) if so, what are the details thereof and the reaction of Government with 
regard thereto? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS 
(SHRI CH. VIDYASAGAR RAO): (a) to (c) According to available 
information, 12 persons were killed at village Lotto, District Palamu, on 
November 16717,1999. The deceased belonged to the family of one Abdul 
Gafoor Ansari. 

A case under sections 147/148/149/3021.P.C. has been registered at RS. 
Chhatarpur in connection with this matter. Two suspects have been arrested. 
The State Police is making efforts to nab other accused persons. 

The State Government has reported that ex gratia grant at the rate of Rs. 
20,000/-per deceased has been paid to the nearest kin of the deceased 
persons. 

Government condemns all acts of violence. 
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