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approach, focussing in particular, on core 
technology in areas such as information 
technology, telecom, biotechnology and 
infrastructure development has received 
endorsement. Now, of course, we signed 
eight bilateral investment, promotion and 
protection agreements between member-
countries, and we have also signed agree-
ments with Indonesia and Zimbabwe. 
These are all follow-up actions. The most 
significant is the aspect of cooperation on 
the matter of W.T.O. and strategic sector. 

MISS SAROJ KHAPARDE: Sir, may I 
know from the hon. Minister as to what are 
the salient features of the resolution 
adopted by the G-15 Summit which are 
particularly advantageious to India and 
what are the key issues under discussion? I 
would also like to know whether India has 
been able to safeguard its interests 
ultimately. 

SHRI JASWANT SINGH: Sir, I have, in 
my effort at answering the queries of other 
Members, covered a number of these 
aspects. She wants to know as what arc the 
aspects that have addressed India's concern. 
I think, India's concern is really related to 
the functioning of multilateral lending 
agencies, the disorder in global financial 
markets, the forthcoming W.T.O. meeting 
and the approach of the other 15 countries to 
strategic sector. . On each of these aspects, it 
was India's proposal that found unanimous 
acceptance and they do reflect on the 
success that was achieved in this conference. 
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THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PERSONNEL, PUBLIC 
GRIEVANCES AND PENSIONS AND 
MINISTER OF STATE IN THE MINIS-
TRY OF FINANCE (BANKING, RE-
VENUE AND INSURANCE) (SHRI 
KADAMBUR M.R. JANARTHANAN): 
(a) and (b) A statement is faid on the Table 
of the. House. 

Statement 

Based on the recommendations of the 
Fifth Central Pay Commission relating to 
the increase in age of retirement of Central 
Government employees from 58 years to 60 
years, the Government, after taking into 
account this recommendation and all other 
relevant factors like increasing trend of late 
marriages and longer education span, 
expectations of SC/ST and OBC 
employees, world-wide trend to raise the 
age of retirement, impact on employment 
opportunities etc., decided to accept the 
recommendations of the Fifth Central Pay 
Commission and raised the age of 
retirement of the employees of the Central 
Government. The age of retirement of the 
employees of the banks and Central Public 
Sector Undertakings has also been raised 
from 58 to 60 years. Orders to this effect 
were issued on 13.5.1998. In addition, the 
age of retirement of armed forces and 
personnel of Central Para Military Forces 
was also raised by two years across the 
board. 

The age of retirement has no one to one 
relationship with the employment 
opportunities and as such the increase in 
age of retirement has not affected the 
overall employment market. Even prior to 
increase in age of retirement, large number 
of employees of the Central Government 
belonging to Group D and workmen 
category; pre 1969 bank employees; 
scientific and technical personnel, school 
teachers and a section of Doctors used to 
retire at the age of 60 years. The vacancies 
in these cadres continue to be available for 
fresh recruitment further reducing the 
impact on unemployment. 
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With opening of the infrastructure sectors 
like telecom, power, roads, communication, 
posts etc. to the private entrepreneurs, the 
employment opportunities have increased 
considerably. 

To ensure that unemployed youth are not 
put to disadvantage, the maximum age of 
entry into Government service through 
open competition  has also been increased 
by two years. 

As per Nineth Plan, a number of 
employment generating schemes are likely 
to be implemented which will further 
increase the employment opportunities. 
However, no separate statistics regarding 
retirement and growth related vaacancies 
State-wise, in this regard, arc maintained 
centrally. 
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SHRI KADAMBUR M. R. JANAR-
THANAN: Mr. Chairman, Sir, I would like 
to reply to the questions asked by the hon. 
Member. The retirement and the 
recruitment is an on-going, continuous 
process. Furthermore, recruitment and 
retirement is not done on one-to-one basis. 
This Government does not reply only on 
Government employees. We are creating 
more- employment opportunities for our 
youngsters by implementing a number of 
employment generating schemes as per the 
Ninth Plan particularly. 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: Sir, 
she has asked a specific question. What is 
he answering? 
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SHRI KADAMBUR MR. JANAR-
THANAN: Mr. Chairman, Sir, the hon. 
Member has asked whether the employ-
ment opportunities are affected by in-
creasing the retirement age. They are not 
affected, this is what I am saying. The age 
of retirement has no one-to-one rela-
tionship; it is an on-going process. There-
fore, the Government is creating new 
employment opportunities in the infras-
tructure sectors. ...(interruptions)... Mr. 
Chairman, Sir, I can answer only one 
Member. ...(interruptions)... Sir, our 
comrades must understand that it is 60 
years not only in the Central Government 
but also in West Bengal. 
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MR. CHAIRMAN: Please let him reply,  
(interruptions). 

�� 2=� �-ह
�� �
8���� : �)w��� ��  �
�� 
8[ �ह� ह� ...(!��"
#)  

�� #��& �
%� : ��, �
�8 �हV %�� ह� 
...(!��"
#)  

�� �,
��� : %� 8�
 �+ �
�� ��	���� �  
(inter-ruptions). You cannot interfere. 
(inter-ruptions). He is not yielding, 
(interruptions). %� r�( 8�/ �+ <C �ह� ह� 
...(!��"
#) She is quite competent to put a 
question. (interruptions).  

�� #��& �
%� : r�� ह�+ �	:��� �हV ह� ?   
 
�� �,
��� : �हV, �8 
ह 8)� �ह� ह� �) 

�	:��� �हV ह� � 

�� 2=� �-ह
�� �
8���� : �#��	� �ह)
�, 
�) <k� 	
�� ��� ह�, 
ह 	
-��� �� 	
�� ��� ह� 
3� ��)� 8ह� �) <��+ �� ���8 �� 8�� 
�� "��� �+ � Mf�� �हV ह)�� /�	ह� ...(!��"
#)) 

MR. CHAIRMAN: Question Hour is 
over. 

WRITTEN  ANSWERS   TO   STARRED 

QUESTIONS 

Status of Bofors Kickback Enquiry 

*222. PROF.       VIJAY       KUMAR 
MALHOTRA: SHRI RAGHAVJI: 

Will the PRIME MINISTER be pleased 
to state the present status of Bofors 
kickback enquiry? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PERSONNEL, PUBLIC 
GRIEVANCES AND PENSIONS AND 
MINISTER OF STATE IN THE MINIS-
TRY OF FINANCE (BANKING, RE-
VENUE AND INSURANCE) (SHRI 
KADAMBUR M.R. JANARTHANAN): 
Pursuant to the registration of the 


