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exemption given in the Act to the firms in 
respect of which provisions of part-II of 
the Cinemetograph Act, 1952 applies may 
be withdrawn and the reference Indecent 
representation of women' be changed to 
'derogatory representation of women'. 

The Department of Women and Child 
Development is in the process of 
consultation with concerned Ministries/ 
Departments of the Government of India 
and the State Governments on the 
amendments suggested by the NCW in the 
above four Acts. 

The Domestic Violence to Women 

(Prevention) Bill, 1994: 

The Commission proposed enactment 
'The Domestic Violence (Prevention) Bill' 
during December, 1994. The Bill gives a 
wide definition to domestic violence by 
bringing into its purview all types of 
violence against women committed by her 
husband, his or her relatives thereby 
bringing about a consequential 
amendment to the Indian Penal Code, by 
inserting a new Section 498-B. The Bill 
seeks to protect the women against all 
types of domestic violence. 

Since the Bill relates to provisions in 
the Indian Penal Code, Code of Criminal 
Procedure and Indian Evidence Act, the 
State Governments/Union Territory 
Administrations have been advised to 
examine the provisions of the Bill and 
convey their comments for the enactment 
of the Bill. 

In addition to the above, the National 
Commission for Women has proposed 
amendments/enactments of women related 
Legislations, which have been taken up 
with the concerned Ministries/ 
Departments. 

Amendment of Existing Legislations: 

1. Medical Termination of Pregnancy 
Act, 1971 

2. Child Marriage Restraint Act, 1929 

3. Family Courts Act, 1984 

 

4. Foreign Marriage Act, 1969 

5. Guardian and Wards Act, 1869 

6. Indian Succession Act, 1925 

7. The   Married   Women's   Right   
to Property Act, 1874 

8. Hindu Marriage Act, 1955 

Enactment of New Legislations: 

1. Legislation        on        compulsory 
registration of marriage in India 

2. The      Orphan      and      Destitute 
Children (Adoption) Bill 

3. The Criminal Laws (Amendment) 
Ordinance, 1996 

4. The Criminal Laws (Amendment) 
Bill, 1994 

5. The Marriage Bill, 1994 

UNICEF Report oo Female Literacy 

574. SHRI AKHILESH DAS: 
SHRIMATI VEENA VERMA: 

Will the Minister of HUMAN RE-
SOURCE DEVELOPMENT be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether according to the UNICEF 
Report "State of the World's Children 
1999" Madhya Pradesh, Uttar Pradesh, 
Rajasthan, West Bengal and Andhra 
Pradesh are amongst the States named as 
States with a high number of districts 
where female literacy rates are less than 
30% with 75% of children of Schools; 
•and 

(b) if so, whether Government have 
any schemes or an action plan for prom-
oting and boosting up female literacy in 
these and primary education and if so, the 
details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF HUMAN RE-
SOURCE DEVELOPMENT (DR. 
MURLI MANOHAR JOSHI): (a) and (b) 
No, Sir. However, the main strategies 
adopted by the Government of India for 
increasing female literacy in the country 
include: National Literacy Mission for 
imparting functional literacy, Universal-
isation   of  Elementary  Education   and 
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Non-Formal Education. The proposal for 
Ninth Five Year Plan envisages intensifi-
cation of efforts towards Universalisation 
of Elementary Education with a focus on 
the needs of backward areas and disad-
vantaged group of girls. In addition several 
State Governments are providing special 
incentives like free uniform, free text 
books etc. 
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