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REPORT        OF        THE        

EITHICS COMMITTEE 

SHRI S.B. CHAVAN (Maharashtra) Sir, 
I present the First Report (in English and 
Hindi) of the Ethics Committee. 

REPORTS       OF       THE       PUBLIC 

ACCOUNTS COMMITTEE 

SHRI K. RAHMAN KHAN: 
(Karnataka): Sir, I lay on the Table a copy 
each (in English and Hindi) of the 
following Reports of the Public Accounts 
Committee (Twelfth Lok Sabha). 

(i) First Report on Excesses over Voted 
Grants and Charged 
Appropriations (1996-97). 

(ii) Second Report on Union 
Government Appropriation 
Accounts    (1996-97)    Telecom-
munication Services. 

SPECIAL MENTIONS 

Mixing of Naphtha and Plastic in Petrol 
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Delay in calling of Winter Session and 
reduction in the number of days for the 

session 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA (West 
Bcngiil): Mr. Chairman, Sir, you will kindly 
remember that in the last session we had 
raised an issue on the number of sittings of 
Parliament. You will also kindly remember 
that Members belonging to all political 
parties had expressed a concern over the 
steady decline in the number of sittings of 
Parliament and deliberations by Parliament. 
1 do not want to blame the present 
Government. But the trend that has set in 
has taken a very ominous turn from bad to 
worse. My complaint is that Parliament is 
being side-lined. The number of Parliament 
sessions is being curtailed. Secondly, it is 
being made ineffective. When I had raised 
this issue in the last session, the hon. 
Parliamentary Affairs Minister was kind 
enough to state, "I would like .to assure you 
that the points raised in your letter will be 
kept in view while finalising the programme 
of Parliament session in future." Therefore, 
it means that the Government had 
responded. But the response had not been 
translated into action. The present 
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winter session of Parliament had been 
called nearly 15 days after the normal 
schedule. The present winter session of 
Parliament has been convened only for 18 
days which includes two days exclusively 
provided for Private Members. We are left 
with 16 days only. How much it comes to? 
When the new Government and the new 
Prime Minister came to power they have 
always been talking of democracy and 
democratic principles. For the current year, 
the Parliament session had been reduced to 
59 days. It is one of the shortest Parliament 
sessions ever held. Earlier the Parliament 
used to meet for 100 to 120 days. Of 
course, that was the dawn of India's 
Independence. Subsequently it has been 
reduced. Now it seems the Parliament 
session had been reduced to merely half. 
What is the situation? The situation is like 
this. Our Rajya Sabha is having 35 
Government Bills pending. The number of 
Parliament sittings has been curtailed. The 
number of Bills pending is 35. In the other 
House, the number of Bills pending for the 
current Lok Sabha is eleven. The number of 
sittings of Parliament is being reduced. The 
number of Ordinances is on the rise. 
Perhaps we have one of the shortest 
sessions of Parliament. We had five 
Ordinances. Many of these were 
controversial. The Government have also 
amended an Ordinance by issuing an 
additional Ordinance. Sir, the Rajya Sabha 
is having nearly 1000 Government 
assurances pending. About 1000 
Government assurances arc pending. 
Therefore, the question arises whether 
Parliament is being sidelined over the 
years. And at present, it is taking a turn for 
the worse. Normally, the Budget Sessions 
used to be for 40 days. After the 
introduction of the Parliamentary Standing 
Committees, it was made clear that the 
Standing Committees were not considered 
to be a substitute for an open parliamentary 
deliberation. The Budget Session used .to 
take place for 40 days. This time, the 
Budget Session has taken place only for 30 
days. Why do we feel helpless? The hon. 
Prime Minister is here. May I say, Sir, with 
all humility, 

that Parliament is the forum for developing 
a national consensus of which he had been a 
champion? It is not in a dinner meeting of 
the leaders of Parliament where you 
exchange your views. That cannot be found 
to be suitable for developing a consensus. 
National consensus can only emerge if the 
parliamentary form or the parliamentary 
forum is allowed to be effective, is not 
interefered with, if its Sessions arc not 
deliberately curtailed. Why do you feel 
helpless? In the Constitution, there is no 
provision that makes it obligatory for the 
Government to have a minimum duration of 
parlimcntary deliberation. Taking advantage 
of this lacuna in the Constitution, the 
executive, the Government, the Cabinet, is 
usurping the powers beyond any limit and 
taking Parliament for a ride. Why do we 
feel concerned? We feel concerned because 
there is a talk of a Presidential form of 
Government. If there is a talk of a 
Presidential form of Government, if there is 
a talk of constituting a Commission for 
changing the Constitution, there is every 
reason to fect alarmed. I feel alarmed. 

Secondly, the Prime Minister is reported 
to have said—I do not know if it is so; it is 
for him to correct—while addressing a 
meeting of industrialists that despite the 
drama-of-democracy, reforms shall 
continue. If the parliamentary process is 
considered to be a drama.... 

THE PRIME MINISTER (SHRI ATAL 
BIHARI VAJPAYEE): I did not say that.  
(Interruption). 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: 1 stand 
corrected. 

SHRI ATAL BIHARI VAJPAYEE: It is 
as simple as that. (Interruption). 

SHRI JIBON ROY (West Bengal): It 
appeared in the Press. 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: An 
hon. Member of this House, Mr. Ashok 
Mitra, yesterday, referred to it. I am 
referring to his speech. If the hon. Prime 
Minister says he has not said that, I stand 
corrected. 
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SHRI MD. SALIM (West Bengal): Is the 
Parliament Session a drama or is the 
election result a drama? 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: I do 
not know where the drama lies and who the 
actors are and if it is a tragic drama. 

THE MINISTER OF FINANCE (SHRI 
YASHWANT SINHA): Sir, Mr. Ashok 
Mitra had made that point in the debate that 
the House was having yesterday. I am 
prepared to reply to that point. It is 
unfortunate that Mr. Gurudas Das Gupta, 
without referring to him, has repeated that. 
I have the text of the Prime Minister's 
speech. I will clarify that in the course of 
my reply to the discussion on the current 
economic situation. 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: My 
point is, Mr. Ashok Mitra referred to it. 
Hon. Minister, Mr. Yashwant Sinha was 
very much present. He never said that it was 
not said by the Prime Minister. 
(Interruptions). I am only referring to that. 
Since the Prime Minister has said that he 
has not said it, I take it. But my apprehension 
is still there. My apprehension is still there 
because of the campaign that has been let 
loose regarding the Presidential form of 
Government, regarding a change of the 
Constitution, amendment to the 
Constitution. All this is going on. I feel 
concerned because despite the issue being 
raised in the House and despite the concern 
being expressed in different quarters, the 
Government had called this Session 15 days 
after the normal schedule and Parliament is 
being allowed to meet. Parliament can be 
convened, only if the hon. Prime Minister 
so advises the President. Therefore, I am 
constrained to say, if Parliament is not 
allowed to meet and if Parliament Sessions 
are curtailed in the way it is being done 
now, where is democracy allowed to 
function? Do you believe of a system of 
parliamentary setup where Parliament will 
be ineffective? Only a few months back, a 
delegation of this House, led by Mr. 
Chavan, had    visited    a    number    of    
countries 

and met a number of Parliamentarians, 
including      the      Presiding      Officers. 

We had met the leaders of deferent parties 
of the House of Commons, the House of 
Lords, the leaders of the French Parliament, 
the Italian Parliament. A very mature and 
developed parliamentary system operates in 
those countries. We were given to 
understand that Parliament in those 
countries meets almost round the year, at 
least, for 120 days despite Parliamentary 
Committees being allowed to function 
there. Almost all the important political 
issues are discussed there. It is not to 
transact Government Legislative Business 
that the Parliament meets. Of course, that is 
an important component and a part of the 
parliamentary programme. But Parliament 
meets to debate, discuss and deliberate the 
important Government issues. We did not 
get that opportunity because Parliament 
was not in Session. Many things had 
happened in this country, beginning from 
Pokhran down to many things. Parliament 
had met many months after those 
happenings. But in the devslojsd capitalist 
countries, in developed Western 
Democracies, Parliament meets for a longer 
period of time. /»s a result, the Parliament 
becomes the national forum for discussing 
the national issues and a platform for 
developing the national consensus. Since 
the hon. Prime Minister is present here, I 
would most humbly request him to respond 
to it and let us know as to what is in store 
for this august House and the Parliamentary 
System as well. 

SHRI PRANAB MUKHERJEE (West 
Bengal): Sir, I am grateful to Mr. Gurudas 
Das Gupta for drawing the attention of this 
House to an important issue, that is, about 
the duration of the Session of Parliament. 
On earlier occasions also, he had brought 
this subject before the House. Sir, by and 
large, I agree with him. But my contention 
is that it is not merely the days, the quality 
of the business transacted by Parliament is 
also to be improved     substantially.     The     
Prime 
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Minister is a veteran parliamentarian. It is 
needless to point out this fact to him. From 
his own experience he will agree with me 
that in the first three Lok Sabha, from 1952 
to 1967, before the election of the Fourth 
Lok Sabha, 68 per cent of Parliament's time 
was devoted to discuss the legislative 
business and the financial business because 
Parliament is to act as a watchdog on the 
Executive in regard to transaction   of   the   
financial   business. What has happened 
now? Since the 10th Lok Sabha, only 32 per 
cent of the time of Parliament today is 
devoted to discuss legislation    and    to    
transact    financial business. This fact has 
been revealed by no less a person that one 
of the former 
  
Speakers of Lok Sabha. We had a Plan 
where  this  country  spent  Rs.   4,34,100 
crores in the public sector alone. But in full 
five years, we did not have the time to 
discuss either the  Approach to the Plan or 
the full Plan itself. The Winter Session  
started  on 30.11.1998.  I  think, today,  we  
are in  the  midst of second week, and we 
have not transacted any Government 
Business except one piece of legislation. 
Very often, we have pointed out   that   
Parliament   is   not   merely   a talking   
shop.   It   is   there   to   transact 
Government     Business,     and     if     the 
Government   does   not   come   out   with 
legislative proposals, we cannot make our 
plan  properly.   From  the  day one  this 
Session started, I have been suggesting to 
the   Government-side,   for   God's   sake, 
make  proper  planning.   Some  of  these 
Bills  are  to  be  passed,  and what  has 
happened? Parliament is to transact the 
Government   Business.   But   we   cannot 
discuss those things in greater detail. In an 
anxiety, we have to hasten the entire 
legislative process. It should be avoided. Of 
course, there are many Members who are 
senior to me. But I have been in this House 
from 1969. Normally, we used to meet for 
26 weeks. Normally, we used to meet for 26 
week; 12-13 weeks during the Budget   
Session,   6   weeks   during   the monsoon 
Session and 6 weeks during the winter 
Session. We used to meet in the first  week  
of  November   and   adjourn before the 
Chrismas eve.  On 23rd  or 

24th, i.e. on the Chrismas eve, we used to 
adjourn. In between, the Parliamentary 
Committees used to meet. 

Sir, most respectfully, I would like to 
submit that time-schedule should be 
adhered to. There may be many political 
events, important events like elections 
and other things, but those things will go 
on. I remember—Mr. Prime Minister will 
agree with me—that when the elections 
took place in 1978 in six important 
States, the Parliamentary Budget 
schedule was not disturbed. He was in 
the Government. He was Foreign 
Minister at that time, and Morarji Bhai 
was the Prime Minister. The Budget 
Session started from the second week of 
February. Elections to the provincial 
assemblies took place in the fourth week 
of February. 1 don't know why, this time, 
the winter Session was delayed, and what 
the reasons were. Sometimes, the Prime 
Minister may have a commitment outside 
the country. One or two days can be 
adjusted But there was no reason why, 
instead of meeting in the first week of 
November, we began this Session on 30th 
November. We should not link it with the 
provincial assembly elections or some 
other political events. Elections are a part 
and parcel of the democratic process and 
we whould have a fixed calendar. Many 
other matured, advanced countries have a 
fixed calendar. It is true that the 
President is to summon the House on the 
advice of the Council of Ministers headed 
by the Prime Minister. If we have a fixed 
calendar, then all other programmes can 
be adjusted according to that fixed 
calendar. It may be one or two days here 
and there. Most of the advanced, mature 
countries having parliamentary 
democracy have a fixed calendar. They 
know well in advance as to when their 
Parliament is going to meet for Budget 
Session or for monsoon Session or for 
winter Session. We are having three 
Sessions. So, I would like to submit that 
this is a matter to be considered seriously, 
cutting across party lines, how to strengthen 
the democratic system, how to make the 
Parliament more effective, 
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more careful, more responsible and more 
responsive to the needs of the people. It is 
true, Sir, that as the Chairman of the House, 
you are 'guiding us on certain issues, but, to 
my mind, here, it would better if the Prime 
Minister takes a little initiative and 
convenes a meeting in order to see how we 
can strengthen the democratic system, how 
we can make it more effective. See the 
wastage of time. I am sorry to say that we 
are also contributing to that process. We are 
spending Rs. 4,267/- per minute of 
Parliament Session—I am talking of the 
figure before the enhancement of salaries, 
allowances and other perks. If one minute is 
wasted, then we can understand how much 
money is wasted on adjournments, 
interruptions, etc. I am not talking of the 
adjournment motion as such. But if the 
House cannot transact its business because 
of disorder, then the cost of that 
adjournment is really having an effect on 
the Exchequer. All these issues had been 
discussed. We had made certain 
commitments when we completed the 
Fiftieth Anniversary of Independent India 
and we should strictly adhere to those 
commitments which we had made, and one 
such thing was not to disturb the 
Parliamentary proceedings in an unseemly 
manner. It is incumbent on each and every 
one of us. Therefore, it is the reponsibility 
of the Government of the day to ensure that 
the number of days of Parliament Session is 
not reduced. Both the Ruling Party and the 
Opposition parties should work together, 
discuss it in a structured manner and make 
their best contribution in resolving the 
issues. Of course, this could be utilised as 
the highest forum to build a national 
consensus on contentious issues. I thank 
you, Mr. Chairman, for giving me this 
Opportunity to speak. 

SHRIMATI JAYANTHI NATARA-JAN 
(Tamil Nadu): Sir, I would like to endorse 
what was said by Mr. Gurudas Das Gupta 
and I plead with the Government to 
consider this very important question. I 
would also like to add one more important 
issue. I am sure many of 

my colleagues will agree with me. I would 
like to appeal to the Prime Minister to 
kindly see to it that we in the Rajya Sabha 
are given proper guidance. I say this with an 
objective spirit and I hope the Prime 
Minister will accept it. The Rajya Sabha 
doesn't have the assistance of a full-time 
Parliamentary Affairs Minister here. They 
may have a Minister in the other House 
about whom I am not talking. Every day 
normally the Parliamentary Affairs Minister 
in charge of the Rajya Sabha attends the 
Chairman's Chamber so that we are able to 
understand what are the issues that are 
going to be raised and who are going to 
raise them, whether a particular Bill is 
coming or whether some Government 
business is going to be taken up or whether 
some voting is going to happen. Now we 
are completely unaware of such things. Of 
course, we have the respected Leader of the 
House who is always willing to help us. He 
sometimes comes to the Chairman's 
Chamber. As far as the Rajya Sabha is 
concerned, I am afraid the Government is 
not very fair to us because we have not had 
anyone right from the beginning to sit here 
permanently. There used to be a 
Parliamentary Affairs Minister for the Rajya 
Sabha, who sits here throughout the day, to 
assist the House in whatever deliberations 
that are taking place. Today we have 
nobody. It is as if the Government is not 
there. Every day when we discuss in the 
Chairman's Chamber about the issues that 
we would like to have on the day, there is 
no Parliamentary Affairs Minister. There-
fore, I would like to make a specific request 
to the Prime Minister to see that somebody 
is appointed for the Rajya Sabha so that we 
will be able to understand what the 
Government business is. 

SHRI R.K. KUMAR (Tamil Nadu): I 
deny your statement that from the very 
beginning there was nobody. I was there in 
the Rajya Sabha every minute when I held 
the additional charge of Parliamentary 
Affairs. How there is another Minister also. 
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SHRIMATI JAYANTHI NATARA-
JAN: Sir, I agree that Mr. Kumar was there. 
I stand corrected that Mr. Kumar was 
definitely there. But today we don't have 
anybody here. (Interruptions).... I don't 
even know who the Parliamentary Affairs 
Minister is. (Interruptions)... I have no idea 
who the Parliamentary Affairs Minister is 
because he is never seen here. I don't know 
who it is. I don't know his name. 

Sir, I would like to add my concern to 
what Mr. Pranab Mukherjee has raised 
about Government business not being 
transacted in the House and what he has 
said about the business of the House being 
disrupted. During the special session we 
had all discussed very seriously how we 
should conduct the House and how we 
should not allow the House to be disrupted. 
I would like to make an appeal to the Prime 
Minister. Let us know what the business 
that we are going to transact will be. 
Unfortunately, there is a certain confusion. 
Again I say this in a very objective spirit. 
As far as the Parliamentary business is 
concerned, the Parliamentary Affairs 
Minister says one thing on television and 
the Finance Minister says another thing. 
Take, for example', the Insurance 
Regulatory Authority Bill. The Finance 
Minister says, "No, this is only the agenda 
for this week". He said so at the World 
Economic Forum. We are a little confused 
about what actually the agenda of the 
Parliament is. We would like them to speak 
in one voice. 

Finally, I would like to request the Prime 
Minister not only to increase the time of 
the House but also to take a firm view on 
the legislations that he is going to bring, 
with particular reference to the Women's 
Reservation Bill. Let him take a stand on it. 
Let the Members discuss it without 
disruption. If it is the fate of the Bill to be 
defeated, let it be defeated. Let us not 
disrupt it. Let us not say that even the Bill 
should not be discussed. These are the 
three issues which I want to raise. 

SHRI S. VIDUTHALAI VIRUMBI 
(Tamil Nadu): Mr. Chairman, Sir, I en-
dorse,   and  associate   myself with,   the 

ideas and views expressed by my collea-
gues. I hope most of the issues raised by 
them will be accepted by the whole House. 
I don't want to repeat what they have stated. 
The General Purposes Committee is also 
going to meet on the 9th. We can have a 
full discussion there. Now I want to deal 
with whatever issues are left by them. 
Previously, we had Special Mentions daily. 
Zero Hour . Mentions were also allowed. 
Now due to time constraints, even if we 
want to make Special Mentions or Zero 
Hour Mentions, we are not able to make 
them. When we give notice of a Special 
Mention we are able to get the permission 
only three or four days later. Sometimes the 
purpose of the Special Mention itself 
becomes infructuous. It clearly shows that 
we are having more business but less time. 
After this globalisation and liberalisation 
took place, the problems have also 
increased. There are more problems like the 
stand taken by the European Union, the 
issue of patents relating to process to 
product, etc. These are all issues whch are 
agitating us. We have been unable to deal 
with that, due to constraint of time. Now 
people say that the standard of 
Parliamentary institutions is declining. But 
the decline has not taken place suddenly. It 
has declined gradually. When we say that 
we have been unable to transact the 
business which ought to have been done, it 
means we must give more importance to 
these things and come to some conclusion 
con-sensually. 

I hope this issue will be taken up 
seriously by the Treasury Benches and-they 
will take appropriate action. Failing which, 
I hope, Sir, you will protect us. 

Thank you. 

PROF. (SHRIMATI) BHARATI RAY 
(West Bengal): Mr. Chairman, Sir, I 
endorse what Shri Gurudas Das Gupta and 
other Members have said. Therefore, I will 
not repeat what they have said. I would 
start with sharing a personnel sorrow with 
you. I came to Parliament two years ago 
and it took me a year to settle 
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down. By the time I settled down, I found 
that I had no work to do. I was expecting to 
do a lot, but Parliament was not sitting. 
Therefore, there was hardly anything that 
we could do. The Budget Session and the 
Monsoon Session were compressed 
together and that, too, for a very short time 
and very little business could be done. This 
Session is only for three weeks. As Shri 
Pranab Mukherjee has said, the winter 
Session used to start on the first day of 
November. Now in this session half the 
time has already gone and no substantial 
Government Bill has come. Shrimati 
Jayanti Natarajan has just now mentioned 
about the Women's Reservation Bill. We 
were hoping that it would come. The okpal 
Bill has not come. The Agriculture Workers 
Bill has not come and the Electoral 
Reforms Bill also has not come. If I 
remember correctly, the Prasar Bharati 
Ordinance was issued just two days before 
the adjournment of the last Session. But the 
Bill did not come. What I want to say is 
that the Government, to my mind, is not 
taking Parliament seriously. There has been 
a division of work between the executives 
the legislature and judiciary, mentioned in 
the Constitution. Parliament must deliberate 
seriously and thoughtfully on the Bills 
which have to be passed. There should not 
ortly be a fixed calendar for sittings, but 
there should also be given enough time for 
the Bills that have to be passed so that we 
can apply our mind. 

Sir, I would request you to take up the 
matter with the Government so that the 
days reduced and Parliament can exercise 
an  effective  voice;   as  it  should,  in  a 
democracy. 

Thank you. 

��,
������� ����(%a! 3'��): �>� �� 
�ह&'�,������ �)O'�� '���)K� 
� �� 
& 3h 
%?��� ह�,%��� 2 �� �& ���Q �!�� ह)
 �# ���� 
ह� �ह�� C�ह;��� �� >�!� ��  ���/9�� ������<� 
�� 
�  �V������� ����� �& 
��K� ���� ,�ह 
��� ';�!� ह�  �� �!��! ��  ���B 2�� 
���6 �����,�/9����� *! U��� ����� �& 
2 ��-2 �� p�	 �� 2�9��! �'
 ह)
 ह# , ����� 
�ह >� �/6��U� ��� ह� �� ���' ��  

�/9����� ���� ���� `��'� ����/! ह# 
& 
�ह� 2Ds �� 
��� �� �_7� �� 3�����9I/ �!�� 
ह�,%��& �!-����  �!�� ह� , 9�!�-9�!� ���' ��  
���6 �'/�B �� ��� ��� 
� !ह� ह� , �)@� �ह 
���� ह� �� 
���-2�
��� �� ह� �&� ���' ��  
�हI/ �& �� �!�� C�� 
� !ह� ह# , �����
 �
 
�'� 
& ';�!� ���D�� ह#,';�!� ������;�U� ह# /ह 
���'  ! 3I�p ��  !&p O  �� 3ह�! >� �!�� 
!ह�� ह# , �>�-�>� X�� ���� ह� �� 
& ��� 
���' �� ह&�� C��ह
 /ह ��� U��� ����� �� 
';�!� 2��B �� 2 �� ह�D �� �� ���� ह# , ������ 
39�� ��	� 
� �ह�� �o
;' ह# , �# � ��  ��R�� �� 
������ 39�� ��	� 
� �� 2�)!&9 �O� �� �� �&0 
X�� T�/�D� �)��bdC� �!� �
��� �� ���' ��  
���6 �'/� >� �J� *! 
��� �&�B �& ���� ह� �� 
���' 2�  ह�� 
��� 3>�/ �ह+ !ह� ह� /ह >� >� 
�&�B ��  �� �� ';! ह& 
�
 , 9U�/�' ,  

SHRI T.N. CHATURVEDI (Uttar 
Pradesh): Mr. Chairman, Sir, the subject 
which has been raised by Shri Gurudas Das 
Gupta is an important one. Sir, this House 
will recall that earlier also, during the lat 
Session, this matter was raised and the 
same points were emphasised. All of us 
expressed concern that over the years, there 
had been a decline in the number of days 
when Parliament met. But to blame a 
particular Government and, at the same 
time, denying that is not the intention, I am 
afraid, does not reflect so much with the 
concern over the reduction in the number of 
sittings, but it is, in a way, some kind of an 
excuse or a pretext to criticise the 
Government. I am saying this for the simple 
reason that this matter was raised not only 
in this House, but also outside, a number of 
times. I would like to remind Shri Das 
Gupta himself that five years, back, the 
former Home Minister, the Leader of the 
Party to which he belongs, wrote an article 
about the working of the Indian Parliament 
—which is available to all of us—in which 
he particularly emphasised this aspect. But, 
Sir, to say that during this year, it has been 
deliberately done, I think, is not fair to the 
Government. We cannot ignore the simple 
fact that two elections took place. There 
was the General Elections and then there 
were the Assembly 
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elections for five States. I do agree with 
Shri Mukherjee that, necessarily, Assembly 
elections are not to be linked with the 
Parliamentary schedule. But one has to 
keep the realities in view.' As we are all 
aware, during the last Session, many a time, 
when there were discussions as to when this 
particular Winter Session should 
commence—there were discussions on 
different fora and even the Parliamentary 
Affairs Minister was there —the leaders of 
most of the parties felt that it might not be 
fair to have this Session earlier because of 
the Assembly elections. Hence the delay. I 
do not want to go into the discussions on 
these different fora, but this is the reality of 
the situation and the fact remains. I would 
also like to mention, in this connection, that 
I also agree with Mr. Mukherjee about the 
quality of the debate and the despatch of 
business in the Rajya Sabha. This matter 
has been raised earlier also and you 
yourself had been good enough to say that 
this would be discussed through proper 
devices that we have, namely, the Business 
Advisory Committee, so on and so forth. 
You yourself had given a direction to that 
effect. And I fully agree that if we really 
devote ourselves to the finaical and 
legislative business much more, there will 
be much less grievance from the people, 
and even if there are grievances, the 
devisions will be expenditious. There is no 
dispute on the point that yes, this, House, 
the Parliament, is a place for ventilating the 
grievances of the people. But it is not 
correct to say, or it may not be fair to say, 
that the Government will not be otherwise 
responsive to any particular matter which 
has been raised, if the Government has 
been approached in this regard. I would 
also like to mention that much has been 
said by Mr. Das Gupta about the intentions 
of the Government to change the 
Constitution. I think, that itself shows the 
kind of preposition or bias which the 
learned Member carries in his mind. We 
have to remember that the proposals are 
only for the review of the Constitution and 
that is with an idea as   to   how   the   
Parliamentary   system 

can be further strengthened, how it can be 
made more stable and how it can be made 
more representative. It is only a Reveiw 
Commission and the debate has been going 
on. Probably, this House, Mr. Das Gupta, 
Mr. Pranab Mukherjee and everybody else 
knows that this matter was considered even 
before the Emergency as well as during the 
Emergency. 

Whatever may be the view-point of the 
Government during that particular period, 
they felt that these changes were to be 
made. But, here, it is just a proposal by the 
Government for a wider discussion because 
so many seminars have been held in the 
country in various forum, in Universities 
and outside and there arc criticisms in the 
Press and also in many other legal forum. 
This only provides an opportunity where a 
free and frank discussion can be held as to 
how the Parliament can be made much more 
effective. I even remember that when Dr. 
Karan Singh,—he is not present here, was 
the President of the IIC, a Committee was 
appointed in which were legal luminaries 
and also the representatives of various 
political parties and many other experts. 
They also gave certain recommendations 
and then suggested that a Commission 
should be set up to review the working of 
the Constitution over the last 50 years to see 
whether there are any loopholes. For 
example, one loophole was pointed out by 
Mr. Das Gupta himself, that should there be 
a fixed schedule in regard to the sittings of 
Parliament. Now, this is also a loophole. 
Unless we have a Review Commission, how 
can we look into such problems? So, a more 
holistic, a more comprehensive, a more 
rationale, kind of an approach can be 
adopted through the Reveiw Commission 
and whatever the recommendations of the 
Review Commission are, the House would 
see it will obviously come before this House 
because the House is the final authority, it is 
the supreme authority—whether those 
recommendations could be adopted. 
Attributing any 
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motive or any insinuations—directly or 
indirectly—is completely misplaced. 

I do agree that it is necessary that we, the 
Parliament, meet more often and we also 
transact our business with greater dispatch, 
attend to the essentials much more than 
spending our time on other peripheral 
matters. It may not be fair to blame us and 
say that this particular evil has started at 
this point of time and then say, 
apprehensions are being entertained. I think. 
Sir, for apprehensions, there is no remedy; 
as the proverb goes: 

2�! �� ह� �& %��� '/� �)���� ��   �� >� 
�ह+ ह� ,  

So far as Shri Gurudas Das Gupta is 

concerned. Sir, he has a perpetual bee in his 

bonnet with which we are all aware. Thank 

you. 

SHRI JAYANT KUMAR 
MALHOUTRA (Uttar Pradesh): Thank 
you, very much Sir. On behalf of my group 
and myself, we would like to associate 
ourselves with the issues raised by Shri 
Gurudas Das Gupta. It is a very important 
issue. Some of us had the opportunity of 
visiting foregin countries and interacting 
with Parliamentarians under the leadership 
of Shri Chavan very recently. We found 
almost everywhere that the number of days 
that Parliament met was over 120. Although 
the hon. member on the left has expressed 
the view that there is some sort of criticism, 
in fact, senior Members cutting across party 
lines have expressed concern at the gradual 
reduction of the days in which Parliament 
meets. This is the highest forum where 
views, ideas, subjects can be discussed and 
I feel that instead of curtailing the number 
of days to under 60 we should gradually 
bring it up to the level that exist in the other 
democracies of the world. This has been 
discussed frequently in this House and we 
have also expressed our concern at the lack 
of Government business coming before the 
House when almost half the session is over. 
Except for one Bill, no Government 
Business has been brought and this is again 
an area of .concern. With 

these few words, I would like to once again 
associate myself and my group with the 
views expressed by Shri .Gurudas Das 
Gupta on this subject. 

����� ���� ��-ह�(��ह�!): �>� �� 
�ह&'�,�
� �/g� �& �)O'��  
� �� �'� ��  
����� 3��)� ���� ह�-���' ��  �	 �& 9�!�-9�!� 
7&�� �! '���-*! %��� �����9� 
& ���� %UहB�� 
�ह� �D� 3:/ �)=
f 
� �� �
� ���B �& �ह� �# 
%���  ��D 2 �� �& �5�Q �!�� ह;� , 

�ह&'��,�)@� ��' ह� 
� �# �� �'� �� �0 �& 
�/�� 39�� ��	� 
� �/ p ��  '� �� ��?�� D� *! 
%��� ���B �& ���� �)�� , %� ��� �) 7 ��� 
�!ह �� ��� �!�� D� , ���' ��  �	 ��  ����9 �� 
%��� cC�� !ह�� D� , �
 %��� �ह 2 �p� ह� 

� /� �/�� %� '�� ��  �:69�! �� ��?� ह# �& /� �� 
���B ��  z ! R��� '��� ,  

���� �/1� (�� :C� �8ह�
� ����$��): “�� 
��?� ह#” �� ��� ���� ह� ?  

����� ���� ��-ह�: =(� !�ह
 �-! 
....(_�����) 

���' �� �	 9�!�-9�!� 7&�� ह&�� 
� !ह� ह# 
...(_�����) 

�m���� k8n��q� ��� &��� (��ह�!):  
%���  �' >� 7&�� ह& !ह� ह� , /ह >� �J�� 
C��ह
 ,  

†ŚŶŮ  ̃¢ Ã Ķǿ θ ¢ ŀźŠ˜  ĶΉ κ ŗΈŚŶŮ  ̃¢ Ã Ķǿ θ ¢ ŀźŠ˜  ĶΉ κ ŗΈŚŶŮ  ̃¢ Ã Ķǿ θ ¢ ŀźŠ˜  ĶΉ κ ŗΈŚŶŮ  ̃¢ Ã Ķǿ θ ¢ ŀźŠ˜  ĶΉ κ ŗΈ : : : : Śⁿ  ŀ΄  ĶΞ  ̂¢ 
ø śŻΕ Ķǽ  ĶŷΊ ńſ Śⁿ Ç Ä  ι  ĶΌ ̄   ŗΌ  ĶǺ ŗŹǽ 

����� ���� ��-ह�: %���  ��!� �� ���� cC�� 

��ह! �� *! ')���� ��  
& 3�)Q �&�� �	 ह� 
%���  ��!� �� >� CC� �� , �) 7 
�ह� �)@� >� '�=�� 
�� 2�)>/ ह� , 2� ����#� �& �& �ह� 
��� ह�-
�'! �- ���&N� �� , �'�-!�� �&� ��� �!�� ह# 
, �9�-�9� !�� ��?�! ����' �&� ��� �!�� ह# 
, �/g�  ! CC� �!�� ह# , C;��� ह� �ह� ��?�� 
ह#,C;��� >�!� �� ���' ���-���  ! �� ���B 
 ! �/C�! �ह+ �!��,���;� ���  !  �� �ह+ 
�!�� ह� �& 9�!�-9�!� �V���U��
 �J�� 
� !ह� ह# 
*! �V���� �� !�
 ह���� =!�� ह&�� ह� , ���� 
3��� �� 2�! �V���� �� !�
 ह& 
�
 �& ह���� 
�&� �N�����
  

†[ ]Transilteration in Arabic Script 
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�!�� ह# �� �ह�� �& �V���� �� !�
 ह& !ह� ह� 
, 2�! '�� �� ���� T�/�D� ह� �V�����
 ��  
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�� ���' �� *�CI� ��� ह&�� ,  
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�� ���' �� ��� �J��� 
�
 , C;��� ���' ?�� 
�̂� �� ��� �ह+ �!  ��� ह� ��� �� ��� ह� 

����
 
�
���;��/ �� `��'� ह�D �J�� 
� 
!ह� ह� , %��� 2�9��! �J�� 
� !ह� ह� , /� ह! 
����� �� ह��p�  �!�� ह# , �
 �'� �  >� '�=�� 
ह# �ह&'� , ����  ��!� �� !�� �& �� 
� �� >� CC� 
�� �� ���� 2�9� 
)������ 
b���/`� ह& 
!ह� ह� �� �
��& �&�  ��' �ह+ �!�� ह# , 
& 

�
���;��/,
&  �V������ �& �!�� C��ह
 %� 
���B  ! >� '=�-'ह��� ��� ह� , �ह ��� >� 
2_7� �ह+ ह� , �&���	 ��  ��
 =�!� �� घ��� ह� ,  

ह� �ह�� �&���	 �� !p� �� ��� �!�� ��?�  ह# , 

��� ��  3�����9 ह&�! ह� �
 ह# , 2�! 
��� 
��  3�����9 ह� ह#,���' ��  �&� 
��� ��  
3����9 ह# *! �ह �/s_C �'� ह#,��!� '�� �� 
����ह ��  ! !ह�� ह# �-! 2�! ह� ?�� �̂� �� 
��� �ह+ �!���,���;�  ��!� �ह+ �!���,�
� 
��� �� �
5��'�!� ���! ह� �
 ह#,'�� ��  3�� 

& %a!'���I/ ह��!� ह� %��& 2�! ह� 
��>�
��� �ह+ �& �-! ��� ��� /��� �'�B �� '�� 
�� >�/|� 2�9��!�� ह&�� , 9U�/�' ,  

SHRI R.K. KUMAR: Sir, while I do 
associate myself with the Special Mention 
made by Shri Gurudas Das Gupta, I would 
like to briefly touch on a different subject. 
There is no doubt that the number of days 
on which the House meets, is getting lesser 
and lesser. But the introspection that is 
required to be done by each one of us here 
is this. Are we using those lesser and lesser 
number of days in a more and more 
effective way? When I came to this august 
House, 1 came with a six-year plan, not a 
five-year plan. In the first year, it was that I 
should be present in the House from 
morning till evening. In the second year, it 
was that I would ask questions on subjects 
with which I am familiar. So, I had a plan. 
Now, what is required, is, while the 
Government should consider increasing the 
number of days, we should 

use those lesser and lesser number of days 

in a more and more effective manner. That 

is my appeal to all my colleagues. 

SHRI SOLIPETA RAMACHANDRA 
REDDY (Andhra Pradesh): Sir, this issue 
was discussed earlier also. I feel, the 
Ministers may have some reasons, but the 
Members from all the parties are naturally 
of one opinion that the House should meet 
frequently and for more days. Sir, I feel 
there is no justification in saying that 
because of elections, particularly the 
Assembly elections, we could not have 
more days of sittings of the House. I 
suggest that even if elections are taking 
place, the number of sittings should not be 
reduced. The sitting days can be changed, 
but it should not be reduced. A number of 
Bills are there for approval of the House. I 
agree with my colleagues that the House 
should sit for some more days. Sir, on 
behalf of the Telugu Desam Party, I once 
again appeal to the Government to strictly 
adhere to the normal schedule of the 
sittings of the House. I particularly request 
that this Session should be extended till the 
end of this month. Thank you very much, 
Sir. 

MR. CHAIRMAN': As I said in the 
last Session, I wanted to put it before the 
General Purposes Committee. That 
meeting is, probably, being held 
tomorrow. In that meeting, we will 
discuss all the points which have been 
raised here. The Leader of the House is 
here........ (Interruptions)... 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: Sir, the 
Prime Minister may react to it. 
...(Interruptions)... The Leader of the 
House may also react ...(Interruptions)... 

MISS SAROJ KHAPARDE 
(Maharashtra): Let the Prime Minister react 
to it. 

��� �$  �$�� (�� ���-�
 8r�): �'� 
��ह�,'& ���� ...(_�����) ��!� �)
��!� �)� 
���

,����  ��' 3��� ������!� ��ह� %?��� , 
'& ���� �)@� '� '��

 , ...(_�����)  
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   śŻΜΎ ¬"...Ĺŵǿ ¢ ŀΈ ..."  
        

         Í ڈ  Ń  ĶŹ΅ ¨ Ä Ńˆ Ê ̄  ĶŶΟ Í ڈ  Ń  ĶŹ΅ ¨ Ä Ńˆ Ê ̄  ĶŶΟ Í ڈ  Ń  ĶŹ΅ ¨ Ä Ńˆ Ê ̄  ĶŶΟ Í ڈ  Ń  ĶŹ΅ ¨ Ä Ńˆ Ê ̄  ĶŶΟ : : : :ˆ  ̄  ŀŷų
  śΏ  ŗΌ  śℓźſ Ћ Ê →ŷΈ Â ĶΊ ¬ Ń ÞķǾ Ķ¯ Ĺё
  ĶŹǽ ¢ Ĺυ  ŗΨ ›· ŗΦ Ç Ä  ŃΆ ¢ Þ›Έ Â ŀˆ ³ ¢ ›Ό

   ι"...Ĺŵǿ ¢ ŀΈ ..."  ŗ΅ Ћ Ê →ŷΈ Â ĶΊ ¬ Ń
 ø śŻΜΎ ¬  śŷ· ŗΦ  

  
  Ĺё  ̄  ŀŷųˆ Ê ŃˇĹё  ̄  ŀŷųˆ Ê ŃˇĹё  ̄  ŀŷųˆ Ê ŃˇĹё  ̄  ŀŷųˆ Ê Ńˇ:::: ÞķǾ Ķ¯  ̄  ŀ¯ 

 ¢ ŀΈ ¡  ̄  ĶΟ ĹΎ Ķω  śΉ  ³ ←ŶΈ œŠΎ ŃΉ ¢  ›ƒ Ķſ ŔΌ 
 Ј ŗ΅ ›Έ ³ ¢ Þ›Ό А ›ƒ Ķſ ÑǼ ŗΨ œſ Ķ΄ ĶΈ ›Ό ŚŸ΅

ˆ ̄  Ä ↓ŷ΅ Ĺυ ø Ķƒ ŗΌ ›ω  ¢ ŀź œΞŵſ À ¢ ŗˆ  ĶΟ Ś
  ŗǼ ›Ό Ј ¡ Śⁿ ŖΎ ŅΎ ŗі őűũδšˆ ¢ Ê ̄  Ķˆ
  Ń΅ ÑǼ ŗΨ » Ń˙ А Â ¢ Ñ΅ ›Ό  ̄  ŗŮγΈ  ŗ΅ ĺŷŶΉ ̄  ŗΆ
  ĶŸ΅  śΉ  Ã ŗŹΉ ¢  śũΚǼ øŖΎ Ń΅  źšΎ ̄   ŗųˆ ¢  ╒
 А  śΉ  Ń΅ őţˆ ¢  ŗųˆ ¢  Ń΅  Ķŷſ À Ä Łźˇ őΎ ¢ Ñ΅  ι
 À Ä Łźˇ  śųˆ ¢  ŗ΅  ŅΈ ¢ ŃΆ Ä Ń Љ Ķſ  ̄  Ä ¢ ŖΎ Ń΅ ňˇ ŗ΅

 Ķſ őΎ ¢ øŖΎ Ń΅ œΈ Ķˇ ›Έ ŕǼ ¢ ↓Ή ДŷźǼ ¥
 Ã Ķϊ Þ ›Έ ÑŵΈ ĶůΈ  ╒ ŇΫ Ņſ ŚŸ΅  śΉ  ÑŠǾ Ķ¯  
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  śŢΕ ̄   Ń˘ ĶǾ  ↓ũγΈ  ± ź ¢ Ê ↓ŷŶź· ̄  Ķ  Í ̄  ĶŶΌ
  śˆ  ķǾ Ķ¯  ↓ũγΈ ŔΏ ¢ Ń ›Έ  ŗΨ Þ›Ό ›ω
ÑǼ ŗΨ » Ń˙ А ³ ¢ Ñ΅  ĶΠΉ Ä Ń΅ Ĺˆ ¢ ŗǿ ̄  ¬ А 

 œΞŵſ œźˇ ̄  Ä  Ä ↓ŷ΅  ŗųˆ ¢ ›Έ ø ι ¥ ̄  Ä Ń˘
 œſ Ķ΄ Þ›Ό ЙΆ ŚŸ΅ ›ƒ Ķſ ŚŹǽ ¢ Ĺυ ø Ķƒ Ķŷſ ›ω
  Ķũά ¢  śŻΕ Ķǽ  ĶΉ ŗΌ œŶ˜  Ń ³ ¢  ̄  Ä ¢ ø›Ό ЙΆ А ÑǼ ŗΨ
 ›ŷŹσ ¢ Ê ńſ  ŗΨ Ś₧΅ Ś₧΅ ŕųź· øÃ ŗΌ  ĶŢΉ ĶΈ ›Έ
 ›ω А  śŬΘ΄  ╒ Śũ΅  ŗǼ ›Ό Ѓ ¡ А Ŕũ΄ Œ· ¢
Ã ŗγǼ ›Έ Ĺű· ¢ ›Ό  śƒ  ĶǼ  ŗΌ  ŗΨ ŘŦ΅ Þ›Ό  ╒ 

 ³ ¢ ŔΌ ›Ό  śŢ∆ ¬  ĶŷΎ ÑΉ ¢ ŗά ¬ Śⁿ ¿ ŗ· ŘŦ΅  ̄  Ä ¢  ̄  Ķǻ ¡
 Â ¬  Í ° ŗ₣  śΏ  ŗΌ  śΏ  ¡ Śⁿ ¢ Ñ΅ ›Ό ›Έ Ĺ· ĶǾ
 ňˇ ŗ΅ А  śΉ  κ ›Έ  ŗΦ Ķ΄  ŗ΅ ¥ κ ĶǾ ø›Ό  śΏ  ŗΌ
  ╒ Ŕũ΄ ³ ¢ ¥ κ ĶǾ ŘŦ΅ ŕųź· ø›Ό  ι ̄   Ń΅
 ›ω ›Έ  śŬΘ΄  ŗǼ Ñ΅ ›Ό  śƒ  ĶǼ  śŵΗ  śƒ  ŗΌ

 ›Ό  ι ̄  ¡"...Ĺŵǿ ¢ ŀΈ ..."  ›Ό Ћ  ύŶΟ
"...Ĺŵǿ ¢ ŀΈ.." .  ι ŚΌ  Ķŷƒ ¢  ĶŷŸ΅ ν Ķǿ  śŹΜΈ

 Ê ̄  ĶŶΌ  ŗǼ ø ĶŢΌ Ķǽ ›ω  ĶΉ ĶǼ ›Έ Ã ŗΨ Ķſ Â ¢ ›Έ Ñ΅
 Ã ĶΎ ̄  ŗήťΈ Ç Ä ›Ό Ã ĶΎ ̄  ŗήťΈ Ê ̄  ŗήťΈ
 øŚŴΎ ń ŚΌ І Ń΅ ÞŚŴΉ ŗΌ ŚΌ І Ń΅  ̄  Ä ¬  ŗ΅ ĺŷŶΉ ̄  ŗΆ
  śŢųˆ ¡ ›ω Þ›Ό Ç ¬ ĶΎ ± Ĺυ  Ņŵſ Ñ΅  ι őź₤
  ι ̄  Ķ ›ω őǺ Þ›ω  Ķŷſ Ñŵũŵˆ   śŻΉ  śųˆ ¢ ø›Ό

ƒ  ŅΎ Ņ˜  śŷΓ ¢ » Ń¯ø›Ό ŕΎ Ń  
 

 
 

 

 ÑΎ ÑųΉ ŗδ΅  ι ŚΌ ̄  ĶǼ ÑǼ ŗΨ Ê ↨Έ » Ń˙ А Ĺˆ Ä ¬
 ÞА  śˆ  ¥ Ķſ À ŗŲůΈ Ê ńſ  śΉ  Ã ŗŹΉ ¢ ¥ Ķ˜ Ä Ńˇ  ŗΨ
  śˆ  ¥ Ķſ À ŗŲůΈ Śũά ¢ ŘŦ΅ Ç Ä А  ŗǼ ŔŢǿ ŕųź·
  ↨˝ ŚΌ ĹΎ Ķω Ç Ä Þ›Ό ¸ Ķű· ¢  ŗǼ  śŻ·  ╒ ³ ¢ Ñ΅ А
 Ã ĶŸ΅ øÃ ŗΌ  ĶŢΌ Ķǽ ›ω  ĶΉ ĶΠ· ›Έ Ç Ä ø›Ό À ŗŲůΈ

 ŕˇ ŗδǺ Śũ΅ ÑΎ ›Ό  ╖ Ľŷφ Ã ĶŸ΅  śˆ  ι ̄  À ŀſ
 ø ι І ¢ Ń ¥ ¬ Ķ˜ Ç Ä  ↨ǿ  ŃŴΈ ›Ό  

  
   ĶΉ ̄  Ä З ¢ ŚŴΉ ¢ ŗά ¬  ЙΆ ¡ Á ĶΟ  ¢ ŗΌ  ĶŹǽ ¢  ŗŵǽ
 ¤ ¡  ŗ΅ ³ ¢  śƒ  ĶǼ  ĶŸ΅  śΉ   ĶŹťŶˆ  ŗ΅  Ńⁿ  śΉ  ĶΈ ± ŔΌ

  ╓ ŖΎ ̄  ĶΊ ŀˆ"...Ĺŵǿ ¢ ŀΈ ..." Þ›ω ›ω
 Ñŵũŵˆ ÞŚŴΎ Ń΅ ÑǼ ŗΨ » Ń˙ А Ã Ä ≡ǽ Â ¢ ĺŷŶΉ ̄  ŗΆ

  ŚŴΎ Ń΅ Ĺˆ ̄  ¬"...Ĺŵǿ ¢ ŀΈ ..." ÑǼ ŗΨ œſ Ķ΄ Ĺυ
Ј ¡ ŖΎ ŅΎ ŗэ  Ķź΅ ŘŦ΅  ̄  Ä Ń˘ » Ń˙ А ³ ¢ Þ›Ό 

ø ĶΠźΏ ĶǼ 
�� �����$C� 
��G-d� 
$s�: ह��& �ह 

�/d/��� '���
 �� �� �� �� �ह �#�� �ह��� 
=I� �� C����,  

†Ê ŁΎ ̄   ̄  ŀŷǽ Á ¢ ̄   Ķţźšź· ŗˆ Ê ŃˇÊ ŁΎ ̄   ̄  ŀŷǽ Á ¢ ̄   Ķţźšź· ŗˆ Ê ŃˇÊ ŁΎ ̄   ̄  ŀŷǽ Á ¢ ̄   Ķţźšź· ŗˆ Ê ŃˇÊ ŁΎ ̄   ̄  ŀŷǽ Á ¢ ̄   Ķţźšź· ŗˆ Ê Ńˇ:::: ÑΎ  ŗ΅ ŔΌ
 ŔŢǿ ÑŷźŸΈ ŕŪδˆ ÑΎ Ŕ΅  śˆ  Ŕ΅ Ñ΅  śŻΜΎ ¬ ŕˆ ¢ ŗˇ ¡

ø ĶΡ  śŵΗ őƒ 

�� :C� �8ह�
� ����$��: ������ �>� �� 

�,��!� /�!|? �ह�&�� h� ���U'! �]� 
� �� 
& 
�) 7 �ह� %���  ��' �&0 �/��g ��� �ह�� ��  ��
 
�ह+ !ह�� ह� , ���� �� �	 �� �!�� �� ह��!� 
�&0 �!�'� �ह+ ह# ,  
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2�! �� ह)� ह� �& �ह �/���! �!�� �� �)@� 
���&C �ह+ ह� �� �� ��! �
� �!ह �� 
 �!b�D�����  �'� ह)0,%� �� ���� �
��� �'� 
����� C��ह
 D� %��� �'� �ह+ ���� ह#,����� 
�� ��   �7� �&0 �!�'� �ह+ ह# ����  ��  �	 �& 
�� �!�� �� , 2�! �'� C�ह� �& 2>� >� ���!�� 
�& ����/�! �& ��?�� �� -� ��� �! ���� ह�,
& 
��� ह& %� �&  ;!� �! ���� ह� , 2�! �'� 
����! हB ...(_�����)... 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: As 
a Parliamentarian, he knows how to trick 
Parliament. (Interruptions) 

�� :C� �8ह�
� ����$��: ह��!� �!�'�  �� 
*! ��- ह#,2� �  ��
;! �ह+ �! !ह� ,  

�>� �� 
�,�C�)C �� 
� ��� 2�)>/ ह� �� 
%9! ��?�! ह� 
& ���� �ह� �!�� D�,2� �9! 
��?�! /ह+ ���� �)��� ह# ,  

�� ��t��� �����X: �  �� ��� ह� ह� �&� 
�&� !ह� ह# ,  

�� :C� �8ह�
� ����$��: ����� �# �ह�� ह;� 
�� ���� �� �	 �� �ह+ ह&�� C��ह
 , �# 
�)O'�� '���)K� 
�  �& �9�0 '��� C�ह�� ह;� 
��B�� �UहB�� ��-6  �'� �� ����� �ह+ 
%?���,!�|� �� 
� �& >�  	 ��=� D� , !�|� �� 

� �� �ह  	 �)@ �& >�
� �& �# ��@ ��� D� �� 
�ह ����� %?��� , �# �-! '&ह!��� C�ह�� ह;� �� 
��� �& �� ���� �� �� �(� 
�-3�����9 ���D� 
ह� *! >�!� ����! �� �� �� �(� �&���	 ह# , 
�'� �� ��?� ��!��! C��� !ह�� C��ह
 , ह� 
�& 120 �'� C���� C�ह��� *! �� �� �� �� 
�ह�&� �/d�� ह# , �� ��! C)��/ � �
 ��C 
��,*! �& C)��/ ��� /��� �ह+ ह� , ����
 
& 
D&(� ��o�� ह)0,�# ����� ह;� %� ��o�� �� ह� 
>! �0 �!� , 
��� �#�� �ह� ह� ���/�! �& ��?�� 
�� -� ��� �! ���� ह# *! � ह& �& �N��� ��  
��' �'� �� �	 C��� !ह�,�!��! �� ��  ��
 
>� ����! ह# , �>� �� 
�,�ह �  ��
��� 

�/��
!� ����� �� �� �! ��,�# �&� �>� �� 
��� �! �;��� , 2>� �& �N��� ��  ��D �'� �& 
���K� �!�� �� 3���/ ह#,2�! �J��� �� 
�/d���� ह& �& �J��� 
� ���� ह�,ह��!� 
�!- �� �&0 ���&C �ह+ ह� , ह� �'� �� �!�� 
�ह+ ह# , 1957 �� �'� �� ह� 2 �� !�� �'=��� !ह� 
ह# , ...(_�����)... 

�� ��
� �
�� !��p<: �!,%� !�� �� *! �
 
��  !�� �� 
��� ����� �� -�6  ह# ,  
 

�� ��ह7�� ����: �  �� �&2V���c�� 
����� *! 
��
U�  ��f �� �! *! >� `��'� 
�  ��   p �� ह� ,  

†Ŕźŵˆ  ŀŶŧΈ Ê ŃˇŔźŵˆ  ŀŶŧΈ Ê ŃˇŔźŵˆ  ŀŶŧΈ Ê ŃˇŔźŵˆ  ŀŶŧΈ Ê Ńˇ:::: ÞŒŷţźŷΎ  ڈ ̄  ¡  ŗ΅ Śų ¡ 
 ›Έ ňų  ╒ ¤ ¡ Ç ¬ ĶΎ ± Śⁿ  ̄  Ä ¢ Є ̄  Ķ ̄  Ä ¢ ЕźŶΟ

ø ι 
�� :C� �8ह�
� ����$��: %� �� ��?��0  �'� 

�ह+ ह&�� ह� , �  >� 
���
� C���� ह#,�  >� 
�&MV���c�� ����� ����� ह# ,  

�>� �� 
�,2� �� CC� �� ���/9�� ��  
 )�V/C�! �� ����� %?��� *! !�|� �� 3:��� 
���; �!�� ��  �!�'� ��  ���� �& ���� 
!� 
O!� 
�� `��'� ह# , D&(�-�ह)� !�
���� �� ��@ ���� 
ह;�,����� �� ह' �� �ह+ , �)O'�� 
� �& >� 
��@��� �)bd�� ह# , �>� �� 
�,ह� �  ��  ह�D 
�� ह�,
& �  -� ��� �!� , ��!� �'� ���� ह&�! 
��:6� �!�,=)�� CC� ह& *! ��D6� CC� ह&,�&!-
�!��� 
� ह' �� C��,����� ��� ह& , 2� 
� 
T��/ह��!� ��?��0 ह& !ह� ह� ,
& �# �'� ��  
����� !=�� C�ह�� ह;� , ���c�� �������� ह� �� 
����� ह#,/� ���c�� �������� % �&�� ह� ��! 
������ �������� 
O!�-��-`��'� ��� �� !ह� ह� 
, ��� /ह�� >�
 �'
 
��� ह#,��� �o��� �ह+ ह� *! 
�-! ������ ह&�� ह� �� �!��! ��   �� 

��� 
�ह+ ह�,�!��! ��   �� ��� �ह+ ह� , �& ���c�� 
����� 
.'� 2 �� ��� �!�,�# ���� 
�/��g��9��! �� %.��घ� �ह+ �! !ह� ,�ह+ �& 
��!� �=��- �/��g��9��! �� %.��घ� � ���� 
ह� , ���c�� ����� 2�! �/9���B �& 
.'� >�
��� 
�& �'� ��  �����  ���6/�ह� !ह��� *! ��� !ह��� 
�& �'� %��  ;!� �!���,�)@� >!&�� ह� *! %� �� 
�!��! 2 �� �&�'�� '��� ��  ��
 ����! ह#,�ह �# 
�  �& �d/��� '��� C�ह�� ह;�,�d/�� �!�� ह;� 
,  

�� �
�^-;u �
��(
5�; / �d��!): C��!��� 
��ह�,���c�� ����� ��  ��!� �� 2��!���� 3��� 
������! ��ह� �� 
& -!���� ह�,�ह >� ')O�� ह� 
*! �ह >� ')O�� ह� �� ���c�� ����� �ह)� ��
 
>� ��� �!�� ह�,����� 
��� ���� � �! &�6 
� 
������ ह# �& �/�6��� �� �!- �� /ह �ह+ ����� ह� 
%� /t >� ह��&  !����� ह&�� ह� ,  
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†¼ ̄  Ķˇ ŕΎ ŀ· ¢ ŏά Ńˇ Ê Ńˇ¼ ̄  Ķˇ ŕΎ ŀ· ¢ ŏά Ńˇ Ê Ńˇ¼ ̄  Ķˇ ŕΎ ŀ· ¢ ŏά Ńˇ Ê Ńˇ¼ ̄  Ķˇ ŕΎ ŀ· ¢ ŏά Ńˇ Ê Ńˇ:::: ‹Έ  źǽ
 ›Έ  Í ̄  Ķſ  ╒ ЕźŶΟ ŒΉ Łŷźţˆ ¢ øķǾ Ķ¯
 ø ι  ĶΎ ĶΈ Ń  ŗǼ  śΉ  ķǾ Ķ¯  ↓ũγΈ ŔΏ ¢ Ń œŠΎ ŃΉ ¡
 Ñ΅ ι Ĺˆ ̄  ¬ Śⁿ ÑΎ  ̄  Ä ¢  ι Ĺˆ ̄  ¬ Śⁿ ÑΎ
 ø ι Ѓ Ń΅ Á ĶΟ Śⁿ  ≡ƒ Ĺυ ЕźŶΟ ŒΉ Łŷźţˆ ¢

ŕŪųΎ ¢ ŕųź·  ŗΨ ›Ό  śŢŴΉ ĶΈ ķǼ ¦ ̄  ŗΧ ̄  ŕųźǺ 
 ø ι  ĶŢŵΈ ›ω Ç Ä  śˆ  » Ń˙ А ĺŷŶΉ ̄  ŗΆ

ø ι Ѓ ŗΌ І ĶŪά Ń  ŗ΅ ŔΌ Śⁿ Ĺ΄ ŗˆ ¢  

�� :C� �8ह�
� ����$��: ���& >� 

��� ��- �� �!��� ,  

MR. CHAIRMAN: Now it is one o' 
clock. So, we adjourn till two o' clock. 

The House then adjourned for lunch at 
one of the clock. 

The House reassembled after lunch at 
four minutes past two of the clock The 
Vice-Chairman (Shri John F. Fernandes) in 
the Chair 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI JOHN 
F. FERNANDES): Now, there is a Bill for 
introduction. The Home Minister has 
sought the permission of the Chair to 
introduce the Bill now. Mr. Advani. 

The North-Eastern Council 

(Amendment) Bill, 1998 

THE MINISTER OF HOME (SHRI L.K. 
ADVANI) Sir, I beg to move for leave to 
introduce a Bill further to amend the North-
Eastern Council (Amendment) Bill, 1988. 

The question was put and the motion was 

adopted. 

SHRI L.K. ADVANI: Sir, I introduce the 
Bill. 

†[ ]Transilteration in Arabic Script 

SPECIAL MENTIONS—contd. 

Allocation of Gas from Tapti Gas Fields 
to Pipavav Project 

SHRIMATI URMILABEN CHIMAN-
BHAI PATEL (Gujarat): I would like to 
say a few words about the allocation of gas 
from the Tapti gasficlds to the pipavav 
power project in Gujarat. 

Gujarat is a fast developing State, 
especially, in terms of industrial develop-
ment. But it is facing a great shortage of 
water and power, which are the basic 
amenities needed for the development of 
industry as well as agriculture. The Pipavat 
is a 615 MW gas-based power project. The 
Government of Gujarat had approached the 
Central Government for gas allocation from 
the Tapti gasfields on 15th May, 1990. The 
then Petroleum Minister had given a 
commitment to provide gas for the project. 
The then Prime Minister, Shri Rajiv 
Gandhi, had also promised allocation of gas 
from the Tapti gasficlds, whenever extra 
gas was available. An announcement in this 
regard was made in this august House also. 

Uptill now, the availability of gas from 
the Tapti gasficlds was estimated at 3.5 
MCMD. Now, with the increased availa-
bility of gas, the estimate has gone up to a 
minimum of 5.5 MCMD. It may even be 
more than that. It is believed that It may be 
10 to 12 MCMD. The requirement of the 
Pipavav power project is estimated to be 
2.25 MCMD. Therefore, it should be 
possible to straightway make gas available 
to the Pipavav power project. But, instead 
of considering the demand for diverting the 
newly available gas to the Pipavav project, 
it is reported that the entire gas, is going to 
be diverted to HBJ pipeline and the Pipavav 
power project is going to be deprived of 
gas, despite the fact that the Government 
had already committed itself on this. It is 
also heard that the extra gas, which is going 
to be available, would be allotted to 
Madhya Pradesh or some other Southern 
State. A pipeline for this purpose has also 
been sanctioned. If it is a fact, it will 


