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(d) whether Airport authority have cleared 

the issue of raising the tower height of 
Doordarshan Kendra, Dibrugarh upto 
150m; and 

(e) if so, the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF INFORMATION AND 
BROADCASTING (SHRI MUKHTAR 
NAQVI): (a) All lndia Radio, Dibrugarh is 
already broadcasting a 5 minutes news 
bulletin in Assamese daily and a five 
minutes weekly news summary in 
M ish in g  dialect every Wednesday. There 
is no plan to start regional news bu lle t in  
in Assamese lanugage and Mishing dialect 
from Doordarshan Kendra, Dibrugarh at 
present due to various resource constraints. 

(b) Does not arise. 

(c) to (e) Whereas districts of Sonitpur 
and Golaghat do not lie in the coverage 
range of HPT. Dibrugarh, reception range 
in the districts Dhemaji, Lakhimpur, Jorhat 
and Sibsagar is affected due to the height of 
the tower. Necessary clearence to increase 
the height of the tower of HPT, Dibrugarh 
to 150m has since been obtained from 
Airport Authority. The project to increase 
the height of the tower which would 
improve the receiption quality in these 
districts would take about 2-3 years' time 
after sanctioning of the scheme subject to 
av a i l ab i l i t y  of resources, infrastructural 

facilities and inter-se priorities. 
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Shortage of Staff in Doordarshan 

2116. SHRI PARMESHWAR KUMAR 
AGARWALLA : Will the Minister of 
INFORMATION AND BROADCASTING 
be pleased to state : 

(a) whether Government are aware of 
the fact that there is a shortage of 5892 
posts in various categories of staff in 
Doordarshan; 

(b) if so, whether Government are also 
aware of the fact that a large number of 
projects are awaiting commissioning and 
some operational projects are also facing 
difficulty for want of staff; and 

(c) if so, what action has been taken by 
Government in this regard? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF INFORMATION AND 
BROADCASTING (SHRl MUKHTAR 
NAQVI) . (a) to (c) The Staff Inspection 
Unit of the Ministry of Finance has been 
requested to have a quick study of the 
staffing norms of various 
HPTs/LPTs/VLPTs to work-out their 
overall staff requirement. On receipt of the 
recommendations of the SIU, necessary 
action will be taken for creation/abolition of 
posts in required categories so that all the 
transmitters are fully manned and the 
already completed projects are 
commissioned at the earliest. 

Ban on Advertisements Promoting 

Alcohol 

2117. SHRl C. RAMACHANDRAIAH : 
Will the Minister of INFORMATION 
AND BROADCASTING be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether Government are aware of 
bad effects of advertisements for the 
promotion of alcohol in television network; 


