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Ludhiana & Mumbai. The exporters can 
complete almost all formalities and paper-
work with the Central Excise office having 
jurisdiction on the warehouse for sourcing the 
export goods from factories in any part of the 
country instead of, with offices at all such 
places. They can procure the goods in bulk, 
pack, re-pack, label or relabel and export in 
split quantities and assorted as per export 
order. Such alterations in exporter's store 
rooms are not permissible under normal 
export. 

(c) Docs not arise since already im-
plemented. 

(d) Only the Central Warehousing 
Corporation has shown keen interest in the 
Scheme and has represented for their 
inclusion in the Scheme. 

Impact of Entry of Tobacco Companies on 

Revenue and Excise 

2574. DR. MOHAN BABU: Will the 
Minister of FINANCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whether Government have 
examined the impact on revenue and excise 
by the entry of foreign tobacco companies 
with 100 per cent foreign equity;    .            

(b) if so, the details thereof; 

(c) what would be the possible impact of 
such a policy on revenue and excise 
collection; and 

(d) the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (BANKING, 
REVENUE AND INSURANCE) (SHRI 
KADAMBUR M. R. JANARTHANAN): (a) 
Presently, there is no proposal under 
consideration for any duty/tax concessions for 
cigarette industry. Therefore, the question of 
impact on revenue and excise duty collections 
does not arise and hence no such examination 
is required. 

(b) to (d) Do not arise in view of (a) above. 
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