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(he Lok Sabha in this respect, clarifying the 
Government's position in this matter, this 
House should also be taken into confidence. 

 

THE MINISTER OF EXTERNAL 
AFFAIRS (SHRI I.K. GUJRAL) Madam, I 
have taken note of your instructions. The 
needful will be done. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Okay? 
Now we go ahead with the Zero Hour 
submissions. Mr. Ajit P.K. Jogi.... He is 
absent. 

SHRI R. MARGABANDU: Madam, i 
rise to make one point. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: No, 
nothing.. ..(Interruptions).. .Mr. Mar- 
gabandu, no. Your name is Margabandu. So 
you are bound by that name! So please sit 
down and let me go according to the normal 

procedure.  

 Don't go out of the decided way! 
Then we can finish the business. Help me! 
Yes, Shrimati Bharati Ray. 

RE. NEGLECT OF EXCAVATIONS AT 

HARAPPAN SITES 

PROF. (SHRIMATI) BHARATI RAY 
(West Bengal): Madam, I rise to draw the 
attention of this august House to the utter 
neglect of historically significant 
excavations at Harappan sites. 

As we all know, Madam, this spectacular 
civilization flourished over an extensive area 
covering, from the west, the Baluchistant 
hills and Makaran coast, to_ 

the east to Punjab and down west to 
northern Rajasthan and Gujarat. Madam, I 
was shocked to read a news item published 
by The Hindustan Times of 9th December, 
that at one site, Bhorgarh, in outer Delhi, 
the mound has been partly destroyed by 
ploughs, and at another place in Mandoli, 
part of the area is used for public toilets and 
part for a modern graveyard. In a third area, 
at Bhojpur, the mound is lying open and the 
trenches are filled with rainwater every 
monsoon. 

Madam, these excavations are extremely 
significant because they have traced four 
successive cultural periods: The uppermost 
layer traces the mediaeval period, the 
second layer is connected with the Kushan 
era, the third with Indo-Arynas, and the last 
layer has found evidences of links with 
Harappan culture. As we all know, Madam, 
some western scholars, that is, orientalists, 
and some Indian shcolars, while 
constructing the ancient period of Indian 
history, focussed on the Orion age, the 
Vedic age. Some stressed the non-utilitarian 
aspect of the cultural history of India and 
some were concerned with the annals of 
dynasties and empires. But the corpus of 
evidence furnished by the Harappan culture 
indicates a new way of looking at our 
history. 

Every civilization has its own virtues, but 
we can be truly proud of a civilization, a 
spectacular civilization—urban and 
sophisticated—that flourished in India in the 
third millennium B.C., long before the 
Aryans even set foot in this country. This 
needs further exploration. Its links with the 
Indo-Orion culture, so different from it and 
so late and far behind it, has I not yet been 
established. 

We talk of heritage and history but we 
allow crucial evidences for constructing our 
past to be destroyed. I strongly urge upon 
the Government to preserve, develop, 
protect and explore the historically 
significant excavations at Harappan sites. 

Thank you. i 
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THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: It is a 
serious thing. Everybody supports it— 
there are no two opinions about it. 

PROF. VIJAY KUMAR MALHOT-RA 
(Delhi): We all associaie witn. it. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: We all 
associate. We are destroying our past 
without knowing it. We don't know about 
our past, really. We are destroying it 
ignorantly. 

RE. NON-REPRESENTATION OF S.C/ 

S.T. IN PLANNING COMMISSION 

 

 

SHRI H. HANUMANTHAPPA (Kar-
nataka): Madam, the Ninth Plan is on the 


