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SHRI K.P. SINGH DEO: Sir, since he 
has got information, I shall profit by it. I 
will have to collect from official sources 
whether there is at all an application for 
dahi or not. how can I just give a 
hypothetical answer to a hypothetical 
question. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: You collect and 

give the information. 

SHRI K.P. SINGH DEO: But charity 
begins at home, Sir, in West Bengal. 

NAM Summit in Columbia 

*42. SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY: 
Will the Minister of EXTERNAL 
AFFAIRS be pleased to state: 

(a) what are the subjects discussed at 
the Eleventh Summit of Non-Aligned 
Movement held at Cartagena in 
Columbia; 

(b) the details of the resolutions passed 
or declaration adopted at the end of the 
Summit meeting; and 

(c) what is the future role envisaged for 
NAM in international relations? 

THE MINISTER OF EXTERNAL 
AFFAIRS (SHRI PRANAB 
MUKHERJEE): (a) to (c) The Eleventh 
Conference of Heads of State/ 
Government of Non-Aligned Countries 
held in Cartagena, Colombia from 14-20 
October. 1995, focussed on the continuing 
relevance and role of NAM in changed 
international situation and NAM's 
priorities, goals and response to new 
challenges. The Final Document and a 
short declaration entitled "Call from 
Colombia" adopted at the conclusion of 
the NAM Summit pronounced on a range 
of issues including the review of 
international situation, role of the 
Movement, international security and 
disarmament including nuclear 
disarmament, question of UN reforms, 
development, human rights, social issues 
and South-South Cooperation. The 
Summit documents, adopted after in- 
depth deliberations, reaffirm the 
continuing validity and relevance of the 
principles and objectives of NAM and 

stress that the Movement should work 
towards cooperation and a sense of full 
partnership in the international field for 
the promotion of peace and social and 
economic development. The Movement 
has a major role in shaping the future of 
international relations as it provides an 
important platform to its 113 member 
states to project their collective positions 
on issues of interest to the Movement. 

SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY: Mr. 
Chairman, I agree with the hon. Minister 
that the relevance of NAM is very much 
there in the world because there is 
disparity between the developed and the 
developing countries. Sir, to my mind 
and also from the information which I 
gathered, bilateral issues should not be 
raised in the NAM Summit. But, to my 
surprise, I find, Sir, that one of our 
neighbouring countries, Pakistan raised 
bilateral issues. Only multilateral issues 
have to be raised according to NAM's 
Charter. And India gave a fitting reply. 
The Prime Minister and the Foreign 
Affairs Minister gave a fitting reply. Sir, I 
would like to know from the hon. 
Minister, when there is a specific 
understanding among the member- 
countries of NAM that bilateral issues 
should not be raised, why those issues 
were raised and why those issues were 
allowed to be raised by the countries and 
why India had to go and reply to those 
issues. 

SHRI PRANAB MUKHERJEE: Sir, 
there are norms in NAM and other 
international organisations which are 
basically meant for discussing multilateral 
issues concerning all countries. But if 
somebody raises it, there is no way you 
can get out of it. While making 
observations if a Prime Minister or the 
head of a delegation makes a point, then 
the only way left is to reply because there 
is no mechanism by which you can gag a 
member or stop or prevent him from 
making his observation. The norms have 
to be followed and observed, but if 
somebody does not follow the norms, he 
only incurs the displeasure of others, as it 
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happened in other international 
conferences. When this issue was raised, 
the Chairman had to intervene and say 
that bilateral issues should not be raised. 

SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY: Sir, at 
the Jakarta NAM Conference in 1992, as 
well as at the recent Columbia 
Conference, a Resolution relating to a 
ban on nuclear tests by all countries was 
adopted unanimously. At the same time, 
we find that China and France have 
conducted nuclear tests. Therefore, the 
question arises as to the relevance of 
NAM. While some countries have a 
moratorium on nuclear tests, some other 
countries—for example, our neighbouring 
country as well as France—have 
conducted nuclear tests. When this is the 
position, what would be the effect of 
passing these Resolutions? How are we 
going to implement it effectively? 

SHRI PRANAB MUKHERJEE: Sir, 
what the hon. Member has said is 
correct. Even when the question of 
indefinite extension of the NPT was being 
discussed at New York, even at that 
point of time, a particular country 
resorted to nuclear tests. Again, after the 
decision to extend the NPT indefinitely 
was taken, another country carried out 
nuclear tests. International protests were 
recorded against these tests. 

Now, all the NAM countries are not 
signatories to the NPT; like India, for 
example. We are not a signatory, but 
quite a few others are signatories to the 
NPT. Between the Jakarta Summit and 
the Columbia Conference, the difference 
was this. At the time of the Jakarta 
Summit, there was no decision in regard 
to the indefinite extension of the NPT. 
The issue was still open at that point of 
time. But in the middle of the current 
year, the decision was taken at New 
York. There too, despite the efforts, 
unfortunately, the Member-States of 
NAM, when they participated at the New 
York Conference as Member-States of 
the NPT, could not formulate a common 
position. 

Therefore,   the   Resolution   we   have 

adopted has relevance in this sense. If we 
want to have a nuclear-war-free world, if 
that is our ultimate objective, the 
elimination of nuclear weapons is 
essential. The thesis that the possession 
of nuclear weapons by some countries 
would act as a deterrent to others is not 
valid. We do not accept it. Even in 
respect of those countries which are not 
resorting to nuclear tests, we cannot 
come to the conclusion that they would 
not add to their nuclear arsenal. Some of 
them are conducting tests on computers. 
The sophisticated technology which they 
have developed helps them to improve 
and refine their weapons without 
resorting to physical tests. Some of the 
nuclear weapon States which do not have 
this technology are conducting physical 
tests. None of the nuclear weapon States 
have committed themselves that they 
would not make any vertical expansion. 
That is the reason why we are 
persistently opposing that this Treaty is 
inadequate, it is discriminatory and it is 
unequal, and that it cannot prevent the 
nuclear proliferation, at least, vertically. 

Still, the Resolutions by NAM have 
relevance. This is a large body. Out of 
the 185 countries in the United Nations, 
113 countries are in the non-aligned 
movement. In addition, a large number 
of countries are enjoying observer status, 
guest status. This is the largest forum. 
Therefore, what they say has some 
influence over the decision-making. 

�� ������� ��� : ������ 	ह��
, 	� 	�I. 
	ह��
 �� ����� ��ह�� ह�� �� <��6
� �� �� *>��" 
��<�� ह% �%�� ���+ &��@	 ह�, 
ह 0
$ �ह8 ��� ��
� 
���� ह� �� �+��
� 	� ह� �"ह ���+ &��@	 �ह�� 
���हJ 0
$�� ह	��� �K�� ��  ��- 	� &�" L�M	� 
��@
 ��  (L�� �� ह	 �� ������ ह� #� 
���+ &��@	 	��� ���� �� 	���� ���हJ, �� 
���+ &��@	 	��� ���� �� 	���� ���हJ, �� 
���+ &��@	 �� ���& 0
$ �ह8  N�
� ���� ह�? 
�����  �. ��ह �� ���& ह� �� (	����� 	� 
“�&� �5�+�6�” ह�; (�. ,�� J �	�&
� �.�+H� 
�� �ह�� �6	��*>�-� ��
� /�; �� ह	��. ����� <� 
7�� �� 0
$ �ह8  N��. ह� �� “�&� �5��6�” 
�+��
� 	� �	�O� ह��� ���हJ; #� घ��&� 	�	&� 	� 
(	����. <�����-� ह��� ह�, (�. ह	��� 
ह�� 



13 Oral Answers [29 NOV.  1995] to Questions 14 

J� ��3 ���� �. �"�P���. ह+Q #� 5���6�� 
R0&�� ����L ���� ह� �� 
ह�� J� ��	. �. 
�"�P���. ह+Q, (	����� 	� 7ह+�� �. �"�P���. ह+Q, 
�� 0
$ �ह8  N��� ह�? J� 
ह ����� ह� �ह. ह� 
�� ह	��. ����� �9� (&�<�	�� 	��	�� �. �� 
&.6 ���. /., (7 घ+��� ����  �.�� (ST�
�� �� 
�ह. ह�; �� <��� ह	 &�"$ �� 7��� ���हJ, 
ह 
��=>.
 5��=N� �� ���& ह�; <��&J ह	 	�I. 
	ह��
 �� �ह�"� �� 
ह �&� �5�+�6� #� 
���+ &��@	 �� 0��B�� and the 

question of American intervention in the 
domestic affairs of another country—why 
are these questions not being raised by 
India as they used to be earlier? Indian 
prestige is going down: people abroad 
think that India is surrendering. 

SHRI PRANAB MUKHERJEE: Sir, I 
do not understand what the hon. Member 
tried to convey. If the role of the Non- 
Aligned Movement against apartheied.... 

SHRI CHATURANAN MISHRA: I 
can repeat it. 

SHRI PRANAB MUKHERJEE: I 
have understood, but he has brought in 
everything—colour prejudice, secularism 
and India's prestige going down. The 
point is, if the hon. Member wanted to 
ask whether the Non-Aligned Movement 
has only role to play in the fight againt 
apartheid, I would say that it is only 
this Movement which took it up. We 
have achieved that objective. And India 
is the country which.... 

SHRI CHATURANAN MISHRA: 
That was not my question. I have made it 
clear. 

SHRI PRANAB MUKHERJEE: Then 
please repeat your question. 

SHRI CHATURANAN MISHRA: 
Over a million people had demonstrated 
against colour prejudice in the United 
States—and you don't speak about that. 
That's why the message goes to the world 
that India is not leading the Movement. 
This is the precise question. Don't put it 
in general. I have particularly mentioned 
secularism in the context of the present- 
day world-that is the strongest point of 
India—and the world is not considering* 

this question. They are equating Pakistan 
with India. It is a fact that we stand for 
secularism whereas Pakistan stands for 
theocracy. Why don't you raise all these 
questions and also about American 
intervention in the domestic affairs of 
other countries? These are the questions, 
but don't generalize them and don't 
preach us. We are old people and we 
know what India used to stand for. 

SHRI PRANAB MUKHERJEE: Sir, 
the problem is, the hon. Member knows 
too much! What I was saying is, this 
conference was basically meant to review 
global issues, and when we reviewed 
global issues, surely the question of racial 
discrimination was an important element, 
and the Non-Aligned Movement has 
expressed its views very strongly against 
racial discrimination. It has expressed its 
views, very strongly, against racial 
discrimination, against apartheid and 
against fundamentalism, and that is why 
the main point which I referred to in the 
context of the question was that all these 
issues were raised and India played a 
major role in formulating the Draft 
Declaration, in formulating the Columbia 
call, where on these important issues the 
concern of the non-aligned countries was 
expressed—against racial discrimination, 
against apartheid, against the new mode 
of protectionism and against the policies 
of interventionism. These issues have 
been raised and we have expressed our 
concern. We have formulated our views 
and in the process of drafting the 
document—which reflects the views of 
the Member-States-India played a major 
role. 

DR. GOPALRAO VITHALRAO 
PAUL: Sir, I would like to ask the hon. 
Minister whether-while an important 
discussion is going on in the world about 
the expansion of the Security Council' of 
the UNO during its Golden Jubilee 
celebrations—the subject of expansion of 
the Security Council was discussed at 
NAM. As you know, Sir, there are more 
than 184 members in the United Nations 
and    representation    in    the    Security 
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Council as permanent members is limited 
only to five countries. Therefore, I want 
to know whether this important subject 
was discussed at NAM. I think many 
more NAM countries should be 
represented in this very important body. 
More importantly, India has got a very 
major role to play in the NAM, and the 
Security Council—where we deserve a 
seat. So, in that respect I want to know 
whether any discussion has taken place 
about India's representation in the 
Security Council and what was the 
response from the NAM countries to the 
proposal of India getting a seat in the 
Security Council. India is the largest 
democratic and peace-loving country and 
a regional power. It has helped the 
United Nations in peace-keeping 
operations. It has fulfilled all its 
obligations. Therefore, it deserves a seat 
in the Security Council. Has any effort 
been made in this regard, and what was 
the response of the NAM countries? 

SHRI PRANAB MUKHERJEE: Sir, 
in fact, this issue of reform of the United 
Nation, expansion of the membership of 
the Security Council, both in the 
permanent and the non-permanent 
categories, was raised. The NAM 
Declaration has clearly spelt out that 
expansion of the membership in both the 
categories, the permanent category and 
the non-permanent category, should take 
place. The Declaration has gone to the 
extent of suggesting that any expansion 
without including the NAM member 
countries would not be acceptable to the 
Movement. Specifically, it has been 
suggested that there should be more 
representation from Asia, Africa and 
Latin America. 

No country-specific resolution was 
adopted because that is not the practice. 
Here, we shall have to work very hard to 
evolve a consensus among the NAM 
countries themselves so that we can take 
a common position. But, the difference 
between the last summit and this summit 
is that here we have emphasised that 
there should be expansion in both the 

categories that in the expanded 
categories, both permanent and non- 
permanent, members belonging to the 
NAM should be included and that any 
expansion without them would not be 
acceptable to the Movement. 
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SHRI PRANAB MUKHERJEE: Sir 
out of 113 member-countries of the 
NAM, quite a large number of them are 
also contracting parties to the new WTO, 
the old GATT. 

Therefore, the voice has been 
expressed in the economic part of the 
Declaration that in the WTO, in the 
name of extraneous issues, either in the 
form of human rights or environment or 
social clause, new protectionism should 
not be allowed to come in and that new 
non-tariff barriers should not be raised. 

In addition to that, in regard to two 
very important organisations of the 
UNO, which are helpful to developing 
countries, the UNCTAD and the 
UNIDO, and attempt was made by 
industrialised countries to wind up these 
two organisations. The NAM has 
reiterated that these two organisations 
are very relevant and important for 
developing countries and that they should 
be strengthened, instead of being wound 
up. 


