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> . -holding demonstrations and conducting
campaigns to ensure that the public
sector does not die for want of funds.
Unfortunately, despite assurances having
been given on the floor of the House by
the Minister of Industry, the Minister of
Labour and the Minister of Finance, the
public sector industries in West Bengal
are not getting funds to enable them to
run these industries properly.

What I am saying is this. We are very
much agitated on this issue. Therefore,
this issue must be discussed here.
Members should be given more time. The
Ministers concerned should give replies.
Unless that is done, it would be difficult.
We are very, very agitated. Before we go
back, the Government must come out
with its stand. Otherwise, our workers
would ask us: ‘What has Parliament
done?’. If there is no discussion on this
matter, it would be very unfortunate.

SHRI S. JAIPAL REDDY (Andhra
Pradesh): Mr. Vice-Chairman, Sir, a very
vital question regarding sickness in public
sector units, which could be remedied,
has been raised. The BIFR has become
an albatross round the neck of Indian
industry. So many matters have been
referred, but the Government has done
nothing. Therefore, would you kindly
issue the necessary directive to the
Government? Thank you, Sir.
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SHRIMATI JAYANTHI
NATRAJAN (Tamil Nadu): He has got

permission. What is this? Is this a
democracy or not?

THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI
SURESH PACHOURI): He has been
permitted by the Chairman.
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THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE
MINISTRY OF STEEL (SHR1
SONTOSH MOHAN DEV): Let him
finish.
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SHRI SURINDER KUMAR SINGLA
(Punjab): Let him exercise his right to
speak. He is speaking as a Member of
this House.
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SHRI MOHAMMED AFZAL alias
MEEM AFZAL: If he has got
permission, there is no probiem, but it is
being said that he has not been given

permission.

SYED SIBTEY RAZI: 1 am
competent enough to reply to the hon.
Leader of the Opposition.
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Mr. Bhandari, Please bezr with me. I
am reading the permission.

SHRI SIKANDER BAKHT: If
permission has been given to him. I have
no objection.
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SYED SIBTEY RAZI: 1 am not
Indcpendent Member of this House. T am
a member of the Congress Party.
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THE VICE-CHAI (SHRI

SURESH PACHOURI): 1. hsve allowed
him. Please.
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THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI
SURESH PACHOURI): I have already
called Razi Sahib. He has been given

permission by the Chairman.
(Interruptions)
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We want to walk out on this issue.

(At this stage, some hon. Members left
the Chamber.)

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE
MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS
(SHRI RAJESH PILOT): Mr.. Vice-
Chairman, Sir, they must listen to the
facts. They should not walk out. Sit down
here. Don’t go away. Listen to us. Don’t
do this (Interruptions). We had seen it in
1992 and we shall not see this again in
our country. Please stay and listen to us.
What had you been talking and what had
your leaders been talking?
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SHRI SURINDER KUMAR
SINGLA: Mr. Vice-Chairman, Sir, I
would like to say that they were walking
out from ‘their responsibility. We should
never trust the BJP.
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“ 1. Name and territory of the
Union—1) India, that is Bharat, shall be
a Union of States.
2. The States and the territories thereof
shall be as specified in the First Schedule.
3. The India shall
comprise—
a) the territories of the States;
b) The Union territories specified
in the First Schedule; and
c) such other territories as may be
acquiared.”
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“It shall bé the duty of the Union to
protect every State against external
aggression and internal disturbance
and to ensure that the Government
of every State is carried on in
accordance with the provisions of
thls Constitution.”
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“It shall be the duty of the Union to
protect every State against external
aggression and internal disturbance
and to ensure that the Government
of every State is carried on in
accordance with the provisions of
this Constitution.”
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/)/,J/// Vol st basr s
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AR TE A SR Y ok el R d wygm #

Fon srefan S Wt e TR % gl
A, FTTERINF Rt A

ST SRR, deel ofvd R 3R SEEd

e 4n Q, e s ¥, g Wl § dfte S
Qe ... (wmEAHA)... _

Ne favEm AR o (Reeh): & S
G

st wuen famn: o€ @ W, e we
do| Fo T G AR wHTT T W W FE
g O 6 U W aed Afee @ e ek
Th 4 vdEer @ W B }w F wml, 3@
o A & T T W, e 9
WE A N G G W W, SES o am
4 Y, w1 o alds =D ¥, 9mc FQ ¥ IR
& 4% e €Y ¥ R TR @ INE, Wd
[ A gelt B, W IR, gew g AR 9 QA
1 I R A BN B FE aed € R e
oy w=a @Y @ WeeR dee, = w
T AN &I B N dg) IR wed
A o0 FH VAN A W IPeR T s
R Foit | gaT |

sraarag (s g wm@irl): S fom
FAR HEE |

SHRI E. BALANANDAN (Kerala):
Sir, please allow me for a minute.

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI
SURESH PACHOURI): I have already
called him. (Interruptions) We have to

- .l{CJL;/‘M:: P

complete the business. (Interruptions)
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Site oty AR WoRAl: Iua eI wed,
.. (FTE) ...

Igavreay (s Yo w=ih): ©F fime F
fea

Mo g FAR veden: W e fead
AN AAE: FHT?

SHRI E. BALANANDAN: Just one
minute.

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI
SURESH PACHOURI): Please complete
in one minute. (Interruptions)

SHRI E. BALANANDAN: Mr. Vice-
Chairman, Sir, in India, a big tension had
been created. The Government of India
and the people concerned have at least
saved the situation. Whatever the Central
Government has done in that is not a bad
thing, according to us.

e faoa TR WedAT: SUEHEsE HeIey,

SHRI RAJESH PILOT: They have
charged me in person. They have charged
the Government. Let me answer.

IqeMTE Heled, dgd 4 Wi, W@W TR
go R wRT W St A W@ R agy Fem
e 3N AT T N o B @R o, ST
a8 ¥ F W &, B0 %o oar & b awr o
TS e ER &, S @ A8 o g W F
da ¥ g 9 98wl w9 A A A @ P
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SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY (Pon-
dicherry): This is an allegation against the
Minister?
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SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY: With-
out hearing the Minister, why are 'you
making a noise?

M IEw SHRE WU ¥ geem-geen
3T @M B ¥ fF gm ol s W @ wwE
g ¥ o o] Oy ¥ R wEA ¥ o9 oW
as w ¥

IqquTemy (i v Teirdl): e ket
B A ol T F AN L (EAEm)..

oft I S T T €, ST 9t )
Y T R L. (FEGE) ... 98 Geer-gedt
FA R L. (FEEW) ...

st T wder: R A @ wd
.. (58aEq)...

st fellet e agdd: RenEivm W
FUT 31BN 2 ... (SR ... ITH AT
W WA agI AW R L. (SWEAGF)...

IuavrEas (ot Qw werfl): s dfsu
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SHR1I V.P. DORAISAMY (Tamil
Nadu): Sir, the time is 1.45.
THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI

SURESH PACHOURI): Please be sea-
ted. ...(interruptions)... 1 am requesting
you to sit down.
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R it g @2 W T 91 39 AW W o
Bm?.. (E9H) ...

PROF. VIJAY KUMAR MALHOTRA:
What is wrong in it?

qaweay (s P w=d) : = A, R
@™ = foar?

. WM umere: Gdw ¥ Sumwaw
St (caEar) ...

sit Brellait g agdd: § W IR
Al § THH Ao ¥E T & e 8% i =
aee e o o Foper om ® fe & weh
af o FeR 8 g 99 W 3 gon 911 el

*Not recorded.
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IMITFG R AT Shag w2 @ E =8
faeipet TTe ¥ | TSSO HIew T @ A 9 A
g d= 4 3. (=@Eum)...
stk 3% T Wt A T FA )@ ¥? few @
§ Al A fre ow ¥ fusRal @ 3 W
Fgd w W A7 . (SIEEE) ..
e a@ ¥ TEA T 84 ¥, T 84 F WH
§... (sx=@9gm)...

SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY: Sir, as
Home Secretary, he was a failure.

Iawray (st o weitd): <ie. i
LI St (sEgm) .

st frehalt M wgAR: AE, W, W
s w1 wae 81 38 ¥ et 2d @
... (CAFGM) .. F I A9l {1 . (R
FGM)...

IoEaran (sht e w=hd): s s
Nothing will go on record.

ot TAV UEHL: ITNMAY TESd .. (SqA
q ) ...

st Bl e agEde

SHRI MD. SALIM (West Bengal):

o freE W gddt

IuewrEay  (sft gier wed): Sl R,
amy wiw afsu. (Eam)...

st frehat g agEdt

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI

SURESH PACHOURI): Nothing will go
on record.

ol BEva a uSgdad
Iqquraay (st Hier weitd): sw SR

...(interruptions)... It will not go on re-
cord.

s e T A

sft TR TraEe: TG waed. . (SaR
q9)...

st Breian g eREA™ i
IqawrEy (s e o= hdl) : wgdd S
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sit frdal g sl -

sft Il egeE:*

st fredrad wra wrgefdl:*

st SvEfwr wae Wyt

st fehalt g g

sit WMot ergEe:

sl Bl g s

H T aAgeAn*

st frefan 19 St

SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY:*

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI
SURESH -PACHOURI): All of you,
please sit down. Nothing will go on
rccord.

o Brera Ty agas:
SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY:*
st Bl g agdd:

SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY:*

SHRIMATI JAYANTHI NATARA-
JAN* (Tamil Nadu):

SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY:*

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHR1I
SURESH PACHOURI): Mr. Naray-
anasamy, please be secated. (Interrup-

tions).... Nothing will go on record. (In-
terruptions)...

SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY:
ot Frelra} wa agdd:*

sit wlter agEet

sht frcde g =g

sft srdftwr ZrEee*

THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI
SURESH PACHOURI): All” of you
please be seated. (Interruptions)
Please be seated. Yes, Minister.

[RAJYA SABHA]

*Not recorded.
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st TN YW WYL Teawe 9€ gl fH
T S A qE wW A€ Fen AN TN aF
Sy A T TE O Wl A (FEER)

st et EgeET: Wy W TE FE

(caam) B v 6 T@ WA S B Wkl
® uH @ @€ et ad ik fer ¥ R
fan | (sEa)

st frcirat e e & Foh S @ B
FaR Jeq X fedt waem # Fd T
(maar) ¥ @g FE wwa@ § R 9w T
ai% ¥ 9= | @ ¥ 7€ 39 I aNE A
d fr N oT o™ W TR wWE & 2
(smaar)

sft STty Tgee: F oygelt Wi agg o
€1 (AAYU) INCETE & i Frng ot ¥z |
@ A (EAA)

st Breirant e wgdd: F Yo ¥ o o
T il (|EUE)

Juauraay (s @ gE): wen s
aa 99" A W (E"EE)

sit Brelent ta s g 98 e 9@
B ¥ 1984 & <0f & off Gpfamew & (sSx@am™)
FoSen & umA # AN G0 Agq J| A W@
F ooR wm Y Ao e W e @
7GR, (SFAR)

st TrltyT SO WY a9 o =T g
& gg s e W A Tfew [@fs Tgeer S
3 w% ) (smaa) SR 9w ad FRr &
s9 99 Whet 9, A WE W F@ w4
gofele T@ S W 9E wWE R )
(Haa=)

SHRIMATI JAYANTHI NATARA-
JAN: Sir, we don’t want to have any
explanation from Mr. Mathur. There are
other issues also. There are many States
in the country. (Interruptions).

oft T wraeR: ¥ wgd fEwagds o
wew wigdl F 3R W ) g e |gm
W o ff v WeE F TS GOR & 5
wa Yy FfF T P " 7 w2 o W ad
A Fdm i w1 92 Sk IEF | TR
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mmﬁﬁmﬁgaﬁfm%@z
mg:mm&wmiwﬁwﬂﬁmﬁﬁ
TR TN € R N Hieee e 3
¥ wER T 2T F0it | - T 99T Gl
WRAw ) N e T
e ! %309 ¥ 9@ & g el I
% ] &0 ¥ (SHEEE)

W faera FER TeREn  (Reel): o
e # iR wEe ¥ @ sl e wmy &4
(sEgrE) T BRI @ wEEEeRR 3
W w1 (smEgm)

SHRI RAJESH PILOT: Let me assure
the House...(Interruptions). 1 would like
to assure the House that the Government
will leave no stone unturned and will not
allow any such force which can damage
the secular fabric of the country...(Inter-
ruptions). There can be charges against
the Government. But, the Government is
not bothered about the charges. The
Government is committed to this role and
it will fulfil this role. All the communal
forces will be rooted out from the coun-
try. This is the commitment of the
Government. There is no doubt about it.
Thank you.

st NI AW WG UH FH R 55
A Y W B ¥ MY IHR I DR |
(saea) S ge 0 e e o1 9
S AU TH T ¥ (SEA™)

RE: CHANGE IN NAMES OF
CONNAUGHT PLACE AND
CONNAUGHT CIRCUS.

Mo fFm T AR wed (Reel): swwrag
TR, FAAE O R gOe 98 9 W w 9@
angd gon b Fe Q| IR e whW H AW
@ W TohE e ol sfeumid d a B
T oW WA § 9 9| {.. (EUT)

(summiemsr (st &fte  AroaorETd)
dlerd gu)
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2 pom.

o @ TR R AW g @ e Reaw
22 @ fufrex " 3 S 98 W A @ W
fafrey res @ Ig U fRe @ 5 3w e
X H AW G 7 AT IR T M F o
¥ 2 Iy weE, J Reeh e
S W W W o R, S 3 e Y W™
frmn ®, SW a® fo@n ¥ ¥ : “The
Chairperson of the New Delhi Municipal
Council may, with the sanction of the
Council, determine the name or number
by which any street or public place vested
in the Council shall be known.”

77 R fak = ool gfrae Afea &
o ¥k &) s ot o T } f5 ¢ No
person shall destroy, remove, deface in
any way or injure or alter any such name.

| g A AW o el gia FA Y W
¥ TR o W SR foeed SafR B AR @
I B A A e e Sfew @ S
& awd @1 se fer ¥ Rra o ®
IR W =R YW W D IR A s B
TehdT ® | B fIfRER WR" R 3PR 50 T W
i, @ SN g 9, F TH AR W I
Faae 9 g6d 2 R FawE F 9 3 99
fifrer @ @ 99 w9, @' g wew ad)
sy waed, ¥ 9w wen aed § R 8w
ffrer wed R+ wfger T o) W oo
a1 S A ¥ e ¥ R A W T
Worn }1 3@ W A and o = Ree gfngw
#ae 3 A Whegyw ww T A, W A9
€ fora 1 o 3u% Y g W =9 o G
X G | IGEIIEY, JE W T@ A Q ¥, T8
W S ST GEd W P I ], 36w
& 2 ffred 3 S fad) Roel & e Skl
fogl, Rt ardiom @ e, 3 ke
ofreE WA @ A, SER ¥ O s
o § ) 9% SR 1976 o wan ¥ g
e ® & : The question of renaming of
streets, roads, etc ... (Interruptions) ...

SHRIMATI JAYANTHI NATRAJAN



