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ley; the rest 9/10 is a hill area. The road is 

just near Indo-Myanmar borders in the hill 

district of Ukhrul where, about 25 kms., belt 

the Army does not allow the PWD people to 

enter and do their works. They chase away 

the PWD people while they do their work. 

Since a large portion of Manipur is a hill 

area, exploitation of the hill areas is very 

much important for the development of 

Manipur. The State Government is taking a 

very keen interest in the development of hill 

areas. But now the Army which is posted on 

the Indo-Myanmar border is preventing the -

construction of roads. 

We all know that the road is very 

important for economic development. It is 

recognised all over world. In this connection, 

Sir, The Chief Minister of Manipur has 

already written to the Defence Minister, Mr. 

Mulayam Singh Yadav. However, no reply 

has come yet. 

If this situation is allowed to continue, the 
laying of roads in the hill areas would come 
to a stop. Already, in the wake of this 
obstruction, the construction of more than 
250 kms. of road covering seven roads has 
been affected. Therefore, while drawing the 
attention of the hon. Defence Minister this, 
through House I would like him to look into 
this matter. This is an undeveloped area. In 
the context of the Common Minimum Prog-
ramme of this Government, attention should 
be paid to such backward areas. 

Thank you. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI MD. 

SALIM): Shri S. Niraikulathan. There should 

be no disturbance now. It is his maiden 

submission. 

Need to Enhance the Financial Assistance 
under Jeevan  Ohara Scheme to SC/ST 

and Backward Classes Farmers 

*SHRI S. NIRAIKULATHAN (Tamil 

Nadu): Mr. Vice-Chairman, Sir,.before I 

begin my maiden speech, I express my 

*English translation of the original speech 
delevercd in Tamil. 

profound gratitude to my revered leader Dr. 

Puratchi Thaivi, who has sent a commoner 

like me to this august House. But for the 

benevolence of the General Secretary of 

AIADMK, Goddess of the poor, former Chief 

Minister of Tamil Nadu, and our guradian 

angel. Dr. Puratchi Thalaivi Annai 

Jayalalitha, I would not have been in this 

hallowed assembly of hon'ble Members. 

I also thank the Chairperson for permitting 

me to make my special mention. Sir, I wish 

to refer to the Million Wells scheme known 

as Jeevan Dhara introduced by the centre for 

helping the poor farmers belonging to SC/ST 

and backward classes. Though this scheme is 

generally beneficial to the farmers, I feel it 

my duty to bring to the notice of the centre, 

the necessity to modify this scheme for better 

results. 

Under this scheme, Rs. 40,000 is given as 

financial assistance to small and marginal 

farmers for digging up open well for 

irrigation. This amount is generally insuf-

ficient for constructing a well for the purpose 

of irrigation. Only in areas where the water 

table is on a very upper level, a 40-fcet deep 

open well can provide water for irrigation. 

But in dry regions like Ramanatha-puram 

district, 40-feet deep open wells constructed 

under the Jeevan Dhara scheme remain dry 

and the disappointed farmers are unable to 

cultivate their lands without water for 

irrigation. Even the report of the geologists of 

Ramanathapuram district says that water can 

be obtained only if a tube well of more than 

150 feet is sunk into the open well. The 

report states, "after completing the well, bore 

well may be sunk upto a depth of 30 to 40 

meter below the open well for better yield". 

This is the report of the Assistant Director of 

Geology of Ramanad district. 

Sir, I am only trying to point out as to how 

both, the spirit of the scheme and the order of 

the Government arc contrary to each other. 

Because of this, small and 
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marginal farmers of Ramanathapuram district 

belonging to SC/ST and backward classes are 

not able to derive the benefits of Jeevan 

Dhara scheme, even though they arc getting 

rupees 40 thousand financial assistance. 

These poor farmers do not have money for 

sinking 150 feet deep tube well in the open 

well for obtaining water. One can see a 

number of 40 feet deep dry wells in my 

district of Ramanathapuram. Therefore, 

Jeevan Dhara scheme has remained a mirage 

for the farmers of Ramanathapuram district. 

Mr. Vicc-Chairman, Sir, I wish to make a 

few suggestions to the Government for 

making this scheme more useful and 

beneficial to the farmers. While I say this, I 

am reminded of the inaction of the present 

D.M.K. Governnment on the matter. The 

D.M.K. Government in Tamil Nadu is busy 

celebrating its 100 days in office. Therefore, 

I appeal to the centre to enhance the financial 

assistance from Rs. 40,000 to Rs. 80,000 at 

least. 

THE MINISTER OF SURFACE 

TRANSPORT (SHRI T.G. VENKAT- 

RAMAN): Sir, I am on a point of 

order...... I am on a point of order. Sir. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI Md. 
SALIM): Mr. Niraikulathan, just a minute. 

SHRI T.G. VENKATRAMAN: Sir, he 
can't comment upon what is going on there 
with regards to programmes and other things. 
The Chief Minister has said something there 
with regards to certain programmes and all 
that. He is referring to that. But he can't do 
that here. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI Md. 

SALIM): Without referring to anyone who is 

not in the House, please conclude your 

speech. 

SHRI R.K. KUMAR: (Tamil Nadu): It is 

not an accusation on anybody. 

SHRI N. THALAVAI SUNDARAM 
(Tamil Nadu): What is this? If you want you 

can reply to it later. 

SHRI S. MUTHUMANI (Tamil Nadu): 
He is only referring to the problems of poor 
farmers in the rural areas... .(Interruptions) 

SHRI S. NIRAIKULATHAN: Sir, the 

amount of 40 thousand rupees for digging up 

an open well was fixed several years before. 

Due to inflation and price rise the cost of 

construction of a well has escalated. 

Therefore, this financial assistance should be 

raised to at least Rs. 80,000. The 

Government should give the farmers the 

option to have cither open well or tube well 

according to the requirement of the area. 

While open wells can be constructed in areas 

where the sub-soil water is in upper level, 

farmers in dry areas like Ramanathapuram 

district should be allowed to sink tube wells. 

Then alone farmers belonging to SC/ST and 

Backward classes would be able derive the 

benefits of this scheme. 

Our hon'blc Prime Minister hails from 

peasant's family. He knows the difficulties 

and hardships of farmers. So, I am hopeful he 

would modify the Jeevan Dha-ra scheme and 

enhance the financial assistance under the 

scheme. I urge upon the Government to make 

the announcement in this regard during the 

current session, itself. With these words I 

concludes 

Devastded   Caused   by   the   Floods   in 

Bihar 

 


