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shifting charges and 25 decimals of 
homestead. In addition payment is made to 
compensate for house and lands acquired in 
the submerged area. 

According to the Orissa Rehabilitation 
Policy Act, 1994, a displaced family is being 
given assistance of Rs. 64,000/- for purchase 
of house plot, construction of house and 
purchase of cultivable land. Besides this a 
rehabilitation assistance of Rs. 500/- per 
month is given for one year from the date of 
displacement. 

DTC Bus sheds on Noida Road 

24. SHRI O.P. KOHLI: Will the Minister 
of SURFACE TRANSPORT be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether it is a fact that no DTC bus 
sheds have been provided on the NOIDA 
Road across Yamuna consequent to which bus 
commuters have to face the vagaries of the 
season; 

(b) if so, the steps Government propose to 
take to provide bus shelters on NOIDA road; 
and 

(c) if not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF SURFACE 
TRANSPORT (SHRI T.G. VENKAT-
RAMAN): (a) Yes, Sir. 

(b) and (c) Construction of bus sheds is a 
continuing process depending upon the 
availability of funds. It has not been possible 
for D.T.C. to construct bus sheds on all the 
bus stands due to paucity of funds. 

 

 


