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Intcrnalisation of Higher education 

3976. SHRI JAGIR SINGH DARD: DR. 
SHRIKANT RAMCHANDRA 
JICHKAR: 

Will the Minister of HUMAN 
RESOURCE DEVELOPMENT be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether Government realise that the 
internalisation of higher education is first of 
all a reflection on the universal character of 
learning and research; 

(b) whether Government also realise that 
this is reinforced by .the current process of 
economic and political integration as well as 
by the growing need for intellectual 
understanding; and 

(c) if so, what steps arc being taken to 
achieve this? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION IN THE 
MINISTRY OF HUMAN RESOURCE 
DEVELOPMENT (SHRI MUHI RAM 
SAIKIA): (a) to (c) The Government is 
aware of the worldwide transformation 
taking place in the higher education sector. 
The various agencies and authorities 
involved in the higher education sector are 
continuously assessing the situation and 
trying to respond to the emerging challenges 
and opportunities. This is an on-going 
process. 

Among other initiatives, the University 
Grants Commission is also implementing 
Cultural Exchange Programmes, with about 
70 countreis, for fostering international co-
operation in the field of higher education. 

Improvement in the working of Regional 

Engineering Colleges 

3977. SHRIMATI JAYANTI 
PATNAIK:     Will     the     Minister     of 
HUMAN RESOURCE 
DEVELOPMENT be pleased to state: 

(a) whether there is a need to improve the 
working of the Regional Engineering 
Colleges (RECs) in the country; 

(b) Whether Government propose to make 
any review with a view to improving the 
standard of educaiton and also the working 
of RECs; 

(c) Whether any panel is proposed to be 
set-up for the purpose; and 

(d) if so, the steps taken in the matter? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION IN THE 
MINISTRY OF HUMAN RESOURCE 
DEVELOPMENT (SHRI MUHI RAM 
SAIKIA): (a) to (d) A High Power 
Committee has been appointed by the Central 
Government with Dr. R.A. Mashelkar, 
Director-General, Council of Scientific and 
Industrial Research (CSIR) as its Chairman 
and eminent experts as its Members to 
conduct an overall reivew of the RECs and 
suggest ways and means to improve the 
standard and performance of these institutions 
as leaders in technical educaiton. The work of 
the Committee is in progress. 

 

 


