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Cochin-Madura National Highway 

1747. SHRI THENNALA BALAK-
RISHNA PILLAI: Will the Minister of 
SURFACE TRANSPORT be pleased to state: 

(a) whether Government fixed the 
length of Cochin-Puthencuze route in the 
Cochin-Madura National Highway, 

(b) if so, the details thereof; and 

(c) if not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF SURFACE 
TRANSPORT (SHRI T.G. VENKAT-
RAMAN): (a) No, Sir. 

(b) Does not arise. 

(c) The Survey and Investigation is in 
progress and the alignment can be fixed only 
after Survey and Investigation if completed. 

Missing Women 

1748. SHRI SUSHILKUMAR SAM-
BHAJIRAO SHINDE: Will the Minister of 
HOME AFFAIRS be pleased to state: 

(a) the number of missing women, as per 
latest records available in the coun-try; and 

(b) whether it is a fact that a large number, 
of them find their way to brothels or 
otherwise pushed into flesh trade? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS (SHRI 
MOHD. MAQBOOL DAR): (a) and (b) No 
specific information regarding the number of 
missing women is avail able. However, 
according to available information, there were 
12,998 cases of kidnapping and abduction of 
women and girls in the country during the 
year 1994 

for various purposes as per details given 
below— 
 

Prostitution: 
Other purposes: 

299 
12699 

 Total: 12998 

The registration, detection, investigation 
and prevention of crime is primarily the 
responsibility of the State Governments. 

 


