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REPORTS OF THE DEPARTMENT- 
RELATED PARLIAMENTARY STAND 

ING COMMITTEE ON SCIENCE 
AND TECHNOLOGY, ENVIRON 

MENT AND FORESTS 

SHRI      K.       RAHMAN      KHAN 
(Karnataka): Madam, I beg to present 

the    Twenty-fourth    and    Twenty-fifth 
Reports (in English and Hindi) of the 

Department-Related Parliamentary 
Standing Committee on Science and 
Technology and Environment and Forests 
on the Demands for Grants (1995-96) of the 
Departments of Scientific and Industrial 
Research and Electronics respectively. 
...(interruptions)... 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: My mikes' 
buttons are switched on, and his mike's 
button is also pressed. There is something 
wrong, no? My voice also is not coming on 
mike. There is something wrong with the 
mike. They will find it out. 

REPORTS AND MINUTES OF THE 
STANDING COMMITTEE ON URBAN 

AND RURAL DEVELOPMENT 

 

 

MOTION ON THE SITUATION IN 
CHARAR-E-SHARIEF 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Under rule 
167, Chairman has permitted a discussion 
on the situation in Charar-e-Sharief. Four 
hours have been allocated for it. We are 
starting at 12-30. If Members feel that there 
should be some more time, then, I feel that 
we can suspend the lunch hour and continue 
the discussion. 

DR.    MURLI   MANOHAR   JOSHI 
(Uttar Pradesh): No, no. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Okay, it is 
entirely up to the House. 

SHRI S. JAIPAL REDDY (Andhra 
Pradesh): There should be lunch break. 
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THE DEPIHY CHAIRMAN: Okay, as 
you like, as the House agrees. 

 
THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: What I am 

saying is that it is entirely up to the House. I 
am sitting here to discuss this. So, I will ask 
...(Interruptions)... Please. 

Mr. Jaipal Reddy to initiate the 
discussion. The time has been allocated 
according to party strength. 

SHRI S. JAIPAL REDDY: Madam, I rise 
to speak on the situation in Kashmir with 
more anguish than anger. I am also speaking 
with a tremendous amount of despair. We 
are not able to.throw this Government out, 
and this Government is surviving from day 
to day with a manipulated majority. This 
Government does not have the competence 
to govern the country properly. Nor does 
this Government have the grace to resign. 
So, this is a case of despair so far as we are 
concerned. 

You may kindly recollect, Madam, that I 
happened to raise the matter on Wednesday 
morning, and the destruction of the Charar-
e-Sharief Shrine took place in less than 24 
hours from that point of time. This is a 
tragedy of the first magnitude. The shrine is 
sacred for everybody. Any shrine of any 
religious group in any part of the world is 
sacred for everyone. The uniqueness of this 
shrine lies in the fact that it was sacred for 
both the Hindus and the Muslims. 

Though the tragedy took place four days 
back, I am really perplexed at the lack of 
proper response from the Government. The 
Government was not ready with a suo motu 
statement. In other words, the Government 
does not know how to react to the situation, 
though so much time has since passed by. 

This incident could take place because of 
monumental incompetence. In fact, all my 
command over vocabulary, limited as 

it is, gets exhausted. This Government 
alternates from one blunder into another. 
The handling of the issue was characterised 
by ineptitude, blundering, bungline, 
floundering. I must say the Peter principle 
has come into operation for this 
Government. This Government has risen to 
its level of utter incompetence. Whenever 
things go bad, our Prime Minister has one 
magic solution. He takes over. He takes 
direct charge. And what happens? The bad 
things get worse. I am really amazed at the 
Midas touch that our Prime Minister is 
blessed with. 

Should anybody take responsibility in this 
Government for what happened in Kashmir? 
Did anybody even offer to resign? Should 
not heads roll? Should all things go without 
any punishment to anybody? In the instant 
case the only person who should be held 
accountable for this bungling is the Prime 
Minister. I think he should resign in all 
grace. I have no illusions about his 
inclination to respond to my suggestion, but 
all the same I must make this demand and 
place it on record. 

Madam, when hazratbal was under siege, 
it was for any Government to foresee that 
this would come next. What was easily 
foreseeable, was not foressen. I understand 
from my own authentic sources that even 
before the shrine was occupied by the 
foreign mercenaries, the Government of 
Kashmir knew about such a possibility. We 
are all aware that our authorities do intercept 
the messages that Pakistan and its agencies 
keep transmitting to its agents in the 
Kashmir Valley. My reliable information is 
that the Government through intercepts of 
such messages, knew full-well that this 
would be occupied by foreign mercenaries, 
militants and terrorists. When you are so 
forewarned even if you could not foresee, 
why did you fail to forestall? Everybody 
knows it was a wooden structure. It was, 
therefore, highly inflammable and 
Therefore, highly 
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vulnerable and it was under occupation by 
foreign mercenaries for more than two 
months. The Government, of course, 
exercised restraint, but with what effect? 

I would like to ask another question. I am 
not opposed to elections in Kashmir. 
Political process is unavoidable and election 
is an integral part of the political process. 
But, why did you talk of elections even 
before the shrine was cleared of these 
foreign mercenaries? Why did you play into 
the hands of these foreign mercenaries? 
Why did you play into the hands of the 
Government of Pakistan? When the shrine 
was in under the occupation of those 
elements, the Government could have 
mounted an international diplomatic 
propaganda offensive about the manner in 
which this shrine was being defiled and 
desecrated. 

Did you do that? Did you take the 
Opposition to Kashmir? Did you at least 
educate the people of Kashmir? If they had 
been properly educated, they would not 
have reacted in the manner they did after the 
shrine was destroyed. Now, the authorities 
say, the operation is over, but the patient is 
dead. The shrine is not there any more. 
What is worse, Madam, the arch villain of 
the piece "Major" Mast Gul, managed to 
escape under the cover of darkness. He is 
still supposed to be hiding somewhere in 
Kashmir, one is not sure. You did not save 
the shrine. You did not catch the thief. What 
right have you got to stay in office? Madam, 
now, what is the situation in Kashmir? We 
were told—some of us felt—that the 
situation in Kashmir was improving bit by 
bit; therefore, you thought of elections, you 
talked of elections. Now, the situation is 
back to square one. The situation is as bad 
in the Valley today as was ever before. So, 
where do we go from here? I will join the 
Government in denouncing the diabolical 
designs of Pakistan. Pakistan undoubtedly 
has played a vicious, villainous part in this 
cynical tragedy. We are all one on that. 
There cannot be two opinions on that. But 
we cannot be one when it comes to 

assessing the performance of this 
Government. Madam, though we have 
raised the matter—I am confining myself to 
the present situation because the scope of 
the debate is primarily limited—I would 
like to ask who is going to speak for the 
Government in the House. We have the 
Home Minister here. The Home Minister, of 
course, is not dealing with Kashmir. Ido not 
know what he is dealing with. I know what 
he is not dealing with but I do not know 
what he is dealing with. Kashmir is being 
handled by the Prime Minister directly. 
Therefore, Madam, I demand the Prime 
Minister come here before the House at any 
part of the day or in the evening. I know 
that he is busy in the other House. The other 
House is equally important. There is not 
question about it. Both Houses are equally 
concerned with the matter. It is a matter 
paramount concern for whole of Parliament 
and for the people of India. The Prime 
Minister should come before the House and 
explain his own failure. I don't expect him 
to respond adequately. Of course, people 
will teach a proper lesson to him and to his 
party for the tragedy they could not 
forestall. 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA (West 
Bangal): Madam Deputy Chairman, it is 
extremely painful for this House to discuss 
the sacrilege of places'of worship in rapid 
succession. We- have discussed the 
sacrilege of places of worship on a number 
of occasions in the recent period. It is not 
only painful but it gives a serious 
dimension to the political environment of 
the country. There are important factors 
associated with the development. Number 
one is the role of Pakistan, its henchmen 
and the game-plan. Number two is the 
failure of the Government to prevent of 
conspiracy. Number three is the impact of 
the burning-down of the place of worship 
on the religious-minded people not only of 
this country but also the world over. That is 
where the complexity lies. The fourth Is the 
consequence of this deplorable de-
velopment on the democratic process and 
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the restoration of normalcy in Kashmir. 
These are all vital fundamentals associated 
with this development. 

On the question of Pakistan's involve-
ment, there can be no different opinion. It is 
extremely tragic, Madam, that Mrs. Benazir 
Bhutto, who fought fundamentalism at the 
beginning of her political career, one who 
had been a victim of military rule, now 
seems to be stepping into their shoes, and it 
is unfortunate, Madam, that the present 
ruling circle of Pakistan, headed by Madam 
Bhutto, is too cunningly plaing the anti-
India card to protect her pwn power and 
cover up her own failure in her own country. 
Unfortunately, madam, the Government of 
India is also harping only on the role of 
Pakistan and refuses to realise the mistakes 
that it has committed and take corrective 
measures. That is where the painful 
comparison lies. Madam, the failure of the 
Government of India is absolutely clear. 
Why is it clear? It is clear because the 
Government had information beforehand. 
The failure of the Government is clear 
because that place was under siege for 
months. The failure of the Government is 
clear because they knew that the militants 
and their patrons in Pakistan would take all 
possible steps to ensure that the situation in 
Kashmir did not become normal. This was 
the normal political understanding that the 
ruling party in India and the Prime Minister 
should have had. They should have foreseen 
it. If they had not foreseen it, that was the 
beginning of the failure. When the 
conspiracy was well-known, why was a pre-
emptive action not taken? I do not go into 
other details. The game-plan was known; 
the master-mind behind the conspiracy was 
known; it was known that Pakistan and her 
henchmen would be doing all, that was 
possible to prevent the democratic process 
in Kashmir, it was all well-known. The 
point is, if it was well-known, what was the 
pre-emptive action that the Government had 
taken? This is the explanation that the 
Government   must   give   to   the   nation, 

what the Government was trying to do. It is 
hot a question of inaction alone. It is not a 
question of normal failure. It is not only a 
political failure, but also a military failure.    
It    is   also   an   administrative failure. 
What could have been done? My friend 
wants to know from me what could have 
been done. That is precisely what I would  
like  to  ask the  Prime  Minister. That   is   a   
question   which   the   Prime Minister 
should answer, not I. The point, Madam, is, 
the siege was continuing for months.  Did 
any Cabinet Minister visit the place during 
this period? It was left to the Governor. It 
was left to the local administration.  It was 
left to the local people. No Minister did visit 
the place. The   Opposition   was   not   taken   
into confidence. Not only that, but also the 
Government   did   not   issue   any   public 
statement saying that a  conspiracy was 
being hatched to destroy  that  place  of 
worship. If there was that warning from the 
Government much before the crime was 
committed, then it would have been much 
easier to pass on the buck. If the Government 
had issued a statement much before   saying,   
"We   are   apprehending militants'   action;   
we   are   apprehending destruction", the 
Government could have not  only  appealed  
to  the  world   as  a whole but could have 
also put on record publicly   its  
apprehension   of  the   game plan. If that 
was done, that would have given   much  
strength  to   us;   that  could have isolated 
Pakistan; that could have exposed   Pakistan.   
Nothing   was   done. Everything was done 
secretly.  Pakistan was carrying on in its 
conspiracy secretly. The Government of 
India was carrying on in its pre-emptive 
movements secretly. Everything was secret. 
The people were not taken into confidence. 
Therefore, the responsibility of destruction 
falls not only on  the   shoulders  of  those   
who  have destroyed it but also on those who 
have failed to stop the destruction. The 
blame has to be apportioned equally between 
those   who   have   destroyed   the   place 
and those who have failed to prevent the 
destruction of the place. Now they are on an 
equal footing. 
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Look at the news, look at the reports. The 
army and the administration are trying to 
play one against the other. They army says 
the administration has not done its job and 
the administration says the army has not 
done its job properly. Whose responsibility 
was it to co-ordinate the administration 
with the military? Whose responsibility 
was it? Surely, it is the political 
responsibility of the Government alone. Let 
us not make a scapegoat. If anybody has to 
be held responsible, it is the Government of 
India, it is the Prime Minister, it is the 
Minister of Defence and it is the Cabinet as 
a whole. Let us not try to put the 
responsibility on the Prime Minister alone. 
It is a Cabinet failure. The Government is 
collectively responsible. 

Madam, the point remains. How could so 
many militants find their place in the place 
of worship? How could so many militants 
assemble there? What was the Intelligence 
doing? It is not a question of burning down. 
Our vigilance had collapsed. Our 
intelligence had collapsed. Our 
administration had not acted. You must 
explain how it was possible for so many 
militants to cross the border and to hole up 
in a single place. How could it happen? 
You must explain how such a huge quantity 
of explosives could be stockpiled. Were 
they from across the border or were the 
supplies arranged from within the country? 
Whatever may be the reason, it speaks of a 
colossal breakdown of the administrative 
machinery, the intelligence, the security the 
military and the Government of India as a 
whole. It only proves how hollow is the 
claim that we are all protected. 

Madam, I must thank the hon. Home 
Minister for going to Kashmir. But I cannot 
thank him because he has made an aerial 
view of the ground realities. He has made 
an aerial view of the ground realities. It is 
unfortunate. If important Ministers cannot 
visit the place of occurrence and find out 
for themselves what the cause for it is, how 
is confidence going to be generated? 

1.00 P.M. 
I can understand the militancy. I can 

understand the deep threat that it poses. I 
can understand the prozimity of Pakistan. 
But I don't understand that a Government 
representative, after such a colossal failure, 
should only make an aerial survey of the 
ground realities. This is once again an 
indication of the way in which the 
Government is functioning. 

 
Very good. The Minister had a bird's eye 

view of the situation. It is very unfortunate. 
I take exception... 

SHRI MAKHAN LAL FOTEDAR 
(Uttar Pradesh): You must congratulate 
him because at least he had the courage to 
go there. 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: I must 
congratulate the Government for not 
visiting the place physically! I must 
congratulate them. I must say that this is 
not the way the Government should func-
tion. Let us have a little amount of 
seriousness. After all, this Government 
represents millions of people. Our rep-
resentatives must face the danger them-
selves to find out what the situation is. 
Everybody's life is important. We must 
face it. Without facing the situation nobody 
can counter, nobody can take the challenge 
of  what is being done in the country. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Mr. 
Gupta, the time is short. Time was allotted 
with everybody's consent. So, please 
confine yourself to your time. 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: 
Madam, I am concluding. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: You have 
overstepped your time. 

SHRI G. SWAMINATHAN: Madam, 
the same time may be given to me also. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: That is 
why  I   said,   "Let   us   not   have   lunch 
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Hour." They want to eat their cake and 
have it too. 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: Sec-
ondly, I take a serious exception to it. The 
Government's representatives were there. 
Why was it not found feasible that they 
sould meet the Press there? Why? There 
were hundreds of Pressmen there. Most of 
them were Indians. They were moving 
around and they had their information. The 
Home Minister should have met the Press. I 
am told that the Press people were forced to 
live within their places, least they should 
disturb the Minister. That is not the way a 
democracy should function. Why was such a 
curb put on the Press? He did not meet the 
Press. Not only that. A curb was also put on 
the Press. Why? Everything should have 
been transparent aftet the burning down, 
after the damage was done. After the 
damage was done the Minister had gone 
there. Why should he not meet the Press? 
He should have answered their questions. 
He should have known from the Press what 
their experience was. That is not the way a 
responsible Government should function in 
a national crisis like this. Therefore, my 
point is... 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Still you 
have a point. 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: Yes, 
Madam. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Mr. 
Gupta,... 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: I am 
concluding, Madam. 

This is a colossal failure. It only indicates 
a perpetual failure. I cannot but put on 
record that this is the Government which 
has failed to protect the places of worship in 
this country. It is not for the first time. This 
Government has failed to protect the places 
of worship in India. They have failed to 
protect the Babri Masjid. They have failed 
to protect this Shrine. Unfortunately, the 
country is paying the price for the foolish 
misdeeds of 

the ruling circle of the country. The 
religious-minded people feci hurt when 
there is a sacrilege. This is not a question of 
any party. The point is the religious 
sentiment of the country is hurt. It is 
because of your inaction, thorough inaction, 
and your failure to protect the religious 
places and that is making the Indian 
situation very complicated. Despite that, I 
believe that the only solution in Kashmir is 
democracy. The electoral process must not 
be hindered. There may be a change of 
time-table. I don't mind that. 

By amending the Constitution, by post-
poning the elections, I do not think the 
situation will improve. I believe that a 
democratic set up is a bullet-proof set-up 
than the bullet itself. Therefore, despite 
everything, despite condemning the actions 
of the Government, I think the electoral 
process and restoration of democracy in 
Kashmir should definitely be initiated. It 
should not be hindered because if we do 
that, we shall only fall into the trap of the 
ruling circles of Pakistan. Thank you. 

SHRI SANGH PRIYA GAUTAM: Who 
will they vote for? 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: That is 
for the people of Kashmir to decide 
...(Interruption)... This is how we 
complicate the Kashmir issue. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: The hon. 
Chairman had cleared three names. These 
three people had give notice under 167. After 
them, I will call the Members according to 
the party. 
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SHRI R.K. DHAWAN (Andhra Pradesh): 
Madam, Deputy Chairperson, I am thankful 
to you for giving me this opportunity for 
sharing my deep anguish and sorrow at the 
happenings in Kashmir, the sufferings of 
those people and the sentiments of different 
communities of this country that have been 
hurt. As all of us know, the Shrine was not 
only a place of holy pilgrimage for the 
Muslims but also for all communities all 
over the country. So, before I say anything, 
I want to express my party's and my own 
sympathies to all those who have suffered 
there and I share the sentiments of the 
people of the country. 

It is very unfortunate, and there are no 
words to condemn what has happened there, 
but an equally unfortunate thing is the 
manner in which my senior colleagues have 
tried to project their feelings before this 
House. Senior leaders, Mr. Jaipal Reddy, 
Mr. Gurudas Das Gupta, and of course, the 
seniormost Mathurji, have tried to choose 
the best words that they could find in the 
dictionary to condemn the Government and 
to condemn the Prime Minister. If one looks 
at the record and sees what all they have 
said, one just dose not find anything 
tangible that has been said by them. They 
are only trying to say that the Government 
is incompetent, the Government should 
resign, the Prime Minister should resign. 
This is not the first time they are saying 
this. This is the thing, this is the theme on 
which they have been harping right from 
day one when this Government took over, 
the day on which Shri P.V. Narasimha Rao 
took over the reins of the Government; they 
have been saying this. Not only they have 
been saying this, but also they have been 
praying for it. Right from the beginning, 
they have been thinking that this Govern-
ment will not last for more than three 
months, their leaders have been saying that 
this Government will not last for more than 
six months more than one or two years. 
Their hopes have been belied and they are 
feeling very sorry for it. I 

don't want to enter into it, but it could have 
been very nice on their part had they tried 
to apply their mind to go deeper into the 
issue as to what happened there and why 
and what the circumstances were that have 
led to the situation, what the duty of the 
Government was. It is very embarrassing 
that senior leaders, who know in their heart 
of hearts as to what the real difficulty was, 
what the practical difficulty involved was, 
and how it was not possible for the 
Government to prevent any pilgrim from 
going to the Shrine, are asking questions 
now. If the Government had allowed that, 
then all of you would have been on your 
heels. 

SHRI S. JAIPAL REDDY: It is entirely 
possible. 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: You can reply 
later on. Let me speak. I did not disturb 
you. Please do not interrupt mc. I am 
requesting the Chair...(Interruptions)... 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Please 
...(Interruptions)... I think, we have for-
gotten what a debate is. He has to put forth 
his views and he can question anybody's 
wisdom... (Interruption.1!)... 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: I will explain to 
you. (Interruptions) Please have patience. 
(Interruptions) They have not gone into the 
main aspects of the congestion in that area. 
(Interruptions) 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: One 
second, Mr. Dhawan. Mr. Jaipal Reddy, 
...(Interruptions)... 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: Yes, Mr. 
Fotedar, you must have been guided by Mr. 
Jaipal Reddy. We will reply to you. Do not 
worry. Mr. Fotedar is still with-
...(Interruptions)... 

SHRI MAKHAN LAL FOTEDAR: Mr. 
Dhawan should know that I am not guided 
by anybody. Nobody guided me... 
(Interruptions)... 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: I am not ac-
cepting this. (Interruptions) He is trying his 
best.  (Interruptions) 
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SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: It is a 
pity that senior leaders of the Congress 
Party are fighting among themselves on the 
floor. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Order, 
Please. {Interruptions) It is a serious dis-
cussion. Let there be order {Interruptions) 
Please maintain silence. 

 
THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Mr. 

Dhawan, one minute...Will you sit down, 
please? {Interruptions) It is a serious matter 
and that is the reason why the Question 
Hour was suspended. The Chairman has 
accepted the discussion on special 
considerations and, I think, in the spirit of 
this we should discuss in all seriousness. 
{Interruptions) Just a second, please. Mr. 
Dhawan did not interrupt anyone. He has 
his viewpoints. He has the right to say that. 
A debate means one questions the other's 
wisdom when their party's turn comes; They 
can question his wisdom. This is the debate. 
Debate does not mean that you should keep 
...{Interruptions) ... 

SHRI S. VIDUTHALAI VIRUMBI: 
Madam, he is suspecting the patriotism of 
the Opposition. It is not fair. ..{Interrup-
tions).. 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: You use the 
headphone ...{Interruptions)... 

SHRI VISHNU KANT SHASTRI: * 
THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Mr. 

Shastri, I am not allowing. I am not 
allowing {Interruptions). It will not go on 
record. Anything other than what the 
speaker, who had been identified by the 
Chair says will not be allowed. Any 
interruptions will not be allowed. If you are 
serious, then please be serious in the House 
also. Otherwise, you "will have a free-for-
all ... {Interruptions)... 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: When I am 
trying to probe their minds, they get hurt 
...{Interruptions)... They do not want to 
listen to know the realities. The reality is 
that they are empty ...{Interruptions)... 
They are absolutely {Interruptions)... 

 
SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: They are so 

much frustrated ...{Interruptions)... When I 
start saying something, they get agitated. 
{Interruptions) 

 
SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: They do not want 

to listen to know the realities. 
{Interruptions) Madam, they do not want to 
face the reality. They do not want to listen 
to know the facts. That is why they are 
trying to disturb me. There is no point with 
them except the one point and that is, the 
Government is responsible; the Government 
should resign. Thank God! Some sense 
prevailed upon them to condemn Pakistan. 
Otherwise, they would have cheered 
Pakistan in this respect! So, the question of 
condemning the Government comes. 
{Interruptions)  

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Please sit 
down ...{Interruptions). 

SHRI S. VIDUTHALAI VIRUMBI: 
This is not the way. They are questioning 
the integrity of the Opposition ...{Inter-
ruptions)... 

*   Not recorded. 
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Apoint has been raised as to why the 
militants were permitted to enter the shrine. 
This is a very pertinent point and everybody 
is concerned to know the reality about it. But, 
the fact remains that the militants entered the 
shrine as ordinary pilgrims. They did not 
enter as militants. Everybody has a right to 
go to a place of worship or pilgrimage and, at 
the time of entering, it is not the practice 
with the Armed Forces, the Army 
authorities, to stop, to intercept or to ask 
anybody not to go to the place of 
pilgrimage. If tomorrow I decide to go to a 
place of pilgrimage and after having 
entered there, I start doing something, what 
can the Government do or, for that matter, 
the administration do? 

SHRI K.R. MALKANI: Madam, 
...(Interruptions)... 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: I am not 
allowing. 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: I am free to 
express my views. You may have entirely 
different views ...(Interruptions)... 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: I am not 
allowing you...(Interruptions)... 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: Nobody is going 
to express your views. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Just a 
minute, Mr. Dhawan. What is the point in 
your Party having time, what is the use of 
other parties having time. You will have 
time to answer, to repudiate his charges. 
But, you should not interrupt someone when 
he is speaking. Otherwise, they will interrupt 
you ...(Interruptions)... and you will not be 
able to make your point. Let him speak in 
the spirit of a true democracy. That is what 
everybody is asking. Please bear with him 
and bear with me too and listen to 
everybody as I am doing. 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: It is an estab-
lished fact and is a matter of history that 

this was a very sacred shrine and the Army 
could not stop people from entering that 
place. But, look at the congestion in that 
area, how the houses are located, what their 
proximity is to each other; parameters of the 
houses and what they are made of. They are 
made of wood. If a person tries to destroy 
those things, it will hardly take ten minutes. 
You cannot go into all these things. So far 
science has made a lot of progress, but 
science has not made any instrument as such 
that one can put on an X-ray machine on the 
brain and decides and decipher as to who 
those people were who had entered the 
shrine in the guise of pilgrims and what 
were their intentions. I share your concern 
that the Government should have been more 
vigilant and the intelligence agencies should 
have been more vigilant, there should have 
been a proper screening and all these things. 
Kindly imagine the circumstances in which 
these militants entered the shrine. I must say 
that you should congratulate the Army—
although the Army should not be brought 
into the picture at this stage—because they 
have played a very laudable role and 
exercised an absolute restraint in doing it. 
We should see as to what action they have 
taken. If they had not allowed the pilgrims, 
there would have been a big hue and cry in 
the country ...(Interruptions)... When your 
turn comes, they only you can reply. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Please do 
not interrupt. 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: A lot has been 
said that the Government is in the habit of 
getting the shrines destroyed. But, they are 
forgetting the fact that there is no equation 
between the Babri Masjid and this. It 
cannot be equated with the Babri Masjid at 
all, according to my humble views. At that 
time, the circumstances were different. It 
was destroyed by a different community. 
But, here nobody is trying to say even as to 
by whom the shrine  has  been  destroyed, 
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who are the persons who have destroyed 
their own shrine and h3ave hurt the feelings 
of the other communities of the country 
which used to visit the shrine. I must say 
that nobody is applying his mind to that. 
The basic question which arises is: Who 
have destroyed the shrine and to which 
community do they belong? Instead of 
condemning that and saying that they have 
hurt the feelings of the other communities, 
they are not even touching that subject and 
they are harping only on one thing, "The 
Government is responsible; the Government 
should resign." Then they say, as to why the 
Home Minister has gone for an aerial view. 
The Home Minister has done an aerial 
survey. That is what the Home Minister has 
done in the possible time at his disposal. If 
he had gone there, held meetings and some-
thing had appeared in the Press, then you 
would have hauled him up that the Parli-
ament was meeting here and the Home 
Minister is making a statement there. With 
all the possible time that was at his disposal, 
the Home Minister did his best to utilise it 
fully and the Government has also come out 
clearly as to what it plans to do. The 
intentions of the Government have been 
made clear to reconstruct the shrine and give 
compensation to those who have suffered in 
the process. The intentions of the 
Government have been made clear. They 
say, 'No Minister'. They forget, probably 
they ignore when they condemn the 
Government, and even forget the newspaper 
reports. Mr. Ghulam Nabi Azad has been 
there for the last four or five days. He has 
been in touch with the Government. Senior 
Ministers were sent from here, the Congress 
team is also going there and so many other 
people are going there. The basic question 
is—I agree with the Opposition—the 
intelligence agencies should have been more 
vigilant. But they should be one in 
condemning what has happened there and 
they should not say anything which will hurt 
the feelings of the Army or the authorities 
who are controlling the situation. The basic 
question into which 

they should go and which they should try to 
understand is what the basic problem was 
and how they could stop it. What happens 
in other places? If pilgrims go to a place, 
they cannot be stopped. The Government 
was doing its best. They did not want to 
have a war-like situation. And why did 
Pakistan choose this time? Why Pakistan 
chose this time was the Government had 
been announcing the electoral process. The 
Government had come out with a clear 
policy that elections would soon be held 
there. So, Pakistan did not want the 
democratic system to prevail upon there. 
(Interruptions) 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Let him 
speak please. 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: Pakistan did not 
want elections to be held. They wanted to 
create a chaos. The whole House should be 
with the people, should share the suffering 
of the people who have suffered, condemn 
the role of Pakistan and they should 
demand that Pakistan should be declared a 
terrorist State. That will be their national 
duty rather than blaming and condemning 
the Prime Minister and the Government. 
They should go deeper into the question: 
What are Our neighbouring countries 
doing? 

What Pakistan is doing? Are they going to 
allow them to destroy the nation? Are they 
going to fall into such things? ; Today, it has 
happened here tomorrow ' they   will   do  it   
somewhere   else.   We we  should condemn 
the neighbouring coun- try, Pakistan, in the 
strongest possible words that we can 
possibly choose from the dictionary, if we do 
not have enough  words,  we  should  consult  
the   Oxford people to give us the words. 
With these words, I say that everything 
possible is being done by the Government. 
Thank you. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Now, we 
have to have lunch hour as the House does 
not want to dispense with. But I have so 
many names. (Interruptions) Just 
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one minute, please one minute, please one 
second. Sikander Bakhtji, just let me please 
explain. I have six names from your party, I 
have seven names from the Congress Party. 
Mr. Jaipal Reddy has already spoken. I have 
two  aames, Mr. Gujral and Mr. Azmi. Like 
this, I have so many names listed before me. 
About 24 to 25 Members want to speak on 
this. I do not mind, I have no objection. It is 
entirely up to the House to decide whether 
to have the lunch hour or not to have the 
lunch hour. If you want to have the lunch 
hour, so will it be. The House is adjourned 
for one hour for lunch. 

The House then adjbumed for Lunch 
at thirty-two minutes past one of the 
clock. 

The House reassembled after lunch at 
thirty-three minutes past two of the clock, 
The Deputy Chairman in the Chair. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: We 
continue with the discussion on 'Situation 
in Charar-e-Sharief. Dr. Biplab Das-gupta. 

DR. BIPLAB DASGUPTA (West 
Bengal): Madard, Kashmir occupies a very 
special place in the hearts of the Bengalis. 
In Bengali, we call Kashmir Bhuswarsa, 
which means 'paradise on earth'. Now hell 
has been let loose on this paradise on earth. 
The Valley which was known as the Valley 
of Peace until about five years ago has now 
been turned into a Valley of Death. 

Our first concern should be a 
humanitarian one. A large number of 
houses have been gutted. There should be 
some programme of rehabilitation to ensure 
that those who have been rendered 
homeless, those who- have been injured, 
are taken care of. I am very happy that the 
Government has promised a Rs. 15-crore 
programme for a model township there and 
also for the reconstruction of the shrine at 
the same place. I am very happy that the 
Government has made a prompt 
announcement to that 

effect. But I would like to get a categorical 
assurance from the Government that this 
pledge would be redeemed because the 
record of the Government is not a very 
good one in recent times. I do not wish to 
mention Babri Masjid because the situation 
is different here. But, certainly, one of the 
reasons why the communal situation has 
got complicated in our country is, partly, 
because of the failure of the Government to 
redeem its pledges. So, I hope that at least 
this pledge, which has been given 
categorically, should be redeemed and there 
should be no need for prompting from this 
side or for a reminder to the Government 
from this side on this issue. 

The second point I would like to mention 
is that it is a matter of shame that this 
shrine could not be protected. Not only was 
this shrine, built in the name of a Saint who 
preached communal harmony, destroyed on 
a day of religious significance—Bakrid—
but all sorts of stories are circulating as to 
how this thing came about. I don't believe 
in those stories—like some powder having 
been spread, this and that—but if there is 
any doubt, I am prepared to give the benefit 
of the doubt to our Government rather than 
accepting the stories being circulated by the 
militants. But one of the first things which 
the Government should do now, I feel, is to 
institute a judicial inquiry into the incident 
so that this issue can be settled. For 
instance, there are reports that there was a 
lot of disagreement between the Army and 
the Administration. I don't know whether 
there is any truth in it—that the Army and 
the Administration were not seeing eye to 
eye on this particular issue of how to 
handle the militants. It is not clear how the 
militants came there, in the first place. How 
could they stockpile their arms and how 
come they managed to destroy the shrine, 
when it was known that that was what they 
were intending to do? Why it could not be 
prevented is 
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something which we would certainly like 
to know from the Government. 

Then there is also the fear of bungling on 
the part of the Government because of the 
way the Government had looked at Kashmir 
over the past few months. We had a Home 
Minister who was not in charge of Kashmir. 
We had a Minister of State who was for 
some time in charge of Kashmir but not any 
more. And now we have the Prime Minister 
himself who is looking after the Kashmir 
portfolio directly. There have been so many 
changes in the Administration over the past 
few months. So it raises a question whether 
the Administration was properly geared to 
meet this challenge of the militants, and 
probably because it was not properly 
geared, this unfortunate thing has happened. 
So I would demand a judicial inquiry into 
all aspects of this issue to ensure that such 
bunglings do not take place in future, and 
also to settle the issue as to how this whole 
thing happened in the first place. 

The third point I would like to make is, 
Madam, that in view of what has happened 
now, the Government should seriously 
reconsider the whole question of holding 
elections in Kashmir in July because it is 
clear, from what has happened, that the 
situation in Kashmir is far from normal. It is 
clear that a lot of tension is still prevailing 
in the atmosphere there, it is also clear that a 
large number of people are still very 
confused and, in this situation, whether it 
would, be proper to hold elections there—
this is a question which I would like to pose 
to the Government—and I would advise 
them not to display undue haste and not to 
rush because, in any case, General Elections 
will be held after six, seven, eight or nine 
months. So, what is the point in rushing 
when time is the greatest healer?—because 
whatever wound that has been inflicted on 
the people can be healed only by time, and 
time, let us hope, is on our side, and so let 
us not try to get things done in a way which 
might 

create further complications in future. For 
instance, the political process has not yet 
started. 

I remember, in 1990 when I was a 
Member of the other House, a delegation 
went to Kashmir, and in that delegation all 
the heavyweights from the different parties 
were Members. For example, Devi Lalji 
was there, Rajiv Gandhiji was there, Mr. 
George Fernandes was there, many others 
were there. But what we found was that the 
situation was far from normal, and when we 
came back, all of us had suggested that the 
political process should be initiated. Since 
1990, over the past five years, we had 
repeated this again and again, that the 
political process should be initiated. But the 
political process has not been initiated so 
far. Now, supposing there is a poor turn-out 
in the election, someone might say that in 
Punjab there was a poor turn-out but the 
situation has been brought to normalcy 
because now there is a Government there. 
But Kashmir is different from Punjab 
becasue, elections in Kashmir will be 
monitored by international bodies; elections 
in Kashmir will be monitored by Muslim 
countries all over the world. Election in 
Kashmir is not something about which we 
can take a risk. If there is a very low 
percentage of voter turnout, if there is a 
large drop out then the clock will be.... 

THE MINISTER OF HOME AFFAIRS 
(SHRI S.B. CHAVAN): May I interrupt 
you for a minute? What makes you think 
that elections in Jammu and Kashmir are 
going to be monitored by international 
agencies? 

DR. BIPLAB DASGUPTA: I am not 
saying "monitoring." I am saying that they 
might take a lot of interest in this. 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA (West 
Bengal): They would be watching. 

DR. BIPLAB DAS GUPTA: They might 
be intrested in this. So we must be careful. 
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SHRI DIGVIJAY SINGH: You said that 
they would be monitoring it. 

DR. BIPLAB DASGUPTA: I am sorry if 
I have said so. I am amending it. What I 
was saying was that they might be 
interested in this and if they take an interest 
in this we must be very careful about what 
we do. In fact we should not do something 
which actually puts the hands of the clock 
backwards. Rather than achieving 
something it might even do damage to our 
settling the dispute on Kashmir. That is 
why I am urging the Government not to 
rush in for an election now. 

I also ask of the Government to go in for 
an introspection on why our Kashmir policy 
has failed. I am not going into its details but 
we should discuss about it. For instance 
why are such things happening in what was 
known as the valley of peace where no riot 
over took place? The people of Kashmir a 
vast majority of them being Muslims 
decided to join India in October 1947 even 
in a situation in which actually riots were 
going on in India and lakhs of people were 
being killed in Punjab. How come that 
since then the situation has deteriorated so 
fast? Why was Sheikh Abdullah impris-
oned? Why was a corrupt regime installed 
there? Why for instance later on when 
Farooq Abdullah became the Chief 
Minister and 3decleared openly "Kashmir is 
a part of India, and I am an Indian citizen" 
not enough was done to utilise that 
oppotunity to ensure that there was 
sufficient investment of whatever goodwill 
Farooq Abdullah had as our capital so that 
Kashmir could be fully integrated with 
India? But unfortunately what hap-pend 
was that Farooq Abdullah refused to let his 
party become a part of the ruling party in 
India and he wanted the National 
Conference to be separate from the Indian 
National Congress and that was his guilt 
and so he was dethroned thrown out and 
another corrupt regime was installed during 
which maybe communal elements entered 
the administ- 

ration una so on. Later on when Farooq 
Abdullah was brought back to work in 
collaboration with the Congress Party that 
further destroyed the credibility of Farooq 
Abdullah. Those who were against 
Congress but for India, turned against 
Congress and against India. So, by bringing 
Farooq Abdullah in as an ally of the 
Congress, you actually destroyed the 
credibility of Farooq Abdullah. In a sense, 
for those who were opposed to the 
Congress Party, there was no other political 
figure. Unfortunately, this is the situation. 
In this situation, we should not take things 
very lightly. 

Jagmohanji has just come. I also mention 
that it was also a blunder to dissolve the 
Jamrfiu and Kashmir State Assembly in 
1990. If Jagmohanji speaks, I hope he will 
throw some light on it. I remember that it 
was a mistake to have made Jagmohan the 
Governor in the first place becuase of what 
had happened in the past. But, secondly, his 
decision to dissolve the assembly was a big 
blunder. If the Assembly had continued, the 
situation would have been different. Rather 
than Kashmir being ruled from Delhi 
directly, there would have been some 
semblance of some representative 
Government there. This mistake was also 
made. We made many other mistakes, but I 
am not going into their details. 

Jagmohanji might remember that when 
he was the Governor, we went to Kashmir 
in a delegation. One issue which came up 
was in how many seats there was rigging in 
the previous election. There was a dispute 
between Jagmohanji and Rajivji. 
Jagmohanji was putting a high figure, and 
Rajivji was putting a low figure, but 
everybody agreed that there was rigging in 
the election. That rigging also led to a 
feeling in the minds of the Kashmiris that it 
was not for them to have democracy in 
Kashmir. That feeling of frustration might 
have been one of the reasons why we find 
that there is so muck of discontent in 
Kashmir. 
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Lastly, I want to make this point that the 
issue of Kashmir does not involve only us 
or even the Pakistanis or the Afghanis who 
have taken an undue interest in Kashmir. 
One of the things which the Government 
should have done was to write to the 
Governments of Pakistan and Afghanistan 
asking why their militants should infiltrate 
into Kashmir and what efforts they were 
making to ensure that no cross-border 
activity was permitted by them. 
we should also not forget that one of the 
reasons why the Kashmiri militants have 
been able to do so much damage to us is 
largely because of the resources they get 
from the United States through the ISl! ISI is 
a conduit through which they come. But the 
resources and materials originally come 
from the United States and other Western 
countries. For that it is very important for us 
not only to warn Pakistan or Afghanistan, 
but also the United States and such other 
countries that such activities would not be 
permitted in India. A strong message should 
go against the sponsoring of such' activities 
by these countries. I only end by repeating 
that the pledge given to the people of 
Kashmir should be redeemed. There should 
be a judicial probe to ensure that there is no 
confusion about what happened and what 
led to the destruction of this old shrine. The 
Government should also think many times 
before rushing to an election there. 

SHRI S. VIDUTHALAI VIRUMBI 
(Tamil Nadu): Madam, today we are 
discussing about a very serious situation 
arising out of the fire that took place at the 
Charar-e-Sharief. Two years earlier, the 400 
year old Babri Masjid was demolished. 
Now, the 600 year old shrine has been 
desecrated and destroyed. At the time of the 
Babri Masjid episode, our army was 
standing eight kilometres away from the 
place-of the incident. Now our army stood 
three kilometres away 

If the Government had taken the 
appropriate steps at the appropriate time, 

this incident would not have taken place at 
all. The Government of India was informed 
by the State Government during the month 
of December 1994 itselft that the intrusion 
of militants had already taken pice at the 
Charar-e-Sharief area. On 5th February this 
year, another information was given by the J 
& K Government to the Central Government 
that the self-styled Major, Major Mast Gul, 
had entered the troubled area. Apart from 
this, on 26th and 27th of April, our army 
was able to intercept a message that was 
passed on by the I SI of Pakistan to the 
militants as to what action they had to take. 
At that time there was an advice to ignite the 
shrine..- This information was provided by 
our Army Officers to the media. Ten days 
after this information was passed on by the 
Army to the Government, of India, this 
unfortunate. incident took place. On 8th 
itself, most of the places of the city, about 
two-thirds of the area, were gutted. And 
before the Government woke up, the shrine 
itself was destroyed. I want to remind one 
thing there. When Mrs. Gandhi was the 
Prime Minister, she drafted a strategy by 
which they were able to flush out militants 
from the Golden Temple at Amritsar 
without damaging place of worship. 

That is what I wanted" to remind this 
Government. Without hurting the religious 
feelings of the people, the same strategy 
could have been adopted if the Government 
of India had any intention to do it. It clearly 
shows that all these things had happened 
because of the lethargic attitude of the 
present Government. 

Madam, the militants have entered the 
Charar-e-Sharief with arms and ammunition 
and explosive materials. After that, they 
were able to camp in the town. Then, a 
factory was opened to Manufacture bombs 
in the Charar-e-Sharief shrine. They have 
manufactured improvised    explosive    
devices.    They    have 
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planted the devices four feet deep into the 
ground. That is important. They have 
planted devices four feet deep into the 
ground at various placces of the shrine. 
Then, they were ablve  to contact the Press. 
They have entered the shrine. They have 
brought in explosive materials. They have 
camped  in the town. They have opened a 
factory and bombs have been manufactured. 
They have been able to plant explosive 
devices. After all these things, the 
Govemment with hundred crores of people 
stood like a mere spectator which means it 
is a very shameful affair. 

THE VICE-CHARIMAN (SHRI V. 
NARAYANASAMY) in the Chair After 
that, they have set the city ablaze. On the 
8th May itself. In the north side of 
Kashmir, Baramulla and the centre of the 
Kashmir Valley, Badgam, 350 Kgs. of 
explosive devices, AK-47 rifles, AK-56. 
reifies and magazines were captured by the 
Army. It clearly shows that not only the 
Charar-e-Sharief town but the entire 
Kashmir Valley, the militants have sneaked 
into and settled down there. The 
Government should have protected the 
place of worship. The Government should 
have protected the people Jiving in that 
area. Instead of protecting the people there, 
instead of protecting the Charar-e-Sharief, 
the Government had announced that they 
would protect the militants and they would 
give them safe passage to go to Pakistan. 
What we expected from the Government 
was that they would protect the Indians but 
they had announced that they would protect 
the militants of Pakistan. That means, the 
Government was able to  protect the agents 
of Pakistan but they were riot able to 
protect the citizens of India. That means, it 
is a very shameful affair. 

I would like to know from the Govern-
ment whether they have lodged any protest 
with the Government of Pakisatn after this 
incident. I feel that if you have not lodged 
complaint, the Government of 

Pakistan would lodge a protest with the 
Government of India. Then, we would be 
on the defensive. Diplomacy does not 
require offering a safe passage to the 
militants out of India. India's image has 
gone down. It has taken a further dip in 
view of Charar-e-Sharief incident. The 
Government appeared on the scene only 
after the enemies did damage to the nation. 
Then, why can't the Government declare 
that the Government of Pakistan have been 
brewing a war against India? Why are you 
hesitating? ... (Time bell rings)... It is a very 
important issue. I hope that you would be 
generous. 

The Governor of Jammu and Kashmir has 
come to Delhi as told in media to meet the 
Prime Minister on the 8th May. If it is true, 
has the Governor shared this information 
with the Prime Minister? If it had been 
shared with the Prime Minister, why did the 
Government fail to take the leaderts of the 
Opposition parties into confidence? Are we 
not nationalists? We may have thousands of 
differences of opinion with the Government 
but as far as the unity and integrity of the 
country are concerned.... and if anything 
happens which is detrimental to unity and 
integrity, we will forget all our differences, 
political differences, stand together and see 
that the unity and integrity of the country is 
saved. After the Government met the Prime 
Minister and briefed him on the situation the 
Prime Minister did not want to share the 
information with the leaders of the 
Opposition. It is most shameful. I want to 
know what has happened after that. This 
happened six years ago. Actually, firing was 
resorted to on a mass rally in the Chrar-e-
Sharief. That firing has been converted into 
an inferno in the same place within a period 
of six years. Sir, apart from that, there was a 
popular Government. We are now talking 
about the unity and integrity of the nation. 
Unfortunately the Government of India did 
not want to see a family being united. The 
family was living unitedly. For petty 
political gains they divided the 
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family. They wanted to see that that 
Government fell. That Government fell. 
When the family was divided, we thought 
that only a particular family was divided 
and the Government fell. When that family 
was divided, it is not that only the family of 
Farooq Abdullah was divided, but it is also 
the Jammu and Kashmir State itself and it is 
actually the integrity of India that was 
affected much. Sir, for political gains...  
(interruptions)... 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. 
NARAYANASAMY): Kindly conclude. 

SHRI S. VIDUTHALAI VIROMBI: Sir 
when some Delhi based envoys of the 
Embassy of the European Union went to 
Kashmir to see the situation, an elderly 
person said with anguish, "You tell the 
Government of India to appoint some good 
officers in Kashmir." What does it mean? It 
means that there is no corrdina-tion between 
the local people and the local Government. 
Coordination is very essential. We have to 
find the reasons for the lack of corrdination. 
See the way in which the issue has to be 
tackled by the Government of India. 
Therefore, I hope that at least now it will 
wake up and find the reasons. Only then can 
we find the remedies. We have to take into 
confidence the local people. Only then can 
we succeed. The last point is, one 
newspaper reported that some chemical 
powder was thrown by the helicopters 
hovering over the Chrar-e-Sharief. I did not 
believe when it was reported, but some 
important people gave this information. If 
the information is correct, still I feel that our 
Army should not have done it. Still I believe 
that if the information provided by those 
particular people to the press is correct. 
What I fear is that the helicop-tors from 
Pakistan might not have intruded into 
Kashmir. In that case, our Army should 
have prevented them from hovering over 
the area. I want to know whether this is an 
untrue statement or whether we have failed 
to prevent the Pakistan  helicopters from  
intruding into 

Kashmir. ...(interruptions)... Sir, within one 
minute I will conclude. When he was 
compaining like this, another person who 
started speaking against the militants was 
hounded by the crowd. It means, only one 
person was speaking in favour of the 
Government of India, not for Pakistan. 
Only one person among the crowd said that 
it was the militants who had done this. 
When he started accusing the militants, the 
whole crowd pulled him down and said, 
"You should not say all these things." That 
is why I feel, Sir, that that would have been 
actually a false statement. If it is "true, the 
Government should state the facts. I suggest 
that the Government should appoint either a 
Parliamentary Committee and a 
Commission to equire into where the 
mistake lies. 

Finally, Sir, there is no cooperation 
between the local administration and Army. 
Unless there is cooperation between the 
two, I think it is very difficult to govern a 
State. I hope that you will take into account 
all these things and see that it docs not 
recur. Otherwise, as in Chrar-e-Sharief and 
Babri Masjid—Babri Masjid was 
demolished by the fundamentalists and 
Chrar-e-Sharicf is destructed by the 
militants—it will occur in other places also. 
In order to see that it docs not recur, the 
Government should wake up, and I hope 
that at least now it will wake up because it 
has already slept for three years, it will now 
wake up and do what is needed for this 
nation. Thank you, Sir. 

3.00 P.M. 
THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. 

NARAYANASAMY): Syed Sibtey Razi. 

 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. 
NARAYANASAMY): I have called Syed 
Sibtey Razi already. 
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13 -A-147/MP/RSS/ND/98 

 

SHRI   MAKHAN   LAL  FOTEDAR: 
He was a minister without portfolio. 

SYED SIBTEY RAZI: Yes, he was a 
Minister without protoflio. 
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SHRI  MAKHAN   LAL  FOTEDAR: He 
was a minister without portfolio. 

SYED SIBTEY RAZ1: Yes, he was a 
Minister without portfolio. 

    †[] Transliteration in Arabic Script. 
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SHRI G. SWAMINATHAN (Tamil 
Nadu); Sir, from today's newspapers we 
came to know that the hon. Home Minister, 
Shri Chavan and the Union Minister of 
finance, Shri Manmohan Singh were there 
in Kashmir yesterday. They had been 
overseeing the matter there. They have also 
promised to build the houses that were 
destroyed. The hon. Prime Minister has also 
said that the shrine Charar-e-Sharif would be 
rebuilt. Sir, the question is not of destruction 
alone. Rebuilding the shrine will not solve 
the problem. The Prime Minister had said 
that the Babri Masjid would be rebuilt. But 
no action has been taken so far. So many 
months have passed by and nothing has 
happened so far. An assurance was given to 
this House that the Babri Masjid would be 
rebuilt. But no action has been taken. Now 
the hon. Prime Minister says that the Charar-
e-Sharif shrine would also be built. But the 
credibility of the Government in rebuilding 
mosques is doubtful. Perhaps, the Congress 
Party and the Prime Minister will be 
rebuilding many more mosques. Rebuilding 
the mosque is not going to solve the 
problem 

because the new mosque cannot replace the 
old mosque. That is what I want to say. 

Sir, another matter that I want to raise here 
is that there has been a lot of confusion over 
the Kashmir affairs over a period of time. 
Even the Parliament is not aware as to who 
is in charge of the Kashmir affairs, even 
though the hon. Prime Minister has said that 
he is in charge of it. We know that the hon. 
Prime Minister is burdened with a lot of 
work. He has many portfolios with him 
which have not been filled up for the last so 
many months and years. Many Cabinet-level 
posts are vacant. I feel that with this kind of 
a truncated Ministry, with so many subjects 
and he also being not very young, his 
shoulders may not be able to cope with the 
troubles that this country is having. It has 
become almost a fire-fighting exercise 
everyday. So, in this kind of a situation, we 
have a doubt whether the hon. Prime 
Minister will be able to devote time to the 
Kashmir affairs or whether it will be the hon. 
Minister of State for Home Affairs who will 
take over this charge. The hon. Home 
Minister had taken over the charge of 
Kashmir affairs. Then, suddenly he was 
asked to get out of that position because 
there was a conflict between him and Mr. 
Pilot. The newspapers also wrote that there 
were conflicting opinions between the two. 
One Minister goes there and issues a 
statement. Our Home Minister has been very 
careful in issuing statements. But there have 
also been varying statements. Suddenly, he 
has been asked to get out of this subject. I 
personally feel that there was sort of a lack 
of confidence of the Prime Minister in his 
Home Minister because there have been no 
reasons adduced as to why when the Home 
Minister was in charge of the Kashmir 
affairs, he was asked to hand it over to the 
hon. Prime Minister. The hon. Prime 
Minister is responsible for all this confusion 
and he should be accountable for what has 
happened. 
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The only solution that the hon. Prime 
Minister seems to offer on the Kashmir 
question is early elections there. Sir, I had 
personally been to Kashmir. We have been 
going there. Some hon. Members are also 
saying that leaders of the Opposition parties 
should be taken to Kashmir. We all know 
that when we went there two or three years 
ago, we had to be escorted by a large 
number of Army men and policemen. 
Without them, we were not able to move 
from one place to another. Mr. Ghulam Nabi 
Azad and some hon. Members, were there in 
a dak bungalow and the militants started 
shooting all around us. It went on for about 
half-an-hour. You all know that in Tamil 
Nadu, except the LTTE problem, we have 
never heard of shooting and ail that. Tamil 
Nadu has been a calm State. We have not 
been having anything except the problems 
created by Subrama-nian Swamy. We hear 
only the Diwali crackers. So, we came out 
and when we were going in a jeep to 
Srinagar, I heaved a sigh of relief and told 
my driver and the securityman who was 
accompanying us, that I thought that we 
were safe now. But they said that till we 
reach Srinagar, I should not say that. I was 
really scared. They said that there may be 
mines on the road and that mines were more 
dangerous than the shooting. This happened 
about two years ago. Now, when we were 
there, we were told that the militants were 
there everywhere. The terrorists are there 
everywhere. They are there not only in those 
places that have been mentioned. They come 
in summer and then go back in winter. They 
are moving about everywhere. Sir, many 
Tamilians are there in BSF and other forces 
in Kashmir. They have been telling me that 
the militants are not confined only to one 
place but they are there in the whole of the 
Valley. They come during the winter time 
and during the summer time they go up the 
hills. So, there are these movements all the 
time. I have been told that the militants have 
been there in the Charar-e-Sharief area 

not only during this period but they have 
been coming in and going out of this area 
for several years. Most probably what has 
happened is that you have prevented them 
from going out of this area during the 
summers to the hills and then they have got 
bottled up in that area. Most probably this 
kind of a thing has happened. 

Another thing, which was also raised by 
Shri Jaipal Reddyji, is that the propaganda 
offensive has been lost by us in the sense 
that the people there are very confused 
about the situation. The newspapers are 
writing that it is the handiwork of the 
militants and the terrorists and that they 
have torched the shrine. But many people in 
Kashmir still believe that they are not 
responsible for it. I do not want to make any 
disparagement about the Government by 
giving a different idea. But the point is that 
there should have been a propaganda 
offensive to the effect that it is the militants 
and the terrorists who are responsible for 
this heinous act. Because I am very doubtful 
how many people in Kashmir, in Srinagar, 
fully take your view, hundred per cent your 
view, that it is the militants who have burnt 
their own mosque. I believe it and I believe 
it at once, but whether all the people there 
believe it is the question. Have you taken 
the propaganda to that extent? On the other 
side, Pakistan is there which is carrying on a 
propaganda that it is only the army which is 
responsible for these crimes and not the 
militants. That is the propaganda offensive 
that they are taking there. Sir, the other 
day,—I don't want to mention the name—a 
senior person here in Delhi, belonging to a 
minority religion, said that it was not the act 
of the militants. He said, "I am very 
doubtful whether it is not the act of the 
Army." Sir, if that is the kind of thinking 
around, then who is responsible for not 
taking proper course of action to win the 
hearts of the people there? That is what I 
personnal feel. Sir, 
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I want to add two or three important 
points. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. 
NARAYANASAMY): Your time is over. 

SHRI G. SWAMINATHAN: Finally, I 
will only say that the elections will not 
solve the problem. They say, "Elections 
will bring peace to Kashmir." I am not able 
to understand that logic at all because 
elections have to be held, only during the 
period of calmness when the candidates can 
contest, when people can go and vote there. 
The other day, an hon. Minister said in this 
House, "Why can't the Opposition leaders 
go to Kashmir? They can only be there 
within the bounds of the Army." If the can-
didates don't want to stand for elections and 
fear that they will be killed and the people 
are prevented from voting, I think the ground 
situation is not good for holding elections. 
Elections can come only when you prevail 
upon all these things', in that situation only 
you will be able to hold elections. The hon. 
Prime Minister seems to have a feeling that 
he should hold elections there whatever may 
be the situation, and once you start talking 
about it, ultimately the Kashmir problem will 
itself  get resolved . Three days ago, he was 
talking about holding elections in Kashmir. 
Even after this incident he was talking about 
elections. How can elections solve the 
problem? Elections can come only if the 
problem is solved. You are trying to bring 
the cart before the horse. 

 
That is what I want to say. I, on behal of of 

my party, squarely blame the hon. Prime 
Minister for this mishap. We feel that he is 
seriously accountable and he should resign. 
The people have lost confidence in this Prime 
Minister in taking the country through these 
crises. Kashmir is a crisis and we personally 
feel that he will not be able to solve either the 
Kashmir problem or  any other problem of 
the 

country, because of his nature. He takes 
decisions not very quickly and also may be 
because of his age he is not able to take the 
country forward. The country is such a big 
problem and for it we need a young Prime 
Minister who may be able to take the 
country forward so that it will be able to do 
all these things. Sir, I personally feel that it 
is high time that either the Prime Minister 
resigned or the whole Government resigned 
so that we may be able to have a sort of 
normalcy in Kashmir. The people have lost 
their belief and faith in this Government. On 
behalf of the AIADMK, I again say that the 
Prime Minister is accountable and he should 
resign. 

 
Pakistan should vacate the area of the 
Indian State, Jammu & Kashmir, which they 
have occupied through aggression, and (d) 
any attempt from any quarter to interfere in 
the internal affairs of India will be me 
resolutely. 
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SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY 

(Pondicherry): Mr. Vice-Chairman, Sir, I 
thank you for giving me this opportunity. 
(Interruptions) Mr. Fotedar, kindly permit 
me to speak. 

Everybody in this House is concerned 
about the situation prevailing in Jammu & 
Kashmir. Last Wednesday, all of us showed 
our concern on the vexed Jammu & Kashmir 
issue. It is not an issue which has been there 
for the last one year two years, three years 
or five years. It has been there for the last 
13-14 years. Each and every political party 
which came to power, whether it is the 
Congress at the Centre or whether it is the 
National Front Government supported by the 
BJP on the one side, and on the other side, a 
Government which was supported by us, 
every Government tried to solve the 
Kashmir problem. Sir, it is not a national 
issue alone. It is an international issue... 
(Interruptions)... 

SHRI G. SWAMINATHAN: No, no. 
(Interruptions).. Sir, he says that the 
Kashmir issue is not a national issue 
alone. It is an international issue. It is a 
very wrong thing...(Interruptions)... It 
can create problem for 
us.. (Interruptions)... 
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SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY: Kindly 
hear me. I am telling about the militancy 
that has been perpetuated by Pakistan. I am 
telling in the context. Why are you shouting 
without listening to me properly... 
(Interruptions)... 

 
SHRI S. JAIPAL REDDY: Sir, if he has 

made a mistake, he has right to correct 
it...Interruptions)... 

SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY: I said in 
the context of the terrorism that has been 
perpetuated by Pakistan in Jammu and 
Kashmir. Pakistan is trying to 
internationalise the issue. I said that in this 
context. Pakistan is using every forum, 
whether it is the Islamic Organisation or the 
United Nations, to raise the issue of 
Kashmir. AH forums are being used by 
Pakistan. India has always been making its 
position very clear. Therefore, we said two 
things; one, within the framework 6i the 
Constitution; and, two, within the 
parameters of the Shimla Agreement. We 
made our position very clear in this regard. 
If Pakistan is trying to internationalise the 
issue, as many of the Members have said, it 
is doing so only for the survival of its own 
political leadership, whether it is the 
Benazir Bhutto Government, or whether it 
was the Nawaj Sharif Government. If they 
did not raise the issue of Jammu and 
Kashmir, their Government would have 
been thrown out by the militants. 

Therefore, Sir, I say that all the political 
parties, i.e., the political leaderships are one 
for the purpose of solving the problem of 
Jammu and Kashmir. 

Sir, there was a very important 
propagada raised in the year 1993 by the 
BJP. It was not a true propaganda. They 
said that all the temples in Kashmir had 

been demolished. They raised this matter in  
this House and ultimately they had to 
apologise to the House that it is was not the 
case. Sir, when we see the situation there; 
the topography of area; the woodden 
constructions that are there, we find that the 
houses are in a very congested place, the 
shrine is more than six hundred years old 
and we are not in a position to identify as to 
who was a terrorist and who was not 
because of the stature of the person. They 
go into the shrine, hole themselves up and 
they try to stay inside the shrine with the 
militants. Sir, in the same House, the senior 
leaders who are here, would have blamed 
the Congress Party and the Congress 
leadership if an Army operation had been 
carried out and if there had been any 
damage. They would have said, "You have 
unnecessarily invited the trouble and 
thereby demolished the shrine." It is a very 
typical and a very difficult operation. Our 
Army personnel have to be congratulated, 
though they were not able to save the 
shrine. We have to congratulate them 
because in the winter season and in other 
difficult circumstances, they have been able 
to see that civilian casualities are not there. 
The militants who were manning the 
houses burnt this shrine. 

Sir, one point I would like to make very 
clear. The administration in Kashmir did 
not take the people of Kashmir into its full 
confidence. If the people of Kashmir have 
been taken into full confidence... 

DR. MURLI MANOHAR JOSHI: 
President's Rule is there now. Therefore, if 
the adminstration did not take the people 
into confidence then whose fault is it? 

SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY: Dr. Murli 
Manohar Joshi, you will get your chance. 
You can speak at that time. I am not here to 
reply, the Minister will reply to your 
question. The Minister will come and reply. 
Sir, or the one side there is 
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propaganda by Pakistan which has been 
supported by the querrillas of Afghanistan. 
On the other side, the youth of Jammu and 
Kashmir have been won over by the 
mercenaries to join the group in the name of 
liberation of Kashmir. The Government has to 
be very careful in tackling the situation. After 
all, wc have declared Kashmir an integral 
part of our country and we have to win the 
confidence of the people. Without the support 
of the local population it is very difficult for 
any army or any Government to keep the 
country together. Therefore, Sir, I would like 
to ask the hon. Home Minister what action 
plan they have for the purpose of taking the 
people of Jammu and Kashmir into 
confidence. 

Secondly, Sir, we had been telling in the 
international forum at one stage and the 
United States almost made up its mind to 
declare Pakistan as a terrorist State. At 
another stage, they have been discussing. 
Mr. Jaipal Reddy can refresh his mind. He is 
a genius, he can refresh his mind. Thereafter, 
they have given up that idea on the pressure 
given by Pakistan. And we have made our 
attempts to see that Pakistan is declared as a 
terrorist State. Sir, recently, the President of 
Pakistan came to India. He had a meeting 
with our hon. Prime Minister on various 
bilateral issues and I would like to know 
what the reaction of the Pakistan President 
was. I was under the impression that 
Pakistan's administration will not interfere 
with the internal affairs of the Indian 
government, especially, Jammu and 
Kashmir. I was also under the impression that 
Pakistan Government, especially the 
President who approached the problem in a 
very reasonable manner, will cooperate with 
the Government of India in solving this 
issue. But my hopes have been belied by the 
shrine being burnt by the mercenaries, the 
Afghan and Pakistan mercenaries. It has 
been belied because they have been bent 
upon claiming and 

creating problems for the people of Jammu 
and Kashmir. Therefore, Sir, it is high time. 
Sir, I also have a feeling that only an elected 
Government, a popularly elected 
Government, can solve the problem. It has 
proved successful in Punjab. But, in Punjab, 
from various quarters there was opposition 
when the elections were declared and this 
Government held the elections it Punjab. A 
popular Government was established and 
now we find normalcy in the State of Punjab. 
Sir, political process is the only solution for 
the purpose of putting an end to this 
militancy because the people will have 
confidence in the political leadership and the 
administration and the grievances of the 
people can be taken care of by the political 
leadership which is ruling that particular State 
at that point of time. Therefore, I request the 
hon. Minister of State for Home Affairs who 
is sitting here to tell what the strategy is that 
they are going to evolve because the hon. 
Prime Minister has stated that the 
Government is planning to hold elections in 
Jammu and Kashmir. Today, I find two 
different voices from the leaders of the 
Opposition. On the one side, one political 
leader says the time is not conducive for 
holding elections and, on the other side, 
others says that the political process is to be 
started and elections are to be held. But the 
Opposition is not consistent. 

SHRI S. VIDUTHALAI VIRUMBI: You 
are also saying...(Interruptions)... 

SHRI  V.   NARAYANASAMY:  You 
should follow what I am saying. 

SHRI S. VIDUTHALAI VIRUMBI: You 
said a little while ago that only a popular 
Government would solve the problem. It 
means the Prime Minister cannot solve the 
problem. Therefore, he should resign from 
his post. The Government should go. 
..(Interruptions).. If you say that the Chief 
Minister who would take office after the 
elections can solve the problem, is means 
the Prime 
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Minister cannot solve the problem. 
Therefore, he should resign from .his post. 

SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY: Mr. 
Viduthalai Virumbi, kindly hear me. I 
quoted Punjab. You have heard what I said 
about Punjab and what I said about Jammu 
and Kashmir. 

Sir, it is unfortunate that because of an 
incident which took place in one corner of 
the country, the Opposition is making a 
demand that the Government should go; the 
Prime Minister should resign. This is not a 
healthy political situation. Now, in some 
States, rioting takes place. There is a law 
and order problem. I can cite Tamil Nadu 
here. So many things are happening there. 
Has the Government of Tamil Nadu, has the 
Chief Minister of Tamil Nadu, resigned on 
that count? 

SHRI    G.    SWAMINATHAN: 
have created the problem there. 

SHRI V. NARAYANASAMI: Even after 
the Governor gave sanction for prosecution 
of the Chief Minister, the Government is not 
resigning; the Chief Minister is not 
resigning. 

SHRI S. VIDUTHALAI VIRUMBI: Mr. 
Narayanasamy, I feel that both should 
resign: the Chief Minister of Tamil Nadu 
and the Prime Minister. Both should resign. 

SHRI G. SWAMINATHAN: Both of 
them are not going to oblige our Members. 

SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY: There-
fore, Sir, I would plead with the leaders of 
the Opposition not to make such a demand. 
Let us put our heads together and work for 
restoring peace in Jammu and Kashmir. Let 
us work together to see that normalcy is 
maintained there. 

As the hon. Home Minister has said in the 
House, very clearly, and also in the Press, 
which we read, the shrine would be rebuilt 
and the houses that have been burnt would 
also be rebuilt. The people 

who have suffered in this incident should be 
taken care of; their interests should be 
safeguarded. That should be the primary 
concern of everybody. Therefore, let us, 
work together and try to solve the Jammu 
and Kashmir problem. Thank you. 

 

You
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THE      VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI 

SURESH   PACHOURI):   Mrs. Renuka 
Choudhury. ...Not present. 
Mr. Jagmohan. 

SHRI JAGMOHAN (Nominated): Sir, 
there is no doubt that physically the shrine 
has been burnt down by pro-Pakistani 
elements, bit, not a different plane, it has 
been burnt down by the timicity, hollowness 
and hesitancy of the present Indian rulers. 
Pakistan and its outfits have committed this 
crime by commission, and the Indian rulers 
have committed it by omission. Who says 
that there is no Indo-Pakistan co-operation? 
One's commission is being supplemented by 
the ommission of the other. This is not the 
first time that this co-operation has taken 
place. When Benazir Bhutto was shouting 
against me, there was an equally strong 
arrangement from this side. There was a 
vicious disinformation campaign which 
augmented the argument of Ms. Benazir 
Bhutto. Now you are blaming Pakistan. At 
that time, you virtually played the game of 
Pakistan. 

A dear friend of mine mentioned that 
when he went there on the 7th March, 
1990 I was asked to explain the position. 
While I was explaining it, a very senior 
leader, egged on by a person who is now 
a Member of the other House and who 
has        specialised in suppressing 
documented facts, egged up to tell the senior 
leader to say. "You, Muslim youth, take Mr. 
Jagmohan as your friend, put he is your 
enemy. In 1986 when he was the Governor, 
he recommended abolition of article 370." 
So, the idea was to create an impression in 
the minds of the Muslim youth that he was 
their enemy, not their friend so that they did 
not think him as their friend and they did 
not co-operate with him. This was their 
attitude then. Today, the same people arc 
saying because Jagmohan went there, the 
situation became worse. What is this? 
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You cannot cheat mathematics. You cannot 
cheat methods. You cannot cheat history. 

There was an incident on the 15th 
August, 1939, as early as that. What 
statement did he make? It was published in 
all national dailies. He was the President of 
the Congress Party. He was not a BJP man 
or Mr. Jagmohan's man. What did he say? 
He said that there was complete rule of 
Pakistan in Kashmir. He said, "Look, they 
are having a salute." 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: Did you agree 
with him at that time? ...(Interruptions) 

 
SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: Did you approve 

of that? You say that first. 

 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI 
SURESH PACHOURI): Okay, Mr. Jag-
mohan, please continue your speech. 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: You should 
speak on the issue, not on your appoint-
ment. 

SHRI JAGMOHAN: I am not speaking 
on my appointment. I am speaking on this. 

SHRI R K. DHAWAN: You are casting 
as persions on our senior leaders, which I 
cannot tolerate. 

 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI 
SURESH PACHOURI): Yes, Mr. 
Jagmohan. 

 
SHRI JAGMOHAN: Please, please. I 

have no grievance against Mr. Dhawan. 
SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: I have no 

grievance against you. 
SHRI JAGMOHAN: I am only grateful to 

you for proving my point that truth is bitter.  
...(Interruptions) 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: You have not 
spoken the truth. Did you approve of Mr. 
Qureshi's statement or not? ...(Interruptions) 
he mentioned what Mr. Qureshi had said. As 
the Governor, did he approve of it or not? 
This is the point. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI 
SURESH PACHOURI): I request Member 
not to interrupt. 

SHRI JAGMOHAN: I say that on the 15th 
August, 1989, Mr. Jagmohan was not the 
Governor of Jammu and Kashmir. 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: But, did you 
approve of Mr. Qureshi's statement? 

SHRI JAGMOHAN: What is this? Now 
you are changing the question. Anyway, on 
the 15th August, there was an incident, and 
on the 14th of August there was an incident. 
All that I am saying is what Mr. Qureshi said 
at that time that there was complete rule of 
Pakistan in Kashmir and that the 
administration had totally broken down. 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: What was your 
reaction to that? He said that in the Islamia 
College premises a regular parade was held, 
in which a 21-gun salute was taken in the 
shape of an AK-47 being fired in the air and 
no action was taken whatsoever by anyone. 
Then he says that 
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the bomb exploded "in my own house", 
"my own Maruti car was totally burnt and 
no action was taken." These were the 
conditions. I am only saying that we should 
take an objective view. It is a national issue. 
Let us not cheat facts. The fact is, I mean, 
Shafi Qurcshi Sahib, these are all published 
in the national dailies. 

Our distinguished Member, Mr. Inder 
Kumar Gujral wrote in the month of October 
a leading article in the Times of India, in 
which he said the same thing, that there was 
no Government in Kashmir. Anybody could 
switch off_ the lights from the mains and 
there was a total darkness. On the 15th not 
even Ministers had come and done anything 
on the subject. So, all that I am saying is 
about the facts. On the basis of a Parliament 
question itself in the second half of 1989, 
there were 1600 violent incidents. There were 
350 bomb explosions. There were 50 
explosions in the month of October alone. 
Tika Lai Taploo, Mr. Hal-waii and many 
others were being shot like flies in the open 
market, on the hari Singh Street and so on. 
No action was taken. Even the Station House 
Officer of Mysoma Bazar was shot dead in 
the Bazar itself and not even the police 
officers came to pick up his dead body for 
five hours. This was the condition. When I 
was sent there for the second time, the 
collapse of the Government was total. I 
would not have mentioned this but for the 
point you have mentioned. I was only 
referring to what my friend said about the 
dissolution of the Assembly. My point was 
that there was a total breakdown of the 
administration. And since I had some good 
equation with the people whom I had served 
in the past, I was telling them, "Please calm 
down, let us settle your problem, tell us what 
your problem is. "One of the major problems 
that everybody said was that they had taken up 
arms because there was arigged election. 
Everybody said that there was bigged 
election.  So we will teach  this 

 

Government a lesson, we will bring it 
down. My point is why I dissolved that 
Assembly was I wanted to take this 
argument completely out. The Assembly 
was in any case had become a dead 
Assembly. It was not functioning. It had 
no role to play. And all the national 
dailies had said that it was a cropsc. My 
point is I had to use force to save the 
union. Now, what was the moral justifica 
tion for using this force? If I had used 
this force by keeping the Assembly alive 
and trying to bring again the same callous 
and corrupt oligarchy on the ground, it 
would have locked that I was fighting and 
killing people for the bringing that oligar 
chy back on the seat; or I wanted to put 
myself in a situation when it would be 
known that was fighting on a moral 
ground, I was having moral justification 
for using the force, I was using the force 
for the integrity of the nation, for keep 
ing its unity; and therefore, I had given 
you all chances, all opportunity; now you 
have no argument to fight; if you now 
fight, then I will have to give you a reply 
in the same coin. That was the justifica 
tion for this. In any case, the dead 
Assembly was gone for the last three 
years. This was the moral and legal 
justification. If I had kept this, all the 
terrorists would have united against me. I 
wanted that out of them, the compara 
tively moderate elements should respond 
to my efforts. I accepted the job only on 
this ground that I had a good equation 
with the people. Many people had told 
me that.......... 

 
You had a glorious term first time, why are 
you going again?" There was only one per 
cent chance and that is, if you go there, you 
may be able to build some bridges there. 
That was the justification. Mr. Inder Kumar 
Gujral is my witness to that. Mr. Arun Nehru, 
the other day, wrote two articles in THE 
HINDU. He said: Jagmohan never wanted to 
go. He was sought out. And today you say 
this. 
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It is very unfortunate. Let us take it as a 
national issue. He said: He did a magnifi-
cent job on the ground. And he said: I was 
not the only one who felt that he had been 
badly treated. 

4.00 P.M. 
Therefore, I am only trying to put the 

record straight. There are so many other 
events which I want to raise but do not 
want to do so. But this was a reply to my 
friend's point which he has raised. 

The other issue which I want to mention, 
which is very important is while Pakistani 
terrorists have spread lethal mines around 
the complex, the Government had planted 
its own mines of indecision in the strategy 
of the Army, making it look like a hesitant 
force without any initiative and freshness 
of approach. The result has been a repeat 
performance of a confusion and confusion 
and confusion. 

Could there be a worse administration 
than this? It is an example of inepttitude, 
incompetence, nonumental mishandling. 
The result was total destruction of this 
historic shrine, burning of 800 houses, 200 
shops, besides consting millions of rupees 
to the poor country's exchanger and causing 
grave human misery and pain not only to 
the residents of Charar-e-Sharief but also to 
millions of others who would suffer now 
because of the fall-out of this event. I have 
chosen the words carefully. So, I do not 
want to hurt anybody's feeling. But the 
point is there are a number of unanswered 
questions which the nation is entitled to ask. 
It has been said here, "How is it that these 
people were allowed to gather in the 
Charer-e-Sharief shrine?" My distinguished 
friend had mentioned about the congestion 
around the area. I had been to Charar-e-
Sharief. 1 was the only Governor who had 
been honoured from inside the shrine by 
tare-bandi because they had much respect 
for what I was doing for the Charar-e-
Sharief shrine and for the area that was 
being developed. I have got those 
photographs with me. Later on 

when it suited our friends, they called me 
anti-Muslim. I was the only Governor who 
had been given tare-bandi there. I had 
prepared a redevelopment plan for the 
whole town. They were grateful to me. I 
know the topography of the town more than 
anybody else. I can fell you, it was very 
easy to control. Mr. Dhawan objects, "Why 
do you mention?  But I must mention 
historic facts as they are. When I went there 
there was a total collapse and hardly I had 
any force at my disposal. The civil 
administration had totally broken down. 
...(Interruptions)... 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: Mr. Vicc-
Chairman, I would like to know whether he 
is referring to this after his tenure as the 
Governor during the first time or the second 
time. 

SHRI JAGMOHAN: Second time. 
SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: I have to refer to 

the letter which he wrote to Mr. Rajiv 
Gandhi. That letter is still available in the 
records. 

SHRI JAGMOHAN: You can refer to it. 
SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: I have to refer to 

it. 
SHRI JAGMOHAN: Please listen. 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: I can produce that 
letter and lay it on the Table of the House. 

SHRI JAGMOHAN: Okay. 

 
THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI 

SURESH   PACHOURI):   Mr.   Shastri, 
.

.. (Interruptions)... 

SHRI R.K. DHAWAN: He has made a 
reference to me. So, I have to reply. 
...(Interruptions)...  Mr.  Vice-Chairman, 
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he has referred to my name. So, I have to 
reply. ...(Interruptions)... 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI 
SURESH PACHOURI): Let him finish. 

DR. BIPI/LB DAS GUPTA: Just a 
minute. He thay have differences of opin-
ions with him. But why should he not be 
allowed to speak? ...(Interruptions)... 

SHRI R.KN DHAWAN: If he withdraws 
it, I will keep quite. 

SHRI JAGMOHAN: All right, I will 
withdraw this reference. Anyhow, my point 
is that the conditions were such that it could 
be easily prevented. On my arrival there on 
the 20th January I found that all the mosques 
in Kashmir had been fitted with scores of 
loudspeakers where recorded messages and 
recorded slogans were being blared out 
simultaneously to create an atmosphere of 
terror and an intimidating atmoshphere all 
around. Even at that time, I did not allow 
any gathering in any of the mosques, be it 
Hazratbal mosque, be it Jama Masjid Idga, 
be it Charar-e-Sharief shrine, be it any other 
mosque. Because once you allow a 
gathering, then you will have a situation like 
the "Operation Blue Star" or like the 
Tianmen Square or like what has happened 
in Charar-e-Sharief recently. It is an 
elementary imagination that was required. I 
had concentrated on that. If that had not been 
done on the 26th January, you would have 
had a gathering of 15 lakh people in Idga. 
There would have been an "Islamic Republic 
of Kashmir" flag there. What could you have 
done? The whole national Press, the whole 
international Press would have covered it; 
and you would have had a situation worse 
than the Tianmen Square. I saved the 
situation. 'Vithout allowing any Tiananmen 
Squau? to happen, without allowing any 
"Bluestar" to happen, I still saved the 
situation with only 27 casualties during the 
whole ten days. I do not understand what has 
happened to us. Let us face the facts as they 
are. 

Now, in Charar-e-Sharief, for many days, 
you knew that they were coming in. Why 
could not a few metal detectors be fixed at 
the entry point? Why could not a picket be 
posted in the open ground which is outside 
Charar-e-Sharief? The bus stand is very 
nearby. Why could not a police picket or an 
army picket be fixed there? How is it that 
they were planting explosive devices inside 
the mosque and you did not have the means 
to check them? Where was the civil 
administration? (Interruptions). What is the 
intelligence. What is the administration? I 
can also go as a pilgrim and find out who is 
inside. They were Afghans. Can't you 
distinguish between a Kashmiri and an 
Afghan? (Interruptions). This simple thing 
was not done. 

That was the first part. The second part is 
about the timing. There own statement in 
the Press is that the explosion was there at 2 
o'clock. The army went in at 5 o'clock. 
What happened between 2 o'clock and 5 
o'clock? Who was obtaining orders from 
whom? What was happening at that time? 
There is no explanation for that. Who 
caused that confusion? The army had no 
instructions to do that with the result that 
within those three hours, there was a state of 
indecision, a state of confusion, and within 
that time, the whole Charar-e-Sharief was 
burnt. 

Another unanswered question is about the 
fire brigade. You bad a fire brigade. You 
had the experience and catastrophe of 1,000 
houses being burnt. You said that you fixed 
a fire brigade nearby. Where was that fire 
brigade when the fire took place? They say 
that they refused to move. Was it not 
incumbent upon the authorities to make an 
alternative arrangement knowing full well 
the attitude of  the State Government 
employees? They never co-operated with 
you in the Amarnath Yatra. They never co-
operated with you in the preparation of the 
electoral rolls. They never co-operated with 
you  in  anything.   And  did  you  expect 
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them to co-operate with you this time? They 
have been on strike for the last so many 
days and they come one day and take the 
salary and again threaten to go on strike. Is 
this government? How did you expected 
there people to co-operate with you? You 
did not even think of a second line of 
defence. What is this Government if they 
cannot even think of a second line of 
defence? 

And there was another wonderful idea! It 
is the same thing as was done in Hazratbal 
siege. Some say it was a 'siege'; some say it 
was a 'cordon'. Call it 'siege' or 'cordon' or 
by any name. Have you ever seen a 'distant 
siege two kilometres away'? Can such a 
siege or cordon be effective? Now, Mast 
Gul has shipped. He has shipped because 
your whole arrangement was absolutely un-
sound. It was unimaginative. You told the 
army to stand away. The army is not used to 
this type of decision-making. With the 
army, you have to give very clear orders. I 
had been in Kashmir for two terms. I was 
clear. I know how the army functions. You 
have to be very! clear with the army. You 
have to tell them, "You have to do this job". 
You have to give them clear advice and 
thent they will follow. You cannot say, 
"Please do this and then ask me; then do this 
and then again ask me". It is a total failure. 
You have written your failure in these very 
instructions. That is what has happened in 
Kashmir. 

There are a number of other unanswered 
questions about various other points. All 
types of things like timing, distant siege, 
etc. are there. There is one other point 
which is equally important. That is about 
the civil set-up. It was said in the Press that 
houses were burnt, shops were burnt. Lt. 
General Zaki and the Director-General of 
Police went there. After such a great 
tragedy, they went there. Eight hundred 
houses and two hundred shops were burnt 
and so many things were destroyed. What 
did they do there? They came back! Did 
they 

not think that it was necessary to prepare a 
sub-civil unit? 

DR. MURLI MANOHAR JOSHI: What 
else could they have done? 

SHRI JAGMOHAN: I will tell you. Why 
did they not think so? I mean, there was a 
total lack of imagination and mental 
alertness on the part of the Government as a 
whole. They are only functionaries of that 
Government. They came back and they did 
not even think of making an arrangement of 
proper liaison with the Army and the Civil 
Unit at that time, when the city was burning, 
when after a few hours even the Chrar 
Shrine was burnt, and they were seeking 
orders from outside as to what to do! Why 
couldn't the Director-General of Police stay 
there and coordinate with the Army? The 
truth is, he was the same Director-General 
who slipped away from the scene at the AH 
India Institute of Medical Sciences in 
Kashmir when Maulvi Farooq was 
murdered. He slipped away from that place, 
leaving the body to the crowd which 
snatched the body, took the body away and 
clashed with the CRPF and the catastrophe 
took place, without the knowledge of the 
Governor. The Governor did not know. A 
lot of shouts were made. The Governor had 
ordered firing on the crowd! Adarshwadi 
people made such statements. I mean, all 
types of Adarshwadi people made this 
statement, knowing fully well that it was a 
patent lie. And the Governor was listening 
to 600 people who had come to his house at 
that time. And it was all photographed in the 
newspapers. And still that lie was coined 
and circulated! And today you say that the 
situation in Kashmir is wrong, bad. The 
Chrar Shrine incident has happened. Today 
the nation is being punished for the sins and 
lies that they had spoken. One on the most 
vicious campaigns of disinformation was 
launched for petty political ends, for petty 
personal ends, and even now they are being 
covered-all concrete and hard facts are 
being covered; the contempor- 
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ary documents have been covered. You can 
never solve the problem if the facts are being 
covered. What is this? Will you solve the 
problem by hiding the reality? By deceiving 
the truth you can never solve the problem. 
And my only point is—I am not asking for 
the resignation of the Government or 
anybody else—I am asking for the 
resignation of the attitude which encourages 
this untruth, which encourages the lies, 
fabrication, and which will bring disaster to 
this country not only in Kashmir but in many 
other fields also. Thank you very much. 

 
 

"I repeat my offer of safe passage." 
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the Babri Masjid was allowed to be 
destroyed, was allowed to be demolished, 
there was no reaction from the Kashmiris. 
But today what has happened in Kashmir is 
very unfortunate. What compclls me to 
speak is that the Indian army which was 
regarded as a saviour and a protector of the 
people of Kashmir has now been brought to 
disrepute. The last month, many Kashmiris 
told me that whenever searches were 
conducted in Kashmir, they wanted the 
Governor to send the army and not the 
police. Such was the faith. Such was the 
trust in the army. The army is a disciplined 
force. It works with restraint. But I do not 
know how this Government brought in the 
army. We have built so many commando 
forces like the NSC and others which could 
have accomplished the task which the army 
could not. This country, this Government of 
India has a glorious tradition. In 1971, we 
made General Niazi surrender with one-lakh 
army and thousands of tanks on the soil of 
Pakistan. The war was to continue for 18 
days. But it was over within 13 days. Mr. 
Inder Kumar Gujral would remember it. 
What was there then? There was political 
will. It was a psychological warfare. That 
was the glorious tradition of the 
Government of India. But it is unfortunate 
that today, that very Government has been 
brought down to this level. We are not able 
to get hold of a person like Mart Gul who is 
on our soil and who is  in our shrine and the 
shrine is surrounded by our army. The 
second thing that I would like to talk about 
is the Governor. Many people have 
questioned as to why he was there. I am on 
record having told the Prime Minister as far 
back as November, 1991 and a|so in April, 
1992 that he would be a disaster. He did ask 
me whether this Governor could be sent to 
Kashmir. I told him that he was a competent 
General, but a very bad administrator and a 
person with no political acumen. I told the 
Prime Minister that if he was sent to 
Kashmir, he would be a disaster. 
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But the Prime Minister actually did 
otherwise. He immediately asked me to 
make an exit from the Cabinet. He perhaps, 
thought that Fotedar had misguided him. I 
have always been telling the Government, 
and the hon. Home Minister will bear me 
out, that there should be a well-thought-out 
strategy on Kashmir involving the Internal 
Security, Department of the Home Ministry 
involving the External Affairs Ministry and 
involving the Information and Broadcasting 
Ministry. I told the Prime Minister about 
this a number of times. But there was no 
response. I sent many suggestions in 
writing. But so far no committee to 
formulate a strategy has been formed. I had 
occasion to see the Pakistan TV. Pakistan 
has unleashed false propaganda against the 
Government of India and we have not 
responded to it. The question of an 
appropriate response does not arise at all. 
Similarly, I have also been telling the Prime 
Minister what wc should avoid doing in 
Kashmir. And, I have sent letters to him that 
sensitive and strategic places in Kashmir 
have to be protected. 1 feel disgusted that 
many such places were not protected so far. 
I do not know why with elections in 1993, it 
came to the mind of the Government to lay 
siege to the Hazartbal shrine and why now it 
came to the mind of the Government to lay 
siege to the Charar-e-Sharicf shrine. I have 
been saying that there has to be a policy. 
And, what policy has to be there? The Islam 
in Kashmir is different from the Islam in 
other places. Kashmiris believe in the 
catholicity of Islam. The catholicity of Islam 
has to fight with fundamentalism, which is 
Jamaat-i-Islami elswhere. This is the basic 
fight. And, this Charar-e-Sharicf could have 
been a symbol of catholicity of Islam. It is 
very unfortunate that such a place, such a 
symbol, has been destroyed by this 
Government. 

Sir, we have many great traditions in this 
House. We have many great traditions    in     
the     Government.     One 

tradition is that when we had the 1962 
debacle, Mr. Krishna Menon accepted the 
moral responsibility. Earlier, we had one 
rail accident and Lai Bahadur Shastri 
accepted the moral responsibility. The 
Congress had built up these traditions. In 
public life, there should be accountability 
and moral responsibility should be 
accepted. What has gone wrong? 
...(Interruptions)... No. I am not demanding 
anything. I am not demanding anything. I 
am only saying that the traditions should be 
maintained. 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: Sir, he 
is not demanding. But I find total 
unanimity in that understanding with him...  
(Interruptions). 

SHRI MAKHAN LAL FOTEDAR: What 
has gone wrong in Kashmir? What has gone 
wrong in Kashmir? As I said the other day, 
the Home Minister was very ably dealing 
with the subject. It was at my instance and 
Mr. Arjun Singh's instance that wc wanted 
to go Kashmir and we sought the permission 
of the Home Minister to go there. The Home 
Minister was sent to Kashmir in anticipation 
of our visit to Kashmir. It is good. I thank 
him and I should also congratulate him that 
at least he had the' courage to visit Kashmir 
at this time. So, what has gone wrong in 
Kashmir? In the past what wc used to do 
was that there was one man who was 
responsible for one job. So, what has gone 
wrong is that now there is one man for all 
the jobs. Unless these things are shared, the 
country will not prosper. So, my heart goes 
to my...(Interruptions) I do not want to be a 
part of this. (Interruptions). 

SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY: Who 
bungled on the Kashmir issue? 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: Mr. 
vice-Chairman, Sir, he should be allowed to 
speak. 

SHRI   MAKHAN   LAL   FOTEDAR: 
Mr. Narayanasamy asks as to who bungled 
on the Kashmir issue. I must tell him that I 
come from Kashmir and I have 
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had the privilege to work with great leaders 
of this country. I am neither a sychophant 
nor a mercenary. I can say with authority 
and I have said it at many places—that right 
from Sheikh Abdullah to Makhan Lai 
Fotedar, all of us are responsible for this. 
But who is responsible now? That has to be 
seen. (Interruptions) Who is responsible? 
(Interruptions) 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: Sir, 
what is this? (Interruptions) They don't 
allow their own partyman to speak. 

SHRI MAKHAN LAL FOTEDAR: I 
know it will hurt many hearts. I would like 
to say...(Interruptions)... I would like to say 
only one thing...(Interruptions)... I would 
say only one thing, Sir, that there is absence 
of any coherent or consistent policy on 
Kashmir. I think there is absolutely no 
policy on Kashmir. Secondly, the Kashmir 
situation, as of now, requires a positive, 
determined, I should say, clear sense of 
political direction, and thirdly, I feel that as 
of now no such policy on Kashmir is 
visible. If some people feel that they can 
win the people of Kashmir with force and 
bullets, then they are mistaken. Kashmiris 
of Kashmir can only be won with 
compassion, with humulity, with love and 
with a muman heart. I am sorry to say that 
all these the things are absent there. I share 
the agony of those people, the non-Muslims 
in Kashmir, who are living as refugees in 
the rest of the country, their houses have 
been burnt by the hundreds for no fault of 
theirs, but only because of the incom-
petence of the Government they returned. A 
number of temples have been burnt and, 
maybe ...(Interruptions)... I will never reply 
to ...(Interruptions)... So, I would suggest 
and request the Government, in case there is 
any Government to give same relief... 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: What 
more indictment could there be? 

SHRI   MAKHAN   LAL   FOTEDAR: 
The same attitude should be shown to- 

wards those whose houses have been burnt. 
All those houses of minorities and the 
refugees should be built at Government's 
cost. This is my request. 

Last but not the least, I would request the 
Home Minister to please apply his mind in 
dealing with the situation as he has dealt 
with such situations in the past. I offer my 
support to the Home Minister in dealing 
with the Kashmir situation. With these 
words I thank you very much. 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: The 
debate is completed. Let the Prime Minister 
come and reply to the debate. 
...(Interruptions)... 
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SHRI V. KISHORE CHANDRA S. DEO 
(Andhra Pradesh): Thank you, Mr. Vice- 
Chairman. 

I have been listening to the debate since 
the time it started. What has happened in 
Charar-e-Sharief is a matter of shame; 
something which deserves to be 
condemned. I think most of my colleagues 
from all sides of the House have done that. 
But, unfortunately, during the course of the 
debate, I found that some of my colleagues 
went down to a personal level. I was really 
sorry to hear that. 

Certainly, Mr. Vice-Chairman, I am not 
one of those who would like to believe that 
everything in Kashmir was normal and all 
right before 1991. Nor am 
I one  who would like to believe my 
colleague, Mr. Jagmohan, would bear me 
out that everything would have been 
all  right had he continued as Governor. 

5.00 P.M. 
He might  have done something good-  that 
is a different matter. But the 
situation there has development over a 
period of time, and I don't think the solution 
to the Kashmir problem is as simplistic as 
someone continuing as Governor or 
somebody being in or out of power. These 
things do matter, but they are incidental as 
long as we strike at the very root of the 
problem. 

Mr. Vice-Chairman, the monument of 
Charar-e-Sharief, as many of my collea- 

gues here have said, is a shrine where 
people of all faiths and religions Hindus, 
Muslims and others also used to go for 
worship. Muslims were also devotees of this 
shrine and they used to worship at this shrine. 
And I think, everybody, both inside and 
outside this House, must note that Pakistan, 
which is a therocratic State, established on 
the principles of Islam as an Islamic State, 
was responsible for the destruction of this 
mosqife where Muslims also worshipped. It 
has been amply proved, beyond doubt, that 
the hand of Pakistan was very much there in 
this episode which shook the nation. The 
foreign mercenaries have been apprehended 
they have been identified-—and 
I think some have been caught alive, and I 
don't think there is any doubt that Pakistan 
had a hand in this incident. It is unfortunate 
that some of my colleagues on the other side 
have expressed doubts, based on certain 
erroneous reports, .that our armed forces 
themselves were involved in this. I was 
extremely sorry to hear that, and I think that 
any sort of doubt that may exist in that 
direction should be dispelled from our minds. 
It is very, very clear that Pakistan has been 
playing a surreptitious game across the 
borders. 
My friend from Tamil Nadu, Mr. Virum-bi, 
has said, "Why don't you declare a war on 
Pakistan as Pakistan has de-cleared a war on 
us?" Well, that precisely, is the point. There 
they have not declared a war as such. What 
exactly they are doing is that they have been 
fighting a low-cost proxy war in a very 
surreptitious manner. So, that kind of a war 
you cannot declare and fight like in an open 
war, because it is being done in such an 
underhand and obnoxious manner that we 
will have to find ways to counter it, to see 
that it is exposed to the rest of the world. 
We cannot take extremist views or stands 
like that. 

Mr. Vice-Chairman, Pakistan has always 
resorted to its Indian card whenever its   
rulers   have   been   in   trouble:   That 
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apart, they have also been fomenting 
trouble, creating problems, at times that are 
crucial for us in this country, and I have no 
doubt that this was done because we were 
thinking of restoring the democratic process 
in Kashmir and probably because things were 
going ahead in that direction, this was the last 
straw on the camel's back and they wanted to 
see that elections are postponed now. So, to 
say that we are back to square one--my 
friend, Mr. Jaipal Reddy, has said, "You were 
thinking of elections but now you are back 
to square one and you cannot have 
elections"-is not correct. Well, a certain 
kind of confusion is there and now a 
problem has cropped up, but it doesn't mean 
that we have gone back to square one. 
Ultimately, I think, the democratic process 
has to be restored in the Valley and you will 
have to have elections there, because any 
Government will have to have a certain 
amount of popular support, and in a 
situation like this we will have to solve the 
problem. To do that you must find a way 
out, create a suitable atmosphere and have a 
democratically-elected Government in-
stalled sooner or later in the Valley. Hence, 
I am not of those who think that to have 
elections would be to put the cart before the 
horse, because then the horse will never 
come before the cart in such cases. 

Mr. Vice-Chairman, many of my col-
leagues from the other side have put the 
blame squarely on the Government and they 
have demanded the resignation of this 
Ministry. Well, it is their prerogative to do 
so. This is a very, very peculiar kind of 
situation. We know what had happened in 
Punjab under Operation Bluestar. In a 
situation like this, what would have they 
done if they were in power? 

If you go and storm the shrine you will be 
hurting the religious sentiments of somebody. 
If you don't do it then also you will commit a 
sin. These are very sensitive situations and I 
don't think that , 

a normal yardstick can be applied to a 
situation like this where one has to do a lot 
of tight-rope walking. Well plans may not 
work sometimes. They did work at 
Hazratbal. They may not have worked this 
time. The plan was the same as that or 
different. This is something that we do not 
know. In such sensitive issues, the 
Government also cannot go public and 
announce the plan of action or the methods 
or the ways and means by which it is trying 
to control a particular situation. So, these 
things should be understood. 

Anyway Mr. Vice-Chairman it was very 
refreshing today to hear my friend Mr. 
Gurudas Das Gupta expressing or echoing 
the religious sentiments of the people of 
this country. It is rather refreshing to hear 
that from him. 

[The Vice-Chairman  (Miss Saroj 
Khaparde) In the Chair] 

On the other side of the border the 
Pakistani people are desecrating the shrines of 
other people of their own religion where they 
worship. So in this kind of situation I think 
what we need in Kashmir is not just a 
political solution. It does not need a military 
solution. I think what Kashmir today needs 
is a healing touch. You cannot solve it 
totally by political means or by military 
means. You will have to take the people into 
confidence. A long drawn-out plan will 
have to be chalked out. Ultimately, the gap 
that came about in these decades will have 
to be bridged. I don't see any reasons why 
this should not be possible if all of us are 
united in this endeavour. 

Madam, while Pakistan has nefarious 
designs while listening to this debate at 
some moments of time I felt that there was 
some political design behind what some of 
my colleagues spoke. My earnest humble 
and sincere advice to my colleagues on all 
sides of the House will be not to try to get 
any political mileage out-of a situation like 
this. This concerns all of us. 
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This concerns the nation. I know that 
Parliament elections are just a year away 
from us. But I think on several occasions 
earlier, Members from all sides of this 
House have rallied together and desisted 
from going in for petty political gains from 
a situation like this. I am sure that at this 
juncture too, political parties and my friends 
and colleagues from all sides will rise as 
one to see that the issue of Kashmir 
concerns not only the Government but all of 
us alike. 

Well, Madam, I would just like to say a 
few words to the hon. Minister for Home 
sitting over here. Of course, it is very very 
necessary that the three nodal Ministries 
who are concerned with this problem, the 
Ministries of Information and Broadcasting 
Defence and Home, should interact with 
each other especially as far as the issue of 
Kashmir is concerned. I presume that they 
have been doing that. Another very serious 
matter arising out of what has come to our 
knowledge now, after what has happened 
there is our inability to find out how these 
arms and ammunition came into this 
country. Well, of course, many of these 
people came in as pilgrims. I know it is 
difficult to identify pilgrims from non-
pilgrims or terrorists, but, then, I think, we 
should make the checking at the borders 
more foolproof. 

I also feel that personnel belonging to the 
army and the para-military forces should 
not be kept there for an unduly long period 
of time because once you are there, you get 
identified. You have your own possible 
attachements because you arc a human 
being too. So, I would appeal to the Home 
Minister and the Government to see that 
changes are made in the personnel who are 
posted in these sensitive area. They can be 
there for a short period of time not 
endlessly. I don't think that we should send 
the same people back again and again. Of 
course, abundant precaution and care should 
be taken to see that our best officers and 
men, both from the army and from the 

para-military forces, are posted in places 
like this because this also concerns our 
national security. With these words I thank 
you for having given me this opportunity to 
speak. I would appeal to all sections of the 
House to see this as a national problem and 
seek to offer a solution so that such things 
do not happen again. 
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THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): Shri Sikander Bakht. Not 
there. Shri I. K. Gujral. 

SHRI INDER KUMAR GUJRAL (Bihar): 
Madam, I have sat through listening to the 
debate with the utmost attention. I must say 
in the beginning, as my friends have also 
said, that I think the sympathy of this House, 
all of us, goes to the victims who have 
suffered. Not only to those whose houses 
have been burnt but also to those whose 
deep emotions have been disturbed because 
the Charare-Sharief has been burnt. When I 
say 'those', I do not say that on the basis of 
any community or religion; I mean all those 
who have faith in that Shrine. And the faith 
in that Shrine was not confined to Hindus or 
Muslims. I believe it is a symbol of the Sufi 
movement in whole of the country. 
Therefore, I think that all of us feel bad 
about it, sad about it. But, at the same time, I 
would like to say—and I had submitted it 
when we met in the leaders' meeting also—
that speedy relief is very much called for. I 
do not know if my hon. friend, the Home 
Minister, had seen a TV programme last 
night telecast by the Zee TV in which 
women and children were shouting that no 
relief was being given to them, no food was 
being given to them, no medical aid had 
reached them. I was very upset to see this 
because I saw the Home Minister visiting 
Srinagar yesterday. And two days back, a 
promise was given to all of us in that 
meeting that speedy relief would be given. I 
had pointed out at that time that I had 
received a telephone call from Srinagar, 
from the President of my own party, Mr. 
Qayum, pointing out three things. Firstly, he 
said, "We are holed up becaused of 
curfews." I am quoting him. "I cannot say 
what is happening outside but can only feel 
what others would be 
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feeling." He said, "Please do something very 
speedily about the relief." And I think relief 
is the essence of immediate action. Unless 
you are able to build this credibly by 
tomorrow or tonight, I do not think it will do 
us good. I do not want to say that but I have 
to say, with a great deal of pain, what I saw 
in the programme last night. A young girl, 
must be out of despair, was shouting the 
slogan, "Pakistan Zindabad!". When you do 
not give the people help at this particular 
moment, if people feel sad and bad and also 
disturbed, I have my sympathy with them. I 
do hope that when the hon. Prime Minister 
speaks he will give us a realistic picture. 
There is no use telling us that you have sent 
so many mounds of rice. The main point is, 
you have to tell us whether the Kashmir 
Administration is adequate even for this 
purpose or not. They have failed otherwise. 
Arc they adequate to hand out  the relief to 
the people or not? This is the situation that 
we are confronted with. 

My hon, friends from all sides of the 
House    have    been    talking    about    the 
Kashmir situation.  It  is an  unfortunate fact,     
Madam,     that     in     this     House we    
seldom    get    an    opportunity    to discuss  
the   vital   issues  of  the   nation. I think 
this is a sad atmosphere and a sad occasion     
when     we     are     discussing Kashmir. I 
wish there were opportunities when we 
could  have a full debate on Kashmir   so   
that   we   could   have   all expressed our 
views. It does not happen because    
hurriedly    things    arc    gone through. 
Certain things have been done. I don't want 
to  talk  here in terms of partisanship. 1 do'nt 
want to talk here in terms of my sitting on 
this side or that side of the House. I want to 
talk today more as a Indian and as a 
committed patriot and nothing else. A few 
things, which   have   been   done,   I   want   
to appreciate. A few things, which have not 
been  done,  I want  to  deprecate.  To 
deprecate I must begin with this. I think and 
believe that the local administration, to say 
in a very mild language, has been 

inadequate. It has not been able to rise to  the  
occasion.  This  voice   has  been raised here 
and in the meetings that the Prime Minister 
had called from-time to time, for a change of 
the administration. The   media   have   been   
writing.   The newspaper-men,  who have  
gone  there, have  been saying this.  Every 
time we have   been   saying,   "For   God's   
sake change it." We have nothing against the 
particular   gentleman.   We   don't   know 
him. But if the gentleman does not come up to 
the expectations of the nation, I think it is not 
in the Government's own interest to try to 
stick on to an individual. Every   individual   
is   dispensable.   The nation comes first. I do 
hope, at least now, the Government will do 
something suffle the local administration. It is 
also important to have some sort of a credible 
inquiry  done   because   my  friend,   Mr. 
Fotedar,  has pointed  out a few things that arc 
very disturbing. Mr. Jagmohan pointed out a 
few things which are even more disturbing. I 
think a very credible inquiry has to be done. 
You may not do it today. You may not do it 
tomorrow. But in your own interest, for God's 
sake, do it and find who failed? Why did he 
fail?   If   he   has   failed,   is   he   held 
responsible for it or not? I think for a few 
days or for a few weeks now, two or three 
things have been happening, which is also, I 
think, are initiaves in a right direction. I have 
been participating in the Indian delegations to 
the United Nations and   the   human   rights  
conferences  on behalf of this country. I have 
felt that increasing transparency has been 
helpful. I suggest we must not get derailed 
from it. Transparency helps us also. It is not 
only the world but we also begin to know 
what is really happening there because many 
of us do not travel to that part of the  country  
and  many  papers  do  not write   regarding   
the   prevalent,   there reality. The speeches 
made by my hon. friends in the Treasury 
Benches generally attempt to hide more than 
they expose. Therefore, transparency will help 
up. I would  refer to  two or three  instances 
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regarding trasnparency, particularly a visit of 
the U. N. Human Rights Commissioner, Mr. 
Lasso, last week or a week earlier. Mr. Lasso 
had gone there. I think the Government was 
very wise in letting him in. I had an occasion 
of talking to Mr. Lasso in New York during 
the last U. S. session. Mr. Lasso sounded to 
me as a person of credible integrity. I have 
heard with interest Mr. Lasso's remarks in 
Geneva after going back from here. He thinks 
that the human rights situation there is 
improving. That by itself is a good thing. I 
have also heard about the report given by a 
few Ambassadors, five or six, who have gone 
there, they are from European countries. They 
have come back and I am personally aware 
of their assessment. They have made the 
following assessment. One they have said, 
the situation is better than last year. I am 
talking about the situation before this 
incident. I will come to the incident slightly 
later. The situation is better than last year. 
This group had gone there last year also. 
They came back and said that the situation 
was better than last year. They also said that 
the elections were feasible. They also 
advised us to invite international observers. 
This is an issue about which I am going to 
talk for two minutes more,-Madam, because 
in this House this has been a controversial 
issue. As and when the elections are held, if 
at all, whether international observers should 
be invited or not? You will recall in October 
last a team of the House of Commons 
Members had come here. They had gone to 
Kashmir, came back and had met some of us. 
Probably, you were also there, Madam. They 
had come back with to advice that we should 
let international observers come in there as 
and when the elections are held to make the 
elections credible. Why did they say so? We 
have no doubt and I don't really suspect that 
the Government will do the blunder of 
rigging the elections or any such thing. But I 
am certain that it must be seen to be so clear 
and transparent by the world 

as a whole not only the world as outside and 
for the purpose of international opinion but 
also for our own people because in the past 
our acts had been such which had cast 
doubts. This is not the issue. The issue 
basically was, when they the British MP's 
went to Srinagar, they met the Hurriyat 
people, they met the militants. The militants 
told them that they would not participate in 
the elections. They told the militants—that is 
what they later told us and I think several 
members of this House were also there— 

"It means you don't want you claims of 
popularity to be tested. We are sitting here 
and if wc see that there is no polling only 
because of the fear of the gun then it is a 
point against the militants, not against the 
Government of India. That is, I think, the 
essence of the whole exercise. I told them at 
that time, I had, may I say, the courage or 
the idiocity of telling them, 

"In the last few years in this subcontinent 
several elections have been held in Pakistan 
in Sri Lanka in Bangladesh and in Nepal. In 
all these elections international observers 
were there." I had the privilege of being one 
of the observers in the elections in Pakistan 
itself. It helped Pakistan tremendously. 
Nobody would have believed Pakistan. This 
time when I went there a team Member of 
the Leader of the Opposition, who is now 
questioning the validity of the elections 
there, was blaming me. He said, " You 
certified that it was a free and fare election, 
but it was not." 

The main point remains , that is a point in 
our favour. I told the house of commons 
team one more thing. In all these countires 
no Government of any country invited 
international observers. No Government had 
invited international observers and no 
Government should invite them. The non-
officials should invite them. The 
Government should only facilitate their stay 
and their observing the elections. I think this 
is the 



545    Motion on the Situation [15 MAY 1995] In Charar-E-Siiarief   546 

issue which they must keep in mind when 
they think of elections. Elections should be 
held only if they are transparent. Elections 
should be held only if the international 
observers are to be there. 

SHRI MAKHAN LAL FOTEDAR: Are 
you supporting the international observers? 

SHRI INDER KUMAR GUJRAL: I 
strongly support that because I think we will 
commit the blunder of our life if we do not 
let the international observers come in. 

SHRI MAKHAN LAL FOTEDAR: Will 
the UK or the USA accept the international 
observers? 

SHRI INDER KUMAR GUJRAL: I 
would like to elaborate. Mr. Fotedar, I am 
happy that you have put this question. By 
'international observers' I don't mean 
observers sent by the other Governments. I 
was not sent by the Government of India to 
Pakistan. International observers are those 
who are men of standing in various spheres 
of life whose credibility is acceptable, 
whether they come from our neighbouring 
country or they come from 'Commonwealth 
countries or they come from worldwide. 
That is something which we have to work 
out in detail. Mr, Fotedar, I beg of you to 
kindly consider 

SHRI MAKHAN LAL FOTMDAR: No 
Government of India worth its name can 
accept this. 

SHRI INDER  KUMAR GUJARAL: I 
would say that if you do the mistake of 
queuing it, stopping the transparency, then 
it will be a wise thing for us not to hold 
elections; otherwise it would become 
counter-produetive. Anyhow, that is not the 
issue. 

We must give an assurance to the 
Kashmiri people, to the LadakM Jammu 
people that not only the election will be free 
and fare but the election results will also   be   
respected.   That   is   exlremely 

important. Whatever the election results, 
they should be respected. Madam, it is very 
important for us to keep one fact in mind. 
There is a big question, and I think there are 
some differences on this as well, as to what 
type of autonomy can be given. What should 
be the quantum of autonomy? I am not going 
to discuss it in detail. I am going to say only 
one thing. Please give an assurance to the 
people that you will talk to the elected 
people on this subject. Then, of course, you 
will naturally discuss this here in 
Parliament as well. 

I come to the next point. Only a few 
weeks back the USA has published its 
Annual Terrorism Report. I have a brief 
summary of that. I will not take the time of 
House in reading it. But, I will only say that 
even this report holds that foreign-aided 
terrorists are in Kashmir. 

Madam, if you permit me I will read only 
two lines. It says: 

"The only group that conducts operations 
in Kashmir that was mentioned in the report 
was the Harkat-ul-Ansar (HUA), which 
seeks Kashmir's accession to Pakistan. It is 
based in Muzaffarabad, Pakistan, and has 
sevenral thousand armed members situated 
in the Kashmir Valley and the Doda regions 
of India. 

Besides being actively involved m 
Kashmir, the report said that HWA 
members, who comprise mostly Pakistanis 
and Kashmiris and also Afghans and Arab 
veterans of the Afghan  war, have 
participated in insurgent and terrorist 
operations in Burma, Tajikistan and 
Bosnia." 

There is another relevant thing that I 
would like to share I said in the beginning 
that I was in Pakistan some time back. I 
want to share a few things that I saw there 
two weeks ago with the Hon. Members. I 
saw two or three things 
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there. I saw a feeling of desperation. The' 
degree of desperation amongst the ruling 
people was very high. I meet most of them as 
was published in the media. I had the 
opportunity of meeting almost everyone who 
mattered in that country, in office and out of 
office, l came to the conclusion that they were 
very much in despair regarding Kashmir. The 
talk of elections had caused a great deal of 
despair in that country. Everyone I met, talked 
worriedly about whether we were really going 
to hold elections and if elections were held 
what would happen. That made me conclude 
that some desparate action was round the 
corner. By a commonsense, I calculated that 
they would do something at the time of the 
SAARC meeting. I am surprised that the 
Government should not have foreseen it when 
a layman like me could see it. But it did not 
happen at the time of the SAARC possibly 
because the President of Pakisatan decided to 
participate in it. I think they did not want to 
raise a controversy at that time. Another issue 
pertains to Ms Benazir Bhutto's recent visit to 
the United States. Her visit has divided the 
country. The official version says that it was a 
success story. But almost everyone else in 
Pakistan thinks otherwise. It is very iteresting. 
Mr. Clinton, after meeting her, had said that 
Pakistan was a moderate Islamic State. The 
fundamentalists in Pakistan have taken this as 
an affront. That is also pne of the contributory 
factors for stepping up their activities in 
Kashmir. They wanted to teach us a lesson 
and they also wanted to teach her a lesson; 

"You think we are moderate. But we are 
not moderate." This is the message they 
wanted to convey. This, was being published 
in their entire media. The second thing that I 
would like to say : Let us not underestimate 
even in our divided House, the type of 
reaction Mr. Rafsanjani's visit has caused in 
that country. They are dismayed. They are 
dissappointed. They are angry and 
frustrated.   I   don't   know  what   other 

" adjectives to use. Mr. Rafsanjani's 
statement that it is a bilateral issue which 
India and Pakistan must discuss and solve has 
caused a lot of anger there. It is a helpless 
anger, the anger of the impotent. They do 
not know what to say. They did not know 
how to react. They cannot condemn him 
strongly. But they also object to it. The other 
thing that Mr. Rafsanjani said here was that 
there should be close coperation between 
Iran, India and China. Every newspaper in 
Pakistan commented upon this. I have the 
cuttings with me. They see a great deal of 
danger coming to them. Please do not ask 
me the name of the high dignitary in Pakis-
tan who put this question to me. He asked 
me, "What do you mean by the three of you? 
I wanted to appease him. Hence, I said, 
"...the four of us." The point is that they see 
a danger in this. The Press in Pakistan was 
writing clearly and openly that China was 
angry with Pakistan because of 
fundamentalism and Iran was angry with 
Pakistan because of the anti-Shia activities 
that were happening there. The most 
important fall-out of her visit to America 
was that, on the one side, America was 
taking action and issuing sanctions against 
Iran and, at that time she goes there and 
makes friends with Mr. Clinton. In that case, 
Iran cannot be their friend. These are the 
interesting happening there. Therefore, what 
I find is that the President of Pakistan goes 
to Iran. He told me himself and I am not 
quoting anybody else. While talking of the 
gas pipeline coming to India from Iran 
through Pakistan, he talked of it as if he was 
giving us a concession. But is was actually 
meant to appease Iran. 

He said to Iran, "We will welcome the 
passing of the pipeline through Pakistan." 

Why are they doing it? It is primarily 
because they see this dimension of Indian 
foreign policy that Iran and India are getting 
closer hurting them. 

On the nuclear issue, there is a great deal 
of anxiety there and that anxiety is 
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there  is a great deal of anxiety there bccuasc 
they suspect that she has yielded ground to 
USA. And, there fore, there is another point. 
I am not commenting on that. I am just 
giving you information. I am sorry I am 
taking time but I thought that it is important 
for the nation. Please, bear with me. Nawaz 
Sharief told me and he was also speaking in 
the Parliament itself that he thinks that 
Pakistan and India must talk.  He  thinks that  
there should be a peace treaty between India 
and Pakistan. He told me that he had been 
criticised but he saw the writing on the wall 
and there was no escape from this. Now, you 
imagine, what would happen in a scenario 
like this. What is the stare of mind of that 
country? What is the confusion in that 
country? What is the despair in that country? 
Therefore, we must keep a close watch on 
what happens   in   that   country.   A   
question arises as to what we can do then. I 
will take a couple of minutes to tell you as to 
what I feci we should do. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): I have already given you 30 
Minutes. 

SHRI INDER KUMAR GUJRAL: I 
know, Madam. I am taxing your patience. 
But I thought I am saying something in 
which the House may be interested. One 
thing which I have already mentioned is that 
we make some interen-al administrative 
changes. I will not develop that point again. 
But internal changes in Kashmir are 
important and are called for. The most 
important point and I want to repeat it is, I 
do not know what the Government's policy 
on Kashmir was. I am neither saying 'yes' 
nor saying 'no' to it. But whatever your 
policy was, for God's sake, do not get 
derailed because of this  incident. Pakistan's 
purpose will have been served, if you get 
derailed  you should expoect more such 
incidents, if you pursue the same policy. I 
would also request you to share that policy 
with us sometimes. If you don't want to do it 
openly, talk to us in private. But please let 
us know as to 

what you want to do. And, if we express 
any doubts on your policy, hear us also. 
Therefore, evolve a national consensus on 
that. Our strength in Kashmir can be the 
national consensus, not a divided openion. 
Therefore, totality on the unity of India is 
very important for this. 

I, therefore, feel that we have to keep two 
things in mind and there I agree with my 
friend, the Leader of the Opposition. As a 
nation, we must sit down and decide as to 
how the sancitity of the shrines can be 
preserved, particularly when a new chapter 
is opening up in India's life. When the 
terrorists think where we are vulnerable, 
they enter the shrines. I am not saying that 
you do this or do not do that. But I think it is 
very important that we  sit together and 
evolve a national consensus and re-educate 
the public opinion on that. Otherwise, 
everyday you will be confronted with a 
reality like this. But. more important than 
every thing else is that, for God's sake, do 
something where you arc failing 
institutionally. Who makes the policies 
here? You don't have the CCPA. Last year, 
.the Prime Minister promised here on the 
floor of this House, that he was going to set 
up the Security Council. I interrupted him 
and told him at that time that we had set up 
one during our Government and you 
abolished that. He rebutted by saying, "But 
your system was only the CCPA". But now 
you don't have even the CCPA. You may 
have your differences with those who are 
going to have a rally on the 19th, including 
Mr. Fotedar, but don't punish for that. Don't 
punish the nation for that. Let there be a 
structure where decisions can be taken. Let 
there be a Defence Minister. Appoint 
anybody. Appoint Mr. Chavan, if you want 
to, or Mr. Fotedar, if he so agrees. But 
please do something.... (Interruptions)... The 
single biggest failure, if I may submit, be it 
Kashmir or be it any other situation, is our 
institutional failure. Even Jawaharlal Nehru 
did not function without the institutions. 
Even Indira Gandhi did not function without 
such institutions. They 
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were great leaders. I have great respect for 
my friend, the Prime Minister. I have all 
regard for him. But I think no individual can 
substitute because you don't even have the 
institutionalised memory. Unless you have 
institutionalised memory, how can you 
make policies? Who will tell you what 
happened in 1986? Mr. Jagmohan has to 
remind you what happened in 1990. Who 
will tell you what happened in 1947? 

The Joint Secretary is transfered and the 
memory vanishes. Therefore, you talk of the 
Security Council, you talk of the CCPA and 
whenever you make a policy, for God's 
sake, vet it through some institutions. That 
will help you and also, for God's sake, do 
something to stop that rift. 

SHRIMATI RENUKA CHOW-DHURY 
(Andhra Pradesh): Madam, it is very difficult 
for me to follow up on what my learned 
colleague, Mr. Gujral, has spoken so 
eloquently and so adequately. So what I will 
be speaking is merely to emphasise what the 
rest of the House has already said. At the 
very outset, Madam, I would like my 
colleagues to join me, in the sense of 
collective pride that I take, that the nation 
transcended the weaknesses of the 
Government and its policy, and as 
Parliament that they have maintained the law 
and order and internal peace and we have 
been able to show Pakistan that as a nation 
we stand united and we have not given in to 
the kind of forces and attempts that they 
have made to weaken India's sovereignty. 

The second thing that I would like to 
mention is that the emphasis on Charar-c-
Sharicf is not only as a place of religious 
worship it is not a minority sentiment that we 
are catering to but as a monument, as a 
national symbal as something that we expect 
and take for granted under the Constitutional 
rights, that this nation will keep safe for us 
what is rcightfully ours, be it a place of 
worship, be it some other institutions, be it 
the 

home of a citizen. It is with this importance, 
it is with that priority that the nation should 
have been alert. It is a sad thing that the 
Government failed and, as has been pointed 
out by several people, we have attributed 
many reasons, but I am not here just to blame 
them for what has happened because it is not 
going to resolve the problem. I came to the 
House late because I was talking to the Army 
and I, being a daughter of an armed 
personnel, feel pained that some of the 
newspapers are making it out to appear that 
it is the fault of the Army, the failure of the 
Army, that we could not control this burning 
down of the Charar-e-Sharicf. I think it is a 
terrible blot to place on the Army which is 
one of the best in the world and it is the last 
bastion on which we fall back for and it is 
the last bastion on which we fall back for our 
political weaknesses and inadequacies. Let 
us not abuse them. Madam, I have spoken to 
the Army and one of the highest authorities 
of these armed services has told me, 
categorically, that the Government did not 
have clarity of policy and that they were not 
told as to what was to be done. These men 
lay down their lives to protect a brick or a 
monument. If the Army was told, "Go in and 
get these chaps out and try, if possible, not to 
destroy a, b or c's territory," they could carry 
out your instructions. It is nothing new. They 
have done it in the past and they will 
continue to do it provided we given them 
instructions with clarity of thought and 
application of policy. The Army goes on 
fighting with one hand tied to the back, and 
Madam, 'I can't even begin to fathom the in-
tricacies or the intrigues behind the ap-
pointment of Governors in Kashmir wherein 
in 1989, we had this gentleman who is sitting 
there and we have a history and a track-record 
of everything failing, and I have been told 
that the Governor did not attend his office for 
the past six months—six months, you have 
not heard the Governor sitting in his office 
and attending,  to  the  affairs of the State, 
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what kind of administration are we falling, 
back on? Who is this head in whom we have 
put the reins of Kashmir's sup-possed 
renaissance of democracy there? How do we 
pin the accountibility and what is the track 
record that we keep these people as sacred 
holy cows and don't move them from their 
offices when they have constantly failed to 
deliver the goods? Madam, the time has 
come for introspection. I am not here to ask 
the Government to step down or to condemn 
them. We all play a part in what is known as 
'the act of governance.' But, the absence of 
the Governor is one thing which I cannot 
help. Condemning them for an action not 
done is something. But, how do you 
condemn the Government for inaction? 
What is this rigor mortis that has seized the 
Government that they arc in the throes of 
death, that they cannot move, that they are 
paralysed, that they have no foresight? They 
knew in December 1994 that some foreign 
and local militants were frequenting the 
town of Charar-e-Sharief. We knew that on 
May 8th the militants set fire to residential 
houses in Baba Mohalla Talakalam in the 
town. Fire tenders were called. The fire 
tenders could not reach the place to put out 
the fire because the militants opened fire on 
the fire-fighters. This is on the 8th of May. 
On May 11, the performance is repeated. We 
had intelligence, intercepted messages. Do 
we not know that the modus operandi is 
fire? Do we not know that it would be wise 
to have fire-tenders parked nearby or give 
them the escort so that they reach on time? It 
took six hours of battling for the fire tenders. 
And they reached well after everything was 
set on fire. They could not reach because the 
militants opened fire for the second round. 
Rockets were shot off and they had all kinds 
of state-of-the-art technology. This man's 
name goes by Mast Gul and I do not even 
want to take his name which is an amazing 
name. Wc have houses which have been set 
on fee and the Government is very smart. 
They  came  up and said they are 

quickly going to give compensation for 
these houses. But, how do yon compensate 
for loss of credibility? How do you 
compensate for inadequacy? How do you 
compensate for the insecurity that is now 
growing in India? 

Madam, I salute the nation. I salute the 
people that we have risen above these. It is 
no credibility to the Government. It is now 
for us to sit and worry. Arc our soldiers 
wearing shoes in the shrine? We have not 
done it because it happened in the past and 
religious sentiments were exploited. 
Minority people have come in and torn 
down this shrine which is, as far as I know, 
no particular community but it is the 
Kashmiriyat of India that has been abused 
and destroyed. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): Please conclude. 

SHRIMATI RENUKA CHOW-DHURY: 
Madam, I am concluding. We gave safe 
passage to militants; we gave safe passage 
to inefficient officers; we are giving safe 
passage to the Governors who sit in the 
chairs without doing anything. Madam, the 
time has come to view the Kashmir issue at 
macro-level. As my hon. coleague has said, 
it b not just India's foreign policy, it is 
India's globalisation that wc have opened 
up, and India is opposed to contending with 
any global comunity. This is a sabotage. Let 
Pakis tan stay warned. Madam, I want to 
know only one thing. Whatever the reason 
the Government has, what prevented the 
Government from formulating a resolution 
to tell Pakistan as to where they get off? 

I am tired of being bullied by our next 
door nation who neither has the strength nor 
the moral authority to talk to India or 
behave like a nation. 

Madam, I am standing here and I join my 
colleagues in saying that we are not afraid 
of Pakistan. I hope, Pakistan will stay 
warned that if it continues to fiddle with 
Kashmir, which is an integral part of 
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India and which will remain as part of India 
for the rest of our generations, it will get a 
befitting reply not just from the political level 
but also from the people of this nation. 
Thank you, Madam. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): Thank you. Mr. Jagannath 
Mishra, please try to be brief. 
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SHRI S. JAIPAL REDDY: Madam, we 

would like to know as to how long this 
debate would continue, as to when the 
Prime Minister would come to reply to the 
debate. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): For this debate we have 
allotted four hours. (Interruptions) If the 
Members try to be brief, we can finish it 
within four hours. 

SHRI S. JAIPAL REDDY: I am asking 
about the time around which the Prime 
Minister would come and reply to the 
debate. 

THE      VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS 
SAROJ     KHAPARDE):     The Prime 
Minister  is   busy  in  the   other House. 
(Interruptions) 

SHRIMATI JAYANTHI NATARAJAN 
(Tamil Nadu): The Prime Minister is in the 
other House. As soon as it is over there, he 
would come here. 

SHRI S. JAIPAL REDDY: We would 
like to be told. (Interruptions) We cannot go 
on sitting without knowing as to when the 
Prime Minister would come and reply. 
(Interruptions) 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: Four 
hours were allotted, but we have already 
gone beyond the time allotted. 
(Interruptions) 

 

SHRI S. JAIPAL REDDY: Let an 
assurance come from the Chair that the 
Prime Minister would come and reply to the 
debate towards the end, after he completes 
his business in the Lok Sabha. We are not 
asking him to come here right now. 

SHRIMATI JAYANTHI NATARAJAN: 
The Home Minister would reply. 

SHRI MD. SALIM (West Bengal): It is 
the Prime Minister who has to reply. 

SHRI SATYA PRAKASH 
MALAVIYA: Madam, how many speakers 
arc there? 

SHRI S. JAIPAL REDDY: Madam, it is 
the Prime Minister who has to reply to the 
debate because it is he who has been 
directly dealing with this issue. (Interrup-
tions) 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: 
Madam, it was decided in the morning. The 
hon. Chairman had told us that the debate 
would continue for four hours. We have 
exceeded this time by thirty-five minutes 
now. Therefore, we would like to know.... 

SHRI JAGESH DESAI (Maharashtra): It 
is not correct. The hon. Deputy Chairman 
had said in the morning 'four hours plus 
some more time if Members felt that there 
should be some more time'. (Interruptions) 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: Hon. 
Jagesh Desai was not present. The hon. 
Chairman had said that the debate would 
continue for four hours. Accordingly, time 
was allotted to different par-tics. Now, if 
this is going to be extended, let us know 
about it; in that case, we can give the names 
of Members from the other parties also. 

SHRI JAGESH DESAI: Mr. Gurudas 
Das Gupta, the Deputy Chairman had said 
that there would be more time. 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: I am 
sayiung what the Chairman had said. 
(Interruptions) 

15-B— 147/M P/RSS/ND/98 
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THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): The Leader of the House 
wants to say something. 

SHRI S. B. CHAVAN: Madam, in the 
morning, when the entire issue was being 
discussed in the Chamber of the Chairman, 
the time allotted was four hours. At that 
time, I clearly indicated that I was going  to 
reply to the debate. We are prepared to 
reply to all the points which the hon. 
Members have made. 

So, there should be no problem. Let as 
many Members as would like to participate 
in the discussion do so. We will certainly 
reply to them. 

... (Interruptions)... 
SHRI S. JAIPAL REDDY: Madam Vice-

Chairperson, we did not get the impression 
in the Chairman's chamber that the reply 
would be given by the Home Minister. I 
hold him in high personal esteem. I think he 
is intellectually competent to deal with the 
subject, but the problem is, he is not dealing 
with the subject. 

AN. HON. MEMBER: There is a 
separate Ministry now. 

SHRI S. JAIPAL REDDY: We de-
manded in the morning—and I demanded 
when I spoke first—that the Prime Minister 
should come and reply to the debate. We 
insist on the Prime Minister's reply in this 
House, either today or tomorrow, but we 
insist upon the PM's reply. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (KUMARI 
SAROJ KHAPARDE): Mr. Jaipal Red-dy, 
I think, since morning it was current that 
the Home Minister was going to reply in 
the evening after everybody had 
participated in the debate. 

SHRIMATI JAYANTHI NATARA-JAN: 
Madam, this is not what has happened in the 
morning. In the morning the Leader of the 
House has clearly said that' he was going to 
reply as the Prime Minister was engaged in 
the Lok Sabha. 

.... (Interruptions).... 

SHRI MD. SALIM: In the morning we 
were discussing... (Interruptions)... Let the 
Prime Minister come and reply. The whole 
day we have been discussing this issue and 
now, nothing!. ...(Interruptions). ... 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (KUMARI 
SAROJ KHAPARDE): Mr. Salim, since the 
morning itself it was known to all of us that 
in the Chairman's chamber there was a 
meeting and it was made very clear that it 
was the Home Minister who was going to 
reply to the debate....(Interruptions)... 

SHRI S. JAIPAL REDDY: No, Madam. 
THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 

KHAPARDE): Yes. 
SHRIMATI JAYANTHI NATARA-

JAN: Yes. 
SHRI S. JAIPAL REDDY: Madam, with 

due respect to you, that is not all the 
impression that we have had. 

SHRIMATI JAYANTHI NATARA-
JAN: It was absolutely clear that the Prime 
Minister was going to be in the Lok Sabha. 

....(In terruptions)... 
THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 

KHAPARDE): The Prime Minister is really 
busy in the other House. 

SHRI S. JAIPAL REDDY: Therefore, we 
can continue the debate until tomorrow. 
The Prime Minister can come and reply to 
the debate tomorrow. 

SHRIMATI JAYANTHI NATARA-
JAN: How can the Prime Minister be at two 
different places at the same time?.... 
(Interruptions).... 

SHRI S. VIDUTHALAI VIRUMBI: 
Madam, we are not insisting that he should 
come and reply now. Let him come 
tomorrow and reply. 

SHRI MD. SALIM: Tell us what time he   
will   be   coming   here. ...(Intcrrup- 
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(ions).... You may not be serious about this 
matter. We have been sitting here the whole 
day. 

SHRI S. VIDUTHALAI VIRUMBI: Let 
the Prime Minister come and reply. He is in 
charge of Kashmir affairs. 

SHRI   S.   JAIPAL  REDDY:  Let  an 
assurance be given by the Chair. ...(In-
terruptions).... 

 
THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (KUMARI 

SAROJ KHAPARDE): Mr. Jaipal Red-dy, I 
would like to call Mr. Murli Manohar Joshi 
to speak. 

SHRI JAGMOHAN: Madam, I have to 
say a few words. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): No, no. Nobody is going to 
raise anything now. Let him speak, please. 

SHRI JAGMOHAN: Madam, I am only 
going to say that Dr. Jagnnath Mishra had 
mentioned about the situation. When I was 
speaking, I had given facts and figures. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): This is not a question to be 
raised now. 

SHRI JAGMOHAN: He should give facts 
and figures rather than making only a 
general statement. 
. THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 

KHAPARDE): Shri Murli Manohar Joshi. 

 
SHRIMATI JAYANTHI NATARA-JAN: 

Madam, why is Mr. Mathur speaking? 
....(In terruptions).... 
THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 

KHAPARDE): No, Mr. Mathur. 

I   have   not   allowed   you.   Mr.   Joshi, 
please. ...(Interruptions).... 

SHRIMATI KAMLA SINHA: Madam, I 
have a point of order. I would like to know 
whether the Prime Minister is coming here 
to reply to the debate or not. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): I have called Mr. Joshi to 
participate in the debate. Mr. Joshi. 
...(Interruptions)... I said "Mr. Joshi." 

SHRI SATYA PRAKASH 
MALAVIYA: Dr. Joshi! 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): Dr. Murli Manohar Joshi! 

DR. MURLI MANOHAR JOSHI: 
Dhanyavaad! 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): Is it okay now? 

DR. MURLI MANOHAR JOSHI: It is 
always okay when you call me! 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): Okay, please speak on. 
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"Terror Training Network of 'Muslims 
Holy Warrios' Thrives." 
"The report filed by New Delhi-based 
John Ward Anderson and Kamran Khan 
from karachi...." 
"Titled 'Pakistan Tiptoes Around Islamic 
Militants' the reports spread across four 
columns with a photograph of the four 
Western hostages who met the Press in 
New Delhi after the Indian police 
rescued them from Muslim separatists in 
Kashmir speaks of now on the third 
Thursday of every month, a bus with two 
dozen men pulls away from a secret 
rendezvous in Karachi and travels 1,000 
kms north to a base in Afghanistan 
where the men spend the next 40 days in 
base training "for a worldwide holy 
war." 

 
"Since the end of the Afghan war in 
1989, the report said Pakistan officials 
estimate that at least 10,000 militants 
have been trained by various groups in 
the Pakistan-Afghanistan border area 
which are 'unpatrolled and lawless'. 
Sudanese, Egyptian and Libyan veterans 
of the Afghan war were the instructors 
in exclusive training camps run by Arabs 
for recruits of West Asian origin." 

 
"Funding for our organisation largely 
comes from Saudi Arabia, where several 
philanthrophists are not happy with the 
way the country is governed by the 
ruling family," said a Markaz 
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activist, the International Herald Tribune 
report said. A Harkat official claimed 
that this organisation's largest donor was 
a group of Muslim merchants from India 
who now live in England. The group 
claims to collect millions of dollars a 
year in public fund-raising drives in 
Pakistan's cities, when they plead 'for 
money to pay for their holy war against 
Indian troops in Kashmir." 

 
SHRI INDER KUMAR GUJRAL: 1 

think my friend did not understand me 
'correctly. I never said that the trouble 
began after the visit of Rafsanjani. I was 
only trying to say... 

DR. MURLI MANOHAR JOSHI: 
Yes, I agree you were trying to... 

SHRI INDER KUMAR GUJRAL: 
...how desparate they are because their 
policy in Kashmir was not successful to 
that extent. It was their feeling of despair. 

DR. MURLI MANOHAR JOSHI: 
"The report also mentioned that during 
last month's visit by Ms Bhutto to the 
Philippines, President Fidel V. Ramos 
protested that Pakistanis were fighting 
alongside Muslim extremists battling for 
autonomy against his Government. 
Russia has also charged that Pakistanis 
are aiding the separatist war going on in 
Chechnya." 

"That Pakistanis are involved in their 
Jihad is clear from the fact reported in the 
IHT report that while conducting street 
corner recruiting in Karachi, Tariq Cheema 
circulated a list of names and addresses of 
56 Markaz members killed last year during 
fighting against Government troops in 
Tajikistan, the Philippines, Bosnia and 
Kashmir. And this is only one of the many 
Pakistani groups involved in the so-called 
Jihad to conquer the world." 

 

and    to    spread    a    particular    type    
fundamentalism. 

to destabilise many countries
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THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 

KHAPARDE): Shri Janeshwar Misra. Not 
here. Shri Janardan Yadav. Not here. Shri 
Virendra Kataria. 

SHRI S. JAIPAL REDDY: Madam, who 
is going to reply to the debate? 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): As I told you, the Home 
Minister is going to reply. 

SHRI CHIMANBHAI MEHTA (Gujarat): 
Madam, let the debate be over. 
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Then this question can be raised. (Inter-
ruptions)... They have spoken and we are 
entitled to speak. First let the debate be over. 
Then raise the issue. 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: We have 
raised our points. How long are we going to 
sit? 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): There are a few more 
Members before me. 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: How 
long are we going to sit here? 

SHRI CHIMANBHAI MEHTA: Let all 
the speakers speak. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): I think it will take half-an-
hour more. We will finish it within half-an-
hour. 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA: How 
many speakers are left? 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): Seven speakers are left. 

SHRI CHIMANBHAI MfcriTA: How 
much time have the previous speakers taken? 
Why are they asking about other people? All 
the Members listed should be allowed to 
speak. 
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†[] Transliteration in Arabic Script. 
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In an interview to A&I TV for its weekly 
news programme Ghumta Aiyana which 
was telecast on March, 25th, Mast Gul had 
said that he would not hesitate to blow up 
the shrine. In the same interview, the 
Afghan national rejected India's offer of 
safe passage to Pakistan and declared, "I 
can go and come to Pakistan as I wish." 
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†[] Transliteration in Arabic Script. 
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THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): Thank you. Mr. Janeshwar 
Misra. 

SHRI NILOTPAL BASU (West Bengal): 
How long are we to sit here? Please take 
the sense of the House. If the reply is not 
going to be given today, then adjourn the 
House. Let the rest of the speakers speak 
tomorrow. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): In the Business Advisory 
Committee meeting, we had decided to sit 
in the House up to 7 p.m. and sometimes 
beyond 7 p.m. also. There are seven more 
Members who have to 

speak. Let us finish with all the speakers 
today. 

SHRI NILOTPAL BASU: No, no. This 
cannot go on. We can sit only up to 7 p.m. 
What is the use? Let the other speakers 
speak tomorrow. Please take the sense of 
the House. 

SYED SIBTEY RAZI: Madam, this is 
not fair. Some Members have been waiting 
here since morning to speak. They have not 
got a chance because of the other Members 
who have already spoken. I think this is not 
fair. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): Mr. Janeshwar Misra has 
been sitting here since morning and now 
when he has to speak, you want me to 
adjourn the House. 

SYED SIBTEY RAZI: Madam, you did 
not get my point. I said that we should 
finish it today. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): I appreciate your stand and I 
now request Mr. Janeshwar Misra to speak. 

 

SHRI NILOTPAL BASU: What is this? 
Please take the sense of the House. 

If the reply is tomorrow, then the rest of 
the speakers can also speak tomorrow. What 
is the trouble? I don't understand. 
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SHRI PASUMPON THA. 
KIRUTTINAN (Tamil Nadu): Madam, it is 
better to continue tomorrow because the 
Minister is going to reply tomorrow only. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE): What I would like to say is, 
let Mr. Janeshwar Mishra speak today and 
the rest of the Members can speak 
tomorrow. Is that okay? 

 
SHRI S.B. CVHAVAN: If you don't 

mind, there is one point that I want to 
make.   Tomorrow,   there   is   a   Calling 

 Attention Motion and if, by any chance, the 
Calling Attention Motion were to get 
preference over the discussion that we are 
having, then, of course, the entire thing 
will be delayed. If the hon. Members are 
prepared for the Calling Attention, instead 
of tomorrow, it might be taken up the next 
day so that we get full opportunity to hear 
the six or seven Members, who are left and 
who would like to speak, and thereafter, I 
will reply. 

THE      VICE-CHAIRMAN      (MISS 
SAROJ KHAPARDE): Today? 

SHRI S.B. CHAVAN: Not today, but 
tomorrow. 
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7.00 P.M. 
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DR. BIPLAB DASGUPTA: Madam, may 

I make a request? I mean no disrespect to the 
hon. Home Minister. But the Home Minister 
has not been in charge of the Kashmir 
portfolio. Therefore, we would prefer — at 
least, I would prefer; I think most of the 
Members from the Opposition would prefer 
— the Prime Minister coming and giving the 
reply to the debate here. Chavanji can 
intervene. We would appreciate his 
intervention, but he has not been in charge 
of the Kashmir portfolio, as I said. 
Therefore, it would be better if the Prime 
Minister comes and gives the reply. This 
would be my request to Chavanji. 
(Interruptions) 

SHRI S.B. CHAVAN : Madam, as I said 
earlier, I am going to give the reply. The 
Prime Minister cannot find time and that is 
why it would be difficult for him. 

DR. BIPLAB DASGUPTA : If it is 
tomorrow? (Interruptions) 
we are interested in the Prime Minister 
coming      and      giving      the      reply. 
(Interruptions). 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (Miss Saroj 
Kharpadc): Hon. Members: before me, I 
have a list of the Members who are going to 
speak tomorrow. They are: Shri O.P. 
Kohli... (Interruptions) 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY .OF PARLIAMENTARY 
AFFAIRS (SHRIMATI MARGARET 
ALVA): Madam, how many more have to 
speak? 

DR. MURLI MANOHAR JOSHI: Would 
the remaining speakers take their chance 
tomorrow? (Interruptions) 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (Miss Saroj 
Kharpade): I am going to adjourn the 
House. But before that, I want to bring this 
to the notice of the hon. Members. There 
are seven more names in the list 

before me. There would, certainly, be no 
addition to this list. The names are: ... 

DR. MURLI MANOHAR JOSHI: 
Madam, I think Mr. Sikander Bakht's name 
is there. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (Miss Saroj 
Kharpade): Mr. Sikander Bakht's name is 
there. 

SHRI S. JIPAL REDDY: Madam, if the 
Prime Minister is not going to reply 
tomorrow...(Interruptions)     This is a 
matter      of     paramount   importance. 
Therefore,      I      am      repeating      the 
point... (Interruptions) 

SHRIMATI MARGARET ALVA: How 
many more names are left, Madam? 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (Miss Saroj 
Kharpade): The names are: Shri Sikander 
Bakht, Shri O.P. Kohli, Dr. Alladi P. 
Rajkumar, Shri Chimanbhai Mehta, 
Maulana Habirbur Rahman Nomani, Shri 
Triloki Nath Chaturvedi and Shri 
Tindivanam G. Venkatraman. 

SHRIMATI MARGARET ALVA: Dr. 
B.B. Dutta's name is there. 

DR.   BIPLAB   DASGUPTA :   What 
about Mr. Nilotpal Baso? 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ   
KHAPARDE) :   His   name   is 
there. 

SHRIMATI MARGARET ALVA: 
Madam, what 1 am saying is the total time 
allotted for this was four hours. I think we 
have taken more than five hours. Therefore, 
the question is whether there is time left for 
the parries, or, whether, tomorrow, we want 
to give more time to the different parties. I 
am asking this because the Budget is also to 
be discussed tomorrow and the day after. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE) : There is no time left for the 
discussion. We have already exhausted the 
time allotted. I adjour the House till 
tomorrow ..(Interruptions) 



 

SHRIMATI MARGARET ALVA : We 
should finish it today. (Interruptions) SHRI 
GURUDAS DAS GUPTA : If the Prime 
Minister is not going to reply, what is the 
harm in the Home Minister giving the reply 
today itself? Let him reply today itself. 
(Interruptions) 
Madam, the point is, this is an important 
discussion. If it is going to spill over 
tomorrow, it becomes totally formalistic. It 
becomes totally formalistic Many important 
issues have been raised. SHRIMATI 
MARGARET ALVA : Let them be 
answered. 

SHRI GURUDAS DAS GUPTA : Our 
demand was that the Prime Minister should 
come and give the reply. If the Prime 
Minister is not going to reply, let 

the Home Minister give the reply today 
itself. Otherwise, the whole discussion 
becomes infructuous. (Interruptions) 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE) : Mr. Gurudas Das Gupta, I 
do not have any objection, it the House is 
prepared to sit. 

SHRI SATYA PRAKASH 
MALAVIYA: Madam, you have already 
adjourned the House. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (MISS SAROJ 
KHAPARDE) : I adjourn the House till 11 
a.m. tomorrow. 

The House then adjourned at eighteen 
minutes past seven of the clock till eleven 
of the clock on Tuesday, the 16th May, 
1995. 
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