
53        Written Answers [23 MARCH 1993] to Questions 54  

 

Telecom Research Centre in the Country, 

*400. SHRI G. PRATHAPA REDDY : 
DR. SHRIKANT RAMCHAN-DRA 
JICHKAR : 

Will the Minister of COMMUNICATIONS 
be pleased to state : 

(a) what is the total strength of the em-
ployees of the Telecom Research Centre and 
the total amount of money being annually 
spent on it; 

(b) what is the nature of the latest research 
being done at this Centre; 

(c) what is the reason that this Centre has 
not provided or developed technology relating 
to cellular telephones and paging devices; and 

(d) whether this Centre has become re-
dundant in view of Government's policy al 
liberalisation by which all latest technology is 
available ? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMUNICATIONS (SHRI 
SUKH RAM) ; (a) to (d) The original 
Telecom Research Centre (TRC) under 
Department of Telecommunication set up in 
1956 continued till 1988. The manpower of 
TRC in 1988 was about 450. Thereafter the 
TRC was bifurcated into "TRC Society" and 
"Telecom Engineering Centre (TEC)". The 
TRC Society was entrusted with exclusing 
development of Transmission systems. The 
"TRC Society" subsequently was merged with 
Centre for Development of Telematics in 
1989. TEC continues to function to carry-out 
activities such as standardisation, validation of 
systems, validation of products for induction 
to DOT network, study and field trial of new 
technologies, minor development works to 
meet DOT's operation and maintenance 
requirements and has a strength of about 389. 

The C-DOT was created as an autonomous 
society for the devclopmenl of switch-ing 
system in  1984.    Now all the research 
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and development activities are being done by 
Centre for Development of Telematics (C-
DOT). 

The C-DOT has manpower of 939 emp-
loyees and the annual expenditure for the 
current financial year is estimated at Rs. 41.55 
crores. 

. The C-DOT is engaged in design and 
development of state-of-the art switching & 
transmission technologies. 

• The development of Cellular Telephone 
system and paging devices are not in the 
priority development of C-DOT. 

The recent liberalisation of the Government 
Policy will not affect the C-DOT. The C-DOT 
designed and developed exchanges are most 
appropriate to suit climatic conditions of rural 
lndia. 

 

Vayudoot   services from Ludhiana 

3364. SHRI JAGIR SINGH DARD ; Will 
the Minister of CIVIAI. AVIATION 
&TOURISM be pleased to state : 

fa) whether Vayudoot services arc in 
operation from Ludhiana to Delhi; if so, what 
are the details thereof; 

(b) whether Government of Punjab have 
requested the Central Government for the 
increase of flight of Vayudoot from Ludhiana 
to Delhi; 

(c) if so, what are the details thereof; and 

(d) what is the reaction of Government 
thereto ? 

THE MINISTER OF CIVIL AVIATION 
AND TOURISM (SHRI GHULAM NABI 
AZAD) ; (a) Vayudoot is at present ope-rating 
six clays a week Dornier services on the route 
Delhi-Ludhiana-Chandigarh-Delhi. 

(b) to (d) Vayudoot has received a request 
from the Government of Punjab for increasing 
the present frequency of one flight to two 
flights a day. The present load does not 
warrant operation of two flights a day to 
Ludhiana. 

 


