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Setting-op of Staff  Women Commission in 
Delhi 

3388. SHRIMATI CHANDRIKA ABHI-
NANDAN JAIN: Will the Minister of 
HUMAN RESOURCE DEVELOPMENT be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether any State Women Commission 

would be set up in Delhi; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; 

(c) what would be the term of office of the 
proposed Commission together with the 
number of its members and the criteria to be 
followed for their selection; 

(d) what is the amount likely to be allocated 
as token funds for the Commission and What 
will be the respective share of State and 
Central Government therein; and 

(e) the details of the schemes likely to be 
undertaken by the State Women Commission 
and the provisions made to solve their 
problems ? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF HUMAN RESOURCE 
DEVELOPMENT (DEPARTMENT OF 
WOMEN AND CHILD DEVELOPMENT) 
(SMT. BASAVA RAJESWARI): (a) Yes, Sir. 

(b) to (c) Details are being worked out by 
the Government of the National Capital 
Territory of Delhi. ' 

(d) No Central Government grant is 
provided for Setting up of State Women's 
Commissions. The National Capital Territory 
of Delhi has made a provision of Rs. 1 lakh 
for the year 1993-94 and Rs. 10 lakhs  for the 
year  1994-95. 

Guidelines for  Admission  in  Professional 

College 

3389. PROF. VIJAY KUMAR MAL-
HOTRA : Will the Minister of HUMAN 
RESOURCE DEVELOPMENT be pleased to 
state : 

(a) whether the Supreme Court had laid 
down guidelines for admission into privately 
owned professional colleges ; 

(b) if so, the details thereof ; 

(c) whether there is any similar proposal to 
lay down guidelines for Government owned 
professional colleges ; 

(d) if so, the details thereof; and 

(e) if not, the reasons therefor ? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN TIT 
MINISTRY OF HUMAN RESOURCE 
DEVELOPMENT (DEPARTMENT OF 
EDUCATION AND DEPARTMENT OF 
CULTURE) (KUMARI SELJA): (a) to (c) 
The Supreme Court in its judgement dated 4-
2-1993 in Unnikrishnan's case prescribed a 
Scheme for regulating admission into private, 
unaided professional colleges. According to 
the earmarking, 50% seats as free seats and 
remaining 50% as payment 
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seats both art- to he filled on the basis of 
merit. The fee to be charged by professional 
college-, in each State will be as decided by a 
State Committee. 

The Supreme Court has covered only the 
private, unaided professional colleges with a 
view to ensure abolition of capitation fee and 
admissions to be. made on the basis of merit 
alone. 

 
 


