
51 Written Answers [RAJYA SABHA to Questions 52 

Prosecutions under Weights and 
Measures Act 

4238. SHRI T. VENKATRAM REDDY: 
Will the Minister of CIVIL SUPPLIES, 
CONSUMER AFFAIRS AND PUBLIC 
DISTRIBUTION   be pleased to 
state : 

(a) the number of prosecutions made 
under the Weights and Measures Act, State-
wise, during the last two years; 

(b) whether it is a fact that in a number of 
Fair Price Shops also the proper certified 
weights are not used; and 

(c) what steps are being taken to see that 
proper certified weights and measures are  
used  in Fair Price Shops ? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF CIVIL SUPPLIES, 
CONSUMER AFFAIRS & PUBLIC 
DISTRIBUTION (SHRI KAMALUD-D1N 
AHMED) : (a) to (c) The enforcement of the 
Weights and Measures Laws is done by the 
States/Union Territories. The details are not 
readily available in the Ministry, and will be 
collected from the States/Union Territories 
and will be laid on the Table of the House. 

 

Loans taken by  the   Employees of  Super 
Bazar 

4240. SHRI GOPALSINH G. SO-LANKI : 
Will the Minister of CIVIL SUPPLIES, 
CONSUMER AFFAIRS AND     PUBLIC     
DISTRIBUTION     be 
pleased to state : 

(a) whether there is any provision for 
take-homs salary for the employees of 
consumer societies viz. Super Bazar and 
Kendriya Bhandar, on percentage basis; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; 

(c) what is the number of employees who 
have taken loans like housing, vehicle and 
emloyees credit society's loan during the last 
three years, in Super Bazar ; 

(d) the number of (Persons) employees 
name-wise whose loans have been sanctioned 
and taken by the employees of the Super 
Bazar; and 

(e) the norms and policy laid down by the 
Management in this regard and the mode of 
repayment ? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF CIVIL SUPPLIES, 
CONSUMER AFFAIRS & PUBLIC 
DISTRIBUTION (SHRI KAMALUD-DIN 
AHMED) : (a) .No. Sir. 

(b) Does not arise. 

(c) Super Bazar has reported that the 
number of employees of Super Bazar who 
have availed of the facility of vehicle loan 
and loan from Super Bazar Co-operative 
Thrift and Credit Society at 

 


