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Income Tax and Central Excise does 
against M/s.   LT.C. Ltd. 

3749.  SHRI   SARADA     MOHANTY: 

SHRI   ANANTRAY 

DEVSHANKER      DAVE: 

SHRIMATI  MIRA  DAS: 

SHRI CHIMANBHAI MEHTA: 

SHRI J.   S.  RAJU: 

Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased 
to refer the answer to Unstarred Question 297 
given in the Rajya Sabha on 3rd September, 
1991 and state the progress of investigation of 
Enforcement Directorate after taking over the 
cases relating to M/s. ITC Ltd. from Direc-
torate   of   Revenue   Intelligence? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI 
RAMESHWAR THAKUR): The Unstarred 
Question No. 297 replied in Rajya Sabha on 
3rd September, 1991 related to the Central 
excise and income tax dues against cigarette 
companies including I.T.C. limited and the 
show cause notices pending adjudication 
against these companies. None of these cases 
was taken over by the Enforcement 
Directorate. As such, the question of any 
progress of investigation by the Enforcement 
Directorate in those cases does not  arise. 

 

 

Premium   collected towards health Insur-

ance Schemes 

3751. DR. YELAMANCHILI SIVAJI: 

Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased   

to   state: 

(a) what are the company-wise details of 

total premium collected by General Insurance 

Companies towards Health Insurance Scheme 

and what is the total amount of claim during 

the last three years; and 

(b) what is the year-wise outstanding 

claim amount for the said period? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY     OF      FINANCE      (SHRI 


