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provide for any special responsibility of the 
Governor for— 

(a) the establishment of separate development 
boards for Vi-darbha, Marathwada, (and the 
rest of Maharashtra or, as the case may be, ) 
Saurashtra, Kutch and the rest of Gujarat 
with the provision that a report on the 
working o'f each of these boards will be 
placed each year before the State Legislative 
Assembly. 

The special development board previously 
was granted by the Central Government to the 
Kutch area but it was cancelled after some 
years by the Central Government. Recently, 
the Central Government has declared a 
development board for the Marathwada 
region. The long standing demand of the 
people of Kutch for the development board is 
pending with the Central Government. We 
demand that our special development board 
should be headed by the Chief Minister and 
not by the Governor because the Chief 
Minister is answerable to the Legislative 
Assembly. Secondly, Madam, our board 
should be provided with sufficient funds by 
the Central Government. Thirdly, Madam, our 
board should have the provision of proper 
services of the Central Government as well as 
the State Government. Lastly, we demand that 
there must be technical institutions in Kutch 
area and a technical college should be 
provided in our area. This has been our 
demand since long but still it has not been 
provided to this area. Our area is a backward 
area. It fe situated on border and that is why, 
this provision has been made in the 
Constitution and our demand must be fulfilled. 
So I request the Central Government through 
this House, to fulfil our demand. 

SHRI DINESHBAI TRIVEDI (Gujarat): I 
associate myself with the sentiments 
expressed by the hon. Member. 

SHRI MURLIDHAR CHANDRA-KANT 
BHANDARE (Maharashtra): If it is Kutch, I 
also associate. 
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SHRI GAJ     SINGH     (Rajasthan): 
Madam, I  associate. 
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