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the said steep increase in the procurement 
and minimum support prices of paddy and 
other kharif crops including groundnut and 
whether it would not result in the increase 
in prices of other essential commodities; 
and 

(c) the steps proposed to be taken by 
Government to check the price rise? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
DEPARTMENT OF RURAL 
DEVELOPMENT IN THE MINISTRY 
OF AGRICULTURE (SHRI 
UPENDRA NATH VERMA): (a) The 
procurement / minimum support prices for 
Rabi crops of 1989-90 to be marketed in 
1990-91 season were revised in. ApriT, 
1990. 

(b) All commodities Wholesale Price 
Index (base 1981-82 = 100) for March, 
1990, i.e. before the revision of 
procurement / minimum support prices 
for Rabi crops was 170.1. After the 
announcement of the prices for Kharif 
crops of 1990-91, the Wholesale Price 
Index in July, 1990 (average for 3 w6eks) 
was' 178.1. 

The price movements of essential 
commodities etc. depend on' factors like 
production, supply and demand situation, 
money supply, general price situation, 
international prices etc. 

(c) Steps being taken by Government 
include judicious release of essential 
commodities through the Public 
Distribution System, - augmented 
availability through enhanced production 
and/or imports if necessary, stringent 
measures to prevent hoarding and black 
marketing, fiscal and monetary 'measures, 
etc. 
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