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Cabinet Committee has been constituted 
on Panchayati Raj to look into the 
various issues relating to Panchayati Raj; 

(b) All Constitutional aspects will be, 
considered before any Bill is introduced; 

(c) Government is committed to 
strengthen the Panchayati Raj system in 
the country. 

Reintroduotion  of Nagar Palika Bill 

49. SHRI RAOOF VALIULLAH: 
Will the Minister of URBAN DEVE-
LOPMENT be pleased to state: 

(a) whether Government are con-
sidering to re-introduce the Nagar Palika 
Bill in Parliament, if so, what are the 
salient features of the Bill distinct from 
the earlier one; 

(b) whether Government are com-
mitted to give power to the people by 
giving Constitutional status to the Nagar 
Palikas; and 

(c) whether the Central-State relations 
in respect of financial devolution would 
be looked into afresh and Central and 
State subjects would be further divided 
for this purpose? 

THE MINISTER OF URBAN DE-
VELOPMENT (SHRI MURASOLI 
MARAN); (a) to (c) Government is 
committed to devolve adequate financial 
and administrative powers to States to 
enable them to discharge their 
responsibilities to the people and is also 
committed to promote a genuine 
devolution of powers, functions and 
resources to Local bodies, within the 
federal structure of the Constitution, 
enabling fullest participation of the 
people in the developmental process, 
through appropriate administrative, 
financial and legislative measures. 
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I. Report and Accounts of the 
various State Agro Industries Dev-
elopment Corporations and related 
papers. 

n. Report and AccOunts (for 12th 
October 1987 to 31st March, 1988) of 
the National Dairy Development 
Board, Anand, Gujarat and related 
Papers. 

HI. Notifications of the Ministry of 
Agriculture (Department cf Agriculture 
and Cooperation) 
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