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port requirements of the growing po- 
pulation of Delhi. In the present ar- 
rangements, the buses of private ope- 
rators operate in accordance with the 
schedule prescribed by the DTC who 
control and monitor these operatiom. 
Whenever "any irregularity is detect- 
ed, the DTC not only instructs the 
private operators to ensure operations 
as per schedule but als0 strict action 
is taken including levy of penalties, 
depending on the nature of the ir- 
regularity. There is no proposal be- 
fore the Government at present to 
Teplace the existing arrangement. 

(e) and (f) Route rationalisation is 
a continuous process for the DTC as 
a whole. The work of route ration- 
alisation by DTC is continuing since 
October, 1987. Out of 727 routes, 353 
routes have been rationalised s0 far 
including 98 routes in South Region. 

 

 

Release of Indian  Prisoners of War 
detained in Pakistan 

*133.  SHRI LAL K. ADVANl- 
SHRI ASHWANI KUMAR. 

Will the Minister of EXTERNAL 
AFFAIRS be pleased to state- 

(a) whether Government of India 
have recently forwarded in Pakistan 
a list of about 1100 Indians (includ- 
ing at least six women & twelve 
children) for repatriation; if so, what 
is the response of Pakistan Govern- 
ment thereto and the follow-up ac- 
tion taken  thereon; 

(b) whether India has also plead- 
ed for the release of prisoners 0f war 
of 1965 and 1971; if so, the number 
thereof and what is the response of 
Pakistan thereto; and 

(c) what are the outlines of India's 
programme in this regard? 

THE MINISTER OF EXTERNAL 
AFFAIRS (SHRI p. V. NARASIMHA 
RAO);   (a)  No,  Sir. 

(b) and (c)' There are 54 Indian 
missing defence personnel of the 1971 
Indo-Pak conflict who are believed to 
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be in Pakistani jails. While Pakistan 
has consistently denied their presence 
in their jails, they have at our request 
undertaken to conduct a fresh enquiry 
into the matter. We are continuing 
to"press Pakistan on this issue. 

Specialised Police Force  t0  protect 

Historic  Monuments 

* 134. SHRIMATI RATAN KUMARL 

DR.   RATNAKAR  PANDEY: 

Will the Minister of HUMAN RE- 
SOURCE DEVELOPMENT be pleased 
to state; 

(a) whether there is any proposal 
under Government's consideration for 
the creation 0f a specialised police 
force vested with the sole responsibi- 
lity of protecting the country's my- 
riad historic monuments; and. 

(b) if so, what are the details 

thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF HUMAN RE- 
SOURCE DEVELOPMENT (SHRI P. 
SHIV SHANKER);  (a)  No,  Sir. 

(b) Question does not arise. 

Complaints from Training Institutions 
for Women in distress 

*135. DR. BAPU KALDATE: Will 

th8 Minister of HUMAN RESOURCE 

DEVELOPMENT be pleased to state: 

(a) whether Government have re- 
ceived complaints from training insti- 
tutions for women in distress for not 
releasing the . amounts sanctioned/ 
granted to them; and 

(b) what are the names of such ins- 
titutions in various States which have 
been closed for non-availability of 
adequate funds and harassment from 
bureaucrats|administrators? 

THE MINISTER OF HUMAN RE- 
SOURCE DEVELOPMENT (SHRI P. 
SHIV SHANKER):  (a)  Yes, Sir. 

(b) No such case has been "brought 
to the notice of the Central Govern- 
ment,  

Schemes for better Management of 

University System 

*136. SHRI D. B. CHANDRE. 
GOWDA; Will the Minister of 
HUMAN RESOURCE DEVELOP- 
MENT be pleased to' state; 

(a) whether the University Grants 
Commission hag recently initiated 
several new schemes for better man- 
agement of the . University system. in 
the country; and 

(b) if so, what are the details 
thereof?  

THE MINISTER OF HUMAN 
RESOURCE DEVELOPMENT (SHRI 
P. SHIV SHANKER): (a) and (b) 
The. University Grants Commission 
was established under an Act of Par- 
liament in 1956 to make provision for 
coordination and determination of 
standards in universities. The Com- 
mission has since its inception taken 
various measures and formulated a 
number of innovative schemes to 
achieve its objectives. In Pursuance 
of the thrust areas identified by the 
National' Policy ton Education—1980, 
the U.G.C. has recently initiated a 
number of schemes in the higher 
education sector. The schemes initia- 
ted by the Commission for better 
management of the university system 
in the country include the following: 

(i)  Scheme of Autonomous Colleges 

The major objectives of this scheme 
are de-centralisation of academic 
administration, freedom to colleges to 
frame their own courses, provide for 
teaching and conduct of examinations, 
etc.. encouragement to innovation and 
experimentation. Since the announce- 
ment of .the Policy, 76 college., have 
been conferred autonomy, bringing 
the total number of autonomous 
colleges in the country to 96. 


