RAJYA SABHA [6 December, 2006]

DR. K. MALAISAMY: Let all these things be taken care of. Will it be
effective and adequate? That is the point I would like to know.

SHR! A.K. ANTONY: We are very particular that we must take effective
and adequate steps. We must redress the grievance of the jawans. That is
why I asked the Committee that they must give the report within two
months. Once I get the report, we will start implementing the report.
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Fund under PMGSY to Jharkhand

#206. SHRI AJAY MAROO: Will the Minister of RURAL
DEVELOPMENT be pleased to state:

(a) the amount that has been allocated to the State of Jharkhand under the
Pradhan Mantri Gram Sadak Yojana;

(b) the amount utilized out of the said amount; and
(c) the current status of the said scheme in Jharkhand?

TOriginal notice of the question was received in Hindi.
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THE MINISTER OF RURAL DEVELOPMENT  (SHRI
RAGHUVANSH PRASAD SINGH): (a) Rs. 890.00 crore under regular
Pradhan Mantri Gram Sadak Yojana and Rs. 75.00 crore under World Bank
funded PMGSY has been allocated to the State of Jharkhand upto October,
2006.

(b)An expenditure of Rs. 434.26 crore has been incurred against the
release of Rs. 504.41 crores upto October, 2006 under the programme.

(C) The total value of projects sanctioned so far is Rs. 633.03 crore. 629
road works for a length of 3362.37 Kms have been sanctioned out of which
447 road works covering a length of 2367 Kms have been completed. 182
road works for a length of 995 Kms are in progress.

oY 35T 9T : HEISY, “UTFHAT YT g AT UTSIY & AT Bt
IR DI T, HRA WRBR B 3T Agcardiel aRvdg Ao ol $9$ T8d
HRT WRBR 1 IA-TRTETT P AT & PR AT P S NS FqB
Pl B HIGH dTell TSDI I SIS BT BRIBH JRE fhaT o) 3 JUH IR0 §
U TSR A 371 STETET et TiaT iR fF<i a=oT & 500 ¥ 31ferd mare areft
T BT SIS BT HRIHH 2|

H3i HEIGY F 39 STaTd H Hel b AFEaR,2006 AP 890 BRIS BUY DI MY
dfed @t 18 ol fh FIRES Ua UwsT gl I &, offdp a8 WR 54
IS D1 AT HIA H BIBT BT fa@TE TS & 3R 890 RIS A A ATH 434 FRIS
S0 B A gY | BTl O AT H 5 AT & Bl B: BT BRI 9t 8T
2, Afp IR # el IR &1 $1d &1 I 8T 2

H A A HEIGd | 8 ST ATl g (b A1 Bl R R A 3R
DR & folQ AT T H&H IT B &, [ 6 Sl 434 BRIS $UY, ST 99 g
§, ST SYANT 81 SITY 3R I8 377 AT BT 207 H AT Y2

2N Tga vE R : AU HE ISy, SRS 1Y Bl Hog i BuRie] o3
2189 32 IR-IR RATES AT 8, sqd fov 396 Ashest & A1 936 U
RS T 7, I A &6 A1 Sod B 8 6 I 3 gt Hufad @y
0| I B BIs HHI 81 21 e & I8 9% Sifex © fb S9a1 i 890
FRIS BYY BT &, <Afeh 31 T I Hof 416 BRIS B € @I B Y &1 &
489 PRIS BUY Reflsl BR QU &, A1 & 89 9 W g&Is W1 & & I 9
SR FURTET FeT¢ IR ITd! Sl SRHSOIRE 2, SH AT B R
SSNIRT @ HHI 7, IAD fog W &9 H8T 2 T s & TdR &1 wergar
PR F U TR 2, T SIRES o7 ff 3=y TR B IRE MU Hog (T
HURIET QT B AT Bl TSB! I STre DI Sl AISTT &, ITH A 31T
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eIy, I8 U1 A1 AT DI & @A AT © | 57 A GST 7 30
B A < &1 | 50 APR TR 89 GG 2 6 % 71 @ 9g1Y 3iiR -
Tial BT FSHI B SIS B S ASHT 8,781, fd a8l IR Afeardl aga
oI & | BRI 18 STal <9 YR § YR 4107 § S9IR &1 SIS Bl e
2,T81 TT39el SATh H,USTS! SlTh § 500 O Bl JATETET BT 2009 dh BH SIS
ST 8 U8 § BRI YR AT &1 Hrd| I vy ded 8 b T.8.0.%
RTST 3 YET H31 919 A AN Y g Al | Al 59 S5 BR BRIS ATeA]
Al HRAT AT AR 3F B i AT NH 12 TR PRIS ATA Gd B DI
RT3 & | 3AfeTT ST 3iR TIoil A oI fopam |

sft 35T 9re: ABICY, 39 9wls ¥ 89 W A8l 8¢ 9ad [ I8
TS0 SRIHI H 3R™ g AISHl © | Helad,Je H3ll U1 dedh
AISHT H b e YUl a1 & b B HIGH B1 TS I BT BRIHH AT,aifh
P5 IR W qukrerd AR Sl 8 | AFAg 73 A8, H I8 S
=TT g b g <27 | I8 Sl 0 S REN & T A$b S VIR B & I8 §
3R R PIS b1 Told) ST g HY I8! & ?

4t Ig gae e 78i9y, Udhed A% A er 2 o Tura d qHsiid
DI BIS YoIe e 7 | Fanferet dgiar off foar Rivew ® | 918t g IR
T PR BT © 8] B2 (SR, Ahs [EAR I AR $ e H & | o) fear o
g IRBR gRT A Il Hiex Bl AT HRb B BRIs STl & |
R w9 Ugd I H THFGA ST BT W g7 Seiege a1 g aife
FTAST § BIS TSl 7 8l | 3R Fel A RIe1ad frer IR R eH! Hoiah
AT FTfIET AR §IRT SHD! ST1d BRI STl & 3R BRATS B ST 2 |

it Tl aredt: T=, 77T ware oft =it & qanfeoras © % < g w5
U FSH IS 8,94 Hgel MaTHE B 9gd AR IS 8 ITH A U AT
I A1 8 | i1 <31 # I8 3 & o St U1 gl TTawiie Aokl & SHPT 1T
SRS T TaHE &l Hell 2 [[FHD! FaTferct iR 9gd ST df T 8l &
TR UBT STR IS H a1 ASd &1 8] 97d1 § 3R STR Y H ...(AQEH)...

it 3R RE: Thad Tad I B © | ...(FaeT)...
sft enfee RifEmt: *
8ﬂ3T¥I'\’ﬁﬁ='*

*Not recorded.
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it gumafa: 93T, 3f3T, wieT 2@ IR Wi | ...(@agM)...

£} RIS Sreelt: WX, AT PR VBT E | ...(FFEH)...
£} TR STed] BT | ..(FaEH)...
it S<a yam e *

Nt umafa: e 2,31% 7 | <Rau,smy Af3v | ..(aum).. ey w3
HRY | ...(THUH)...q8 Y BIFST |

7t RS STt B, S aTe Al Y8 QI | .. (Fae™). .

Y wumfy: sfev-afsu,sa9a siom T | . (au ). Th
fime,am af3y | ..(caum)..3Y F' W} B 5 wsdh 9gd o T
..(FAIM)...YP 7,37 95 Wz | Rere ) &1 < @71 8,Ree ) 15
T ST | 319 HE X2 & b Fob 98 a1 & 3R A Hed & [ s 78] a1
2 1 g1 e e e € f asd o g1 I8 S 7 1(aem).. s9foy
TaHe gt fh denml EISREERIEICEIRISESE] %,Let the Government
speak.

ot Tf¥re St R, 7”7 Tt © o .. (=asm ). ..

Mt wumfa: 9 8RN I 98 BfeR I8 99 Tod ©
(FAYH)..aTR g 91d FEl § ..(FQHH)...3MY I1-931 7 ey |
...(TGET). .39 e SRTY, e | Ul S | ... (FET)...

ot Tf¥re a1 R, 7”7 ATt © o .. (asm ). ..

sfumaf: o9 FAveas HRY 1..(FEU)..3Y Fb9gaq gy |
..(FALT)... 93-S Tl Bl FOIToId 81 © | ..(FGLTH). .

it RS 3redlt « |R,ART HaTel |3l off 9 8 3R H S e g P
AR FITel BT STaTg H37 Sff 21 <3, fdt @R | #R_71 wardd 181 € | ..(cgae)... |
HA St | qo arEdl g 6 o Ul )ed $ 3iaR, V9 U wil & ofr, Sl ded
THE & T BT TS H7 3R B ...(ae™).. TR, 40161 9 T8 A @1 g
| ...(@GEH). .

ot quTaf : 39 R HRY | ...(FaLH)...

it TfdrE sred): WR, ™1 UeE U% ® P ...(aum).. ), H HE oft @
qoT ATedl § [ ST AR &1 31 a1 S5 U1 87 ...(FaHm)...

it At : S 2,3 g e FIfFReR |18d,3Y 918 | ....(aem ). .

*Not recorded.
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st WIR¥E 31ed): 3R BIs We TTa-He SHBI WA B! ©,dl &l
D! LY. SRR BT Al © 72 ....(SdHT)...

it Tgder gare R 9wl weiga,yee @50 9 9sd e Uh
HecdThiel 3R <2 & oIy Hecqqol AISHI € | 3949 F@1ferc] & IR d A1
HERI 7 U YBT T FEIST, TSPI Bl Faifere] dl Sfia-gsdrd & forg off fear
R & | B feaR @ik s femR &) i IR&GRI & §RT & STl 8,39 d1
A 8 o 31 WX 0R 396 19 & ISIaRI 3R SR & UgIdR, ol R
B B 8, 971d R 8 | S 918 IS IR 7,8 U 98 a1,89 I8 A
USTHR SIid BRAT & | §H el Falfore] AR &l Siid HRard & 3R 394
Rrerad fieq )& fieq wR,38 ) f,396! 991 # fears, dfeRaa o
TR A7 HF RIS o 2,99P Gdg d g9 HRIAE! HRd & | sdIfory <97-
TR AR TS 99 I8 8,374 T HAl U G AT & A4 TShi b
TR I 8 | el Wi Wfthes RIBTId 811 IR, 89 S| ST1d Hrdl Aol
T AT FE SR Yo F IR H U3 I8 3 2,89d IR H g1 SR a1 2 |
IR U< M B3 a1 IR WF w3 7 ol G B 1...(FHH).. I
HEIGY,®s I, HH A HH 15 Iy 30 R &1 I Wd oxe § 99 B |
ID oY B9 15 1T &b A1 IRIER T99H H 8 | 89 g7 H3ll Sff bl o o
2,89 Ashe) & WY Jo& HRd AR I § SR S 7o 919 ge MU ?
.89 I18d & fhaTal H HogfiT HUfST 96 | 89 g1 WRI &M BT B |
JUTIf TeTey, g8 YR FEfor &)1 € ...(Fae)... IR Ul § 48 89K BRIS
WU @9 BRAT © R Tl H AR G A1 BRI & g9iry A Ga<il b
..(HGHT)... FHTIRT ARIGT, FS] Bl 399 S § 3R g1 4=7 fwa 2 f
YR A0 HRIBH THd BIHR BI,5HH Bl A8 T8l © | ...(FLH)...

St ST gEE: WR,H o Aegd | HA Sft | qudr aredl §
IR Y2 P IR H A g (575 fohar, g #4311 &l farg) fordl, wehet 3 a1
TN YT ¥ EH 0D 2,98 91 9E1 ¥ | 319 MY HERTS iR T8 & IR § R Y
T T ? 98 @ AR WX & WM DI GSh SId T81 2,39 99T W ¥ |
...(FHT)...J81 BIS ASP I 81 & | H HT Sl | Go1 T8l § [b Y T8i
S A R PFIILE ? ...(FqEH)...

MR. CHAIRMAN: Question Hour is over.
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