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Late printing of telephone  directory      in 

U.P. 
DR. MOHD. HASHIM KIDWAI (Uttar 

Pradesh): Mr. Vice-Chairman, I rise to draw 
the attention of the Government to an urgent 
matter of public importance. This pertains to 
the slowness in the publication of the up-to-
date or new edition of the telephone directory 
in U.P. and its very late delivery to the subs-
cribers. 

The Telecommunication Department is 
supposed to be among the fastest moving 
departments, but unfortunately the U.P. 
Teleeommunicaion department does not 
belong to this category. It still clings to the 
very old, slow moving departments. For 
instance, in Lucknow the latest telephone 
directory published and supplied to the 
telephone subscribers is only up to December. 
1986. while the. telephone directory of 
Aligarh is only up to June, 1986, and the 
subscribers are waiting for the up-to-date 
edition or the latest supplement to the 
telephone directory. What is the use of such 
telephone directories which are so much out 
of date? 


