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scientific source finding, construction of 
water harvesting structures for recharge, 
extenslion of distribution systems of existing 
schemes to needy areas, etc. are being 
implemented to mitigate drinking water 
shortage. 

(c) No Sir, such a proposal was 
considered earlier by Gujarat State 
Government and not found techno-
economically viable. 

(d) In line with the objective of the Inter-
national Decade on Water Supply and 
Sanitation, it is aimed to supply the entire 
rural population with safe and adequate 
drinking water by the end of the Seventh Plan 
period. The total irrigation potential of the 
country is 113 million hectares. About 60 per 
cent of this potential has already been created. 
The Seventh Plan envisages creation of 
additional irrigation potential of about 12.9 
million hectares. It lis expected that the 
ultimate irrigation potential of the country 
would be fully created by about 2010 A.D. 

Siphoning off of  lakhs of rupees in NEMC 

hot mix plant 

1416. SHRI V. NARAYANASAMY: Will 

the Minister of URBAN DEVELOPMENT 

be pleased to state: 

(a) whether it is a fact that siphoning off 
of lakhs of Rupees by the senior officials of 
Civil Engineering Department was unearthed 
in NDMC hot mix plant; and 

(b) what is the total amount mis-
appropriated and the names of the officers 
involved in scandal? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF URBAN DEVELOPMENT 
(SHRI DALBIR SINGH): (a) and (b) No, Sir. 
However, the Administrator,  New.  Delhi  
Municipal 

Committee has appointed a High Power 

Committee to look into the lapses pointed out 

by the Chief Technical Examiner's 

Organisation of the Central Vigilance 

Commission about the improper functioning 

of the NDMC Hot Mix Plant. 
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