Oral Answers

§34% ¢ |
A 5
%3

£
)
%dl

i1
CE

"’%”%

5 %3%
% o
w3y

a 4

%ﬁ

1%

g.:s;ﬁ' ®OFA F fad wdw far

frt WAt (o0 &0 "o T) ¢
(%) 9% (@) @tq ad & =
FAEATA® qITFAT ¥ 9frFa e
e gagfae afeadt fapgfea Taarfast
¥ griward #1 ¢4 §%aT 3,533
¥ 1 €7 @t IweREd ¥ ¥ 14
gafitard &1 o7a oft & wew
qrzgwst ¥ waw fegr mar ) fawa-
fegran & @9 oY W W wfger
@ e foig fwqr g afz §

qq

[14 AUG. 10891 _  to Questions . go

FEel § EW WA 97 wEW A
femr v o & &7 @T o T
faer &1 wrevw fgmdr oar ) aefy,
farafaem & gwde W gwafam
F@l ¥ oifgeR o ™ e -
! afew FT faar &

it e GRAATR : ATHHT e
of o, AT st ot Ao gwe femr
§ SE% SR T A W efwre
fFar f5 3,533 Ot H & IS 14
orEl & oy a% g3w fawr mar
AT 3519 OTEl F' T qF WAG .Y

et &o ®WYo WA : TARI Il

'wﬁé, fert & wow wrar & QY

Aae awa g feedt B e #v
#g-3@ IaN § & 14 7 SREET -
=y &1 fag mar &

SHRI PARVATHANENI UPEN-

DRA: It is a very serious matter.

0 wﬁmmﬁmm{ ¥ am-

-fra wadr wEew ¥ fadwm e fE

g feY wqare a%  w fear
e arfe i qEAT JT 9F |
qry magd T g ¥ "o GEW
feelt & qur 91 Afew gt
WAt oY ¥ It JEma oish i famm
s A MfeAa Farg g 9= e fgedi

TR # qsftga feg o
wgfaa fegfaa  swonfadt
# IR ¥ X gEAT 3,433 Wi
(w3 @ wny arm W Wed) 14,
geitamet M SIT6T I7 GHY -
<t sAer ©fq ¥ WART qUgy-
wat 7 qaw faar aay | favafaaragt |
F A9 el W N afewr J ;-



31 * Owal Answers
W A T §% grEe ST
3¢ 9 ff 9% ¥ g9 oW &
FRE H W oW 9% w&w
T faar T W fF e @ o
I frer &1 seaw Rl &1 ) oA,
fawfqaren ¥ geeic o Hefae
FAW 7 AriETETC A af BET w
efger T faar &

W e wEea™ . SSAY
AT S, A T F oge T
AT fox Y oF fawaar qrHT W-
fat & gewm af *1 faor @y &
ag qeatrargar 3 fo fm sfustal
F & wtew § g8 s faafas
Tt q3w I faur 9% fges @0
FT ¥ w7 Ty F1, v fame-
faarma & gfawiforl § 3% faars
T FOAATE AV 7

- st o ®Yo 9 : aﬂﬁmat fx
. fawmfearag 7 99 9 g @

qOIA @A FFF @ OWT
wFe xT fagr fa gt wmeww
¥ 93 gu Sy F3F arq § gwsr afean
T a0 O 3RSy agr arta@ar fam
_TH §

Y GqREE @A - Ay,
AL g FT IAT A1 fH=0 w9 A
g7 Ja| Afgq) du gw  feegw
"y AT " & @ fov afgsia
7 g wrsmw ¥ waw gt faarfagi
#1 waw ag) fear ge § 1 F41 a8
fam? ewar ®RW a1 § 7 7 a.g“ia
a8 fagr W WA & #fEmw W
Fd &1 wrwar 9TA g 3E% Rw
Wﬁ#ﬁr% faoda #1% fFan
¥ o agw g v ogaw fgam
T FYATE zﬁ"r LT 2 ag %@ W@
A’ gfesr w3 & faar Afew
g ug ) agt fmr wan?

Wt %o ®o v : IIETRY AT FTE
it F T ®wiT s mrawwar
1 T@ A T oawAY I IEE §

% aai s:giq wifgar 7& fear ag ama
sy qﬁ%l afer T© WASTH T3

[RAJYA SABHA |

- ——————

1
!
I
|

| guT AW ad et & .

" YADAV:

b Questions 92

J9d AT wieww ¥ g @, Reey

. & e § wE gyt | gufad v v

Foagi ¥ 9 gfmrd § 9 o9 sEw
g s oo F¥a9 fgst wteaw &
gral &) Ay IR g 5 amw
g ag IfEs 7 F3T g@d o
& &ifad | gft gEwr w97 ) AfwE
famafgamn & ‘afasfal & Sww
guaggr fo o9 & Afoy & F
AgF SaF & wE o fay Wy §)
M R WA T
Z@W qAIE &, dvY geAHEd.
MR. CHATRMAN: No, you have put
three questions. 1 am not allowing.
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MR. CHAIRMAN: Will you please

sit down? Shri Vishvajit Singh.
i RN eEes #

MR. CHAIRMAN: Nothing will go
on record,
ST QT geeaTs c*

LAt this stage, the hon, Member left
the Chamber.]
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MR. CHAI’RMAN No, nothing will
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SHRI JAGDAMBI PRASAD

- 7';Not recorded.
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MR. CHAIRMAN: He says nobody

has been refused admission.

SHRI VISHVAJIT PRITHVLIIT

SINGH: They were refused. MR. Cha-
irman, Sir, they refused in the first

instance. They were allowed later. L
only want to ghnow their , number.
That's all.

... (Interruptions)....

S JrFwE NJT QT 0 JZ AL
ST, TE AL qET § )
....{(Interruptions)....

SHRI K.C. PANT: T do not have the

number with me, Sir.

MR. CHAIRMAN: Why do you pec-

ple think the Chair is not able to take
of itself?
1 can dcal with it.
number? He says “No.”

I don’t nesd your assistance
Have you got the

*Not recorded.
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SHRI INDRADEEP SINHA: Sir, I
have an important thing on this ques-
lion. .

MR. CHAIRMAN: No, no.

SHRI INDRADEEP SINHA: I have
visited the Delhi University in that
connefiion, .-

MR. CHAIRMAN: I cannot allow
everybody.

Theft of steel from the Pench-Hyaro
Electric Project at Nagpup

*320. SHRI INDRADEEP SINDIA:}
SHRI SURAJ PRASAD:

Will the Minister of IRRIGATION
AND POWER be plcased to state:

(a) whether it is a fact that steel
worth one crore of rupces was stolen

from the Pench-Hydro Eleectric Pro- .

jeey al Nagpur; and

(b) if so, what action has been ta-
ken in this regard?
THE MINISTER OF STATE TN THE

DEPARTMENT OF POWER (SHRI
ARUN NEHRU): (a) Government of

iThe question was actvally asked
on the floor of the House by Shri
Tadradeep Sinha.
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Maharashtra has intimated that on
9-7-85 the police intercepted two
trucks carrying steel costing about
Rs. 50,000 stolen from the stores of
the Pench Hydro-electric Project &t
Nagpur. ’

(b) A complaint wag lodged  with
the police who have arrested two
employees of the project and investie

" gations are in progress.

SHRI INDRADEEP SINHA: Sir, ¥
would again comment that the answer
given by the hon. Minister seeks more*
to conceal the facts than to reveal
them.

" I am now putting the question. Is
it a fact than the two trucks were-"
seized by the Maharashira police in & .
routine check-up and that the truck
drivers have stated that the steel rods
were being taken to a firm in Bombay
near Bandra and that there wag a -

regular racket of stealing steel from -~

the project stock yard? N

{(b) iy it also a fact that after the
Executive Engineer of the projeet
lodged a FIR, a Junior Engineer and
a Supervisor were arrested and the
superim' officers transferred that Exe- °
cutive Engineer immediately for have -
ing committed the offence of lodging
a FIR? .

SHR1 ARUN NEHRU: First of all _

~the itewis which have been mentioned -

is steel wroth of Rs. 50,000 and no#

silver worth of Rs. 1 crore. The sei- . .
zure was made on the 9th and when - .
the police detected it a FIR was lod-
ged on the 10th and on the 12th po-
lice have arrested a Junior Engineer
and a Store Attendant of that project.

As lar as the enquiry is concerned,
the State Government has handed ovep |
the case to the Anti-Corruption Bue
reau. Only when the investigations.
are revealed, we will know the full
details. The information we received
so far s that om a routine check on
the 8th these two trucks were caught.
There were 11 tonnes of stcel worth
of Rs. 10,000, - -7

MR. CHAIRMAN: Second supples
mentary. .



