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MR. CHAIRMAN: Next Special 
Mention. Shri Thangabaalu. Not here. 
Next special Mention. Shri S. P. 
Malaviya. 

Reference to the Reported closure 
of clothes Mills  at Modi Nagar. 

 

REFERENCE TO THE REPORTED 
RESENTMENT AMONGST WORK- 

ERS OF THE PUBLIC SECTOR 
UNDERTAKINGS OVER INTERIM 

RELIEF 
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THE DEPUTY       CHAIRMAN: 

Shri Sukomal  Sen. 

SHRI NIRMAL CHATTERJEE 
(West Bengal): He has  gone    Io 

the hospital. 

THE  DEPUTY CHAIRMAN:  Why? 

THE NIRMAL CHATTERJEE: He 
was slightly sick this  morning. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Now. 
Shri Madhavrao Scindia to make a 
statement. 

STATEMENT BY     MINISTER 

Freight rate  for salt for Human 
consumption 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN 
THE MINISTRY OF RAILWAYS 
(SHRI MADHAVRAO SCINDIA): 
Madm, Members may recall the gene- 
ral discussion on Railway Budget 
which took place in March 1985 and 
the reply thereto on 21st March, 1985. 
The revised fare and freight rates have 
accordingly taken effct from 15-4-85. 
However, some of the Hon'ble Mem- 
bers had made mention about giving 
some relief in the matter of freight 
rates for salt for human consumption. 
We have been giving considerable 
iaht to this matter.   In deference 

to the wishes of the Hon'ble Members 
and on grounds of sentiment, i; has 
been decided to exempt salt for 
human consumption from the levy of 
the 10 per cent supplementary charge 
on consignments moving over 500 
Kms. I, therefore, announce that the 
10 per cent supplementary charge 
imposed on goods traffic with effect 
from 15-4-1985 will not be leviable 
on salt for human consumption with 
effect from 1-6-1985. 

THE   FINANCE   B|LI*   1985-*ontd. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Fur- 
ther discussion on the Finance Bill— 
Shri Nirmal Chatterjee. You have got 
26 minutes. I do not want to disturb 
you. You try to frame your speech 
within that time limit. 

SHRI NIRMAL CHATTERJEE 
(West Bengal)) Thank you, Madam, 
for your consideration. I may mention 
incidentally that I had an agreement 
with the previous Deputy Chairman 
that as soon as he rang the bell I 
would stop and so long as I continued 
to speak he would not ring the bell. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: That 
agreement  has to be renewed  again. 

SHRI NIRMAL CHATTERJEE: 
Madam, I was referring to the dwind- 
ling importance of the Finance Bill. 
In fact, Madam, as has been men- 
tioned at page 48 of Part 'B' of the 
Finance Minister's speech, the net 
reduction in deficit of the Union 
Budget would be only to the extent 
of Rs. 311 crores and another Rs. 132 
crores of course would be added to 
the States during 1985-86. I am not 
talking of the deficit. The reduction 
on the basis of the efforts of the 
Finance Bill would be to the extent 
of this amount only. That indicates 
the dwindling significance in    teems 


