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(a) whether the object of removing 
imbalances of the past in the matter of 
equitable distribution of essential mass 
consumption goods to the rural areas as well 
as in each of the States has been achieved; 
and 

(b) if not  what    are the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE, CIVIL 
SUPPLIES AND COOPERATION (SHRI 
KRISHNA KUMAR GOYAL): (a)'~and (b) 
Measures in this direction are taken/being 
taken by State ''Governments to ensure 
equitable distribution of essential 
commodities covered under the public 
distribution system through the fair price 
shops and other licensed retail outlets. So far 
as levy-sugar is concerned, in order to remove 
the disparity between the urban and rural 
areas, the Central Government have refixed 
the State-wise quotas on the basis of 425 gms. 
per capita availability for the projected 
population as on 1-4-1978. The total levy 
sugar released for allocation to the States has 
been stepped up to 2.71 lakhs tonnes from 
2.05 lakh tonnes released earlier and the 
higher quotas on this basis are being allotted 
from the month of December, 1977 onwards. 
The State Governments have been advised to 
gear up the distribution machinery to ensure 
distribution at the enhanced levels and also to 
treat the rural and urban populations in a 
similar manner for purposes of distribution of 
levy sugar. 

Longr-term  credit to tea industry 

279. SHRI BIPINPAL DAS; Will the 
Minister of COMMERCE, CIVIL SUPPLIES 
AND COOPERATION be pleased to state: 

(a) whether there is any proposal under 
Government's consideration to help the tea 
industry in getting long-term institutional 
credit; and 

(b) if so, what are the details in this 
regard? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE, CIVIL 
SUPPLIES AND COOPERATION (SHRI 
ARIF BAIG): (a) and (b) Tea Board has three 
major financial assistance schemes for the Tea 
Industry viz. (i) Tea Plantation Finance 
Scheme, (ii) Tea Machinery and Irrigation 
Equipment Hire Purchase I Scheme and (iii) 
Replantation and Rejuvenation Subsidy 
Scheme. Long Term credit for developmental 
purposes is also available to the tea industry 
from Agricultural Refinance and 
Development Corporation, Industrial 
Development Bank of India and other State 
Financing institutions and cooperative banks 
in tea growing States. 

 

† [ Prices   of essential   Conunodities 

280. SHRI BAPURAOJl MARG-TRAOJI 
DESHMUKH: Will the Minister of 
COMMERCE, CIVIL SUPPLIES AND 
COOPERATION be pleased to state the 
percentage of fall in the prices of esgential 
Commodities in March, 1978 as compared to 
March, 1974?] 
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†[THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE, CIVIL 
SUPPLIES AND COOPERATION (SHRI 
KRISHNA KUMAR GOYAL): The 
percentage fall in the wholesale price index 
number of some important essential 
commodities 

†[  ]  English translation. 


