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Pollution of water of the river Naea-pati 

*319. SHRI BRAHMANANDA PANDA; 
Will the Minister of WORKS AND 
HOUSING AND SUPPLY AND 
REHABILITATION: be pleased to state: 

(a) whether it is a fact that & 
memorandum has been sent to the Minister of 
Health and Family Welfare in which it has 
been stated that the pollution of water of the 
river Nagapati due to discharge of poisonous 
effluents of the J.K. Paper Mills into the river 
is causing hazard to public health and that 
people have been suffering by-drinking river 
water, as reported in the "News World" of the 
6th February _ 1978 published from Cuttack 
in Orissa. 

(b) whether it is a fact that :: number of 
deaths have occurred thereby and the people 
and cattle, who have no alternative source of 
water supply are forced to drink the polluted 
water of the ri''er and thus develop a number 
of diseases: 

(c\ whether the Central Government have 
made an enquiry into the matter: if so, with 
what results; and 

(d) what preventive measures the Central 
Government have taken or propose to take in 
this regard? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF WORKS AND HOUSING 
AND SUPPLY AND RE-HABILITATIOV 
(SHRI RAM KIN-KAR): (a) Yes, Sir. a 
representation dated 17th 'December, 1977 to 
this effect addressed to the Chief Minister, 
Orissa. with copy to the Union Minister of 
Health and Family Welfare was received. 

(b) The Government of Orissa have stated 
that no report has been received about deaths 
due to use of this water. 

(c) and (d) The Central Act, viz. the 
"Water  (Prevention and    Control 

1    of Water Pollution)    Act,  1974". has I    '.iot 
yet been    adopted by the    State 
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Government. It is, therefore, for tne State 
Government to enquire and take action under 
the Orissa River Pollution Prevention Act. 

SHRI BRAHMANANDA PANDA: In this 
wretched country the arm of big money is so 
long than that of the arm of law that whatever 
these monopoly houses and big houses do, 
what. ever crime they comit t0 humanity they 
go scotfree. Recently, Sir, there was a petition 
on pollution about Jayshree Chemicals Ltd. 
The report was submitted to the House but so 
far nothing has been done. No steps have been 
taken by the Orissa Government and the 
Central Government. Here it is again another 
monopoly house which is having its factories 
in the backward areas of Gonjam. This 
concerns the river Nagapati. Sir, you have 
been Governor of Orissa and you know it. It 
is left to the Board. Why not the Central 
Government press the Government of Orissa 
to have a legislation as a model in accordance 
with the legislation of the Central Govern-
ment? Most of the States have accepter it. 
Now. if it is left to the officers there alone, 
what can you expect? Only death and 
suffering for the people there.    Nothing else. 

SHRI SIKANDAR BAKHT: I have already 
writte'n in this connection to the Chief 
Minister of Orissa and the State Government 
have written recently that expeditious steps 
are feeing taken to adopt the Act. I am sure we 
will be able to take effective measures to 
check this pollution. 

SHRI BRAHMANANDA PANDA: There 
was regular commotion. I do not know what 
the Orissa Government have dotae. One 
Satyanarayana died because of polluted 
drinking water. Have the Government taken 
any steps because when they issue a licence 
they should ensure that safety measures are 
taken. The Government mechanism is 
completely silent at tho Central level. From 
my own experience I am telling you. The man 
has died.    Cattle dide and there 

soil erosion. If it is left only to the 
Government of Orissa and its low-level 
officials to go and look into the matter what 
will be the fate of those people? Therefore, I 
demand from the Government that they 
should send a team from here to find out what 
has happened and report to the House. Will 
the Government agree to that? 

SHRI SIKANDAR BAKHT: We shall be 
able to send the team immediately after the 
State decides to adopt the Central Act. 

SHRI LAKSHMANA MAHA-PATRO: 
May I know, Sir. whether the Government 
will conduct a survey in the area to find 0ut 
how far it is affecting the health _of the 
people down-stream at least? 

SHRI SIKANDAR BAKHT-. There are 
about fifty villages which are supposed t0 be 
affected by this sort of effluents which are 
being discharged into the river. The mill 
authorities were directed to provide open 
wells in all the fifty villages. Twenty villages 
have been provided with open wells. They are 
being pressed to provide open wells in the rest  
of  the  thirty  villages  also. 

State farms 
•320. DR. Z. A. AHMAD: 

SHRI   INDRADEEP   SIN HA: SHRI 
JAGJIT SINGH ANAND:f Will the Minister 
of AGRICULTURE AND     IRRIGATION     
be pleased  to state: 

(a) whether it is a fact that some 
State Governments have asked the 
Central Government to hand over the 
Central Government owned farms in 
States to the respective State Govern 
ments- 

* 
(b) if so. wbat are the details in this 

regard and what action the Central 
Government have taken or propose to 
take in  the matter;  and 

|The question was actually asked on the 
floor of the House by Shri Jagjit  Singh  
Anand. 


