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iy74,   as  compared  to  the     corresponding 
period of the preceding year. 

A proposal to set up a police post in this 
area is under consideration. In the meanwhile, 
night patrolling has been intensified and 
mounted police and foot patrol parties are sent 
out in the night in this area 

Scheduled Castes/Tribes (Order) Kill 616. 
SHRI B. R. MUNDA: Will the Minister of 
HOME AFFAIRS be pleased to refer to the 
reply to Unstarred Question 1044 given in the 
Rajya Sabha on 8th March, 1973 and state by 
when the Scheduled Castes and Schednled 
Tribes (Order) Bill is likely to be introduced 
in Parliament? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS (SHRI F. 
H. MOHSIN): Every effort is being made to 
expedite re-introduction of the Schednled 
Castes and Scheduled Tribes Order 
(Amendment) Bill. It cannot be said as to 
when the final Bill will be ready for 
introduction. 

t [Solar Energy] 

617. SHRI GUNANAND THAKUR: Will 
the Minister of INDUSTRIAL DEVE-
LOPMENT AND SCIENCE AND TECH-
NOLOGY be pleased to state the steps taken 
by Government for the development and use 
of solar energy and by when it will be put to 
actual use.] 

t[   ] English translation, 


