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I think Mr. Chandra Shekhar has raised this 
question and I see his point but it is very 
difficult for me to say what we can do but, we 
are certainly looking into it. 

SHRI KHYOMO LOTHA: Sir, the figure 
given here is Rs. 221.38 crores for the entire 
North-Eastern region. X would like the hon. 
Minister to give me a complete break-up State-
wise in this region. I would also like to know 
the reasons for the vast disparities in this 
region. 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN: Well, the Statewise 
break-up I can give you. As far as Manipur is 
concerned, it was Rs. 10 lakhs in 1967 and Rs. 
12 lakhs in 1969, 

[Mr.      Deputy   Chairman   in   the  Chair] 
Then, Arunachal Pradesh. I think about the 
other areas I have not got any particular in-
formation here with me. Assam, of course 
have got. In regard to this State, it was Rs. 164 
crores in 1967, Rs. 182 crores in 1968 and Rs. 
220 crores in 1969. So, I have go1 only 
information about Assam and Manipur with 
me at the present moment. Tripura figure also I 
have got. Investment here also is very little. It 
is only Rs. 89 lakhs in 1967 and Rs. 70 lakhs 
tn 1968. 

Construction of a  Civil Enclave    at Jorhat 
Airport 

♦186.   SHRI        NABIN        CHANDRA 
BURAGOHAINf: SHRI    K. B. CHETTRI: 
SHRI N. P. CHAUDHARI : DR. V. A. 
SEYID MUHAMMAD : DR.  R.  K.  
CHAKRABARTI   : 

Will the Minister of TOURISM AND 
CIVIL AVIATION be pleased to state: 

(a) whether it is a fact that the proposal for 
construction of a civil enclave at Jorhat Air-
port which was mooted in 1971, has not yet 
been implemented; and 

(b) what are the hurdles in the way of con-
structing   the  enclave? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE MI-
NISTRY OF TOURISM AND CIVIL AVI-
ATION (DR. (SMT; SAROJINI MAHISHI): 
(a) and (b) The development of a civil enclave 
at Jorhat air port has undergone some delay 
due to difficulties in acquiring suitable land. 
Some land has now been transferred to the 
Civil Aviation Department and additional land 
is being acquired through the State 
Government. It is hoped to start work on the 
civil enclave during the next financial year. 

SHRI NABIN CHANDRA BURAGOH-
AIN: May I know what is the cost of the   plan 
? 

(Interruption) 

MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: She does not 
follow the question. Well, the Question Hour 
is over. 

†The question was actually asked on the 
floor of the House by Shri Nabin Chandra 
Buragohain. 


