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MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Yes, Mr. 
ifogendra Sharma. 
rHE FINANCE BILL, 1974—contd. 

 
MR.   DEPUTY   CHAIRMAN:  I    have 

called Mr.  Sharma to  speak, on the  Bill. 

MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Tomorrow 
you can  raise all  these points. . . . 

SHRI   NIREN  GHOSH (West  Bengal): 
We want it on Saturday . . . {Interruptions). 
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SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA: Mr. Chairman, 

I would ask my friend not to interrupt him 
because he is developing the Marxist theory. 

 
THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: The House 

stands adjourned till 2 P-m. 
The House then adjourned for 

lunch at seven minutes past one of 
the clock. 

The House re-assembled after lunch at three 
minutes past of the clock. Mr. Deputy 
Chairman in the Chair. 

 

(Interruptions)
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SHRI G. LAKSHMANAN (Tamil Nadu): 

Mr. Deputy Chairman, Sir, peculiarly this 
country of ours has two Finance Ministers —
one is Mr. Chavan and the other is 'Black-
money'. One Finance Minister has presented 
the Finance Bill. Black money and the other 
so-called financers and money-lenders, they 
are all responsible for the conditions that are 
prevailing in this great country of ours. We 
have a Parliament here, and we are all 
Members of Parliament. Our Finance Minister 
is here. The Black money is also having a 
Parliament, a parallel one. 'Black-money' is 
the Finance Minister there and the 
monopolists are Members of that 'Parliament', 
and the financers in this country—the Tatas, 
the Birlas, the Dalmias and the Goenkas—
these people form conspirators to bring down 
the wealth and the greatness of this country. 
They are running a 'parliament'. It is very 
unfortunate that in our country these things 
continue to exist even after 25 years of in-
dependence. 

Sir. how is this black money being used in 
this country? For example, ever-silver was 
taxed. Excise duty was increased. But the 
Government do not care to know how much 
ever-silver stock was available with the 
wholesalers in this country. They simply 
announced on increase in tax. Then the 
merchants and the wholesalers do not want to 
sell these things at the original rate. They sell 
at the increased rates. The Government does 
not take any action to see whether they sell the 
original stock at the old rates or at the revised 
rates. Take, for example, cigarettes or tobacco. 
The stocks available with the wholesalers are 
not accounted for and they go underground. 
They come out after the taxation proposals are 
out and they are sold at the increased rates. 
Therefore, T would suggest that hereafter, 
when    the    taxation    proposals ate 
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placed before the Parliament, the stock 
available with the manufacturers, wholesalers 
and retailers must be taken into account and 
they should not be sold at the revised rates. I 
may inform you, Sir, because of this, about Rs. 
500 crores is converted into black money. I 
know, Sir, in ever-silver business alone, many 
people have become lakhiers because of this 
increased rate. The price of one tumbler was 
increased to Rs. 6 or Rs. 8 from Rs. 4 as soon 
as the taxation proposals were out. And that 
money is not accounted for. and that money is 
not shown in the accounts. That money is thus 
converted into black money. Therefore, the 
Government themselves are responsible for the 
black money thai is being manufactured in the 
country. And how this black money is being 
distributed? I may say, Sir, there are about 200 
financiers in this country; their headquarters is 
Bombay. And they are distributing the black 
money to small merchants, film producers and 
so many people throughout India. These 
people take money from the financiers on 
heavy interest. There is no account, no deed 
but only words to the effect, "I have given you 
Rs. 4 lakhs or Rs. 5 lakhs or Rs. 10 lakhs. And 
the interest is 24 per cent." Now, it has been 
increased to 36 per cent. No accounting, no 
transaction deed, but they get the money. And 
in turn, what they do? The film magnate who 
produces a film gives an actor Rs. 10 lakhs. 
There is a case in Tamil Nadu, Sir. There is an 
actor—I should not name him because he is 
not here in this House—who takes Rs. 10 
lakhs but gives an account for Rs. 75.000. He 
has openly said in one of the meetings and it 
has. been published in the local Press in Tamil 
Nadu that he was taking Rs. 10 lakhs for a 
film. It is a fact that he was taking Rs. 10 
lakhs. But he says that he is utilizing the 
money to help the poor and the downtrodden 
and that he is giving on donations. And in this 
country of ours where there is a Prime 
Minister and where there is a Home Minister, 
he is bold enough to say that he is getting 
black money. It is a fact, and he is utilizing 
that money. And that gentleman, you will be 
surprised to know, Sir, was granted an 
interview by the reverted Prime Minister of 
India for 30 minutes. I may say. Sir. there is a 
case against him under the  Foreign   
Exchange   (Regulation)    Act. 

And the Prime Minister of India is the 
appellate authority. If there is a case against a 
government servant or if he is under 
suspension, he cannot see the appellate 
authority whereas this gentleman, who 
receives black money and which he has 
accepted, against whom there is a case under 
the Foreign Exchange (Regulation) Act—it is 
under investigation and he is being 
interrogated at Madras—comes to Delhi to see 
the Prime Minister and he is granted an 
interview for 30 minutes. I ask, Sir, if this 
gentleman goes back to Madras, will the 
Foreign Exchange authorities who are 
investigating the case be bold enough to take 
action  against him? 

SHRI RABI RAY: Is he in politics also? 

SHRI G. LAKSHMANAN: Yes, I should 
not say so because he will say that I any 
politically motivated or that I am against him. I 
am only putting the fact before you, Sir. 
Suppose, he goes back to Madras, will the 
investigating officers be bold enough to 
interrogate him as boldly as they could have 
done before he saw the Prime Minisler'.' This 
is not allowed in the case of a Government 
servant. This is not allowed in the case of an 
ordinary citizen of India. But, this has been 
allowed in the case of this particular man. And, 
this is how our Government, which is very 
honest in unearthing black money, is dealing 
with this case. How can our Government 
unearth black money? 

Sir, the Government of Tamil Nadu passed 
a resolution in the Tamil Nadu Legislative 
Assembly to give them the power to find out 
black-money because they are the people at 
the spot. They know who has got black-
money. Therefore, they passed a ' resolution 
to the effect that the Government of Tamil 
Nadu must be empowered to unearth black-
money. But no reply has been sent by the 
Government of India so far. Mr. Chavan says 
that they are very serious about unearthing 
blackmoney. They say that it is their responsi-
bility to unearth black-money. It is creating a 
damage to our economy but still the 
Government of India have not sent any reply. 
May I ask the hon. Minister as to what action 
the Government of India has taken with 
regard to that resolution which 



169 The Finance [ 9 MAY 1874 ] Bill, 1974 170 
 
has been passed unanimously by the Tamil 
Nadu  Legislative  Assembly? 

Sir, another thing that 1 want to say is about 
these financiers and then there is a set of 
moneylenders in this country. They come from 
Kabul and they are called Pathans. They have 
no passports and they pass through different 
ways and they are found throughout India. 
There are thousands of Pathans and 
Kabuliwallas in this country. They come here 
with no money. 1 know, Sir, in Madras these 
people come and do business. Within one 
month they purchase a motorcycle and within 
six months they purchase cars and after one 
year they become financiers and they are also 
giving money to the film-world. These 8/iings 
are talcing place in our country. There is a 
Government here, there is a Finance Ministers 
here but they are not able to check these 
things. Sir, when I visited Calcutta last time I 
found about ten thousand of these people, who 
are moneylenders, who are blood-suckers and 
they are sucking the blood of the salaried em-
ployees of India. What action has been taken 
by the Government? These people do business 
here and take the money to their own country. 
If that is so. then what sort of a Government is 
here? They say that there is a big Government 
and that they have defeated this country and 
that country but they are not able to tackle this 
problem. Sir, in this way. 1 may say that crores 
of rupees are going out this country to Pakistan 
and of other countries. They are responsible 
for the condition of the Central Government 
employees, which is very bad in this country. 
These pathans only approach the salaried 
employees. For Rs. 100 they charge an interest 
of Rs. 10 and they are asked to give a 
promissory note for Rs. 500. They are taking a 
promissory note for Rs. 500 and paying them 
only Rs. 100 and charge an interest of Rs. 10 
to Rs. 15 per month for Rs. 100. This is what 
is taking place. If a Government servant takes 
unfortunately Re. 1 or Rs. 5 or Rs. 10 even as 
gift Vigilance Department comes immediately 
* and he is arrested. The currency note is 
marked and given to another police officer. He 
goes and gives it to him and then he is 
arrested. But, these cheatings by pathans 

 
j are not coming to the notice of our Gov-| 
eminent. Why are they not taking any action? 
Why are they not taking any action against 
people who are having blackmoney? Is it 
because—and I charge—that black-money is 
being utilised once in every five years by the 
ruling party for their election funds. 
Therefore, they do not want to take action. 
Therefore, Sir, the existence of black-
money—Finance Minister—should be 
completely wiped out. There should only be 
one Finance Minister and that must be Mr. 
Chavan. There should be only one Prime 
Minister and that must be Smt. Indira Gandhi. 
Then only, Sir, the economy of this country 
will be all right. Otherwise whatever else you 
may do—you may put it in writing in 200 
pages or 500 pages or 1000 pages of 
Appropriation Bill etc., etc. nothing will 
happen. What has happened in Gujarat, what 
has happened in Bihar and what is going to 
happen in Bihar will also happen to the 
Government of India. Government should 
tackle properly these black-marketeers and 
those who have got black-money. Our 
Government says that so much black money is 
in this country. They do not know. There is a 
lot of black money in this country. Railway 
employees have gone on strike. From 
tomorrow onwards all the Central 
Government employees are going on strike. P. 
& T. Employees are also going on strike. The 
Government are not interest in arresting these 
people who are openly telling that they are 
getting black money. They are not intersted in 
arresting these people who are moneylenders, 
who are charging heavy interest, who are 
foreigners and sending money outside the 
country and the Government do not want to 
take action aginst them. They would take 
action immediately against Mr. Fernandes 
who is the leader of the railway employees. 
Therefore, something is wrong with the 
Government of India. Unless and until they 
correct themselves, Sir, I may tell you, the 
democracy in this country would definitely 
fail. If democracy fails in this country the 
whole responsibility is that of the ruling Party, 
the Indian National Congress and the 
Government in power today. Therefore, unless 
and until these things are rectified. I may 
submit to this August House, the living 
conditions would not im-| prove in this 
country. 
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Finally let me finish this speech by making 
an appeal to the hon. Minister. Do you not 
know that there are so many financiers in 
Bombay? Can't you arrest them as you arrest 
a Government employee who takes Rs. 5 or 
Rs. 10 as gift, as you arrested George 
Fernandes? Is your vigilance so weak, is your 
Enforcement Directorate so weak? Then why 
are you sitting here in power when these 
uncivilised acts are being committed in this 
country in the name of democracy? Why are 
the Ministry and the Government still there? 
They say that it is a civilized Government. It 
has got international fame. Sir, I am speaking 
for the down-trodden. I am myself an 
ordinary worker and, therefore, I could only 
speak this way. Therefore, this black money 
has to be unearthed. Those who are so-called 
financiers have to be arrested. They must be 
taken in streets and shown to the people of 
India. Why has the railway strike come tip? It 
is because these honourable gentlemen. 
Therefore, they must be arrested and they 
must be taken in the streets. Then only this 
Government can prosper, the assurance that 
they have given in the year 1971 would be 
implemented and the Prime Minister's slogan 
'garibi hatao' would also be implemented. 
Then only they can see that 1976 will be 
theirs or else you know what is happening 
with regard to the railway strike. You are 
using 'bullets', definitely the Indian working 
class and the people of India in the year 1976 
through The 'ballot' would change this 
Government. That is going to happen, that is 
what 1 wanted to submit to this House. 
Thank you. 

SHRI BIPINPAL DAS (Assam): Mr, 
Deputy Chairman. Sir, this year's Budget, 1 
believe, 1 think so, has some bright features 
and I must say that the Finance Minister was 
really sincere and serious in his attempt to 
restore health to the eco^ nomy although the 
budgetary instrument had its own limitations. 

The significant features according to roe 
are two or three. Firstly, he has made a very 
significant increase in allocations towards the 
core sector, like coal, steel, non-ferrous 
metals, Railways, power, fertilizers. He has 
also increased the budgetary support to 
agriculture arid in the allied matters. 

And, therefore, from this point of view one can 
say that this Budget is a growth-oriented one. 
There is no doubt about it, but the question in 
my mind is, what happens to the increased 
allocations if the price rise is not controlled. If 
the price rise goes on like this then this 
increase in allocation will lose its meaning. 

The other feature that has struck me is that 
this time the indirect taxation is mostly on 
luxury goods and not on items which are for 
common man's use and that is a very good 
feature. But, Sir, the point is when you levy 
indirect taxes on any commodity, there is a 
general reaction on all commodities and it 
spreads to the whole economy. 

Now, he has also given some relief fa the 
middle-class people, tax relief. That is a good 
feature, there is no doubt about it. He has 
given some incentives for production. He has 
also announced some incentives yesterday for 
such industries which are going to convert the 
use of oil-run machines into coal-run 
machines. These are some good features. 
There is no doubt about it. 

But I have some objections and some 
grievance about only two items. One is, I think 
the finance Ministry should have spared the 
postcard. It does not fetch you any huge 
amount. Postcard is used by the common 
people and that couid have been spared. 
Secondly, the Finance Ministry, on the basis of 
the recommendations made by the Wanchoo 
Committee, have lowered we marginal 
taxation at the highest slab from 97.75 per cent 
to 77 per cent. Now the Wanchoo Committee 
made so many recommendations. The Finance 
Minister caught hold of only one in the hope 
that this will act as an incentive towards 
disclosure of income, this will help in 
improving tax realisation, this will help in 
improving savings and, perhaps, investment 
too. These are the expectations of the Finance 
Minister because of which he has lowered this 
taxation at the highest slab. I wish his 
expectations are fulfilled. But I have my 
doubts. I have a grave doubt and I say if today 
that after one year the Finance Minister will 
have to come to this House and tell us that his 
expectations were not fulfilled.    Because    
tax evasion  does not 
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depend on how much tax amount one has to 
pay. Those who evade tax, it becomes part of 
their character. Whatever may be the amount 
that one has to pay, if one is a habitual evader, 
one will evade always. It does not depend on 
the amount of tax that is to be paid. Therefore, 
I am afraid, the Finance Minister will be 
disillusioned and he will have to come back 
and tell us so. 

Now, Sir, Mr. Chavan, upto  now, has placed 
four budgets before us and in these four  
budgets,    now    levies  amounted   to more 
than  Rs.   1,000 crores. The Central tax 
revenue has grown  during  his period from    
Rs.  2,457  crores    in     1970-71     to Rs. 
4,326 crores in 1974-75. This is a good 
achievement.   This  also   indicates   his   the 
courage   and   the   push   that  the   Finance 
Minister has tried to put into our budgetary 
system. But each year—this is the point —we 
find that the actual deficit becomes always 
larger that what is originally estimated. Now, 
Sir, I do not want again to give the figures of 
every year. I will come to last year's figures 
only. I humbly submit that this country 
cannot afford any longer to have such high 
deficits. Last year in my speech, if you look at 
the records, you will find that while    the 
estimated deficit was given as Rs. 87 crores, I 
said it cannot be lower than Rs. 250 crores; it 
may go even upto   Rs.   300  crores.  When  
the  Finance Minister placed the Budget in the 
House, he said the deficit was Rs. 650 crores. 
And I was really shocked. Later on, the other 
day, he has come with the cheering news that 
it is not 650 crores but it is Rs. 320 crores. 
The news is very  good that it is not  Rs.  650  
crores  but  is  only  Rs.   320 crores.  But still 
it is  much  higher than Rs. 87 crores 
estimated originally. I would like to ask Mr. 
Ganesh and the Finance Ministry how did it 
happen? You declared at the time of 
presentation of the Budget that the deficit in 
1973-74 was going to be Rs. 650 crores and 
now you discover that it is Rs. 320 crores. 
How did it happen? Who made mistake   in   
calculations and estimate? It is a very serious 
mistake and not a matter of joke. You tell the 
country that it is Rs. 650 crores and after a 
month you come to us and say it is Rs. 320 
crores. This is something very serious. I 
would request the hon. Minister to look into 
this matter as to how this happened. 

Now, the annual price rise is 27 per cent. I 
have my doubts whether this Budget, in spite 
of the bright features 1 have pointed out, will 
be able to control the prices because already 
from the 1st week of March to the 1st week of 
April, there has been a price rise from 4 to 5 
per cent. 1 do not know what has happened in 
the meantime. This is going on. Now, Sir, the 
estimated deficit of Rs. 125 crores for 1974-
75 is sure to be larger. I say this deficit of Rs. 
125 crores that you expect for this year is 
going to be larger than Rs. 125 crores for 5 
valid reasons. It is not that out of a dream or 
out of some airy conception I am saying this. 
But I say this out of 5 valid reasons that the 
deficit is going to be larger than Rs. 125 
crores and again he will have to come back at 
the end of the year and say the same story. 

Firstly there is the food subsidy. For this 
food subsidy you have allocated Rs. 100 
crores this year. Last year the expenditure on 
food subsidy was Rs. 251 crores. I do not 
know on what basis you have reduced it. After 
all you are going to release 8 million tonnes of 
wheat through the public distribution system. 
Out of that 6.5 million tonnes will be indigen-
ously produced wheat while 1.5 million tonnes 
would be Russian. To release this much of 
wheat through the public distribution system, 
that is, 6.5 million tonnes of indigenous wheat 
you will have to subsidise to the extent of Rs. 
136 crores and the freight and distribution 
costs of 1.5 million tonnes of Soviet wheat 
would come to Rs. 70 crores. So the total will 
come to Rs. 206 crores. Then there is the 
subsidy to be given on inferior cereals and 
there is a small profit on rice. Taking all these 
into consideration the total food subsidy is 
bound to be Rs. 220 crores which will be Rs. 
120 crores more than what you have estimated 
and this will go to add to the deficit. 

The second factor is the D.A. for which you 
have made a provision of Rs. 120 crores. But 
the D.A. is calculated on some basis, on some 
principle. You cannot keep the D.A. static 
when the prices are steadily rising. The DA. 
will remain at the same level only if the prices 
could be stabilised for 12 long months and 
that is not going 
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to happen. Therefore on this account also 
Government will have to spend at least Rs. 
100 crores more. I am sure about that. 

Thirdly, the Government has assumed that 
there will be no increase in the budgetary 
provisions on loans and grants to the States 
because of the Award of the Sixth Finance 
Commission. It is an assumption made on a 
wrong basis, if you work, out the figures the 
actual net transfer to the States is likely to 
decline from Rs. 2,t>62 crores of 1973-74 to 
Rs. 2,765 crores in 1974-75. If it declines 
naturally the States will fall in deficit and they 
will ask for assistance from the Centre. 
Ultimately in this country whatever deficit the 
States may suffer from it becomes a burden on 
the Centre. Moreover the D.A. of She Central 
Government employees will increase; you will 
be compelled to do that. If you do that the 
D.A. of the State Government employees also 
will have to be increased. If you fail to 
stabilise the prices the D.A. will have to be 
increased. Once you increase the D.A. of the 
Central Government employees the State 
Governments will have to increase the D.A. of 
their employees also and they will have to face 
further deficits. And the deficits of the States 
will ultimately fall on the Centre and the 
Centre's deficit is bound to increase. 

The fourth factor is the provision in the 
Budget for drought-prone areas which has 
been put at Rs. 23 crores. On what basis they 
have arrived at this figure 1 do not understand. 
I will not give the figures of the Third Plan or 
of the first three years of the Fourth Plan, but I 
will refer to what happened last year. In 1973-
74 the Central assistance alone for the 
drought-prone areas was Rs. 320 crores and in 
fact in 1972-73 it was Rs. 370 crores, Central 
and State assistance takes together. If this is 
our experience 1 do not know on what basis 
you have allocated only Rs. 23 crores this 
time for that purpose. After all, even though 
the monsoon may be very favourable, in this 
country even then there will be drought and 
famine in some parts of the country or the 
other. 1 therefore think that the amount 
allocated for this purpose is very-very low and 
}^a will have to spend much more on this 
account,. 

The fifth factor is the Railways. According 
to the Railway Board every million tonne of 
shortfall in the target for 1974-75 would mean 
a loss of Rs. 4 crores. This is the calculation 
made by the Railway Board itself. What is our 
past experiences? Our past experience is that 
throughout the fourth Plan the highest tonnage 
achieved by the Railway Board was 203 
million tonnes. If that was the highest 
achieved in the Fourth Plan period, on what 
basis do you hope that this year you are going 
to increase the tonnage to 217 millions? I do 
not think it is a realistic calculation. There-
fore, on this account also the Railways are 
going to lose and their estimated income will 
not materialise. There will be a deficit to that 
extent and the Central Government will have 
to go to the aid of the Railways and  their  
deficit  will  increase. 

All these factors taken together lead me to 
conclude that the Central deficit this time is 
not going to be less than Rs. 500 crores or Rs. 
600 crores. I say this not to create a scare, but 
to warn the Ministry, so thai the Government 
can take some advance action where 
necessary. 1 am going to make some 
suggestions to meet such a situation. If the 
deficit goes up to Rs. 600 crores, it would be a 
very dangerous situation. This country cannot 
any longer afford to bear such huge deficits. 
From these calculations and conclusions I 
think the Budget is not anti-inflationary. On 
the other hand, the Budget is likely to increase 
the inflationary pressures, because the 
demand-pull effect of deficit financing will be 
reinforced by the cost-push factors arising 
from Rs. 138 crores of railway fare and 
freight hike, Rs. 270 crores of budgetary 
imposts and Rs. 480 crores of petroleum 
products price increases. You must be realistic 
that inflation is not going to decrease as a 
result of the present Budget, but there is a 
likelihood of increased inflationary pressures. 
(Time Bell). 

Since you have rung the Bell, I have to cut 
short There are five main causes of the 
inflationary situation : (a) unprecedented 
increase in money supply both to the Gov-
ernment and the public; (b) vast unaccounted 
money: (c) cost-push effect of indirect taxes 
and demands for higher wages without 
corresponding rise in productivity; (d) 
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slow rise in production because of power 
and raw materials shortage; and (e) halting 
or delaying of production by organised 
labour in the form of strikes and Bandhs. 
These are the main internal factors helping 
inflationary pressures. 

I do not want to go into details, because 
there is no  Take, for example, money supply 
this year and last year. Last year the money 
supply was Rs. 9,011 crores as on 15th 
February and this year as on 15th February it 
is Rs. 10,530 crores. From this you can 
understand how expansion in money supply 
is going on in this country. In the case of 
Reserve Rank credit to the Govt., it has 
slightly come down, but treasury bills 
outstanding has gone up. The net result is 
that the supply of money to the Government 
has gone up. Government is spending this 
money without a corresponding increase in 
productivity, i.e., production of goods and 
services. The credit given to business has not 
gone towards increasing productivity in 
industry. Therefore, whatever money they get 
ultimately finds its way into the speculative 
market. In substance we may say that if the 
landing rates are 12 to 15 per cent and prices 
increase by 27 per cent, it amounts to the 
banking system acting as a subsidising agent 
for hoarding and speculative purposes in a 
very big way. 

Last year we were assured that there would 
be credit squeeze and that the Reserve Bank 
was taking steps towards that end. We know 
the result. The Reserve Bank fixed a limit of 
Rs. 450 crores in November, 1973 but 
ultimately the gross credit increased by Rs. 
1,019 crores between October, 1973 and 
April, 1974. This only means that the credit 
squeeze has completely failed, and if the 
Reserve Bank fails to control the commercial 
banks, I do not know how you can have any 
control over the economy. It is a very serious 
matter that despite all the steps taken by the 
Reserve Bank to squeeze credit, they have 
failed for various reasons into which I am not 
going. And this failure does not inspire 
confidence in us to hope that in the future the 
Reserve Bank will be able to control or 
squeeze credit. If you do not do it and if 
money comes and goes like that, and if 
money comes to the market through excess 

 
credit to the business houses, to Government 
and so on. you will not be able to control it. 

Some friends have spoken about the black 
money. Black money is a very dangerous 
thing, it is eating into the vitals of our 
economv. There is no doubt about it. And 
some steps should be taken about black 
money also. 

I suggest a Jew measures to fight this 
inflationary situation. Firstly, there must be a 
determined curb on deficit financing by 
substantial economy in Government spending, 
by redesigning some of the prestigious, by 
elimination of unproductive expenditure and 
by elimination of wasteful expenditure caused 
by faulty and long procedures. In this 
connection, I would request the hon. Minister 
to go through the Reports of the Public 
Accounts Committee and he will be horrified 
to find how much money'—I was there for 
two years in the Public Accounts 
Committee—crores of money goes down the 
drain because of either negligence or 
indifference or long procedures or delays. 
These things can be corrected. These are the 
ways by which we can cut down expenditure. 

My second suggestion is tightening the credit 
squeeze, putting it at a maximum of R.5. 500 
crores of expansion. Take all possible steps to 
do it with determination. Third is increasing 
production of mass consumption goods. Fourth 
is, no import of any luxury goods at all and the 
existing luxury goods industries of this country 
must be meant only for export. Fifth is that all 
policies and programmes of the Government 
must be re-evaluated in terms of their impact on 
prices. And then the sixth is very important—if 
you mean business, if you mean to do 
something for this country, if you really want to 
fight inflation, apart from the economic 
measures that I have suggested, some 
administrative measures are necessary. And the 
most important thing is that you must bring to 
book the hoarders of unaccounted money, and 
also the speculators, the profiteers and the 
adulterators. If the existing laws are not 
adequate, change the laws or pass a new Act 
and the punishment given to these fellows 
should be rigorous. The present ! punishment is 
nothing. Ten years' rigorous 



179 TheFinance [ RAJYA SABHA] Bill, 1974 180 

imprisonment should be the minimum. Unless 
the Government takes these measures with an 
iron hand, I do not think they can meet the 
situation. 

Another thing that I will now say will not be 
very sweet to many people. I am in favour of 
the workers' right to strike. But their right to 
strike should not mean that in this very critical 
situation of this country they will halt or delay 
production or interrupt production. Similarly, 
the right to lockout also should not be 
exercised freely. My submission is that if it is 
possible, voluntarily let the trade unions of 
this country decide not to have strike for three 
years and compel the capitalists not to have 
lockouts. Looking at the situation today, 1 feel 
compelled to say—and this may be very 
unpleasant to some people and unpleasant to 
me also—that strikes and bandhs are a 
contributory factor towards inflationary 
pressure because they halt or stop or delay 
production. Therefore, if such a thing cannot 
be achieved voluntarily by mutual 
consultations, my submission is that at least 
for three years strikes and lockouts should be 
banned in this country at least in the public 
sector industries, if not in the private sector 
industries. 

MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: You have to 
wind up. 

SHRI BIPINPAL DAS: Finally, my 
suggestion is that the Ministry of Finance 
should streamline the tax collection machi-
nery. Today the machinery is very weak. I 
would invite their attention to the report of the 
Public Accounts Committee, the Estimates 
Committee and so on. They will find how 
weak is the tax collection machinery. I will 
not only request but urge upon them to 
improve the working of this machinery to 
raise its efficiency. If you can do that you will 
be able to fight inflation. For example, it is 
very interesting to note that the film stars 
evade the taxes most. The Government 
decided to have a special kind of organisation 
called the Film Circle or something like that 
for that purpose. But as far as I have seen in 
the Public Accounts Committee the 
experiment has failed, t do not know why it 
has failed. Therefore, steps should be taken to 
improve  the  functioning   of  that  kind   of 

organisation to realise the maximum possible 
taxes from these filmstars. Similarly in the 
case of lawyers, doctors and self-employed 
engineers the Government should take some 
definite steps to compel them to pay the taxes 
which are due from them. 
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SHRI HARSH DEO MALAVIYA (Uttar 
Pradesh): Sir, I am sorry to say that I cannot 
feel enthusiastic about the Finance Bill, 1974 
because, to my mind, it fails to solve any of 
the problems which are besetting our 
economy. What are these problems? What are 
the factors which have contributed   to  this  
continuous  decline  in 
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our economy? I would recount them like 
this: Our recourse to deficit financing, 
growing inflation and disproportionate 
money supply. As a result of all these things, 
the prices have been continuing to rise and 
during the last two years the price rise has 
been as much as 42 per cent and there is 
scarcity of all the essential commodities for 
the common consumer. But the things are 
available in the black market provided you 
can pay a higher amount. You can pay the 
money and get anything you like. 
Unemployment is increasing and someone 
has estimated that it is increasing at the rate 
of ten thousand per day. Adulteration today 
has attained monstrous proportions in all 
things. There is a parallel economy, the black 
money economy which is operating in this 
country, and we have failed to do anything 
about it. There is all-round corruption, from 
the top levels to the bottom and we in the 
administrative machinery have failed to do 
anything to check this. 

Naturally, Sir, this all-round deterioration 
has contributed to the productive effort of 
the nation. We have many production 
programmes. We have many steel plants and 
steel is in the sector which we call the core 
sector. Now, Sir, I would like to take a look 
at our core sector, that is, the steel sector, the 
'eorest' of the core, if I may call it. 

in the matter of steel production, during 
the Fourth Plan period, we have made no 
progress and the production of steel has 
remained stagnant. We can have some 
satisfaction that we have built an extra 
capacity to increase our production by about 
7 lakh tonnes and we can take some 
satisfaction that the first stage in the Bokaro 
steel plant has been completed. But the 
targets for the Fifth Plan are likely to remain 
unattained. It is expected that by the end of 
the Fifth Plan we shall have a capacity of 
about 11.4 million tonnes of steel ingots and 
our target of having 7 million tonnes of 
finished steel is expected to remain a dream. 
If we are very optimistic and place our 
operational ratio as 80—85 per cent, then the 
total steel available to us at the end of the 
Fifth Plan would be about 9 million tonnes of 
ingots only. This is a severe shortfall and it 
will 

mean that our engineering industries which 
we have planned and our other industries will 
remain stagnant and will not be able to 
develop. As a result of this, most of our new 
schemes which we have visualised in the Plan 
will remain only on paper. This is the state of 
affairs now. I am talking about the steel 
sector, the core sector, which is the most 
important sector. 

At the same time, what are we doing? On 
the one hand, we are short of steel and, on the 
other, we have decided upon a programme to 
export steel and also to import steel! The 
world market prices are very high. We are 
short of steel and we are exporting our steel 
and we are importing steel at very high world 
prices. In the case of aluminium, we are in 
short supply. But we have drawn up and 
undertaken a long-term policy to export 
aluminium! We have a growing shortage of 
newsprint. But we are expecting the delegation 
from Bangladesh and we want to sell the 
newsprint to Bangladesh. I fail to understand 
these things. Why can't we see that such 
contradictions do not remain in our policies? 
We know the arguments that will be advanced. 
They will say that we must earn foreign 
exchange and all that. But that does not help. 

Another very important thing for our 
economy is coal and the Coal Mines Authority 
today, Sir, says that 52 lakh tonnes of coal are 
lying at the pitheads and they are not able to 
remove it. Sometimes there are fires also and 
so many times it has been pointed out in this 
House. It is true that because of our 
difficulties with regard to the railway wagons, 
a sizeable percentage of our coal production, 
quite substantial, is being exported by the road 
transport. Sir, we still need, according to 
export estimates, about 9.000 wagons per day 
to take our coal all around. But we ate given 
only about 7,600 wagons which is very very 
short of what we need. It is extremely unlikely 
that the target of 90 million tonnes of coal 
production set for 1974-75 will be attained. 

Sir. when such is the state of our economy, 
we have suddenly developed a new love for 
multi-national corporations. We seem to feel 
that huge multi-national cor-joratiom should 
be invited to our country 
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and they will solve our problems. References 
have been made in this House to General 
Motors, the biggest multi-national corporation 
of the world, and one of the most notorious, 
who have been permitted to join hands with 
Hindustan Motors. Furthermore, the notorious 
Imperial Chemicals, the ICI, a subsidiary of 
the 1CI in West Bengal, have been given 
licence for 4-crore project for the manufacture 
of aniline. It is a basic ingredient for dyes and 
all that. Now, there were Indian entrepreneurs 
in West Bengal whose applications have been 
lying in the shelves of bureaucrats, who have 
not been given permission. Then, we have the 
public1 sector undertaking, the Hindustan 
Organic Chemicals Ltd., Bombay. It has been 
producing aniline with a capacity of 11,000 
tonnes. Instead of increasing our capacity, we 
are going in for multi-national  corporations. 

Our softness towards monopolists conti-
nues—not only continues but it enhancing. 
Figures have been given in this House. 
Between September 1973 and January 1974, 
349 Letters of Intent and 248 Industrial 
licences were issued to large business houses. 
We are encouraging our Birlaji. Our love for 
multi-nationals has grown so much that we 
are encouraging our Birlaji to become a multi-
national fellow, and he has gone to Thailand 
and the Government of Thailand has approved 
a two hundred million dollar project to set up 
a plant by the Birla group of industries to 
produce staple fibre, etc. in Thailand. 1 do not 
know what is happening. I can understand 
Government to Government joint sector 
projects. There are such projects being built. 
We are talking about this matter with Egypt, 
with Yugoslavia and others. But why should 
we permit a notorious, a corrupt monopalist 
of this country. Birla, to go and invest in 
another country and exploit the people there 
and earn a bad name for our country? 

Sir, our people continue to live in dire 
poverty. The per capita availability of food-
grains was 480 grams in 1965; it has now 
come down to 417 grams. In terms of 
calories, as against 3,000 calories necessary 
for a man, the actual availability is only 1900 
calories, that is, less than what is available in 
Ceylon or Pakistan. 

In the background of such a situation, we 
have chosen to trust the wheat trader. What is 
the result? The result is coming out. This is 
going to prove very costly. According to the 
Times of India of April 26, farmers in the 
Hapur region of U.P. are selling wheat to 
dealers at Rs. 125 a quintal. Dealers in turn 
sell it at Rs. 165 a quintal. The corresponding 
figures for last year were Rs. 81 and Rs. 83 a 
quintal. 'Then, there is a report from 
Rajasthan. In Rajasthan, wheat is selling at 
some places at Rs. 175 and Rs. 200 a quintal. 
In Udaipur, Alwar, Bharatpur, Bandikui, 
Ganga-pur. traders arc buying wheat at Rs. 
135 per quintal and selling it at Rs. 165 a quin-
tal. And in the process they are not paying 
'Mandi' tax or sales-tax, and the Government 
is being cheated of lakhs and lakhs of rupees 
which would otherwise accrue to them. I have 
got reports that the Inspectors of the Food 
Corporation of India who have to certify that 
the product is worthwhile take bribe before 
certifying. This sort of things are going on. 

And, Sir, there is no control, as pointed out 
by my hon. friend, over plan expenditure. The 
plan expenditure in the last year and before 
also was frittered away in non-plan 
expenditure. It is a tragic story and I need not 
go into the details. It is very well-known. In 
October, 1973 the Reserve Bank of India had 
said that there would be an expansion of 
monetary supply by Rs. 650 crores only. But 
within six months of the declaration, about Rs. 
450 crores had already been injected into the 
economy by way of credit expansion. And 
further increases are going on. The 
Government of India and the Finance Ministry 
seem to have no control over the Reserve 
Bank. whose officers seem to be super-bosses 
and who do not care even for our Finance 
Minister. 

Sir. I am sorry to say, and I am constrained 
to point out that we seem to have forgotten 
the basic tenets which we had in our mind, 
which we bad set before ourselves when we 
started on our path after attaining 
Independence. We have too much talk of 
pragmatism and of production. All kinds of 
crimes are being committed in this country in 
the name of increased production. There is an 
utter failure to realise 
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the intimate connection between production 
and the pattern of ownership. If the pattern of 
ownership continues to be of an exploitative 
nature, the increase in production, whatever it 
is, is not going to affect anybody. It is not 
going to affect the nation's wealth. We have 
failed to bring about any change in our 
production relationships. We could do it, Sir, 
by working in the parliamentary way, through 
parliamentary democracy. It is not so easy to 
bring about the changes in the social setup. 
Nevertheless, we could do something. And the 
sector where we could do it was the 
agricultural sector. In the agricultural sector, 
we introduced our land reforms. Had we made 
our land reforms a thorough success, the area 
on which affects 80 per cent of our population 
lives, we would have brought about definite 
changes. But what happened? Landlords have 
been replaced. But the landlords have been re-
placed by a set of kulaks, rich peasants. And 
the former landlord is now a rich peasant. A 
new class has arisen, which represents 7—10 
per cent of the population in the village. It 
controls the entire economy of the village. And 
furthermore, retired Generals, retired civilians 
and retired officers are going to the villages and 
settling there as gentlemen-farmers—a 
capitalist penetration into our agricultural 
economy. Agricultural economy of a capitalist 
type has assumed serious proportions. I would 
like to point out that the capitalist farmer and 
the rich peasant are united together. Together 
they form a veritable base of reaction, together 
they form a powerful forci' and do not allow 
the economy to move in the desired direction. 
Sir. let us remember the history of Germany. 
In Germany, the Prussian lunkers, the big 
landlords were never touched. They remained 
in power and became capitalists and big 
industrialists. So. the combination of village 
fedual reaction and modem capitalism created 
a type of society which gave birth to Hitlf-r. 
And that is happening today. The continuing 
trend towards reaction in this country, the rise 
of fascist forces in this country, is the direct 
result of our failure to effect any structural 
changes in our economy. 

It is pitiable that we seem to think that 
we   now   depend   upon   market   mechanism 

and economic incentives for our fiscal, 
monetary and prices and incomes policies. It 
is really the traditional laissez-faire economy. 
Let us not talk of socialism. We have bid 
good-bye to socialism. We are soft to the rich. 
We could very easily and very efficiently 
round-up in one night 700 railway-men 
because there was going to be a strike but we 
have not yet rounded-up 70 hoarders of this 
country. If we can act with strength, if we can 
prevent the black-market functioning and if 
we can round-up the hoarders and black-
money dealers, the men who corrupt our 
society, it can go a long way to solve our 
problems. But, we are very efficient so far as 
arresting workers' leaders are concerned, so 
far as arresting railway employees' leaders are 
concerned—we could round-up 700 of them 
in one night—but we cannot arrest those who 
corrupt our society. So, Sir, I would like to say 
that it is time that we wake-up. All is not lost. 

Sir, one of the heartening news which has 
come to us is the news about the public sector. 
The 1972-73 Report on the Working of the 
Industrial and Commercial Undertakings 
shows that we are now making a profit of Rs. 
17.74 crores. The losses have been written off. 
Some of our factories and some of our 
enterprises are earning profits. Of course, 
some are still running at a loss. But, by and 
large the inherent strength, the inherent power 
of a public sector undertaking—the power 
which was visualised by Jawaharlal Nehru —
is asserting itself today. The public sector in 
India today has turned the comer. But. this is 
not enough. The people are restless. The 
policies which we are pursuing today have to 
be changed. We need courage and we need a 
strong will and we need to rely upon the 
people. Reliance upon multi-nationals, 
reliance upon capitalists, reliance upon 
monopolists is not going to help and unless 
we wake-up in time and unless we make the 
necessary changes and bring about adequate 
policies which are necessary for the 
Government, there is going to be a big hlow-
up. Either we change or we be prepared to be 
washed away in a deluge which will sweep 
this country. This Finance Bill is no solution 
to these problems. 
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MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Shri Habib 
Tanvir. Not here. Shri Sardar Gur-charan Singh 
Tohra. Not here. 
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THE MINISTER OF FINANCE (SHRI Y. 
B. CHAVAN): Mr. Deputy Chairman, Sir, I 
have tried to go through all the important 
points made by hon. Members in the debate on 
the Finance Bill which is being considered in 
this hon. House. The major points which have 
been made are somewhat on the same lines as 
were made during the debate on the Budget 
itself. The major criticism which has been 
made is on expected lines. The hon. Member, 
Dr. Kurian, on the one side, has said that the 
Budget and the Finance Bill are a sort of 
surrender to the monopolists and the richer 
classes of the country and . . , 

DR. K. MATHEW KURIAN (Kerela): With 
his sweet voice, he is enthusiastic about his 
surrender. 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN : This is the way he 
interprets my voice. Now, you can see how he 
can interpret the Budget. This is the taste that 
he has. 

MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: He only 
wants to provoke you, so that your voice is 
louder. 

SHRI   Y. B.   CHAVAN :   Nobody   can 
provoke me to raise my voice, but certainly my 
voice will take its own volume naturally.   The   
main   point   they   were   making and   the  
criticism   made  was   that  it  has shown undue   
concession   to   a particular class of people, 
particularly those who are supposed to  be  the 
upper classes of the society, the richer classes, 
the monopolists and so on. I would like to say 
that this is far from the truth. This is an 
accusation which    is  motivated    by  certain  
political considerations. 1 can very well 
understand such things from some Members   
who have got a    particular    way of    looking 
at the Government's   approach   to problems 
and Government's   programmes.   I   would   
like to take  that point  itself first.    We    have 
reduced the    rate    of taxation    not only of 
any particular class of people. Certainly it has 
been reduced. If we have reduced it, it    is    
reduced  apparently  at the  highest level, but 
the result of it is going to be a reduction of 
taxation at all levels. We have also specifically 
reduced the taxation at the lowest level. The  
normal exemption  from direct tax  was  at  the  
level  of Rs.  5,000 income.  It has been  raised  
to  Rs.  6,000. Some   hon.   Members   made   a   
suggestion that it should be raised to Rs. 7.500 
and some said it could be even at the level of 
Rs. 10,000. I would like to say that though it 
has    been    raised    to    Rs. 6,000, as a matter 
of fact it is going to be higher than Rs. 6,000. In 
some cases we have allowed exemption    from    
income-tax    of   certain contribution to the 
provident fund. etc. In practice the exemption 
comes to more than Rs. 7,000, may be up to Rs. 
7,500. In the same  way  the  deduction   is  
going  to  be made applicable to all levels of 
taxation. Even then some Members can ask 
why it 

I
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is being done. Once they accept the position 
that the deduction is made applicable at all 
levels, then certainly they will be able to 
appreciate why it is done. Incidentally, they 
have also raised the question of black money. 
It is also a very major question that we are 
facing in managing our economy in general. I 
think 1 had gone into it in greater detail when 
1 replied to the debate on the Budget itself. I 
had gone into details about what was being 
done on the problem of black money and how 
we were trying to deal with it. But I would 
like to repeat it because there are some new 
Members in this hon. House and many new 
Members have participated in this debate. 
Although they are speaking for the first time, I 
am sure they would be knowing about it. Even 
then it is my duty to recapitulate for their 
benefit what we are doing for attacking the 
problem of black money. It is in this context 
that they will see why we have resorted to this 
new measure of reducing the level of taxation. 

As far as black money is concerned. 1 will 
enumerate some of the things. Firstly, what we 
have done is the provision made through the 
Taxation Laws (Amendment) Act, 1972, for 
acquisition of immovable properties, where 
they have been undervalued at the time of 
transfer, as such under-valuation facilitate 
generation and circulation of black money. 
This is one aspect. For that matter, I would 
suggest that if the new Members possibly refer 
to the Act itself they may know more about it. 
Then there is provision made through the 
Taxation Laws (Amendment) Act, 1972 that 
no suit to enforce any right in respect of any 
property held 'benami' shall be instituted in 
any court unless the property has been 
disclosed to the Income-tax Department. The 
same Act also contains certain measures for 
strengthening the valuation machinery of the 
Department to check tax-evasion through 
under-valuation. These were the steps which 
have been taken, because some hon. Members 
did make a reference to it, as to where this 
unaccounted money goes. I think one of the 
Members did make a mention that this black 
money brings about some sort of distortion in 
our economy. This is way in which the black 
money is utilised. It is utilised to purchase 
properties: it is utilised to pur- 

chase property in somebody else's name. 
Sometimes it is property purchased by paying 
a higher price, but it is shown at a very low 
level in the transactions which are registered. 
So, in order to check that, these two 
amendments were resorted to. The third is 
that the Finance Act, 1973 provides for partial 
integration of agricultural income with non-
agricultural income for tax purposes, absence 
of which has been a fruitful source of tax-
evasion. It is well known that in order to evade 
the lax effectively, recourse has been made to 
agricultural income because agricultural 
income was not liable for taxation. Therefore, 
it was very convenient for people to show that 
this is the agricultural income and therefore it 
is free from taxation. In order to avoid this or 
to take away this opportunity from the 
evaders, we have introduced this new measure 
in the last Budget. The fourth is that the 
Taxation Laws (.Amendment.) Bili, 1973 
contains many provisions to curb black 
money, such as increased powers of search 
and seizure, stricter provisions for penalty and 
prosecutions for tax-evasion, additional 
powers of survey, compulsory maintenance 
and audit of accounts and plugging of 
numerous loopholes in the tax laws. 

These are very important administrative 
measures which are necessary and the law has 
to be strengthened to enable the administration 
to act in this way. Fifth is the reduction in the 
rates of income-tax proposed through the 
Finance Bill, 1974. I think this also should 
help fight tax-evasion. 1 have said somewhere 
else—perhaps I have said in this House also—
that if we ultimately see the problem of 
unaccounted money, the black money, it arises 
out of the evasion of taxes. Therefore, the 
major effort or the major attempt to prevent 
the creation of black money is to prevent the 
evasion of taxes. And this is going to be the 
most effective method of doing it. There are 
many ways that have to be resorted to, to have 
this achieved. And I think this is perhaps one 
of the important steps towards that. And a very 
important high-power committee consisting of 
eminent people appointed by the Government 
in 1970-71 made this recommendation. And 
we decided, after careful consideration, that 
this is one of the ways.   I do not   know 
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whether this is the final answer to the problem 
and I do not know who has found the final 
answer to any problem. But certainly we have 
to make efforts out of the experience that we 
gained, and this is one of the measures 
suggested. And we thought that this could be 
one very effective way of controlling the 
evasion of taxes. Sir, I think this has been 
done not as some sort of gift to anybody. It is 
done with a view to avoid evasion of taxes. It 
is a very important experimental measure, as i 
would like to point out. Let us see what effect 
it has, and it is our hope—personally I can say 
that it is my confidence also—that it will 
certainly help us to curb this evasion of taxes 
by this method. So it is no surrender. It is no 
concession. It is a deliberate, well-considered 
policy to control the evasion of taxes. If the 
hon'ble Member is to think in constructive 
terms he will be one with me . . . 

SHRI RAB1 RAY: He is himself not 
convinced. 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN : If you are prepared 
to think constructively you may accept it but 
if you cannot . . . 

DR. K. MATHEW KUR1AN: A little 
interruption if you do not mind. In your main 
statement you say that control of black money 
is possible by controlling tax evasion itself 
because it is a wrong understanding of the 
sources of black money. This, I think, is the 
basic defect of the Wanchoo Committee report 
itself. Black money is not a stock but a flow of 
resources. That flow arises from investible 
resources arising from the wrong channel of 
consumption pattern or wrong investment. 
This investment of black money continuously 
generates black income. Unless black income 
and black investment is controlled you cannot 
control black money as a flow. And this. I 
think, is the basic defect. If you try to say that 
only tax evasion is the source of black money, 
that I think is not looking at the problem cor-
rectly. 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN : Well, Sir, this is 
one of the controversial debates which has 
given birth to this thinking. It is true that 
wrong consumption pattern and wrong in- 

vestment methods jive birth to black money. I 
am prepared to accept it but th« wrong 
consumption and wrong investment also are 
born out of certain created money, and that 
money is created by evasion. This is what I 
am trying to say. 

SHRI SUBRAMANIAN SWAMY (Uttar 
Pradesh): What about import licences? 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN: This is part of it. 
This is the sort of thing that happens. As far as 
import itself is concerned there is nothing 
wrong about it. As far as investment is 
concerned, there is nothing wrong about it 
basically. As far as certain consumption is 
concerned there is nothing wrong about it. But 
the wrong starts taking shape when the wrong 
use is made of consumption, wrong use is 
made of the investment and wrong use is 
made of imports also. Therefore, it is no use 
using the word here and there. 

'therefore, I do not agree with the hon. 
Member that evasion has nothing to do with 
it. Evasion is a method of creating 
unaccounted money. 

DR.  K.  MATHEW KURIAN :  One of 
the methods. 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN ; I am also resorting 
to this as one of the methods. I am not saying 
that this is the method and there is no other 
method. We are trying to make experiment 
with it. Let us try to see. While 1 am open on 
this point you are not. That is my only 
trouble. 

Sir, 1 do not want to go into all the things 
again. But these are the major lines which we 
have taken. I am trying to deal with two 
arguments simultaneously. One is that the 
Government has not done anything for black 
money. It was Mr. Swamy, I think, who said 
yesterday in a very eloquent manner—he has a 
very wonderful way of putting things and be 
was so convinced about what be was saying—
that there is the problem of black money, there 
is the problem of deficit financing, there is the 
problem of money supply and be wanted to 
know what the Government has done about it. 
This was the question that be posed. And his 
answer was "Nothing". A very simple way of 
saying things without 
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trying to know exactly what has been done 
against black money. If somebody asks what 
is the effect of this thing on black money I 
will say it is a legitimate question and 1 will 
say that certainly we will have to see the 
effects of this continuous chain of steps that 
we have taken during the last three or four 
years and I am sure it will certainly give us 
some results in this matter. 1 would like to 
know from him what exactly is he expecting 
us to do. Let us have constructive suggestions. 

DR. K. MATHEW KURIAN : We have 
been saying it. What about demonetisation? 

SHRI SUBRAMANIAN SWAMY: Sell the 
import licences at the market price. 

DR. K. MATHEW KURIAN : Have you an 
open mind on the question of demonetisation? 
Let us know about it. 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN : About that also I 
may say that it is not a question of having an 
open mind on demonetisation. If it has to be 
done, it has to be done. It is not merely a 
question of keeping an open mind. At the 
present moment, we are not doing it. We are 
very clear about it. 

SHRI G. LAKSHMANAN: Mr. Deputy 
Chairman, Sir, the Legislative Assembly of 
Tamil Nadu passed a resolution unanimously 
to empower them to unearth black money. It 
was sent to the Centre and no reply has been 
sent from the Government of India so far. 
They say they are very serious to unearth 
black  money. 

MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN : You have 
already mentioned about it. 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN : I do not want to 
bring in Tamil Nadu in this matter. Certainly 
we wil! discuss about it later. I will discuss 
this matter with the Tamil Nadu Government. 
You do not bother about it. 

Sir. the other question that was raised was 
about the role of direct taxes and indirect 
taxes. It is one of the points constantly made. 
Why is it that we are only emphasising on 
indirect taxes and we are not doing much 
about direct taxes? What is the role of direct 
taxes in our economy? I think there is some 
basic misconception 

about these things. It is not merely an aca-
demic question of dealing with the problem of 
taxation in a class-room. We have to deal with 
the particular type of economy that we are 
having. Ours is an economy which is 
predominantly an agricultural economy. And 
in an agricultural economy, there is not much 
of scope for direct taxation as far as the 
Central Government is concerned. When 
agriculture comes to shape, certainly there is 
scope for income-tax to make a contribution to 
the national exchequer. I do not deny that 
position. But in an undeveloped agricultural 
economy there is always very little scope for 
direct taxation. When development takes 
place, when the industrial base is widened and 
deepened, when the agriculture becomes 
modern agriculture and also gives rise to more 
agro-industries, etc., and when there is much 
more employment, then there is possibility of 
having a larger base for direct taxation. If at 
all we have to meet the challenges of 
development in this country and raise 
resources on the present basis, there is no way 
but to go to indirect taxation. And there is 
nothing wrong about it. It is not true to say 
that direct taxation is not making its own 
contribution. I would like to give some 
information on this question as to what 
exactly is being done about direct taxation. I 
find that in the last four or five years, direct 
taxation has made a very big contribution. For 
example, in 1960-61 the total income from 
income-tax, wealth-tax, etc., excluding gift tax 
and estate duty which were in a very negligi-
ble quantity at that time, was Rs. 286.59 
crores. In 1970-71, it went up to Rs. 865.11 
crores—less  than  four  times in  10 years. 

DR. K. MATHEW KURIAN : What is the 
proportion? 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN : I have conceded 
already that indirect taxation is the major 
contributor to the general tax resources. I have 
not tried to conceal it. I am admitting it. But 
even direct taxes have been gradually 
expanding their base. 

DR. K. MATHEW KURIAN : But not in 
proportion. 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN : Naturally not in 
proportion. I do not deny that also. 



205              The Finance [ 9 M AY 1974 ] JNU, J974      206 

SHRI SUBRAMANIAN SWAMY: May I 
interrupt? ... 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN: I do not treat it  as 
interruption. 

SHRI    SUBRAMANIAN   SWAMY:    I 
think the point which the Finance Minister is 
making is somewhat valid. But the question is 
that the proportion of direct taxes should 
increase over time. But here we are finding 
the opposite of it. Is our economy going 
backward? 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN : 1 am glad at least 
within ten minutes he has come to this 
position that 1 am valid in my arguments. If 
he keeps patience. possibly at the end of it, if 
he wants to be very frank.  . . . 

SHRI BIPINPAL DAS :  Honest. 
SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN : Well, you have 

used the word; I won't use it. You have 
picked up the word from my mind . . . 

SHRI SUBRAMANIAN SWAMY :  It  1 
approve of what you say, then you will be in 
trouble. 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN : We will be here 
now for some time to face Mr. Subra-manian 
Swamy. 

Anyway, what I was saying was in 1970-71 
it was 865.11, in 1973-74 it has gone up to 
1354. It is nearly, 1 should say, 50 per cent. 
This is the way it is going on. It means that 
the base of direct taxes is being widened 
gradually and also deepened continuously. 
This is not a small increase . . . 

DR. K. MATHEW KURIAN : But the 
burden is also much heavier. 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN : Taxation is cer-
tainly a burden. When it is done through a 
representative Government, it is a burden 
which the people have accepted with some 
sort of willingness. We are doing it with a 
plan. We are doing things for a certain 
purpose. For what purpose? That is the 
ultimate test on which the judgment rests. 

 

 
SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN : The point you 

have raised is very relevant. What have we 
done about the recommendations of the Raj 
Committee? 1 hope you have studied the Raj 
Committee's report very carefully. Raj 
Committee's recommendations comprise two 
parts : One is about recommendations made 
for holding agricultural land which is for the 
State Government to consider. The 
Committee made another recommendation 
which 1 have already implemented. That was 
about aggregation of agricultural income and 
other incomes. It was the most important 
thing that the Central Government could do 
and within six months of the 
recommendations of the Raj Committee, we 
implemented it . . . 

 
DR. K. MA'IHEW KURIAN: At least now 

break your alliance with the Indira 
Government. 

 
SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN: I do not want to go 

on further with this. Whatever possible about 
direct taxation has been done. Of course, I do 
not agree with my friend on this side that we 
should not do anything to touch agricultural 
sector at all. He certainly has made some valid 
points which possibly I may agree with- But 
on this question I do not agree with him. 
Agricultural sector of 
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our economy will have to make its contribu-
tion. We have done so much for the agri-
cultural sector. The country has done so much 
for the agricultural sector: development of 
power, development of irrigation facilities and 
so on and so forth. Naturally, therefore, this 
particular sector at least will have to make its 
contribution. Even the State Goverments have 
not said 'no'. Gradually they are coming to it. 
They are giving us their cooperation. 1 do not 
want to take the position that we should not do 
anything about it at all. I am not taking that 
position. 

Well, Sir, then I may try to meet some 
general points. I have tried to deal with the 
problems of black money, tax evasion, direct 
taxes and other taxes. Some members have 
made the point whether the banking industry 
has made any contribution for the 
development of the eastern sector. I think this 
is a very legitimate point made by Sardar 
Amjad Ali. I think he constantly makes this 
point and he is right in this matter. I can only 
say that much needs to be done in that 
particular field. But gradually the steps have 
been taken and I would like to recapitulate in 
the short time at my disposal whatever efforts 
we are making in this matter. 

During the last 3+ years the banks have 
devoted considerable attention to the exten-
sion of banking facilities in this region. I am 
talking of the eastern sector. Between July 19, 
1969 and 31st December 1973 the number of 
branches in the eastern and north esatern 
regions increased by 989 and 145. 1 am 
speaking of the eastern and north-eastern 
regions. The absolute number may not be very 
impressive particularly when compared to the 
branch expansion in other parts of the country. 
But I am sure you will appreciate that in many 
States, particularly in the north eastern region, 
banks have attempted to . reach unbanked 
areas, totally neglected in the pre-nation-
alisation period. 1 expect the banks to achieve 
a more rapid expansion of their net-work in 
these regions during the next three years. The 
Reserve Bank has advised the banks to devote 
greater attention to these areas in the 
perspective branch expansion  plan  for  the 
three years  1974-76 

that is being formulated. The point is that 
unless there is some good base, further ex-
pansion becomes very difficult. What is now 
being done is to lay that foundation for further 
development. 

Regarding the flow of bank credit in North 
Eastern and Eastern Regions particularly to 
the priority sectors the banks have made 
significant progress during the last three years. 
For example, in the North Eastern region, the 
priority sector advances have increased from 
Rs. 1.97 crores at the end of June 1969, to Rs. 
14.18 crores at the end of June, 1973. The 
increase for the Eastern region has been from 
Rs. 30 crores to 140 crores. This shows the 
dimension of work that has been done. In the 
Northern Region in 1969 the total advances 
were not more than Rs. 2 crores- This shows 
the dimension of work that has been under-
taken. Now it is 14 crores. Now certain base 
has been laid for this work and I am sure this 
will give us some good results. 

[The Vice-Chairman (Shri V. B. Raju) IN 
THE CHAIR.] 

In this connection, I would also like to point 
out that bank credit is ouly one of the 
elements necessary to motivate the people to 
undertake productive efforts. Irtfras-tructural 
facilities and availability of other essential 
inputs probably play a more determinant role 
in this regard. In fact the level of utilisation of 
bank credit itself is determined by these 
factors. While we are urging the banks to 
enlarge their advances protfolio in the Eastern 
and North Eastern regions, it is essential that 
the State Governments and their development 
agencies also undertake detailed planning at 
the district level to formulate viable schemes 
which could be implemented with bank 
finance. This is about banking activity in' the 
Eastern and North Eastern regions. 

Shri Swamy has referred to the customs and 
central exice revenue estimates from various 
petroleum products. Since the revenue 
estimates for the current year are higher as 
compared to the last year, Shri Swamy has 
drawn the conclusion that there might not be 
any curb in consumption of petroleum 
products. This was the point be was making.- 
What is imported from abroad 
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is aviation gas and not ordinary motor spirit. 
As against the imports of 60,000 tonnes 
during 1973-74, the anticipated imports 
during 1974-75 are 50,000 tonnes. The 
Budget estimate of Rs. 12.6 crores for 1974-
75 as against the revised estimates of Rs. 11 
crores for 1973-74 is not due to the increased 
volume of imports, but due to the increase in 
the counlei-vailing duty consequent on the 
increase in the basic Excise Duty by Rs. 1,000 
per KL with effect from the 3rd November 
1973. It may be mentioned that while 
formulating the Budget estimates on the 
Central Excise side, we have already forecast 
a curb in consumption of the order of 25%. 
The increase in the cost of motor spirit in 
1974 is not on account of the increase in the 
expected consumption, but is due to the fact 
that the rate of the basic Excise Duty has been 
increased from Rs. 1,000 to Rs. 2,000 per KL 
from the 3rd November 1973. 

Kerosene: As against the revised Budget 
estimates of Rs. 31.3 crores for 1973-74. the 
Budget estimates for 1974-75 are Rs. 4S.3 
crores on the Customs side. Compared to the 
estimated imports of 8.3 lakh tonnes of 
kerosene during 1973-74, the anticipated 
imports during 1974-75 are placed at 10 lakh 
tonnes. In order to make available refined 
diesel oil, indigenous production of kerosene 
has been reduced and to make up for that 
shortfall, keronese has to be imported. That is 
the reason why we have to import kerosene. 
The estimates for 1974-75 have, thereore, 
been placed at a slightly higher figure than for 
1973-74. There has also been an increase in 
the rate of countervailing duty consequent on 
the increase in the basic Excise Duty by Rs. 
100 per KL in November 1973. It will be 
significant to mention here that the combined 
forecast for 1974-75 for Customs and Central 
Excise for kerosene is placed at Rs. 170.3 
crores as against the corn-bind revised 
estimates of Rs. 183.3 crores for the preceding 
year, that is, 1973-74. It will thus be seen that 
the forecast for the current year is lover 
despite the fact that there was an increase in 
the duty by Rs. 100 per KL which will 
indicate a lower order of consumption. I hope 
I have made my point  clear. 

Then, Sir, some points were made by Shri 
Chandrasekharan. He is not here just now. He 
observed that the coffee growers of Kerala 
who produce mostly the Robusta variety of 
coffee have been hard hit due to the 
phenomenal rise in the cost of production 
without there being a corresponding 'economic 
price'. One of the important reasons which has 
aggravated the situation is stated to be the 
recent increase in the Excise Duty on the 
Robusta variety of coffee and he has said thai 
this is inequitable since the Robusta variety is 
the low-priced variety when compared to the 
Arabica variety. A concessional rate of duty on 
coffee in the varieties commonly known as the 
Robusta, Liberia, Excelsia and Robusta Hybrid 
was introduced for the first time in 1961 to 
provide an initial incentive for the growth of 
these varieties. Opportunity was taken to 
review the position last year and it was 
observed that the ex-duty average pool auction 
prices of Robusta varieties are comparable 
with the prices of Arabica. The pool auction 
prices of Arbica Cherry, PB, etc. are found to 
be comparable with the price of Robusta 
Cherry. PB, and, likewise, the prices of 
Arabica and Cherry AB could be compared 
with the prices of Robusta and Cherry AB. It 
was, therefore, felt that the duty differential of 
the Arabica variety which was paying a duty of 
Rs. 100 per quintal and the comparable 
Robusta variety which was paying a duty of 
Rs. 66 per quintal was not justified. Hence the 
duty on Robusta variety was brought on par 
with the Arabica variety in this year's Budget. 
While the prices which have been taken into 
consideration represent the average prices, this 
may not cover certain isolated cases where the 
prices of Robusta varieties are found to be 
lower in certain regions and it may not be 
possible to provide any Excise relief to the 
Robusta variety on the basis of production per 
hectare in respect of any particular region- 
Subsequent to the withdrawal of concessional 
levy on the Robusta, Liberia and Excelsia 
varities, representations were received urging 
for restoration. It was found that Liberia and 
Excelsia were decidedly inferior varieties of 
coffee when compared to the Arabica and 
Robusta varieties. It was, therefore, decided to 
provide a concessional    duty of Rs. 75 
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per quintal for these varieties from 1st May 
which I mentioned in my introductory speech 
when 1 presented the Budget this year. It may 
be mentioned that a suggestion tor an ad 
valorem levy on coffee has been received. The 
feasibility of converting the present specific 
rates of duty into an ad valorem levy is already 
under examination ... 

DR. K. MATHEW KURIAN: The im-
pression given is as if this is a case of some 
isolated nature about the difficulties of coffee 
planters in Kerala. But this is a universal 
suffering. There should be some concessional 
rate for small-scale producers of coffee. This is 
our demand. It is not an isolated case ... 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN:     1    have   your 
point, it is well taken. That is all I can say. 
Only one point remains now to be taken note 
of. And that is about financial institutions. Sir, 
1 shall    make that point and then conclude my 
observations on this debate. It was stated that 
only large industrial houses are granted    
licences    to    produce, whether in the core 
industry or heavy industry.    Once they    are 
in the process of production, we cannot decide. 
It is for the financial  institutions,     whether    
they    are commercial banks or investment 
institutions to decide.    They will have to stake 
their claim and   needs   of    investment by 
their capacity of making use of that for produc-
tion purposes.    We cannot    conclude that 
they are only meant for large-scale houses. 
This is the point that 1 would like some hon. 
Members who made that point, to take note of. 

Welt, Sir, I have got a very large statistical 
information with me. But we have given this 
information through our replies to many 
starred and unstarred, questions. If hon. 
Members select some answers at random to 
some of the unstarred and starred questions, 
they will get very rich information about how 
we are trying to deal with the different 
categories of industrial houses. 

Financial institutions also are aware of their 
social obligations. In the case of LIC, for 
instance, we find that not more than 10 per 
cent of it goes for the private sector- 

Of course, whatever goes for private sector, 
out of that the major portion goes to the 
bigger houses, that's true. But we seem to 
forget that of the total investments, 90 per 
cent goes for the social priority investments. 
So we must not try to judge financial insti-
tutions in a partial manner. We have to take 
into consideration the total performance and 
then come to the conclusion. 

I need not go into other detailed matters. 1 
have dealt with the major points. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN    (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU):  The question is: — 

"That the Bill to give effect to the 
financial proposals of the Central Govern-
ment for the financial year 1974-75, as 
passed by the Lok Sabha, be taken into 
consideration." 

The motion was adopted. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN: We shall now 
take up the clause-by-clause consideration of 
the Bill. 

Clause  2  was added to the  Bill. 

Clause 3—Amendment of Section  10. 

SHRI LOKANATH MISRA (Orissa): Sir, 
I beg to move: — 

1. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends 
to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

"That at page 7, line 7, for 'Juno" 
substitute 'April'." 

The question  was proposed. 

Sir. this clause is intended for Societies, for 
public trust and khadi and village industries. 
And the tax exemption was given to them 
from the first day of June, 1974. My 
amendment is that instead of 1st of June, 
1974, it should be 1st of April, 1974. Why I 
do it, Sir. is because the financial year in the 
case of charitable trusts as well as private 
firms begins from the 1st of April. Therefore, 
if it is made applicable from   1st  of   April,   
it   would   synchronize 
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with their financial year and it would be more 
convenient to them for the maintenance of 
accounts and the submission of accounts too. 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN:     Sir, 1 am not 
accepting the amendment. 

THE   VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI   V. B. 
RAJU):Are you pressing your amendment? 

SHRI    LOKANATH    MISRA:   I don't 
want a division but let there be ;i voice vote. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN:   The question is: 

1. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends 
to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, name 
ly : — 

'That  at  page  7,  line  7, for    'June' 
substitute 'April'." 

The motion was negatived. 
THE VICE-CHAIRMAN:   The question 

is: 
"That Clause 3 stand part of the Bill." 
The motion was adopted. 
Clause 3 was added to the Bill. 
Clause 4 to 6 were added to the Bill. New 

clause 6A 
SHRI    LOKANATH    MISRA:    Sir,   I 

move: 

2. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends 
to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, name 
ly :- 

"That at page 9, after line 45, the 
following new Clause be inserted, namely: 
— 

6A. In section 80G of the Income-tax Act 
with effect from the 1st day of April, 1974, 
in clause (0 of subsection (5) for the words, 
figures and brackets 'of Sections 11 and 12 
or Clause    122)    or    Clause    (22A) Or 

Clause (23) of Section 10,' the words, 
figures and brackets 'of Sections 11 and 
12 or Clause (22) or Clause (22A) or 
Clause (23) or Clausse (23B) of 
Section 10' shall be substituted." 

The question was proposed. 

SHRI   LOKANATH   MISRA:   Sir, this 
Clause is again in connection with the public 
charitable trusts established for the 
development of Khadi and village industries 
which are made eligible for tax exemptions, 
provided the income applies only for deve-
lopment of Khadi and village industries. There 
is, however, a notable omission in the 
proposed new provision in Section 80(G) of 
the Income-tax Act. So, the donor to such a 
society or charitable trust will not be eligible 
for exemption of his contribution. So, I would 
like this Clause to be introduced in order to 
make the donors eligible for tax exemptions. 
Nobody would probably contribute unless he 
gets tax exemption on the donation made by 
him to the charitable trusts. The Government 
admits that charitable trusts of this type are 
necessary in the country; naturally, they would 
have to look forward to public donations 
unless the Government itself wants to put in 
all the money in it and lose it. Therefore, I 
would like to impress upon the Finance 
Minister to accept this amendment in order to 
make eligible the donors to get the exemption 
from income tax when they make contribution 
to these charitable trusts. 
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THE VICE-CHAIRMAN: There are no 

future commitments. The Chair does not 
commit for the future. 

  
SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN: Sir, I am not 

expressing any view on the merits of the 
issue involved in this thing because I am 
dealing with an amendment to the Act. Shri 
Rajnarain is an hon. Member of this House 
for many years. First of all, when you are 
amending an Act, you have to find out 
whether the    original    amending Act 

is dealing with that particular part of the 
section or not. My own plea is that this 
amendment is outside the scope of the 
Finance Bill itself. Therefore, I cannot accept 
this amendment. I am giving the reasons for 
not accepting it. As far as Shri Raj-narain's 
point is concerned, it is not relevant to    the 
issue. 

THE   VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI V.  B. 
RAJU): The question is: 

2. "That at page 9, after line 45, the 
following new Clause be inserted, namely:- 

"6A. Amendment of Section 8QG.— In 
section 80G of the Income-tax Act with 
effect from the 1st day of April 1974, in 
clause (i) of sub-section (5) for the words, 
figures and brackets 'of Sections 11 and 12 or 
Clause (22) or Clause (22A) or Clause (23) 
of section 10', the words, figures and 
brackets 'of Sections 11 and 12 or Clause 
(22) or Clause (22A) or Clause (23) or 
Clause (23B) of Section 10' shall be 
.substituted.-' 

The motion was negatived. 
Clause 7.—Amendment of    Section 80MM 

SHRI    LOKANATH    MISRA.     Sir,   I 
move: 

3. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends to 
the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, name-
ly:~ 

That at page 10, lines 3 and 4 be 
deleted." 

The question was proposed. 

SHRI LOKANATH MISRA: Sir, section 
80MM was inserted in the Income-tax Act by 
the Finance Act, 1969, to cover Indian 
companies to carry out research and deve-
lopment programmes and develop indigenous 
technical know-how. This thing was further 
extended to cover the non-corporate tax-payer 
by Finance Act No. 2 of 1971. This move of 
the Government encouraged to some extent 
young engineers and other technical experts to 
develop     their talents 
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which has helped in reducing repetitive import 
of technical know-how in certain fields. The 
withdrawal of this exemption, Sir, which was 
hardly given for about three years to young 
engineers would not be very reasonable. 
Therefore, I would request the hon. Minister to 
consider it and see if he really intends to give 
some initiative to young engineers. If so, he 
should allow this to continue for some years, 
There is no reason why he should have 
withdrawn this particular concession only after 
allowing it to remain in operation on trial for 
three years. 1 am told that some engineers 
because of this initiative had developed certain 
methods, certain new methods and had pro-
vided some new technical know-how to Indian 
entrepreneurs and therefore Indian industry to 
that extent was benefited and. we did not have 
to import know-how from foreign sources. I do 
not know the reason why it was so soon 
withdrawn- I would request the hon. Minister 
to accept my amendment. 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN: Sir, I would like to 
explain this matter because this exemption is 
in respect of royalties, commissions, fees, etc. 
received by a resident non-corporate tax-payer 
for provision of technical know-how or 
technical services to Indian concerns. What is 
being withdrawn is this particular exemption. 

SHRI LOKANATH MISRA: Residents' 
means, the young Indian engineers would be 
prevented from getting the exemption. 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN: I just want to say 
what exactly the exemption is and for whom it 
is meant. Why it is being withdrawn now is 
because we have reduced the level of personal 
taxation and under these circumstances it is no 
longer necessary. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU):  The question is: 

3. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends to 
the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill. 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, name-
!y:- 

That at page  10. lines 3 and 4 be 
deleted." 

The motion was negatived. 
THE   VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI   V. B. 

RAJU):   The question is: 
"That clause 7 stand part of the Bill". The 

motion  was adopted. 
Clause 7 was added to the Bill. 
Clauses 8 to  17 were added to the Bill. 

Clause  IS.—Amendment of Act 32 of 1934 
DR.   K.   MATHEW     K.UR1AN:   Sir,  1 

move: 
4. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends to 

the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, namely 
:- 

"That at page 19, for lines 21 to 23, the 
following be substituted, namely: — 

'Every notification issued under sub-
section (4) shall as soon as may be 
after it is issued, be placed be-I'ore 
each House of Parliament for their  
approval'.". 

The question was proposed 
DR. K. MATHEW KURIAN: Sir, the main 

point in moving this Amendment is that it is 
not sufficient for the Government to lay 
notifications issued by them under sub-section 
(4) before each Houses of Parliament. I 
suggest and 1 demand that all the notifications 
under subsection (4) be laid before both 
Houses of Parliament for approval. Sir. in case 
where the Central Government feels that in the 
interest of trade and particularly in exports 
there is need for discontinuing preferential 
rates or increasing the preferential rates or 
discontinuing it altogether, under sub-section 
(4) it is obligatory on the part of Government 
to publish it in the Gazette. The new provision 
in the Finance Bill reads as below: 

"Every notification issued under sub-
section (4) shall, as soon as may be after it 
is issued, be laid before each House of 
Parliament." 

Sir, the decision of the Government should 
be: "subject to approval and scrutiny by 
Members of both the Houses." The judgment 
of the Government in such matters 
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is most likely to be wrong. This is parti-
cularly because of the nexus between the 
Government and the private industry and 
trade. It is true that threre are a large number 
of notifications. The Finance Minister might 
argue that it will be inconvenient to get the 
approval of the Parliament of such a large 
number of notifications but the Parliament in 
their wisdom could take up only those 
notifications which are patently wrong. It is 
up to the Parliament to pick and choose and 
correct the mistakes. I am also aware that the 
Congress Government has been increasingly 
losing faith in Parliament and the 
parliamentary practices, particularly in the 
way in which the Prime Minister has been 
treating both the Houses yet I must appeal to 
the Finance Minister to accept my 
amendment and show at least some respect 
to the Parliament in the bargain. 

SHRI Y.B. CHAVAN: Sir. I do not think 
there is mucfi difference of opinion between 
him and me except on one or two points. As 
a matter of fact, for the first time we have 
made a provision that these notifications will 
be placed on the Table of both the Houses of 
Parliament. Now he wants every notification 
to be approved by the Parliament. That is the 
suggestion he is making. Sir, what he said is 
right but this is making the whole game 
rather more difficult or impossible. It would 
be rather difficult; Even as such when every 
notification is placed on the Table of the 
House, every Member under the normal 
rules is entitled to raise the issue and have 
the matter discussed in the Parliament but if 
you say that every notification should be 
considered by the Parliament and only after 
its approval it should be given effect, that 
means we will have to move the Finance Bill 
every day in this House. Ultimately that 
amounts to that. In the course of the year, 
normally about 300 notifications are issued. 
That means practically it comes to about one 
notification per day. I do not think that is the 
intention of the House and, therefore, I 
cannot accept this amendment. 

THE   VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU): The question is: 

4. 'That the Rajya Sabha recommends 
to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, name 
ly:- 

'That at page 19, for lines 21 to 23, the 
following be substituted, namely: — 

'Every notification issued under sub-
section (4) shall, as soon as may be 
after it is issued, be placed before each 
House of Parliament for their 
approval.'" 

The motion was negatived. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN:   The question 
is: 

"That clause 18 stand part of the Bill" 
The motion was adopted. 
Clause 18 was added to the Bill. 

Clause 19 to 21 were added to the Bill. 
Clause 22.—Auxiliary duties of excise 
DR. K. MATHEW KURIAN: Sir, I beg to 

move: 

5. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends 
to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974. as passed by the Lok Sabha, name- 
ly:- 

"That at page 20, line 12, for 'twenty' 
substitute 'ten'." 

The question was proposed. 

DR. K. MATHEW KURIAN: My sub-
mission is that Clause No. 22, amendment No. 
5 standing in the name of 3 members of my 
party, and also amendments No. 6 to 12 may 
be taken up together if that is possible and Mr. 
Viswanatha Menon, a member of my party 
would like to speak on it. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU): Let us finish this one first. We have to 
finish clause 22 with this amendment. 

SHRI   V.  VISWANATHA  MENON:   I 
am moving this amendment because, even 
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after hearing the learned speech of the hon. 
Minister, i feel that the poor people have been 
affected very much by the Finance bill 
although he has tried to impress upon the 
House by making statements about the quality 
of indirect and direct taxation and all that. On 
the question of even postcard, or post cover or 
in the case of an Inland letter, he has taken the 
attitude of picking the pocket of the common 
man ... 

SHRI JAGDISH PRASAD MATHUR: 
Are we taking up clause 25 also? He is 
speaking on clause 25. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU): Are you speaking on the amendment 
to clause 22 of clause 25? 

SHRI V. VISHWANATHA MENON: 
Clause 25, Sir. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI   V. B. 
RAJU): Let us finish clause 22. Mr. Ma-thur, 
you want an amendment on clause 22. 

 
"The auxiliary duties of excise referred to 

in sub-section (1) shall be levied for the 
purposes of the Union and the proceeds 
thereof shall not be distributed among the 
States." 

THE   VICE CHAIRMAN   (SHRI  V.  B. 
RAJU):   The question is: 

5. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends to 
the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, namely: 
— 

"That at    page   20,    line   12,   for 
'twenty' substitute 'ten'." 

The motion  was negatived- 

THE  VICE CHAIRMAN   (SHRI V.  B. 
RAJU):   The question is: 

'That clause 22 stand part of the Bill." 

The motion was adopted. 
Clause 22 was added to the Bill 
Clauses 23 and 24    were    added to the Bill 

Clause 25.—Amendment of Act 6 of 1898 
SHRI  VISHWANATHA   MENON:   Sir, I 

move— 
6. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends to 
the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in (he Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, namely: 
— 

"That at page    20, line 44, for '25 
Paise' substitute '20 Paise'." 

7. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends 
to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely: — 

"That at page    21, line 1, for '15 Paise' 
substitute TO Paise'." 
8. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends 

to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely: — 

"That at   page   21, line 6, for '20 
Paise' substitute '15 Paise'." 
9. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends 

to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 

i '■ 
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1974,    as    passed    by    the    Lok Sabha, 
namely: — 

"That at page 21, line 8, for '15 Paise' 
substitute '10 Paise'." 
10. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends 

to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely: — 

"That at page 21, line 9. for '30 Paise' 
substitute '20 Paise'." 
11. "That the Rajya Sabha recomends 

to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely: — 

"That at page 21, line 13, for 'One 
rupee and fifty paise substitute 'One rupee 
and ten paise'." 
12. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends 

to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:'— 

"That at page 21, line 15, for 'One rupee  
and  fifty  paise*  substitute 'One rupee and 
ten  paise'." 
SHRI JAGD1SH PRASAD MATHUR: Sir, 

I move— 
13. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends 

to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely: — 

"That at page 20, line 44, for '25 Paise' 
substitute '21  Paise'." 
14. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends 

to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely: — 

"That at page 21, line 1, for 15 Paise' 
substitute '11  Paise'." 

15. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends 
to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 

1974,   as   passed    by   the  Lok Sabha, 
namely: — 

"That at page    21, line 6, for '28 Paise  
substitute   '16   Paise'."' 

16. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends 
to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely: — 

"That at page    21,    line 8, for '15 
Paise' substitute '11  Paise'." 

17. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends 
to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely: — 

"That   at   page   21, line 9, for '30 
Paise'  substitute  '22 Paise'." 
18. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends 

to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely: — 

"That at page 21,  line 13,  for 'fifty 
paise'  substitute  'ten  paise'." 
19. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends 

to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely: — 

"That at page 21, line 15, for 'fifty 
paise'  substitute  'ten  paise'." 

The  questions  were  proposed. 

SHRI VISWANATHA MENON: Sir, by 
raising the rates for post cards, covers, inland 
letters and such other postal articles, actually 
the people who will be affected are the poor 
people. I have been noticing that Mr. Chavan, 
after he became the Finance Minister, with all 
his so-called progressive ideas, has always 
been increasing the indirect taxes. Although 
Mr. Morarji Desai is considered to be a reac-
tionary in all the three Budgets which he 
presented the indirect taxes were below 50 per 
cent of the total    tax revenue.  Now 
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after Mr. Chavan, the so-called socialist 
became the Finance Minister he always 
presented Budgets in which the indirect taxes 
increased. Indirect taxes going up means that 
the ordinary people are being looted. In this 
case the ordinary man, the poor man, the 
common man, who writes a post card has to 
pay more. Actually it is just like pick-
pocketing. Mr. Chavan has been known as 
modren Shivaji in Maharashtra but now he 
will be known as the modren pickpocket of 
New Delhi. He is picking the pocket of the 
poor people. 

DR. K. MATHEW KURIAN: He should be 
arrested from doing so. 

SHRI VISHWANATHA MENON: The 
people all over India are suffering. Mr. 
Chavan tries to impress upon us that he is not 
surrendering to the monopolists and other 
vested interests. But his very action of 
increasing the postal rates while giving tax 
concessions to big business show how he 
treats the big monopolists and how he treats 
the ordinary man in the street. I do not know 
whether my request will be heeded but I 
would request the Finance Minister even at 
this juncture to come forward and accept my 
amendments. 
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SHRI LOKANATH MISRA (Orissa): Sir, I 
support the amendment. The hon. Finance 
Minister tried to put in an argument saying 
that mostly the companies use the post card 
for sending intimation to their shareholders or 
for any kind of inti- 
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mation from the company. Even if it is true, he 
can make a distinction between a post card 
used by a company and a post card used by the 
poor individual. He could have made a 
provision that where a post card is typewritten, 
it would carry a higher rate and where it 
carries handwriting, it would have a lower 
rate. No poor man ever uses a typewriter. So 
where the post card is typewritten, I think it 
can be rated differently. When the poor man 
writes, he writes in his own hand and that post 
card can be rated less. Why didn't he make 
such a distinction? 

THE VICE CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU): It is a noval idea. 

SHRI LOKANATH MISRA: That way he 
could have provided a concession to the poor 
man. 

THE VICE CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU):  The Minister of Communications. 

THE MINISTER OF COMMUNICA-
TIONS (SHRI K. BRAHAMANANDA 
REDDY): Sir, I may be permitted to place a 
few facts for the consideration of the hon. 
Members. As you are all aware, the postal 
service is a public utility service and all of us 
are committed to providing this service to as 
large a community as possible in the entire 
country. You would have noticed, Sir, that 
since 1947, in addition to the expansion of the 
telecommunication branch, the postal side 
also has been expanding, and to-day about 
3,52,000 and odd villages have been served 
by this postal communication on daily basis, 
about 1,51,000 on tri-weekly basis and about 
84,000 on bi-weekly basis. It is our intention 
to see that as many areas as possible are 
provided with daily service. If you had had a 
look at the plan document, you would have 
seen that we are trying to increase the number 
of post offices, etc., by another 25,000 to 
30,000. We want to see that if there is a 
regional imbalance in the coverage of these 
post offices or in providing postal service in 
the respective States, it should be our effort to 
see that we. rationalise it and we see that no 
State suffers in this respect. In addition, it is 
our effort also to see that this tri-weekJy 
service, as far as possible, is replaced by daily 
service. 

       Now you will also    kindly see that this '   
petal side of the Ministry of Communications 
is a labour-oriented branch. It is not as small as  
some  hon'ble friends think. 1 myself said on 
the    floor of    this House during Question 
Hour that there is a wrong impression  going  
round that the price of the post card has been 
raised because of the rise in the price of paper 
and printing. It is not so. The cost of printing 
or paper in a post card is only 6.17 per cent. 
The rest is in respect of the service provided. 
For example, it  also  involves     clearance, 
despatch, branch post offices, post-masters, 
postmen,  sorters,      R.M.S.   and  the  daily 
worry and what not. Therefore, the service 
portion covers about 92-93 per cent. 

Sir, the Finance Minister, when he made 
his speech, said that in spite of this rise there 
is going to be a loss of about Rs. 2.5 crores 
on the post card. With all this rise you will 
notice that the post card still loses; it has to 
be subsidised. Money orders, newspapers, 
all these will have to be subsidised in spite 
of rise in price. 

You are also aware, Sir, that the Fifth Plan 
document envisages a total outlay of about 
Rs. 1,100 crores for telecommunication and 
postal side. It is true that we make a little 
money on the telecommunication side. Even 
there you will find that in recent years there 
has been a progressive increase in the price 
of plant and machinery either imported or 
indigenous. And we are also committed to 
providing as much services as possible. All 
of us are also aware of the deficiencies in the 
telecommunication. Therefore, to make up 
all this it becomes necessary to make this 
increase. 

One more important point I would like to 
mention. It is not correct to say that the post 
card is used by a poor man. It is partially 
true, no doubt. A survey has been conducted 
recently which shows that only one post card 
is used by a man once in a year especially in 
the rural areas while in the urban areas it is 
5-6 per person. Even there the business 
houses, the commercial bouses etc. use post 
card widely with printed matter. Therefore, 
the impression that post card is used mainly 
by a poor man is, in my opinion and in my 
submission, is wrong, It is partly true, I 
agree. 
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SHRI PRAKASH VIR SHASTRI (Uttar 
Pradesh): Generally used by poor man. 

SHRI K. BRAHMANANDA REDDY: In 
the rural areas which have 80 per cent of our 
people, even if a man use a postcard once in a 
year, an extra five paise in a year, I do not 
think will add to the inflation or any other 
thing. Therefore, my submission is that if we 
have to cover the entire country this becomes 
necessary. 

DR. K. MATHEW KURIAN : You have 
raised the price of post card from 5 to 10 paise 
for a number of years. In your statistical wing 
whosoever makes this fantastic study, have 
they examined if the price were much less the 
poor people would have written more post 
card to their relatives and friends? 

 
(Interruptions). 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU) : It is the Chair who should control. 
Mr. Rajnarain is a senior Member. He knows 
the procedure of the House and he will abide 
by it. 

 
THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 

RAJU): After the detailed reply of the 
Minister, do you still want to press for a vote? 

SOME HON. MEMBERS : Yes. 

DR. K. MATHEW KURIAN : We are now 
determined that it should be pressed. 

SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA : Each 
amendment should be put separately. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU) : I shall now put amendment No. 6 to 
vote. 

The question is : 
6. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends to 

the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

"That at page 20,  line 44, for '25 Paise' 
substitute '20 Paise'." 

The   House   divided 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU): Ayes—20; Noes—77. 

AYES—20 

Advani, Shri Lai K. Borooah. 

Shri D. K. Goray, Shri N. G. 

Gupta, Shri Bhupesh 

Kunjachen, Shri P. K. 

I.akshmanan, Shri G. Lolha, 

Shri Khyom Mahadeo, Shri 

Mathew  Kurian, Dr. K. Menon, 

Shri Viswanatha Misra, Shri 

Lokanath Raha, Shri Sanat 

Kumar Rajnarain, Shri Ray, Shri 

Rabi 
Roy, Shri Monoranjan 
Sakhlecha, Shri V. K. 
Shastri, Shri Prakash Vir 
Shekhawat, Shri B. S. 
Singh, Shri Sitaram 
Sivaprakasam, Shri S. 
Yadav, Shri Shyam Lai 
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NOES—77 

Abid, Shri Qasim Ali 
Adivarekar, Shrimati Sushila Shankar 
Alva, Shrimati Margaret 
Arif, Shri Mohammed Usman 
Bhardwaj, Shri Jagan Nath 
Bhatt, Shri Nand Kishore 
Buragohain, Shri Nabin Chandra 
Chakrabarti, Dr.  R.  K. 
Chandra Shekhar, Shri 
Chattopadhyaya, Prof. D. P. 
Chaturvedi, Shrimati Vidyawati 
Choudhury, Shri N. R. 
Chowdhary, Shri C. L. 
Chundawat, Shrimati Lakshmi Kumari 
Das, Shri Balram 
Das, Shri Bipinpal 
Devendra Nath, Shri 
Gadgil,  Shri Vithal 
Gian Chand, Shri 
Hashmi, Shri S. A. 
Himmat Sinh, Shri 
Jagdish Chandra, Shri 
Jagtap, Shri R. D. 
Jha, Shri Kamalnath 
Kalaniya. Shri Ibrahim 
Kalpanath, Shri 
Kalyan Chand, Shri 
Kamble, Shri N. M. 
Kapur, Shri Yashpal 
Khan, Shri Khurshed Alam 
Khan, Shri Maqsood Ali 
Krishan Kant, Shri 
Kulkarni, Shrimati Sumitra G. 
Mahanti, Shri B. K. 
Majhi, Shri C. P. 
Makwana, Shri Yogendra 
Malaviya. Shri Harsh Deo 
Mali, Shri Ganesh Lai 
Mehta, Shri Om 
Menon. Shrimati Leela Damodava 
Mukherjee, Shri Kali 
Mukherjee, Shri Pranab 

I Munda, Shri B. R. Nizam-ud-Din, 
Shri Syed Nurul Hasan, Prof. S. Pai, 
Shri T. A. Panda, Shri Brahmananda 
Patil, Shri D. S. Patil, Shri G. R. 
Pradhan, Shrimati Saraswati 
Rachaiah, Shri B.Rao, Shrimati 
Rathnabai Sreenivast Rao,  

Shri V. C. Reddi,  
Shri K. Brahmananda Reddy, Shri K. 

V. Raghunatha Sangma,  
Shri E. M. Sardar Amjad Ali, 

Shri Savita Behen, Shrimati 
Shahi, Shri Nageshwar Prasad 
Shastri, Shri Bhola Paswan 
Shukla, Shri Chakrapani 
Shyamkumari Devi, Shrimati 
Singh. Shri Kameshwar 
Singh, Shri Mahendra 
Bahadur Singh, Shri Nathi 
Singh, Shrimati Pratibha 
Singh, Shri Ranbir Singh, Shri 
Sultan Sisodia, Shri 
Sawaisingh Sukhdev Prasad,  
Shri Swu, Shri Scato Thakur,  
Shri Gunanand Tilak, Shri J. 
S. Tiwari, Shri Shankarlal 

Trivedi, Shri H. M. 
Varma, Shrimati Narayani Devi Manaklal 
Vyas, Dr. M. R. 

The  motion  was  negatived- 
THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI  V.  B. 

RAJU): The question it: 
7. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends to 

the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 
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"That at page 21,  line  1, for 
paise' substitute '10 paise'." 

The House divided. 
THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI V. 

RAJU) : Ayes—23; Noes—82. 

AYES—23 

Advani, Shri Lai K. Barman, 
Shri B. D. Goray, Shri N. G. 
Gupta, Shri Bhupesh Kunjachen, 
Shri P. K. Lakshmanan, Shri G. 
Mahadeo, Shri Mahapatro, Shri 
L. Mathew Kurian, Dr. K. 
Mathur, Shri Jagdish Prasad 
Menon, Shri Viswanatha Misra, 
Shri Lokanath Raha, Shri Sanat 
Kumar Rajnarain, Shri Ray, Shri 
Rabi Roy, Shri Monoranjan 
Sakhlecha, Shri V. K. Shastri, 
Shri Prakash Vir Shekhawat, 
Shri B. S. Singh, Shri I. D. 
Singh, Shri Sitaram Swamy, Shri 
Subramanian Yadav, Shri Shyam 
Lai 

NOES—82 

Abid, Shri Qasim Ali Adivarekar, 
Shrimati Sushila Shankar Alva, Shrimati 
Margaret Arif, Shri Mohammed Usman 
Bhardwaj, Shri Jagan Nath Bhatt, Shri 
Nand Kishore Buragohain, Shri Nabin 
Chandra Chakrabarti, Dr. R. K. Chandra 
Shekhar, Shri Chattopadhyaya, Prof. D. P. 
Chaturvedi, Shrimati Vidyawati 

Choudhury, Shri N. R. 
Chowdhary, Shri C. L. 
Chundawat, Shrimati Lakshmi Kumari 
Das, Shri Balram 
Das, Shri Bipinpal 
Devendra Nath, Shri 
Dhabe, Shri S. W. 
Gadgil, Shri Vithal 
Gian Chand, Shri 
Hashmi, Shri S. A. 
Himmat Sinh, Shri 
Jagdish Chandra, Shri 
Jagtap, Shri R. D. 
Jha, Shri Kamalnath 
KaJaniya, Shri Ibrahim 
Kalpanath, Shri 
Kalyan Chand, Shri 
Kamble, Shri N. M. 
Kapur, Shri Yashpal 
Khan, Shri Khurshid Alam 
Khan,  Shri  Maqsood Ali 
Krishan Kant, Shri 
Kulkarni, Shrimati Sumitra G. 
Lalbuaia, Shri 
Lotha, Shri Khyom 
Mahanti, Shri B. K. 
Majhi, Shri C. P. 
Makwana, Shri Yogendra 
Malaviya, Shri Harsh Deo 
Mali, Shri Ganesh Lai 
Mehta, Shri Om 
Menon, Shrimati Leela Damodara 

AMukherjee, Shri Kali 
IMukherjee, Shri Pranab 
'Munda, Shri B. R. 

Murthy, Shri B. P. Nagaraja 
Nizam-ud-Din, Shri Syed 
Nurul Hasan, Prof. S. ' Pai, 

Shri T. A. ;   Panda, Shri 
Brahmananda I Patil, Shri D. S. j 
Patil, Shri G. R. 

Pradhan, Shrimati  Saraswati 
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Rachaiah, Shri B. 
Rao, Shrimati Rathnabai Sreenivasa 
Rao, Shri V. C. 
Reddi, Shri K. Brahmananda 
Reddy, Shri K. V. Raghunatha 
Sangma, Shri E. M. 
Sardar Amjad Ali, Shri 
Savita Behen, Shrimati 
Shahi, Shri Nageshwar Prasad 
Shastri, Shri Bhola Paswan 
Shukla, Shri Chakrapani 
Shyamkumari Devi, Shrimati 
Singh, Shri Rameshwar 
Singh, Shri Mahendra Bahadur 
Singh, Shri Nathi 
Singh, Shrimati Pratibha 
Singh, Shri Ranbir 
Singh, Shri Shivdayal 
Singh, Shri Sultan 
Sisodia,  Shri  Sawaisingh 
Sukhdev Prasad, Shri 
Swu, Shri Scato 
Thakur, Shri Gunanand 
Tilak, Shri J. S. 
Tiwari, Shri Shankarlal 
Trivedi, Shri H. M. 
Varma, Shrimati Narayani Devi Manaklal 
Vyas, Dr. M. R. 

The motion  was negatived. 
THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI  V.  B. 

RAJU) : The question is : 
8. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends to 

the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Financ* Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

"That  at  page  21,  line  6,  for  '20 
Paise' substitute '15 Paise'." 

The   House   divided 
THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI  V.  B. 

RAJU):  Ayes—23; Noes—79. 
AYES—23 

Advani, Shri La] K. 
Barman, Shri B. D. 

I  Goray, Shri N. G. 
Gupta, Shri Bhupesh I  

Kunjachen, Shri P. K. 
Lakshmanan, Shri G. 
Mahadeo, Shri 
Mahapatro, Shri L. 
Mathew Kurian, Dr. K. 
Mathur, Shri Jagdish Prasad 
Menon, Shri Viswanatha 
Misra, Shri Lokanath 
Raha, Shri Sanat Kumar 
Rajnarain, Shri 
Ray, Shri Rabi 
Roy, Shri Monoranjan 
Sakhlecha, Shri V. K. 
Shastri, Shri Prakash Vir 
Shekhawat, Shri B. S. 
Singh, Shri I. D. 
Singh, Shri Sitaram < 
Swamy, Shri Subramanian 
Yadav, Shri Shyam Lai 

NOES—79 

A bid. Shri Qasim Ali Adivarekar, Shrimati 
Sushila Shankar Alva, Shrimati Margaret 
Arif, Shri Mohammed Usman Bhardwaj, Shri 
Jagan Nath Bhatt, Shri Nand Kishore 
Buragohain, Shri Nabin Chandra Chakrabarti, 
Dr. R. K. Chandra Shekhar, Shri 
Chattopadhyaya, Prof. D. P. Chaturvedi, 
Shrimati Vidyawati Choudhury, Shri N. R. 
Chowdhary, Shri C. L. Chundawat, Shrimati 
Lakshmi Kumari Das, Shri Balram Das, Shri 
Bipinpal Devendra Nath, Shri Dhabe, Shri S. 
W. Gadgil, Shri Vithal i  Gian Chand, Shri 
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Himmat Sinh, Shri 
Jagdish Chandra, Shri 
Jagtap, Shri R. D. 
Jha, Shri Kamalnath 
Kalaniya, Shri Ibrahim 
Kalyan Chand, Shri 
Kamble, Shri N. M. 
Kapur, Shri Yashpal 
Khan, Shri Khurshed Alam 
Khan, Shri Maqsood Ali 
Krishan Kant, Shri 
Kulkami, Shrimati Sumitra G. 
Lalbuaia, Shri 
Mahanti, Shri B. K. 
Majhi, Shri C. P. 
Makwana, Shri Yogendra 
Malaviya, Shri Harsh Deo 
Mali, Shri Ganesh Lai 
Mehta, Shri Om 
Menon, Shrimati Leeia Damodara 
Mukherjee, Shri Kali 
Mukherjee, Shri Pranab 
Munda, Shri B. R. 
Nizam-ud-Din, Shri Syed 
Nurul Hasan, Prof. S. 
Pai, Shri T. A. 
Panda, Shri Brahmananda 
Patil, Shri D. S. 
Patil, Shri G. R. 
Pradhan,  Shrimati  Saraswati 
Rachaiah, Shri B. 
Rao, Shrimati Rathnabai Sreenivasa 
Rao, Shri V. C. 
Reddi, Shri K. Brahmananda 
Reddy, Shri K. V. Raghunatha 
Sangma, Shri E. M. 
Sardar Amjad Ali,  Shri 
Savita Behen, Shrimati 
Shahi, Shri Nageshwar Prasad 
Shastri, Shri Bhola Paswan 
Shukla, Shri Chakrapani 
Shyamkumari Devi, Shrimati 
Singh, Shri Rameshwar 

Singh, Shri Mahendra Bahadur 
Singh, Shri Nathi 
Singh, Shrimati Pratibha 
Singh, Shri Ranbir 
Singh, Shri Shivdayal 
Singh, Shri Sultan 
Sisodia, Shri Sawaisingh 
Sukhdev Prasad, Shri 
Sultan, Shrimati Maimoona 
Swu, Shri Scato 
Thakur, Shri Gunanand 
Tilak, Shri J. S. 
Tiwari, Shri Shankarlal 
Trivedi, Shri H. M. 
Varma, Shrimati Narayani Devi Manaklal 
Vyas, Dr. M. R. 

The motion was negatived. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI  V.  B. RAJU) : 
The question is : 

9. That the Rajya Sabha recommends to the Lok 
Sabha that the following amendment to be made in 
the Finance Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok 
Sabha, namely:— 

'That  at  page  21,  line   8,  for  '15 Paise' 
substitute '10 Paise'." 

The   House   divided 
THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI  V.  B. RAJU):  

Ayes—24; Noes 80. 

AYES—24 
Advani, Shri Lai K. Barman, Shri B. 
D. Goray, Shri N. G. Gupta, Shri 
Bhupesh Kunjachen, Shri P. K. 
Lakshmanan, Shri G. Lotha, Shri 
Khyom Mahadeo, Shri Mahapatro,  
Shri L. Mathew Kurian, Dr. K. 
Mathur, Shri Jagdish Prasad Menon, 
Shri Viswanatha 
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Misra, Shri Lokanath Raha, Shri 
Sanat Kumar Rajnarain, Shri 
Ray, Shri Rabi Roy, Shri 
Monoranjan Sakhlecha, Shri V. 
K. Shastri, Shri Prakash Vir 
Shekhawat, Shri B. S. Singh, 
Shri I. D. Singh, Shri Sitaram 
Swamy, Shri Subramanian 
Yadav, Shri Shyam Lai 

NOES—80 
Abid, Shri Qasim Ali 
Adivarekar, Shrimati Sushila Shankar 
Alva, Shrimati Margaret 
Arif, Shri Mohammed Usman 
Bhardwaj, Shri Jagan Nath 
Bhatt, Shri Nand Kishore 
Buragohain, Shri Nabin Chandra 
Chakrabarti, Dr. R. K. 
Chandra Shekhar, Shri 
Chattopadhyaya, Prof. D. P. 
Chaturvedi, Shrimati Vidyawati 
Choudhury, Shri N. R. 
Chowdhary, Shri C. L. 
Chundawat, Shrimati Lakshmi Kumari 
Das, Shri Balram 
Das, Shri Bipinpal 
Devendra Nath, Shri 
Dhabe, Shri S. W. 
Gadgil, Shri Vithal 
Gian Chand, Shri 
Hashmi, Shri S. A. 
Himmat Sinh, Shri 
Jagdish Chandra, Shri 
Jagtap, Shri R. D. 
Jha, Shri Kamalnath 
Kalaniya, Shri Ibrahim 
Kalpanath, Shri 
Kalyan Chand, Shri 
Kamble, Shri N. M. 

Kapur, Shri Yashpal Khan, Shri 
Khurshed Alam Khan, Shri 
Maqsood Ali Krishan Kant, Shri 
Kulkarni, Shrimati Sumitra G. 
Lalbuaia, Shri Mahanti, Shri B. 
K. Majhi, Shri C. P. Makwana, 
Shri Yogendra Malaviya, Shri 
Harsh Deo Mali, Shri Ganesh 
Lai Mehta, Shri Om 

Menon, Shrimati Leela Damodara 
Mukherjee, Shri Kali Mukherjee, Shri 
Pranab Munda, Shri B. R. Nizam-ud-
Din, Shri Syed Nurul Hasan, Prof. S. 
Pai, Shri T. A. Panda, Shri 
Brahmananda Paul, Shri D. S. Patil, 
Shri G. R. Pradhan,  Shrimati  
Saraswati Rachaiah, Shri B. Rao, 
Shrimati Rathnabai Sreenivasa Rao, 
Shri V. C. Reddi, Shri K. 
Brahmananda Reddy, Shri K. V. 
Raghunatha Sangma, Shri E. M. 
Sardar Amjad Ali, Shri Savita Behen, 
Shrimati Shahi, Shri Nageshwar 
Prasad Shastri, Shri Bhola Paswan 
Shukla, Shri Chakrapani Shyamkumari 
Devi, Shrimati Singh, Shri Rameshwar 
Singh, Shri Mahendra Bahadur Singh, 
Shri Nathi Singh, Shrimati Pratibha 
Singh, Shri Ranbir Singh, Shri 
Shivdayal Singh, Shri Sultan I Sisodia, 
Shri Sawaisingh 
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Sukhdev Prasad, Shri 
Swu, Shri Scato 
Thakur, Shri Gunanand 
Tilak, Shri J. S. 
Tiwari, Shri Shankarlal 
Trivedi, Shri H. M. 
Varma, Shrimati Narayani Devi Manaklal 
Vyas, Dr. M. R. 

The  motion was negatived. 

THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI  V.  B. 
RAJU) : The question is : 

10. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

"That at page 21, line 9, for '30 Paise'  
substitute  "20  Paise'." 

The  motion  was negatived. 
THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI  V.  B. 

RAJU) : The question is : 
11. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 

mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

"That at page 21, line 13, for 'One 
rupee and fifty Paise' substitute 'One 
rupee and ten Paise'." 

The motion  was negatived. 
THE VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI  V.  B. 

RAJU): The question is : 
12. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 

mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

"That at Page 21, line 15, for 'One 
rupee and fifty Paise' substitute 'One 
rupee and ten Paise'." 

The  motion  was negatived. 

THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI  V.  B. 
RAJU) : The question is : 

13. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

"That at page 20, line 44, for '25 Paise'  
substitute '21  Paise'." 

The motion  was negatived. 
THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI  V.  B. 

RAJU): The question is : 
14. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 

mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

"That at page 21, line  1, for  '15 Paise' 
substitute 'II Paise'." 

The  motion was negatived. 
THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI  V.  B. 

RAJU): The question is : 
15. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 

mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

"That  at page 21,  line  6,  for  '20 
Paise' substitute '16 Paise'." 

The  motion  was negatived. 
THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI  V.  B. 

RAJU) : The question is : 
16. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 

mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

"That at  page  21,  line  8,  for  '15 
Paise' substitute '11  Paise'." 

The  motion   was  negatived. 
THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI V.  B. 

RAJU): The question is : 
17. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 

mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 
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That at page 21,    line 9,    for '30 
Paise' substitute '22 Paise'." 

The  motion was negatived. THE  VICE-
CHAIRMAN   (SHRI  V.  B. RAJU) : The 
question is : 

18. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 
"That at page 21, line 13, for fifty paise'  

substitute  'ten  paise'." The  motion  was 
negatived. THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI 
V.  B. RAJU): The question is: 

19. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 

namely:— 
That at page 21, line 15, for 'fifty paise' 

substitute 'ten paise'." 
The  motion  was negatived. 
THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI  V.  B. 

RAJU) : The question is : 
"That Clause 25 stand part of the Bill." 

The motion was adopted. 
Clause 25 was added to the Bill. 

THE FIRST SCHEDULE 
SHRI LOKANATH MISRA: Sir, I beg to 

move: 
20. "That the Rajya Sabha recom-meands 

to the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 
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SHRI JAGDISH PRASAD MATHUR : Sir, 
I beg to move: 

21. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That    at    page    29,      line  6    for 
'Rs.   6,000'   substitute   'Rs.   7,500'." 

SHRI JAGDISH PRASAD MATHUR: 
Sir, I beg to move: 

22. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 29,    line 7,    for '12 per 
cent' substitute '10 per cent'." 

SHRI JAGDISH PRASAD MATHUR. Sir, 
I beg to move : 

23. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 29, line S, for 'Rs.   
6,000'  substitute  'Rs.   7,500'." 

SHRI JAGDISH PRASAD MATHUR: Sir, 
I beg to move : 

24. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 29, line 9, for 'Rs.   
6,000'  substitute  'Rs.  7,500'." 

SHRI JAGDISH PRASAD MATHUR: Sir, 
I beg to move: 

25. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 29, line 10, for 'Rs. 480 
plus 15 per cent' substitute 'Rs. 400 plus 
12 per cent'." 

SHRI JAGDISH PRASAD MATHUR: Sir, 
I beg to move : 

26. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

"That at page 29, line 13, for 'Rs. 
12,300 plus 20 per cent' substitute  'Rs.   
1,050 plus   15  per cent'." 

SHRI JAGDISH PRASAD MATHUR: Sir, 
I beg to move : 

27. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 29, line 16, for 'Rs. 2,230 
plus 30 per cent' substitute 'Rs.  1,900 
plus 25 per cent'." 

SHRI JAGDISH PRASAD MATHUR: 
Sir, I beg to move: 

28. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 29, line 19, for 'Rs. 3,730 
plus 40 per cent' substitute 'Rs. 3,200 plus 
35 per cent'." 

SHRI JAGDISH PRASAD MATHUR: Sir, 
I beg to move: 

29. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely.— 

"That at page 29, line 40, for 'Rs.   
6,000'   substitute  'Rs.   7,500'." 

SHRI JAGDISH PRASAD MATHUR: Sir, 
I beg to move: 

30. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 



249 The Finance [ 9 MAY 1974 ] Bill, 1974 250 

'That   at   page   29,   line   43,   for 
'Rs.   6,000'   substitute   'Rs.   7,500'." 

SHRI  JAGDISH PRASAD  MATHUR: 
Sir, I beg to move: 

31. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

'That   at   page   29,   line   45,   for 
'Rs. 6,000' substitute 'Rs. 7,500'." 

SHRI  JAGDISH PRASAD  MATHUR: 
Sir, I beg to move: 

32. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

'That   at   page   29,   line   46,   for 
'Rs.  6,000'  substitute  'Rs.  7,500'." 

The questions were proposed. 
SHRI LOKANATH MISRA (Orissa): Sir, 

pursuant to the recommendations of the 
Wanchoo Committee, the maximum marginal 
rate of personal Income-Tax has been reduced 
from 97.75 per cent, on incomes exceeding Rs. 
2 lakhs to 77 per cent, on incomes exceeding 
Rs. 70,000. Compared to the Wanchoo 
Committee recommendations, the proposed 
rates are higher. Hence my amendment to the 
First Schedule which I have given. The exemp-
tion limit has been raised from Rs. 5,000 to Rs. 
6,000 only. The Bhoothalingam Committee 
had recommended the same to be raised to Rs. 
7,500 in the year 1968. Since then the price 
rise has been tremendous and the basic 
exemption up to Rs. 7,500 was proposed to 
provide the much-needed relief on the earnings 
in the lower structures. Sir, now the most 
affected people are in the lower income groups 
which include the Government servants and 
those in the public sector undertakings. The 
middle-income group is suffering so much 
because of the price rise and they are the 
people who deserve some exemption In the 
case of Income-Tax and this should be done. 
By spreading the net wide, the Finance 
Ministry does not gain much out of this. 
Unless it wishes to keep more 

people in its clutches by casting the net wider, 
I can say that this exemption in the case of the 
lower-income groups is not much. I am told 
that the officials who are engaged in working 
out this and working out the Income-Tax for 
the lower-income groups eat away almost 90 
per cent, of the earnings from this group. 
Therefore, Sir, I would plead with the 
honourable Finance Minister that he should 
give some serious thought to this. Why should 
he unnecessarily harass the people? They have 
to keep accounts in respect of the Income-Tax 
and then in these days of inflation, they have 
to somehow pay the Income-Tax and they 
create the trouble, unnecessary trouble, for the 
maximum number of people. If, on the other 
hand, they gave relief to these lower-income 
groups, then the Income-Tax Officers could 
probably concentrate more on those people 
who are really the tax-evaders. 

From people who should really be taxed, 
who should pay to the Public Exchequer, he 
does not earn anything by casting his net 
wide. Let him become wiser and relieve the 
others. 
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THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN    (SHRI V.  B. 
RAJU): The question is:— 

20. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends to 
the Lok Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, namely:— 
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THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI  V.  B. 
RAJU) :   The  question  is:— 

22. "That the Rajya Sabha recom- 
merits to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 29, line 7, for '12 per cent' 
substitute '10 per cent'." 

The motion was negatived. 

THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI  V.  B. 
RAIU):  The question is:— 

23. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 29, line 8, for 'Rs. 6,000' 
substitute 'Rs. 7,500'." 

The motion was negatived. 

THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI  V.  B. 
RAIU):  The question  is:— 

24. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 29, line 9, for 'Rs. 6,000' 
substitute 'Rs. 7,500'." 

The motion was negatived. 

THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI  V.   B. 
RAIU) :   The question is:— 

25. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974. as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 29, line 10, for 'Rs. 480 
plus 15 per cent' substitute 'Rs. 100 plus 
12 per cent'." 

The motion was negatived. 
THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI  V.   B. 

RAJU):  The question is:— 

26. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 29, line 13, for 'Rs. 
12,300 plus 20 per cent' substitute 'Rs.  
1,050 plus  15 per cent'." 

The motion  was- negatived. 

THE   VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI   V.   B. 
RAJU):  The  question is:— 

27. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 29, line 16, for 'Rs. 2,230 
plus 30 per cent' substitute 'Rs.   1,900 
plus 25 per cent'." 

The motion was negatived. 

THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI  V.  B, 
RAJU):  The question  is:— 

28. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 29, line 19, for 'Rs. 3.730 
plus 40 per cent' substitute 'Rs. 3,200 
plus 35 per cent'." 

The motion  was negatived. 
THE   VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI  V.  B. 

RAJU):  The question  is:— 
29. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 

mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 29, line 40, for 'Rs. 6,000' 
substitute 'Rs. 7,500'." 

The motion was negatived. 
THE   VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI  V.  B. 

RAJU):  The question  is:— 
30. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 

mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
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Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That   at    page   29,    line    43,   for 
'Rs. 6,000' substitute 'Rs. 7,500"." 

The motion was negatived. 

THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI  V.  B. 
RAJU):   The question  is:— 

31. "That the Rajya Sabha recom- 
ments to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That    at   page    29,    line   45,   for 
'Rs. 6,000' substitute 'Rs. 7,500'." 

The motion was negatived. 
THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI  V.  B. 

RAJU):  The question  is:— 
32. "That the Rajya Sabha recom- 

ments to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That    at   page   29,    line    46,    for 
'Rs. 6,000' substitute 'Rs. 7,500'." 

The motion was negatived. 
THE  VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI  V.  B. 

RAJU):  The  question is:— 
"That the First Schedule stand part of the 

Bill." 
The motion was adopted. The First 
Schedule was added to the Bill. 

THE SECOND SCHEDULE 

DR. K. MATHEW KURIAN (Kerala): Sir, 
I beg to move:— 

33. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 36. after line  16 the 
following be inserted, namely:— 

(ia) in item No. 7, for the entry in 
the third column against 'KEROSENE', 
the entry 'NIL' shall be substituted." 

SHRI   JAGD1SH   PRASAD   MATHUR 
(Rajasthan): Sir, I beg to move:— 

34. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 36, line 15, for 'Ten per 
cent' substitute 'Five per cent'." 
35. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 

mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 36, after line 16, the 
following   be  inserted,  namely:— 

(ia) in Item No. 7, for the entry in 
the third column against 'KERO 
SENE', the entry 'NIL' shall be 
substituted. 

(ib) in Item No. 9, for the entry in the 
Third Column against 'DIESEL OIL, 
NOT OTHERWISE SPECIFIED', the 
entry 'one hundred and sixty-eight 
rupees and twenty-five paise per kila 
liter at 150 centigrade thermometer' 
shall be   substituted'." 

36. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 36, line 29, for 'Sixty 
paise' substitute 'Forty-five paise'." 
37. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 

mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 36, line 40, for 'Seventy-
five per cent' substitute 'One hundred per 
cent'." 
38. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 

mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 36, line 41, for 'Seventy-
five per cent' substitute 'One hundred per 
cent'," 
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39. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 37, line 4, for 'Ten per 
cent' substitute 'Five per cent'." 

40. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 37, lines 15 to  !9 be 
deleted." 

The questions were proposed. 

DR. K. MATHEW KURIAN (Kerala): Sir, I 
would request the hon. Minister that this is an 
amendment which he should be able to accept. 
I would request the hon. Minister that at least 
in the case of kerosene, which is a product 
which a large number of poor people, 
particularly in the rural areas are using, this 
should be left with practically no tax burden. 
Sir, in fact, in Bihar during the recent riots it 
was known that a large number of students 
were not getting kerosene and a large number 
of people in the rural areas today go without 
any kerosene at all. Kerosene prices have gone 
up and on top of lhat Government is getting 
tax revenue. This, I think, is a very wrong type 
of policy. And I request the hon. Minister that 
at least in the case of kerosene he should have 
some soft touch. 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN: Sir, I would like to 
make one point clear as far as I see that. As far 
as kerosene is concerned, in thess Budget 
proposals we have not taxed kerosene. He is 
aware that the excise rates were approved by 
the House earlier. I don't think there is any 
reason to have 
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that exercise. As far as papers are concerned, 
there is no relation between the two because 
we have not raised any taxes or excise rates. 

THE   VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI  V. B. 
RAJU): The question is : 

33. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Mnance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

"That at page 36, after line 16, the 
following be inserted, namely:— 

'(ia) in item No. 7, for the entry in the 
third column against 'KEROSENE',   the   
entry   'NIL'   shall   be substituted.'" 

The motion^was negatived. 
THE   VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI   V. B. 

RAJU): The question is : 
34. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 

mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 36, line 15, for "Ten per 
cent' substitute 'Five per cent'." 

The motion was negatived. 
THE   VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI  V. B. 

RAJU): The question is : 
35. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 

mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 36, after line 16, the 
following be inserted, namely:— 

'(ia) in Item No. 7, for the entry in 
the Third Column against KERO-
SENE', the entry 'NIL' shall be sub-
stituted'." 

(b) in Item No. 9, for the entry in the 
Third Column against 'DIESEL OIL, 
NOT OTHERWISE SPECIFIED', the 
entry 'one hundred and 

sixty-eight rupees and twenty-five 
paise per kilo litre at 150 centi 
grade thermometer' shall be substi 
tuted'." 

The motion was negatived. 

THE   VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI   V. B. 
RAJU): The question is : 

36. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 36, line 29, for 'Sixty 
paise' substitute 'Forty-five paise'." 

the motion was negatived. 
THE   VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI  V. B. 

RAJU): The question is : 
37. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 

mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 36, line 40, for 'Seventy-
five per cent' substitute 'One hundred per 
cent'." 

The motion was negatived. 

THE   VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI   V. B. 
RAJU): The question is : 

38. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 36, line 41, for 'Seventy-
five per cent' substitute 'One hundred per 
cent'." 

the motion was negatived. 
THE   VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI  V. B. 

RAJU): The question is : 

39. "That the Rajya Sabha recom 
mends to the Lok Sabha that the follow 
ing amendment be made in the Finance 
Bill, 197.4, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 37, line 4, for 'Ten per 
cent' substitute 'Five per cent'." 
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The motion was negatived. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU) : The question is : 

40. "That the Rajya Sabha recommends 
to the Lok. Sabha that the following 
amendment be made in the Finance Bill, 
1974, as passed by the Lok Sabha, 
namely:— 

That at page 37, lines 15 to 19 be 
deleted'." 

The motion was negatived. 
The Second Schedule was added to the Bill. 
The Third Schedule was added to the Bill. 
Clause 1, the Enatcing Formula and the 

Title were added to the Bill. 
SHRI Y.  B. CHAVAN: Sir, I move: 

"That the Bill be returned." 
The question was proposed. 
SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA: Sir, I would like 

to make some observations. First of all, I 
know that the hon. Members are tired after 
having said 'yes' and 'no'. .Most of them have 
gone to the Central Hall and I have no 
intention of getting the bell rung again in 
order to disturb our friends who may be 
sipping coffee there. Nonetheless, I would like 
to make one or two observations at the last 
stage of the Finance Bill and indeed the 
Budget Session as far as the financial matters 
are concerned. 

Sir, we are told that Dr. Henry Kissinger, the 
U.S. Secretary of State, would be visiting our 
country soon. I. understand he is coming this 
month. Recently, Sir, and the Finance Minister 
may kindly note— I don't know whether he 
knows it or not— that on May 4, there was an 
elaborate briefing of the Economic Secretaries 
of all the Ministries by Mr. Kewal Singh, 
I.C.S., Secretary in the Ministry of External 
Affairs. These Secretaries in that briefing were 
asked to prepare their plans for the projects 
which would be placed before Dr. Kissinger in 
order to get American collaboration   and aid.    
And  much    was said 

about the American aid. And all kinds of cock 
and bull stories, I believe, were told about the 
American generosity. That is, of course, what 
Mr. T. N. Kaul, our Ambassador in 
Washington, has been saying these days. 

For example, on January 4, this year, Mr. T. 
N. Kaul said that relations between any two 
sovereign independent countries or nations 
and particularly between two of the biggest 
democracies in the world like India and the 
U.S.A. cannot and should not be assessed in 
the context only of the present or the recent 
past but in the lareg perspective of the past 
history and the future perspective. 

Therefore, he is pleading for American 
collaboration and he has been put on the job 
although he has not been able to get 
Americans budge an inch over the Diego 
Garcia issue. But,  he is very active. 

Now, Sir, recently, at the Special Session of 
thi United Nations General Assembly, where 
the problems of the developing countries 
specially in respect of raw materials were 
discussed, the American delegation took a 
very hostile stand and their main spokesman 
John Scali openly said that he disagreed with 
the major and important conclusions of the 
two documents which had been adopted or 
were going to be adopted at the Special 
Session. In fact, he was very bitter in his 
attack against the developing countries and in 
fact he pleaded for maintaining the status quo, 
and yet Mr. T. N. Kaul is talking about all 
kinds of friendships. 

Now, this is only one part of the thing. This 
is what the representative of the United States 
of America said. The representative of the 
western countries, specially those belonging to 
the European Economic Community took a 
similarly hostile stand against developing 
countries like ours. In such a situation how is 
it that they are going to get so much assistance 
from our country. The position has been made 
very clear. 

Now, Sir, I understand Mr. K. B. Lai— not 
the B.B. Lai of the land-grab fame, there  are 
too  many  Lais  here,    we    are 
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tired of Lais, there are different types    of Lais 
. . . 

AN  HON.  MEMBER:  Who are . . . 
(Interruptions). 

SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA: You are not lal 
at all, you are black. These Lais believe in 
rolling out red carpet for the Americans. Now, 
Mr. K. B. Lal, I.C.S., he went to New York to 
brief Mr. Swaran Singh and had midnight 
meetings with the Americans and others to 
impress upon them that they should go in for 
collaboration with Indian business and others. 
I understand Mr. K. B. Lal is an aspirant for a 
post in the permanent secretariat which is 
going to be created to take care of the 
decisions of the United Nations Special 
Session and their implementation. He is 
canvassing to be appointed to this post in the 
west, above all, in the United States of 
America. Now is Mr. K. B. Lal suitable for 
that post? For that you have to fight neo-
colonialism and imperialism and different 
interests of the developing countries so that we 
get better prices for raw materials, so that we 
get better terms in our trade relations with 
developed countries specially the United 
States of America, Britain, West Germany, 
Japan and others. Now, K. B. Lal is the most 
unsuitable person. I would like to know from 
Mr. Chavan whether he is being consulted in 
such matters. 

Now, Sir, before I change over from K. B. 
Lal to other things, I would like to say that 
when he was Joint Secretary and Secretary in 
the Ministry of Commerce in 1959-60—I 
mentioned this earlier but he did not reply—he 
led an Indian delegation which entered into an 
agreement with the COGIS of Italy. The 
agreement was that some surcharge was to be 
paid on import of Italian fertiliser and the 
surcharge was to be utilised for promoting 
Indian exports. But, nothing of the sort was 
done. The COGIS got the money and an 
allegation was made that at that time the 
additional money was shared by COGIS with 
Mr. K. B. Lal. The Finance Minister should 
enquire. He should look into his own files and 
the files of the Home Ministry and the  
Ministry of External  Affairs and  find 

out whether at that time there was a serious 
allegation against Mr. K. B. Lal sharing the 
money in this manner. It is a question of 
national exchequer. The COGIS were 
supposed to have utilised this fund for 
promoting Indian exports or rather buying 
Indian goods like tea, coffee, textiles and so 
on. 

Actually they did not do that. They went to 
the old importers and asked them to continue 
to import these things only. They paid some 
money to the Italian importer so that they 
imported Indian goods under the aegis of the 
COGIS and the remaining money to COGIS 
shared with Lal. Now I do not know why the 
hon. Minister did not refer to this when he 
replied to the other things. When Lal was in 
the Commerce Ministry as Joint Secretary he 
reduced the cost of raw cotton in order to 
benefit the Birlas and the Goenkas. That was 
his record. The Jute Commissioner's office in 
Calcutta really became the office of the IJMA. 
Not only that, Lal was smuggling jute from 
then East Pakistan saying that it was jute 
cuttings. They came as jute cuttings but 
actually it was real jute and the smuggling 
went on. 

These are the officers who have got the 
upper hand. I do not know why the officers are 
being given so much power. Now, what is 
being done? The Committee of Economic 
Secretaries—all ICS bosses—are dominating 
this thing. They really decide the policy. I 
know, recently they met with a view to 
discussing the oil crisis but they came to the 
conclusion that they should import coal from 
Australia to run the power houses in the South. 
Can you deny it? Why is it not being 
published? Why are we not told? This is one 
of the latest decisions. 

As you know, when the Bechtel company 
scandal came up the Takru Commission was 
appointed. These secretaries met and said there 
was nothing wrong. And they are thinking of 
entering into an agreement with Bechtel 
company which was of CIA origin. I have one 
very interesting information. In the days of the 
second World War, John McCone, who was to 
become later the boss of CIA (1961 to   1965)   
started  an engineering  firm    in 
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San Francisco called Parson-Bechtel-McCone 
Corpoiation. After the war the name was 
changed to just Bechte] Corporation but in the 
course of time its links with the C\\ became 
deep after the chief promoter of ihe company 
had entered the CIA. This is that company and 
with them they are going into an agreement. 
This matter should be gone  into. 

Secretaries are now more than Cabinet 
Ministers and the Cabinet responsibility is not 
working. Parliamentary accountability has 
become a facade and the Secretaries have 
really become the policy makers and the brain 
trust. With all my criticisms and reservations 
any day I can sit with a Minister rather than an 
ICS Secretary; I can call them, I can sit and 
talk with them and speak on the wave length 
with many of them and they will be more 
responsive. In the interest of parliamentary 
democracy what is important is to see that the 
Cabinet Government functions as a Cabinet 
Government, retaining parliamentary 
accountability. It is the duty of the Prime 
Minister to see that the initiative of individual 
Ministers combines with the collective 
responsibility and collective functioning. 
Today it is not so. What is happening today is, 
the bureaucrats are on the top, the nabobs of 
the Railway Board are sitting on the pyramid, 
at the apex and creating such problems. Now 
this is the problem to be considered. I have 
mentioned it because I am feeling a little 
worried. The other day at a seminar the Prime 
Minister said "Democracy is on trial". Yes, 
democracy is on trial not only because rightists 
are on the offensive which is true but 
democracy is on trial because we are deviating 
from some of the fundamental tenets of 
democracy or functioning of parliamentary 
institutions. I hive been here for many years 
and I have known that even Mr. Nehru held 
that pailiamen-tary institutions had to be 
maintained, although much of it was showy 
and perhaps there was more of form rather 
than substance. Nonetheless these forms are 
very important. Without these forms we do not 
get pegs to hang these things. I think what is 
happening is a very wrong thing. In any case  
bureaucracy should not be a power. 

My friends will speak about Mr. B. B. Lai. I 
would ask for an inquiry against Mr. Lai and 
Mr. Subramanian because they were getting 
presents from Mohan Meakin Breweries and 
the late B. R. Mohan. They are the friends of 
these people and they wrote confidential 
reports against honest officers. It has been 
revealed now that when nothing could be 
found by searching the house of an officer 
who had not obliged Mr. Lai and Mr. 
Subramanian and the Mohan Meakin 
Breweries in getting illegal expansion and who 
had not agreed to the case for violation of the 
Industries (Regulation and Development) Act 
being dropped malicious reports were written. 
His house was searched, persecution took 
place; all these things have been revealed and 
admitted today. But what about those two 
officers I would like to know from the Home 
Minister who maliciously wrote motivated 
entries after they failed to implicate the officer 
through a search of his house. What has 
happened to them? You have expunged most 
of the remarks; some two or three words are 
kept. Sir, in perjury—you are a lawyer, is it 
not? 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN    (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU): I am not a lawyer but I can say you 
have argued your case. You must now 
conclude. 

SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA: Now I will have 
to tell that, because you have said no. If you 
had said yes I would not have proceeded with 
it. In perjury if there is perjury with regard to 
90 per cent then the other 10 per cent has to be 
thrown out. A perjuror is a perjuror, never to 
be believed. People who write malicious and 
motivated reports cannot be believed. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU): All this has been much debated. 

SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA: All right; you 
are fond of new points. Here is the case of an 
officer writing reports on his nephew-in-law 
for 16 years and Mr. Swarup was kept in 
Geneva for seven years. Let them deny it. 
Such corruptions take place. I do not want to 
go into details but imagine, Sir, the maternal 
uncle-in-law writing reports, confidential 
reports, of his nephew Mr. Swarup for 16 
years. 
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Now, as far as the Budget is concerned, you 
have given wholesome concessions to the 
capitalists. You have reduced income-tax for 
top brackets; those who pay Rs. 10 lakhs will 
pay Rs. 2 lakhs less now. Therefore you cannot 
create an impression that you are giving relief 
to all. This is a wonderful type of relief. You 
know very well, according to your own 
statement the arrears of income-tax from 600 
odd asses-sees who are assessed for 10 lakhs 
and more come to Rs. 200 crores and you are 
not collecting this money. And it is these 
people who will get the relief. 

One point about National Rayon Cor-
poration and the Kapadias. I want to bring to 
your notice now because tomorrow I will not 
bring it. The Kapadias are trying to get their 
Directors appointed and prevent the 
appointment of Government Director who I 
believe is a Member of this House, Mr. H. M. 
Trivedi. Their term expires in June this year. 
What they are trying to do is this. Mr. 
Umashankar Dikshit, kindly listen to this; I 
know you know Kapadia very well. Therefore 
I would ask you to listen. Kapadia is trying to 
regain control of the . . . 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAIU): At the third reading stage of the Bill, 
you cannot go into these details. 

SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA: This is a point to 
be noted, you know. Under section 408 of the 
Companies Act Government did not approve 
of the five Directors which Kapadias were to 
appoint on the basis of their preference shares. 
It is a strange thing. They would get these 
Directors appointed if the Government 
Directors disappear from the scene. Then the 
situation will become serious. The Unit Trust 
and the public have a great stake in this. The 
Kapadias tried to exercise considerable 
political influence to get the Company Law 
Board to approve the election of the five 
Directors who were elected in May 1973 but 
ultimately failed. Now they are also trying to 
prevent the appointment of Government 
Directors and to have their own Directors on 
the basis of preference shares. Sir, in the 
national interest this National    Rayon    
Corporation should    be 

saved from the grip of the Kapadias. It is now 
engaged in an expansion project for nylon tyre 
yarn cord involving Rs. 6 to Rs. 8 crores. 

This should be done immediately. There 
should not be any delay because time is 
running out. I am told they are holding another 
general body meeting the day after tomorrow, 
on the 11th May. I would ask Mr. Chavan 
kindly to intervene in this matter because your 
financial institutions, including the Unit Trust, 
have a big stake in the National Rayon 
Corporation. You see to it that the 
Government directors are re-elected and take 
necessary precaution so that the Kapadies 
cannot have a grip of the organisation. Thank 
you very much. 

1 think, Mr. Chavan, you have let down the 
nation by presenting a Budget of this kind. 
The Finance Bill is your brain-child and I 
think this is the product of it. I am very sorry 
you1 have done such a thing. Now, things are 
moving to the right. As far as the economic 
policies are concerned, there is a competition 
among the Ministries to placate the 
monopolists and even the multi-national 
corporations. In that way they are fighting the 
economic crisis. The crisis will worsen. 
Conflicts will grow. Struggles will grow. That 
is why today you find that the people are 
awakening and resisting the reactionary 
policies of the Government in the economic 
field and defending their interests. 

Before I sit down I congratulate the brave 
railwaymen for the splendid and magnificent 
manner in which they have risen against these 
policies of the Government. They are 
defending their interests and the honour of the 
nation. It Is they who are defending 
democratic norms in public life, whereas the 
Government, as if in a war, against their own 
people have mobilised the police and various 
other forces. The army has been alerted. I 
think democracy is being endangered by such 
action. The nation's fair name is being 
tarnished by such action . .  . 

HON. MEMBERS: No. 
SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA: I do hope the  

working people in  the  country    will 
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rise to the occasion and rally behind the 
railwaymen and make it impossible for the 
Government  to  go  ahead with  its  policy of  
reprisal and    repression   in  order    to silence 
two million railwaymen who    run the  lifeline 
of the country. We owe them a duty  to stand  
by    them  in    defending their interests.  Let  
there   be  a  negotiated settlement. Let the    
doors of   the jail be thrown  open   and let  
discussion   start    to have mutual consultation 
and a negotiated settlement could be arrived at.    
That    is what we want. It is a matter of shame 
that the    Government is    telling lies 
everyday through the All India Radio. I wish   
Mr. Gujral had been here. Do not sanction any 
money for Mr. Gujral's lies. Public finance is 
not meant for public lies in the manner in  
which   Mr.   Gujral  is  doing. Yesterday the 
television  carried a  lying  story in    a 
shameless manner. Mr. Chavan, since when he 
became the Finance Minister to finance such 
lies, lying by  a Government institution like 
the All    India    Radio    and television. It is a 
shame for the nation. It does not behove our 
democratic institutions. Mr. Chavan, you 
should tell Mr. Gujral to stop lying.    
Otherwise,    no money shall come. Money  is  
not meant for  financing.    Mr. Gujral's lying 
propaganda.    Blatant   falsehood he has been 
uttering. It is a shame to his own name, shame 
to his past tradition and shame to all of us. 

SHRI MONORANJAN ROY (West 
Bengal): Sir, at the fag-end of the debate and 
at the Third Reading stage I am constrained to 
make some observations. I begin where Mr. 
Bhupsh Gupta ended. Twenty lakh 
railwaymen are on strike in connection with 
their most legitimate and just demands. The 
Railway Ministry would give to the General 
Revenues a sum of Rs. 181 crores in the year 
1974-75. He says there is no money and asks 
wherefrom the money will come to meet the 
demands of the workers. Here is the Finance 
Minister who is giving extra-incentives and a 
special bonus to the monopoly houses which 
are reaping huge profits. This is from the Eco-
nomic Times. It is not a paper owing 
allegiance to any leftist party. It is a paper of 
the monopoly house. It is dated the 7th May. It 
says that the report that was prepared by one 
of the Departments 

of the Finance Ministry, by the Directorate of 
Inspection and Research, Statistics and 
Publications shows that in size the monopoly 
industrial houses account for 20 per cent of 
the total number of companies. 

The report says 20 per cent of the total 
number of   companies accounted   for 93.3 per 
cent of the retained profit of all companies.  In   
other words,  the report    says, the larger the 
company, the higher the profitability and   
consequently    the    dividend declared.  Under  
the heading "Big Houses Profits" this is a 4-
column report in    the Economic Times. I  do  
not  like  to waste the time reading out   the   
entire   thing as to how the profit has been 
increasing from year to year for big houses, not 
small industrial    entrepreneurs. The smaller   
ones are,  on  the  other hand,  sustaining 
losses. And   these  big  houses  are  evading  
taxes. Their income-tax arrears, according to 
the Finance    Minister',    come to    the tune of 
Rs. 714 crores. For whom has the Finance 
Minister given tax relief? Not for the small 
farmers, not for the small businessmen, not for 
the small industrialists, but for the big houses. 
The Finance Minister gives tax relief for the 
big houses because they    are hard  pressed.  
And yet he does not    feel ashamed to increase 
the price of post card; he does not feel ashamed 
to put tax    on kerosene, tax on  paper used for 
books of primary    school children.    On  such 
things used by the common man taxes have 
been increased. Naturally the prices will go up 
and they have gone up and are going up. The 
Finance Minister said we are trying to hold the 
price line. I shall thank him for one thing. The 
other day he said those who are thinking  of 
reducing  the  prices,  they are in fool's paradise 
and prices can never be reduced.  It is true, 
because when   the Finance Minister is 
increasing excise duties on every essential 
commodity, naturally the prices can never go 
down. I do not    like to go into the details. 

Then about deficit financing. Many of our 
honourable friends have spoken about deficit 
financing. The Finance Minister says that 60 
per cent of deficit financing has been reduced 
during the last year. Nonetheless the prices of 
all essential commodities have gone up. Why? 
Because,   you 
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are imposing excise duty on everything. Excise 
duty is the main reason. The second reason is 
black money which is creating a parallel 
market in the country. Black money is creating 
havoc in the country. And for those black 
money holders Mr. Chavan has reduced the 
taxation, for those higher groups, from 97 per 
cent to 77 per cent. There is a twenty per cent 
reduction in taxes for the higher groups. Is 
there anything to explain? You say money is 
not available for railwaymen. For them bullet 
is available. You have given Rs. 169 crores for 
the Central Reserve Police where it was only 
Rs. 3 crores during the year 1950-51. It has 
been increased to Rs. 169 crores for the year 
1974-75. Yes, because it is understandable 
now, the Government depends not on the 
people's support. During the election they go 
on rigging. They depend upon the police, they 
depend upon the CRP, they depend upon the 
State Police, they depend upon the BSF, and 
ultimately upon the Army. So, the way they 
want to deal with the railwaymen is the fascist 
v/ay. It is the fascist method they are adopting. 

There is the Goebbelic propaganda going on 
from the All India Radio. This method was 
first adopted by Hitler himself. He came to 
power by using Goebbels through Radio and 
the press. I challenge Mr. Chavan—Mr. 
Dikshit is also here— whether he can deny 
that the press was warned against giving any 
publicity to the letter of Mr. Fernendes sent to 
the Prime Minister. The P.T.I, and the U.N.I, 
have been warned not to circulate any letter 
sent to the Prime Minister by Mr. George 
Fernendes. This is how they want to deal with 
railwaymen. And I am told there is a 
conspiracy to kill a large number of 
railwaymen's leaders through shooting, 
hounding them, throwing away their bodies 
and then asking as to who killed them. That is 
the conspiracy. I warn the railwaymen from 
the platform of this House to be careful that 
their leaders will he hounded and killed. They 
will adopt the methods adopted by them in 
West Bengal. More than a thousand of our 
comrades there were killed in the name of 
Naxalites by anti-social elements and  by the 
police. 

THE VICE CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU): Please do not go to Calcutta. 

SHRI MONORANJAN ROY: That is the 
method they are going to use against the 
railwaymen who are on strike. 

My last point. This is a very serious matter. 
Mr. Chavan has left. Unfortunately, Mr. Debi 
Prasad Chattopadhyaya, who was present here, 
has also left. This is about excise duty on tea. 
The best flavoured tea in the world is produced 
in Darjee-ling and no doubt it also fetches the 
highest price. But the yield is very low. The 
small planters cannot cope with this high excise 
duty upon their tea. Small gardens have been 
closed down in largo numbers. Mr. Debi Prasad 
Chattopadhyaya has been repeatedly 
approached by the workers and small planters 
also. He issues some statement and through 
promises. But he has not done anything with 
regard to the excise duty. The entire industry is 
in jeopardy and on the verge of complete ruin. 
If immediate steps are not taken it will go 
completely out of commission. If excise duty 
upon Darjeeling tea is not reduced more 
gardens will be closed and the workers will die 
of starvation. Gardens will be closed down and 
the whole economy of the Hills will be ruined. 
lust now Mr. Chavan said that he is taking care 
about problems of the hilly areas of North East 
India. Darjeeling is one of the hill areas of the 
North East region of the country. May I know 
what facilities have been provided to this area? 
If an industrialist wants to start an industry in 
any part of the Darjeeling hills he will not get 
any facility. I had discussion with a number of 
small industrialists who can invest some money 
to start small or medium industries. They are 
prepared to invest. But, unfortunately, that area 
is not declared as a backward area. No facility 
is given to the area of Darjeeling hills. Mr. 
Chavan just now said that in 1969 bank finance 
to the tune of Rs. 2 crores was given to this 
region and it increased to Rs. 14 crores in 
1973-74. Bui Dn-jjeMng is part of that region. 
It has not got anything either by way of bnnk 
loan or by way of financial assistance or by 
way of any other facilities. But our 
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Chief Minister, Mr. Siddhartha Shankar Ray is 
a master in telling Goebbelsian lies ami in 
giving promises after promise*. He says his 
second motherland is Darjeeling. But I do not 
know whether he knows it or not that 
Darjeeling is declared as an advanced area, a 
developed area, only because there are some 
moribund tea bushes. Why should it not be 
declared as a backward area and given special 
facilities, special incentives and special 
attention? The people of that area, after their 
failure to get their Nepali language into the 
Eighth Schedule of the Constitution—it was 
rejected by the Government of India- -have 
demanded regional autonomy. I warn that if 
this regional autonomy is not granted, you will 
be compelled to grant it a full state's status in 
course of time as you have granted to the Mizo 
hills, to Meghalaya and other hill people of 
Assam. This demand has been voiced and it 
has been supported by the people of West 
Bengal. They have supported the demand of 
regional autonomy within the State of West 
Bengal. They will demand full autonomy 
unless their reasonable demands are met. With 
these words, I am warning again about the 
attitude of the Government towards the 
railwaymen. The entire working class of India 
will observe a one-day strike on May IS in 
support of the railwaymen and in protest 
against the attitude of the Government which 
is trying to cow down the railwaymen by brute 
force. Thank you. 
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SHRI SUBRAMANIAN SWAMY (Uttar 
Pradesh):  Mr.  Vice-Chairman, I just want to 
take a few minutes to highlight   some 
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of  the  points that the  Minister  has    not 
cared to include in his defence. 

First, I would like to point out to this House 
that on the question of money somehow this 
House is constantly misinformed. 1 
remember when the discussion was going on 
on the Railways, the Minister said that the 
demands of the railway workers would cost 
Rs. 450 crores. I challenged the Minister and 
wanted to know how these estimates have 
been worked out. He replied: "Well, 1 will 
write to you a letter". It is in the 
Parliamentary record. 1 asked: "Will you 
write before the strike'?". He said: "Yes, I will 
write before the strike". Today the 
Government has not defended itself or 
defended the estimate that is floating around. 
1 mention this because the total staff bill of 
the Railways is Rs. 480 crores. How can the 
demands of the railway employees amount to 
between Rs. 450 and Rs. 500 crores? If you 
remove all the paddy from the staff bill and 
consider only the workers of the Railways, 
then the total wage bill would be Rs. 260 
crores. Whether it is 260 or 480 crores, the 
total bonus commitment will  only amount to 
Rs. 40 crores. 

The remainder of the financial demand, 
whether it is concerned with connecting DA 
with price index, has nothing to do with price 
rise and revenue rise. It is the duty of the 
Government to see that the price rise is 
compensated. What I am trying to say is that 
Rs. 450 crores figure is being circulated all 
over the country through the T.V., through 
radio and through the Minister's printed 
speeches. But in this House, while we are 
discussing the budget, this has nowhere been 
defended. And when I tried to pinpoint it on 
the Minister, he said that he would write me a 
letter. But up till today he has not written me 
a letter. 

Similarly, Mr. Chavan spoke about peri-
pheral issues raised in my talk or that of my 
colleagues. What about food subsidy? Only 
Rs. 100 crores have been allocated. Can you 
give a guarantee that you will not exceed Rs. 
100 crores? Is that a realistic figure in the 
present situation? Or is St realistic   in   the   
view   of   the   Agriculture 

Ministry? Similarly, about the allocation of 
giants and loans to State Governments, this has 
been reduced by Rs. 266 crores. Now, what 
have the State Governments to do? They will 
have to cut down their expenditure. Can they 
do that? The expenditure of the Central 
Government is increasing by 15 per cent; they 
are not able to control it. Or the State Govern-
ments wi;i have to draw overdrafts, which 
means increase in the deficit. I pointed out to 
the hon. Minister that the deficit estimate of 
Rs. 125 crores is wildly an underestimate. This 
has been the past history. Would he care to set 
a new tradition this time in Parliament, in the 
broad sense of the word, by assuring this 
Parliament that this time, whatever may 
happen, he will see that the deficit does not 
exceed Rs. 125 crores? He has not given that 
assurance. Neither has he told me where I have 
gone wrong in pointing out the wrongness of 
the estimates in these regards. These are the 
two items: food subsidy and loans to State 
Governments. 

Mr. Bhupesh Gupta has been raising the 
issue of bureaucrats. I personally feel that 
some of our young bureaucrats are the most 
brilliant people in this country. I think this 
country should be run very well by them. But 
we have a hang-over from the past, which, I 
am afraid, will frustrate any Ministry, any 
plan, as long as the Minister is basically 
complacent or perhaps is a man who is 
preoccupied in some party or factional warfare 
or some State election. If the Minister are 
capable, with the help of bureaucrats this 
country can be very  well  run. 

Here is a young officer—Mr. Seth— whose 
house is raided. It is totally unjustified. Then, 
adverse remarks are written about him. By 
whom? By Mr. B. B. Lai. What are Mr. B. B. 
Lai's antecedents? He was Chairman of the 
State Electricity Board in Uttar Pradesh . . . 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN    (SHRI V. B. 
RA.TU): This subject has been discussed at 
great length already . . . 

SHRI SUBRAMANIAN SWAMY: You 
have been most liberal with others . . . 
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THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU): I am not intervening. I am just telling 
that this subject has already been discussed .  .  
. 

SHRI SUBRAMANIAN SWAMY: I am 
bringing new facts. I am just pointing out how 
can such people inspire young bureaucrats? 
Mr. B. B. Lai was the Chairman in Uttar 
Pradesh. It was Oberoi Electric Works. He 
gave a contract to a foreign company, whose 
agent was living in his house. The Minister got 
suspicious. The Minister there at that time was 
Mr. Banarsi Das. He got very suspicious. He 
asked for the file. Mr. B. B. Lai refused on 
grounds of autonomy. The Minister wrote to 
the Central Vigilance Officer here in Delhi 
that he wanted an inquiry to be conducted 
against this man. Nothing has happened. He 
was transferred. He was made Chief Secretary 
and sent abroad for training or for vacation or 
for what, I don't know. After he came back, he 
became Secretary in the Ministry of Industrial 
Development, then in Commerce, and then he 
was sent to the Planning Commission. How 
can officers with such background inspire 
young bureaucrats in our country? 

I can give you many instances. I have got a 
long list of Secretaries—these are the old 
block, coming from the British days. These 
people are guilty of enormous indiscretion. 
Sir, I lived for seven years in the United 
States. There I used to see three bureaucrats 
every year, mostly when it was hot in India 
and cool there. And they used to be there with 
our Economic Professors and their discussions 
were incredible. I can document them but it is 
unnecessary. As long as such a crust, given to 
us by the British, continue to rule this country 
and continue to terrorize the young elements 
in our bureaucracy, we cannot get 
implementation under any circumstances. And 
as long as the Ministers are completely 
insulated from public opinion, from the young 
bureaucrats, from young people, just by a set 
of senior bureaucrats who come to see the 
Minister at the aerodrome, carry their luggage 
and arrange for their passage, and as long as 
this insulation takes place, I am afraid, Mr. 
Chavan will have to come back next year and 
say, "I 

am very sorry, it is not going to be a deficit of 
Rs. 125 crores this year but it is going to be 
Rs. 1,000 crores, for the following reasois." 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN    (SHRI V.  B. 
RAJU):  Yes, Mr. Finance Minister. 

 
THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 

RAJU): Two members from your Party 
participated. Now your Party Leader. . . . 
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THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU): You could have taken a chance in the 
First reading stage. 

SHRI UMASHANKAR DIKSHIT:    Mr. 
Vice-Chairman, Sir, it is not a question of his 
speaking or not speaking; he often speaks. We 
want all the Members of the House to 
participate. But, Sir, he is creating a precedent 
which will not be conducive to the proper 
functioning of the House. There is a system 
there is a tradition which has been followed. I 
would request the hon. Member not to break 
that tradition. Otherwise, every Member can 
speak like that and go on playing with the 
valuable time of the House. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU): The Chair has to regulate the business 
of the House. 

 
THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 

RAJU): I have already called the Finance 
Minister. 

 
 

 
THE VICE-CHAIRMAN    (SHRI V. B. 

RAJU): It is not a question of time, Raj-
narainji. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU): We have been very liberal to you. 
Please do not disturb the business. 

 
THE VICE-CHAIRMAN    (SHRI V. B. 

RAJU):  Please do not create a situation. 
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were of a general nature and no specific points 
were raised. Therefore, I do not think that any 
detailed reply is called for. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN    (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU):  Mr.  Rajnarain, please sit down. 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN: Mr. Vice-Chairman, 
Sir most of the points that were raised 
74L/P(N)11RSS—0000—27-8:74—C1PS 

SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN: Some of the points 
raised by Shri Bhupesh Gupta were not 
germane to the Finance Bill as such and, 
therefore, Sir, I do not think that a further  
detailed reply is called for. 

 
SHRI Y. B. CHAVAN: One point Mr. 

Subramanian Swamy has raised was about 
subsidy and deficit financing. I can tell you, 
Sir, that nobody can give any 100 per cent 
guarantee about it. But, I can only say that it is 
our desire and it will be our sincere and 
genuine effort to see that this deficit financing 
is kept down to Rs. 125 crores. More than that 
I do not think anything is required. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU): The question is: 

"That the Bill be returned." 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN    (SHRI V.  B.  
 
 
 

: The question is: 
"That the Bill  be returned." 

The motion  was adopted. 
THE  VICE- CHAIRMAN:   The House 

stands adjourned till 11.00 a.m. tomorrow. 
The House adjourned at forty-six 

minutes past six of the clock till 
eleven of the clock on Friday, the 
10th May, 1974. 

 

 


