
89 Re Constitution of Special cell  [ 12 MAY 1972 ] in the Planning Commission 90 

5.   Consideration and passing of .2 hrs the Delhi 
Cooperative Societies Bill, 1972, as passed by 
ihe Lok Sabha. 

The Committee recommended that the 
House should sil up to 6.00 P. M. daily and 
beyond 6.00 P. M. as and when necessary for 
the transaction of Government business. 

RESOLUTION RE     CONSTITUTION    
OF SPECIAL     CELL     IN   THE    

PLANNING COMMISSION FOR WEST 
BENGAL 

SARDAR AMJAD ALI (West Bengal) : 
Sir,   I   beg to move : 

In view of the present political, social and 
econcmic condition of the State of West 
Bengal, this House is of opinion that the 
Government of India should take immediate 
steps to constitute special cell in the Planning 
Commission for West Bengal, allocate 
adequate funds for the development projects 
of that State and advise the Government of 
West Bengal to ser up a State Planning  Board. 

Mr. Deputy Chairman, by the time my 
Resolution comes up for discussion in this 
House, I think the last portion thereof wherein 
it is said : "advise the Government of West 
Bengal to set up a State Planning Board" has 
become redundant because in the meantime 
you all know that the Government of West 
Bengal have already constituted a Stale 
Planning Board in which not only eminent 
technologists and economists have been given 
their due place, but also one resprcted Member 
of this House, Shri Kali Mukherjee, has been 
given a place. Even then I move the Resolution 
in this House with the hope and'expectation 
that the entire house will realise the situation, 
as it is now prevailing in that State—
situation—prevailing in the fields of politics, 
society and economy   of  that   particular State. 

The Stale of West Bengal which has passed 
through a stage of uneasiness for the last few 
years has naturally drawn the attention of the 
wisest men oft' e country, not only to speak of 
the Members of this House. I know that hon. 
Members of Parliament have thought over ihe 
problems of tliat State. They ha- e made 
several suggestions lo the Government for 
minimising the problems of that Slate and they 
have expressed   their   anxiety    with   regard   
to  the 

incidents 'hat were happening for the last few 
years in thai particular State. Now that stage is 
over in the Slate and peace stability have come 
back and I think this particular stage or 
situation will coniinue. Even then there is no 
gainsaying the fact that the turmoil which was 
prevailing for the last few years has di l'.nilely 
drawn the attention of the wisest men ol the 
country. But specific and careful attention to 
the problems of development of I lie Sta'e 
should now be given without any hesitation or 
delay. I hope my Resolution will be accepted 
not only by the hon. Members, but I also 
believe that the government will accept it 
inasmuch as it says about opening of a special 
c. 11 in the Planning Commission for West 
Bengal. Whenever the State of West Bengal has 
come in for discussion here, the exuberance that 
was shown by the youth of that part of the 
country was ruthlessly criticised. Al this stage I 
must confess thai, when with due consideration 
the Government of India has allocated a fund of 
Rs. 145 crores for ihe development of the city 
of Calcutta. The Government, after due 
consideration, has declared 13 of the 16 
districts as under-developed in this State. So, 
Ihe Government should feel I hat it is high time 
that a special cell in the Planning Commission 
for the State of West Bengal was opened. 

Now, Sir, the lion. Minister for Planning 
may come with an answer that there is no 
necessity lor opening a special cell in the 
Planning Commission, because, in the entire 
planning machinery, there is the National 
Development Council or that there is provision 
lor Programme Advisers and so, there is no 
utility of opening defFerent cells. But, Sir, I 
should submit and I should urge upon the 
Planning Minister to realise that the National 
Development Council and the Programme 
Advisers, in so far as their duties are con-
cerned.—I am not casting any aspersions on 
them—could not act according to the times and 
they could not act according to the exigencies 
of the times in respect of the needs of the 
States. The National Development Council is a 
big and bulky body and so, to my estimate ol' 
the situation, it is not possible for them to give 
always clue importance and weighlage to ihe 
problems, the specific problems of a particular 
Suite and that is why, I think, to co-ordinate 
ami to look to the implementation of the 
different projects of the States, the posts ol' 
Programme Advisers were created. 1 submit, 
Sir, that the Programme  Advisers  were  given 
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[Sardar Amjad AH] charge of several States 
at a time while the entire Indian territory, that is 
all the States, were divided into three regions, 
Northern, Southern and Eastern Regions and 
only three members were appointed as 
Programme Advisers and ihey were in charge 
of several States. Their primary duty was to go 
through the schemes and projects forwarded by 
the different State Governments, to look to the 
implementation thereof and to co-ordinate 
between the Union Government, the Planning 
Commission and the State Government. But, 
Sir, I must bring it to the notice of the Planning 
Minister that not a single Piogramme Adviser 
could even work in that particular business for 
more than two years. 

Sir, our planning is meant for five years and 
that has got to be completed within five years. 
The very important posts of Programme 
Advisers were created to co-ordinate and to 
look to the implementation of the different 
projects. But the tenure of these posts could not 
even be completed by a single Programme 
Adviser for one full plan period. So, I fee!, Sir, 
that though the posts of Programme Advisers 
were created with a very genuine hope, with a 
very genuine expectation, these Programme Ad\ 
isers, for some reason or other, could not 
discharge their duties and they could not fulfil 
the aspirations due to the short tenure of their 
offices. So, Sir, I feel that it is high lime that we 
considered the spirit of my Resolution which I 
have placed before this august House. 

Sir, the Indian independence which we got 
on the midnight of August 14, 1947, caused the 
vivisection of this country affecting two States, 
the State of West Bengal and the State of 
Punjab. The Planning Commission was formed 
in 1950 with the idea that the resources of our 
country should be mobilised for the betterment 
of the entire country, for the uplift-ment of the 
people, and for the utilisation of all the 
resources for the benefit of the country. I do not 
want to cast any aspersions on the working of 
the Planning Commission, nor the Union 
Ministry. But probably, Sir, sometimes the fact 
is stranger than fiction and we cannot simply 
say a goodbye to the facts which are very 
rampant, which are very luminous, which are 
very assertive for the whole of India. 

Sir, the State of West Bengal was definitely 
the highest wealth-producing State at the time 
when   we   freed   our country.   The   planning 

came into being with the idea that each part of 
the country will flourish, that the resources of 
each part of the country will be utilized— 
utilized for the national integrity, utilized for 
the causes of betterment of each part of the 
country. 

Unfortunately, Sir, after long 25 years, after 
three Plan periods have already passed and 
while we are in the middle portion of the fourth 
Plan, weifind the question of regional 
imbalance has come in. We find to our utter 
surprise that the question of provincial 
discrimination comes in. Sir, I am the last 
person to bring in a sense of provincialism in 
this House. But again I must reiterate that the 
fact is stranger than fiction. 

Sir, during this Plan period we find that 
whenever any question regarding the betterment 
and development of the State of West Bengal 
came in, the reply from the side of the 
Government was that this State was passing 
through a stage of turmoil, that there was no 
political peace, that the entire society is agitated 
and that the entire economic environments were 
closed. I admit that this was so. But the 
conditions remained as such only for a few-
years. That stage came into the picture only 
from 1967 to 1971. During these four or five 
years the State was in turmoil. But before that 
there was stability. There was Government of 
the pattern of the Union of India. There was a 
Government formed by the Congress. What 
happened during those days ? 

Let me bring it to the notice of the Planning 
Minister that up to 1955 West Bengal maintain-
ed its position with regard to the per capita 
income. But after 1955 up to 1965, let us 
compare the Stale with some other State of our 
federation. Sir, in Tamil Nadu, the per capita 
income from 1955 to 1965 increased up to 40.5 
per cent, in Maharashtra 28.4 per cent, in Bihar 
22.9 per cent, in Punjab 91.1 per cent, in Gujarat 
5.7 per cent, the all-India average being 13.7 per 
cent. But in the case of West Bengal we find a 
very dismal picture. We find that there was a 
decline of per capita income by 2 per cent, while 
in the case of Assam it was 1.8 per cent. The 
planning was there. I do not cast any aspersions 
on the will and desire of the planning personnel, 
the Union Government. But it is a fact and that 
fact has got to be considered. 

With regard to the agricultural sector of West   
Bengal,   what   is   the   increase   in output 
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from 1950 to 1960 ? It is much less than it is in 
other States. We find that in Maharashtra the 
increase it total output was 66.5% ; in Madhya 
Pradesh, 61,2% ; in Tamil Nadu, 50.2%; in 
Punjab, 35.8%. But in the case of West Bengal 
it was only 12.8%. So is the case in the case of 
domestic production. From 1950-51 to 1960-61, 
in Maharashtra the increase was 58.7% ; in 
Tamil Nadu, 57.1% ; in Punjab and Haryana, 
37.3% ; Bihar, 43.3% ; Gujarat, 34.1%. But in 
the case of West Bengal it is only 30.3%. Now, 
if the national Plan was aimed at development 
of each part of our country, then I fait to under-
stand as to what the causes were behind this 
dismal picture of the State of West Bengal. I 
find to my wisdom that it is not for the people 
to find out the causes but it is for the Union 
Government and it is for the Planning Com-
mission to ascertain the causes—the causes 
which are not known to the people, the causes 
which are not known to the ordinary citizens of 
that part of the country. 

I have urged upon the opening of a special 
cell in the Planning Commission and also have 
urged upon in the old traditional way for 
allocation of adequate funds. I think the 
Planning Minister will be one with me that in 
the geographical position of the Indian territory 
the State of West Bengal occupies a very 
strategic position. It has got a specific political 
importance in so far as the integrity of the 
nation is concerned. Any slightest move ^there-
in will definitely cause serious tension in so far 
as Indian politics is concerned, in so far as the 
State is concerned. Therefore, if tensions were 
there—I submit—causes were also there for 
creating this sort of tension. We cannot simply 
bid goodbye to the proposition that something 
more has got to be done for the State. One 
should surely be one with me in saying that the 
State requires specific attention inasmuch as it 
is a very vital and important State. One cannot 
say that the people of West Bengal or the youth 
of West Bengal or the unemployed people of 
West Benga! are of a different anthropological 
aspect. I must submit, boastfully, that the 
people of West Bengal are very tolerant and 
very submissive if not the wisest. They have 
wailed so far though the Government in their 
wisdom have made many more things for them. 
But I would urge upon the Planning Ministry to 
realise the situation, a situation, which now is 
explosive. If you find that the youth of that part 
of the country indulged in excesses in violence, 
created  some  trouble   and    committed    loot- 

ing and arson in some nooks and corners of that 
part of the country, it is for the craftsmen of our 
Slate and for the Government of India to look 
for the causes. Of course they are paying their 
attention and they will have to pay their 
attention so that the entire national integrity of 
our country is not butchered. 

With regard to the question of population 
growth in West Bengal, I would submit that 
population growth in West Bengal, is also very 
high as compared to the other States. 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PLANNING (SHRI MOHAN 
DHARIA) :   Is that also our fault ? 

SARDAR AMJAD ALI : When the popula-
tion grows and when this particular issue is 
brought to the notice of the hon. Minister for 
Planning, the hon. Minister is very much 
jubilant but we are not jubilant. It is not that 
West Bengal people are alone responsible for 
this growth.   One should appreciate this. 

MR.  DEPUTY  CHAIRMAN  :    You   can 
continue after lunch. 

The House adjourned till 2.30. 
The House adjourned for lunch 

at   two   minutes   past   one  of the 
Clock. 

The House reassembled after lunch at half 
past two of the clock, MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN 
in the Chair. 

SARDAR AMJAD ALI : I was speaking 
about the population growth of the different 
States. I said that in the case of the State of W 
est Bengal the population growth since 1951-61 
is 32.8%. At this point the Planning Minister 
also gave a very proper attention. I do not know 
what are the causes for this population growth 
but at least one cause is there and that cannot be 
lost sight of. Since the partition, a vast number 
of emigrants from East Pakistan crossed the 
border and tool shelter in this particular State. 
So that is thi most important cause lor which 
the growth o population in that Stale culminated 
in a mucl greater measure. What I want to urge 
upoi is this that while the growth of population i 
high in that State, the growth of per capit. 
income is very low. While the growth c wealth 
is very high, the growth of per capit income is 
very low. After we have covere three Plans it is 
really a strange matter th; that particular State 
could not flourish  in 
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way   as  our   Planning   Commission   at   hast 
thought  of.   In  the  field   of education also up 
to the year 1961 it was 5th in position while   in 
the year 1971 it is in   the  9th  position.   So  in 
all aspects of the social, economic and   
political side  the  State   of West  Bengal   is  
in  a  very lamentable position.   What I   want   
to   impress on the  Planning  Minister  is this,   
it   is not a fact   that  we will  urge  upon   the  
cry   on   a povincial  footing.   It   is  not  that  
we  will cry in   a   parochial  way.   Nor   is  it 
a fact that we will impress upon the   
discrimination   which   is very   wrongly   
alleged   by   some    Opposition parties   in  
this  side  of the   country.   What  I want  to  
impress   upon   the Planning Minister is this 
that   the problems  of West  Bengal  are vast 
and the, problems  altogether  have   got   to be 
scrutinised in a very very sincere way.   Willi 
the   fiscal   atmosphere   that   nas     how    
been brought after   this election, with the 
establishment of a  stable  Government   over  
there and with the new zeal with which the new  
Government   is   now   acting,    with    their    
sincerity expressed  by  the  formotion  of   the  
Planning Board for the State. I think I  will  not  
be  out of   tune,   to   say   that   on   some  
occasion   the Planning Minister said that if the 
State   formed a  State  Planning  Board,   then   
he  will   also cooperate  in  the  matter  by  
giving   financial assistance    for    the     
development—all-round development—of that 
State.   Sir,   to  close  my speech, another 
aspect which   I   will   bring  to the notice of 
the Planning Minister is regarding the  total  
Plan  outlays for different States and Central 
assistance that  has  been  provided   so far for 
that State in comparison to other Stat< -. In   
the  First  Plan  West  Bengal   was   allotted 
Rs. 113   crores,   in   the   Second   Plan   Rs.   
73 crorcs and in the  Third   Plan  Rs.   157  
crores. But what   do  we find  with regard  to   
other States?   Take for instance  the case  of 
Andhra Pradesh.   In  the  First  Plan the 
Central assistance was  Rs. 61   crores,  in  the 
Second Plan Rs.   '16   crores  and   in   the 
Third Plan Rs. 227 crores.   The figures for 
other States are : 

So I do not say it is a case of discrimination but I 
would plead with tlie. Planning Minister to see 
that conditions are not there in which some 
political elements or some political parties may 
interpret it as a case of discrimination in a 
different light thai will cause a serious disaster to 
the all round national integrity of our country. So 
far as the Fourth Plan is concerned while West 
Bengal, a poor States has only a total allocation of 
Rs. 322 crores, it is nrich lower than that of other 
States. Of course it may be said that the Slate 
itself cannot mobilise resources while other other 
States can. Hut I would only say that even as early 
as 1968 the then Governor, Mr. Dharma Vira for 
whom there is much indignation in Bengal, told 
the Union Government that not a single item is 
left for the Stale which can be taxed. It is a highly 
taxed State. Of course in die field of earning of 
revenue for the whole of India three major 
commodities are there, steel, jute and coal. 
Therefore as I said earlier it is a more well-paid 
State but in the case of development we find it is 
not satisfactory. And the time is high enough 
when the Planning Minister will kindly realise the 
situation from the experiments which were clone 
during the last year and from the point . of view to 
which West Bengal has been exposed for the last 
kw years. In conclusion I would urge upon the 
hon. Members of this House to be one with me in 
the tune in which I have placed my Resolution 
befoie this House and I think it would he 
accepted. Let us hope for the best and let us hope 
that the evil will be removed. 

Thank you. 

The question was proposed. 
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India  is backward as a   whole. 
And. U. P. is one of the most backward States. 

CHAUDHARY. MOHAMMAD (Bihar) : 
And Bihar. 

SHRI NAW'AL KISHORE : Bihar also. 
Bihar is behind also. It would be a body of so 
many States. 
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SHRI  PRANAB  K'JMAR  MUKHER.JEE 
(West Bengal): Mr. Deputy Chairman, Sir, I 
support the resolution moved by my friend, Mr. 
Sardar Amjad Ali. Sir, when I was listening to 
Nawal Kishoreji it struck my mind as to why he 
was objecting to reference of West Bengal's 
political situation in the resolution. 

Mr. Deputy Chairman, Sir, you are aware 
on many occasions since 1967 problems of 
West 
Bengal have been discussed on the floor of 
this House. Almost every year since 1967 we 
had to pass the Budget of West Bengal, in the 
National Legislature and we had to discuss 
the affairs on West Bengal on many occasions. 
And since my entry into this House, I do not 
remember a single session when the problems 
of West Bengal, cither relating to 
3 P.M. the law and order situation, cr relat- 

ing to the proclamation of President's 
rule, or relating to other incidental mailers, were 
not discussed on the floor of the House. In view 
that, what the mover of the Resolution wants to 
emphasise is that there is a change in the 
political situation of West Bengal. There is a 
favourable change in the political situation of 
West Bengal in which the industrial climate may 
improve and economic betterment is possible. 
Therefore, he wants lo refer to the change in the 
political situation in the State of West Bengal 
which was not there since   1967.    Regarding   
the  last  part  of the 
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Rosolution, as Nawal Kishoreji has very rightly 
pointed out, it is the business of lhe State 
legislature, and if I understand correctly, the 
mover of the Resolution has also pointed out 
(hat the last part ol the Resolution stands 
redundant because of the establishment of a 
Stale Planning Board in West Bengal. When 
actually the text of the Resolution was given to 
the Secretarial, the Slate Planning Board had 
not been formed. Therefore, the last part of the 
Resolution practically does not stand now, as 
the Board has already been formrd. 

Sir, when I was listening to the argument of 
Nawal Kishoreji in regard to financial 
allocation and when he was pointing out that 
population should be the criterion for financial 
assistance, it struck me why he referred to il. 

SHRI NAWAL KISHORE : I might tell my 
friend that I said that one chief Minisie: of U. P. 
wanted (his to be the basis but T did not agree 
with him then. But the step-motherly treatment 
of the Central Government has forced me to say 
that there should be some change in the policy 
of Central assistance. 

SHRI PRANAB KUMAR MUKHERJEE : 
It is only there. I was already trying to point out 
that it is already there. Mr. Tyagi presided over 
the Fifth Finance Commission, From the First 
(o the Fifth Finance Commission, it has been 
the principle of every Finance Commission that 
while allocating funds to the States, populations 
should be the major cri'e-rion, and almost over 
90 per cent of allocation is made on the basis of 
population. In fact, we have a grievance against 
Mr. Mahavir Tyagi on this point . . , 

MR. MAHAVIR TYAGI (Uttar Pradesh) : 
That population formula mostly applies to the 
distribution of the income-tax revenue. The 
Income-tax revenue of the Centre has to be 
distributed among the States. For that pui-pose, 
the general practice has been that quite a large 
chunk of it is distributed on the basis of 
population, and the rest, on the basis of their 
requirements. 

SHRI PRANAB KUMAR MUKHERJEE : I 
want to point out that when Mr. Tyagi presided 
ovi i the Fifth Finance Commission, he made a 
departure from that principle regarding the 
allocation of the income-tax revenue because 
he gave more emphasis on the incentive   
aspect;   that   is,   the    Stales  which 

realised more income-tax were given Deuer 
shares in the recommendations of the Fifth 
Finance Commission. But if you look at the 
recommendations of the First Finance Commis-
sion to the Fourth Finance Commission, you 
will find that more emphasis has been laid on 
the population criterion. So, it is there. And I 
would also like to remind Nawal Kishoreji that 
during the regime of Mr. Mahavir Tyagi in the 
Fifth Finance Commission, Uttar Pradesh, for 
the first time, got grant-in-aid under article 275 
of the Constitution. In all olher 
recommendations of the Finance Commissions 
from the First to the Fourth, no allotment was 
made under the grant-in-aid scheme under 
article 275. The Fifth Finance Commission 
made this recommendation. 

SHRI MAHAVIR TYAGI : It is always 
there when there is deficit. If a Slate is in 
deficit according to the figures supplied, then 
that aid is given. 

SHRI PRANAB KUMAR MUKHERJEE : 
I want to point out that you got money and it is 
not as if you did not get money. 

SHRI  NAYVAL KISHORE :   I accepted it. 

SHRI PRANAB KUMAR  MUKHERJEE : 
Now, why should the question of West Bengal 
b~ taken as a special case ? It is a very 
reasonable question as to why a special cell 
should be created to deal with the affairs of 
West Bengal. Mr. Deputy Chairman, Sir, we 
must face the facts and we must be realistic. 
When President's rule was proclaimed in West 
Bengal* during the last occasion, we made a 
Constitutional deparlure and a cell was created 
in the Union Home Ministry. One Central 
Cabinet Minister was designated as Minister of 
West Bengal Affairs to look after the affairs of 
West Bengal. The problems ol West Bengal arc 
not normal. The problems are serious. And 
each and every member of this House and the 
olher House, each and every member of the 
public, each and every member of the Gove-
rnment, is fully aware of it. So the special 
treatement of West Bengal comes into picture. 

Before 1967 West Bengal did not need any 
special treatment because along with the other 
States of India West Bengal was having its 
problems in the normal way. But since 1967 
West Bengal reached almost stagnation. How il 
reached stagnation, I would like to quote 
something from   a  paper  prepared not by any 
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politician,   but   by  one  of  the   officials of 
the West Bengal Government  the number of 
registered factories  continued   to increase 
sleadily from 2625  in   1952  to  5714  in 
1966.   Income from    organised factory   
establishments  nearly trebled, from Rs.   103  
crores   to about Rs. 310 during this period.    
The gross ex-factory value of industrial  output    
increased    from  about Rs. 350 crores  in   
1951   to  Rs. 1376 crores in 1965.    Between   
1961   and 1966 the number of jobs provided 
by  West Bengal in the organised sector was  
the   largest  of all   States.   In 1966 it was  
22.8  lakhs   compared   to  22.7  lakhs in 
Maharashtra.      That   is   the  picture  of West 
Bengal between   1952  and   1966.    What is 
the picture  after   1967?    Again  I  quote 
from the same    paper;      The    number    of    
registered working  factories   of West  Bengal   
decreased from 5737 in 1961 to 55J9 in 1967. 
The average number  of persons   employed   
daily  in  these factories  also   fell   from 8.17   
lakhs in 1968 to 7.91 lakhs   in   1969.    
Because of this abnormal situation   in   West    
Bengal    we   demand,  we pray,  we  urge   
upon    the   Government   that West  Bengal  
should   be  treated   on  a  special footing.   
When  we speak   of West Bengal we should 
nor forget that West Bengalis the central point 
of entire  eastern  India.   When  we  talk about 
industrialisation   of West  Bengal, when we  
speak  of   economic  developnent  of West 
Bengal, we should keep in mind that in most 
of the jute mills of West  Bengal,   in  
mostoftlv tea  gardens   of West  Bengal,   in   
most of the factories of West  Bengal, only 
Bengali  people are not working. If you lock at 
the employment list of the jute mills you   will  
find that almost 70 per cent of  the  employees  
cf the jute mills do not come from West 
Bengal, they come from the   neighbouring   
States.   If you   look   at the employment list 
of tea plantations you will find a   
considerable,    a    sizeable    section    of    the 
workers do  not  come   from  West Bengal,   
do not  come  from  the  Bengali  community,   
but they come from   the   adjoining   States.     
If you look at the  employment   list   of coal, 
mines in Raniganj   and Asansol  you will find 
that   out of 50000 workers, almost  "0000 
workers belong to Bihar  and   certain  other 
adjoining  States. Therefoie, when  we  talk   
of developing West Bengal, we do not mean 
that it should be done only  for the  Bengalis.    
If you   develop West Bengal, if you develop  
Calcutta, if you   industrialise West Bengal,  it  
will   serve the purpose of entire eastern  India.    
Eastern  India  taken together,   everybody  
will   admit   and   I   hope Mr. Nawal Kishore 
also will admit, is the most 

beckward region   in   comparison lo other parts 
of the  country.   Therefore, while talking about 
West Bengal we do  not mean   anything paro-
chial,   anything    provincial    and    we  do  not 
interpret   the  development   of West Bengal in 
the narrow sense  of the  term.    The  question 
comes as to why  a  special cell is to be created 
in   the    Planning     Commission.      My    
friend Shri Arnjad AH has  quoted   some 
statistics and figures.   I do not.   want  to  go   
into them.   But it has to be remembered  that 
when the Fourth Plan allocation  was  made.  
West  Bengal  had total plan outlay of  Rs. 
322.50 crores.   Out of that, West  Bengal's  own   
share   was  Rs.   101 crores.   Shri Dharia 
knows it very well.   It was not possible for 
West   Bengal Government since the inceptions 
of the  Fourth Plan even to give Rs. 1 til crores 
as their own share. I am grateful to him because  
this year   he   has given Rs. 73 crores  as    non-
plan    assistance    to  the  West Bengal 
Government.    This Slate which was on the top 
of the industrial  map of India in 1947. It cannot 
pay  Rs.   101   crores at its own share for the 
Forth Plan outlay   what   is   the  outlay for the  
Forth  Plan in respect of West Bengal ? It is Rs. 
322.5 crores.    What   is  the  plan outlay   in  
other   States?    Maharashtra  had   Rs. 898.12     
crores ;     Andhra     Pradesh    has    Rs. 420.59   
crores Bihar   had   Rs.   455.00 crores ; Tamil 
Nadu had  Rs.   510.36  crores and West Bengal  
had Rs.   322   crores.    What was West 
Bengal's   Third   Plan   outlay ?     It  was about 
Rs. 304 crores whereas  the Fourth Plan outlay 
Rs. 322 crores with Rs. 101 crores as their own 
share    which      they     are    not    in a  
position to spend and   therefore it had to beg 
from the Government of  India    which,   I  must 
admit, was   kind   enough   to  allocate   Rs.  73 
crores as non-Plan assistance because of our 
problems, because of our peculiar situation, 
because of the State's    stagnation    in    
industrialisation and economic situation. 

It is because of that, my friend has placed a 
demand that a special cell should be created in 
the Planning Commission to loo!: after tfie 
affairs of West Bengal. It is not a parochial 
demand nor is it a provincial demand. West 
Bengal is not the State of West Bengal geogra-
phically. This has to be remembered. In the 
economic context and in the industrial context, 
West Bengal means the whole of Eastern India. 
It has also to be remembered that even today, 
that is in 1971-72, 20 per cent of the total in-
dustrial output comes from this State. It has also 
to be remembered that two highest foreign 
exchange  earning industries,   namely, jute and 
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tea, are established in West Bengal. When we 
talk of increasing our exports in engineering 
industry, it has to be remembered that the entire 
industrial structure of West Bengal is based on 
the engineering industry. It is a State where 
there is no rule to give employment only to the 
sons of the soil. Wc are against it. Each and 
every person has a right to seek a job anywhere 
lie likes. Can you make any comparison with 
other States? I have spoken about engineering 
industry ; I have spoken about jute industry; I 
have spoken about coal mine industry, I have 
spoken about tea plantations. In all these sectors 
persons belonging to other States outnumber the 
sons of the soil. Therefore, when we talk about 
development of West Bengal, we do not mean it 
in any narrow sense of the term. 

Not only I have no objection, but I would 
rather welcome if various cells for the develop-
ment of various States are being created in the 
Planning Commission. I do not know why Shri 
Nnwal Kishore should object to it. What is the 
harm ? That is not going to be a super-body. 
They have to be there in their advisory capacity. 
They will help the Planning Commission very 
much. If there be a cell for each individual Slate 
under the guidance of the Planning 
Commission, under the overall supervision of 
the Planning Commission, and if each State has 
its own planning Board, and if there is co-
ordination between these two agencies. I think 
the functioning of the Planning Commission 
will be much better. Mr. Deputy Chairman, Sir, 
another thing I would like to point out and that 
is about the regional imbalances about which 
Shri Nawal Kishore has spoken. It is a very 
serious thing and we must take note of it. If we 
talk of regional imbalances, I apprehend, there 
is a chance of being misunderstood. But, Sir, it 
is at the same time necessary —and this has 
been spoken by the highest in authority in our 
country that unless and until you do away with 
the regional imbalance:,, you cannot stop these 
fissiparous tendencies and the separatist 
tendencies. 

If some part of the country remains undeve-
loped and if some part of the country is exploit-
ed by the other parts, definitely fissiparous ten-
dencies and separatist tendencies would crop up 
and the best way to s'op it is to do away with 
the regional imbalances. When we had a dis-
cussion on the Mid-term Appraisal of the 
Fourth Plan, that very point was discussed and 
the Planning Minister assured the House that 
they will do their best to do away with regional 

imbalances.   How  can   it   be  done  until  you 
control   the   licensing  policy ?   How can it be 
done until you control the financial institutions? 
How can it be done until you  give opportunity to 
the  backward areas ?   We have  framed two or  
three schemes   for  the  development of the 
backward   areas.    The  scheme  of  concessions 
from the financial institutions and 10% subsidy 
schemes   Mr. Deputy Chairman. Sir, if you look 
at  the  progress   of these   schemes you will be 
disappointed.   Now, there  are valid  reasons in 
the  argument of Mr. Navval Kishore when  he 
said that some parts of U. P.  which is the bir th 
place of all the Prime Ministers and which pro-
duces Prime Ministers and which sends the maxi-
mum number of Members to  both  the  Houses 
of  Parliament, are the most backward  in com-
parison with the other parts of the  country.    I 
do not want that any part of the country should 
remain  backward.  There are some  lacunae in 
the policies  of the Government and they  have to 
be  removed.   Therefore, Sir, when  I talk of 
West  Bengal,   I hope,  Members  will not mis-
derstand me or the other  Members saying that 
we are advocating the cause of West Bengal for 
parochial   reasons or for partisan reasons.   We 
talk of West  Bengal   because  of the  political 
situation "created   by   the   political   parties   in 
West Bengal.   They themselves are  responsible 
for  it and I do not blame anybody.   But as an 
abnormal situation has been created, there is no 
point in saying that it cannot be rectified.  Be-
cause of this,   Sir, we want   that West Bengal 
should   be treated   specially and  a special  cell 
should   be created there.   The  Planning Board 
is  already there and the  Government of India 
should  come forward   with adequate  financial 
assistance.    Otherwise,   Sir,   you  cannot   save 
West Bengal.   If you stick to past  policy, if you 
stick to that formula of help and if you follow it 
in  right  earnestness, you   may save your skin 
but not West   Bengal. You may look  impartial 
to other  States  but with no   result   you  may 
live in   the air of  impartiality.   But, ultimately 
peace in the whole of the eastern region will be 
disturbed   if what  I have said is not done.   We 
cannot   ignore the special   position, the geogra-
phical  position,   the   strategic  position, which 
West  Bengal  occupies  today.   Only the other 
day,  there  were  violences  and,   Mr.  Deputy 
Chairman,  Sir,  you will admit  that these acts of 
violence were not merely the question of law and 
order. If 25 lakhs of people . . .  (Time Bell rings) 
. . . remain out of employment, if 60,000 people  
sleep   on the  footpaths   of Calcutta,   if Calcutta  
remains  as  a human jungle,  as was pointed   out   
by   our   former    Leader   of  the 
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today. It is a problem State since pre-partiti on 
clays. When Pakistani people came to West 
Bengal and there was an influx to West Bengal, 
from that day we are feeling that problem. So it is 
not the mai hematics of money. It is not the 
mathematics of allocation of funds. It is the 
calculation of politics. So I think in an all-India 
context, Bengal is a problem Stale, though it has 
got its material basis. So Bengal's problems as 
stands today should be taken polit ica l ly  and 
emphasis should be given accordingly. 

This House also should specially consider the 
interest   of India  as a whole.   If any phenomenon   
and untoward   situation in Bengal, politically  or 
materially,  goes out of  the control of the  Indian 
Union,   then it  is in the interest of the Indian 
Union, the national Central Government,   to look   
alter the politics in an all-India context and in the 
background of our situation vis-a-vis our relations.   
We are moving towards advancement.   We  are 
moving  towards  socialism,   towards  peace  
against  war.   We are for liberation  of dependent  
countries.   We arc in support of Vietnam.   But 
how are we feeling for our own siser State like 
West Bengal ? 

Now, why special emphasis be given to West 
Bengal ?   I have got some reason   and grounds. 
On  the  basis of those  reasons and  grounds   I 
want   to  establish  my  case that in support of this 
Resolution I would propose that a  special cell 
politically be considered and constituted by the 
Centre  for Bengal at  present.   It is  not to 
counterpose any problem of West Bengal against 
any other problem.   It is only to solve the pro-
blems of other States by solving the problems of 
West Bengal.   What do we see in West Bengal ? 
Why this special emphasis ?  Why is this condi-
tion   which   is explosive ?   It  is  not  explosive 
today, just now.   The explosion has got its ma-
terial   basis.   So,  I say that it  has reached the 
climax of the process today.   The situation has 
become uncontrollable.   It cannot be controlled 
through  any election or any   picecemual planning   
gesture by the Centre.   An extraordinary situation,   
an explosive   situation exist in West Bengal.   So,   
special emphasis   should be given on the 
following grounds. 

Politically, West Bengal is the colony of mo-
nopolists, capitalists. It is the colony of Lord 
Cornwallis. It still remains to be the colony of 
Zamindars and monopolists. I would not say like 
our Party-brothers that Bengal is the colony of the 
Centre, of Indira Gandhi. I would 

[Shri Pranab Kumar Mukherjee] Opposition, 
Shri S.   Mishra—he   termed   Calcutta   as   a 
human   jungle—if    the    premier city  of India, 
that  is,   Calcutta is  a   human jungle,   if    25 
lakhs   of    youth    remain    unemployed,   you 
cannot  expect that  everything will be normal. 
There will be a law  and order situation.   Each 
and every one in the  Ministry and  in the public 
feels  and has  admitted that the situation   in 
West  Bengal is  abnormal and an abnormal 
situation in West Bengal demands and requires 
special attention from the Planning Commission. 
Only  to  focus this  idea  and to draw the 
attention of the persons in  authority and the 
Members of the House,   my friend has brought 
this Resolution.   I hope hon. Members will 
render their support and   the Government will 
do as best as they can do.   Thanking   you, Sir. 

MR.   DEPUTY CHAIRMAN :   Mr.  Sanat 
Kumar Raha. 

SHRI SANAT KUMAR RAHA (West 
Bengal) : Mr. Deputy Chairman, Sir, in the 
Resolution the hon. Member, Shri Amjad AH, 
has brought, tl ere are two parts which should be 
considered in this Hous-. The first part is 
regarding the formation of a cell in the Planning 
Commission for West Bengal. The second part 
of the Resolution which has already been 
operated by the State of West Bengal is regard-
ding the State Planning Board. So our main 
emphasis should be to discuss how far the pro-
posal for constructing a cell in the Planning 
Commission is viable and reasonable and whe-
ther there are reasonable grounds, political, 
economic and such other reasons, for it. 

I think  the spirit of the Resolution is not to 
counter-pose  the problems of West Bengal   as the 
problems of other sister States,   So I would not 
like  to go  into  the  controversy of interstate 
situation. I say that the problems of West Bengal 
should   be   considered    seriously    and should be 
given all emphasis politically. Bengal of Ram 
Mohan,   Bengal of Bankim Chandra, Bengal  of 
Rabindra   Nath,  Bengal  of Vidya Sagar,   Bengal 
of  Sarat   Chandra,   Bengal  of Khudi Ram,
Bengal of Deshbandhu,  Bengal of Netaji,  wants 
today  one special cell   from the Centre   to  have 
its own  advancement in   the arena  of world 
politics  and   in   the arena of Indian national 
advancement.   In this context, politically  I think in 
the all-India  context, the problems ; of Bengal 
should   be visualiszed.   In the all-India  context, 
politically,  Bengal is  a   i problem State.   It   is 
not   a  problem Slate   of 
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only say that it has been made the colony of 
monopolists. It has still been made the colony of 
Rajas and Maharajas created by Lord Corn-
wallis. Since those days Bengal has been suffer-
ing. 

Bengal was made a land of clerks, a State of 
-clerks. Bengal has been allowed to serve British 
imperialism, only to fill their pockets out of 
exploitation. Yet Bengal is proud of itself. 
Bengal fought and produced Khudiram to fight 
against Britishers. Bengal is proud because it 
gave birth to Netaji, it gave birth to Dcshban-
dhu, it gave birth to Bankim Chandra whose 
poems we are quoting here and there. It gave 
birth to Rabindra Nath Tagore. This is our bright 
tradition. This is our pride. This is the glorious 
tradition of West Bengal created by the long-
drawn struggle by Bengalis. This is not the 
question of chauvinism, of regionalism. I do not 
bother for all those things. I do not bother for all 
this local petty-mindedness. I think of Bengal in 
a broader sphere, in an international and national 
sphere, in an integrated manner. This is the 
perspective in which -we should think of Bengal 
today. 

Bengal is still the land of zamindars and 
monopolists. Big industrialists are there. At one 
time, Bengal was the richest State in India. 
Today I think Bengal is lagging behind in all 
spheres of activities, economically, politically. 
It is lagging behind in cultural, educational and 
institutional spheres. In everything of 
development it is lagging behind. The shape of 
Bengal has changed one after another. Out of 
the conspiracy of imperialists, out of the 
conspiracy of monopolists, landlords, zamin-
dars, different fueds and inter-party clashes, it 
lias reached this stage of climax today. Bengal 
is getting frustrated. Frustration is reaching the 
saturation point, It is giving birth to such 
spontaneous ac t iv i t i e s  which are getting out 
of control today. Bengal has undergone many 
experiences of changes, multifarious changes in 
various forms, economically as well as politi-
•cally. 

The two crops, tea and jute of West Bengal 
earn foreign exchange for India. Jute earns Rs. 
250 crores and tea Rs. 160 crores per annum. It 
gives Central Government revenue and foreign 
earning. But frustration has reached such a point 
that poltical solutions arc not possible without 
atcrial aid. Ultimately those whom we think are 
our masters—the electorate, owuld decide the 
course of Bengal. With thebles- 

sings of the electorate, there is a Government of 
alliance. That Govt, is starting to do something 
and they have created this Board of Planning for 
the State. It is high time that we should consider 
it seriously. If we lose this opportune time 
psychologically, politically, economically and 
philosophically, wo shall lose the ground lor 
good. Any phenomenon in Bengal politics has 
got reflected in the all-India horizon of politics. I 
would only emphasize that all this phenomena 
of Bengal should be considered politically and 
valued accordingly. Out of the various problems 
facing Bengal one is the problem of closure and 
lock-outs. The grounds may be there but the 
main fact, accepted by both Lok Sabh.i and the 
Rajya Sabha is that only 29 per cent of the 
closures is due to political actions ; the rest is 
due to want of raw materials, want of 
management, corruption and other things. Then 
North Bengal is also a problem. North Bengal is 
completely cut off from other parts of West 
Bengal. Farakka Barrage is the only connecting 
link between North Bengal and West Bengal. 
North Bengal is a separate problem and it should 
be dealt wMi seriously and in a different 
manner. Every year North Bengal is facing 
recurring floods. Its vast population is facing 
crisis alter crisis and no solution is being 
proposed or attempted either by the Centre or by 
the State. North Bengal is the neglected child of 
India. Therefore I say even wi th in  West 
Bengal imbalances within the districts are there 
and they are very sharp. Calcutta has been 
created a Metropolitan city by the Britishers and 
we arc following that legacy and creating a 
Metropolitan Authority. Thereby we are having 
improvement in Calcutta but not for the rural 
people and we arc keeping in tact the 
imbalances. Districts like Murshidabad, Nadia, 
Birbhum and Ban-kura are backward districts of 
West Bengal and they should be given special 
emphasis politically as well as economically so 
that their problems can be solved. This ran be 
done by creating a cell in (he Planning  
Commission. 

SHRI SASANKASEKHAR SANYAL (West 
Bengal) : But these Districts produce advanced 
people like my friend. 

MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN : Please wind 
up now. 

SHRI SANAT KUMAR RAHA : I am 
winding up. In the end I shall give some data 
regarding . . . 



115 Re Constitution of special cell       [RAJYASABHA]       in the Planning Commission    116 

MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN :   Mr.  Raha, 
there is no time now for any data. 

SHRI   SANAT   KUMAR   RAHA   :   
How 

much time will you allow me ? 

MR. DEPUTY  CHAIRMAN :   15  
minutes for everybody. 

SHRI SANAT KUMAR RAHA : How 
much time have I taken ? 

MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN : You have 
taken 20 minutes already. 

SHRI SANA'!' KUMAR RAHA : Then I 
would sit down. 

SHRI SASANKASKKHAR SANYAL : Mr. 
Deputy Chairman, Sir, the motion moved by 
my friend, as my good friend. Shri Nawal 
Kishore, has put it, gives a welcome and help-
ful opportunity for discussing the question of 
Plan and the relation between tax the States and 
Centre having a bearing on that. Sir, when I 
was in the Bengal legislature we pleaded in 
both the Houses asking for funds from the 
Centre. The Congress was in power at the 
Centre and it was there also. We pleaded in 
vain. I do not know what new effect this 
pleading of my friend now will create. My 
good friend there who is now holding the 
portfolio and listening to the debate, if he were 
a non-official Member, probably would have IK 
en an effective spokesman in support of my 
friend Mr. Amjad Ali but the wheels of fortune 
have turned now. The question of chauvinism 
or the question of parochialism does not arise 
because from my own experience and study of 
the facts and figures I have found that if paro-
chialism and imbalance came into existence 
that was a planned gift of the Centre. The 
Centre wanted to rob Peter to pay Paul. If my 
good friend, Mr. Raiia, looks at the matter a 
little deeper, he will find that Peter was also 
robbed to pay James, James was also robbed to 
pay X and X was also robbed to pay Y. Ulti-
mately, the bottomless pit of the Centre was 
responsible for all the beneficiaries of all the 
States. 

Sir, the Constitution was conceived in the 
spirit of federal unit system of States. But the 
States have been converted into veritable 
clients, charity-boys. This thing has to be 
reversed, and we have been claiming and 
demanding that. Sir, when my friend speaks of 
Bengal, we support it.   My good  friend, Mr. 

Nawal Kishore, also supported it, and  we four 
Bengalis are  naturally   supporting   it.   But   I 
must  make  it  clear that I do not want this to be a 
special case for West   Bengal  as my good' friend,   
Mr.   Pranab Kumar Mukherjee, put it. I want to 
have it as a scheme  for   every State : our  spirit  
is  that,   not Bengal for Bengalis, or Bihar for 
Biharis, or  U.   P.   for  U.   P.  people. We must 
take the stand that the  States  are for themselves  
and  for  the  country.   And   if   all the  links of 
the  chain  are  properly oiled and geared  to  the  
needed   strength, then it will be merely the 
strength of the   particular   unit ;   it will be the 
strength of the  overall   composition of the  whole  
nation.   Sir,  therefore  I  put   it for the 
consideration of my friend, the Minister. You   
make   it   the  primary concern  of every State  to 
go  on  with  its own planning.   Don't treat  it  as  
a minor child to be looked after by a   senile   
guardian.    Let   all the  States  have their  own  
plans.  The  Centre will  work only as a 
coordinating factor for adjustment if there is  any  
conflict  causing  anxiety,   or   anything like that 
of crossing   the "Ts' or dotting the'Is. Otherwise, 
every State will be  an  autonomous planning   
body,   and we  shall  plan according to our  
resources  and  meet  the  needs  of unemployment   
and   productivity.   If    we    shall have  some  
surplus,  we shall contribute to the Centre   and   
sometimes,   if   we   shall   have a deficit,   the   
Centre   will  have to contribute to us.   It is in this 
spirit that we have   to  go   on. Now,  we  find  
that there  are   certain   things which   look  very   
odd.    When   cotton   prices are    going  down,   
it    is the headache  of the Centre.   If wheat   
prices   are  going  down, it is   the   headache  of 
the   Centre.   But it   jute and     tea    prices    are      
going      down     this nobod 's    beadacbeme.     
In    Bergal   all    the jute  factories are still 
allowed to remain in the private sector.   Why ?   
Because,   as my  friend, Mr.  Raha,  has said, the 
monopolists are there. At  the   same  time,  my  
friend,   in a follow-up sentence said that he docs 
not agree with  those who  say  that   Shrimati   
Indira   Gandhi  is   a monopolist.   I  say  (he  
Central Government of India is the greatest 
monopolist in this   country and therefore these 
things are happening. 

SHRI SANAT KUMAR RAHA : Monopoly 
of ruling ? 

SHRI SASANKASEKHAR SANYAL : 
Monopoly of ruling and grabbing and exploit-
ing. 

The question therefore is this. My friend said  
it is  the  Bengal  of Khudiram,  it is the 
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Bengal of Yivekananda, it is the Bengal of 
Nctaji Subhas Chandra Bose, it is the Bengal of 
C. R. Das. It is there, but now it is the Bengal of 
Shri Amjad All and Mr. Raha and 
Sasankasekhar Sanyai, poor people, indigent 
people, and yet, this Bengal must give the lead 
to the rest of the country by demanding it, and 
expect other States ot follow the demand. The 
D. M. K. is coming up a little, and other States 
must come up, even with folded hands,—doesn't 
matter—and say : "We beseech the Centre. 
Please leave us to ourselves. Let us put our 
whole house in order with our own resources. 
Don't interfere. We shall be able to manage 
ourselves.' I put it to my friends. Mr. Amjad AH 
and Mr. Pranab Kumar Mukherjee : Are you 
pleading ? We have pleaded for West Bengal in 
the last, twenty-live years. I hate pleading. Xow, 
arc you praying, as Mr. Pranab Kumar 
Mukherjee says ? I detest that word. He just 
slipped a word and then retracted it. I say we are 
demanding and commanding that things must 
have a changed outlook. With autonomy, as I 
have said, there will be readjustment. Suppose 
this pleading fails, suppose this demand fails, 
what are you going to do ? The breach between 
the Congress and this side of the House is 
eliminated. We have to follow it up with action. 
Therefore, mobilise public opinion, mobilise the 
feelings of the people, mobilise the sense of 
justice of the people. And shall I be wrong—I 
hope it will not hurt my friends over then—and 
why the election rigging was done ? The 
election rigging was done because as a 
spokesman of tie- rest of India West Bengal was 
raising its voice and said that every State must 
have its own planning body, and every State 
must be left to itself. Therefore, the r igging 
was not merely for West Bengal. This rigging 
was a slap in the face of the rising tempo of the 
imagination of the people of the rest of the 
country. We, the constituents of the United 
Front, gave a •clear call to the people. 1 hope 
my friend will also give a clear call to the 
people. Now, let u* not go on pleading and 
protesting, persuading and praying with folded 
hands. Let us follow lh;s up with action. We 
shall follow you. We must go on with muscles 
in our body, not with rickety hands, with folded 
palms. I say 1 am at the disposal of Mr. Amjad 
Ali. You go to your Government. Your 
Government is there. You ask the West Bengal 
Government to adopt a governmental resolution, 
a special resolution saying that we want to  have 
our own planning.   Let that resolution 

come here. If we were in the Government there 
today, we would have done it. We did not do it, 
but if we were in the Government today We 
would have done it. I do not conceal the fact that 
we were guilty of omissions and commissions. 
Because we were not in a comfortable position 
and we could not run the Government on our 
own on previous occasions there were the 
pinpricks of the Centre and we had to be the 
handmaids of the Centre, but once we were able 
to go on our own, things took a different turn. 
Anyway, those slogans were there. We' do not 
mind that we have been ousted from power, but 
you remain in power. You can cry to your 
Government. You can cry to your people. We, 
from this side of the House, will persuade those 
persons who are with us, to follow you. You go 
on with the bantu i of limited independence for 
the State and we shall follow that banner behind 
you. Are you prepared to do that ? That is the 
whole point. Mere saucy words, sweet jelly-
brand pharases, sonorous and pathetic-i L i i n  
bumptious appeals will not do. At least they 
must give place to demands. Demands will have 
to be followed up by commands. Commands will 
have to he followed up by sanctions. That 
sanction, if asked for by my friend and his party, 
we are prepared to giver and we are prepared to 
take the command and give obedience to you. 
With these words 1 support this Resolution, the 
spirit of it and not the letter. I do not want to 
have a special case for West Bengal. We want to 
have a respectable case of Bengal. Bengal is in 
the vanguard leading the people throughout (lie 
country, so that we can be free, we can be 
independent. We cannot be over-dependent on 
the Centre. We shall resist the Centre in their 
carnal device for squeezing out the blood. If all 
the constituent units of the country are 
themselves strong, it will be unity par excel-
lence. It will be a stronger u n i t y  and a real 
unity. 

With these words 1 support the Resolution. 
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[THE VICE-CHAIRMAN  (SHRI ^ . B. RAJU) in 
the Chair] 

About political murders in West Bengal. Mr. 
Subrata Mukherjee, Minister of State for Home 
told tbe State Assembly during the Question 
Hour on April 29, 1972 that there were 1751 
political murders in West Bengal between 19C9 
and February, 1972. The number oj" murders in 
1969, 1970 and 1971 was 108, 436 and 1169 
respectively. There were 38 murders in 
January/February, 1972, he added. About the 
labour situation in West Bengal in 1971-72, the 
number of industrial disputes was 10622 
including 3658 cases brought forward from last 
year, Strikes and lock-outs were 219, workers 
involved were 1,48,097 and man-days lost were 
49,30,412.      (Hindustan     Times     of    27-4-
72) 
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SHRI G. A. APPAN (Tamil Nadu) : Mr. Vic-
Chairman, Sir, I should congratulate my friend, 
Sardar Amjad Ali, for moving this Resolution. I 
am sure that there will be no single opposing 
voice against this Resolu'on. It should be carried 
unanimously. I entirely agree with my friend, 
Mr. Sanyal. You know, even to build your own 
house, you should get the   permission   of    
somebody    else.   What   a 

funny thing it is. This move Should have rightly 
come from tlie Slate there. Why should you 
come here even for the setting up of a planning 
body in the State ? Why should you go on 
seeking the permission of the Planning Minister 
to do anything ? Can yon not try to tell the 
people, "We want to do this, we have our own 
independent spirit" ? Even for this, you want to 
go about begging.'I am really surprised. I think 
they should have the moral support of my 
revered friend, Mr. Siddhartha Shankar Ray 
who is reigning in that State now. I think it 
should normally have the blessing of the ruling 
party here also. If that is so, then it is a very 
good augury for the whole country. Every State 
should have a planning body. I do not think any 
good Slate, honest State, honourable State, 
should go even for 'Ins favour to the Centre. Is it 
not a pity, is it not pathelie to see that only one 
Minister of State is here and not any Minister of 
the Cabinet rank ? Out of 17 Cabinet Ministers 
and about 17 Ministers of S'ate, we see only 
three Deputy Ministers here. Is it not a 
disrespect to ihe House when a very important 
resolution an planning is being discussed on the 
floor of the House ? 

SHRI NAND KISHORE BHATT (Madhya 
Pradesh) : On a point of information. He is a 
Minister of State, not a Deputy Minister. 

SHRI G. A. APPAN : Excuse me then ; I 
apologise for it. But in that case, there should 
be at least half of the Cabinet Ministers and hall 
of the tviims'ers oi State. iVhat is the work of 
this Minister for Planning to-day is a thing that 
th : House will have to examine and find out. 
That is wny everywhere there is now a clamour 
for Stale autonomy. You know, even when we 
want to make a small shirt,  we do planning. 
Even when we want to make a small house, we 
go in for design and planning. In everythji g, 
design and planning are very, very importam. 
Perhaps costing has not come. Costing has also 
to be included. Mr. Vice-Chairman, that is why 
from the very beginning, in the only State 
which is being run by the sadarana people or 
the most common people, i. e. Tamil Nadu, 
where the common people are reigning, we 
have been trying to have a similar resolution or 
do it practically for the development of the 
society. Development of family, development 
of society, development of community, 
development oi blocks, taluks and the Slate, 
and then the Centre comes. Planning has to start 
from down below, not from the Centre. 
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[Shri G» A.Appan] 
Now, the disparity gap is yawning, is wide, 

like a dragon's mouth. This growing disparity 
and this balloonist inflation in this country in 
respect of prices will have to be checked. That 
is what the DMK Government of Tamil Nadu is 
advocating. Wc have started a Planning 
Commission in Tamil Nadu. Did we go about 
seeking any permission ? Why should you wan1 
it ? I th ing  the whole House will certainly 
adopt this Resolution unanimously with the 
support of the Government, rather than the 
Government askink the mover to withdraw   it.   
Let   us   show    our   mettle,   our 

honesty of purpose. What are the 4 
P. M.        immediate needs of a society ? Food, 

shelter, clothing, education, justice, 
employment, judicial and social protection. 
How far have we been able to meet all these 
ti lings ? We should have planning not only at 
the Slate level but even at the block level. That 
is what our Tamil Nadu DMK Government is 
now doing . . . 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU) : Mr. Appan, this is about West Bengal. 

SHRI G. A. APPAN : West Bengal is one of 
the greatest States of India which begot the 
greatest people of India like Subhas Chandra 
Bosc, J. C. Bose, die first recepient of the 
international award, such eminent people, 
warriors, statemen and others. Why should ilie 
people of such Slate have so go in for favours 
and things like that ? I entirely support this 
Resolution : 
"In    view  of    die   present  poli ical, social   
and   economic    condition   of  the Slaie  of 
West   Bengal,   this House  is   of opinion   dial   
dr?   Government  of   I n d i a  should take 
immediate  steps  to  constitute a special cell in 
die Planning  Commission for  West Bengal,   
allocate adequate funds for the development 
projects of  thai   State and advise tin; 
Government of West Bengal to set up a State 
Planning Board." Development  has   to  start   
from   down below, not from high up.   The 
disparity, the   yawning gap,   between   income    
and   expenditure   and high and low should be:   
narrowed   down.   The rich  has  lo   be  put 
under restraints and constraints and die poor  
has  to  be  helped.   That is  what   the   Tamil   
Nadu Government is presently doing.   There is 
a saying in Tamil which means the State should   
help   die  Centre  grow strong.   That  should   
be    die   altitude.   Some 

ul" the Minister.", here feel they are not able to 
understand the true principles: An honest man 
never distrusts anybody. But a dishonest man 
will always distrust everybody, be he honest or 
not. In the same way unless one is honest, I do 
not think one is honourable. He will not distrust 
and people, will try to begin to twist matters. 
The Prime Minister is there. She has established 
a good name as one of the greatest stalwarts of 
die whole world, not of India. In Bangla Desh 
her estimation has grown greater than that of her 
father, than that oT Mahatma Gandhi, than that 
of even Shastriji. When she is such a great 
person, some of the Ministers, some of Iter 
colleagues, try to misinterpret ti l ings 10 her. 
Do you mean to say that sin di.se not have the 
common sense? Site lias managed die affairs in 
such a way and I do not want my friends there to 
become Sakunis. I think most of you know who 
Sakuni was. They were the people who always 
tried to misguide that great man Duryo-dhana 
and ruined him. We also know that the Tamil 
Nadu Government has been responsible to 
maintain Government of India's stature and 
Government of India's prestige and the prestige 
of the Congress Party. But for the DMK's 
interest and but for the DMKAs support, die 
election of present President. . . 

DR. M. R. WAS (Maharashtra!: On a point   
of order. . . 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN SHRI V. B. 
RAJU) : He is concluding. Please wind up your   
speech. 

SI1RT  G. A. APPANi   Every  Stale  should 
have a Planning Commission. You might have 
heard about our Slum Clearance Board, and 
Drainage Board. Most of the Chief Ministers 
wli.i have visited our Stale have praised our 
work in these fields. I wish every State acts in 
the same way, that is, in the interests of the 
common man and not in the interests of the 
capitalists or monopolists. In Tamil Nadu, we 
have provided dec education up to PUG 
whereas in some other States they have not 
provided free education even up to the fifth 
standard. . . 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN SHRI V. B. 
RAJU) : This is not very relevant. I would i'i 
cutest you to conclude your speech. 

SHRI G. A. APPANi I want to say that all   
Sta tes   should now try to join together and 
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put their demand to start a Planning Cell. This 
would be in their own interest and to the benefit 
of the common man. With these words, I 
conclude my speech. 
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SHRI MOHAN DHAR1A : Mr. Vice-
Chairman, Sir, the R solution moved by the 
hoii. Member, Sardar Amjad Ali, h:is I'ocussed 
attention on the various grievances ami pro-
blems being faced b) West Bengal. The House 
and the whole country is well aware of these 
problems and broadly the sirategic and vital 
importance of West Bengal. So far as the people 
of West Bengal are concerned, several things 
were said here, but I can say to the House and 
to my friends from West Bengal that I love 
Bengal because 1 know that the people are 
emotionally sentimental, politically explosive, 
historically patriotic by blood rebellious but 
cultural, socially lovable and, of course, 
intellectually teasonable. And therefore I have 
all love for these friends of mine and for West 
Bengal. 

Sir, one rJiing shall have to be admitted by 
everybody in the House that if this country is to 
develop, it is not only the economic development 
of the country which is material : along with 
economic development, political and social 
conditions are also equally important. If the 
social and political conditions are un tabic, it will 
not be possible for this country or for any State 
to have social or economic development. And it 
is on this background that we I|M ' to take "lock 
of the situation, I am not here to challenge the 
figures quoted by the hon. Member. On the 
contrary, I am here to say, • yes, he has rightly 
quoted the figures from Government records. But 
why was such a situation reached ? Till 1965, as 
was rightly pointed oul, there was all-round 
growth in the economy of West Bengal. But the 
moment the possession of West Bengal was 
taken by those who hid little faith in democracy 
and also in the Constitution, people who wanted 
to exploit the Constitution so ihat they could get 
the democratic protection in the country for their 
violent 
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[Sre Mohan Dharia] activities, since then the 
whole character of West Bengal changed, the 
economic conditions of West Bengal changed, 
and that is perhaps the important reason for the 
present situation there. I have no doubt in my 
mind that stable conditions are being created by 
the people of West Bengal. The threat was given 
: Why have you come to the House .' You have 
not come here for getting a Planning Board or a 
special cell or development fund, let us mobilise 
the people, let us command our own sanction 
and through such sanctions, wc shall create 
conditions whereby we shall see what is to be 
done and ultimately we shall go towards self-
autonomy. And Sir, the idea is not only of self-
autonomy. But as was expressed by one of the 
Members of thai very "party, they believe that 
India is not one nation, that it is a federation of 
several nations. So, they have their faith again 
in several nationalities in the country and natu-
rally, when such Members again want to create 
the very conditions as before, I have no doubt 
that the people of West B< ngal have 
particularly realised that this cannot be the way. 
In this country, we are determined to see that we 
are here for a democratic rule and it is through 
this democratic process, it is through this par-
liamentary institution that we would like to have 
our socialistic objectives achieved. And it is in 
this direction that wc have to go. 

When I look at this Resolution, I find diat 
there are three demands. One is regarding the 
creation of a special cell in the Planning Com-
mission, the second demand is for the allocation 
of adequate- funds for West Bengal and the 
third is for the creation of a Planning Board at 
the State level. This Hmasc is aware that a 
Planning Board at the State level has already 
l>een constituted by the Government of West 
Bengal. And here again, the approach of the 
Planning Commission and of the Central 
Government is very clear. It is not today that we 
are accepting that ihere should be a separate 
Planning Board, that planning should have the 
district as the unit and that it should start with 
the village. It is their right from 1951 on wards 
(hat we have been pursuing ii. And I may say 
that it was on the 23rd August, 1971 that (h-
Minister of Planning himself personally wrote 
letters to all the Chief Ministers urging upon 
them to have Planning Boards at the State level. 
And not only sub-committees for planning, wc 
wanted Planning Boards as we have here. The 
Planning Commission today includes economic 
experts.  Similarly, at the State 

level also, along with political leader, along 
with some important officers, they should also 
include experts, economises, scientists, and I am 
happy that the Tamil Nadu Government did the 
job earlier; the Kerala Government has also 
done the same way. West Bengal Government 
has also constituted such body. A reference was 
made regarding my assurance in the House that 
it" such a Wanning machinery is created by the 
State Governments whether the Central 
Government would come forward to their help 
or not. As was assured by me in this House, I 
would again assure lion. Members that all pos-
sible co-operation and some monetary help will 
also be given for the proper functioning of the 
Planning Board created by the West Bengal 
Government. 

So far as the demand for more allocation of 
fund is concerned, may I bring to the notice of 
this House that in view of the strategic impor-
tance of West Bengal the Central Government 
has taken all possible care in making allocations 
to the extent possible'? Sir, the Fourth Plan of 
West Bengal is o\' the order of Rs. 322.5 crores 
out of which Rs. 221 crores, nearly two-thirds, 
comes from the Central assistance. 

As for the Plan, for the Calcutta Metropolitan 
Area development we have allocate 1 to the 
tunc oi Rs. 150 crores. Besides we have again 
made Rs. 10 crores available for Ousted im-
provement schemes. Sir. these figures come to 
Rs. 381 crores. I can tell the House that it i-; not 
taking any partial approach towards West 
bengal but because of the explosive conditions, 
we felt that unless and until socio-political sta-
bility is established in that area, perhaps it may 
become explosive for [he whole of the country. 
And, therefore, we have made this amount 
available and these funds are allocated for West 
bengal. 

Besides thai, a crash programme for rural 
employment has been made applicable for all 
districts ouiside Calcutta in West Bengal. In 
other States we have not done that. Rural work 
programmes have been taken up in I'umlia, 
Bankura and Midnapore districts to mitigate 
their difficulties arising from chronic drought 
conditions. Then, Sir, Darjeeling. Hooghly and 
West Dinajpur have been selected for the Small 
Farmers' Development Agencies. Purulia and 
Bankura districts have been selected for the 
Marginal Farmers and    Agricultural     Labour    
agencies.      Tiie 
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Purttlia district has been selected as an indus-
trially backward district to qualify also for the 
central scheme of 10 per cent, subsidy. Under 
these schemes, if a person invests, say, Rs. 10 
lakhs, one lakh of rupees are given by the 
Central Government by way of subsidy so that 
rapid industrialisation should take place. 

Sir, besides, incentive schemes have been 
made available through which there are reliefs 
given in sales tax, ottroi duty, power subsidy 
and all those schemes. Besides, a committee 
was appointed consisting of the Cabinet 
Secretary, Finance Secretary and the Secretly 
of the Planning Ministry. They prepared a 
sixteen point programme. I would not narrate 
the whole scheme to the House or their 
recommendations. But I would like to put only 
a lew points before you. For proper 
industrialisation a rapid survey of every district 
was necessary. Rapid surveys have not only 
been ordered but this House will be happy to 
Know that almost all districts have been 
surveyed by the officers appointed as per the 
recommendations of this Committee. The 
whole of West Bengal except Calcutta. Howrah 
and 24-Pargana districts is now being treated as 
a backward area for concessional finance for 
the industrial development of West Bengal. 

Then there are the West Bengal Industrial 
Development Corporation and the Small-scale 
Industrial Development Corporation. There are 
the two important bodies concerned with 
industrial development of West Bengal, and 
they have been vitalised. And they have also 
been give ail possible help in having their 
activities accelerated. 

Sir, the proposal for a second Hooghly 
Bridge has been accepted since long, but 
unfortunately there was no proper implementa-
tion of that programme. The construction of a 
second Hooghly Bridge can give rise to 
tremendous industrial activity for the small 
industries because several things are required 
for the project. Here also we have taken 
immediate action. The Government has 
accepted all the recommendations of the 
committee and how this second Hooghly 
Bridge could be immediately taken up is being 
referred to the Transport Ministry and they 
have beep asked to take immediate steps in the 
matter. 

Besides, a Raw Materials Bank is being 
organised for making scarce raw materials 
available through  the    small-scale  Industrial 

Development  Board.    And   the  Development 
Commissioner of the Small-scale Industrial 
Development Board has been asked to see that 
at least 2.000 industrial units are established 
every year in West Bengai in order lo have that 
industrial activity in West Bengal. This is how 
steps are taken to see that there is industrial 
development there. I can assure this House that 
the approach rof the Government is certainly 
one of sympathy. 

Apart from this, certain demands were made 
that much larger allocations would be 
necessary. I cannot assure you beyond my 
limits. But I can say that we have taken up the 
preparation of the Fifth Five*Year Plan and the 
main objective of the Fifth Plan will be attack 
on poverty. If that attack on poverty is to be 
made, naturally we shall have to take up several 
schemes both in the Industrial sector and in the 
agricultural sector for more production, and 
more funds shall base to be made available. I 
can assure this House that this will be the 
approach of the Fifth Five-Year Plan, and the 
garibi liatau programme to which we have 
cammilted ourselves, is necessarily included in 
that and all priorities will be given for such 
schemes. The required funds, come what may, 
shall be made available for such priority 
schemes whereby we can meet the challenge of 
unemployment. 

AN-HON. MEMBER :   Even for Orissa and 
Assam? 

SHRI MOHAN DHARIA: It is for the 
whole of the country. 

Coming to the third aspect; i. e. regarding the 
creation of a separate cell in the Planning 
Commission for West Bengal, now it is not the 
idea of the Planning Commission to have 
everything concentrated here. Such charges 
were levelled. On the contrary, we have written 
to the Stale Governments to have their own 
planning bodies and these planning bodies 
should function not only at the State level but. a 
iso ai die district level and the village level. It 
should then be possible to identify the various 
problems in the rural areas on this basis, we can 
have pragmatic plans. Naturally when we arc 
trying to have decentralisation of the whole 
planning machanism, to say that we should start 
something here would perhaps go contrary to 
our present thinking. But on some occasions 
there are certain problems which   require  the  
help of the planning 
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[Shii Mohan Dharia] Con mission from here 
because that much expertise, that much 
technical knowledge. may not be available at 
the State level. Here again may 1 say that in the 
planning Commission we are having our 
divisions and there is a separate Division 
exclusively for State Plans. There are 
programme advisers for States. And naturally 
these programme Advisers take care of the 
special problems of these Slates and it is 
through this macha-nism that we see. if there 
are any special problems to be looked afier. It I 
may quote an instance, there are some problems 
which are rot concerned with only one State, 
like the problem of hill areas. There are hill 
areas in U. P., Himachal Pradesh, in Bihar, in 
Assam, all over the country. And they are 
having some special problems. Now the 
Planning Commission has taken a decision to 
set up a separate cell to consider, to locale, to 
identify, the problems of bill areas. So naturally 
for special problems a special machanism shall 
have to be created.  But to say that you should 
provide a separate cell fur West Bengal is not 
practicable. Then why not a scperate cell for 
every other State? In fact there are cells though 
they are not called as such; we are having a 
Division exclusively for States. It is in 
consultation with the S t a t e  Governments that 
we function. We do not want to create anything 
like a monopoly of ours. We an- ..veil aware of 
our own limitations. It is for the State 
Government, it is for the planning buclies at 
the State level, to function in an effective way 
and it is for us to coordinate their functions.   
That should be the job of the. . . 

SHRI   (J.   R.   PATTL   (Maharasht-a) :   
By 

giving money also. 

SHRI MOHAN DHARIA: Money 1 Un-
forunately printing of notes at Nasik is not in 
the hands of the Planning Commission, 
interruption) I was really concerned to hear (lie 
cr i t ic ism that came from Dr. Bhai Mahavir 
when he said that here in our country planning 
is done only ai the Central level. It is not 
correct. In the ini t ial  stages when there was no 
planning mechanism in the country, when some 
inf ras inic iu ia l  activity was required for the 
whole of tin- country, somebody or some 
mechanism was absolutely essential and it is 
because of the creation of that body, of (he 
Planning Commission then at the Central level, 
that we could create the necessary infrastructure 
for   the   industrial,  agricultural  and 

other development of the country. Hctd we not 
taken care then, it would not have been possible 
for this country to have this infrastructure today. 
So there was a time when this sort of machinery 
was required at the Central level. Now that we 
have created that infrastructure, the States are 
well aware of their jobs and responsibilities. We 
shall be glad and happy and that is why we had 
written to the State Governments to have 
planning bodies and we shall offer all our 
cooperation for the proper, systematic and 
scientific, functioning of these planning 
bodies..., 

SHRI JAGD1SH PRASAD MATHUR : 
(Rajasthan : Planning- should be there at the 
lower levels also, not only at the State level. 

SHRI MOHAN DHARIA: That is what I 
said. 

SHRI JAGDISH PRASAD MATHUR : The 
Resolution is for the State level. Is there any 
proposal for the Planning at base ? That is '.he 
point. 

SHRI MOHAN DHARIA : Please do not 
interrupt me. I just mentioned that we advised 
the Mate Governments so that planning conic up 
r i g h t  from the village level and district level. 
From (here it conies to the State and from the 
State to the national level. We want that multi-
level planning. Besides thai, if you want 
effective .implementation of out-plans at the 
State level, from State to village level, 
decentralisation of power through Zilla 
Parishads and Panchayat Samithis is equally 
important. U is our experience that wherever 
Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samithis properly 
function, it has been possible for us to 
implement our programmes in a better way and 
therefore along with the multi-level planning the 
decentralisation of power at the local level also 
becomes absolutely important. I would now like 
to take cognUanee of the speeds of honourable 
Shri Sanyal. All the while Shri Sanyal was 
t ry ing  to provoke the honourable Mover of die 
Resolution iu an absolutely different language. 
If it is in the mind of anybody that this present 
un i i . uy -cum-federal structure of this country 
could be broken with some threats or witli some 
sanctions, I would like to make it very clear that 
the people of India have rejected that idea long 
back. Even in the e!e< tjons in West Bengal 
they have rejected   that   idea   and   they 
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will not tolerate it here in the country. Here in  
our  country  we are having a unitary-cum- 

federal system. It is like a flower 5 
P.M.        having several petals; but  combined 

together somewhere ; it is like a 
rainbow having so many colours, but united 
somewhere. It is perhaps the best of all possible 
systems ihat we have accepted. If there is any 
move or desire to disturb this unity of the 
country by making demand for different 
nationalities or lor separate autonomus units, 
the people of India will not tolerate that and the 
Government also will not tolerate such sort of 
thinking . . . 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU) : Will the Minister continue at the next 
sitting ? 

SHRI MOHAN DHARIA : I will take just 
five miuutes more. 

THE    VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI   V.   B. 
RAJU) : I hope the House has no objection to 
sit for five minutes more. 

SHRI JAGDISH PRASAD MATHUR : 
What will happen to my Resolution ? Am I 
entitled to move my Resolution ? 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU) : After the Minister concludes his 
speech, the mover has to reply to the debate. 
Therefore, it will take time. You can do it the 
next day. After the Minister's speech, the House 
will be adjourned. 

DR. BHAI ;MAHAY1R : Are you proposing 
that the House should sit for five minutes more 
just to hear Shri Dharia or to hear the reply to 
the mover also ? 

THE    VICE-CHAIRMAN   (SHRI   V.   B. 
RAJU) : The Minister said that he would not 
lake more than five minutes. 

SHRI  PRANAB KUMAR MUKHERJEE : 
In that case, let the Minister conclude his 
speech in five minutes and let the mover reply 
the next day. 

DR. BHAI MAHAVIR : Does the Minister 
agree that much of the difficulties are because 
of our failure at the level of implementation and 
because of red-tape and too ,^..^K nf rlillv-
Hallvinsr  ? 

SHRI MOHAN MARIA : Unfortunately, 
Dr. Mahavir was not persent when I was . . . 

DR. BHAI MAHAVIR : I was persent. I 
heard you from the gallery. I might have 
missed to hear you somewhere. 

SHRI MOHAN DHARIA : In the midterm 
appraisal report we have very candidly admitted 
the shortfalls. There are shortfalls to some 
extent. But I do not agree with this charge that 
there is all-told failure. It is not correct. It is true 
that at the time of implementation special care 
has to be taken. In the mid-term appraisal report 
we have also said that steps have been taken to 
see that we implement the Plan properly. If (lie 
plans are to be implemented properly, it will not 
be possible at this level. We shall have to create 
mechanisms at all levels from the very village 
level up to the central level at Delhi. Besides, 
people's participation in planning becomes 
absolutely essential. Without active partici-
pation of the people, it will not be possible lor 
us to implement any plan. But that is not i he 
topic of the day. We are considering a 
Resolution. The whole of the speech of Dr. 
Mahavir, though intelligent, was equally-
irrelevant because we are today considering a 
Resolution. Instead of talking on the Resolu-
tion, Dr. Mahavir has spoken on the Plan and 
taken much of the lime of the House. He said 
whatever he had to say regauling planning 
machanism . . . 

DR. BHAI MAHAVIR : I did not say any-
thing except in relation to Plan. Of course I did 
not confine myself to West Bengal. If there is 
failure of Plan in Bengal, it is failure 
throughout the country. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU) :   You understand each other. 

SHRI MOHAN DHARIA : I was aware of 
the intelligence of Dr. Mahavir, not of his 
irrelevance. Today, I have gained additional 
knowledge. 

DR. BHAI MAHAVIR : I do "not think that 
would be your reply. You are escaping the 
points, 

SHRI MOHAN DHARIA : Sir, some other 
honourable Members have made some sugges-
tions regarding the development   of backward 
areas.     On    rvtars 



147 Message from [RAJYASABHA] the Lok Sabha 148 

[Shri Mohan Dharia] this House about 
regional imbalances and I do concede that the 
regional imbalances in the country are a 
serious danger to our economy and also to 
our democracy. I also feel sad when I look at 
the violent movements in West Bengal. Even 
ihough I feel that there should not be any 
violent movement in the country and that 
such movements should be condemned, I 
cannot forget the feelings of the youngsters. 
Sir, if 'heir aspirations are not taken care of 
by the Planning Commission, by the country 
by the economy by the social forces, 
naturally they will not go according to the 
peaceful ways of life that all of us would like 
to have and there are bound to be eruptions 
and explosions and all possible care shall 
have to be taken. 

Then, Sir, about allocating funds, it is the 
National Development Council and the 
Finance Commission who do the job. These 
are the two bodies which do the job. 
Regarding the allocations made by the 
Finance Commission, there were some 
discussions here. Regarding the allocations 
made by the National Development Council it 
is not only on the basis of population that it is 
given. 60% of the Central funds are given on 
the basis of population, 10% on the basis of 
backwardness of the State, 10% on the basis 
of tax efforts, 10% is reserved for spillover 
schemes and 10% is reserved for some special 
occasions like national calamines such as 
floods, drught, etc. This is how the Central 
funds are allocated. Again, here we have to 
remember thai we are a great country, we are 
one country and there are various States and 
Union Territories and The Central 
Government has to take care of everyone and 
of all the Stales. We cannot have bias towards 
this State or against that Stale we cannot have 
malice towards this or that State. So, Sir, we 
have taken special care of West Bengal for 
the reasons that I have already slated and 
against this background, Sir, though 1 am 
here to appreciate the spirit of the Resolution 
and also the intentions of the mover of the 
Resolution,  I   feel,   in   view  of what  I 

have explained, there is no need for any special 
cell in the Planning Commission. If there are 
any special problems, we shall certainly take 
care of them. The Planning Body that was 
demanded at the time when the notice of the 
Resolution was given has also come into 
existence. Regarding funds, Sir, I think I have 
tried my level best (o satisfy this House. 
Therefore, Sir, against this background. I think 
the mover of the Resolution has served the 
purpose of moving the Resolution and \ would 
like to request him to kindly withdraw this 
Resolution and I thank him and I thank the 
House for hearing me.   Thank you, Sir. 

MESSAGE FROM THE LOK SABHA 

THE APPROPRIATION (NO. 3) BILL, 1972 

JOINT SECRETARY : Sir, I have to report 
to the House the following message received 
from the Lok Sabha signed by the Secretary of 
the Lok Sabha : 

"In accordance with the provisions of Rule 
96 of the Rules of Procedure and Conduct of 
Business in the Lok Sabha, I am directed to 
enclose herewith the Appropriation (No. 3) Bill, 
1972, as passed by Lok Sabha at its sitting held 
on the 12th May, 1972. 

2. The Speaker has certified that this Bill is 
a Money Bill within the meaning of article 110 
of the Constitution of India". 

Sir, I lay the Bill on the Table. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI V. B. 
RAJU) : The House stands adjourned til) 11-00 
A. M. on Monday, the 15th May, 1972. 

The House then adjourned at 
eight minutes past five of the clock 
till eleven of the clock on Monday, 
the 15th May, 1972. 

 


