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SHRr BHUPESH GUPTA : He spoke of an 

international force. Why is the Government of 
India not doing a simple thing ? Will it please 
explain ? Many people in the ruling Labour 
Party in England, Members of Parliament, have 
demanded properly through their organisation, 
that the U.K. Government should take military 
action. The U.K. Government is under an 
obligation to take military action against the so-
called Southern Rhodesian regime. Why is the 
Government not making this demand, since it 
continues in the Commonwealth ? Wha-t 
comes in the way of the Government of India 
telling publicly and also through diplomatic 
notes that the United Kingdom Government 
should take military action in Southern 
Rhodesia ? The U.K. Government itself has 
definitely called it treason and said that the 
regime is illegal and there is every justification 
in international law for such action. May I 
know why the Government is not making this 
plain and simple demand  ? 

SHRI DINESH SrNGH : We have already 
done so. 

SHRI KRISHAN KANT : When they are 
asking the British Government for even armed 
intervention in Rhodesia, will the Government 
of India consider helping those nationalist 
movements in the" African continent which 
have joined together and have come to the 
conclusion that there is no way out except an 
organised armed struggle ? Will the 
Government of India help them by supplying 
arms, so that the armed struggle gets the full 
support   of the   Government  of India   ? 

SHRI DINESH SINGH : We are no* asking 
the United Kingdom Government to launch 
any aggression, as the hon. Member has said. 
We have said that it was the obligation of the 
United Kingdom Government, as the 
administering power to have used force and 
they should vise force to b-ing about a change 
in the status that is, the existing position. So 
far as any armed struggle in the other colonies 
of Africa is concerned, we have given 
whatever support we could in international 
forums and elsewhere to these liberation 
movements. We have also given them some 
assistance directly, but we have not given   
them   any   arms   assistance. 

MR.   CHAIRMAN   :   Mr.  Rajnarain. 

SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA : We have a.   
marshal   right   here,   Mr.   Rajnarain. 

 
IMPORT AND EXPORT OP COTTON 

•388. SHRI R. P. KHAITAN : t SHRI 
KRISHAN KANT : 

Will the Minister of FOREIGN TRADE be   
pleased   to   state   : 

fThe question was actually asked on the 
floor of the House by Shri R. P. Khaitan. 
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(a) the quant ty of each variety of cotton 
and the value thereof exported yearly during 
the last  five years; 

(b) whether these varieties of cotton were 
suitable for censumption by the textile mills in 
India and if so, the reasons for their export ; 

(c) the deU Is of imports of cotton during   
the   aiove period ; and 

(d) the adv: ntages gained by exports vis-a-
vis import:   ? 

THE DEPU TY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FOREIGN TRADE 
(CHOWDHAI.Y RAM SEWAK) : (a) to (d) 
Statements showing exports and imports •£ 
cotton during the last five financial years are 
attached. [Set below) Impor of cotton is 
allowed to fill the gap between the availability 
of and requiremei ts for cotton in the country. 
The imported cotton is mostly long staple. As 
regards the three varieties of cotton allc wed 
for exports, only one of them is spi mable for 
the manufacture of yarn of cx> irse counts. 
This variety is   allowed   to   be   exported   
because   its 

entire production is not consumed by the 
indigenous industry and there is surplus 
available for export. Exportable varieties are 
such that they cannot be a substitute for 
imported cotton. 

STATEMENT I 

IMPORTS   OF   COTTON 

Quantity in lakh bales 
Value in Crores Rs. 

(All figures financial year-wise) 
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SHRI KRISHAN KANT : From the figures 

i I is seen that every year the import is 
increasing. From Rs. 58*08 crores in 1964-65, 
it has gone up to Rs. go-18 crores in 1968-69. 
On the other hand exports are not increasing 
so much. In view of this, may I know whether 
the Government have any phased programme 
by which they will give impetus to research on 
cotton or agricultural production, so that the 
whole import can be stopped in a particular 
period ? Have you  any  plan  like  that   ? 

SHRI B. R. BHAGAT : There is a plan, but 
unfortunately particularly in cotton we have 
not achieved a breakthrough as we have 
achieved in food crops. The main reason for a 
lack of increase in the production of raw cotton 
is tha< most of this area is dry area, rain-fed 
area and the other technique of research has 
not been able to make headway. We are trying 
to make it an irrigated area and also improve 
the quality of the seed. We are adopting pest 
control measures on a large scale and we 
expect that we will be able to achieve self-
sufficiency in the near future. 

SHRI KRISHAN KANT : By what time ? 

SHRI B. R. BHAGAT : If we produce tSo 
lakh bales a year, we will be able to meet our 
requirements, but then by that time our 
requirements may go up. So, I cannot say, but 
we should be able to achieve   it   as   early   
as   possible. 

SHRI A. G. KULKARNI : As they have 
rightly stated here, the imports have reached 
the Rs. 100 crores mark regarding foreign 
cotton. In this connection particularly it is the 
duty of the Government as it has failed in the 
matter of development of cotton. It is not only 
in long staple cotton but even in indigenous 
cotton our production is very short. I want to 
know from the Government whether the 
Consultative Committee of Parliament had 
categorically recommended that development 
of cotton should be taken over from the 
Agriculture Ministry to the Foreign Trade 
Ministry because it is the Foreign Trade 
Ministry's responsibility to supply cotton to the 
textile mills ; whether Government will say 
what 

action they will take on this. Secondly, I want 
to know whether, as has been stated in the 
Press, today we have seen a statement, the raw 
materiab import—that has to be canalised and 
also of foreign cotton— whether the 
Government has decided that the raw materials 
import will be canalised and also that of 
foreign cotton, whether through a separate 
Corporation or whatever it is. What is the 
specific reply to these questions ? 

SHRI B. R. BHAGAT : It is true that in the 
Development of cotton fibre we have not 
achieved self-sufficiency, and I have written to 
the Food and Agriculture Ministry to put the 
whole of this scheme on a very urgent basis. 
Whatever financial requirements, whatever 
technical requirements are necessary, we must 
provide them, and it is our effort to see that we 
try to improve the raw cotton production 
because it is a 'must' ; that is the main problem 
of the textile industry. As for the second 
question whether import of cotton will be 
canalised and also of other raw materials, so 
far as the import of cotton is concerned, I have 
already made an announcement in this House 
that we will canalise the cotton import from the 
next season, that is, from November. The hon. 
Member knows that we are making all 
administrative arrangements and technical 
preparations should be there before the next 
season. As for other raw materials, we have 
taken a number of raw materials already under 
public agency and we arc examining that 
progressively we should take over all industrial 
raw materials administratively feasible under 
public agency. 

SHRI P. C. MITRA : I am glad that the hon. 
Minister has agreed to the suggestion that they 
will canalise the import trade in cotton- May I 
know whether there is any proposal under 
consideration to nationalise the export trade 
also so that this export trade in cotton could be 
made through the State Trading Corporation 
only, whether there is any such proposal  ? 

SHRI B. R. BHAGAT : In the export trade 
also we are progressively increasing the role of 
State agencies on many items which are 
amenable to canalisation. Export is more 
difficult because it deals in a highly 
competitive market. Wherever possible like 
the export of iron ore or other minerals they 
are fully canalised. Similarly manufactured 
items like railway wagons and other items,  
item  by  item, -product  by 
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product, where we make necessary admi-
nistrative prepai ations we take the action for 
canalisation. We only want to ensure that it 
would not result in dislocation and loss  to the   
coui try. 

SHRI K. S. CIHAVDA : May I know the 
leng'h of tHe long staple cotton imported ? 
May I know whether that kind of cotton is pri 
duced in this country or not  ? 

SHRI B.jR. UHAGAT : The length of the 
cotton particularly from the U.A.R. and 
Sudan—th'.y are called long staple cotton ; 
they ire not produced in our country ; if th -y 
are produced, they are very very sma 1 in 
quantity. It is one of our efforts o develop the 
production of that. Import under PL480 is of a 
mixed variety. 

SHRI K. S CHAVDA : Sir, he has not 
replied about the length. What is the length of 
the staple cotton imported ? 

SHRI A. G. KULKARNI : 1-3/16. . . 

SHRI B. }.. BHAGAT : The hon. Member  
has   *iven  it.    1-3/16". 

SHRI PHC'OL SINGH : The hon. Minister 
has l x\d that they are trying to achieve self-su 
Bciency in the near future. But the figur( s 
supplied show that there is a continuoi ; 
increase in import. What steps the Go\ :rnment 
propose to take to reverse this ti 2nd  ? 

SHRI B. R. BHA.GAT : Our textile industry 
is {rowing ; our population is growing : our 
demand is growing. We are expo? ting more 
and more. That is the reason or the increase in 
the cotton imports. 
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PROCESSING OP RAW MATERIALS BY M/S. 

TARNA WATCH CO., MANDI (H.P.) 

*38g. SHRI A. D. MANI : Will the 
Minister of FOREIGN TRADE be pleased to 
state : 

(a) whether M/s. Tarna Watch Co. (in 
collaboration with Favre Leuba Co. of 
Bombay) of Tarna Hill, Mandi (Himachal 
Pradesh) applied for permission to process 
raw materials outside the factory in the year 
1962 ; 

(b) whether the said company has 
produced sufficient proof for the soundness of  
their   financial   position    : 

(c) if the answers to parts (a) and (b) above 
be in affirmative, whether Government have 
given permission for processing the raw 
materials outside the factory ; and 

(d) if  not,   the   reasons   therefor    ? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FOREIGN TRADE 
(CHOWDHARY RAM SEWAK) : (a) M/s. 
Tarna Watch Co., Mandi (H.P.) applied to the 
Joint Chief Controller of Imports and Exports, 
CLA, New Delhi an the 5th February, 1968 
for permission to process the raw material and 
parts for manufacture of clocks and time 
pieces yutside the factory. 

(b) No, Sir. 

(c) The permission has not been granted. 
(d) Docs not arise. 

SHRI A. D. MANI : May I ask the 
fillister—if the permission has not been 
ranted, how was the person allotted Iser's 
Licence? I will give you the. number 

—A662793 etc- The substance of this question 
is that this is the first time that a watch factory 
is being thought to be put up in the Himachal 
Pradesh. The present import licence for raw 
materials has been assigned by the Controller 
of Imports to some other party without any 
notice to the original importer. I would like 
him   to   answer   this   question. 

SHRI B. R. BHAGAT : That was done 
earlier on the recommendation of the Director 
of Industries. Earlier this import licence was 
granted. But when it was found that they did 
not have the means to use this licence, it was 
transferred and given to a regular 
manufacturer. Therefore, no permission has 
been given to this. 

SHRI A. D. MANI : A question has been 
raised in the other House and the result of this 
has been that this person has been served with 
a show-cause notice by the Government as to 
why he should not be debarred from receiving 
licences. The question is, before the 
Government granted the licence, did they try 
to go into the facts whether there was a colla-
boration arrangement with Favre Leuba by the 
person who is going to set up the factory ? He 
might have all sorts of relations with the 
collaborator. The allegation is being made—I 
am not going to mention the details—that 
there is some thing shady in regard to 
allocation of the raw materials to be imported, 
to some other party, thus denying this person 
who wanted to start this factory in Himachal 
Pradesh the benefit of using the raw material. 

SHRI B. R. BHAGAT : This factory has 
collaboration with Favre Leuba. This was 
known and this matter was gone into. Various 
investigations were undertaken. 15ut the point 
is, according to the procedure, import licence 
to a concern like this is given on the 
recommendation of the Director of Industries 
of the State in which that firm is situated. All 
these conditions were fulfilled. Therefore, 
originally a licence was given. But as soon as it 
was found out subsequently that the firm did 
not have the means to undertake production, 
care was taken that whatever import had taken 
place went to a person who was duly 
authorised. 

SHRI ARJUN ARORA : May I know what 
was the raw material which dlis firm which 
admittedly had no means to process it was 
allowed to import, what was the value of it and 
whether it imported the material only once or 
repeated permissions were given ? 


