
2555       IVrttten  Answers [ 9 MAR. 1966 ] to  Questions      2556 

of Medical Research has been investigating 
into the etiology of Coronary heart disease 
and hypertension. Epidemiological survey is 
being conducted by Indian Council of 
Medical Research at Bombay and New 
Delhi. Researches in Coronary heart disease 
are engaging the attention of medical 
scientists all over the world.] 

WATER SUPPLY SCHEMES IN MADHYA 
PRADESH 

330. THAKUR BHANU PRATAP SINGH: 
Will the Minister of HEALTH AND FAMII V 
PLANNING be pleased to state: 

(a) the names and number of urban and 
rural water supply schemes received from 
the Government of Madhya Pradesh during 
the year 1965-66; and 

(b) the schemes approved by the Govern-
ment of India and the estimated cost thereof 
? 

THE MINISTER OF HEALTH AND 
FAMILY PLANNING (DR. SUSHILA 
NAYAR): (a) and (b) 1 Urban and ISI Rural 
Water Supply Schemes have been received 
from the Government of Madhya Pradesh so 
far. In addition the State Government have 
sent outline proposals with rough cost figures 
in respect of 11 urban water supply and 
sewerage schemes for preliminary advice on 
their feasibility. The names of the schemes 
received and approved, returned or under 
scrutiny with their estimated cost are given 
in the annexure. [See Appendix LV, 
Annexure No. 36.] 

WATER   SUPPLY SCHEME   IN GUJARAT 

331. SHRI M. C. SHAH: Will the Minis 
ter of HEALTH AND FAMILY PLANNING be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the names and number of urban and 
rural water supply schemes received by 
Government from the Government of 
Gujarat during the year 1965-66; and 

(b) the schemes approved by the Govern-
ment of India and the financial estimate for 
each of the schemes ? 

THE   MINISTER   OF    HEALTH   AND 
AMILY   PLANNING     (DR.    SUSHILA 

NAYAR): (a) and (b) The required infor-
mation is given in the following statement:— 
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