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THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN :  Do   not 
emphasise on mentioning the names. 

 

(3) A CASE OF  ALLEGED  VIOLATION  OF GOLD 
CONTROL ORDER 

 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: You refer to 
the substance of the calling attention notice .   
.   . 

 

put in a calling attention notice, I would 
request you to give the substance of the thing 
rather than the names. The names need not 
come at this stage. 

SHRI SYED AHMED (Madhya Pradesh) : 
We have not seen the calling attention notice 
that he hSs given to the Government.   He is 
reading. 
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THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN : You are not 
on the Calling Attention Notice; it is only just 
explaining. The Chair has permitted you to 
mention about it. You cannot go into the 
details of the judgment. You have only to 
mention the substance of your Calling 
Attention Notice. I do wish that Members 
would know that you are given permission by 
the Chair to mention about the Calling 
Attention Notice even thought it is not on the 
Order Paper. Therefore, Members also should 
be have with a sense of responsibility and just 
mention the substance in a very brief manner 

AN HON. MEMBER  : 1    would    say, 
misplaced generosity. 

Tufe   DEPUTY   CHAIRMAN :    Pleaste 
carry on, Mr. Rajnarain. 

(Shri Rajnarain started reading.) 

SHRI SYED AHMED : He   is   reading 
from the judgment. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: If you are 
reading from the judgment, that will not be 
there in the proceedings because the Chair has 
given the directive that you must not read 
anything but you have only to give the 
substance. If you still insist on reading from 
the judgment, it will not go into ihe records. 

 

SUM RAJNARAIN.  It will be finished 
within Half a minute. 
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THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN:   But you 
must not read from the judgment. 

(Shri Rajnarain started reading.) 

Order,  order. That will  do.  You must not 
read. I was appealing to you. 

 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN : I want to tell 
this august House that he has only drawn 
attention to his Calling Attention Notice and 
therefore I do not propose to allow any other 
Member to ask any clarification now from the 
Government. I do hope that this august House 
will agree with the Chair that the official 
business must go on. 

HON. MEMBERS   .   Yes, yes. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN; If the official 
business is to go on, every Member must have 
a sense of duty and responsibility both. 

SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA (West Bengal) : 
Why say 'official business' ? ^ay 'business'. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN : Now we go 
on to introduction of Bill—The Industrial 
Disputes  (Amendment)  Bill,   1966. 

SHRI NIREN GHOSH (West Bengal) : 
Madam, I took permission from the Chair to 
say .  .  . 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN : How can I go 
on. Have I to say the same thing every time ?   
I was appealing to you. 

SHRI NIREN GHOSH : . . . that the 
information that was given was wrong and 
that the House was misguided. 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN : I want tc pass 
on to the next item. If yon have any 
information you must pass it on to the 
Government. I want to go on with the regular 
business because we have very few days and 
we have a number of items on the Order 
Paper. We must go on. Yes, the Industrial 
Disputes (Amendment) Bill, 1966 to be 
introduced by Shri Jagjivan Ram. 

THE INDUSTRIAL
 DISPUTES (AMENDMENT)  

BILL, 1966 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER m THE 
MINISTRY OF LABOUR, EMPLOYMENT 
AND REHABILITATION (SUM D. R. 
CHAVAN) ; Madam Deputy Chairman, I move 
for leave to introduce a Bill further to amend 
the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947. 

The question was put und the motion was 
adopted. 

SHRI D. R. CHAVAN : Madam, I introduce 
the Bill. 

THE     REPRESENTATION     OF     THE 

PEOPLE   (AMENDMENT)    BILL,    1966 

THE MINISTER o* LAW (SHRI G. S. 
PATHAK)   :   Madam,  I move  : 

"That this House concurs in the re-
commendation of the Lok Sabha that the 
Rajya Sabha do join in the Joint Committee 
of the Houses on the Bill further to amend 
the Representation of 


