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member of the International Monetary Fund 
and we did not certainly let them know. But 
having said this, I would say that I do not 
think it is right to say that the welcome to any 
of our Ministers was anything but warm in the 
USSR. That would be doing injustice to the 
USSR and putting something on it, which is 
not justified. 

SHRI A. P. CHATTERJEE (West Bengal) : 
I would ask the Finance Minister— now he 
has given a list of the countries of Western 
Europe that he has visited. But in his itinerary, 
as given out to this House, we are not finding 
that he visited or tried to \isit or attempted to 
visit any of the East European countries. Does 
this show that there has been a shift in the 
policy of non-alignment of the Congress 
Government that is to say, is the Congress 
Government shifting from its policy of non-
alignment to the policy of alignment with the 
Western bloc financially and, consequently, 
also politically ? 

In this very context I would ask the hon'ble 
Finance Minister to enlighten the House on the 
point that when he visited Western Germany, 
did he also have in his mind that by his visit to 
that country he may be hurting the sentiments 
and feelings of the East German Republic ? It 
is true that we have not given diplomatic 
recognition to East Germany in that fashion; 
still we have got our trade relations with East 
Germany, and there have been some talks in 
this House and in the Lok Sabha also whether 
we are going to grant recognition or we are 
going to have diplomatic exchanges with the 
East German Republic. Now with that in view 
did his visit to the Federal Republic of West 
Germany augur good for our policies as far as 
that country, namely, East Germany, is 
concerned, augur good for our relations with 
that country ? That is the second question 
which I would ask the hon'ble Finance 
Minister to enlighten us on. 

The next thing which I would ask the 
hon'ble Finance Minister to enlighten this 
House on is whether the loans and the 
agreements for loans which he has executed 
with the different countries of Western 
Europe, have these loans got any strings, 
hidden or concealed, implied or expressed ? 
Now, it may be made clear to us, at least to 
this House, whether there are any con- 

ditions or preconditions attached to those 
loans. Of course, he has said that those 
loans, agreements, or talks which he had 
with the countries of Western Europe, 
had nothing to do expressly with devalua 
tion. But then one thing he has been silent 
upon in spite of a question that was put 
to him by my predecessor in this House. 
He has said that due to some procedural 
technicalities of the International Monetary 
Fund the question of devaluation could 
not be mooted to the Soviet Union, with 
whom we have got the best of relations. 
Now the point is not whether due to some 
technical procedure of the International 
Monetary Fund we could or could not dis 
close the question of devaluation or the 
decision on devaluation to the U.S.S.R.; the 
question is exactly this. When we were 
going to take a decision on devaluation, 
certainly that decision was taken in the 
Cabinet      here. Now,        if       that 
decision was taken in the Cabinet here, when 
we have the best of trade relations with the 
U.S.S.R., did we not or should we not have 
informed, or should we not have made some 
information available to the U.S.S.R. in some 
way to the effect that the Government was 
thinking of devaluation, or immediately after 
the devaluation was it not possible for the 
Government also to let the U.S.S.R. know 
about devaluation along the proper diplomatic 
channel without being bogged up in the 
technical, procedural thing which the hon'ble 
Finance Minister has just now placed before 
the House ? 

SHRI SACHINDRA CHAUDHURI: So 
far as my visit to Western European countries 
was concerned, the itinerary that had been 
made out was not out of any sort of shift in our 
general policy of non-alignment. It was in 
pursuance of that pdicy and no other. I had a 
particular mission to go there because of the 
simple reason that I had to discuss this 
question of aid which was to be routed through 
the Consortium, and these are the Consortium 
countries, and I had a reason for goinc there. 

The second thing is that we got thi warmest 
feelings for all the East European countries 
and with the great nation of the U.S.S R. 
There is no reason why some day or the other 
somebody should not go there.    In fact, it 
would be untrue to say 
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that our Ministers do not go there. Our 
Ministers, including the Prime Minister, has 
been to the U.S.S.R. and quite a lot of 
Ministers, more than one, went to the U.S.S.R. 
very recently after my visit. I should say this. 
So far as we are concerned, I do not see any 
reason why if we visit a particular State there 
should be any feeling of unhappiness in any 
other part of the world. After all, if we are 
going to one country, that does not mean that I 
personally have got to go to another country. 
As I said, I went there with a particular idea in 
my mind, namely to find out what were the 
economic possibilities of co-operation between 
our country and the countries that I visited. 
There is no question of slur, no question of 
hurting anybody, no question of any shift from 
the policy we have. 

So far as the other question is concerned, 
namely communicating with the U.S.S.R., I 
explained that we had not communicated to 
any of the other countries. Certainly, so far as 
our trade is concerned with the U.S.S.R. and 
the East European countries, it is a valuable 
trade for us as well as. I hope, for them too. 
But my duty, or rather the duty of the 
Government, after having taken the decision 
was to inform our country first before 
informing anybody else. And when that 
information had been given, it was broadcast 
in this country. That information went there. I 
do not think we have an obligation to consult 
any of the other countries as to what we do in 
the matter of arranging parity in our exchange, 
and in consequence of that, there was no 
question of distinction between one country 
and another. 

Madam, I do not see the reason why the 
hon'ble Member opposite thinks that we are 
bogged up in any technicalities. There is no 
technicality at all. There are international 
obligations created by international 
agreements. The International Monetary Fund 
is an organ of an international body, cr an 
international body by itself. There ate certain 
terms under which we are members, and that 
body is entitled to say that as we are going to 
have a share in the funds of this body, if we 
want to use them, we shall abide by the rules to 
which we have agreed. And in compliance 
with that, as a self-respecting nation, as a 
nation with honour we have to do that.   There 
is no 

question of technicalities or bogging down in 
technicalities. 

I think I have answered all the questions of 
Mr. Chatterjee. I do not think there is any 
more question. 

SIXTH AND   SEVENTH  REPORTS  OF 
THE COMMISSIONER FOR 

LINGUISTIC 
MINORITIES 

SHRI LOKANATH MISRA (Orissa) : On a 
point of order on this, Madam. I have my best 
wishes for Mr. Shukla and I consider him to be 
one of the ablest Deputy Ministers. In spite of 
that I would object to his moving this motion 
because 1 would point out to you, Madam, 
paragraph 22 of the Chief Minister' 
Conference Resolution which reads : 

" The Zonal Councils should pay parti-
cular aitention to the implementation -ol 
this policy in their zonal areas. A committee 
consisting of the Vice-Chairman ot the 
Zonal Councils should be set up under the 
chairmanship of the Union Home Minister. 
If. considered nece^sat i the Union Home 
Minister may invite cither Chief Ministers 
or other Ministei to meetings of the 
Committee. This committee would keep in 
touch with the working of the various 
safeguards for linguistic minorities and the 
promotion of national  integration."' 

The point. Madam, here is this. I would have 
been happy if Mr. Shukla could preside on this 
Committee. But unfortunate!) he cannot 
preside over this Committee. It is the Home 
Minister in person, Mr Gulzarilal Nanda, who 
would be. presiding over this Committee, and 
unless he move-this motion and sits through 
the debate I do not think the impressions, even 
though they will be conveyed to Mr. Nand; 
through Mr. Shukla, will be as effective as if 
he would have been here. 

Secondly, there is no other business any 
where else that could prevent Mr. Nanda from 
coming to this House and from moving this 
motion. This is on the fourth year when we are 
taking up this report or the linguistic 
minorities; there was a gap of three years. 
That shows how lightly this particular thing, 
even though yen important from the-point of 
view of national 
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integration, has been dealt with by this 
Government. And on this particular occasion, 
Madam, I would request you to prevent Mr. 
Shukla from moving this motion and ask Mr. 
Gulzarilal Nanda to come and move it. 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS (SHR1 V. 
C. SHUKLA) : May I say something about  
this  objection ? 

THE DEPUTY CHAIRMAN : Do you want 
to say anything? He has addressed the Chair 
and the Chair must say something. The 
Government organises its own business and 
anyone of the Minister's repre->xntatives can 
be here. Mr. Shukla is here and whatever you 
have said, Mr. Shukla will convey to the Home 
Minister but this discussion must go on.   The 
Deputy Minister. 

SHRI LOKANATH MISRA : At least (here 
must be a directive that he should reply to this 
debate. 

SHRI V. C. SHUKLA : I beg to move : 

"That the Sixth Report of the Com-
missioner for Linguistic Minorities for the 
period 1st January, 1963 to 31st December, 
1963 and the Seventh Report of the 
Commisisoner for Linguistic Minorities for 
the period 1st January, 1964 to 31st 
December, 1964, laid on the Table of the 
Rajya Sabha on the 7th May, 1965 and the 
10th December, 1965, respectively, be 
taken into consideration." 

Madam, I would, to begin with, confine 
myself only to certain introductory remarks 
and after the hon. Members have participated 
in this debate, 1 would take that opportunity to 
reply to those points iais3d and clarify the 
matters. 

As the hon. House knows, the question of 
linguistic minorities in the present form arose 
when the States were reorganised on a 
linguistic basis late in 1956. Although before 
such reorganisation the Constitution of India 
itself laid down several safeguards for the 
linguistic minorities the bulk of these rights 
are grouped under the Fundamental Rights in 
our Constitution—apart from these, they are 
also mentioned in article 347 and after the 
States Reorganisation Commission made 
certain recommendations, two new articles 
were introduced in   the  Constitution   to  give  
further  safe- 

guards to the linguistic minorities. The more 
important thing is that these rights given to the 
linguistic minorities are justiciable. In other 
words, any person aggrieved can take these 
matters to the court of law and take the 
appropriate decision in case he finds the action 
of the concerned Government is not in 
keeping with the Constitution. 

Then another memorandum on the safe-
guards of the linguistic minorities was made 
out by the Government of India. It was also 
laid before both the Houses of Parliament and 
it gave two or three lines for the protection of 
the rights of the linguistic minorities. The 
provision of facilities for primary education in 
the country is guaranteed in the Constitution 
but for secondary education, no such provision 
u made in the Constitution. In this memo-
randum and in the executive orders, the Home 
Ministry and also the Commissioner for 
Linguistic Minorities have been insisting that 
the respective State Governments make 
arrangements for the students belonging to the 
various linguistic minorities in the various 
States so that after the primary education is 
over, if a certain number of students ask for 
that kind of education through their mother 
tongue, that education should be made 
available. The minority language in the 
various States could also be given official 
recognition provided a certain percentage of 
population spoke that minority language in a 
particular area. This of course is left to the 
discretion of the State Governments and if the 
State Governments find that all the conditions 
laid down in this memorandum are fulfilled, 
the minority language could be recognised in 
these areas for such purposes. 

The third point laid down in this memo-
randum was the provision against discri-
mination in matters of recruitment to the 
services under the State because of language. 
This principle which was laid down in this 
memorandum has been accepted by all the 
States and most of the State Governments 
have taken action to implement this point of 
the memorandum. 

Then the meeting of the Chief Ministers and 
Central Ministers held in August 1961 also 
reaffirmed and further improved upon the 
safeguards which have been provided to the 
linguistic minorities in this country. 
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[Shri V. C. Shukla.] As I have said, the 
Chief Ministers agaio reaffirmed their faith 
that no person should bo debarred from 
Government service in any State because of 
the language he speaks. Another decision 
taken by the Chief Ministers' Conference was 
that the Commissioner who was appointed by 
the Government of India should be given the 
fullest possible cooperation by all the State 
administrations. To ensure this it was 
recommended that the Chief Ministers 
themselves should take o»er this matter so that 
there is proper coordination between the 
various departments and the linguistic 
minorities get the best possible attention from 
the State administration. It was also decided 
that a Special Officer would be appointed to 
look after this work and to assist the Chief 
Minister and the Chief Secretary in fulfilling 
the obligations provided in the Constitution. 

Then again in the National Integration 
Conference which was held later on, these 
decisions taken by the Chief Ministers were 
again affirmed and confirmed and further 
safeguards, although minor, were suggested. 
Now the Committee which met suggested 
certain safeguards in the shape of some 
agencies for the implementation at the zonal, 
district and State levels and they also reviewed 
the implementation of the various decisions 
taken before the National Integration 
Conference met. 

I must say that in all sections of the country 
the various linguistic minorities here and there 
have expressed by and large their satisfaction 
at the various steps taken by the Government 
to safeguard ■ these linguistic minorities' 
rights. If hon. Members would care to go 
through the two reports under discussion, they 
would find that although there are some 
lacunae, some mistakes and certain 
deficiencies, but by and large, the work done 
by the Commissioner has been hailed and it 
has certainly benefited the linguistic minorities 
spread out in the various parts of our country. 

SHRI MULKA GOVINDA REDDY 
(Mysore) : Their complaint is that the State 
Governments have not complied with the 
directives. 

SHRI V. C. SHUKLA: In certain respects 
but in most of the respects the Commissioner 
has said that the State Governments have 
complied with the recommendations of the 
Commissioner. 

SHRI MULKA   GOVINDA   REDDY: 
The Commissioner himself has complained. 

SHRI V. C. SHUKLA : I will explain what 
action we have taken on the sixth and seventh 
reports that are under discus-won today. 
According to the scheme of our Constitution, 
most of the safeguards that have to be given to 
the linguistic minorities ha\e to be given by the 
State Administration. The Central Government 
by itself has no locus standi in this matter. It 
has only to take these matters to the State 
Administration, request them to take action 
and keep on checking what action has been 
taken about the decisions which have been 
arrived at with their concurrence. So all these 
recommendations by the Commissioner were 
forwarded by the Commissioner to the various 
State Governments and all the suggestions, I 
must say, have been accepted by the State 
Governments except in one or two cases which 
are mentioned in the report and I personally 
feel that the State Administrations are quite 
serious in affording the Constitutional 
guarantees and protecting  the   linguistic  
minorities. 

To conclude, I would say that adminis-
trative action connot be a substitute to the 
cultivation of goodwill and a spirit of ready 
accommodation   and   understanding. 

It has to come by cultivating this idea and 
this atmosphere and I am sure the various 
linguistic minorities and the various State 
Governments would do their best to see that 
this kind of atmosphere is geneiat-ed in the 
country so that these recommeni-dations can 
be properly fulfilled. 

The   question   was prop<- 
3 P'.M. ' 

SHRI LOKANATH MISRA : Madam 
Deputy Chairman, as I indicated to you 
earlier, the approach of this Government in 
dealing with this particular Report is very 
half-hearted. The very absence of the Union 
Home Minister from the House when a matter 
of this magnitude that seriouslj affects the 
spirit of national integration in this country is 
being discussed, shows whai their attitude is. 
There is nothing tha could have prevented him 
from taking part in this discussion, or at least 
sitting through to have the mood of the House 
assessed May be, as people say, he might be 
mow interested in having a look at his horost< 
with Mr. Haveli Ram. 
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That may be one of the reasons that has 
prevented him from coming here. He might be 
looking forward to his own future through his 
astrologer. Or else there is nothing so 
important in the country, that could have 
prevented him from participating in this 
important discussion in this august House. 
Therefore, Sir, my contention that the 
Government's attitude to this Report is half-
hearted comes true; it comes true when we 
find the Union Home Minister absent from the 
House when we are discussing this Report. 

Now coming to the Report, I would start 
with the Chief Ministers' Conference which 
has been mentioned by the mover. After 
having gone through the Resolutions of the 
Chief Ministers' Conference I had absolutely 
no doubt in my mind that they were serious 
about national integration in the country. The 
precept is all right; the Resolution is all right. 
But what about th: implementation part of it? I 
would come to that later on. When we look at 
the Resolution it says that the Conference was 
convened to find out ways and means fcr 
better national integration by removal of 
obstacles, and there was unanimous agreement 
about implementation of safeguards to 
linguistic minorities. But the agency for 
implementation in this regard is very 
inadequate. I will not call it defective because 
I have no grievance, in particular against the 
Comrru'ssioner for Linguistic Minorities. He 
has been trying to do whatever he could. The 
fault lies at the door of the Home Minister of 
India and the State Ministries. Under the 
Constitution the Commissioner for Linguistic 
Minorities has absolutely no executive 
functions. His role is purely a 
recommendatory role. It is not even advisory. 
The advice has to come from the Union Home 
Minister if he feels satisfied with the 
recommendations of the Commissioner for 
Linguistic Minorities. Therefore, the powers 
given to him are very inadequate, and I was 
constrained to find that in his own Report, in 
the Seventh Report at page 89, he himself has 
pw down in so many words his helplessness.    
He  says in paragraph  405 : 

"Some State Governments, however, 
have not viewed this recommendation of 
the Commissioner favourably."   * * * 

In another paragraph 407 he says : 

"Instances of delay in furnishing in-
formation regarding the implementation of 
safeguards have been mentioned in the 
foregoing chapters. Enquiries into 
complaints in these matters have generally 
been delayed." 

As indicated by the Commissioner's Report, in 
certain cases the Commissioner has satisfied 
himself that there had been cases tf intentional 
delay, or else he would not have put it in black 
and white. Therefore. Sir, I urge that either the 
powers of the Commissioner for Linguistic 
Minorities should be enhanced, or the entire 
thing turns out to be a farce. There have been 
certain recommendations which have also 
been repeated year after year without any heed 
being paid to these recommendations either by 
the Union Home Minister or by the State Chief 
- Ministers, who are now dealing with the 
cases as reported to us by the mover of the 
motion. That is the first part of it. Then there is 
the second part. The second obstacle is that in 
certain cases even people are prevented from 
meeting the Commissioner when he is on tour. 
I have a specific instance here where a 
Member of the Legislative Assembly of Bihar 
has sent me a copy of a letter written to the 
Commissioner for Linguistic Minorities which 
says that in spite of his repeated attempts to 
have an interview with the Commissioner he 
could not h'ive it; not that the Commissioner 
did not allow it, but the officers who were in 
charge of the Commissioner's tour programme 
in a particular district of Bihar gave the parti-
cular M.L.A. wrong information about the toui 
programme of the Commissioner and 
ultimately, after he had departed from the 
district, he was somewhere else in Patna. it 
says—th'^t M.L.A. was informed that the 
Commissioner had gone away to Patna, and 
that, if it v.as necessary, he could take alt his 
people to give evidence before the Com-
missioner in Patna itself. When this Com 
missioner had gone on tour of a particular 
district am! a people's representative, in spite 
of his repeated correspondence w.th the distric' 
authorities, could not hav; a* interview with 
the Commissioner, you can well  imagine.  Sir, 
the plight of the cum- 
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fShri Lokanath  Misra.] mon man who is    
suffering    under    the majority community. 

The same Chief Ministers' Conference 
passed a Resolution that said that no fa:i-tity 
previously available should be reduced and, 
wherever possible, furtherJIfacilities should be 
given. That was in precept. When it comes to 
implementation, I shall bring to you kind 
notice, Sir, a particular paragraph from the 
Report itself. Whatever I am quoting here is 
from the Report itself It is embodied in the 
Seventh Report, at page   15  in  paragraph  
74. 

"A complaint of Oriya speakers was 
mentioned in para 57 of the Sixth Report 
alleging that there had been heavy fall in the 
number of Oriya primary schools in 
Singhbhum during 1961-62. The Statement 
Government have now reported that the 
number of Oriya schools indicated against 
1960-61 including both "pure Oriya" and 
"mixed Oriya"  schools," 

I am happy they have not said "adulterated 
Oriya". 

"whereas during 1961-62 only "pure 
Oriya" schools were included in the 
statistics. Although the State Government 
mentioned that there were 57 such "mixed 
schools" in J960-61. the increase in the 
number of Oriya sections during 1961-62 
was reported to be only 11." 

And then it continues to say : 

"The State Government have not also 
explained the circumstances under which the 
number of Oriya medium pupils was reduced 
by more than 10,000 during the course of one 
year.    The Commissioner feels that  a more 
detailed investigation in the matter should be 
made   by    the State Government at an early 
date." The point is, from  17,000 students in 
the previous  year,  the  number    of    students 
came down to as low   as   7,000   in   the 
course of just one year only.   That shows how 
sincere our Chief Minister:, are when it comes 
to implementation.    I    do    not know  when   
the Commissioner would  get a reply  from  
that  particular  State  Government.    He must 
have been waiting for it all this time.    But I 
know he will   not get a reply. It is all a 
manipulation. They 

want that even though this minority might be 
speaking a different language now, ultimately 
through this kind of a force, they must be 
brought into the majority language. That is 
what explains this sharp reduction in the 
course of one year of 10.000. This particular 
fact read in the context of the Chief Ministers' 
Resolution only shows how sincerely they are 
in implementing  their  resolutions also. 

There are so many other complaint* which 
one comes across in this Report, Sir. There 
are complaints about inadequate number of 
teachers. Here in paragraph  135 on page 24, 
it is stated : 

"Oriya linguistic minorities of Visher-
khapatnam had complained that in spite of 
substantial number of Oriya pupils in the 
Kenneth Panchayat Samiti Primary School, 
Gandhigram, facilities for education 
through Oriya were not being provided. The 
complaint was referred to the State 
Government who reported that the Block 
Development Officer ha<< been instructed 
to appoint one Oriya teacher there." 

And in the next paragraph it is stated : 

"During his last tour in Srikakulam d.si 
rid the Assistant Commissioner was told by 
the Oriya linguistic minorities that the 
number of Oriya schools/sections at the 
primary stage was inadequate." 

Everywhere if you go through this Report you 
will come across complaints of this nature, 
complaints which have been subsequently 
substantiated by the Assistant Commissioner 
also. He does not know how to get over it. 
Who is to get over it ? Can Mr. Shukla give an 
undertaking here, an assurance here, and say 
that he will seriously look into this matter and 
if the State Governments do not abide by hi'-
directions then he would get a direction issued 
by the President ? There is provision in the 
Constitution that where the State Government 
does not abide by the general principles or by 
any article of the Constitution, about 
safeguards for the linguistic minorities and 
their interests, then the President can give 
directives. Why does he not do it 2 Is he going 
on waiting to get the right gesture from ihe 
State Government ?    How long do we wait.    
In 
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the meantime the attempts of the respective 
State Governments are that they should 
somehow get the students now 'peaking the 
minority language, to take to the majority 
language by forcing them into that language. 

There had been so many complaints about 
publications in the majority language -of 
voters' list and court documents. These have 
also been substantiated afterwards by »he 
Commissioner. If this is the state of things, 
then you are doing the greatest injustice to 
democracy itself, because the voter in a 
particular area cannot find out if his name is 
there in the voters' list. He cannot register his 
name and he will not fee in a position to 
correct his name if it is an incorrect form. You 
will be preventing him from taking part in the 
elections. Therefore, from that point of view at 
least you should give directions to the State 
authorities asking them to see that these 
records and documents are published in the 
minority language also wherever it is 
necessary. The rules in this respect are very 
clear. If you have anywhere more than 15 per 
cent of the population speaking a minority 
language you can issue the directive. Why 
don't you do that ? Why do you shirk your 
responsibility in this respect ?    Why are you 
not doing this ? 

There had been certain complaints, Sir, 
about the languages in which applications 
should be submitted in the courts and the 
Commission has found a case about which 
they say this on page 240 : 

"Complaint that Oriya was the official 
language in courts, offices, and schools in 
Seraikella and Kharswan prior to merger 
with Bihar. The stopping of entertaining 
petitions in Oriya, sudden switching over to 
Hindi after integration with Bihar as the 
official language in the courts, offices and 
schools; changing of all notice boards and 
mile posts to Hindi; issuing of summons 
and other official notices, circulars and 
correspondence, printing of electoral rolls 
and preparation of settlement records in 
Hindi have been detrimental to their interest 
and inconvenience." 

And the most important complaint is this one 
here. 

"Complaint   that    a    case    registered 
as c/1  case No. 7 of 1956 remanded for 

trial has remained undisposed for tat last 5 
years due to failure of the Government to 
get the genuinness of the Oriya signature 
tested by an expert even though the 
examination fees have been paid by the 
parties." 

This one case clearly shows how you give 
Justice to the people. They say in English: 
justice delayed is justice denied. And here 
why is the man denied justice ? He is denied 
justice because he is guilty of sot knowing the 
language of the majority and here sits our 
Home Minister all the time looking after the 
interests of the minorities. 

SHRI A. D. MANT (Madhya Pradesh) : 
Why don't they learn the language ? 

SHRI LOKANATH MISRA : Everybody 
does not possess my hon. friend Shri A. D. 
Mani's faculty of mind. Though he hails from 
Madras he has switched over to Hindi even 
though he does not talk ia Hindi here but talks 
in English. I suppose he has taken to Hindi 
after being in Nag-pur for 37 years. After all, 
it takes time. Even for a person of Mr. Mani's 
mealai calibre it took some 37 years and even 
then he does not talk Hindi the way even I 
talk. I do not belong to a Hindi area, but all the 
same I can boast that I speak better Hindi, 
clearer Hindi, than Mr. Mani can even after 
staying in Nagpur for the last 37 years. So 
naturally you must give the people some time. 
Yon cannot ask them to switch over all of a 
sudden to the other language. It will take some 
ten or fifteen years, and ultimately as the State 
Government manipulates, it may be, that there 
will be only one language in that particular 
State of Bihar. But if you insist and force these 
people to know the language, start talking to 
them and start dealing with them in a language 
that they do not know, you would neither do 
justice to them nor can you give them justice. 

1 was told and somehow I had gathered the 
impression that the question of domicile no 
more exists in this country, because we are all 
Indians. The question of domicile was only 
taken up during the British regime because 
they found that that helped them. After we call 
ourselves the Republic of India there is no 
justification for a domicile certificate 
anywhere. At least I know that Orissa does cot 
have 
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[Shri Lofcanath Misra.] it.    But here is a 
case mentioned in this Report  which says that 
certain States  in the country  require    the    
production    of domicile certificate for 
appointments. 

SHRI SHEEL BHADRA YAJEE (Bihar) : 
Now they have abolished it. 

SHRI LOKANATH MISRA: There is a 
proverb in Oriya which I feel tempted to 
translate into English. The proverb is this. The 
question is asked who is in God's chamber and 
the man answers, 'I have not eaten the 
plantain'. I referred to 'States'; why did you get 
up, Mr. Yajee ? Does it pertain lo Bihar ? 

SHRI SHEEL BHADRA YAJEE: I have 
got the right to state the position. 

SHRI LOKANATH MISRA: Nobody has 
got a right when I am on my feet. 

. SHRI  SHEEL BHADRA YAJEE :  We 
have abolished the system of domicile 
certificates recently during the Chief Minis-
ters' Conference of the Eastern Zone at 
Ranchi. 

SHRI      LOKANATH    MISRA :    This 
question of domicile should immediately go. 
The Union Home Minister should immediately 
issue directions to every State Government 
that they should do away with this certificate 
of domicile. 

Now I come to the last item and that is 
about the chow dance. There are five classical 
types of dances in India and the fifth is the 
chow dance for which Seraikela was 
internationally known. They have a cultural 
centre called the Silpa Kala Pitha which was 
sponsored by Shri Sudhendra Naraytan Singh 
who is the only recipient of the Academy 
Award from Bihar. Now the pity is since this 
belongs to one who is from the minority 
community, this does not get a pie. The entire 
money given by the Bihar Government goes to 
another institution called Chow Dance Centre 
or something like that which nobody knows. 
Even in Bihar it is not known. Anybody who 
comes from outside as a disciple or even as a 
spectator goes to this Silpa Kala Pitha because 
that has artistes of calibre. Without artistes art 
is nothing. If you try to sponsor art through 
your authority, can you do it ? Through your 
money, can you do it ?    Mr. Shukla cannot 
turn    an 

artiste overnight even if he wants to inspite of 
his authority. He might be a jood Deputy 
Minister for Home; but can you replaced 
Ashok Kumar ? You cannot do it. 

SHRI V. C. SHUKLA : You can do it. 

SHRI LOKANATH MISRA : That is 
different. I do not have the authority;' therefore 
I can't but you cannot do it. But that is what 
you are trying to do in Bihar. In this particular 
instance you have been trying to do it. So it 
would be better it you advise the Bihar 
Government not to take a partisan view even of 
art. Look at it dispassionately. If you are a 
connoisseur of art, if you are a lover of art, if 
you want art to live in the country, you cannot 
apportion certain money to your own 
favourites and start calling them articles. 
People will not acept them; the country will not 
accept them. They must know that particular 
art. If you do not know how to dance and if 
you are sent to the rostrum to dance, can you 
entertain the people? You cannot do it. You are 
only pouring your money to waste. Instead of 
wasting the money, you divert the money to 
the institution that deserves it. 

Finally, through you, I would place one or 
two points before the Home Minister for his 
consideration. He must seriously consider 
them. Of course, whether this is feasible or 
not, I cannot say. Now they have to depend 
purely upon the State agency for 
implementation, even for information 
regarding implementation. That puts them into 
some sort of an embarrassing position because 
they are not kept informed. They do not even 
come to know whether what they have asked 
the States to do is being implemented or not. 
Therefore I would suggest that you should 
have one officer for every State who would be 
directly responsible to your Commissioner. Or 
make him responsible to your Ministry, I 
would not mind but let them be free from the 
State prejudices. 

SHRI A. D. MANT:  And controls. 
SHRI LOKANATH MISRA : And controls 

naturally. So those would be the persons who 
could give you dispassionate objective 
information about the affairs in the  States  
regarding  the     implementation- 
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of safeguards to the linguistic minorities. And 
if they need anybody's help there for 
implementation, there must be some sort of a 
link between them and the Governor direct. I 
suppose every Governor we have now in India 
comes from a different State from where he is 
posted. Therefore I would expect from them 
that objective outlook and if the Governor 
directly helps the officer whom you post in-
the different States of India I think that would 
be the ideal position both for getting 
information and for getting your directions 
implemented. Thank you. * - 

. SHR1 HAYATULLAH ANSARI (Uttar 
Pradesh) : Sir, there is a reference about the 
Urdu-speaking public in Uttar Pradesh in this 
Report and having a first-hand knowledge of 
that problem, I would like to throw some light 
on it. And before iioing into details 1 would 
like to point out certain facts given in the 6th 
Report on page 9. They have given the 
districts of Uttar Pradesh and also the number 
of schools in 1960-61 and in 1961-62. In 
Almora there were four schools in 1960-61 but 
after one year there remained only three where 
Urdu is taught. In Saharan-pur there were 19 
schools and after one year only 18 rema ned. 
In Fatehpur from 28 schools the number came 
down to 22. In Ghazipur there were 36 schools 
in 1960-61 but after one year there remained 
only 30. Jalaun had 10 schools which came 
down to six after one year. Mani-puri had 12 
schools and after one year there were only six. 
In Pilibhit there were 35 schools and after one 
year there remained only 20 schools. And so 
far as Gorakhpur is concerned it is an 
astonishing thing. In 1960-61 there were 45 
schools arid after one year how many 
remained ? Nil. So many people disappeared 
from the district ? There were pupils in 45 
schools who were being taught in Urdu and 
after one year all the schools were closed 
down. Of course, the Commis-missioner for 
Linguistic Minorities pointed out this fact to 
the Government but no reply was received. 
These Reports are frill of this kind of thing 
that the attention of the Government was 
drawn to some facts, to some complaints but 
no heed was paid to them. So I would ask this. 
What is the use of having a Commissioner for 
Linguistic Minorities, paying so much 

money 1 He goes round the country and a 
Report is published and presented to the House 
and hours arc spent on discussion over the 
Reports and nothing comes out of it, just 
because we have no power to force the 
Governments of the States to pay heed to the 
minorities. I tell you that the lot of the Urdu-
speaking public has been very bad in Uttar 
Pradesh. They fought well and they called the 
conscience of the country to it and the 
conscience of the country replied to some 
extent but still their lot is not better. This is due 
to many factors and I will not go in detail into 
them but I will only point out some facts. It is 
wrong to say that as cars have been imported 
into the country from foreign countries, so also 
a language has been imported from some 
foreign country into India. It sprang up from 
our motherland. It was never imported. I would 
also point out that nobody invented it. It was 
not invented by any king or any emperor or by 
a section of any religious people or by a group 
of people. It was not invented by anybody. It 
sprang up from this very soil where I am stand-
ing now, from Delhi. Six hundred years ago it 
was as much a flourishing capital as it is today. 
People from all parts of the country thronged 
here. They lived together and they wanted to 
speak to each other and they were searching 
for a link language. Luckily the link language 
was supplied by the suburbs of Delhi. They 
used to speak in those days "Khari Boli" and 
"Khari Boli" was absorbed by them. It was a 
dialect. It was not a literary language. As you 
know, a dialect has always a very limited 
vocabulary, a few words and a few nouns. So, 
even after absorbing those words into that 
language, they could not express themselves 
well, many of their ideas and thoughts. So, 
they began absorbing words from other 
languages and the process went on for 
centuries. This language developed here in 
Delhi. It did not develop on any sectarian basis 
nor on any religious basis. I assure you that 
this language never found a place in the 
durbars of kings or emperors even up to the 
last day. Their whole business was carried on 
in Persian. Even the people who belonged to 
high' castes used to look down upon Urdu. 
They never wrote their letters in Urdu. They 
never spoke in Urdu. It was taken up by the 
common people, by saints and 
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[Shri Hayalullah Ansari) mdhus. There was 
no religious bias given to the language. Nearly 
all people in this country took to Urdu. A few 
years back, I think about eighty years back, 
there was a Mela at Shahjahanpur. It was 
called Mela-e-Khuda Skinasi. They wanted to 
discuss the problem of religions. Nearly all 
sects of all religions took part m that 
discussion. In that discussion there were Arya 
Samajists, Christians, Muslims, Sikhs, etc. A 
book was published on it and perhaps you will 
find it in your library. It is in Urdu. Swami 
Dayanand spoke in Urdu. There was a 
Maulana from Deo-bund who spoke in Urdu. 
There were others who also spoke in Urdu. It 
was a :nmmon language. Urdu never 
developed as the language of 'any party. Many 
words were taken from Persian and Arabic, but 
they were Indianised. They were never taken 
as Persian words. It is written in a foreign 
script, but the script also has been Indianised. I 
tell you there are four letters in Arabic 
expressing the sound "Z", but in Urdu out of 
the three letters only one remained. There arc 
three letters for expressing the sound "A" but 
in Urdu only one letter remained. There is a 
very beautiful story about a Maulana who 
wanted to speak the Tatsam words—the words 
in their original form. He went to a village 
shopkeeper and said "Do you have Ark hana" 
and pronounced hana with Arabic accent. The 
shopkeeper was astonished and got afraid. He 
said: "Saheb, we have this thing, but not so 
thick." It happened, because we are not 
accustomed to these heavy sounds, they also 
absorbed Indian ideas in such a way that I 
think many of our critics, when they go into 
Urdu poetry, are unable to differentiate where 
the foreign idea ends and where the Indian idea 
begins. If you will allow me, I will just read a 
couplet from Ohalib :— 

 
When there was nothing there was God. If 
there would not have been anything, there 
would have been God. My coming into being 
drowned me. If I had not come, what would  
have happened? I do 

not know. This is the idea. This h»s been 
absorbed in such a way that I da not think that 
the Urdu critics have found it out to be a 
vedantic idea. Here is a very famous couplet of 
Ghalib whicfc denotes birth and rebirth : 

 
The poet slays there are so many flowers on 

the ground, but these are not those beautiful 
faces which have vanisked under the ground, 
many of the beautiful faces have come out on 
the ground ia the shape of flowers and buds. 
Still a lot of them are under it. It is an old 
Indian philosophy given in a poetic style. So, 
Indiftnisation went on in respect of words and 
sounds and everything and even in respect of 
the script. Now, we write Urdu in such a way 
that I do not think any man from Persia or 
Arabia will be able to read even a single word. 
Even those word? which have been taken from 
Arabic or Persian when written in the Urdu 
styled script, I do not think that Arabs or 
Persians will be able to read it. The shape has 
been changed. Everything has been Indianised. 
I mean to say Urdu is 100% an Indian 
language. You will see that it played a great 
part in our history of independence. Ram 
Prasad Bismil, the great leader of the 
Revoluntionary Party, was a very good poet of 
Urdu and one of his couplets is very famous 
and very well known :— 

 
Bhagat Singh was very much impressed by 

this couplet and on account of this couplet he 
joined the Revolutionary Party. He was always 
very much impressed by the poetry of Ram 
Prasad Bismil and while going to sacrifice his 
life he asked his Guru Bismil to read one of 
his poems. So, in this way Urdu played a great 
part in our national struggle. It has taken part 
in all our national life. It is not in any way 
from outside. Its nature is Indian. Its writers 
are Indians, composed of all communities. 
There are Hindu. Christian, Sikh and Muslim 
writers and if you will put them all together I 
think that non-Muslim writers will exceed in 
number. But I do not know now why they are 
so 
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much against Urdu. They take it as something 
from outside. That is wrong. ft is a great part 
of our cultural heritage anj if you will lose 
Urdu. I think you will lose a very great 
language. There are so many beautiful things 
in Urdu literature. It has art and it has science, 
(t is a complete library. There are stories 
written in poem. If you go through them you 
will find that they are all full of Indian 
characters. Perhaps you know that there is a 
great epic written about the grandsons of the 
Prophet, who were killed in Karbala. If you go 
through it, you will find that all their 
characteristics are Indian. They eat like 
Indians. They clothe them selves like Indians. 
They talk like Indians All thesv; things are like 
Indians. But somehow or other we are under 
this misconception that those who speak Urdu, 
or write Urdu, are not cent per cent Indians. I 
will tell from where we have borrowed this 
idea. 1 will point out to you a very bad case of 
history, those bad days when Mr. linnah 
brought out his two-nation theory into our 
political life. Those were the bad days. He said 
that nationality was based on religion. 

AN HON. MEMBER :  But he did not 
know Urdu. 

SHRI HAYATULLAH ANSARI: He did 
not know even Islam. He was a champion of 
Muslims and he was a champion of Urdu. He 
did not know either. He was on very safe 
ground because not knowing both of them he 
could say whatever he liked. That was a very 
unlucky phase of our life. But he went on 
preaching his theory in such a way and so 
vehemently that even a good number of our 
non-Muslim friends were converted to his 
Ideas. He went with his followers to Pakistan. 
But there are certain non-Muslim political 
parties which still believe that Muslims are not 
Indians, that they belong to some other nation 
as they speak Urdu. They believe that those 
who speak Urdu do not belong to India. It is 
cent per cent Mr. Jinnah's theory. Unluckily 
for us, a good number of non-Muslim political 
parties follow the same line. They plead the 
same thing day in and day out. In this way 
every mind is divided. I claim my mother 
tongue to be Urdu. I have used Urdu al! my 
life, I fought the British in that language,    lust 
to fight them, I have al- 

ways been thinking in Urdu, I have been 
always writing in Urdu. Am I traitor on 
account of this ? Before getting independence 
I was not called a traitor but after getting 
independence Ihave become a traitor. That is 
wrong. Maulana Azad used to speak in Urdu. 
So many of our great leaders like Raft Ahmed 
Kidwai spoke in Urdu and wrote in Urdu. So 
many of our martyrs had as their mother 
tongue Urdu. Abdul Hamid who died fighting 
against Pakistan spoke in Urdu. So Urdu 
belongs to India. It does not belong to any 
other country. It has been wrongly supposed 
that it should go to the other side of the border. 
Still we have got in India greater writers in 
Urdu than they have. But under this 
misconception a sort of bad feeling and also—
I will not use a very harsh word, I would say—
unfriendly attitude is going on against Urdu. I 
would point out that both of these reports are 
filled with these facts. The number of schools 
is decreasing; the number of pupils is going 
down: and the facilities are diminishing. So 
what is the use of having the report of the 
Commissioner when they cannot do anything ? 

Sir, a few words about the background of 
the problem    .    .    . 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI M. 
RUTHNASWAMY) : You have got only one 
or two minutes more. 

SHRI HAYATULLAH ANSARI : When 
India was divided, so many of us were under 
the impression that as a good number of 
Muslims had gone to the other side, Urdu also 
should go to that side. On account of this the 
education of Urdu was stopped in Uttar 
Pradesh. On that occasion we carried on a 
democratic movement, that is, a signature 
movement. We .-athered 22 lakhs of 
signatures from adults from Uttar Pradesh and 
along with them we presented an application 
to the President of India, bnd I am proud to 
say that the Chairman of this august House 
was the leader of that group who presented 
that application to the President of India, Dr. 
Rajendra Prasad. We demanded in thtat 
application only those things which Gov-
ernment used to say that they wanted to give 
to the Urdu-speaking people, nothing more. In 
those days the Central Government used to say 
that they wanted to give such and such 
facilities to the Urdu-speak- 
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IShri Hayatullah Ansari] ihg people, and 
also the Government of Uttar Pradesh used to 
say that they wanted to give so much facilities 
to the Urdu-speaking people. We put down 
those things in our application and said that 
they should be given those things in such a 
way that they got them in reality. We still ask 
that whatever you say that on grounds of 
justice the Urdu-speaking people should get 
then, you give ihem in such a way that they 
become something practical, not only 
theoretical. I will not go into details. The hon. 
Member, Shri Misra, has gone into them but he 
has given only the difficulties of the Oriya 
people. But if we go through the report, we 
find that the same things are happening with 
Urdu-speaking people in Uttar Pradesh. Sb I 
ask the hon. M.nisler to throw some light as to 
what are the remedies. 

I will say one thing more. There is no 
competition or quarrel between Hindi and 
Urdu. All those who say that they have got 
Urdu as their mother tongue are very proud of 
it but they are learning Hindi. Their sons and 
daughters are learning Hindi, and they are 
doing very well in Hindi. So there is no 
competition between Hindi and Urdu. All of 
us who belong to Uttar Pradesh want that we 
should excel in Hindi more than any other 
people who speak Hindi whether they are in 
Rajasthan, Bihar or any other part of India. We 
want to excel them. So there is no question of 
competition between Urdu and Hindi. This is 
the position. I would ask the Government to 
throw some light as to what they are going to 
do to implement these recommendations 
which have been made by the Commissioner 
of Linguistic Minorities in order to remove the 
difficulties of the Urdu-speaking people in 
Uttar Pradesh. 

 

 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI M 
RUTHNASWAMY) : The subject is not the 
controversy between the two Members but the 
rights of the linguistic minorities. Mr. 
Niranjan Singh.
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SHRI M. GOVINDA REDDY (Mysore): 

Mr. Vice-Chairman, Sir I welcome this 
opportunity of discussing the Sixth and the 
Seventh Reports of the Commissioner for 
Linguistic Minorities. The report is objective 
because it is a very good record of what is 
obtaining in the country. 

SHRI AKBAR ALT   KHAN   (Andhra 
Pradesh): And excellently written. L62RS/66-
6 

SHRI M. G0V1NDA REDDY : It is 
excellently written, I agree. But, Sir, the 
reports are, I should say, of an observer. I 
wonder if article 350B contemplated the 
appointment of a Commissioner only to 
observe facts and to report to the President. I 
thought, Sir, that he was intended to play a 
more vital role, a more important role than 
that of being a more observer. What more 
important role he could have played I will 
support with my remarks during the course of 
my speech. 

Sir, it is a recognised principle—I will 
confine myself first to education and if time 
permits, I will turn to other aspects— in 
education that instruction must be imparted in 
the mother tongue. As long ago as 1949 the 
Provincial Ministers' Conference—it should 
be said to their credit— recognised this 
principle that not only in primary education 
but also in secondary education instruction 
must be imparted in 
the mother tongue. This was further 
strengthened by the States Reorganisation 
Commission which made several recom-
mendations giving safeguards to linguistic 
minorities. The Government of India con-
sidered these recommendations and had a 
memorandum in 1956. Later on, the Chief 
Ministers of States had a conference in 1961. 
They accepted the recommendations made by 
the States Reorganisation Commission and 
also the memorandum drawn up by the 
Government of India all of which went to 
support the safeguards that were devised for 
the linguistic minorities. 

Now, Sir, the obligation of implementing 
these recommendations devolved on the State 
Governments. But the State Governments, as 
they were constituted, one could see, were not 
very keen on implementing these 
recommendations, firstly, because they were 
all governments of linguistic provtoh ces 
where the majority language received all 
importance, got greater emphasis and the 
minorities, therefore, were there as though at 
sufferance, and therefore, the Governments of 
the States' were not very keen to implement 
these recommendations. These two reports 
give numerous instances 
as to how the State Governments have fallen 
far short of expectation in this re-card. 

The hon'ble Deputy Minister in the course 
of his speech while moving this motion said 
that there is commendable progress in the 
work of implementation by 
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[Shri M. Govinda Reddy.] the State 
Governments. I very respectfully differ from 
him. The State Governments have not moved 
their little finger in implementing these 
recommendations. Both these reports go to 
support this statement. 

Now, with regard to the implementation of 
the scheme of establishing schools and classes 
in minority languages, first it was agreed by 
all the Chief Ministers, and Education 
Ministers also, that during the primary stages 
there must be ten students of the minority 
language in each class and forty students 
totalling in the school to have a provision for 
these classes to be opened in the minority 
languages and teachers given. Now some 
States have said that because there are not 
forty students and *rn students in each class 
therefore, they have not done it. Some States 
said that though there were sixty students 
there were not ten in each class, and therefore 
they have not done it. So they have tried to 
find out an excuse to explain away their not 
implementing it. One State goes to say that the 
obligation imposed by article 350A was not 
mandatory, it was only a direction. That shows 
that that State is not at all interested in 
improving minority languages or in providing 
facilities given in article 350A. 

In secondary education the same thing 
obtains, namely, a minimum of 15 in each 
class and 60 total in a school. They have not 
taken care to do it. If these safeguards had to 
be implemented in the right spirit, first of all, 
the minority area should have been 
demarcated by the State. An assessment 
should have been made of the people speaking 
minority languages. Then an assessment of the 
needs of those areas must have been made as 
to how many teachers are required for this 
minority or how many schoofs are required for 
this minority. The State Governments must 
have immediately accepted the Government of 
India's memorandum and the Chief Ministers' 
Conference Resolution and also the Southern 
Zonal Ministers' Conference resolutions as far 
as the Southern States are concerned. They 
should have set about this work of 
demarcating these areas, making the 
assessment and making provision also. Now, 
even if they want, to implement, they do not 
have enough teachers, they do not have 
enough schools and equipment. They do not 
havs 

text-books also. There have been numerous 
complaints received by the Linguistic 
Minorities Commissioner that they do not have 
proper text-books also. This shows that the 
State Governments have not moved in the 
matter at all. Wherever there were elements 
asserting themselves, where their voice could 
not be silenced, there provision has been made 
in those areas. In some areas already facilities 
were existing for minorities, and thoss 
facilities, it must be said, have not been cut 
down, though, as our hon'ble friend remarked, 
at several places those facilities also have been 
cut down, the number of schools has gone 
down, the number of classes also has gone 
down. Therefore, Sir, the State Governments 
have failed to provide these facilities, the work 
of demarcating the areas, assessing the 
minority languages population and assessing 
the needs of these areas and making provision 
for them. That has not been made. Therefore, 
they have totally failed. Now, whose duty •is it 
to see that the States are made alive to these 
needs ? Surely, it is the duty of the Linguistic 
Minorities Commissioner. First of all, he must 
educate himself about this. I think, as far as 
this is concerned, he has gone by only what the 
State Governments seem to have done. The 
Assistant Commissioner went to Bellary in the 
Mysore State where they have made a 
representation. In several other districts in the 
Mysore State there are people with minority 
languages in concentrated areas where they 
could have not only classes but ten or fifteen 
schools. But there is no mention of all that. In 
my district, for instance, there are Telugu-
speaking people. I am a Telugu-speaking man. 
But'we have not had a single school since the 
Adam's day. We thought we should have had a 
school at least. The people are not enlightened. 

It was the duty of the Linguistic Minorities 
Commissioner first of all to have made this 
assessment himself independent of the State 
Government. He should have kept a map of 
each State before himself, each district before 
himself, taken the census report along with it 
and then found out and demarcated the area 
where there were concentrations of people 
speaking the minority languages and then he 
should also have assessed the needs of those 
minority areas. Then he should have pointed 
out to the Governments, taken tbem by the ncs 
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and said :    "There is a concentration    of 
minorities there. What have you done for them 
?' If the Government had said : 'We are going 
to do this for them', he should have told them : 
'I am not at all satisfied. Tell me how many    
teachers    you have trained, how many 
teachers can you provide for   these   areas    
and    how many schools can you open ?' That 
has not been done.  When I visualised  the role 
of the Commissioner,  I  thought he would have 
done at least that, namely, educated himself 
first in order to be able to be effective with  the    
State    Governments  in getting them to 
implement these recommendations. I do not 
think of him and I do not suggest that he should    
play the role  of an executive officer. Not at all.   
It is not the intention but this is the thing which   
he should have done and if his report is   to 
have any effect and if the President has to get a 
true picture of what is happening in the country 
of how far the State Governments fall short of 
implementing the   recommendations of the 
Commissioner, this is the objective    picture, 
true factual picture that he  should present to 
the President. This report    only  records what    
is happening and what complaints have been 
received. No doubt he has  taken action, 
wherever complaints   have   been received, to 
impress upon the State Governments to remedy 
the complaints but the State Governments have 
turned a deaf caT to him. In fact my State 
Government has not at all  furnished the 
statistics to him.  There are other Governments 
like that of Madhya Pradesh, Punjab  and 
Assam which    have not done. The Assam 
Government has not provided facilities  in the  
tribal  areas for schools  and classes to be 
opened in    the tribal languages.    Until today 
it has not submitted its report to the 
Commissioner. Similarly there    are    other   
Governments too. If these recommendations 
have to be implemented in the right spirit, this 
is the role that the Commissioner should play. I 
have no hope of the   State Governments doing 
it because their emphasis is on the majority 
language  and   so they  are    not very keen on 
implementing this but there must be some 
agency to nrake them opjn their eyes and move   
in the   matter   of implementation. Who    
could   that agency be ? The President himself 
cannot do that. That was  why    article 350(b)   
visualised the  appointment of a Linguistic 
Commissioner. It is not only just to observe as 
on 

the screen the pictrue but to take concrete 
action or to compel the States to do this. If the 
State Governments, after his pinpointing to 
them the actual needs by facts and figures, 
still remain adamant, then it is for the 
Parliament to take such action as is deemed 
necessary. 

The Home Ministry also has a responsibility 
in the matter but the Home Ministry is 
burdened with hundred thousand things but 
that is not an excuse for the Home Ministry 
not to take vigorous action. If their Ministry, 
as is admitted, is very widely burdened, they 
should appoint another Minister in the 
Ministry specially for this. It is not done at all. 
Why should there be not a Minister for seeing 
that these minorities get these safeguards ? 
They are in a good number. After all they can-
not be second-rate citizens. They should enjoy 
the same or equal opportunities as the majority 
language people. Therefore this is a very 
important thing. 

You know, Sir, and the House knows the 
dissatisfaction that prevails in the linguistic 
minority areas and in the tribal areas. We have 
not done by the tribals as they surely 
deserved. We have not done by the semi-
tribals as they have deserved. We have not 
even done it by the other linguistic minorities 
who are absorbed in the general population. 
We have not done anything. Therefore it is 
but right that the Home Ministry must give 
thought again to this question. 

About acceptance as the official language, 
the States Reorganisation Commission had 
definitely laid down the line that wherever 70 
per cent of the people speak a language, then 
that forms the language of the State but 
wherever there is a concentration of minority 
language of at least 30 per cenf. there that 
language should be accepted as the State 
language. There is a complaint in several 
States. For instance in Andhra, in Mysore and 
in Kerala .   .   . 

SHRI SHEEL BHADRA    YAJEE :  In 
Assam also. 

SHRI M. GOVINDA REDDY: Maybe but I 
am not very well conversant with that. I dare 
say that there could be such grounds there 
also. Where there is a concentration of 30 per 
cent, people and where their language has not 
been accepted 
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as the State language,    there    are    com-
plaints .  .  . 

SHRI AKBAR ALI KHAN : In Andhra we 
have done it. 

SHRI M. GOVINDA REDDY : That is 
good. This also should be attended to. 

SHRI MULKA GOVINDA REDDY: That 
is for Urdu in Andhra. 

SHRI AKBAR ALI KHAN: For Kannada 
and Marathi also. In those areas they have 
their schools. Generally I have met people 
from Maharashtra and Mysore . . . 

SHRI M.    GOVINDA    REDDY:   But 
now there is a special    circumstance and 
that is, now large industries are coming up in 
several areas where people speaking a 
language different from the language    of 
the State are coming in large numbers and 
are concentrating. They have neither   the 
schools there in their languages nor   other 
facilities for- their languages.    They have 
nothing there, this is a very serious matter 
and the office of    the Commissioner for 
Linguistic Minorities, I visualise, should at 
least be a very important one in order to 
fulfil the obligations    and duties imposed 
upon the Commissioner. If the powers are 
lacking,  it is for the Home    Ministry to 
confer on him powers but if it goes on in 
this way, he will be only just as a cinema-
goer seeing things on the screen. 

SHRI LOKANATH MISRA: The Home 
Ministry is extremely indifferent about this. 
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SHRI G. RAMACHANDRAN (Nominated) : 

On a point of clarification. Sir, May I point out 
that Rabindranath Tagore never wrote a single 
line of poetry in trie English language ? He wrote 
every line in Bengali and what we now have as 
the English poetry of Rabindranath Tagore, every 
line of it is a translation from Bengali. He never 
wrote a single line of poetry in English. 
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THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI M. 
RUTHNASWAMY) : Mr. Mani, which 
minority language are you going lo speak on? 
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SHRI A. D. MANI: I represent the majority 
language in the country, the largest single 
group, that is, Hindi. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI M. 
RUTHNASWAMY) :   Five minutes. 

SHRI A. D. MANI : No, ten minutes. I 
have got some points to make. 

SHRI  MULKA    GOVINDA REDDY : 
The debate will continue on Monday. 

SHRI A. D. MANI: Mr. Vice-Chairman, I 
am glad that the House has an opportunity of 
discussing the Sixth and Seventh Reports of 
the Commissioner for Linguistic Minorities. 
The Sixth and Seventh Reports will assume 
importance in the years to come when the 
various universities adopt the regional 
languages as their medium of instruction and 
when the staff recruited in the secretariats of 
the various State Governments will largely 
consist of persons who speak what they call 
local language. The Commissioner himself has 
referred to the fact that the acceptance of the 
regional languages as medium of instruction in 
the universities would cause a certain change 
in the present situation. I feel, Sir, that the time 
has come for the Home Ministry to consider a 
further amendment of article 350, 350A and 
350B. If the House were to scrutinise article 
350A it will be seen that under that article the 
various local authorities are asked to give 
instruction in primary education in the mother-
tongue of the children belonging to linguistic 
minority groups. This has been largely 
fulfilled by a number of State Governments. 

SHRI MULKA    GOVINDA  REDDY: 
Violated. 

SHRI A. D. MANI: Largely fulfilled, at 
least certain portions had been fulfilled in 
regard to primary education. Article 150B 
says : 

"(1) "There shall be a Special Officer 
for linguistic minorities ............  

(2) It shall be the duty of the Special 
Officer to investigate all matters relating to 
the safeguards provided for linguistic 
minorities under this Constitution and 
report to the President upon those matters at 
such intervals as the President may direct, 
and the President shall cause all such 
reports to be laid before each House of 
Parliament, and sent    to 

the Governments of    the    States    con-
cerned." 
It is here that the machinery for the 

protection of linguistic minorities is not BS 
adequate as the circumstances warrant. 
Frankly the Commissioner for Linguistic 
Minorities is not given the respect that is due 
to him in the Constitution. The Report bristles 
with a number of cases where references made 
by him to various State Governments have not 
been replied to so far. I do not want to single 
out any particular State Government because 
that might arouse some controversy in this 
House. A number of State Governments do 
not regard this Officer as fulfilling an essential 
purpose or a necessary purpose under the 
Constitution and I feel that the time has come, 
in view of the fact that the language 
complexion of the various universities is 
changing, for Government to give some 
powers to the' Commissioner for Linguis:ie 
Minorities to see that his recommendations are  
accepted by  the State  Governments. 

I feel also that the Home Minister should 
advise the State Governments to provide some 
time in the legislative forum for the discussion 
of this Report as far as the State is concerned. 
This matter has never been discussed in any of 
the State Legislatures. Though there are 
various grievances of linguistic minorities in 
the various States, this matter has not been 
discussed on the floor of the State Legisla-
tures. I quite agree that a discussion in 
Parliament serves the purpose, as far as the 
Constitution is concerned, but if the 
Commissioner for Linguistic Minorities is to 
be effective, he must have his Report 
discussed at least for one or two hours in the 
State Legislatures, so that the grievances of 
linguistic minorities may be ventilated there. 

The second point I would like to make is 
that the Report mentions a large number of 
cases of glaring violations of the safeguards 
which have been contemplated in the 
Constitution. The Commissioner mentions in 
his Seventh Report that in spite of the Public 
Employment Act, which was passed in 1957, 
which removed domiciliary restrictions, the 
Assam Government issued public notifications 
asking for candidates who are natives and 
domiciled to apply for certain posts. This 
matter has been taken up by the Commissioner 
for 
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with the concerned State Government, but so 
far there has been no satisfactory clarification 
of the attitude of the State Government as far 
as this matter is concerned. 
There have also been cases where domiciliary 

restrictions have been imposed by other States. 
In the case of Madhya Pradesh, which has been 
free from linguistic , bitterness of any kind, 
there is a stipulation that in respect of 
employment in certain categories, the person 
concerned must have passed a qualifying 
examination from a school in the State. That 
matter has been taken up at the Regional 
Council meeting, but I feel that in regard to 
domiciliary restrictions we have got to take the 
facts into account. My hon. friend, Mr. 
Lokanath Misra, said that the domiciliary 
restrictions should go, but there are categories 
of Government servants, who by their local 
talent will be the most suitable for employment. 
For example, in respect of Class IV, in the case 
of chaprassis, who are not called upon to do any 
clerical work, it is not possible to insist that 
there should be no domiciliary restrictions or 
there should be no language qualification pres-
cribed for such categories. 

SHRI B. K. P. SINHA (Bihar) : I fail to 
understand what has domicile to do with this 
matter, because the Linguistic Commissioner's 
duty is to protect the interests of the linguistic 
minorities living in a particular State. 
Therefore, it is assumed that the man is 
domiciled in that State. He has certain 
linguistic rights which are different from the 
linguistic rights of the majority and he should 
protect them. Domicile has nothing to do with 
it. 

SHRI A. D. MANI: The question of 
domicile arises this way. The person, who is 
not domiciled, belongs to another State and 
speaks a different language. 

SHRI LOKANATH MISRA: I would just 
like to ask Mr. Sinha whether he has cone 
through the Report itself because it mentions 
about the domiciliary certificate. Without 
going through it, if Mr. Sinha asks a question, 
how can he reply? 

SHRI B. K. P. SINHA : If the Linguistic 
Minorities Commissioner has pronounced on 
the domicile issue, he has exceeded his 
jurisdiction. 

(Interruptions) 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI M. 
RUTHNASWAMY) : Order, order. 

SHRI A. D. MANI: I would like this matter 
to be considered at the Zonal Council 
Meeting. It is not fair to insist that in the case 
of chaprassis, who have to speak the local 
language, applications should be invited from 
all over India. There has got to be some 
stipulation in respect of language in regard to 
Class IV. In regard to Classes, HI, II and I, I 
agree with the recommendation made by the 
Commissioner for Linguistic Minorities, that 
no language test should be prescribed as a 
condition precedent for employment and that 
the language test should come in after the 
period of probation is over. That is the 
position normally understood. In this 
connection I must say with regret that the 
State of U.P., which has been in the vanguard 
of political advance in India has not set up a 
very good example in regard to the 
prescription of the language test. There Hindi 
is compulsory. 

SHRI M. GOVINDA    REDDY :  They 
say they are a backward State. 

SHRI A. D. MANI: So, Hindi is com-
pulsory. The linguistic minorities do not get 
that necessary protection which the 
Commissioner for Linguistic Minorities has 
been urging in his previous Reports in the 
State of U.P., though the State, I must say, is 
also free from linguistic bitterness of the kind 
which has disfigured the history of other 
States in other Darts of India. I feel that in 
regard to the language question we ought to 
take a reasonable view and that is in respect of 
certain categories of employees a knowledge 
of the local language is necessary and that if 
there is any insistence on that qualification as 
a pre-condition to employment, there should 
be no objection on the part of the Com-
missioner for Linguistic Minorities. 

There is also a genuine feeling and that 
feeling is shared by many people in Orissa 
that in the case of public sector undertakings, 
the local people do not get opportunities for 
adequate employment. It is again a question of 
linguistic minorities and so on. We should try, 
as far as possible, to see in respect of these 
subordinate categories that a language 
qualification, which is suitable for the 
requirements of the State, is insisted upon and 
if the matter is 


