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GOVERNMENT RESOLUTIONS RE 
PROCLAMATION OF EMERGENCY 

AND AGGRESSION BY CHINA—
continued. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The discussion on the 
two Resolutions moved by the Home 
Minister yesterday and the amendments 
moved to Resolution No. 2 will now 
continue. Shri P. N. Sapru. 

SHRI P. N. SAPRU (Utter Pradesh): Mr. 
Chairman, I was submitting yesterday that we 
are not prepared to negotiate under duress. 
There can be no doubt that we shall achieve 
our objective of ridding the country of the 
Chinese aggressors, but what we must be 
clear about is that we have now to negotiate—
to use a phrase which I do not like but which I 
am going to use for want of a better one—
from a position of strength. We cannot sacri-
fice our national territory in Ladakh, nor can 
we forget that the North East Frontier Area is 
of the most vital national importance to our 
country's defence. We cannot think of 
negotiations until the Chinese withdraw to the 
lines which the parties were occupying before 
the 8th of September in both the areas. We 
cannot allow our borders to be a continual 
threat to us. We have behind us a united 
country under the leadership of our noble 
Prime Minister to whom a tribute in touching 
language was paid by the British Prime 
Minister, Mr. Harold Macmillan. during the 
debate that took place in the House of 
Commons the other day. Mr. Macmillan said: 

"Those of us who have had the privilege 
of personal contacts with Mr. Nehru must 
know how keenly he feels the importance 
of the moral and spiritual values for which 
he has striven." 

After pointing out that the policy of non-
alignment is deeply based on Indian 
philosophy, Mr. Macmillan went on to say 
that in our efforts to deal with China Mr, 
Nehru had been 

guided by high moral and ethical principles 
and that the Chinese were guilty of brutal and 
ruthless application 'of policies based on the 
most naked and realistic concepts of power. 
Critics of our non-alignment policy would do 
well to remember that it has—it is a long 
quotation from Mr. Harold Wilson's speech in 
the British House of Commons, but the gist of 
it reinforces the view that I have emphasised, 
but I regret to find that there are some persons 
in this country who are questioning the 
soundness of that policy—that it has 
contributed largely to the preservation of 
peace during the last fifteen years, and war in 
this age of thermo-nuclear weapons is 
Something which is fraught with the gravest 
danger to the very existence of the human race 
itself. We have refused to allow our country to 
be used for purposes of building up military 
bases by any group of powers and we have 
not entered into entangling alliances 
dangerous for the preservation of peace either 
in South East Asia or in the Middle East. 

We have received generous assistance from 
the United States and Britain as well as from 
other countries, and we are grateful to them 
for it. Between 1941 and 1945 the Soviet 
Union received massive help from the United 
States, but that did not affect its independent 
foreign policy. Today we have received 
support from as many as forty countries, but I 
must refer, in the warmest terms possible, to 
the friendly efforts of our very good friend, 
President Nasser, of the United Arab 
Republic. That those efforts have failed for 
the time being is not due to any fault of 
President Nasser or the Arab world, of which 
he is the undoubted and undisputed leader. 

Both the Right and the Left—and there arc 
occasions when both the Right and the Left 
should work together—are united in our 
country to> fight this war with the will to win 
it. 
We 

are not expansionists, we are not 
jingoes, we are not chauvinists.    We 
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are not irridentists. We are fighting with 
clean hands for what we believe to be right, 
what we believe to be ours by every legal and 
moral  right. 

There is an undeclared war so far. It is 
undesirable to declare an open war. It can 
have consequences, which we cannot ignore 
at the moment, of a far-reaching character. 
After all China and Japan were virtually at 
war in Manchuria for years before war was 
actually declared. Lord Simon described it as 
the Chinese incident tor Japanese incident. 

SHRI ARJUN ARORA (Uttar Pradesh) ;   
The Manchurian incident. 

SHRI P. N. SAPRU: You are right. It is the 
Mukdeu incident. It is not necessary just yet 
to break off diplomatic relations. It may 
become necessary—I do not rule that out—
later, but we must leave the Prime Minister 
free in regard to this matter. We must express 
no opinion on that point at this stage. 

Nothing has united us so much as this war. 
It has lit the fire of patriotism in our hearts, in 
the heart of people, young and old, belonging 
to both the South and the North. Even the 
D.M.K. has begun to realise its identity with 
the rest of India. With this indomitable will to 
win, there is reason for optimism, for we are 
not— and let me say this emphatically— 
without friends both among the aligned and 
non-aligned countries. 

I am myself somewhat of a pacifist, but 
cowardice ^s worse, as our great master 
taught us, than violence. We should be untrue 
to the ideals bequeathed to us by Gandhiji if 
we were to falter in our determination to fight 
the issue out today. Let there be no 'iIS' and 
'buts' regarding our war effort. For behind this 
issue, there loom larger ones. The issues, as I 
see them, are whether force should be 

the arbiter in border disputes between 
neighbouring States, whether perfidy, 
chicanery and fraud should pay dividends to a 
State which practises them. The issue is 
whether treachery should be encouraged by 
those who value certain decencies in human 
and international behaviour. 

China and the Peking Radio have been 
attacking us and our great Prime Minister in 
indecent language. They have been trying to 
stir up trouble in our country. They have 
declared this to be an imperialist expansionist 
war waged by us. Our Prime Minister is for 
us, the people of this country, the symbol of 
the mystic unity that is India. He has the love, 
the affection and the respect of a united 
people behind him, and the Chinese should 
remember that though we are a country which 
believes in using decent language even about 
our opponents, we cannot descend to their 
level. They cannot stir up our workers and 
delude tour people with the false propaganda 
they have been carrying on. Outlawed by the 
international community of nations, China is 
just behaving like an outlaw, and this is a 
tragedy for all those who believe in Asian 
solidarity, for all those who believe in certain 
progressive ideals. 

China, Mr. Chairman, claims to be a 
socialist country. It is covering up its failure 
on its domestic front by ventures abroad on 
our borders. This is the usual way with 
totalitarian States. We are engaged in the task 
of giving to our people higher standards of 
living. We are engaged in the task of 
equalising opportunity, in giving to the 
workers of our factories, the tillers of our soil, 
the clerks in our establishments, that 
economic security, that economic justice 
which is vital for the good life. Though 
defence must, in the circumstances which 
have been forced upon us, receive the highest 
priority, we should not neglect the domestic 
front. It would be fatal for us to do So, for it is 
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[Shri P. N. Sapru.] only an economically 
prosperous India, an India that pursues the 
path of social justice, it is only an industria-
lised India that can give to its workers decent 
living conditions, that can supply the country 
with the nerve and the vigour to fight what 
might eventually prove to be a long drawn out 
war. Let us in this hour of trial which may 
indeed prove to be our greatest hour of 
triumph show firmness and determination to 
stick to our principles, for socialism means 
for us not expansionism, not jingoism, not 
irredentism but a deep and abiding attachment 
to those humane ideals which can only make 
life a joyous adventure on this planet of ours. 

I venture t0 think, Mr. Chairman, that 
China poses a big problem even for those 
countries associated closely with her. They 
cannot be happy, for China is unfortunately 
developing along lines which all those who 
have faith in certain human values must 
deeply regret. Let us dedicate ourselves in a 
spirit of genuine humility to that service of 
the motherland which alone can help us to 
build up a socialist economy imbued with the 
true spirit of humanism, social justice, liberty, 
democracy and freedom. 

We should utilise, "Mr. Chairman, 
whatever military talent is available in our 
country, and give our Generals, some of 
whom have retired, an opportunity to serve 
their country, in such a manner as to create no 
dualism in authority. They should be closely 
associated with the defence effort of the 
country. There should be speed and 
expedition in carrying out problems created 
by the war. and problems should not be 
delayed by red-tapism  or by bureaucratic    
methods. 

Finally, Mr. Chairman, I would like to give 
my wholehearted support to the Resolutions 
which have been moved by our distinguished 
Home Minister in stirring language.   The   
country Is 

passing through a difficult time. It i» the duty 
of everyone to stand behind the Government 
of the day. We have curtailed civil liberties to 
some extent, but I hope that the powers with 
which the executive has been vested will be 
used with moderation and Judgment. 

I would also like to pay once again a 
tribute to the patriotic speech which was 
delivered by Mr. Bhupesh Gupta yesterday   .   
.   . 

AN HON. MEMBER:   Comrade. 

SHRI P. N. SAPRU: I do not mind using 
that word. I have no hesitation in using the 
word "Comrade". His speech shows that 
Communism as an international force in the 
world is disappearing. Perhaps the Com-
munist Party in India will develop one day on 
the lines of the Yugoslav Communist Party. 
Thank you very much. 
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SHRI LOKANATH MISRA 
(Qrissa): Where was the speech made by the 
Prime Minister the day before yesterday? 
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"Mr. ,S. G. Mohan Kumaraman-galam, a 

leading member of the Tamilnad Council of 
the Communist Party yesterday warned the 
State and Union Governments that defence 
production and mobilisation efforts would 
be hampered if Communists were not 
included in the various committees formed 
to organise  the  country's  defence;". 

 

SHRI  SATYACHARAN   (Uttar Pradesh) :  
Has he been arrested? 

 
SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA (West Bengal); 

This is utterly a wrong interpretation of what 
he has said. I know that the Jan Sangh not 
only misinterprets things but burns also the 
Communist Party Offices. 

 

SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA:      It      is 
quite obvious, Mr. Chairman, that in order 
that all the forces and trade unions could be 
mobilized and harnessed together into the 
common effort, Comrade Mohan 
Kumaraman-galam pointed out the need 'for 
inclusion of all. I think even the Jan Sangh's 
intelligence should not be missing this. 

(Inteirruptions) 

SHRI RAJENDRA PRATAP SINHA 
(Bihar): Who is correct, the leader or the 
follower? 

(Interruptions) 
SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA: His leader has 

joined with the Jan Sangh. They go with them 
. . . 

(Interruptions) 

This is vandalism   .   . 

MR. CHAIRMAN: We should let Mr. 
Vajpayee proceed. 
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SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA: Do I interpret it as 

being another threat by the Jan Sangh that unless 
they arrested them, they will be burning Our 
offices and attack us? Do I interpret it that way? 

SHRI A. B. VAJPAYEE: No, certainly not. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: We should allow Mr. 
Vajpayee to proceed and say what he wishes to 
say. 
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MR. CHAIRMAN: Before I call upon the 
next speaker, I would like to tell you that I 
have a very large number of speakers on the 
list. There are as many as 40 speakers from the 
Congress Party. I propose to sit through lunch 
today and on Monday but even that probably 
will not give us enough time. Even that would 
not give us time to allow everybody to make a 
long speech I would therefore request that 
Members may try to make their remarks brief. 
The Opposition Parties have been allotted time 
and they would see to it that they keep within 
the time but the number from the Congress 
side is so large that they would not be able to 
make speeches within the time i'f they do not 
apply some sort of restraint on themselves, 

SHRI AKBAR ALI KHAN  (Andhra 
Pradesh):   Can we sit tomorrow? 

 

MR. CHAIRMAN: I have tried to follow 
the general sense of the House, which is not 
to sit on Saturday but to sit on Monday. 

SHRI AKBAR ALI KHAN: We will sit on 
Saturday. 

 

MR. CHAIRMAN: It is also my view that a 
long speech need not always be better and 
more effective than a short speech and 
therefore if Members impose some sort of res-
triction on themselves especially when from 
one party there is a very large number of 
speakers, that would work well. We should be 
able to allow time to all Members who want 
to speak provided the speeches are 
comparatively brief. 

SHRI AKBAR ALI KHAN: Even then we 
would require more time. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: That would: depend on 
the extent of curtailment. 

SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA: I am in. favour 
of extending the time. More especially I 
would like the Members opposite to speak on 
this subject. After all they are the ruling party 
and it is their views which should be heard in 
defence of everything that is positive and 
good. Therefore, I would request you to 
extend the time and more specially give more 
time to the Congress Party so that good men 
from that side speak out their mind. 

SHRI A. B. VAJPAYEE: It is a reflection. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: I am quite sure the 
Congress Party appreciate* this advocacy. I 
think we shall be-able to -go through the list if 
we proceed as I have suggested today as well 
as on Monday. Mr. Khandubhai Desai. 

12 NOON 

SHRI KHANDUBHAI K. DESAI (Gujarat): 
Mr. Chairman, I rise to support  the  two  
Resolutions  before 
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the House with all the emphasis at toy 
command. There is no need for the criticism 
that has been levelled by Mr. Vajpayee. The 
Resolutions that have been placed before the 
House are fully self-explanatory. The 
Government is seized of the situation that has 
been a foisted on us by a treacherous 
neighbour and the Resolutions take full note 
of the situation that has come before the 
country. As such, in this hour of grave crisis 
be-foi'a the country, as a mature nation, we 
must consider this problem very coolly. The 
first paragraph of the Resolution lays down 
very completely how and under what circums-
tances we were made to face the crisis that has 
overtaken us after fifteen years. It is very clear 
that we hoped that a big neighbour on our 
north, a nation which consolidated itself al-
most simultaneously with us and got out of 
what they called feudalism, may be friendly 
with us. That was our idea and for the last so 
many years we have seriously tried to cul-
tivated friendship and neighbourly relations 
with that nation*. But probably we were under 
a misapprehension. While on our side, as a 
peaceful nation, living as the Prime Minister 
said, in a peaceful atmosphere and in 
conditions of peace, we tried to cultivate 
friendship, the other party that came in for 
Panchsheel at the Bandung Conference, did so 
with some mental reservations. And it has 
come to us as something cruel, that a nation 
with which we assiduously cultivated good 
relations a nation which was an isolated nation 
12 years back, to which we tried to give a little 
prestige in the world, should have done this. 
We wanted them to see the ways of the 
civilized world and there was nothing wrong 
that. But to our regret we find at the end that 
the confidence and trust and consideration, 
which we showed towards it, were ill-placed. 
That is very clearly enunciated in the first 
paragraph of this Resolution. In the last 
paragraph of the Resolution, the Government 
has stated that whatever may happen, now that 
the nation on our north has been found 

out to be perfidious, treacherous, expansionist 
and imperialistic, however grim the struggle 
may be, however hard it may be, the challenge 
shall be faced with determination and 
whatever is necessary will be done-to see that 
the aggressor goes back. When these two main 
intentions are placed before the House, it is no 
use arguing now whether we had acted 
properly or not, whether we were taken in or 
not. Let us not rake up the past. As the Prime 
Minister said, let us now at this stage, as a 
united nation, not have what is called a post-
mortem examination. But certainly 
introspection has been there and the inter-
relations between the two countries have been 
taken full note of in the first paragraph and in 
the last •paragraph of this Resolution. That 
should be enough for those who now try to 
criticise. Criticism at this stage is likely to 
come in the way of our effort to push back the 
invader. It is very clear that in the history of 
our nation, after our independence and for the 
first time, we are fighting face to face with a 
ruthless invader and in order to expel him from 
our territory, we require all our resources in 
men and material. It is a matter of very great 
satisfaction to those who have to conduct this 
struggle that the whole country has rallied 
round the Government. There is almost an up-
surge. Here also we were not fully prepared to 
canalise this upsurge Now the time has come 
to canalise this upsurge among our 45 crores 
of people who are prepared to sacrifice 
everything. Whatever they have, they are 
prepared to place at the disposal of the 
Government. Not only that. It is also a matter 
of great satisfaction that 40 nations have 
sympathised with our cause and some nations, 
particularly the U.K. and U.S.A., without any 
loss of time, have promised—not only in 
words but they have shown it in action—that 
whatever materials they can spare for us will 
be placed at our disposal. CM course, it is not 
good that we should have to rely upon others; 
but in the world as it exists today, there is no 
harm    in   taking   help   from   other 



 

[Shri Khandubhai K. Desai.] nations. Of 
course, we are grateful to all the countries 
that are coming forward with help in our 
hour of dire need and necessity, to face this 
ruthless and trecherous invader. 

Sir, it has been said by the Government, and 
the Home Minister said this morning   that   
the  Plan   has   to   be pruned.   I will not use 
that word, but I  would  say  that till  the  
invader  is out  of our  land,  till   we   put   
them across   the   Himalayas,   there   will  be 
a  plan and it will   be   a   war   plan. 
Everything   that   has   to   be   adjusted 
mentally,   psychologically,    materially and 
economically, whatever has to be adjusted   to   
meet   our   war   require-l ments that have  
been  imposed  upon us, should be adjusted.    
And if other countries are  coming out  to  help  
us there   is    nothing    to    be    surprised 
because  in this  country we  are  destined 
probably by providence to fight the   battle  of  
democracy.    Let  it  be clearly   understood—
as   far   as   I   can understand it this is the 
positiqn and it is my individual opinion—that 
this is a fight between democracy on one side    
and    the    Communist    China's * 
dictatorship on the other. I am reading in the 
papers many ideas trying to find out the 
motives of the Chinese aggression.   To a 
layman the Chinese aggression appears to be 
clear.   They want  to humiliate  India  in the  
eyes of the  Asian    nations,   if  they    can. 
•Secondly,     our     planned     economic 
success during the last 15 years is a challenge 
to dictatorial rule in China. We   all   know   
that   two   systems   of economic  
reconstruction  are  working in  Asia in  these  
two  big    countries. Lest we succeed and they 
fail in order to disrupt our Plan, in order to 
stifle our economy, they want to divert us from    
our   economic    progress.    But. thank God, 
we have in the last fifteen years, built up a 
good base for meeting  the  struggle  that    we 
are    now caught in.    Though our 
development has not come up to that level 
when independently     we    can    meet    this 
challenge  at  least  a   good   industrial and 
agricultural base has been built up In the last 
fifteen years.   And with 

a little patience, however grim the struggle 
may be, for whatever period it may continue, 
we can face it and face it effectively. 

Now, Sir, I would like to refer to an event 
which happened only about two or three days 
back—the change of heart, if I may say so, to 
begin with that has come over the Communist 
Party of India. It has become a patriotic party. 
I welcome it and I hope and pray that the 
change that has come over them as a result of 
this cruel aggression by the Chinese will be of 
a permanent nature and not of a temporary 
nature to suit the expediency of time. To begin 
with I would not like at this stage just to 
question their bona fides; I would take it for 
whatever it is worth but the Communist Party 
should realise that during the last 40 years not 
only in this country but in other countries too 
there have been lessons to us to be learnt and 
we will take this change with a pinch of salt. 
The type of threat that • Mr. Kumaramangalam 
is placing before the people does not inspire 
confidence. It must be an unconditional 
support for the patriotic national struggle of 
this nation against China and at the same time 
. . . 

SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA: May I, Sir, with 
your permission say this? Comrade 
Kumaramangalam is brought in. He is not of 
course in this House. If you read his speech in 
The Hindu* you will find how anxiously he 
was pleading that all people should be 
brought together in the common effort in 
order to step up defence production so that no 
one is left out. He never made the speech in 
the spirit in which it is interpreted. 

SHRI KHANDUBHAI K. DESAI: The 
nation would like to have a united struggle of 
everybody in the land against the Chinese 
aggressor. However, we were taken in by 
showing confidence in our neighbour; may it 
not happen like that in the future. Now, we 
should be forewarned about the attitudes and 
changing policies of 
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those who call themselves Communists. 
Therefore, I have said and very clearly said 
this; let the change that has come over, the 
patriotic fervour that has overtaken the Com-
munist Party, be of a permanent nature and 
they will then be part and parcel of the nation. 
They are our citizens. But our experience in 
the past with Communist parties all over the 
world goads us to take this assertion with a 
pinch of salt. That is what we are saying. Let 
them give unconditional support to the war 
effort in the country. During the time the 
struggle will be on everybody would have to 
sacrifice, whatever vocations we may be 
pursuing, whether we are civil employees or 
workers or farmers and last but not the least 
the businessmen and industrialists. We must 
all sink, for the time being when we are 
waging a grim struggle, our sectional differ-
ences and let all our efforts, as I said, be 
planned for one and one aim only, that of 
pushing out the aggressors from our land. The 
working classes in the country have 
unequivocally pledged their support to the 
nation. They will work overtime; they will 
work on Sundays. Whatever we expect of 
them, they are prepared to place at the 
disposal of the nation. In addition to that, 
quite a large section of the working classes is 
pledging even monetary support to the 
different funds and bonds that may be issued 
from time to time. The nation will require 
resources. These resources must be made 
available from the current income by all sec-
tions of the society. I hope and pray that in a 
short period we may be able to show China 
that a country that has fought imperialism 
with nonviolence is also capable of fighting a 
violent aggressor with its own weapon. That is 
the call before the nation and I hope the nation 
has responded find will respond to it. As the 
Prime Minister has said in the Resolution 
itself, it is going to be a grim struggle. It is not 
temporary; it will go on till this challenge to 
democracy is either softened or is wiped out. 
Thank you 

846 RS—2. 

SHRI DAHYABHAI V. PATEL (Gujarat): 
Mr. Chairman, Sir, speaking on the Resolution 
that has been moved so ably by the Home 
Minister in his characteristic way of disarming 
the Opposition, I would first begin by joining 
in paying my tribute to the brave men who 
have given their lives in defence of this 
country. Sir, I have always been appreciative, 
and I have admired the quality of our fighting 
forces. I have had my doubts of what we have 
been able to give them, whether it is the 
Defence Minister or whether it is the 
equipment. On a previous occasion I have 
referred to this in this House. What I had said 
had been sought to be laughed away. I am not 
trying to say that I am very prophetic or that I 
have been right. I am very sorry that we have 
come to this plight, that the suspicions that we 
have had about China have come true, but 
much more sorry I am to find our Government 
utterly unprepared for what was coming. On a 
previous occasion when I referred to this I was 
asked to read this and read that I never claim 
to be a scholar, but I asked people who are 
supposed to be well-equipped, well-read, 
whether they had not read the views of China, 
the claims of China, even during the Chiang-
Kai-Shek regime. They have always laid 
claims right on Indian soil, on the Himalayas 
whether it is communist China or whether it is 
free China. And what were we doing? We 
have been preaching peace but preaching 
peace does not mean weakness or negligence. 
With great humility I will say that our 
Government has been caught napping and I 
expected the Government to have stood up in 
sack cloth and ashes apologising to the 
country. If the opposite Benches say that it is 
the fault of Parliament I am willing to join 
them. But today is an occasion when the 
Government should get up in sack cloth and 
ashes and apologise to the people of this 
country for their negligence, for bringing them 
to this plight. I would also say that when we 
go next to the United Nations, our 
representative—I hope it will not be Mr. 
Krishna Menon—will also go 
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[Shri Dahyabhai V. Pate].] there in sack 
cloth and ashes and apologise to our friends 
who have come forward so generously to help 
us, who have always been willing to help us 
but whom our representatives have insulted of 
and on. I hope that we will not have a 
repetition of this offence to our friends, this 
offence to the freedom-loving and really 
democratic countries and not the so-called 
democratic countries of the world. I hope 
there will be an end to that chapter. We have 
got very able people in our country. Why is it 
that one and the same person, whom every-
body knows, has been selected for these two 
posts? I hope his exit from one will also mean 
his exit from the other. We have got an able 
person like Mrs. Vijayalakshmi Pandit who 
fulfilled her tasks in the United Nations with 
such great credit. Why not we do send a 
person, more agreeable, more amenable and a 
person who would do our country's task more 
ably? I hope the Prime Minister will give 
some thought to this and reconsider the 
situation. 

It is very gratifying to note that the people 
of this country have been able to assert their 
will. The will of the people has been asserted. 
And it is also gratifying that the Prime 
Minister has accepted the will of the people, 
the verdict of the people. The news that we 
got during the last two months would worry 
everyone, particularly those who have been in 
the freedom struggle and who have such 
personal and close relations with our Prime 
Minister. We were wondering what was 
coming over him. We did not want to say that 
Mr. Nehru was caught in any unpleasant 
mood. I would not say like Nero fiddling 
when Rome was burning, but I would say that 
he was found hesitating when action was 
necessary. I am glad that hesitation has been 
brief and our Government has made up its 
mind to stand up even though we have been 
caught unprepared. We have got friends  all  
over  the world. The  free 

world is there to befriend anybody who is in 
difficulties. If we have not got equipment, 
equipment will be available from people who 
love their freedom, because people who love 
freedom do not know any geographical 
boundaries. They value their freedom as much 
as they value the freedom of others and they 
are willing to come forward and help us. 1 
hope no fetish will be made of seeking aid, 
seeking aid from sources ready to help us and 
in the quantity required. The Prime Minister 
has said that there is massive aggression. 
Well, we will need massive aid to encounter 
this and I hope the Government will not 
hesitate or make any bones about it. It is going 
to be a long-drawn struggle and admittedly 
that also, if I may say so, because of the fault 
of this Government. We did not check the 
Chinese aggression when it began first in 
1956, as the Home Minister told us. Then, 
again, in 1958, why did we not stop it? We 
saw them making preparations, building roads, 
when they started building roads, what were 
we doing? When I referred to this aspect of 
the Chinese aggression, of their making roads, 
in this House, I was told that it was easier for 
the Chinese to build the roads. The terrain 
before us is very difficult and we cannot make 
roads. I am sorry this explanation is not at all 
convincing. The encroachment of China on 
our borders, upon our territory, has been going 
on from 1956 and 1958. We are in 1962 now. 
If it was easier for them to build roads in a 
year, could we not do something in four or 
five years? Therefore, I say that our 
Government has been caught napping. Shri 
Lai Bahadur Shastri did admit it very rightly. I 
wish there was a little more emphasis on this 
failing. Certainly, the country has stood up to 
a man to support the Government in this great 
task that is before us. The magnitude of the 
task is very great. Our fighting forces should 
know it, the way in which they fought in 
Korea where wave after wave of people came 
forward. They do not value human life.    
There  is no  con- 
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sideration for human life in China. It is power 
that the Communists want to wield and in that 
the difference between Russia and China is 
just a matter of difference of shade in colour. 
Their objective is the same. I would refer 
those who read so much and accuse me of not 
reading enough to this. Right from the days of 
Lenin, did not Lenin say that the road to Paris 
is through Shanghai and Calcutta? They have 
got Shanghai. What about Calcutta? In this 
very House I have been pointing out the 
activities of the Bank of China and the large 
number of Chinese agents selling eatables, 
peddling things, whether people buy them or 
not, whether they are really doing trade or 
they are agents of a foreign government, 
whether they are doing espionage work, 
whether they are there to create disruption and 
confusion in our country for the moment that 
China has been planning for years, I am sorry 
our Government has not taken note of the 
warning. On the contrary I remember the 
Finrnce Minister on his visit to Bombay, after 
what I said in this House, asking the bankers, 
who have been giving all this information to 
me, about the activities of the Bank of China. 
Sir, what is our Government doing? They have 
got a police, they have got a Special Police. 
They have got the C.I.D. I dare say that the 
Government will admit that we have got a 
large number of very patriotic citizens. Why 
don't they take them into confidence? Instead 
of taking the wrong people into confidence, 
why don't they take the right people into 
confidence? 

Sir, this country has gone through an 
ordeal once before in its struggle for freedom. 
The Government should know who are the 
people who are with them. When this country 
was up in a struggle for freedom, my friends 
over there did not say that this was a struggle 
for freedom. It became a struggle for freedom 
only when Russia became an ally of Britain 
and the powers that were fighting. And then 
what happened?    They got 

large sums of money from the National War 
Front that was manned by toadies in this 
country and people who started calling it the 
people's war. Government has only just to 
look up the back files in their archives or the 
newspapers and they will find out where to 
find the right people. 

This Government is forming a National 
Defence Council. They are calling it an 
emergency. I would like to warn the 
Government that the emergency is yet to 
come. It is just the beginning. This is a crisis, 
and I would like to warn the Government not 
to use this crisis as a means of taking more 
and more power unto itself. This Government 
is sufficiently greedy of power. Let not their 
greed for power overcome them to utilise this 
opportunity for taking more power and, if you 
please, more money to waste. The war is to be 
fought with guns and bullets and not with 
coffee percolators that our factories are 
making. The Defence Ministry should be 
making bullets, not making coffee percolators 
an-1 bath tubs. Those who are interested may 
go and see it themselves in the ammunition 
factories. I have got the greatest praise for our 
soldiers, for our workers, for the people who 
are working in these factories. I know what 
they have contributed. They are all willing to 
contribute their wages generously. They are 
willing to work on holidays and Sundays 
without overtime if it is necessary. It is only 
my friends here who misled the people all 
these years, and I am sorry that our 
Government has succumbed to that, in trying 
to ask too much of the rights of labour for the 
exploitation of labour. Right here in Delhi 
they use the labour in the Government P.W.D. 
I will not dilate on it, but the need of the hour 
is to gear up production. Is our Government 
doing it? I would not only blame these friends 
but the friends who have been pleading for the 
labour on the one hand and on the other hand 
who talk of planning. Mr. Nanda is pleading 
for labour, and everything has been com- 
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[Shri Dahyabhai  V. Patel.] pletely  slowed  
down.    Efficiency  has go»e down in this 
country. 

AN. HON. MEMBER:  Question. 

SHRI DAHYABHAI V. PATEL: Those 
who say "question" are living in a different 
world altogether. We know what efficiency 
there was right in the offices of the 
Government of India, in the offices 
everywhere, in commercial offices, and 
why has it gone down? Because of the 
deliberate propaganda that has been made 
for going slow and misleading the people 
that there are only two classes, the 
capitalists who are the bloodsuckers and the 
labourers who are the downtrodden. 

SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA: Down-
trodders. 

SHRI DAHYABHAI V. PATEL: This 
has been an absolutely wrong way of doing 
it. and my friends, the labour leaders, have 
been competing with the Communist 
friends in trying to get a better deal for the 
labour and to get their votes. 

SHRI KHANDUBHAI K. DESAI: Mr. 
Chairman . . . 

SHRI DAHYABHAI V. PATEL: I do not 
want to yield to him. I did not interrupt 
him. 

SHRI KHANDUBHAI K. DESAI: He is 
misleading the House. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: You can get only as 
much light as he pleases to give. 

SHRI DAHYABHAI V. PATEL: Thank 
you very much, Sir. I repeat that the 
I.N.T.U.C. people—I can even name them—
have been competing with the Communist 
friends in trying to tell the labour that they 
are going to get this and that. They have 
never told the labour to give a fair deal 
wherever they are employed, give their full 
day's work. I wish they would do it now, it is 
not too late.      I 

Sir, the machinery of the All-India Radio 
has been used by Government very much to 
boost its own doings and its Prime Minister. 
May I say in all humility that the country is 
greater than even the Prime Minister? The 
country should soon realise this. Sir, on the 
day the emergency was declared, I happened 
to be in Delhi and a representative of the 
Associated Press came and said to me: "Why 
don't you say something?" I said: "You will 
not be able to print it". He said: "Surely I 
will". I said: "Government should take a leaf 
out of the book of democratic countries and 
proceed to form a Government that will 
inspire confidence in the people". I do not talk 
of National Government. I know there are cer-
tain friends sitting near me who talk of 
National Government because they are only 
hoping to be called to get in. I have no such 
hope. I prefer to perform the role of a healthy 
opposition that draws the attention of the 
Government to its failings. I shall be content 
to do that. I have not been trying to get into 
the Government. Certain parties are doing. I 
say very clearly that if the Prime Minister 
likes them, he can take them; I have no 
objection. But we must be assured that people 
in the Government are democratic people who 
believe in democracy, who believe in the 
freedom of this country above all. I say that 
the Government and their friends read so 
much. I just read to you what Lenin said. At a 
recent meeting of the Communist Party it was 
said: "We have to work like a woodworm. We 
have to eat into the beams of the Government 
and strike when it is weak and then it will 
crack. Then the whole country will be ours". 
This is how the Communist Party is 
proceeding. In the statement that I gave to that 
person I said: "Here you must follow the 
example of England". Sir Oswald Mosley was 
put into protective custody. I am glad to see 
that Government has put some of these friends 
in custody— they may be very honest, they 
may be patriotic—but the safety of the 
country  comes before  anything  else, 

317 Proclamation of [RAJYASABHA] Emergency and       318 
Aggression by China 



319 Proclamation of [ 9 NOV. 1962 ] Emergency and 320 
Aggression by China 

and I would like to see many more i of them 
there. There are too many of them roaming 
about in this country. There are too many 
Chinamen going about in this country. We have 
not got enough C.I.D. men to keep track of 
them. I would request Government to take steps 
to see that all of them are deported from this 
country. 

SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA: May I suggest 
that he be made the C.I.D. Chief? 

SHRI DAHYABHAI V. PATEL: I do not 
think that the hon. Minister is in a mood to 
take tips from you. You have had your long 
speech. You made a very good speech. Since 
he is interrupting me, Mr. Chairman, I hope 
you will be indulgent and allow me more 
time. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: I hope Members would 
not compet" in giving the hon. Minister tips. 
You please carry on with your speech. 

SHRI DAHYABHAI V. PATEL: Mr. 
Bhupesh Gupta made a brilliant speech in this 
House. Only it was too late. I would have 
liked a similar speech from him and to be 
assured of his patriotism on the 7th of 
September, not after the 8th of September 
after this fresh wave of aggression by China. 
So far he had been defending the Chinese 
aggression that had been taking place on this 
country in 1956 and 1958. When he saw the 
popular upsurge, he made this laboured speech 
and read every word of it. 

SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA: The hon. 
Member cannot make such allegations. The 
proceedings bear testimony to my speech. He 
cannot say anything he likes. 

SHRI DAHYABHAI V. PATEL: I stand by 
every word that I have said    I do not need to 
make written 

speeches because I am sure of my ground. I 
do not need to make a written and laboured 
speech, because I am saying what comes 
straight from my heart; I have nothing to hide; 
I have not to show to the world that I have 
changed my colours. 

SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA: Why are you 
angry? One should not get angry m a national 
emergency. 

SHRI DAHYABHAI V. PATEL: I am not 
at all angry. I was only emphasising the point 
. . . 

MR. CHAIRMAN: Will you please 
proceed? 

SHRI DAHYABHAI V. PATEL: Sir. I 
would request the Government to utilise this 
opportunity of popular enthusiasm to mobilise 
all the available resources to meet the 
aggression that has come before us. I should 
think that the emergency is yet to come. If the 
Government will ask the soldiers who have 
fought against the Chinese in Korea and other 
places, and take notes, they will know the 
Chinese strategy. They have got so much man 
power and perhaps they do not value human 
lives. You will get waves and waves of 
Chinese and they would not care even for the 
wounded and the dead but we, Sir, if I may be 
permitted to say so, live in a little more 
civilised world and we consider human lives 
valuable. I wish, when our Defence 
department had sent the first batch, they had 
sent them with sufficient cover and sufficient 
protection. I will not dilate on that, but I 
would like to say this that the Prime Minister's 
reference to some of the officers and the 
manner in which he defended Communism in 
the other House does not leave a clear picture, 
is not convincing to the people. He said, "All 
the officers in the Defence services were 
good. But in sheer courage and initiative and 
hard work I doubt if we can find anybody to 
beat him."    This is what the Prime Min- 



 

'Shri Dahyabhai V. Patel.] 
ister said in reference to a certain General 
whose conduct was called in question in the 
other House. Sir, I think this is a bit too far . . 
. 

SHRI T. S. PATTABIRAMAN (Madras):    
Are you a better judge? 

SHRI DAHYABHAI V. PATEL: Most 
humbly I would point out to the Prime 
Minister that he is in the habit of calling 
people names; he. calls people feudal. But 
what is he doing? What is he doing when he 
appoints his ambassadors and his generals? 
And was he not doing what the feudal lords 
had been doing, like the Mughals? I suggest, 
Sir, that all this needs a complete reorientation. 
The Defence Council, if it is to be really a 
Defence Council, must contain people who 
have experience, people who will convince the 
public that Government means business. 
Otherwise, of course you can collect gold; 
there are people to give gold. But gold is not 
going to win the war. If you are to win the 
war, if you are serious about it, then you must 
begin by asking the country to be prepared for 
the grim struggle. You must be prepared to act 
quickly, not hesitate and ponder. Un-
fortunately, our Prime. Minister has the habit 
of hesitating when the time for action comes 
and he does not know what to do, whether to 
think of his Communist friends, think of what 
they will say about him, or whether to go 
ahead. It is a good augury that democracy has 
prevailed . . . 

SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA: What he says—
is that jealousy or politics? 

SHRI DAHYABHAI V. PATEL: The 
country will judge what I am say-tog. 

DIWAN CHAMAN LALL (Punjab): It is 
neither jealousy nor politics but idiocy. 

SHRI DAHYABHAI V. PATEL: r say that 
it is food that, people's desire prevailed and 
the Defence Minister had to go.   I hope it 
will not 

stop there. There are still many in the Cabinet 
who should make room for people in whom 
the people have more confidence. Similarly, it 
is necessary that the people who are to lead the 
armies should be people in whom the army 
itself and the people would have more 
confidence. Money alone is not going to get 
you victory. You must promise but not make 
big promises to the country. Like Mr. 
Churchill let us promise blood and tears 
because this is going to be a grim war with 
China. With what our neighbours are doing, 
with what Pakistan is doing, this is going to be 
a long drawn out; affair and you will not be 
able to achieve victory easily, and I think that 
the first step that this Government should take 
is to make peace with Pakistan, come to terms 
with Pakistan. Going to the United Nations 
was a great folly, Mr. Menon going there year 
after year is no good. Let us end this. Let us 
come to an understanding with them. We gave 
them a rebuff when they tried sincerely to 
come to terms with us. I should say we have 
not understood them. They are people who are 
our flesh and blood; they have been in this 
country; they have been with us. Perhaps they 
were misled into asking for partition. But that 
should not make a difference to our course of 
action with them now. Let us come to an 
understanding with them and and fight the 
common enemy. 

DIWAN CHAMAN LALL; How much 
territory has Pakistan grabbed? 

SHRI DAHYABHAI V. PATEL: How 
much territory has China added to its 
territory? Of course, I want it back. I am not 
saying that you should surrender territory to 
Pakistan. I only say that we have an 
honourable settlement with Pakistan. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: I think the hon. 
Member ha3 already given a number of 
suggestions. He need not give many more 
details. 
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SHRI DAHYABHAI V. PATEL: Therefore, 
Sir, I would say that the Government has been 
late in awakening; Government has failed to 
take action in time, but now at least let it take 
up the task ahead of it in all seriousness. The 
country is greater than anybody, than even the 
Congress if it comes to that, and the country's 
will will be asserted whether you like it or 
not. The country if not going to tolerate our 
surrendering even an inch of our soil to the 
aggressor in this way. Therefore, take heed 
and prepare the country for what has come 
before us. 

Thank you. 

SHRI BHUPESH GUPTA: May I know, 
Sir, what he wants to be, Quarter Master 
General or a Cabinet Minister? After hearing 
his speech I am tempted to put this question, 
he had made  many  suggestions. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The hon. Member is too 
curious. 

SHRI LOKANATH MISRA: In any case 
your suggestions will not be accepted by  
anybody. 
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violent and it_ was after a struggle of 150 years, a 
completely non-violent struggle in which Guru 
Go-bind Singh had to suffer the matyr-dom of his 
father, his great grand father, his four children and 
his mother that he came to a tragic conclusion. 
When he was asked how self-rule is established, 
how political regimes are run, he said: 

 
That is to say, our Lord, the Master of the poor 
said; "Without the help of arms, no kingdom, no 
political regime, can run. Why should we run a 
political regime of our own? Why should we have 
any self-rule? It is because without self-rule. 
without self-government, righteousness cannot 
prevail, Dharma cannot prevail and without the 
prevalence of Dharma, no values that we cherish 
can be preserved." 

 
Even in the present emergency, our dynamic Chief 
Minister, Sardar Pra-tap Singh Kairon, has declared 
his intention to offer 2 million recruits during the 
coming one month if we can train and arm them. 
There is unbounded enthusiasm in the minds of the 
people of Punjab as it is in minds of the people all 
over the country, from Kashmir to Kerala, and from 
Assam to Gujarat. For the first time we have come 
to realise that we are a nation which is not ridden 
with any kind of controversy over language, over 
caste, over provincial boundaries, over royalties on 
oil and so on and so forth. In* a moment, as if by a 
magic wand, we have been turned into a nation of 
warriors, everyone dedicated to only one cause and 
that is the cause of victory. But when all this is said, 
when we see large queues 

DR. GOPAL SINGH (Nominated): Madam. 
I rise to support the two Resolutions moved 
by the hon. Home Minister. I belong to a part 
of India and a religious community whose 
blood is stirred by a call to a righteous war. 
We began as a peaceful people in history, a 
small community, devotees of God, 
completely    non- 



 

o-f people massing before the recruiting 
offices, when we see poor people giving away 
their life's savings to the Prime Minister's 
Fund or the National Defence Fund, when we 
see so much of enthusiasm for fighting for this 
righteous war that has been forced upon a 
peaceful and peace-loving country, in spite of 
all this enthusiasm, I would like to strike a 
note of caution. We all know why this debacle 
came. Though we may not admit— manv of 
us especially in the Opposition do not admit—
it is almost an invariable rule of military his. 
tory that whosoever shall strike first shall 
have the initial advantage. Take the case of 
the last war, when the best trained armed 
forces of Britain fell in Malaya, when France 
fell, when Belgium fell, when Britain had to 
beat a retreat at Dunkirk, when Russia had to 
evacuate almost half of the country before the 
onslaughts of the Germans. It is because 
Hitler in Germany and Fascist Mussolini in 
Italy and Tojo in Japan were all preparing for 
war while the democracies were most of the 
time preparing for peace. We were geared not 
merely during our struggle for independence 
lasting over 50 years to ways of peace but also 
after independence we thought that as long as 
possible war should be kept away from our 
borders so that we could build ourselves 
economically. Now, we have been building up 
over the last 15 years economically in a most 
peaceful way and that is whv whatever mis-
takes we committed, those were the mistakes 
of a civilised nation, the mistakes of 
gentlemanliness Thev were not the mistakes 
of weakness and people who stand up today in 
this august House and say that it is all on 
account of our policy of non-alignment that 
we have come to grief have only to read the 
'Daily Telegraph' of November 5 to realise 
that it is not so. The 'Daily Telegraph', which 
is the spokesman of the Conservative Party m 
Great Britain says, editorially: 

"However dubious may be Russia's 
ability to restrain the Chinese, the out and 
out adherence of India to the Western 
Camp would inevi- 

tably link the two Communist giants 
shoulder to shoulder and would involve the 
Western countries in commitments more 
rigid than they would want." 

Then I would read out a quotation from the 
'New Statesman', well-known socialist British 
journal, which says: 

"Britain must give all the help Mr. 
Nehru askes for, without sucking India in 
the cold war." 

Mr. Galbraith, the American Ambas-eador to 
this country, has also spoken in the same 
strain. These gentlemen and these newspapers 
are about as responsive to the needs of their 
own countries and ideologies as our friends 
opposite here are. Therefore we should do 
nothing in the huff of the moment, in the 
excitement of this emergency to deviate from 
our path of non-alignment. If these incursions 
on the borders of India have not dragged the 
whole world into the flames of war, It is on 
account of that wise and sagacious policy that 
was evolved by that jewel of a man. Shri 
Jawaharlal Nehru, and supported by the 
Government of India and this Parliament. I 
would, therefore, say that this policy should, 
on no account be abandoned and nobody is 
asking us to do it, not the West which is 
helping us so generously. We are all very 
grateful that the U.S.A. and the U.K., out of 
motives of good neighbourliness and because 
of their faith in our democracy and on account 
of their faith in our peace-loving leadership 
and thf "'rovernment, have come forward with 
this generous response to our call. They are 
giving without committing us to anything and 
they are giving without settling terms. When 
people ask: Why could not we have arms 
earlier? My reply is that these could not be 
had earlier firstly because we were geared to 
the ways of peace, we were building up 
ourselves economically in peace; for peace, 
and secondly whenever we wanted to strike a 
deal with any firm or Government in the West 
for the manufacture of arms here or even for 
delivery of arms, then the dates that were 
given to us were far in advance of our 
requirements.   All kinds of im- 
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TDr. Gopal Singh.] 
pediments were put in our way, some 
financial, some political, some which I would 
not like to mention here. Therefore. 1 say that 
people who have accused us of being 
deliberately ignorant of the needs of the times 
are themselves ignoring the exigencies of the. 
situation that developed from time to time. 
They advise us now to call all kinds of 
Generals who have retired, blessed be they, 
most of them are now in the Swatantra Party 
and therefore they should be here to advise us 
all the time! But I say, that I met General 
Thimmayya, the ex-Comman-der-in-Chief of 
the Indian Army on 23rd September, 1959 
and I asked him about the situation in Ladakh. 
I was then in Kashmir. This was printed in the 
'Tribune' of Ambala on 24th September,  
1959: 

"Gen. Thimmayya said, 'There was 
absolutely no cause for anxiety on the 
Ladakh border.' 

He said 'There had been no major 
incursions on our territory on this border 
and wherever the Chinese had advanced 
from Tibet or Sinkiang, they had been 
halted at some distance from our picquets'. 

Asked how much area of Ladakh was 
shown in Chinese maps, he said it was not 
more than 800 sq. miles." 

That was on 24th September, 1959, and Gen. 
Thimmayya was our Commander-in-Chief 
then and he should know and he ought to have 
known. When he said this, naturally, the 
country could not be prepared for war at that 
time. All the same, I must say that the 
Defence Ministry did produce and were 
producing more and more of war equipment. 
From a total of about Rs. 6 crores, the pro-
duction rose to much more. When Mr. 
Krishna Menon took over, defence equipment 
worth Rs. 6 crores was being turned out from 
our ordnanr-r factories. But the amount of war 
equipment that has lately been coming out of 
our factories  is  of the    order    of 

about Rs. 60 crores per year, and the 
Government had plans for raising it to about 
Rs. 200' crores to Rs. 600 crores. But 
unfortunately, in our excitement, we forget 
that even though we tried our levei best to 
build up our military apparatus here, there 
were quite a few impediments in our way, 
beyond our reach, that we could not surmount. 
It is only very recently that on account of and 
under the stress of this emergency, the friends 
who have come from abroad, generous 
friends, great friends—I pay my tribute to 
them—have offered us arms without 
conditions. But a few days ago, there were all 
kinds of conditions placed in our way and we 
could not buy our equipment from them and 
we could not manufacture with their per-
mission the equipment that we wanted in this 
country. 

Another thing mentioned here is about the 
border roads. I know something about the 
strategic roads- in NEFA and Ladakh and 
therefore I can say that these roads were deli-
berately not built. I may tell you why, because 
in military strategy these things are done. 
Sometimes roads are necessary, but sometimes 
roads are not necessary. For military reasons 
taking the cue from the British from whom we 
inherited our frontiers we decided that we shall 
not build roads on our borders far away, but 
leave them uninhabited and without roads, as 
far as possible, for the reason that these might 
become useful as much to us as to our enemy, 
if he advanced. He should be met and fought in 
depth. There is a term in military strategy— 
meeting in depth. It means that the enemy 
should be lured into our territory for quite a bit 
of distance so that we might cut off his 
supplies. He cannot bring his forces, his jeeps, 
his armaments and so on and he is denied 
supplies from the local population and then 
surrounded and decimated. That is the way. 
But when we got to know that there was 
absolutely no alternative for us but to build a 
few roads, we started building a few roads 
which were of strategic importance. Therp has 
been a debacle, but as    I 
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ubmitted earlier, Madam Deputy Chairman, 
this debacle had to come, because anybody 
who has taken the initiative in a fight, who is 
the aggressor, will always have an initial 
advantage. That is one thing. Secondly, there 
is another thing. The Chinese came from the 
Thagla ridge and the Thagla ridge, if the hon. 
Members opposite have seen the map, is only 
about seven miles from the road-head of the 
Chinese; but we have to march for seven days 
on foot from the nearest road-head. That is 
why we could not send our troops out there on 
the border and that is why we were out-
numbered. We could only have a few small 
picquets or pockets there. We could not post 
all our armies there. It was just not possible. 
We know it. We Sikhs from the Punjab have 
almost two-thirds of our families in the mili-
tary, in the army, in the air force, in the navy 
or allied services. They know that it was just 
not possible to place large armies on the fron-
tiers, on the Chinese borders. As for 
equipment, I have already submitted and I 
submit it once again that so far as the 
automatic weapons are concerned, they were 
not given even to the U.S. Army or the British 
Army till lately. So far as heavy mortars are 
concerned—we have small mortars—only the 
French have these heavy mortars and no other 
country in the world. That is because now-
adays more and more emphasis is put on the 
air power, just as it was on the sea power 
some fifty years back, the sea power some 
fifty years back, round land power, then it 
became sea power and now the emphasis is on 
air power. So military strategy changes from 
decade to decade nowadays. Therefore, it 
should not be asked why we did not have a 
large army over there. Air power is important 
now. Shri Vajpayee was saying that the 
Chinese have about 8,000 pieces of aircraft, 
MIGs and so ton, and said we should also get 
them. Now, tell me, wherefrom is all that 
money to come if the leader of the Swatantra 
Party says, "Do not ask us to part with our 
gold. Do not ask us to part with   the  ill-
gotten   gains,  profits  got 

out of businesses and so on?" If you are really 
prepared to fight a war, then you should 
submit to the will of the Government. I think 
this is the most fitting time for the 
Government to declare gold as an illegal 
tender. Secondly, all the reserves and profits 
in industries should be taken over for deposit 
in the Defence Fund. Petrol, cement and steel 
should be rationed and what is more, the Rs. 
100 and Rs. 1,000 currency notes should be 
demonetised, because there are large hordes 
of such currency notes in lockers. All these 
should be demonetised. This is what the 
British did at the time of the Second World 
War. They demonetised all Rs. 100 notes and 
above. 

Next, I would like to take one or two 
minutes to submit a few suggestions about the 
military measures that we should take now. 
We are told that in Tibet the Chinese are 
building up their missile bases. We would also 
need to have anti-missile missiles. Perhaps we 
would need more air power also, because we 
cannot depend on the treacherous enemy and 
argue that because he has not yet used his air 
force, he will not use it in future too. If the 
war go?s on, it will become a total war and, 
therefore, we ought, from now, to build up our 
air power. We cannot pay for whatever we 
want to have from abroad and, therefore, I 
would suggest most respectfully to the hon. 
the Home Minister that we should take arms 
on the basis of lend-lease. Even Russia did it 
and there is absolutely no political 
commitment involved in this. The American 
Ambassador, Mr. Galbraith, has very wisely 
stated that India is not going to be committed 
by any kind of assistance that she may ask. 
But I must give a warning here, that even the 
Western powers will go with us only to an 
extent, not because they do not want to, but 
because they have other commitments also. 
Therefore, we have to build almost everything 
that we need, in our own country. And for this 
we would request and implore the Western 
powers to help us as much as is in their 
capacity and power, to 
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[Dr. Gopal Singh.] 
build our military    apparatus within our own 
country. 

One last word about our generals and 
Pakistan. We name our generals too often. It is 
never done, especially in a war emergency. 
But I have here a newspaper called "Current" 
m which it is given: "Kaul is out of NEFA" 
"Maneckshaw to take over." and so on. 
Similarly, there was a mention in another daily 
that Gen. Chaudhury was taking over the East-
ern Command; then, this was denied. Now, 
this kind of silly effusions in the press should 
not be allowed. It demoralises the generals, the 
officers and the men. The Government is 
asked: "To fight the war, why not bring in the 
old generals?" I say the responsibility for our 
unpreparedness, if any, in which we are caught 
is as much the responsibility of the old 
veterans who have retired. Why should we get 
them now? Should they be put in command so 
that they can play their politics and create 
more confusion? Once again, I plead we 
should not mention our generals by name. We 
should not discuss them in public, because the 
morale of not only the generals, and officers 
and of the men, but of the whole country is at 
stake, and such newspapers as indulge in this 
type of gossip should have their mouth shut 
and if the Home Minister has taken powers 
under the Defence of India Rules, here then is 
a fit case where he should use them. He should 
shut the mouth of some of the newspapers 
which are printing the names of generals, 
'demolishing' them, boosting them and which 
are playing with fire when the whole country's 
future is at stake. 

Now, one word about Pakistan and I shall 
have ended. We have been told that we should 
immediately enter into a bargain with 
Pakistan and end our troubles with her so that 
our land frontier which is probably 8,000 
miles is left to the mercies of Pakistan, so that 
we pull out our forces from there and  put 
them  on  the borders    with 

China and wage war with China irrespective 
of what happens on our borders with Pakistan. 
I am very hopeful that General Ayub Khan 
who is a Pathan and who is a soldier who has 
fought in this country alongside his brother 
officers in the Indian Army would take no 
risks and would restrain whatever sentiment 
there is against India among the extremists in 
Pakistan. He should know that at the time of 
stress, any concessions under duress that he 
expects from us would not be worth the paper 
on which they are written. If this Government 
surrenders Kashmir or a part of Kashmir for 
an unsure gain in Ladakh, then I think the 
bargain would not be worth striking. Our 
people will repudiate it. However, I depend 
upon the goodwill of Pakistanis and Pakistan's 
Present who is a great army general and 
implore them not to take advantage of the 
trouble which we. are facing, because this is a 
trouble which today is ours and tomorrow will 
be theirs. 

Thank you very much. 

SHRI B. D. KHOBARAGADE 
(Maharashtra): Madam Deputy Chairman, I 
support the Resolutions moved by the hon. the 
Home Minister. Before I deal with the 
relevant points, I would like to pay my 
humble tribute and homage to those brave and 
valiant, soldiers who have sacrificed their life 
for defending their motherland. 

At last the Government have resolved and 
determined to fight and to expel the Chinese 
people who have perpetrated naked and open 
aggression against our country. This is not the 
time for recrimination or for apportioning 
blame. On the contrary, every citizen of this 
country should stand behind the Government 
and should declare his unequivocal support to 
any action that the Government might take for 
expelling the Chinese aggressors. On behalf 
of the Republican Party, I want to extend the 
wholehearted support of our Partv and we will 
do everything that is possible for us t'o regain 
the terri- 
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tory which has been captured by force by 
China. On this occasion, i feel great pride that 
Mahar and Mara-tha battalions are at this 
moment fighting bravely on the border of 
NEFA and sacrificing their lives. 

Madam, just now Mr. Dahyabhai Patel 
raised a controversy. He says that there are still 
some more Ministers in the Cabinet who 
should not be allowed to continue there. 
Perhaps he was leaning some other pro-
gressive Ministers in the Cabinet. I may point 
out to him that there are other people in this 
country also who demand that there should not 
be any Ministers who belong to the reactiDn-
ary group or who want to safeguard the 
interests of capitalist people. There are. we 
know, people who do not like that Morarjibhai 
should continue in the Cabinet. At this 
juncture the question is, should we raise such 
controversies now? Is this the time to say that 
we do not want progressive Ministers or we do 
not want reactionary and capitalist Ministers 
in the Cabinet? I must point out to the House 
that we do not support Mr. Menon, we d'o not 
support Mr. Morarji Desai but We support, the 
nation supports, Pandit Jawaharlal Nehru, the 
Prime Minister and his Government. 

Madam, we had said long before that 
effective steps must be taken to remove the 
Chinese aggressors from this land. Even 
during the last debate in this House on 22nd 
August 1962 I had raised this question. I had 
urged the hon. Prime Minister to get military 
equipment from friendly nations because I 
thought that unless and until we strengthened 
our defences, unless and until we were 
militarily strong, it would not be possible to 
resist the Chinese aggression, it would be 
much more difficult to expel them from our 
territory. I will just read out whut the hon. 
Prime Minister stated in reply. He said: 

"They may send us some equipment,  maybe  
some  aircraft,  if we 846 RS.—3. 

are prepared to accept it. And the cost we 
pay for it, not in money but in other ways, 
will be far greater than its possible value. I 
am looking at it purely from the practical 
point of view, and the cost of it will be far 
greater, and it will weaken us ultimately, 
weaken us actually in fighting on the 
frontier, apart from 'other ways." 

That was the point of view of tiie Prime 
Minister that if we accepted military 
equipment from foreign countries it would 
weaken our defences at the frontier and not 
strengthen them. I would refer to another 
portion in his speech where he said; 

"It is not that we get a few guns or a few 
aircraft from another country and we 
defend our country. What happens if those 
aircraft are destroyed, or do not fly? Then 
we are helpless. We have nothing to fall 
back upon." 

So, when I urged that we should get military 
equipment from foreign powers he tried to 
ridicule the idea by suggesting that the aircraft 
might be out of order and then we would have 
nothing to fall back upon. Ultimately, when 
there was massive aggression by China there 
was no other alternative but to get military 
equipment from whatever source we could 
get. I am sorry to say that even when there 
was this massive invasion by China our 
Government required five days to take a 
decision as to whether we should take aid 
from Western countries or not. Was thit the 
time to think? Have we not allowed China to 
make progress during these five days which 
we required for taking that decision? 
However, the Western countries are willing 
and ready to give every sort of help to fight 
the Chinese. Therefore, we must 
wholeheartedly, without any reservation, 
thank all the Western powers, particularly 
U.S.A. and U.K., who have come to our 
rescue in the very difficult time which the 
country is facing today.   Madam, the 
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not attach    any strings; they do not want India 
to get involved in the cold war; they do not 
ask:   our Government to give up the policy  of 
non-alignment    and therefore we should try to 
get their support and help.   It is riot a question 
whether we should have only small weapons 
or medium size weapons or large weapons; it 
is a question how effectively  and   at  the   
earliest  we     can expel them from our 
territory.      For expelling the  Chinese     
forces  if we require large size weapons we 
should get  them  from  whatever  source  we 
could get them, from    America, from U.K., 
from France or from Canada or even from 
Russia.   But I doubt whether  in   the  present   
context,   in  the present circumstances, we can 
get any military     equipment     from     
Russia. Because  we  know   we      reached   
an agreement  to  get  MIG  planes  from 
Russia but in spite of the agreement the MIG 
planes have not been delivered s'o far.   
Therefore, we    doubt whether we can get     
any    military equipment from Russia.   But 
there are many countries in the world    which 
are willing to help us and, therefore, if  we  
want   to  remove  the   Chinese from this land 
we must get weapons from whatever source we 
can get.   I am sorry to say that sometimes con-
fusion is created in the minds of the pe'ople.   
Only a few days back Pandit Jawaharlal Nehru 
had given a clarion call.   Emergency  was   
declared. And again we heard that he    wanted 
to have   negotiations   if      the      Chinere 
forces  withdrew to  the  line     which they had 
occupied on the 8th September.   I fail to 
undex'stand this attitude of our hon. Prime 
Minister. There is unanimous   support  in  the     
country. Even the DMK, which was    fighting 
for separation, for partition of    this country,  
has   declared   its   unequivocal support.   
They have said that they will  suspend all their    
activities  till the Chinese forces are removed 
from this country.   Everybody is prepared and  
willing  to  sacrifice     everything that one has  
got.   They are    giving gold and money.   
They are   donating 

their blo'od.   They are sacrificing their lives.   
We have never experienced in the last fifteen 
years of our independence such tremendous 
support, such tremendous  unity  and 
integration  as we  are noticing today in this 
country.   Not only that.   We are    getting 
international  support  also.   Only  the other  
day the  hon.  Home     Minister told us that we 
have got the support of forty nations.   So far 
we could not get the  support  of neutral m 
nations. But only about four br five days back 
we have read in the papers that President 
Nasser had advised China    to accept the 
conditions of the     Indian Government.   
Otherwise,   they  would start propaganda  
against  China.    He had  warned China.   Not  
only     that. When    President    Nasser  made  
that statement, there were leading articles 
published  in  the     Egyptian     papers 
warning  China   that   China      should accept  
the   conditions   laid   down   by the  
Government  of  India.   It mean* that  there  
has  been  s'ome     sort   of change   in the 
attitude and policy of the neutral nations    
also.   Therefore, today we are getting the 
wholehearted  support   of  the  neutral     
nations. Barring  a  few  Communist countries, 
we have everybody's    support.    With internal   
support   and      international support, I do not 
understand why we should again use the 
language of negotiation and talk.      There 
should not be any language of negotiation at 
all. We will negotiate, we will    talk, we will  
discuss the question of    border dispute by 
sitting round a table only when the last 
Chinese is removed from our territory, from 
our soil.    Even if there is one single Chinese 
soldier in our territory, we will not sit round a 
tafre and discuss the border dispute with 
China.   The first thing is that we must remove 
the Chinese people from our territory.   Then, 
we can settle our dispute. 

I will refer to one or two other problems. 
One is that we should try to have good 
relations with Pakistan. Of course, we 
cannot say definitely in the context of the 
present    political 



 
situation whether we shall be able to get the 
support of Pakistan.   But   no doubt  we  
should  try  to  solve  this problem, to settle 
the disputes which are involving Pakistan and 
India and which are the causes of the strained 
relations.   I remember about five or six 
months back     even  the  Foreign Minister   
of   Pakistan  had     declared that he Would 
like to    discuss    the question of Kashmir 
with the Indian Government.      I      
remember      even General Ayub Khan was 
prepared to have some  sort of  compromise.    
We were  given  to  understand     in     this 
House by Pandit Jawaharlal    Nehru that he 
w'ould like to solve this problem peacefully.   
Also, we were given to understand that our    
Government was willing to allow Pakistan to 
have the  territory   of  Kashmir     which  is 
being occupied by Pakistan and that the 
Government     of    India     should occupy  
the  territory     which     is   at present under 
the occupation of India. If we can solve the    
Kashmir isiue on that basis, I think we can    
have friendly relations  with     Pakistan.    I 
do not think Pakistan  will  be  able to attack 
India either on the Kashmir front  or on  the     
eastern    front    at Tripura.   We know that 
Pakistan had tried to have some sort 'of 
skirmishes on the Tripura border, but because 
of the United     States     of     America's 
pressure, I think, she desisted    from that 
attack.   I do not think that in the future also 
Pakistan will be able to attack India, because 
if she attacks us, then it will be difficult for 
Pakistan to fight  against  India  on     two 
frontiers i.e. East and West Pakistan, due to 
vast distance    between    two parts.    That  
will not     be     possible. Until and unless 
there is some chance for  Pakistan     forces  to   
join  hands with Chinese  forces,  I  do  not 
think Pakistan will ever be able to attack 
India.   Only today in the morning we have 
read in the papers that Chinese forces at 
present are making attacks on Walong,  and     
if    they     capture Walong, then it will 
prtvide access to the  Digboi   oilfields.   Not   
only  that. It has been reported in    the papers 
today that it may open for them way 

to Nagaland also. In that case there is a 
possibility that they may join hands with the 
Naga rebels. That has been reported in today's 
papers. In some way if Chinese forces run 
down to Pakistan border they will be abie to 
support Pakistan in defending Eastern Sector 
and, in that case, Pakistan may launch attack 
on Kashmir. I hope fervently that such an 
eventuality will not happen. However, we 
should try to settle our disputes with 
PakistA*. 

Then, we should try to check the 
reactionary forces that are being encouraged 
in this country in the name of war. Everybody 
is making sacrifice for preserving the 
independence and integrity of this country. 
But in the name of war no person should be 
allowed to exploit the situation. The 
blackmarketers, hoarders and profiteers must 
be dealt with severely. There is a section of 
reactionary pe'ople who are not satisfied with 
the resignation of Mr. Krishna Menon. They 
want Padit Jawaharlal Nehru also to resign 
from the Prime Ministership. Madam, I was 
rather moved by the speech made by Mr. 
Vajpayee, but I will just refer to the last issue 
of the "Organiser", which is supposed to be 
the paper of Jan Sangh. Not only one, there 
are three or four articles in which the m'ost 
scandalous propaganda has been made, not 
against Mr. Krishna Menon but Pandit 
Jawaharlal Nehru. I will quote only one 
sentence from this article. It says regarding the 
policy of the Prime Minister: 

"His own decadent philosophy and 
anaemic politics have debased the 
descendants of Bharata, Chanakya, Buddha 
and Asoka, and Sivaji and a galaxy of 
gallant and blameless spirits to a flock of 
contemptible sheep. To transform them 
into the lions that their ancestors were, we 
want a leader other than—NEHRU". 

This is what is mentioned in the Jan Sangh 
paper. At this moment we will not  tolerate,   
the     nation     will   not 
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tolerate, any action that would undermine the 
importance, influence, prestige and p'osition of 
the Prime Minister. To take out this country from 
the debacle that it has been placed into, the nation 
requires today, a man like Shri Jawaharlal Nehru 
in whom the nation has got full faith and 
confidence. If there are any reactionary forces in 
this country who want to remove a progressive 
man like Pandit Jawaharlal Nehru from the helm 
of affairs of this country, we will not tolerate it. 

Ultimately, I will refer to only one point and 
that is We should have conscription. Of course, so 
far as bur people are concerned, our Republican 
Party followers are concerned, I have already 
mentioned that our Mahar Battalion is fighting On 
the front valiantly. Not only that. At all the 
centres, whether it is Nagpur or Bombay, all those 
Mahar people are enrolling themselves in the 
military. We are always prepared t'o sacrifice our 
life in the cause of the nation. We have sacrificed 
our life while defending Kashmir. We shall 
always do it. But if we want to regain our lost 
territory as early as possible, it is essential that we 
must have conscription also. 

In the present circumstances, I do not think it does 
any good to have diplomatic relations with China. 
We are engaged in war. The Prime Minister has 
rightly said that it was a massive invasion 
perpetrated by China. I do not understand what sort 
of benefit or advantage we can get by continuing our 
diplomatic relations with China. In the present 
circumstances, it will only help them to carry on 
their espionage activities. Therefore, Madam, I urge 
that our diplomatic relations with China should be 
severed. 

I thank Mr. A. D. Mani for taking up the cause of 
the political parties in this country. In hij speech 
yesterday he referred to the National Defence 
Council and said that no other 

political party was represented on it. Mr. 
Vajpayee also has pointed out that there are 
many other patriotic statesmen in this 
country who should have been associated 
with the National Defence Council. Past 
experience shows that the peopie have not 
been taken into confidence by Government 
regarding our defence preparations. We 
have often been told in this House itself that 
our defence position on NEFA front was 
extremely strong. But when the Chinese 
forces invaded our territory, we found that 
all our defences were very weak. Therefore, 
it is essential that other persons also should 
be taken on National Defence Council so as 
to create more confidence in the masses. 
Therefore, I think that representatives of 
important political parties should be 
associated with the National Defence 
Council. 
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SHRI SANTOSH KUMAR BASU (West 
Bengal): Madam Deputy Chairman, never before 
has this House met under the shadow at a 
threatening calamity such as has been posed by a 
powerful neighbour who, under the mask of 
pretended friendship, had been building up for 
several years a mighty war machine near our 
northern border. White constantly professing her 
peaceful intentions, China has mounted surprise 
attacks of a most massive character and has 
gained some initial success in the face of brave 
and sustained resistance by our troops. Our troops 
have been overwhelmed by the Chinese hordes 
coming in wave after wave from their higher 
positions behind mountain barriers. It seems 
probable that they counted upon our comparative 
lack of preparedness, military readiness, in that 
region, not only for seizing our territory but also 
to create confusion and terror in the people of this 
country. If so, subsequent events have shown 
how completely they have misjudged the stuff 
that our people are made of, their wonderful unity 
in the face of a common danger, their passionate 
devotion to their newly won freedom, their grim 
determination and spirit of sacrifice to recover 
and protect every inch of their territory from a 
wild, defiant, ruthless  and treacherous  aggressor. 

The lessons of the last war have clearly proved 
that such initial successes and surprise attacks 
bear no ultimate fruit in the long run. This was 
established in America and also in Britain.   Pearl 
Harbour   took   the 



 

entire American continent by surprise, and the 
debacle at Dunkrik could not succeed in 
creating that terror and that sense of 
frustration in the British people which eviden-
tly Hitlerite Germany aimed at. On the other 
hand the people of Britain stood full scale face 
to face against this danger. I may recall the 
well-known observation by Nepoleon 
Bonaparte that the people of Britain lose all 
their battles except the last to show that these 
initial successes achieved by our enemy on the 
Himalayan border should not for any reason 
whatsoever depress this country at all. The 
result has been just the opposite. The people 
have been stirred out of their complacency 
and sense of unpreparedness, and that is the 
answer which India is giving today to the 
treacherous, ruthless aggressor. 

Now, Madam, while our armed forces, our 
brave j a wans and their devoted officers are 
fighting our battles against heavy odds, we in 
this Parliament can only discharge our duty by 
standing solidly behind them and our 
Government in the fulfilment of the task 
which the nation has assigned to them. It will 
be an act of betrayal of our armed forces if we, 
by our word or deed, sow the seeds of discord 
and dissension which we must be very careful 
that none of us in this House would be 
permitted to do. The home front must be kept 
as strong and invincible as the fighting line far 
away in the Himalayas and we must be 
prepared to convert the entire country ranging 
from the Himalayas down to Cape Comorin 
into one solid mass which should be thrown 
against the enemy so that our forces can 
succeed in rescuing every inch of our land 
from his grip. The whole nation has responded 
to this mighty call with spontaneous unani-
mity. Let not political or personal ambitions or 
bickerings create any rift in this solidarity. Let 
not antisocial elements seek any advantage out 
of a national calamity. Unlike their 
predecessors, the present Defence of India 
Ordinance and the Rules dur- 

ing this emergency are not an imposition by 
an alien Government. They represent the 
unanimous desire of the entire people and 
have only focussed and concentrated the 
national will in a concrete form. Government 
is to be congratulated on the promptness and 
thoroughness with which they have come out 
with these essential measures in this national 
crisis. 

May I take this opportunity to refer in a few 
words to our other neighbour Pakistan. I have 
had occasion to come into contact, in another 
capacity, with Major-General Ayub Khan as 
he then was. I have a high regard for his 
practical commonsense and would appeal to 
his sense of realism to rise above narrow 
political considerations and make a broad 
statesmanlike assessment of the common 
danger ahead. The false cry of 'Pak-Chini 
Bhai Bhai' will go the same way as *Hindi-
Chini Bhai Bhai' which the Chinese are not 
ashamed to raise even when dealing mortal 
blows on our soldiers on the front. A seasoned 
soldier like President Ayub Khan will, I hope, 
not be misled by the overtures of China and 
allow his country to fall into the trap. Nothing 
can be a more dangerous illusion for Pakistan 
than to prefer the treacherous hand of China to 
the sincere desire for friendship repeatedly 
expressed by India. 

When I heard the Communist leader 
yesterday, I could trace in his speech the ring 
of the old Bengal revolutionary that Shri 
Bhupesh Gupta was. It was in that spirit that 
he championed the cause of India in hit 
speech yesterday. I hope his followers all over 
India and the members of the Communist 
Party would not hesitate to tread the same 
path that he chalked out in his speech 
yesterday. He has given a glorious account of 
what the Communist Party intends to do in 
this crisis. Well, I wish that his followers also 
did the same everywhere. 

He had put in a strong plea for softer 
treatment to all Communists in 
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[Shri Santosh Kumar Basu.] this country. A 
reference was made by Mr. Khandubhai Desai 
in his sp&ech this morning to some 
observations made by a Communist leader in 
Madras with reference to defence production 
and essential production in our industrial 
establishments in this country during this 
emergency. Mr. Bhu-pesh Gupta stood up and 
tried to correct him. I will take this opportu-
nity of quoting from a newspaper report 
which has also given a verbatim reproduction 
of the relevant portion of the speech of that 
Communist leader in Madras.    He said: 

"It would be at the peril of the nation 
that Communists who controlled millions 
of workers in factories, vital to defence 
production, are excluded from the defence 
committees." 

SHRI AKBAB ALI KHAN: I think Mr. 
Vajpayee read it. 

SHRI A. B. VAJPAYEE:  Yes. 

SHRI SANTOSH KUMAR BASU: I was 
not present here. This is the language of threat 
out and out which has been held out in 
connection with defence production. And if 
that be the spirit in which the Communists 
should approach this problem and this danger, 
then the Government would be perfectly 
justified in dealing with them with an iron 
hand, at least those among them who can 
entertain such feelings at this crisis. I can 
quite understand a desire to be associated in 
Defence Committees after they have shown 
their merit, their desire in a practical form to 
assist Government in this crisis in the matter 
of defence production. But right from the 
very beginning to strike a note of threat of 
this character, I suppose, would be quite 
enough to justify the Government to take 
action, and I am glad the Government has 
beer taking action. 

SHRIMATI C. AMMANNA RAJA (Andhra 
Pradesh): No. 

SHRI SANTOSH KUMAR BASU: The 
Government has been taking action in 
particular cases where they feel that such 
action is justified and desirable. I cannot join 
my friend in making a general appeal to the 
Government on behalf of the Communists to 
desist from adopting any such course. There 
are instances which call for such action and 
there can. be no difference of opinion with 
regard to  that. 

Now, Madam, I do not desire to prolong 
my observations. I can only say that the way 
in which the Indian people have responded to 
this call and to this requirement of the 
situation have strengthened us from every 
point of view, and it is our bounden duty in 
this House to strengthen the national will by 
solidarity, unity and unanimity in extending 
our support to the Government, to the great 
national leader, Shri Jawaharlal Nehru, 
without any hesitation and without any 
difficulty or doubt or even raising those 
questions of the past which were favourite 
themes on which some of the Opposition 
Members have tried to thrive in this House. I 
was pained to listen to the speech that my 
esteemed friend, Mr. Dahyabhai Patel, made 
this morning in this House. Well, I should 
have thought, had it not come from him but 
from any other person that it was an 
unabashed attempt to destroy all our efforts in 
the direction of attaining solidarity, unity and 
unanimity in this country. I am not charging 
him with any such attempt or any such 
motive, but coming from any other quarter I 
would not have hesitated in characterising 
such a speech with  that label. 

With these words I support the Re-
solutions. 

SHRI NAFISUL HASAN (Uttar Pradesh) : 
Madam Deputy Chairman, I rise to support 
the two Resolutions so ably moved by the 
hon. Home Minister. I must at the very outset 
pay my tribute to the bravery of our jawans 
and the    sacrifices    they are 
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making at the battlefield.   The present crisis 
reminds me of the visit of Mr. Chou En-lai 
when he raised the slogan here of "Chini-Hindi 
Bhai Bhai" and all of us responded to it with a 
sincerity which we have always been used to.    
Looking back we find  that all this was  a  
deception.      We    had treated them as 
brothers even earlier. We had recognised and 
accepted their new  Government.    We had  
espoused their cause in the World 
Organisation for their    membership;    and    
shortly after this a slogan was raised, steal-
thily,  some portion  of our    territory was  
occupied.    When  attention    was drawn to 
the Chinese maps, we were told that they were 
very old maps and that we need not bother.   
As a peaceful country    we    corresponded    
with them, had negotiations with them, little  
suspecting  that   this  small  boundary dispute 
would result in an inva. sion of our country.   
But it seems that all  this  time  they  were  
making  all possible  military  preparations   to  
invade us.    Looking in    retrospect    it seems 
that we trusted them too much. I am reminded 
of two lines of Ghalib. Of course, they are 
written in the present tense but I will change 
the tense when reading them,   I think I recited 
these lines on the last occasion  also. They are: 

 
We were absolutely misled. We should have 
known that their ideals were, what was their 
way of working, what were their ideas of 
penetration and what havoc could these 
people play. But, as I said, we trusted them 
too much. 

 
Anyway, we have now realised that we were 
absolutely misled. We were trusting them too 
much and we had committed a mistake. The 
present dark clouds which we are facing have 
however a silver lining.    Till yester- 

tr J  Hindi  transliteration. 

day, we were disintegrated; we were keen to 
have our country integrated; we were divided 
on the basis of caste, religion, language, etc.    
But what do we find today?    This external 
enemy has killed our internal enemy. Today 
we stand united as one man, the whole nation 
as one man behind the Prime Minister.   That   
is   the   greatest   gain that we have had as a 
result of this Chinese     aggression.   
Naturally,     we are up against a very big 
country with a huge population which has    
made preparations for war for a long time and 
we have to make    very    great preparations to 
meet them.    The war is going to be    a    
long-drawn    one. With the support of the 
whole nation and with perseverance and    
courage and  also  fully   knowing     that     
our cause is just, I am sure we will be able  to 
face  the     enemy     and  the triumph will be 
ours. 

We  have  been  getting  both moral and 
material help from a very large number 'of 
countries.   It was suggested that our policy of 
non-alignment should not be affected.   There 
are also some persons in the country who are 
of the  opinion that we should align ourselves 
with a particular    bloc.    I think I must agree 
with Mr. Vajpayee when he says that the 
requirements of the  country  are  foremost     
at     the present moment and even if we have 
to align ourselves with any particular bloc,   
we   should   not   hesitate   to   do so, if 
otherwise we cannot save  our country.   But 
that is not the    position.   We  are  getting     
aid     without any  strings.   And  what     does     
the policy of non-alignment    means?    It only 
means that we should not subordinate our 
freedom to any country; it should be 'open to 
us and we should be free to take any attitude 
that we like in respect of any    international 
matter.   There    are    no    conditions being 
imposed by the countries helping  us  and     
friendly     countries  are coming forward to 
help us.   We are very grateful to them  and    
we will never forget  their kindness; we will 
continue to be grateful to them.   But that does  
not mean     that we    will attach ourselves to a 
particular bloc 
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[Shri Nafisul Hasan.] and agree to 
whatever the countries helping us say. We 
have throughout this period been advising 
all the countries in the interest of peace and 
in favour of peace. We will continue to do 
so even after this. The question of giving up 
our policy of non-alignment does not at all 
arise. 

Then it has been stated that our Plan, the 
Third Plan, will go. Naturally, there shall 
have to be some modification in the Plan but 
in order to fight the war also we have got to 
have a Plan and not only have we got to 
fight the war in the battle-field but by 
development of our industries. We have got 
to develop our agricultural production. 
Therefore, the Plan will be there. It is only a 
question of priorities which may have to be 
changed but our success in the war will be 
the first objective and to attain that objective 
everything that is necessary to be done will 
have to be given top priority. 

Something has been said about nego-
tiations.   We have essentially been a peaceful 
country.   I think the position which we enjoy 
today and occupy today in the world is 
because of that attitude  of ours.   Although  
we     are not prepared to negotiate under any 
circumstances or     conditions     which affect 
our national honour and dignity, still the doior 
for a    settlement will always remain  open.   
But    we    can agree only on the terms    
which are honourable to us and in no way are 
we going to concede any    portion of our  
territory.   What is the claim of China as far  
as the land     south  of the Macmahon Line is 
concerned?    It has been  admitted that for the 
last fifty years at least this has been the 
boundary between the two countries. The only 
contention on their part is that this was fixed 
when the British were ruling this country.   
But at that time there was another 
Government in China and this boundary was 
fixed as a result of an agreement   between the 
then Indian Government and the then Chinese 
Government.   How can 

the present Chinese Government claim 
anything from us? It was recognised 
that all the territory to the south ot 
the MacMahon Line had been in our 
possession. And we also know that 
the Chinese were signatories to the 
principles of Panchsheel. The mere 
fact that they crossed that Line was 
an act of aggression on their part. 
If they had any grievance, they should 
have first negotiated with us. But 
the fact remains that before having 
any kind of negotiations with us they 
stealthily came in and tried to occupy 
that territory. There is therefore 
absolutely no justification whatsoever 
for the action that they have taken. 
As I said, it is going to be a grim 
and long-drawn struggle. We have 
got to practise austerity and all our 
resources have got to be mobilised and 
particularly we have got to take care 
that no profiteering is allowed to take 
place during        this period. 

Some-reference has been made by an hon.   
Member   just   now      that      we should come 
to terms with Pakistan. Of course that is the 
desire of all of us.    Nobody in India wants to 
go on quarreling with Pakistan but what is the    
present   condition?     The   other day I saw an 
editorial in the 'Pakistan Times'.    It was  dated 
the     6th of  this  very  month.    What was  the 
suggestion  made  in  that     editorial? They 
were opposed to the supply of arms to us.     
They said:    'Our association  with   the   West   
and   America ha3 been of no benefit  to us.    
It  >s just putting us in a wrong position end 
we must now find other friend;". This   clearly   
hints   that   they   should go to join the 
Chinese and the Soviet Union.    That  was  the  
editorial.       1 do not know what is the opinion 
of General Ayub Khan about it, but this might 
be another line.    There is one line  very  well  
known  to  those who know   Urdu: 
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When I went nearer his own friend, he has 
forsaken that friend. Why talk about these 
things? We are keen t0 settle everything with 
them but are they also keen? With the^e 
words I support the two Resolutions. 

PROF. M. B. LAL (Uttar Pradesh): Madam 
Deputy Chairman, a nation is born of 
common sufferings and com mon aspirations. 
National unity it-forged by emotional upsurge 
of the people for the protection of the in-
tegrity, honour and vital interests of the 
motherland. National unity is cemented by 
the blood of martyrs. It is judged by the 
response to the chanllenge shown by a 
powerful enemy. 

Recent events have judged us The people's 
response to the challenge has amply proved 
that we are a nation. The national upsurge 
generated by aggression has embraced sll 
sections of the community, transcending all 
classes, castes, creeds and linguistic and 
regional loyalties. Even those that were 
talking of the partition of the country are one 
with the rest of the nation in the fight against  
the  aggression. 

[THE VICE-CHAIHMAN   (SHRI M.  Gov-INDA 
REDDY)  in the Chair] 

Tnat indicates that though there art certain 
tensions and every nation in the world suffers 
from certain tensions, our loyalty to our 
motherland transcends all tensions and we are 
today as good a nation as any other country in 
the world. 

For long our Communist friends told Us 
that a socialist country can commit no 
aggression and because Communist China is 
socialist, therefore, Communist China can 
never commit aggression. They failed to 
recognise that Communist China was 
aggressive, even when Communist China 
deprived Tibet of its freedom and occupied a 
large part of the Indian territory. In this very 
House they denounced tha Western Powers 
for their sins against Algeria, agamst Cuba 
and so on but fhey had no word to say about 
the aggression commit- 

ted by Communist China against Tibet. They 
had no word to say against the expansionist 
policy of China with respect to South-East 
Asia. 

Today when nearly 50,000 square miles of 
our territory are occupied by China, the 
Central Committee of the Communist Party, 
by two-thirds majority, aecides that China has 
committed aggression, May I ask them 
whether they recognise that even a socialist 
country can commit an aggression and that a 
socialist country has Committed an 
aggression? If they do so recognise, are they 
prepared to propose to the community of 
international Communist that because 
Communist China has committed aggression 
which is against the basic principles of 
Communism, Communist China be excluded 
from ihe community of international Com-
munism? If they fail in this attempt, are they 
prepared to leave the community of 
international Communism? 

I have no doubt in my mind that India will 
never be prepared to accept the Indian 
Communist Party as a national party so long 
as that Party remains a part of international 
Communism a section 'of which has 
committed aggression against India. I feel that 
if the Communist Party wishes to be 
recognised as a national democratic party, it 
will have tour dergo a great transformation. It 
will have to modify the Constitution which it 
has passed at its Amrit^ar Congress. It will 
have to renounce its loyalty to international 
Communism none of whose members has 
extended to us even moral support in our 
crisis. It will have to renounce its faith in the 
doctrine of the fatherland cf international 
proletariat. It will have to renounce its faith in 
the idea of people's democracy which u a 
camouflage and pseudo-name of Communist 
dictatorship. If the Party is not prepared to do 
so, it may claim to be a national party a 
democratic party fighting against reaction, the 
country will not be prepared to accept them as 
a national and democratic party. 
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[Prof. M. B. Lai.] 
Shri P. N. Sapru may not be prepared to 

fight for the freedom of the country in 
associatior with, such forces which he 
considers to be reactionary. But I feel that a 
nation makes no distinction, between pro-
gressive and reactionary so far gs the 
question of freedom of the country is 
concerned. We will fight as one united nation 
and we will settle with the reactionaries after 
we aie able to preserve our own freedom in 
this country 

We reiterate our faith in the policy of non-
alignment. But when we do so, we wish to 
point out that in the light of our experience, 
past and present, we will have to re-orient our 
policy of non-alignment. The policy of non-
alignment does not deny to us, Sir, the right of 
military aid fnm. others for the protection of 
our motherland, just as the policy of non-
alignment did not deny to us the right of 
financial aid from different parts of the world. 
Of course, just an in the case of financial aid, 
his •military aid also mu-'t be withcut strings. 
If countries that claim to belong to the camp 
of world peace, for reasons of their own, 
hesitate or refuse to extend their aid to us in 
time and if the Western powers offended the 
necessary aid to L-S, v/i',1 we be justified in 
'knying ourselves that aid or in saying that we 
will only buy military equipment on, a com-
mercial basis, and if we have no money to buy 
things just now, we will fight the Chinese 
unarmed? Only fools can charge us with 
reversing the policy of non-alignment because 
we have accepted military aid from Western 
powers when oth^r powers did not think it 
proper to extend that aid to us. 

Sir, to us Communist China which has 
launched this attack on us is the greatest 
imperialist power and to us all those who 
support Communist China are pro-
imperialists. Sir, we can have no truck with 
Communist China so long as they do not 
revoke their course. We are bound to de-
nounce it as a great menace to world 

peace as long as it pursues a policy of 
expansionism in the South-east Asia. As a 
student of political science and of 
international affairs for more than thirtyfive 
years, 1 have no doubt in my mind that not 
only for years, perhaps for generations, 
Communist China will be a menace to our 
peace and freedom and if we wish to live in 
this world as a free nation, we will have to 
prepare ourselves for facing that menace 
under all circumstances and at all times. 

I am sorry, Sir, I am constrained to observe 
that our Government and our Prime Minister 
failed to face realities firmly and chose to live 
in a dreamland for years, pursued a policy of 
appeasement, uis-a-vis Communist China, and 
allowed both India and Tibet to be preys to 
Chinese perfidy and evil designs. That their 
China policy has proved a miserable failure 
can hardly be denied. Our Prime Minister the 
other day said that he is now facing the real 
world. Let us hope that n'ow he will face 
realities firmly and will not allow himself to 
be deluded by a few soft words here and there 
by some statesmen or others. 

We must admit that because of the 
vacillations of our Government and the Prime 
Minister, we failed to communicate to the 
world India's case against China properly and 
allowed China to hoodwink and confuse a 
great majority of the non-aligned powers. 
What do we see today? Forty powers are with 
us; but most of them are those whom we 
constantly, abused and rebuked for the last ten 
years. And none for whom we fought, with 
whom we worked for ten years chose even to 
shed a tear at this time when we are facing this 
crisis. I am sorry to say that just like our China 
policy, our diplomacy has miserably failed. 
We are today receiving help from other 
powers, not on account of our diplomacy but 
because We are a democracy and  certain     
democratic     countries 
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deem it their duty to preserve democracy 
against communist totalitarianism. 

Sir,   the  mti'on's   reaction   to     the 
challenge is undoubtedly    magnificent and 
we have reason to be proud of it. But has the 
Government    done anything in this matter?    
Is it not a fact that on the plea of avoiding    
panic, the Government did not    inform the 
public about the situation, did not try to  
cultivate the spirit of    resistance among the 
people?   If the people have exhibited the 
spirit of    resistance at this  juncture,   it  is     
not  because of the   efforts   of the  
Government,   but in spite of the efforts of the 
Government   because  of   the   inherent   
love that we have for freedom and for our 
motherland.   Even today, Sir, we see the All 
India Radio    giving    certain bare  items  of 
news,  mostly news  of reverses.   We   are  
not  trying  to> inform the people of the 
human values that are at stake.   "We    
should    tell the  people  that  we  are  
fighting for democracy,  for     the  right     of  
self-determination,    that    in    Communist 
China there is no liberty for the people, that 
the people have no right of self-
determination!   and!     self-expression, that 
they are slaves of a junta of a party. 

For long, Parliament was told that we 
were prepared at least in NEFA. But today 
we are told that we were not prepared there 
and therefore, we suffered reverses. Do! we 
not owe an apology to the nation? Under the 
system of parliamentary democracy, 
Parliament is responsible for the failure of 
the Government wh'.ch is responsible to 
Parliament. It is true that some of us sounded 
a note of warning but by and large 
Parliament supported the policy pursued by 
the Government and therefore Parliament is 
as much responsible for the unpreparedness 
on the part of the Government as the 
Government is and the representatives of the 
people owe an apology to the nation for their 
failure to discharge the duty entrusted to 
them by the people. 

The Prime Minister, Sir, reminds us of the 
courage and determination of the British 
people after Dunkirk in the Second World 
War. May we hope that our Prime Minister 
will play the role of Mr. Churchill, will refuse 
to think of negotiations, will repudiate the 
policy of appeasement and will fight to the end 
for the preservation of the honour and integrity 
of the nation. So far as the nation is concerned, 
the national upsurge has indicated that the 
nation is prepared to back him. They are pre-
pared to back! the Government not because it 
is headed by this man or that man but because 
they1, know that n0 war can be fought except 
through the Government and whatever 
Government is in power must be supported by 
the people. 

In the end, Sir, I wish to say that the people 
of India are fully conscious that this 
undeclared war is different from the first two 
world wars. They know that unlike the first 
two world wars the present war is a national 
struggle, is a people's war. When the Indian 
Communists declared in 1942 that the second 
world war was a people's war, our leader, 
Acharya Narendra Deo repudiated it saying 
that the second world war would continue to 
be an imperialist war until India attained 
freedom. Today India has attained freedom 
and the war with which we are faced today is 
a people's war and the people do realise it. 

While the people are sorry that the 
Government failed to do what they could for 
the protection of the vital interests of the 
nation and smart under certain grievances, 
they have extended their wholehearted 
support to the Government for the prosecution 
of the war. They have willed to undergo 
sufferings for the preservation of certain 
values associated with freedom and 
democracy. They refuse to stand any 
domination or dictation; they refuse to submit 
to an aggression, to be a satellite of any 
power,  to tolerate  the  imposition  of 
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any ideology and to be governed by a 
dictatorship. They want the Government to be 
responsive to their will under all circumstance 
and are determined to work out their own 
destiny in their own way according to their 
own will. 

It is the duty of the Government and of the 
Parliament to serve the nation loyally, to 
preserve inviolate the national honour and 
integrity, as well as democratic values and 
institutions, and to assure to the people social 
justice. 

I wish to point out that this is not an 
ordinary war. It is a people's war. Communist 
China has a certain ideology which is used to 
hoodwink a certain section of the community. 
In that sense the present struggle is also an 
ideological war. The drive towards equality, 
social and economic, must become a vital part 
of the defence effort. Only then can the pre-
sent enthusiasm of the people be sustained and 
the revolutionary challenge of the age can be 
met. It is not a question of equal sacrifices and 
sufferings; it is a question of marching 
towards equality in the midst of war. Then and 
then alone we can mobilise the support of the 
toiling masses of the country." 

H 
In the end, I beg to pay my homage to the 

martyrs who have laid down their lives in 
defending the honour and Integrity of our 
motherland and offer my respects to men and 
officers of our armed forces for their valiant 
struggle on various fronts. I need not say that 
my party j,s with the Government along with 
the rest of the country for the defence of our 
motherland. Our great leader, Shri Ganga 
Sharan Sinha, has assured the House of it 
yesterday and much before Shri Ganga Sharan 
Sinha spoke in the Rajya Sabha, we had begun 
to work for it. Let us march together to 
victory. That is our   wish. 

SHRI K. SANTHANAM (Madras): "Mr. 
Vice-Chairman, I rise to   support 

wholeheartedly the two Resolutions moved by 
the Home Minister. If I do not expatiate on 
Chinese aggression, the heroism of our 
soldiers, the magnificent response of the 
people, or the generous sympathy and 
assistance of disinterested foreign nations, it is 
not because I am less appreciative or grateful 
than any other Member of the House but only 
because I endorse every word of the first four 
paragraphs of the Resolution on China. The 
events of the past few weeks have been so 
tragic and the situation is so serious that we 
have to practise the utmost economy of every 
kind 

SHRI A. B. VAJPAYEE: Including words. 

SHRI K. SANTHANAM: I consider that 
economy of words is no less important than 
any other. I shall, therefore, confine my 
remarks to the last and operative paragraph 
which says: 

"With hope and faith, this House affirms 
the firm resolve of the *n-dian people to 
drive out the aggressor from the sacred soil 
of India, however long and hard the 
struggle may be." 

I hope it is a pledge and not a mere wish. If it 
is a pledge, it is essential that we should 
realise the real nature of the task before the 
country. 

I agree with Shri Ganga Sharan Sinha that this 
is not a fight for mere border adjustments. I do 
not agree with those who think that if we had 
agreed two or three years ago to give up some 
Dortion of Ladakh, we would have had peace 
on the frontier. The Chinese would have taken 
it and then put forward further claims. They 
are adopting the same tactics as Hitler used in 
relation to Austria, Czechoslovakia and 
Poland. I have no doubt that the Chinese are 
resolved to impose Communism by force on 
Asia. I would go even further and say that 
they are engaged in a struggle for the 
leadership of the Communist world. 



 

I was listening with great interest to the 
eloquent speech made yesterday by Shri 
Bhupesh Gupta. I expected that he would 
carry his arguments to their logical end and 
appeal to Soviet Russia and East European 
Communist countries to denounce China and 
come forward to help India with arms. He did 
not do so. I do not wish to embarrass him by 
speculating on the reasons which prevented 
him from doing so. I can understand his situa-
tion and I am content with such courage and 
patriotism as he has been able to summon to 
declare boldly against Chinese aggression. I 
wish to appeal to all the Communists in India 
to retire from active politics for the duration 
of the emergency as it is not possible for the 
country to trust them fully. 

It is also necessary for us to realise the 
embarrassing position in which Soviet Russia 
and other Communist countries which have 
been so far friendly to us find themselves. It is 
our duty not to say or do anything which wi1! 
increase their embarrassment. We should 
make the utmost effort to retain their goodwill 
and ensure at least 

their neutrality in the struggle. 3 P.M. 
But it is  altogether unrealistic 

to expect active assistance from them. 
We have to seek assistance :*rcm those 
democratic countries which (ire opposed to 
Communism and are convinced that forcible 
extension of Communism anywhere is a 
danger to democracy  everywhere. 

Though I support the last paragraph of the 
Resolution as it stands, I feel that it is not 
adequate., I do not agree that time is with us. 
We must drive out the aggressor in the year 
1963, then fortify the frontier and guard it 
indefinitely till the outlook and structure of 
Chinese Communism undergoes fundamental 
changes. If we allow the Chinese to fortify the 
position they have gained, the effort and 
sacrifice involved in driving them out will 
become increasingly difficult and heavy. So, I 
suggest that we should, 

without any hesitation, make the resolve that 
we shall drive out the Chinese in 1963. 

This involves mighty sacrifices. We have to 
create the necessary army divisions and equip 
them during the next three or four months 
when winter and snow will give us breathing 
space. It is true that the Chinese also will have 
this period to strengthen themselves, but we 
are fighting for our motherland, while the 
Chinese will be fighting far from their 
motherland separated by the wild areas of 
Tibet. I would deplore any talk of the 
difficulty of terrain. We have to take the 
terrain as God has given us. So long as we 
claim any part of India as ours we should find 
the ways and means of protecting it. 

While I formally welcome all the voluntary 
contributions in money and gold, wc have to 
face the hard fact that the possible total of all 
such gifts is bound to be a small fraction of 
what we need. So, I suggest that all Plan 
expenditure, except for completing works 
already started and for expansion of war 
production should be stopped for one year. 
The annual addition to our Plan expenditure is 
of the order of Rs 1.400 crores. I suggest that 
we cut it down by half and allowing for any 
reduction in expenditure to prevent inflation, 
the Government of India may be able to 
provide a sum of Rs. 500 crores for war effort, 
during 1963. I feel that this amount, together 
with our unlimited man-power, should 'be 
adequate to drive out the aggressor during 
1963. 

[MR. CHAIRMAN in the Chair] 

I have no doubt that the Government of 
India is aware of the need to cultivate world 
opinion. Though everyone in India is fully 
aware that what is going on on our borders is 
an actual war and not a mere skirmish, we 
cannot expe?t the people in other countries to 
realise its nature. The actual declaration of 
war against Chinese, though it may be fully 
justified, may not be expedient for many    
reasons. 
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[Shri K. Santhanam.] But I am convinced 
that the continuation of diplomatic relations is 
neither necessary nor desirable. While our 
Embassies and Consulates in China will be 
mere prisons for our people their counterparts 
in India are bound to be centres of intrigue. 
There are many nations who have no specific 
quarrel with China, but do not have any 
diplomatic relations with them. It would 
appear strange that we should continue 
diplomatic relations, in spits of the massive 
aggression. We should not blame the other 
peoples of the world if they think that it is a 
case of minor conflict. 

I feel also that some severe measures of 
austerity and discipline should be taken to 
convince our people that we are in earnest. I 
suggest that the present unwieldy Central Mi-
nistry should be dissolved and replaced by a 
manageable small Cabinet of ten to fifteen 
persons. 

AN. HON. MEMBER: At present there are 
only seventeen. 

SHRI K. SANTHANAM: All the work 
which is at present done or supposed to be 
done by the Ministers at States, Deputy 
Ministers and others should be undertaken by 
small Parliamentary Committees of three or 
five working honorarily for the duration of the 
emergency. This will be a flexible method of 
associating members of other parties and 
independents without the disadvantages of a 
coalition Government. 

I also suggest that all ceremonies and 
receptions, except for welcoming 
distinguished foreigners, should be stopped. It 
has been a. sickening phenomenon of our 
political life that Ministers travel from one end 
of the country to the other to perform a 
meaningless ceremony of laying a foundation 
stone or opening a building. 

SHRI AKBAR ALI KHAN: We have 
already issued instructions. 

SHRI K. SANTHANAM: It is all right. 
Weekly or fortnightly visits to home States 
*or the purpose of nursing the electorate ha^ 
become a normal feature. All this may be 
justified to a certain extent during normal 
times. But today they must appear to the 
people as exhibitions of frivolity and 
irresponsibility. We should adopt all these 
measures of austerity immediately and declare 
that they will continue till the integrity of 
India is re-established and the loss of progress 
due to emergency is made up. 

I entirely endorse the sentiments expressed by 
many Members that there should be graded 
sacrifice according to ability not mere 
equality of sacrifice. Like graded taxatioh, 
sacrifice also should be graded according to 
ability. I suggest that immediately excess 
profits tax should be levied on all companies 
and concerns in India. A maximum of six per 
cent dividend only should be allowed and all 
the extra profits should be handed over to the 
exchequer to fight the war. It is only by such 
measures as these that we can convince the 
masses that We are a war Government, that 
we are earnest, that we are going to fight the 
war with all our resources. Sacrifice of money 
by the rich can never be equal to sacrifice of 
life by the poor, but that is all that we can ex-
pect from them. And so I hope that the richer 
classes will not grumble or grudge any 
sacrifice they may be called upon to make in 
this emergency. The Finance Minister has 
announced certain measures. About them I do 
not want to speak in detail. But I cannot help 
saying that instead of his proposal for issuing 
gold bonds, if he had issued an order 
requisitioning all gold with every family over 
the value of Rs. 2,000—it may be that some 
people might have evaded this, as they arp 
evading taxation—I have no doubt that a 
large number of patriotic citizens would have 
responded to it. Today we will not get as 
much gold as we want, and it is useless to get 
only Rs. 5 crores or Rs. 10 crores wo~th of | 
gold. Unless we get Rs. 100 crores or I   Rs. 
200 crores worth of gold, it is not 

373        Proclamation of [ RAJYA SABHA ] Emergency and 374 
Aggression bv China 



375 Proclamation of [ 9 NOV. 1962 ] Emergency and 376 
Aggression by China 

going to help in the procurement of munitions 
or foreign exchange. We must take really 
drastic and severe measures not only because 
they are necessary, but also because they will 
be the only sure index of our earnestness and 
of our resolve in the eyes of our masses. And 
unless we can get the whole-hearted and 
enthusiastic response of the masses, we shall 
not be able to prosecute the war to the end. 

Thank you. 
SHRI ANAND CHAND (Himaehal 

Pradesh): Mr. Chairman, in saying a few 
words just now, you will pardon me if I recall 
to mind a similar debate which took place in 
September 1959 when the Dalai Lama had just 
come to this country and the Chinese had 
demanded something like 50,000 square miles 
of our territory. At that time I respectfully 
pointed out that we made a mistake, a blunder 
if I might say so, of retreating from Tibet or 
signing the treaty with China about Tibet in 
1954 without getting from the Chinese in 
return an assurance or an acceptance of our 
borders with them. That was the basic mistake 
which we committed. That is the basic mistake 
under which we are still labouring, and I was 
rather disheartened to read in the speech made 
by the hon. Prime Minister in the other House 
that our boundary or cur frontiers in the so-
called MacMahon Line had never been 
accepted by the Chinese Government but that 
we did claim it by treaty or by usage because 
it had been our boundary for a long time. 
Now, that to my mind puts our case at a dis-
advantage. In other words, if we go to the 
logical conclusion of what the Prime Minister 
has stated, it means that the Chinese 
Government never accepted our boundaries as 
we say they are, and as such if they penetrate, 
there can be no aggression. That is exactly 
what they are saying today. We should 
reiterate, and I think we should have reiterated 
long ago, that the MacMahon Line is a well 
defined border of India with Tibet. It was a 
border which was defined by our treaties and 
usage when Tibet was not 
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absolutely under the vassalage of China, and 
even after the 1954 Agreement when Tibet 
did form an integral part of China and in 
consonance with the Agreement of 1954 when 
our forces withdrew from Gangtok and other 
areas, according to the agreement arrived at, 
there is no doubt that we have done this in 
recognition of the Chinese suzerainty and 
sovereignty over Tibet, because we are quite 
sure in our mind that the MacMahon Line as 
such is our international boundary Or the 
boundary between India and Tibet, and 
therefore now between China and India. 

The question is, China has come inside the 
MacMahon Line. China has penetrated in 
great force, had penetrated, in great strength, 
and we are retaliating; we must retaliate and 
will go on retaliating till they are driven out. 
The point that I would like to make out is this. 
As far as I have been able to see the legal 
aspect of the question—of course the hon. 
Minister can do it much better than I can—
what the President has declared in his 
Proclamation is not war. A statu of emergency 
has been declared, if I might read out the 
exact words, because India is threatened by 
external aggression. Now, Sir, under article 
352 under which this Proclamation has been 
made, there are three conditions under which 
an emergency can be declared: they are: if the 
country is at. war or if it is threatened by 
external aggression or by internal disturbance. 
So if I read this Proclamation aright, it is not 
war with China but we are faced with external 
aggression. Technically that is the legal 
position which is set out and which to my 
mind flows out of this declaration of emer-
gency. 

Now, Sir, what is the difference between 
war and aggression? The dictionary 
meaning—I do not think it is very difficult to 
follow, I was reading it just now in the 
lobby—of aggression is a first act of hostility 
or injury, and 



 

[Shri Anand Chand.] war, Sir, is a state of 
conflict between States or parties carried on 
bv arms. It is rather a subtle difference, if I 
mis;ht point out. but the difference is there. 

Some friends here have been suggesting all 
the time as to why we should not close our 
Embassy in China and recall our Ambassador, 
and why we should not close the Chinese Em-
bassy in India and ask them to recall their 
Ambassador. I would respectfully point out 
that that scheme is not inherent in the 
declaration itself. It is only when aggression 
evolves itself into a war that the closing down 
or whatever it is will follow. The point that I 
am considering is this: when thousands of our 
soldiers have died, when China is building up 
its massive attack all along the line—it has* 
penetrated and it has occupied so many 
outposts and so on—it is still aggression or is 
it war? If it is aggression, then why the 
Defence of India Ordinance? They do not go 
together. I was going through it and I find that 
the Defence of India Ordinance issued by the 
President is exactly the same as the Defence of 
India Act passed by the late British rulers in 
1939 with very little modification. Does it 
mean that a free India is to react to Chinese 
aggression in exactly the same way as the 
subjugated India reacted in 1939? We are now 
a free country. At that time the Defence of 
India Act was an instrument wielded by an 
alien Government. Today the Defence of India 
Act must be designed for reasons of internal 
security so that we are better able to meet the 
aggressor and throw h'm  out.      There is a big 
difference, 

re is a bas'c difference, but our approach 
is entirely the same. 

Then. Sir. what is our next approach? Our 
next approach is the creation of a National 
Defence Council. Such a Council was also 
created by the British—I think it was in 1942. 
The Viceroy was the Chairman of that 
Council. There were certain Rajas and 
Maharajas on it, and I think the Maharajah of 
Patiala was also on it and 

there were certain private citizens, all of whom 
assembled together once in a while to advise 
the Government in the conduct to    defence    
affairs.    Now I wanted to go into that question 
a little more deeply, and I find on reading the 
papers that this new body is to advise the 
Government to take stock of the situation and 
arrangements for national defence and to advise 
the Government on matters relating to national 
defence, to assist in building up and suitably 
guiding the national will    to fight the 
aggressor, and to suggest to the Central 
Citizens Committee    such measures as may  
be considered    necessary for the utilisation of 
the public co-operation in   national   defence.   
If we look into the constitution of this Council 
it has got the Prime Minister as the Chairman, 
and it has also got Members of the Cabinet who 
I think constitute the Sub-Committee dealing 
with the war or conflict or whatever it is.   In 
addition it has certain retired Generals.   Then it 
has certain other people from  public  life.    
Now,  what will be the precise extent to which 
this large body can  advise the     Government 
of India in the conduct of   national defence? Is 
not the Cabinet to be the responsible instrument 
of the people's will for fighting or for   doing 
everything that is necessary to meet the Chinese     
aggression? If the    last word is to vest in the 
Cabinet    with the Prime Minister as it is, and 
when we have the same Prime Minister as the 
leader or as the Chairman of the National 
Defence Council where     all these questions 
will be discussed, and if certain assurances are 
given jn such a Council, would it not be very 
difficult to undo them in the Cabinet itself once 
an assurance is given There    on behalf of the 
Prime Minister and the same Ministers who are    
responsible for the shaping of policy in the 
Cabinet?   Then  another thing is     that  in 
times of war and in times of stress we have to 
be very careful as to    what the actual defence    
potential of    the country is. Now, by 
discussing all this in such a large body, is    
Government expecting the position that our    
Dre-paredness or otherwise would remain a  
closely  guarded secret? How could 
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it be possible? Under what oath of secrecy 
would the non-Government members of the 
Defence Council be not to divulge the secrets 
or the discussions that took place in that body, 
and if that body is to function as it is 
envisaged, in the form it has come out in the 
newspapers, I do not think 'they could hide 
giving such information as is asked for and 
supplied to the Defence Council, to their 
supporters. So the Defence Council becomes 
ineffective. To my mind there is a serious 
lacuna and unless this serious lacuna is 
removed, I think difficulties will crop up later 
on. I should have thought that in a free 
country, where the Government is elected by 
the will -of the people, the Cabinet Sub-Com-
mittee—call it War Cabinet if you like—
assisted by the Chiefs of Staff would be an 
adequate instrument to deal with this, and if at 
all it was considered necessary to take the pub-
lic into confidence, if at all it was -considered 
necessary to take the people, who are not 
conversant with, what I might call the strategy 
of war, into confidence, because we have to 
maintain the public morale and so on, then the 
setting up of the Defence Council should have 
been in such a manner that it would not 
compromise the position of the Cabinet 
Committee dealing with Chinese aggression 
with the Defence Council. In other words, the 
personnel of the Defence Council should not 
have contained at least the Prime Minister if 
not also, I should say, the other Cabinet 
members on whom the responsibility falls in . 
the ultimate analysis. 

Having said these two things, Sir, I would 
not like to go into so many other matters 
connected with this— hon. friends here have 
dilated on them. There is no doubt that the 
country at large stands united to expel the 
Chinese invader. But what they want is a clear 
lead. Sir. I am no soldier; I am a civilian. Of 
course if the need comes. I can handle a gun 
and I can fight, but the point is that the large 
numbers of people who are today  enthused,  
who are today in  a 

mood to; respond, must be clearly shown the 
way, how their response can very well be 
channelised and how their efforts and energies 
can be put to use. The Citizens Committee. 
which it is intended to constitute in the Centre 
here with its branches in all the States might 
be an answer, but I feel that thi= will not be a 
complete answer. Government would have to 
devise something more, so mat the enthusiasm 
of the people for the war effort, whether it is 
their offer of gold or money or other monetary 
help or whether it is. an offer of blood for th» 
blood bank or whatever it is will be kept up. It 
should be done in a manner in which their 
enthusiasm is put to proper use 

Then, Sir, I would like respectfully to 
submit that this aggression, as the Prime 
Minister himself says, the hon. the Home 
Minister did say yesterday, is going to be a 
long drawn out affair. Now. Sir, I personally 
feel that once we come to accept it as a long 
drawn out affair, it means in other words that 
we accept the position that today we are no 
match to drive the Chinese out of our soil, that 
therefore we must build up the necessary 
armed might of this country when we will be 
in a nosilion to drive them out and thati 
therefore this war is going to be a long drawn 
out affair. To my mind of course this logic is 
quite right. But if we go on labouring under it, 
if we begin to compare me military potential 
of the two countries, the army potential of the 
two countries, the population and other 
resources which both countries can mobilise, 
one would be led to believe that even in that 
long drawn out affair, our ascendency by 
figures alone, if not by arms, would not be 
well established. Today) for example, I do not 
know, it is a secret thing but I was reading 
somewhere and noticed that the total number 
under arms in the country, I mean our army 
today is somewhere near 500,000 or 600,000 
strong. We have been giving train-ma to 
people in the use of arms and so on; we    have 
the    reservists and 
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[Shri Anand Chand.] probably we can 
bring another million men under arms. Let us 
see the total war potential if we put this 
country on a war footing. It may come to 
roughly to li millions. But China today, Sir, 
even by very raagh estimates has got an army 
of 2J millions. They have got people in the 
voluntary army well versed in the art of war 
whom they can mobilise overnight: a crore 
and twenty lakhs of people they can bring in 
straightway if they want them in addition to 
their regular army of 25 lakhs, and if what I 
have read is not wrong, of people who can go 
to war and fight, it is estimated that, the 
Chinese can put into the field something like 
3 crores of people. Now, how will we match 
them? We can only match that by superior 
arms. We can only match that by a massive 
display of arms might. We can only match 
that by inflicting a blow on the enemy before 
he is able to put all that man power against us. 
In other words the aid or whatever the mili-
tary instruments that we have at the present 
moment have to be much more in quantity 
and quality. Now how is this going to be 
achieved? Should we go on waiting for a long 
war? Should we say that because China has 
put in three crores of people and India today 
cannot afford to put more than 15 lakhs of 
people, for a period of four years or five years 
or ten years we have to go through all these 
hardships and sufferings? Is it really 
necessary to undergo all that? If it is not 
necessary and if we do not want it, should we 
not do something about it? 

My friends here have been saying about the 
policy of alignment and about the policy of 
non-alignment. I am not going to say :.ny 
thing on the policy of alignment or on the 
policy of non-alignment. The point is who are 
the peoplp who are going to give us arms. But 
they say, "Oh, the Swatantra Party is a lightest 
party. They want U.S. imperialism or other 
imperialism to come to India." Now, if Russia 
had given arms, they would 

have then said. "Well, they are a good people 
because they are supplying us arms. The 
Socialist camp is good." My argument is not 
this or that. My argument is, let us get 
massive military aid in whichever way it is 
possible. We cannot pay for it because we 
have not got the wherewithal to pay for it. 
We1 want gold. Now, would all the gold that 
is coming out bn able to purchase even one 
hundredth of the arms that we require? Would 
all the money coming in by way of voluntary 
donations form even an infinitesimal part of 
the money that we require if we were to pur-
chase these arms in the open market? Even a 
country like Britain during war could not do 
it. Therefore, Sir, my .suggestion is that we 
must ask for massive aid in arms as quickly as 
possible, and what is more, the possibility of 
getting these arms on a lend-lease basis 
should be fully explored. Only then can this 
country be able to build up quickly. Only then 
will this country have the necessary arms 
potential in a massive way to inflict a 
crushing defeat pn the Chinese before they are 
able to mobilise their vast man power and 
resources, which a prolonged war will enable 
them to do and in the meantime, our hardships 
will mount up and n°t only so many lives of 
our gallant iawans who are fighting on there 
will be lost but, what is more, also the lives of 
the civil population, because a prolongation of 
this war is going to be something which we 
cannot today imagine, because it has only 
started; it is just the starting point. 

It is also my suggestion, Sir, that for 
purposes of effectively putting the Defence 
Ministry into gear a Ministry of Supply should 
be created. We have a Ministry of Works, 
Housing and Supply. I think the time has 
come when we should have a Ministry of 
Supply. A Ministry for Defence Production 
has been created, no doubt, but I would like 
that it should be a Ministry of Supply as Great 
Britain did when the war crisis came in 1939. 
On the shoulders of that Ministry of Supply 
should not only be placed the- 
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burden of giving the wherewithal to the armed 
forces, whether it is the Air Force or the 
Army, but also to see that the needs of the 
civilian population are met as scarcity is 
bound to result once our production or 
potential is diverted towards war. That 
Ministry, to my mind, is an essential one. It is 
also essential that the manning of that 
Ministry, if it is created, should be by a person 
who is not only well-versed with the finances 
of this country but who is also an economist so 
that he can look after the supply of the war 
potential on the one hand and look to the 
supply of civilian needs on the other as 
difficulties will be created in the country for 
the civilian population. (Time bell rings.) 
Only one word more and I am done. 

PROF. M. B. LAL: YOU are not goin? to be 
done so soon. 

SHRI AN AND CHAND: I am very glad 
you give me that span. 

My friend has said about the wasteful 
expenditure which must be eliminated. About 
the large number if these Ministries, 
especially in the States, that are still 
functioning, 1 think the Government of India 
is already taking steps. I think steps should 
also be taken whereby all wasteful 
expenditure is eliminated and the Plan is 
pruned to meet the requirements of today. 

What I wanted to speak really about was 
something which the leader of my group said 
about Pakistan. I am sorry that the reaction 
was a bit premature and that the House did 
not hear him through. It is true that the 
relations between India and Pakistan are 
strained. It is also true that Pakistan recently 
declared as late as a few days ago—I think the 
Pakistan Foreign Minister said this the other 
day—that they would object even to the 
passage of arms through Pakistan if they are 
going to help India. 

PANDIT S. S. N. TANKHA (Uttar Pradesh): 
Even by air. 

SHRI ANAND CHAND: They have not. in 
my opinion, conducted themselves wisely But 
that does not mean that we should not at this 
hour of crisis try to come to some closer un-
derstanding with them rather than that 
Pakistan comes to a much closer 
understanding with China. That. I think, is 
essential from many points of view. That does 
not mean that we should thereby barter away 
our territory in Kashmir or elsewhere. It only 
means that, we should try to come to an 
understanding with them. 

Some understanding, Sir, should also be 
brought about in our relations with Nepal. It 
might be that we do not want a kingly rule 
there. As a democracy we are opposed to it, 
we are opposed to autocracy. But I feel that if 
the Western nations could tolerate France, we 
could tolerate King Mahendra at. least till 
such time as the war on our fronts ends. 

Then, Sir, I have only one thing more to 
say. The responsibility for fighting is on the 
people of this country, on the leaders of the 
people— I would not say of the Congress 
Party—and the leaders of the Government and 
the responsibility for maintaining peace and 
order on the home front falls on the shoulders 
of my h3n. friend, the Home Minister. Small 
in stature, I know his shoulders are big enough 
to take this responsibility. I have full 
confidence in him and I at least would not ad-
vocate the hasty policy of witch-hunting of 
political parties or people with different 
political ideologies because I think at this time 
if we begin to do that, we will lose our proper 
perspective and balance. Howsoever difficult 
the time may be, if we try to say. "Do not take 
people at their face value," or if we try to at-
tribute motives to any party without watching 
its conduct, as I am sure Government will be 
watching, them. I think it will do us harm, it 
will do us injury, it will harm us in the de-
mocratic  way   of   life   that   we   have 
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[Shri Anand Chand.] 
adopted. So, I would say that the policy of 
wait and see, which the Government has 
adopted, is the best, and I hope that n:> action 
under all this Defence of India Act and so on 
will be taken in a manner which would smack 
of any political prejudices or anything done 
simply to suppress a certain political thought, 
and that all action that .would be taken, would 
be taken solely with a view to the 
maintenance of law and order in the country 
and for purposes of meeting and    driving out    
the    Chinese. 
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THE PRIME MINISTER (SHRI 
jAv.'AirniAL NEHRU): Mr. Chairman, Sir, I 
speak on the Resolution moved by my friend 
and colleague, the Home Minister. As a 
matter of fact, I do not think it is necessary for 
anyone to speak in commending that 
Resolution because every party and group and 
every individual in this House, I gather, 
approves of it and gives it full support. And 
what is much more important, that support has 
come in a tremendous and magnificent 
measure from the people of this  country. 

I shall, therefore, say something about some 
points, some outstanding features of this 
situation more particularly about the way we 
have to condition our mentality to face it. 
Some people have criticised our un-
preparedness and may I add that I hope,, not 
now but somewhat later at a more suitable 
time, them will be an enquiry into this matter, 
because there is a great deal of mis-
understanding and misapprehension and 
people have been shocked—all of us have 
been shocked—by the events that occurred 
from the 20th October onwards for a few days 
and the rever-I ses that we suffered. So I hope 
there will be an enquiry so as to find out what 
mistakes or errors were committed and who 
was responsible for them. But for the present 
that cannot be donp and I do not wish to state 
before the House anything in regard to those 
matters though I do think that many of the 
charges made have little substance. The real 
thing, the basic thing, is that we as a nation, in 
spite of brave speeches now and then, have 
been conditioned in a relatively peaceful 
manner in a democratically peaceful manner 
which is somewhat opposed to the type of 
conditioning that a country like China at 
present, has had especially in the last dozen 
years or so. They have been conditioned, even 
previously they have been in a sense at war, I 
should say for SO years in a condition of war, 
not war with foreign countries but war in their 
own country, and the House will remember 
how constantlv this idea of 



 

war was being put forward by them. America    
has been    their chief bete noire, their chief 
enemy and constantly they were rousing up 
their people against  America,   against  
imperialists and the  like so  as  to  keep  up  
that mentality of war, that constant preparation 
for war,    for building up for war and all that.   
We, on the other hand,  have  constantly   
spoken  about peace and we are, in spite of 
sometimes using excited language, a peaceful  
people and we have pleaded for peace^al] over 
the world and in our .own country and 
naturally that conditioning is of a different 
type than the type  of conditioning  that  China,  
tor instance, has had during the last dozen 
years.   Having conditioned their peo-ple> they 
can turn the direction, they can turn the 
people's thinking in any way   they   choose.   
It   was    against America;   suddenly     India     
becomes enemy No. 1.   Not that America 
ceases  to  be  in  their minds  the enemy but 
they turn it round and they turn it round saying 
that we are the stooges   of   America.   
Therefore,      all  the previous conditioning 
against America is turned round to us.   For 
them it is really  as if we are doing a job for -
America, as if it did not directly concern us.   
Now, in normal times, even apart from this 
conditioning and the rest, democratic countries 
do not normally behave like, well, countries—
if 1 may  give     you     an  instance—like 
Hitler  behaved   in   Germany.      Now, great 
countries—not    countries wh'ch •are     
pacifists—like     England,      like France  and   
the   rest     had   powerful armies; yet they 
were n°t conditioned in the way that Germany   
was   under Hitler and when war came   the   
result was that in spite   of their   vast armies, 
the French army and the British   army with  
the fullest equipment they had with them could 
not stand up againsi Hitler  and     they     were     
swept  off. France  was  humiliated  and  
humbled and then the British army, almost th« 
whole of it, was swept into the English 
Channel.   Not that it was not a good army but 
the aggressor   has   an   advantage and the    
conditioning of the. aggressor makes it a more 
fit instrument for the initial attack.   First  of 

all, the aggressor chooses the point of attack, 
the day and the time of attack, which  is  an  
advantage.    So  this has to be borne in mind.   
Now, we in tha last many years have thought 
certainly  of  keeping  our  army,     air force, 
etc.,  but we have  thought  that    the essential  
way  of  gaining  strength   is: industrialising    
the    country and improving     our     
agriculture     because struggles are fought 
today even more than  at the battle front in the 
field and factory and we thought—and we still 
think—that even from the point of view of 
strengthening our defence forces the 
background behind them in the field  and     
factory was essential. Without a proper 
industry no modern war can be fought.   We 
may get a? we are getting—and we are 
thankful for getting them—arms    from abroad 
because the emergency compels us to do so, to 
get them.     Yet we cannot fight for  any  
length     of    time with merely aid from 
abroad.   We have to produce the weapons of 
war here and behind  those  weapons     of  war  
and behind    that    industry    which is    So 
essential . is   the     agricultural  background.   
No industry can be built up unless  agriculture 
is  functioning.    So we come back to the 
growth of agriculture  and   industry   and   we   
have been trying to do that in the last so many 
years by Five Year Plans and the  rest.   
Naturally,  the     Five Year Plans were meant 
to raise the level of living of our people, to 
give them certain amenities,  to raise the natio-
nal  income  and   all  that;  but essen-tiallv. if I 
may venture to state to this House, they were 
meant to strengthen the  country,   to  
strengthen  even   the defence forces  of  the  
country.    Now, many   people  thought,  being 
used  in the  past   to   getting   everything  
from abroad that this was the easiest way— 
getting  arms  and     everything     from 
abroad.    Originally,  our Indian Army before 
independence consisted of vary brave men, but 
it was essentially an outgrowth of the British 
Army.   Most of  the  officers,  all the  senior  
officers were foreign, were British.    Gradually 
( some of our officers rose in rank and a very; 
very few became Brigadiers.   For the rest.  I 
think.  Colonel 
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rank.   All the policy-was  laid  down  in 
Whitehall.      They did not bother.      They 
had to carry out that policy.   Almost all the 
fighting  material—not  human  beings  but 
arms, etc—came from England chiefly. There  
was  only  a  slight  advance  in our    arms    
production    during    the Second  World War,     
because  it  became very    difficult to supply    
India from England. ..Their own    demands 
were terrific and there was distance. 
Therefore,   the     British   Government 
encouraged  the production of certain arms  
and  ammunition    in  our    ordnance 
factories.   Even so, nothing except the most 
ordinary arms were allowed to be made here. 
The rest had to come from there.      That was  
the state of affairs when we took charge. First 
of all, all the policy, direction, etc. changed, 
from Whitehall direction to Indian    direction.   
We   had    good people. Yet all the training 
and thinking    was    originally    derived    
from Whitehall   or  from     Sandhurst,   etc., 
which is good training.    I do not say that it is 
bad.   And they are very fine men.   
Nevertheless,  it was somewhat out of touch  
with  Indian  conditions. Gradually, we had to 
bring that round, to fit in more with Indian 
conditions, but more particularly the whole 
question of production was before us.    We 
could not rely on foreign sources for arms, etc.   
After    all,    when one is forced to do, one    
gets it from anywhere, as we are doing it 
today.   But that is not a safe thing and that 
does not produce a sense of self-reliance and 
self-dependence.   Now, to build up a modern   
arms   industry     requires  not only  some  
prototype  being   obtained and  copying  it.   
That     is      difficult enough.   But it requires 
an industrial background in the country.  It is 
out of a  background  of  industry  that these 
things arise, not a specific thing. You make 
something which may be good for war without 
any background. We have to have a vast 
number of scientists, technicians, etc. and long 
experience of doing it.   All these years we 
have been trying to do that and I think we 
have made very considerable progress.    We 
have today in our Defence 

Science Department—I do not exactly know 
it—I think more than two thousand scientists 
working.    Because you cannot get the real 
thing here, to get somes  idea of it, you   have to 
build   up your own prototypes and   then   after 
building them up you have to experiment with 
them, try them, and then tin-ally  decide in 
favour and then produce themi  in  large   
quantities.   All     this takes time.   We have 
always had this idea that the way to strengthen 
our army is to go through these processes. It is 
true that in defence one has to fix  some  period 
with     some  idea in one's  mind  as  to when  
one may be confronted with a war crisis.   
Suppose, we are confronted with  a war crisis in 
a year's time.      In our    thinking everything 
else has to be conditioned to that year.   We can 
not produce big things    within    that year.   We 
have to do something.   If a war is suddenly 
thrust upon you, immediately you have to do as 
best as you can.    But in doing the best we can, 
for the time being,  we  really  lessen  our  
capacity for the future, even to carry on with 
war for the future,  unless we build it up from 
below as I have said. That was tli-  problem    
always before us. Every country when it thinks 
of arms, etc.—apart from this point of building 
up the arms industry—has to consider when the 
time for trial will come.    I remember the first 
time I came into the  Government,     before    I  
became Prime Minister, I was Vice-President of 
the Council and one day a problem came up 
before us about the Army. What Army should 
we keep?      That was just after the World W»r.    
This was before Pakistan came into existence 
and before there was any particular danger.    
And we were put this question:   "When do you 
expect, what time do you expect to have before 
a war will take place?"   Any war.   We had 
nobody in view.    That is to say, we can 
concentrate more on prepara-I   tions for it in the 
sense of long-term preparations.    If we think 
the war is next  year,    then     the    approach    
is different.    And it was said:    "L«t us think,  
for  the     moment,  ten  years." At that  time 
there  was  no  question 
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of building up the arms industry here. It was  
only  a question of acquiring weapons.   Ten 
years has no particular meaning.   It was just 
a period, so that whatever   we    required     
should    be spread out over ten years.    That 
was the idea and that should be obtained from 
abroad.   Later when we became independent    
we Jaid    much greater stress   on   
production      here   in   this country.      
There    were      difficulties. Many people    
used to old    methods, not only for our Army 
but for everything, for our railways, etc., 
preferred just giving a big order—a team 
going abroad   and  coming     back  here—
for tanks, for this, that and the other.   It was 
simpler and they^cnew that tank. And they 
rather suspected    or were afraid  that  if  we  
made   it  ourselves it may not be quite as 
good.    It may fail us.   But that was not good 
enough for a long-term effort.   We had to do 
it ourselves and    gradually    it   Was built 
up.   And then we had also, you will 
remember, always certain financial or foreign 
exchange difficulties,    how much we should 
turn over to defence. Defence  expenditure     
has     gone  up somewhat by normal peace-
time standards     considerably.    It  affected  
our whole planning,  our First Plan    and 
Second  Plan.    So.  we  had  to  strike a 
balance somewhere.   With all these 
difficulties    and delays,    nevertheless, we 
built up our defence industry, not by any 
means as we wanted it.   The process 
continued  and  continues,  but still I think 
with considerable success. If I could show 
you the rate a't which our  production  in     
defence  industry has gone up, you will notice 
that it is very considerable.    I will not go 
into those figures.    I am merely mentioning 
these things.    Some people criticised that our 
ordnance factories have been making    
civilian    goods.    They nave been making 
civilian goods.    It was to the tune of about 
five per cent because when labour was 
unemployed it had to be turned to do 
something. And alwaysi the normal test is    
that ordnance factories or any arms manu-
facturing concerns    cannot   manufacture in 
peace time as fast as they are supposed to 
make in war time. Other- 

wise, you get stocked up with things 
tremendously.    You cannot    do anything with 
them.    They    get spoiled no doubt.    The 
normal rate is—I forget the exact figure—that 
in war time you have   to advance   your rate   
of production  between     15  and  20 per cent, 
of peace time.   Because you are spending so 
much, your    ammunition is being fired at a 
tremendous pace, it  must  be replaced.    In 
peace time you    do    it   only    when    there   
are exercises.    So,     all  these     problems 
came to us.    I was saying that   our production  
has   gone  up  very  considerably—not civil 
production.   It is a mere bagatelle, nothing—
arms production for the  Army,     Navy  and    
Air Force and especially for the Army and the 
Air Force.   And now for the last month  or  
two,  of  course,     we  have done 
extraordinarily well.    I    should like to say a 
word in commendation of those in charge of 
our arms production, the    Director-General    
of it, who is a very able and very enthusiastic 
man, and  all his workers    and others.    Their 
scientists  and     chiefly technicians are 
working today twenty-four hours  a  day.    
There  is not    a minute's interval when they 
stop.   So, this process went on.    It did not go 
on, I admit, completely, as fast as    a country 
bent on war   would    do    it, because we had 
always to check    it, because the more we 
spent on it, the less we had!    for other basic 
things, even for defence.    As I said, I think 
agriculture is as important as guns in defence,   
I think the growth of industries is as important 
as guns.   I think that power is    as important as 
guns. All  these  things    help    in producing 
guns, all these things help in producing a well-
fed    army    and    well-fed country.    All 
these things help us in conserving our foreign 
exchange.    All these things    are so    inter-
connected. One  must not think    of defence    
as something by itself, training    people, 
parading   them   about     and  handing them 
guns for defence.    So this process has    been    
going    on    naturally limited by our resources, 
limited   by many  other  factors,   limited  by    
the growth of our industrial development. 
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and it  has made  a fairly good progress.   It 
might have made more. 

And now I should like to carry this argument 
to its conclusion.    I would like to say  that 
we have today,    as everyone realises, a 
terrific    problem which cannot be solved 
obviously   by brave gestures and processions 
or anything like that,  which    are good    in 
their  own  way,  but obviously  it    is 
something when wei    are up against one of 
the biggest powers in the world. We  have  
seen  in the    past,  in    the Great War and    
others,    how    great powers mauled    at    
each    other    till ultimately,  after three  or 
four years or more they    were    all    
exhausted, utterly bled, and the greatest 
powers were defeated,    defeated    absolutely 
France, Germany, Japan, for instance. They 
did not    lack enthusiasm, they did  not lack 
good    armies  or    good navies or air force, 
they did not lack the industrial background.    
Yet they were defeated because it was a trial 
ultimately of sbmeihing basic, not    a 
question of a few guns or something but of 
the nerve and basic strength of a nation,    the   
morale of   a   nation. That is what we have to 
face.   I think we can face it with confidence, 
but   I want  you  to  think  of    the    ordeals 
before us.    We may have,  as    every army 
has, as every defence force has, reverses and. 
all  that.    We have    to survive them, we    
will survive them and not get terribly 
dispirited because we  had  a  reverse     That    
is  not    a right outlook  at  any  time  but 
more specially when we are up against    a 
highly organised and trained military machine 
like that of China which has, I believe,  the 
biggest army    in    the world.    Even    in 
Tibet I understand, they have got a vast army, 
leave out the  huge  legions  in  China.    That  
is the problem before us.   Now, in facing it, 
we face it today, as we try to do, with all the 
material we have and all the material we can 
get from abroad, and  we  have  asked  a   
large  number of countries to supply  it.    The 
main countries which have supplied us thus 
far have been the United States and 

th« United Kingdom, and we are grateful to 
them for it, but we have, if T may use the 
word, impartially asked many countries 
including the Soviet Union. I may add about 
the Soviet Union that all the previous 
commitments they made, I believe thev stand 
by them. What further commitments they will 
make I cannot say. We have asked them, we 
have not got an answer yet. But on previous 
commitments they bave said that they stand 
by them in spitf* of these developments. 

So, we have to meet the situation, but if we 
realise, as we should realise, that this is a long-
term    effort,  this may take, I cannot say how 
long, but mentally we must ba prepared for   a 
long long time, for years, two years, three 
years or four years, the people and the  country 
straining  themselves to the uttermost—it is not 
a question of giving some money to a fund, it 
is not a question of some    people being 
recruited, but every man and woman in the 
country being strained to    the uttermost.   If 
that is so, that can only be carried on if 
together with it we are  thinking  constantly  of 
increasing our industrial  potential     and 
behind that our  agricultural     potential,  and 
the industrial potential and the agricultural 
potential    give    us    the war potential.    War 
potential is not something  apart  from  
industrial potential and agricultural    potential.    
That    is why  I  have  said  that     we dare  not 
even for the sake of this war and the defence of 
our country  slacken    our efforts at increasing 
our industrial and agricultural    potential    or    
in    other words  give   up  our Five  Year  
Plan. We may give up some bits of it—that is a 
different matter—which we consider non-
essential, but the basic things of that have to 
continue, if for nothing else,  just  for  the  sake  
of  this    war situation.     That is how I would 
like the House  to consider    this problem 
because  it requires, apart from what we  do,   a  
certain  mental   adjustment to it.   If we have 
not got that mental adjustment,   we   will   be   
constantly 



 

having shocks, not being able to do what we 
can. It is not a hundred yards' race or a 
hundred meters' race where we make a violent 
effort and go as fast as we can for a hundred 
yards in nine or ten second:;. You do it if you 
are a fast runner and get exhausted at the end 
of it. It is a very long race, and if you have to 
run a long race, let us say, uf three miles or 
more, you run differently from how you run a 
hundred yards race. You have to keep your 
breath and get your second breath and carry 
on whatever happens, so that in that sense we 
have to look at this and not exhaust our 
energy, our capacity in initial spurts and not 
have the energy left for ;omething else 
because there is a limit to a nation's energy. 
To courage you may say there is no limit. 
Many men show courage unto death. Fewer 
men show courage living on the verge of 
death and yet working hard. That is true, but 
there is a limit to the totality of a nation's, I 
will not say courage but, strength, if you like, 
and you see that in these great wars that have 
taken place that limit was reached in the case 
of some countries like Germany and Japan. 
They collapsed six months before the other 
party might have collapsed. Mr. Winston 
Churchill, I believe, talking about the fisst 
World War said—I forget his words—just it 
was a pure chance, he said, ultimately which 
side collapsed. It is a very well worded thing 
but I do not remember it. However, one has to 
think ahead and preserve that ooui-ago so that 
we could outlast the other party, our 
opponent, our enemy. That is the problem 
before us, and this requires not only 
tremendous mobilisation of the nation's 
resources but a mental adaptation to it. Some 
of us are not accustomed to facing these 
questions of a nation's life and death in war 
time—and we are not accustomed, let us be 
clear about it—we have heard of wars, read 
about wars, the first World War, the second 
World War and all that, but we were not 
emotionally concerned with them in the sense 
of that type of terrible suffering which 

people in Europe, people in the warring 
countries had, whether it was this side or that 
side, Germany, England, France and Russia. 
All these countries suffered terribly and to the 
ounce of their blood they went on doing it, 
and then those people survived who had just 
the last ounce more than the others, they 
survived. That it the kind of struggle we are 
in. It is not a joke. And now of course in a war 
one has to think of nuclear weapons; not we, 
we are not producing them and we do not 
intend producing them. China says it will 
produce them. It has not done so. It might—in 
a year's time—and even if it does, it will be an 
experimental thing, and it will not be a thing 
which they can use for several years. How-
ever, war now has become a different thing 
and that is why apart from our natural desire 
for peace in the world and in our country, it is 
too terrible to contemplate, even by people 
who like war but fear the annihilation of 
mankind. So, we have pleaded for peace, and 
the world generally has been responding to the 
call of peace, not our call but the general call 
of peace all over. Even the great leaders of 
nations are powerfully affected by it because 
they faced^-as we faced only two or three 
weeks ago—suddenly a turn of events in 
Cuba, and the Cuba affair might have led t° 
war, war in 24 hours or 48 hours. Well, they 
shrank back and wisely decided to avoid it. 
Now, that has been the past, and we, apart 
from—I imagine'— every thinking person 
wanting to avoid wars—are particularly 
trained to some extent, even more, inclined 
that way because of Gandhiji, not that—1 
say—Gandhiji made any of us terribly 
peaceful or made us what he thought he would 
like to have made us, but we did not reach his 
ideal. So with all that behind us we pursued a 
certain policy which at no time— may tell the 
House—was a pacifist policy, which at no 
time meant weakening our defence forces but 
strengthening them to the utmost of our 
capacity having regard to the resources and 
finances at our disposal. 

411 Proclamation of [09 NOV. 1962 ] Emergency ana 412 
Aggression by China 



413       Proclamation of [ RAJYA SABHA ] Emergency and 414 
Aggression by China 

[Shri Jawaharlal Nehru.] Our defence 
forces, our array at the present moment is 
much larger than the limit placed on it by 
ourselves. It has simply grown by 
circumstances bigger. Even so it is a very 
small army compared to China's millions; 
there you go into many millions. We do not 
go into them; we only go into hundreds of 
thousands and, as I said, we thought of 
defence chiefly from the point of view, first of 
all, of defence science—which is the basis of 
defence production, of technicians and others. 
To get all that takes time. For a soldier to be 
trained, it does not take very much time. And 
in the same way we take weapons because it 
is often said that we did not give our people 
adequate weapons. That is both true and not 
true; that is to say, we have not an army 
shifted over completely to automatic 
weapons; we are in the process of doing it. It 
is a lengthy process, manufacturing it 
ourselves, and we did not want, previous to 
this crisis, to spend large sums cf money in 
getting those weapons from outside. We 
decided to make them ourselves, and we are 
making them now. But when the crisis came 
we had to give them—that is a different 
matter. We are trying to give them now, and 
in this connection, I might say that even an 
army like the British Army has only recently 
got automatic weapons. They are changing 
over now, in the course of some months, 
because their thinking is along different lines 
now, and we largely have followed their 
thinking; our officers and others who are 
responsible for this kind of thing have been 
trained there, have been in contact with them 
and think that way. The whole concept of war 
has changed. First of all, the air arm has 
become very important. Secondly, the nuclear 
weapons have become so important that 
conventional arms get relatively less 
important, and there is an argument whether 
the conventional army should be built up, or 
nuclear. All that is going on there. For us 
there is no choice. We do not have nuclear 
weapons and we are not 

likely to have them. But in the confusion of 
arguments this element of automatic weapons, 
even in an up-to-date and modern army like 
the British was neglected in their military 
thinking; they did not think it was necessary 
or essential; they preferred some other 
weapons, -303 rifles, something which we 
have. Anyhow for the last two or three years 
we have been thinking of making the auto-
matic weapons, not only thinking but also 
moving in that direction. But then all manner 
of difficulties are involved in it, because we 
have to get the prototypes, we have got to get 
the blueprints of them, and we have to make 
them ourselves making some adjustments for 
conditions here. Then we have tests and trials 
of them. It takes a long time. Last year we had 
been carrying this out, and now they are being 
produced or will be produced next month. 
Meanwhile we have got many of them from 
abroad. What I was venturing to point out to 
the House, were the problems that we had to 
face all the time, and at no time did we think 
that we can be complacent about this matter, 
about China or about their doings. But we did 
think that we should build up the basic thing 
which will enable us to convert it into a proper 
war machine when the necessity arose, 
because, if we did not have the base, then the 
war machine would be without foundations, 
would be superficial and would depend only 
on some outside help that we can get. We get 
it no doubt as we are getting it now, but it will 
not be able to carry us through for very long, 
and also it was, shall I say, a question of 
judgment as to when this final challenge 
would come. Of course, previously hon. 
Members here and elsewhere asked us—I 
remember a speech delivered here too—"Why 
did we not push them out two or three years 
ago in Ladakh?" Well, it is rather difficult to 
go into that because that kind of thing, if one 
goes to details, may help our enemy, but 
broadly speaking we wanted to be fully 
prepared for that. 
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We did not want to go into it half prepared or 
quarter prepared, and again, the preparation 
involved roads, a tremendous deal of roads, 
and big arms factories being built, the old 
ones being modernised and enlarged and all 
that, which takes time. So we wanted that. It 
was no good our hitting out at the Chinese 
and being pushed back with force and being 
helpless after that. So, we prepared for that 
and tried to build up the roads and build up 
the Dosts, which posts were, obviously, not 
strong enough to hold them back if a big army 
came. A post of a 100 or 200 men is more a 
signal post, that tnus far you advance and no 
more, but if they decide to bring in a big 
army, they can sweep it away. That was the 
position in Ladakh and, therefore, we tried to 
hold them there and prepared to make 
ourselves stronger for a future tussle. In the 
NEFA region, as the House knows, they had 
not come at all except, originally, to a small 
village Longju which again—according to 
them—they claimed to be on the side of the 
MacMahon Line. It is actually on the border, 
and even that, according to them, was not 
coming over the MacMahon Line. Apart from 
that they had not come over at all during all 
this period. What they had stated all this time, 
and their actions, say, in regard to the Burma-
China Treaty and others, led one to believe 
that they would not encroach any further. 
That does not mean that they were satisfied 
with that. They might proceed further if they 
liked, but nevertheless there .VPS this idea 
which was spread abroad by themselves, by 
their statements and activities. Although they 
said that this was an illegal MacMahon Line, 
that they did not recognise it, nevertheless 
they always said that they would not cross it, 
and all these years we were in a sense better 
prepared here than in Ladakh, and specially 
lately we have built some more roads. But 
again, however prepared we were, it is a 
comparative question. No man can say that he 
is thoroughly prepared  to  meet  anything.    
A hun- 

dred men may be prepared to meet five 
hundred men, but a hundred or five hundred 
or five thousand men are not prepared for a 
hundred thousand men to swoop down upon 
them or something. It is always a comparative 
thing. And we suddenly had to face a thing 
which certainly was not in our minds and we 
are, if you like, to blame for it, that an army 
of forty thousand-or fifty thousand men will 
swoop down a small corner of NEFA and 
face our force which was about, I do dot 
know—I do not tf'ish to mention figures—but 
very much smaller. 

Then, again, they have the facility of 
bringing large forces at short notice from 
Tibet. Tibet having a huge reservoir of 
Chinese army, they can bring it by road right 
up to the edge of the ridges because that is 
the end of the Himalayas there. They can 
bring it in, go over a little ridge there and 
down they are in our territory, the ridge being 
the watershed, while we' have to go hundreds 
of miles of difficult territory. Now, although 
we have some roads, we have built them, yet 
almost eve y-thing that we had to send to the 
army had been by air. It is a terrific strain on 
our Air Force which they have done 
remarkably well. 

So, I want to keep this background before 
you that we were all the time thinking of 
producing conditions, both in our arms 
factories, in our defence science and the 
roads, etc. we built, which would enable us to 
meet them as strongly as possible. It was a 
question of whether we will be forced to face 
a big challenge, what lime we might be forced 
and we could hurry these things up, but there 
is a limit to your hurrying an arms factory be-
ing built. Now we are thinking, and I hone the 
House will also think, in terms of a long-term 
effort. We cannot say how long it will be, but 
as things are, we dare not allow ourselves to 
think of a short-term effort, because if we 
think so, we will be disappointed, and that is    
disheartening 
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thing if you do not make up your mind for a 
long-term effort and prepare for a short-term 
one, because then all your calculations are 
upset. Also, if we think in a short-term way, 
we will prepare for a short-term thing; we 
would not be able, perhaps, to carry on for a 
long term. We must think in terms of years. 

Also there is a good deal of talk on the 
Chinese side, a good deal of, what I may say, 
peace offensives. Now, whatever happens we 
shall always favour peace provided that peace 
is an honourable one, a peace that leaves cur 
territory in our hands. That is a different 
matter. I hope that we -jhall never become 
war-mad and forget the objectives that we 
have, as in the great war and other wars, a 
certain madness seizes a nation for which they 
may even win the war but they lose the peace. 
That is so. We are all for peace always. Why 
should we spend vast sums of money? 
Andjnoney re-au'red for these things, for this 
kind of operations, is such that all the money 
we spend in our Five Year Plans is a bagatelle 
before it. enormous sums We thought we are 
brave to put a certain sum for our Five Year 
Plans. But here there is no choice left. We 
have to spend much more for the initial stages 
of the war and f~r subsequent stages. So while 
WP are for peace, we must not allow ourselves 
to be taken in by these so-called peace 
offensives which are not peace, which are 
merely meant to some extent to humiliate us, 
to some extent to strengthen their position 
where they are for a future advance maybe, 
because. I am s-rry to say it, it has become 
impossible to put trust in the word of the    
Chinese Government. 

Now. even now their descriptions all the 
time are that we have attacked them and the 
brave Chinese frontier guards are defending 
themselves, the brave Chinese frontier guards 
having come on our territory, we are appa-
rently attacking them and they are defending 
themselves. Apparently, the idea  is that they 
should have a free 

run on our country and we should do nothing. 
Some of the hon. Members have criticised 

our publicity arrangements and, if I may say 
so. there is a great deal of truth in that 
criticism. We are trying to improve them. I 
think, they iiave improved somewhat, and I 
hope, they will improve, because it is not an 
easy matter to build up these things in a few 
days, war publicity and all mat, and also 
because we do not quite function, we are not 
used to functioning quite in the way the 
Chinese Government are used to functioning, 
that, is, stating complete untruth, one after the 
other, a set of lies. We are somewhat much 
more careful about what we say. Take the 
20th of October. Before even their own attack 
had commenced, they started broad-easting 
that we were attacking them. Before that, that 
is, a little before that, about half-an-hour 
before, I think, they started that. People said 
"Oh, we hurt them first and they afterwards." 
Now, what is one to do? Even before they 
attacked they started broadcasting that we 
were attacking them. Nothing was happening 
there. Then they attacked. When we learnt of 
that a couple cf hours later they got an ad-
vance of two or three hours. So you have to 
face a machine of propaganda publicity which 
originally was often called Goebbels machine 
in Nazi Germany. There is extraordinary simi-
larity in many things between the Chinese 
publicity, etc., and the old Nazi publicity. 
And, of course, that can only be carried on 
with a certain rigid authoritarian pattern 
behind it— nobody dare say anything. 

Here, I do not wish to criticise our 
newspapers, but very often they say and do 
things which do not help the war effort, 
although they are very keen in helping it but 
they do not think in that way. Everybody can 
say anything in a public meeting, and many 
people say amazing things in public meetings 
here which certainly dT not help the war 
effort. They shake their fists. "We will drive 
out the Chinese" and all that, and say all 
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manner of  things which prevent  the Chinese 
being driven out. 

You have to face the background of a 
democratic country, democratic freedoms.   
To some extent they have to be limited.   
There is the Defence of India Act, which is 
not  wholly functioning   j now  but it  is 
meant for    that.   But even in working that  
Defence of India Ordinance or    Act we do 
not do    it wholeheartedly, we do not like to 
do it unless we are forced to.   I do not know, 
in course of war it may gradually  become  
stiffer  in  its  operations. That is possible.   
But at the moment we have got inhibitions in 
acting, in stopping a man from writing or 
publishing something.   But there it is, a 
completely    regimented apparatus    in 
private life and public life.   That    is helpful 
in a war effort, but   I do not think it is 
ultimately helpful.      I  do think that a 
democratic    background ultimately is the 
stronger of the two, and I think, you can see 
something of it;  some  glimpse of it you can 
have here  even in  the  last fortnight,  two or 
three weeks in India, by the wonderful 
response that we have had from our people.   
Now, that it is not a regi-minted response.    It 
is a spontaneous response which has  come  
out of the people's minds and hearts and it 
does show that our fifteen year old democracy 
has taken roots in the people, that, it is all verY 
weu f°r us t0 quarrel with each other and to 
make all kinds of demands, but when they see 
when they feel, that there is danger to their  
democratic set-up they have come up like  
this.    That is a 5. P.M. very healthy sign, a 
very hopeful sign and something that has 
heartened  all  of us.    So,  I  do think that the 
democratic apparatus is ultimately  good even 
from the point of view of war, provided of 
course that the apparatus and everything else   
is r.ot. swept away at the first rush. But wo 
can be sure that it will not    be swept away.    
Therefore it becomes a question  of  utilising  
that enthusiasm in   a   democratic   manner  
with    such limitations   as  war  imposes   
upon   us and directing it to defend the 
country and  repel the invader.    There again 

we have to think from a long-term view( and 
it should not be a question of our panting too 
soon, losing our breath too soon. We may 
have to run long long distances and for a long 
long time we have to carry on with 
determination and with fortitude. Wei', our 
demonstrations and processions will not help 
in that. They may be good for rousing 
enthusiasm here and there, but we require 
something much deeper, much stronger, much 
more  enduring for that. 

Now, one further matter, which    I should  
like  to  mention  is,  that  it is really painful 
and shocking to me—the way    the   Chinese   
Government   has, shall I say, adhered 
repeatedly to untruths.   I am putting it in as 
mild a way as   I can.   What are they   doing t 
.day?    In the other   House, I said it is  
aggression and  invasion which reminds me of 
the activities of the Western powers in the 
nineteenth or the eighteenth  century.    Perhaps    
I    was wrong.   It is more comparable to the 
activities of Hitler in the modern age, because 
one thought that this kind of thing cannot 
happen nowadays.      Of c:urse, some 
aggression may take place here and there but 
this well thought-out, pre-meditated and well 
organised invasion is what one thought was ra-
ther out-of-date and not feasible.   We know 
the whole   Chinese mentality, of the   
Government at least.   It seems to think  that 
war is  a natural state of affairs,  and here  we 
are  disliking it, excessively    disliking    the    
idea    of war   emotionally   disliking   it,    
apart from    not    liking    its    consequences. 
We have, therefore, to realise that we are   up   
against   an   enemy   which   is well 
conditioned, well prepared for the type of 
action it has taken and which is prepared also  
to cover it up with any number of falsehoods. 
And whatever we may do, to some extent this 
kind of    propaganda of the   Chinese, 
naturally,    has some  effect on    other people 
in their own countries.   I    do not say that the   
Chinese persons are all against   India but 
listening tn their own propaganda they are 
influenced by it.  and other countries,  the so-
called non-aligned    countries,    getting    that 
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measure are affected by it, or at any rate", are 
confused toy it. Therefore, it is no good our 
getting angry with them that they do not stand 
forthright in our defence, in support of our 
position, because they are confused. Not only 
are they confused, but sometimes they are little 
afraid too. So, whatever the reason, we have to 
meet this and meet it with truth. Now, in war, 
Sir, unhappily— it has been said—the first 
casualty is truth. That is perfectly true, and the 
sad part of a war is not that people die in large 
numbers—that is sad of course—but the sad 
part of it is that war brutalises a nation and 
individuals. Well, death comes to all of us at 
its proper time but the brutalising of a country 
and of people is a more harmful thing. Now 
we have undergone a process under Gandhiji 
which is the reverse of this. I dj not mean to 
say that we in India—our people— are any 
better than other people. I do not agree to that. 
We have numerous failings, weaknesses and 
we are even violent in small matters when 
other countries may not be. But the fact is that 
basically we are a gentle people, basically we 
have been conditioned by Gandhiji, especially, 
in peaceful methods, and however violent we 
may become occasionally, at the back of our 
minds there is that training. And it alarms me 
that we should become, because of the 
exigencies of war, brutal-ised, a brutal nation. 
I think that would mean the whole soul and 
spirit of India being demoralised, and that is a 
terribly harmful thing. Certainly, I hope that all 
of us will remember this. 

Now, only the other day—two days ago—I 
saw a statement made by Acha-rya Vinoba 
Bhave for whom I have the greatest respect. I 
do not agree with everything that he says. Of 
course, I have the greatest respect for him be-
cause I do think in the whole India he 
represents Gandhiji's thinking more than 
anybody else. And it heartened me—what he 
said about this Chinese invasion. He 
condemned it in his own gentle language, but 
he condemned it 

 and he said himself he was not a man of war, 
he could not take a gun and meet it, but 
inferentially, he said India had to do it.   But 
then he added that he hoped very much that 
even in doing so we would not be full of 
hatred, our minds full of hatred and    ill-will 
and brutalised  and  all that.   Well, hope so 
earnestly.   Now,    what    will happen.   I 
cannot say, because war itself is a powerful 
agent for metamorphosis—varied experiences 
and brutalities.   We may    have to undergo    
all that, not the men.   The men   in   the 
battlefield who face death all the time still 
sometimes survive this hatred. It is the people 
sitting behind    who indulge in all this hatred.   
Then energy and courage of the men in the 
battlefield is exercised in action but the men 
sitting at the counters in their money-houses 
and who encourage them    too indulge in all 
this hatred business and create this brutalised 
mentality. Well, I do hope   that   somehow   
we   shall escape it; we    shall try our best    to 
escape it. 

Now, some people criticise    us lor having 
suggested that we are prepared to talk to the 
Chinese representatives if they withdraw to the 
position before the    8th of    September.    And    
some people say "No, you must not talk to 
them, you must not do any such thing until  they 
withdraw completely from Ladakh and 
everywhere."    Now.    the 8th of September 
was the day when they came in NEFA across 
the Thagla Ridge and also  attacked Ladakh and 
went and captured some more territory in 
Ladakh.   Now, let us be brave but let us also be 
sensible.    Our saying to them "We will meet 
you only when you surrender and confess  de-
feat" is not a thing which is likely to happen.    
Whatever happens, they are not defeated nor are 
we defeated.    In fact, it is very difficult for 
China to defeat us and it is still more difficult 
for us to defeat China.    We are not going to 
march to Peking.   Even if we have success 
here;  as we hope to, it does not defeat China 
and even if they have success in the mountains, 
it does not mean that they defeat India. You 



 

must remember that this type of war 
is a war which may go on indefinitely, 
simply sucking the blood of either 
country and bi utalising us. Therefore, 
to talk of conditions which are mani 
festly aot going to be fulfilled in the 
forseecble future is not a wise thing. 
What do we seek after that? We seek 
after tnat, if these conditions that we 
Slave s;t are fulfilled, to talk to them 
'about what? It is to talk to them— 
our re presents tives and theirs—as to 
how v e can .iroduce conditions to 
relax ensions. etc. mav be other 
with-ir iwals which will lead to the 
third stage which is talking to them 
nn toe merits of the question. We do 
not agree to anything in between and 
I think it is a perfectly fair and legi 
timate proposal, honourable to us. As 
a matter of fact, as the House knows, 
the Chinese have rejected it complete- 
ly 01 id.   So. the various friends 
in J her countries are putting forward 
numerous mediatory proposals, more or less 
all of them based on some kind of a cease-fire 
immediately and about the Chinese proposals. 
I need not go into them because they are so 
manifestly meant to favour their aggression 
and to give them a chance to establish 
themselves and push us out and then, may be 
at a later stage, to commit aggression again. 
But these people are confused. They put 
forward proposals which are very much- to our 
disadvantage. Fortunately, after we had 
explained these various matters, President 
Nasser of the U. A. R. put forward certain 
proposals which are verv very near our 
proposals. They are not exactly the same but 
are very near; basically our proposals that they 
should retire behind Thagla Ridge, that 
conditions before the 8th of September should 
be produced. That is the basic part of his 
proposals. That too the Chinese have rejected. 
I think that the proposals we have put forward 
are honourable, legitimate and not coming 
through weakness but strength and they are 
having a good impression on the rest of the 
world. The rest of the world also counts in 
such matters. 

Many people have    said    that    we should 
close up our Mission in Peking 

and they should close the Chinese Mission 
here. Now, that is a legitimate thmg for us to 
say or to do but we have to balance certain 
advantages and certain disadvantages, and for 
the moment, I need not and I cannot go into all 
the details. For the moment, we do not think it 
will be advantageous to us to do that. When 
the time comes, if it is necessary, we shall do 
that. Again other Members, I believe, have 
talked about our withdrawing our forces from 
the Congo and the Gaza Strip. It is true that 
we would like to withdraw them. We nave 
suggested that we should withdraw them but 
we have felt that we should not do something 
suddenly without adequate preparation for it 
on the other side, something which will upset 
all the two years' effort in the Congo and cast 
a heavy burden on the U.N. Therefore, we 
have told them that we would like to withdraw 
them and we would like them to make other 
arrangements but for the present we will not 
withdraw them till they agree to it. We have 
certain international obligations. It is true that 
where the safety of our country is concerned. 
that is the first consideration. Neverth-less, in 
the balance we thought that we owed 
something to the international community, to 
Africa, and withdrawing them in a panicky 
condition would not be good and the amount 
of help that we derive from it, would be less 
than the harm we cause by our acting in that 
manner, but of course, we want to withdraw 
them as soon as we conveniently can. 

Finally, I should like to say that this is a 
tremendous challenge to our manhood and our 
nationhood, something which is far above our 
party bickerings and party conflicts. Of 
course, parties have their views and they are 
entitled to them, but for the moment, this is 
something bigger than those things and the 
challenge has also another aspect of it and that 
is, it is an opportunity to build up our nation, 
an opportunity to build up on right lines—that 
is my trouble—lest we in our excitement or in 
our folly should go into wroung lines because 
that would 
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deeper tragedy than war. That is not to be 
corrupted by war, to use war to the utmost of 
our strength, not to be corrupted and to use 
that war situation to change our pattern or 
economic and social structure on right lines. If 
we do that, then out of this great trouble that 
we face, good will come for the nation and I 
would like this House and our Parliament and 
our Members to give this lead to the nation 
that we are not interested in the so-called 
victory by itself, because victory is a hollow 
thing if you miss the fruits of victory. The 
fruit of victory is not a little territory. We have 
seen great wars in Europe and elsewhere, 
mighty countries fighting each other and 
countries have won, won decidedly and yet 
somehow the fruits of victory have escaped 
them. That is the lesson of the last two wars. It 
has slipped out of their Angers and new 
problems have been created which they cannot 

solve today and they think of the third war. 
Therefore, we have to think of the basic 
things we aim at because something has come 
in the way, a very bad thing—aggression— 
which is bad from our national point of view, 
from every point of view, therefore, we have 
to get rid of it and we will try our utmost to 
get rid of it/but that by itself is not enougn. In 
doing so, because the process of doing so 
shakes up the nation completely, we have to 
see that that shoking up of the nation is of the 
right kind and they yield right results. Thank 
you. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The House stands 
adjourned till 11 A.M. on Monday, November 
12, 1962. 

The House then adjourned at 
twenty minutes past five of the 
clock till eleven of the clock on 
Monday, the 12th November  1962. 
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