
991 Written Answers [ 9 AUG. 1962 ] to Questions 992. 
 

t [NATIONAL SEEDS CORPORATION 

249. SHRI B. N. BHARGAVA: Will the 
Minister of FOOD AND AGRICULTURE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether Government have recently set 
up a National Seeds •Corporation; if so, what 
is its constitution and how the work of seed 
production will be carried out by it in the 
various States; and 

(b) how the Corporation will be 
connected with the seed organisations that are 
functioning in the various States?] 

t[THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FOOD AND AGRICULTURE 

(SHRI RAM SUEHAG SINGH): (a) No. The 
National Seeds Corporation is expected to be 
set up shortly. The Corporation, which is 
proposed to 

be registered as a Company under the 
Companies Act, 1956, will have a Board of 
Directors at the helm of its affairs. The 
production and distribution of foundation seed 
will be undertaken by the Corporation under 
its direct control. The production of certified 
seed in the States will be the responsibility, as 
far as possible, of Co-operatives or, failing 
that, select individuals or joint-stock concerns. 
These bodies will be helped by the 
Corporation by providing financial aid and 
affording technical guidance. 

(b) In the matter of organisation of the 
production, etc., of improved seed, the 
National Seeds Corporation will act in 
collaboration with the organisations that are 
already functioning in the various States and 
also the other State authorities connected with 
the matter.] 

 

t[An. INDIA SOIL AND LAND USE SURVEY 
SCHEME 

249. SHRI B. N. BHARGAVA: Will the 
Minister of FOOD AND AGRICULTURE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the names of the States in which land 
was surveyed under the All India Soil and 
Land Use Survey Scheme during the last year 
and the 
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area of land surveyed in each of those 
States; and 

(b) the  action that is being taken on 
the Survey Reports?] 

 

 

tETHE MINISTER OP STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FOOD AND AGRICUL-
TURE       (SHRI RAM SUBHAG SINGH): 

(a) The required information is given. 
below: — 
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Ob) The Soil Survey Reports provide data 
which will enable States to prepare land use 
and treatment plans and are intended to be 
utilised by them for formulating soil conser-
vation measures. The reports are being 
utilised accordingly.] 

 

t [IMPLEMENTATION    OP   RECOMMENDATIONS   

MADE  BY  THE  CENTRAL   COUNCIL OP 

HEALTH 

250. SHRI B. N. BHARGAVA: Will the 
Minister of HEALTH be pleased to refer to 
page 153 of her Ministry's report for the year 
1961-62 and state the progress so far made by 
the State Governments in implementing the 
recommendations made by the Central 
Council of Health at its ninth meeting held at 
Hyderabad?] 

 

tCTHE MINISTER OF HEALTH (DR. 
SUSHILA NAYAR) : The information is being 
collected and will be laid on the Table of the 
Sabha in due course.] 

 

t [CHEMICAL EXAMINATION OF IMPORTED 

FOODGRAINS 

251. SHRI B. N. BHARGAVA: Will the 
Minister of FOOD AND AGRICULTURE be 
pleased to state what has beea the result of 
chemical examination made in 1961-62 in 
regard to the nutritive value of the foodgrains 
imported from foreign countries; how many 
samples of each foodgrains were examined 
and what were the food-grains examined?] 

 

HTHE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FOOD (SHRI A. M. THOMAS) : 
Chemical examination of 249 samples, 
comprising 55 of rice and 194 of wheat, 
carried out during the year 1961-62 has shown 
that the food value of the grain imported has 
been satisfactory. Only wheat and rice were 
imported during the year.] 
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