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•was likely to get what he got in 1961. Some, 
particularly the expanded units, will get more. 
That is why the actual allocations for 1962 are 
higher than the actual despatches of 1961. 

SHRI K. SANTHANAM: But how much?    
What percentage increase? 

SARDAR SW ARAN SINGH: I have given 
the figures. For daily average despatches in 
1961 the figure was 5,999. Now the 
allocations are on the "basis of 7,271 wagons 
a day. 

SHRI M. H. SAMUEL; The hon. Minister 
has stated that he is using road transport also 
to move coal—in order to supplement railway 
movements. What percentage of coal has been 
moved by road transport during last year and, 
secondly, what is he doing to set up coal 
dumps in order to meet the urgent 
requirements in various areas? 

SARDAR SWARAN SINGH: Sir, it is not 
easy to give exact information about the 
quantity of coal that moved by road. An 
estimate from 2-3 million tons a year will not 
be quite inaccurate. In addition t° this 
movement by road, we are attempting to 
move coal to the coastal areas by sea also. We 
have also taken a decision that the difference 
in the cost of transport by sea as compared to 
the cost of transport by rail would be 
lubsidised. 

SHRI M. H. SAMUEL;  Coal dumps? 

SARDAR SWARAN SINGH: So far as •coal 
dumps are concerned, we very much like that 
coal dumps should be «stablished. Actual 
physical dumps have not been established, but 
movement to specified points has already 
started. It moves by rail to a particular point in 
a State and that has also improved the turn-
round of the wagons. 

WRITTEN  ANSWERS  TO QUESTIONS 

PRODUCTION OF SMALL CAR 

*168. SHRI DAHYABHAI V. PATEL: 
Will the Minister of DEFENCE be pleas-ed to 
state: 

(a) whether it is a fact that his Ministry 
has taken over the scheme for the production 
of small car or people's car; and 

(b) if so, whether it has entered into any 
agreement with any foreign firm or 
Government for technical aid and if so, what 
are the estimates of cost of the plant, etc., and 
of the product? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER OF DEFENCE 
(SHRI K. RAGHURAMAIAH) : (a) No, Sir. 

(c) Does not arise. ISSUE  or  

 
MATRICULATION CERTIFICATES FOR THE  

EAR 1947 BY PAKISTAN 

•169. SHRI P. N. RAJABHOJ: Will the 
Minister of EDUCATION be pleased to  state; 

(a) whether it is a fact that the 
Government of Pakistan have agreed to issue 
Matriculation Certificates of the Punjab 
University for the year 1947 to the students 
who have migrated to India; and 

(b) if so, what is the number of such 
certificates and by when they are likely to be 
issued? 

THE MINISTER or EDUCATION (DR. K. 
L. SHRIMALI) ; (a) Yes; on application by 
persons concerned as for other certificates 
under the Indo-Pakistan agreement. 

(b) The number of such certificates in 
Pakistan is not known; their issue depends on 
the Pakistan Government. 


