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ACCIDENT OF A RAILWAY PASSENGER  
STEAMER   AT   DIGHA    GHAT   IN BIHAR 

STATE 

78. SHRI NAWAB SINGH CHAU-HAN: 
Will the Minister of RAILWAYS be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether it is a fact that a railway 
passenger steamer met with an accident at 
Digha Ghat in Bihar State on the 18th 
October, 1957; if so, what is the extent of 
loss incurred thereby; and 

(b) what was the cause of the accident and 
how many passengers were travelling in the 
steamer?] 

 

 

ttTHE DEPUTY MINISTER OF RAILWAYS 
(SHRI SHAH NAWAZ KHAN): (a) and (b). A 
statement furnishing the required information 
is placed on the Table of the House. 

STATEMENT 

(a) and (b). Yes, there were two different 
groundings on 18-10-57 one by I.G.N. steamer 
SWS|Mars at present on hire with the North 
Eastern Railway at 11—15 hours and another 
by railways' own vessel P, S. Gomati at 20 
hours. Both these groundings took place 
opposite Kurji village towards the south bank 
of the river and were due to rapid shoaling in 
the zig-zag channels where the depth of the 
water was only 5'—6" and where the sand was 
continually moving resulting in the depth of 
the channel suddenly decreasing and thus 
making the control of vessels extremely 
difficult while negotiating the shallow zig-zag 
channels. The extent of loss as a result of 
these groundings was nil. 

The number of passengers travelling in the 
steamer SWS/Mars was approximately 800 
and P. S. Gomati 308.] 

t[ ]  English translation. 


