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t [CASES OF   ESTATE   DUTY ON ASSETS OF 
INDIANS IN U.K. AND vice vr.rsa 

1408. SHHI NAWAB SINGH CHAUHAN: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) the number «f cases of estate duty 
concerning the assets owned by (i) Indian 
nationals situated in the United Kingdom and 
(ii) nationals of the United Kingdom situated 
in India, which have so far been received in 
accordance with the Agreement with the 
Government of the United Kingdom which 
came into force with ef ect from the 30th June 
1956 for the avoidance of double taxation; 
and 

(b) the amount of estate duty so far (i) 
imposed and (ii) recovered on the assets of the 
nationals of the United Kingdom situated in 
Irdia since the Agreement came into force?] 

 

t [COMMITTEE TO ENQUIRE INTO 
CUSTOMS PROCEDURE AND ORGANI-

SATION 

1409. SHRI NAWAB SINGH CHAUHAN: 
Will the Minister of FINANC* be pleased to 
state the progress so far made by the 
Committee appointed by Government to 
conduct a comprehensive enquiry into 
customs procedures and organisation?] 

 
f[ ] English translation. 
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-KTHE MINISTER OF FINANCE (SHRI T. 
T. KRISHANAMACHARI) : After consulting the 
public, Government Departments, foreign 
.embassies and U. N. bodies, the Committee 
issued a questionnaire covering the entire cus-
toms administration. The replies to the 
questionnaire are being examined by the 
Committee. Another set of questions framed 
from the representations received from the 
trade and Government Departments etc. was 
issued to all the Collectors of Customs and the 
Collectors of Central Excise and Land 
Customs for their comments and views. 
Replies to these questions are also under 
examination. Spot enquiries have been 
conducted at the various Customs Houses by 
members and officers of the Committee on 
various matters of customs organisation and 
procedure and a detailed investigation has 
been made or initiated  on  various  problems.] 

 
t [WIRELESS COMMUNICATION FACILITIES 

FOR ANTI-SMUGGLING STAFF 

1410. SHRI NAWAB SINGH CHAUHAN: 
Will the Minister of FINANC* be pleased to 
refer to paragraph (5) on page 12 of the 
Report of the Ministry of Finance for 1956-57 
and state the time by which the question of 
providing facilities of wireless communication 
to the staff engaged in prevention of 
smuggling will be finally decided?] 

f[THE MINISTER OF FINANCE ( SHRI T. 
T. KRISHNAMACHARI) : It has already been 
decided, in principle, to provide wireless 
communication facilities to such staff as and 
where neeessary.] 

 ]    English translation. 


