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THE    CHILDREN    BILL,       1953— 
continued. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: Mi. Kishen Chand to 
speak on the Children Bill. 

SHRI KISHEN CHAND (Hyderabad) : Mr. 
Chairman, it is several days back that we were 
discussing the Children Bill and I was 
pointing out that the objection raised by hon. 
Members was based on an insufficient study 
of this Bill. I maintain that the Select 
Committee made every effort to make this a 
model Bill and I will specially recommend the 
various clauses therein. Here I will say that 
the Chairman of the Select Committee and 
other Members of the Congress Party showed 
a cooperative spirit, so that every good 
suggestion was accepted by them and I do 
hope that in this House also if every Bill is 
referred to the Select Committee and the 
matter is thrashed out, it will be far better and 
far easier for the passage of Bills. In this Bill, 
every effort has been made that a juvenile 
delinquent is not made into a confirmed 
criminal, that from the first stage, though he is 
taken into custody by the policeman, it should 
not amount to an arrest, that he should not be 
kept in the police lock-up and he should not 
be sent to jail, that he should not be tried in 
the ordinary criminal court. All these steps 
have been taken to give him a feeling that it is 
a psychological mistake and if proper 
precautions are taken, he can be reformed and 
made into a good citizen. 

An hon. Member raised the objection that if 
a juvenile delinquent is helped in escaping 
from the special school, no punishment has 
been provided for in this Bill to that person 
who is helping that delinquent child. I may 
point out that there is a common law of the 
land and under the Criminal Procedure Code 
due punishment can be awarded to the abettor 
of that crime. Similarly, objection was raised 
that the parents who ill-treat their children 
are not liable to 
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also, there is the common law of the land. In 
this Bill every precaution has been taken that 
in the case of the neglected children, .the 
parents are not harassed unnecessarily by the 
neighbours, and the child lives in a proper at-
mosphere which is different from the 
atmosphere prevailing in the orphanages. 
These children's homes will be the best type 
of boarding schools or the best type of hostels 
where a child will be brought up in a proper 
atmosphere and thereby made into a useful 
citizen of the country. I don't want to go into 
all the various clauses of the Bill wherein 
every precaution has been taken for 
improvement and reform.     I support this 
Bill. 

SHRIMATI LILAVATI MUNSHI (Bombay): 
Mr. Chairman, I rise to support this Bill and 
also welcome it. Children are the sacred 
assets of every nation and I am glad that the 
Government has begun to think in this 
direction of promoting the welfare of the 
children. I am interested in the subject of 
children because of my long association with 
the Bombay Children's Aid Society. It was a 
Government nominated committee and I was 
associated on behalf of the Bombay 
Municipal Corporation. I remained its chair-
man for four years and, in that capacity, I had 
many opportunities to come across many such 
problems. In the Children's Aid Society, in 
my time, we had 1,200 children under our 
care. I think the Bombay Children's Aid 
Society is one of the biggest societies, and I 
don't think in any part of India such a big 
society for the children exists. It was divided 
into three institutions. One was a remand 
home, one was an industrial school and one 
was an open colony. To the remand home the 
police brought children, who were com-
mitting various offences. There was a 
juvenile court too in the same compound 
which was trying cases of the children. In the 
industrial school —it was a kind dt a 
vocational train- 

ing school—we were teaching arts and crafts 
and the Chembur Home, which was. the open 
colony and a kind of a basic school, was run 
with an agricultural bias. There was a primary 
school and craft teaching and there was 
agricultural teaching. The time was divided 
half and half —half for primary teaching and 
crafts training and the other half for 
agriculture—three hours for the first half and 
three hours for work on the land. There was a 
separate mentally deficient home too which 
the association had established on the same 
ground but in a separate compound. So, as I 
said, my long association with these 
institutions has given me some knowledge 
about these problems. I had some experience 
as an honorary magistrate in a juvenile court 
too and I had/ to listen to many stories of the 
children who were brought there. Those were 
mostly the runaway children or neglected 
children, destitute and delinquent. 

First of all, I should be permitted to say that 
very few people have any idea of what the 
children's problem is. There are many 
problems of the normal, healthy children who 
are borne in the normal and good families, but 
today we are not talking about them. We are 
today thinking of the problem of those 
children who run away from their homes and 
become waifs or who have nobody to look 
after them. Let us think of those children who 
run away from homes and why do they do it. 
There are various reasons for their escapade. 
Some children run away from home just in 
search of fun, but there are many who want to 
escape the misery and drabness of the home. 
In cases there are too many children in one 
family and not enough to eat, the child is 
neglected and he runs away to find out 
something better for himself. Then there is the 
bad treatment by a step-mother or a drunken 
father and that makes the children leave their 
homes. Then, strangely   enough,   but  that  
is   true,. 
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once they see a cinema, they «ome to the city, 
just run away to see-the cinemas in the city 
because there is a kind of glamour about it. 

SHRI PRITHVIRAJ KAPOOR 
(Nominated): Does the hon. Member 
condemn the cinemas outright? 

SHRIMATI LILAVATI MUNSHI: I don't 
condemn them outright, but these children are 
attracted to them just like a moth before a 
light. They see the cinemas and get attracted. 
These are the reasons which I came to know 
in my capacity as a magistrate of the juvenile 
court as well as in the capacity of the 
Chairman of the Children's Aid Society. 

SHRI PRITHVIRAJ KAPOOR: The hon. 
Member probably means bad pictures. There 
are always two kinds —the good and the bad. 

SHRIMATI LILAVATI MUNSHI: There 
are always two sides, and there are good 
pictures and there are bad pictures also, but 
these children cannot discriminate between 
the good and the bad ones, and when they 
happen to see a bad picture, they want to see 
more of it. And some of them, when asked 
where they learnt to commit this kind of 
crime, answer: 

 
(cinema men dekha hai). Such kind of an 
answer I have received more than once. This 
category of children, come to the cities and 
then they find that life in the city is not all a 
bed of roses. They come in search of 
adventure, or to better their condition, to earn 
a living. And what do the majority of them 
find in the city? Most of them are ignorant 
children, illiterate children and they, as I said, 
learn from the cinemas how to commit 
offences. They commit small thefts and in 
many cases they are employed in docks as 
small labourers or they are employed by 
unscrupulous persons to commit thefts, to 
smuggle liquor and that is how they are 
brought to the court They are also    employed    
in hotels 

and restaurants, • by the Champiwalas on 
Chowpaty sands. They also become the 
victims of unscrupulous people and unnatural 
offences are committed against these 
children. 

Sir, many things could be said with regard 
to these children and how they are treated. 
But I feel that the passing of a law and the 
establishing of one or two homes is no 
solution of this problem. We are just passing 
this Act for the Part C States. But how many 
of the Part A and Part B States have this law? 
Or I would like to know how many homes 
have been established by the Centre itself? 
Even when a law is passed for the States of 
Part C, sometimes they give effect to it and 
sometimes they do not. So, when making 
schemes for them, we should see that we 
ourselves follow those schemes, as also, the 
major States of the. country. Otherwise, 
passing such laws for the Part C States many 
of which have very limited resources will not 
be very helpful. 
[MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN in the Chair.] 
10 A.M. 
As I was saying, the passing of a law or the 

starting of one or two homes is no solution of 
this problem. The problem is a very vast one. 
Even when a home is established, there are 
difficulties in the actual running of it. I can 
speak from my own experience in the 
Umarkhadi Remand Home. The 
accommodation was hardly sufficient for 200 
children, but in my time there were as many as 
400 children there. When we complained to 
the Government, for some time the police 
stopped arresting these children. But that did 
not lessen the over-crowding because the 
disposal of the pending cases was very slow, 
that again being due to the fact that there was 
only one magistrate to dispose them of. The 
same thing happens in the industrial schools. 
They also were over-crowded. There is 
another evil connected with this, iover-
crowding. Even innocent ichildren. learn  a  lot 
of very 
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crimes through their association with other 
children of    a worse criminal type. 

There was a new experiment of starting an 
open colony in Chembur made by the 
Congress Government in 1949—the Chembur 
Home. There the system was to have separate 
hutments and each hutment had 20 children 
with one matron who was supposed to take the 
place of the mother for these children. The 
colony was open on all sides and the time was 
divided between primary schooling, learning 
of crafts etc. But the difficulty there was in the 
finding of suitable personnel for running these 
homes. The matrons were more like ayahs than 
mothers, because they were getting a small 
salary and for that sum we could not get more 
qualified women. The superintendent and the 
staff were not endowed with that kind of a 
missionary zeal that is necessary for such 
work. There were some trained social workers 
on the staff. Some institutions are training 
some social workers, I know. But I am sorry to 
say that these social workers have not that kind 
of a missionary zeal or spirit inculcated in 
them. It is most necessary and essential for 
undertaking such work to have the proper type 
of personnel to be in charge of such homes. 
Merely creating an institution is no solution. 
You must create the people who can take 
charge of those institutions, not mere career 
social workers who just are there for their pay 
and promotion. They should be there for the 
work itself. I could find the great difference . 
when I saw the work done by the Christian 
missionaries. One feels admiration when one 
sees this type of work which they do so well. 
One sees the difference between the work done 
by them and that done in the institutions 
established by the State or by some other 
agencies. The difference is so very apparent. 

There is one point that we should bear  in  
mind   in     this     connection. 

Secularism should be there, but secularism 
does not mean that people should have no 
faith at all. In such institutions nothing in the 
nature of religious or spiritual training is 
given. We must remember that we are here 
dealing with children who are deserted by 
their parents, or who left homes in peculiar 
circumstances; and in the process of knocking 
about in the city, they lose faith in themselves 
and also in their fellow-beings. Therefore, we 
must give them faith in themselves. Each 
child must be made to have faith in himself 
and also in his fellow beings. He must be 
given something higher, something nobler so 
that we may be able to build him up, to 
improve him. Merely giving him training and 
feeding him is not enough. We should 
rehabilitate him mentally also and we should 
give him a little of the spiritual or religious 
strength or training—call it what you will, it 
makes no difference. But it is absolutely 
necessary to give them this kind of general 
background. 

Then, the problem of after-care is also very 
important. In many cases, it happens that as 
soon as a person is released from the 
institution, unless he gets an occupation, he 
becomes part of the underworld. He has no-
where to go, no place to go to, and what will 
he do? He just does whatever comes his way 
and he must become either part of the 
underworld or commit some crime. He has no 
moorings, no family ties. Sometimes he 
becomes a mill worker or a mechanic. The 
detaining Society tries to secure some jobs for 
him but mostly these jobs are only that of a 
mill worker or of a mechanic. The Society 
could not do anything better because there ■ 
was no other occupation available and if a 
released child does not get any job he goes 
into the underworld. He comes out into the 
world without any ties, which is, as I said, not 
good for him. In Bombay we had an "after-
care organisation" where some released 
children who had some kind of jobs 
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used to come and stay. A scheme was 
formulated by the Congress Government then 
that after the children were released, colonies 
should be formed on Government land—there 
should be a group of fifteen or twenty boys—
and these boys should be settled on the land. 
We were training the children for all sorts of 
things, for example, smithy, carpentry, 
agricultural work. It was thought that they 
would settle down because of companionship 
and wo2-king together on the land and they 
would be properly rehabilitated. By living 
together and having this companionship they 
could become part of the village life, become 
good citizens, and they could settle there, 
marry there and till their own land. This 
scheme was not put into practice because the 
Ministry resigned in 1939 and there was not 
sufficient time. Afterwards, the British 
Government did not do anything. I do not 
know what the present position is because 
probably they may be doing something about 
it but some such scheme should be thought of 
while thinking of the after-care of the 
children. It is one thing to promote legislation 
and it is another to enforce it. To establish 
children's homes and to rehabilitate the large 
number of children costs money. If we are 
really undertaking a scheme very seriously 
then we must not have only one children's 
home because that will not help us. There are 
so many such children who will require our 
protection. 

Let us hope     that     this  Bill  will a new deal  
for     the  children and that a new era will 
begin after this legislation comes into force. 

SHRI PRITHVIRAJ KAPOOR: 
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X 

 

ME. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: Mr. 
Kapoor, though there is no time limit to 
your speech at this stage I request you to 
be relevant. We are not concerned here 
with the principles of education  or     
administrative  details. 



4279 Children [ 27 APRIL 1954 ] Bill, 1953 4280 
 

We are concerned here with neglected 
children and juvenile delinquents. 

SHRI PRITHVIRAJ KAPOOR: I am 
not talking about administration. I am 
only talking about the children and their 
parents or guardians, and am trying to 
say how the parents should be taught to 
look after their children. I am sorry if I 
have been irrelevant at any place. 
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[For English translation, see Appendix 
VII, Annexure No. 220.] 

SHRI TAJAMUL HUSAIN (Bihar): Mr. 
Deputy Chairman, the main object, it appears 
to me, of this Bill is to protect, look after and 
reform those children who should be pro-
tected, looked after and reformed by the 
Government by giving them educational, 
social and other opportunities. I, therefore, 
support the Bill in its entirety. I do not wish to 
make a speech; I wish to make only one or 
two suggestions for the improvement of the 
Bill. 

Sir, "juvenile delinquent" has been defined 
in sub-clause (g) of clause (2) as follows: 
"juvenile delinquent" means a child who has    
been found 
to    have  committed   an  offence, ..............." 
To my mind the word "delinquent" itself 
gives the impression that the person or the 
child has committed more than one offence—
and not one offence—and that he is a habitual 
offender. This is the impression the word 
"delinquent" gives me. I may be wrong, but if 
I am right, then I think a better word would be 
"juvenile offender" because the word 
"offender" means a person who has 
committed one offence and not necessarily 
more than one offence. So it would be better 
to use the word "offender". Then the clause 
would read—"juvenile offender" means a 
child  who has been    found to have 
committed     an offence,........... "      This  is 
a very minor suggestion that I have made. 

Another suggestion that I wish to make is 
about the neglected child. Neglected child has 
been defined in clause 2(h). It means a child 
who is found in any street or place of public 
resort begging or receiving alms etc. Suppose 
there is an old man who has no source of 
livelihood and he is blind. He is incapable of 
serving anybody and nobody wishes to 
employ him either.    He has got a 

I child aged about 10 or 12 years. The I only 
source of income for this old blind man is by 
begging. Of course, the Government have not so 
far made any arrangement for beggars, to pro-
tect them, to feed them or to look after them, but 
I hope they will, one of these days. Now, this 
blind old man has got a child of 10 or 12 years 
and he wants the child to take him round for the 
purpose of begging. Under the definition as it 
stands, that child would be treated as a 
neglected child, but it is not a neglected child. 
His father gets the money and feeds the child 
and himself. How can you call that child 
neglected? If you take the child away from the 
protection of the old man, then you are starving 
the old man. Therefore, I think something 
should be done in this matter. What should be 
done, it is for the hon. Member in charge of the 
Bill to think out. 

My last suggestion is that under this Bill 
children's homes have to be established in 
each State. We all know that the financial 
condition of the States is such that it would 
not be possible for every State to bear the 
initial and recurring expenses of at least one 
children's home. Therefore, in every State, 
more or less, you will find a number of 
private orphanages or homes for children. 
They have nothing to do with the 
Government. Why cannot the Government 
take charge of them? The building is already 
there; the expenses are met by public or by 
some other religious trusts. The only thing to 
do is to give them licences and these 
neglected children and the juvenile offenders 
may be kept there and looked after. These are 
the only suggestions I have to make. 

SHRIMATI MAYA DEVI CHETTRY (West 
Bengal): 
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"to provide for the care, protection, 
maintenance, welfare, training, 
education and rehabilitation of 
neglected children and juvenile 
delinquents in Part C States." 
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[For English translation, see Appendix 

VII, Annexure No. 221.] 

SHRI H. C. MATHUR (Rajasthan): Mr. 
Deputy Chairman, I feel I must congratulate 
the Government for this piece of legislation, 
and I have no hesitation in saying that most of 
the criticism of the provisions of this Bill, 
both from the Congress side as well as from 
the Opposition, has been unwarranted and 
certainly uninformed. I do appreciate the 
anxiety, the care and the sentiments of most 
of the Members of this House, and it is only 
natural that we all should feel the same way 
about the children. And I have no hesitation in 
saying that even during the deliberations of 
the Select Committee the Government's 
attitude was open-hearted and any suggestions 
that were advanced were accepted in the most 
commendable manner. 

So far as the provisions of this Bill are 
concerned, I feel that there is very little that 
can be said against them. As a matter of fact, 
this piece of legislation is as comprehensive as 
it could have been under the present 
circumstances. If any legitimate criticism can 
be advanced against the Government, it is 
only the general one that they have taken 
about four years, and this Bill has been with 
them on the anvil for more than that period, in 
spite of the admission on the part of the 
Government that they realised the urgency 
and the necessity of such   a provision 
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partition. This problem was already there in 
the country, but the partition of this country 
further accentuated it, and it was in that 
context that it was considered absolutely 
expedient that such a measure should be 
brought forward. But in spite of this 
recognition for urgency, it is most unfortunate 
and lamentable that this piece of legislation 
has been in the hands of Government in their 
usual sluggish manner for over four years. 

While looking at this piece of legislation, I 
think, the most important aspect to be 
considered is that so far we have been taking a 
very different view in this matter. So far we 
have always felt that children are, in entirety, 
the responsibility of parents. Now there is a 
departure. The Government is taking not only 
the responsibility for the differential treatment 
to be given to the delinquent children, but it is 
taking a very big responsibility in respect of 
the neglected children. My apprehension is not 
about the provisions of this Bill. I do not feel 
that the provisions of this Bill are not com-
prehensive. But my serious apprehension is 
that this good piece of legislation, even when 
passed, will remain a pious hope, and that very 
little good will follow from it, because this 
piece of legislation is not to come into effect 
in its entirety and there is no assurance from 
the Government, or there is no provision in the 
Bill, which may make us feel confident that in 
certain part of it, even in this limited sphere of 
Part C States, this Bill will come into effect. 
This will definitely be left to the discretion of 
Part C States and they will be dilly-dallying 
about it, because all of us know that the 
finances of these Part C States are absolutely 
depleted. They are running their 
administrations mostly on assistance and aid 
from the Central Government. And it is no 
wonder if this piece of legislation remains in 
cold storage and we may have to say "Oh, here    
is a    good piece of    legislation 

which we have got for our children; here is the 
court and here is the children's home." But we 
may have nothing in effect. I, therefore, wish 
the Government to give us at least ah 
assurance in respect of these Part C States that 
within such and such specified period they are 
going to see that the provisions of this Bill are 
made applicable to the entire area of these Part 
C States. And I am very anxious that some 
such thing should be done now, because that 
will serve as an incentive and as a stimulus to 
Parts A and B States as well. We cannot 
blame this Government for restricting the 
sphere of this Bill only to Part C States 
because it is not open to the Central 
Government to legislate for Part A and Part B 
States. Part A and Part B States are to legislate 
in their own right and this piece of legislation 
is to serve as a model for them. As soon as it 
is passed by Parliament, I hope the Education 
Ministry will send copies of this piece of 
legislation to all Part A and Part B States and 
those States will give due consideration to it 
and put it on their Statute Book. 

This problem, after our independence, has 
taken a very acute shape. We all realise that 
apart from the problem created by the 
partition, the present economic distress in the 
country has further accentuated the same. One 
feels absolutely ashamed and one does not 
know what to do when one sees the children 
begging here in Connaught Circus in New 
Delhi. Here in Delhi where we know that a 
number of foreigners visit, I feel utterly 
miserable when I think of the children hanging 
about these foreigners and asking for charity. 
So. I wish that the Government will not rest 
content with merely realising their 
responsibility in this regard in Part C States 
but will feel no hesitancy in giving all the 
funds that are necessary to implement this Bill 
in all Part C States. 

Now, in the implementation of this Bill, the 
Government should not adopt the same 
attitude which it adopts in 
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the     administration     01     tne various other 
Departments. That attitude and that manner of 
administration will be entirely  unsuited to     
serve the  real purpose  of  this   Bill,   and  it  is   
very necessary that we should enlist public co-
operation,      the      co-operation      ct public-
spirited    and   social   workers, and      
associate      them    in    the    implementation    
of    this    Bill.      It    is not  the  provisions  of 
the  Bill which are important.     They are not 
half as important as the actual implementation 
of those provisions.    I have no doubt in my 
mind that, if this is left to the usual course of 
the Department, this Bill,   instead  of  doing  
great  good  to the country for which at present 
we are congratulating    the    Government, is 
more likely    to    do    great    harm. Every care 
has been    taken    to    see that a child who is 
arrested is not left in the hands of the police or 
in custody even for a few hours.   He must be 
removed to some observation home. We have  
amended  the provision    in the original Act to 
see that he is not left in police custody even 
overnight. It is true, and that is why I say, so far 
as the provisions are concerned, they are good 
enough, that they are comprehensive enough, 
but it is the implementation of this Bill which 
requires special   effort,   which   requires  
special thinking,  which     requires  a     special 
approach and which requires  a very specialised  
machinery.   It   is   on   that that  I   wish to lay 
the greatest   stress, and I very much wish that 
the Govern-ment goes ahead with this at least in 
the Part C States before they are obliterated by  
the  States Reorganisation Commission, so that 
some good comes out of it and the time which 
we have taken over this Bill is not    entirely 
wasted. 

11 A.M. 
PANDIT S. S. N. TANKHA (Uttar 

Pradesh): Mr. Deputy Chairman, I welcome 
this Bill and I rise to give my wholehearted 
support to it and I congratulate my hon. 
friend, Dr. Shrimali who has piloted this 
humane Bill, for it. It is, however, my regret 
that it is not possible for this House to pass 
this legislation for the whole country.    W< 

can pass this legislation at the mo-rnenftmly 
in respect of Part C States under our residuary 
powers. So far as I can see, this legislation 
falls under item 4 of the State List, i.e. List 
II—"Prisons, reformatories, Borstal 
institutions and other institutions of a like 
nature, and persons detained therein;  
arrangements  with other 

 
and made applicable to all Part C States, Part 
A and Part B States also will consider it 
advisable to pass laws on similar lines. 
As we all know, modern science of 
criminology and penalogy has undergone 
revolutionary change  within the last few years, 
and it is now an established theory that a 
criminal is not produced because of some 
inherent defect in him or because of his own 
faults or       failings    but  because    of    the 
mal-adjustment    of    society    and    as such,    
it    is    the       duty       of    the public   to   
reform   the   society   and to bring about a 
change in the conditions of the average man.   
As such, it will not be wrong to say that a 
criminal is a victim of circumstances and that it 
is the society which is responsible for his 
creation.   If the society improves the lot of the 
average man    and    his surroundings, the 
chances of producing a criminal—either adult 
or child—will become almost negligible, and 
unless we take measures for the amelioration of 
the common man and radically after the present 
mal-adjustments    in    our society,    criminals       
cannot    be eliminated    or    be    made    to    
become good    citizens     of    the    State.    
Environments,    therefore,    play    a very large    
part    in    the    making or the unmaking of the 
criminal.   This is all the more  so  in the  case 
of  children who do not understand the 
consequences of their own acts, but are made to 
work on particular lines by their own parents or 
guardians in order to benefit them, and it 
would, therefore, be wrong to  blame  a  child  
for  his  acts, or to 
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in embryo. I realize that society cannot be 
reformed or put right through the process of 
legislation only but an earnest effort on the part 
of our social reformers is required for bringing 
about that change which we need in the 
society.    To bring about a change in the status 
of the   criminals .and in our outlook towards 
them  in my  own   State of  Uttar  Pradesh, the 
Government   has    passed    two    laws known   
as   the   First   Offenders   Probation Act and 
the Release on Probation    Act.   Under    the    
former    of these  two  Acts,  criminals  who  
have committed an offence    for    the    first 
time are released either    under    the 
superintendence of the Probation Officer who 
is appointed by the Government, or are placed 
in charge of any other fit person who can take 
charge of and hold himself responsible for the 
conduct of the offender.    The other    Act—
the Release  on Probation  Act—is  an  Act 
whereby after having served a certain period of 
imprisonment, the    criminal, if he is found to 
have been of    good behaviour, is released 
earlier than his term of imprisonment and is 
kept on probation for   the   remaining   period. 
Both these legislations have been working very 
well in the State and I have had the good 
fortune of being associated with the working of 
these Acts.   I was Secretary of the Prisoners' 
Aid Society for a number of years iand in that 
capacity the Probation Officer was working 
under   me.   We   had   also   established 
homes for the keeping of these prisoners and 
for training them on lines which would enable 
them to become independent and self-
supporting on release frorfi jail.    The present 
Bill is more or less on the same lines and 
desires to achieve the same object although, of 
course, it is applicable only in the case of 
children. 

Now, coming to the provisions of this Bill, 
I take up some of the salient provisions and 
give my suggestions regarding them. On the 
whole, it is certainly true that this Bill has 
been prepared well and tries to achieve the 
object which it has in view but I would like to 
place my point of view regard- 

ing  certain  aspects  of  the provisions which 
according to me, require certain changes.    I 
first take up the composition of the children's 
court.   According to sub-clause (2) of clause 4, 
the children's court is to be presided over by a 
magistrate or by a bench of magistrates and 
where a bench is constituted, it is suggested that 
as far as practicable, a woman  may be 
associated  with  that bench.   My suggestion 
with   regard to this is that according to me, it 
would have been much better if the Bill had 
provided that, so far  as    practicable, whether 
it be a single magistrate or a bench of 
magistrates    who    may     be appointed   for  
this   purpose,   the   presiding    officer    as    
appointed     should be   a   lady,   because   I 
feel   that   women   are   in   a   much   better   
position to     understand    the    child's    
psychology and to give proper relief to them by 
their love and affection than we men can.   
Men,   as   a rule believe in   the proverb:    
"Spare   the rod,   spoil    the child".   Now how 
far would a person, who    believes    in that 
maxim.    I ask you Sir, be in a position to judge 
or understand    the    child's    faults    and 
failings and to award    him    suitable 
punishment?    So I suggest that as far as 
practicable ladies should be associated with this 
work and I am confident  that  there  will  be  
no  district in which  suitable ladies will not be 
available for this work.   It is a very selfless   
and  humane, work  and  I   am confident  large  
numbers  of educated ladies will come forward 
to do it. 

There is, however. just one 
little difficulty that strikes me 
about this matter and I hope the hon. 
lady Members of this House will ex 
cuse tfpx/rne^giving expression to it. 
It is within my experience and per 
haps within the experience of 
many of us that two ladies seldom 
agree on a point and can hardly ever 
work together in amity ...............  

AN HON. MEMBER:     Is it so? 

PANDIT S. S. N. TANKHA: I say this 
knowing it from my experience of ladies 
benches  which, had  been  working  in 
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my own city of Lucknow.   They have seldom 
co-operated and even went to this extent at 
times that if one of the two lady magistrates sat 
in the bench, the other refused to go there.   If 
such things go on, how can work proceed? 
Therefore,    my    suggestion    is,    even 
though looked  at from this point    of view, it 
should not, however, be that women should be 
eliminated from this work but provision should 
be made that Where such a disagreement 
occurs between the two magistrates, then    the 
file   of   the   case, >with   their   separate 
opinions thereon, should be submitted to the 
district magistrate for his final orders.    The 
other alternative is that instead of having two 
ladies    on   the bench, have three ladies on the 
bench, whereby two of the ladies will 
necessarily concur in one order.   Even if this is 
not acceptable to the Government then I would 
suggest a third alternative viz., that the ladies' 
bench must have one male member also in it, 
so that he may be   able  to  harmonize    the    
discord between  them  and  to    bring    about 
unity in the orders which may be passed by 
them.   With this    object    in view.   I   have  
made   suggestions   and tabled some 
amendments on this clause. Now according to 
me, clause 4 needs one     other  change  also  
but  I  shall deal  with  it  when  I  take  up  
those amendments which I have tabled.   I next  
take  up  clause    5.   Sub-clause (2)     of    this    
clause    provides    the following: — 

"Where no children's court has been 
constituted for any area, the powers 
conferred on the children's court by or 
under this Act shall be exercised in that 
area, only by the following, namely: — 

(a) the district magistrate; or 
(b) the    sub-divisional     magistrate; 

or 

(c) any salaried   magistrate    of the 
first class." 

Now I fail to understand why this word 
'salaried' has been kept in sub-clause (2) (c). 
If you compare this clause with clause 4, you 
will find that there is  a    discrepancy   
between    them.    I 

specially draw the attention of the hon. the Law 
Minister to this point.   So far as I can see, 
clause 4 does not provide that the work of 
children's    court    is necessary  to  be  
entrusted  to    stipendiary magistrates only.    It   
leaves    it open   to  the  State    Governments     
to appoint either salaried magistrates  or take 
advantage of honorary magistrates. If that is the 
position, and if honorary workers  are  
considered quite  suitable for the  composition  
of  the  children's courts and if suitable persons 
can be found to do this work honorarily, why 
then should you not allow them to be absorbed 
in the making of the benches of magistrates 
who are to try this class of cases where no 
children's courts are constituted?    Therefore, I 
fail to see why  in   places   where  the  
children's courts would be established, it should 
be made incumbent that only salaried 
magistrates shall    be    employed    for this 
purpose.    If honorary magistrates or  honorary  
workers are    not    considered  good,  if  they  
are  not  found suitable for doing this work, 
then it was   incumbent   that   clause   4   too 
should have provided that they should be 
salaried magistrates only.   If clauss 4 does not 
need that condition then why have it in clause  
5?   I believe it is not the intention of the 
Government that it    should    be    only    the 
salaried  magistrate  who  should     do this  
work,  because  if  that were so, the provision    
in    clause  4  regarding women magistrates 
would    not    have been there, because it is 
only a  few ladies who are magistrates,    
throughout the length and    breadth    of    this 
country.    They are not very many and you will 
not find them in every district. If women can 
take part in the constitution of children's courts 
then it implies  that  there  is  no  stipulation  
for having  salaried  magistrates  in  clause 4.   
Therefore,   I   see  no   reason  why clause    5    
should    have    that    word "salaried" there.    I    
have,    therefore, proposed to delete this word 
"salaried" in sub-clause (2) (c) of clause 5. 
Now, the deletion  of this word from    sub-
clause   (2)   (c)   will   not   make   it in-
cumbent   on   the   State   Government 

to    employ    honorary    workers    only 
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will be left unrestricted. They will have full 
authority either to employ honorary workers 
or salaried magistrates, whomsoever they 
consider fit and wherever they can find 
suitable persons to take up this work 
honorarily they will have the liberty to so 
appoint them but where they cannot find such 
suitable persons, they can appoint salaried 
magistrates. As far as I have been able to 
follow the arguments advanced by the 
Government on this point, I am made to 
believe that it is its intention that honorary 
workers should not be put in charge of this 
work because according to it, this is a very 
responsible work which cannot be left to 
honorary workers. But, as I have just pointed 
out, if that is the real intention, then that word 
"salaried" should also have been put in clause 
4. 

As regards the calibre of honorary 
magistrates which we usually find and which 
we can find, I have no hesitation in saying 
that I have known of very many honorary 
magistrates who do this honorary work with 
as great responsibility and with as great zeal 
and earnestness as any stipendiary magistrate. 
I am also of the opinion that many of them do 
this work as well, if not better, than, many of 
the paid magistrates. I further think that the 
salaried magistrates, by their constant contact 
with cases of criminals, themselves  become  
hardened. 

SHRI TAJAMUL HUSAIN: Half 
criminals. 

PANDIT S. S. N. TANKHA: And the finer 
qualities in them diminish, if not disappear 
altogether. They thus will not appreciate the 
children's point of view so well as honorary 
selfless workers would. Moreover the position 
in most of the districts is that the stipendiary 
magistrates are considerably overworked. 
They have so much other work of the district 
that they have little time to spare for even the 
ordinary criminal litigation. Therefore, if this 
class of work is also entrusted to them, 
whether you keep the children's courts within 
the precincts of the ordinary court or you 
keeD them aloof and 

in a separate place, they will not have 
sufficient time to attend to it regularly and it 
may be that the children's cases may have to 
be adjourned from time to time because the 
deputy saheb is not available, or because the 
deputy saheb has gone on tour, or because the 
deputy saheb has gone to inspect the jail or to 
record the statement of a prisoner in prison 
and so on. Therefore, these children's cases 
will be compelled to be adjourned and 
postponed from time to time which will cause 
a lot of trouble and harassment to the 
children. From these points of views, I not 
only see no disadvantage in placing this work 
in the hands of honorary workers, but see a 
distinct advantage and convenience in it. 

Next I come to another important 
matter and that is that while clause J5 
provides that where a parent or guar 
dian of a child complains to the compe 
tent court that he is not able to exercise 
proper control over the child .................  

MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: May I take it 
that you are not moving your amendments, 
since you are speaking on them? 

PANDIT S. S. N. TANKHA: Sir, I will 
move them. I am only speaking on 
the........  

MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: You can 
speak when you move your amendments. 

PANDIT S. S. N. TANKHA: I am giving 
my reasons for the amendments proposed as I 
may not move all of them. 

MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: If you are 
not moving the amendments, you can speak. 

PANDIT S. S. N. TANKHA: I will deal only 
with some important ones now and on the 
others I shall speak at the proper time. 

MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: It will be 
duplication. 

PANDIT S. S. N. TANKHA: No, Sir At that 
time I shall deal only with those aspects upon 
which I may not have spoken earlier. 

I was submitting that according to clause 
15 it was open to the guardians 



4303 Children [ 27 APRIL 1954 ] Bill, 1953 4304
  
or parents of the children to come and say that 
they could not exercise proper control over 
the children and that the court might take 
charge of the children, or the State might take 
charge of them. But there is no provision for 
the child or the child's next friend to come 
forward directly and tell the court that his 
parent or guardian*is ill-treating him or 
neglecting him, and therefore, he may be 
taken over in the custody of the court. I am 
certainly aware that there is provision under 
clause 11 that such information can be given 
to the police officer, that is to say, it will be 
open to the child or his next friend or even 
any other third person to go and report the 
matter in the police station, or to the police 
officer, and say that such and such person is 
neglecting his child and therefore, the child 
should be taken charge of. That police officer 
may or may not take action upon it. If he does 
not take any action, then he has to make note 
of this matter in his diary and send a copy of it 
to the court concerned and if the court then 
finds that it is expedient to take charge of the 
child, it will take necessary proceedings under 
the Act. 

But there is no provision whereby the child 
or his guardian or his next of kin can go 
before the court directly and ask the court that 
immediate custody may be taken of the child. 
I think that such a provision is very 
necessary. 

I have for the present tabled some 
amendments to clause 15 to incorporate that 
provision also but I understand that objection 
has been taken to it that that will not be a 
suitable place for the proposed amendment. If 
that be so and if my point of view is 
appreciated by the Government, then a 
separate clause either after or before clause 
15 may be added to provide for that aspect of 
the matter. 

I next come to clauses 34 and 35. These 
clauses deal with appeals and revision. 
Before the present Bill went through the 
Select Committee stage, this clause read as 
follows: 

"35. (1) Any person   aggrieved   by a 
finding of the court of sessions under 

this Act that a child has committed an 
offence may, within sixty days from the 
date of the order, prefer an appeal to the 
High Court: 

Provided that the High Court may 
entertain the appeal after the expiry of 
the said period of sixty days if it is 
satisfied that the appellant was 
prevented by sufficient cause from filing 
the appeal in time." 

Now, what the Select Committee has done in 
this matter is that it has deleted sub-clause (1) 
of this clause and has only retained sub-clause 
(2) which means that it has taken away the 
right of appeal to the High Court but has only 
retained the revisional powers of the High 
Court in respect of that matter. The Select 
Committee has given its reasons for so doing 
on page (iv) of its report and it says therein on 
clauses 34 and 35, "the Committee are of 
opinion that there should be no appeal against 
acquittal under any circumstances. They are 
also of the view that there should be no 
second appeal in any case and the decision of 
the court of session passed in appeal should 
be final." 

Now, as regards the view that there should 
be no appeal against acquittal, I am in 
complete agreement with the Select 
Committee and I am certainly and definitely 
of the view that this should not be allowed to 
be done, but I would submit that if sub-clause 
(1) of clause 35 of the original Bill had been 
allowed to stand even then the fear of an 
appeal against acquittal would not have arisen 
because subclause (l)said, "Any person 
aggrieved by a finding of a court of session 
under this Act tHat a child has committed an 
offence" and did not provide for cases where 
he was held not to have com-' mitted an 
offence and as such where the order is passed 
that the child has not committed an offence, 
no appeal would lie. That is to say, where the 
child was acquitted no appeal was provided 
for but it was only provided for where a child 
had committed an offence. Therefore, it was 
only, where the finding was of conviction that 
provision was made for the aggrieved person 
to 
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Court.    This subclause,   I  think,  was   a  
very  salutary provision as it was to the benefit 
and advantage of ihe child  against whom the 
order was passed.    I am fully conscious of the 
fact that in criminal law the Criminal 
Procedure Code does not provide for such a 
procedure whereby a second appeal against 
conviction may lie to the High Court.    I am 
also conscious of the fact that in    civil    law 
where a second appeal is allowed that too is    
allowed  in  a  very    restricted measure, 
namely in cases only where a point of law   is 
involved,   whereaa under the present clause 
which I wish to be retained,  I am wishing to 
provide for a second appeal to the High Court 
on any matter whether it be on a point of law 
or on a matter of fact. Still being fully alive to 
this position of law, my submission even then 
is that since the present legislation is neither of 
the character of criminal law nor of the 
character of civil law but is a legislation    of    
an    entirely    different character namely for 
the correction of the child and for correctional 
proceedings  against  him, therefore,  no harm 
would be done, on the contrary, great 
advantage would accrue to the    child and his 
parents if such a provision of second .appeal  
to Hie  High  Court    1& allowed. I am 
definitely of the view that the High Court can    
always    make a better appreciation of the 
evidence on the record tlmn the District Judges 
can and, therefore, to provide this opportunity 
of second appeal    to    the    child would  be to 
his benefit and    to    the benefit of    his 
parents and,    as such, even though the 
procedure may be  a novel one it should be  
allowed to be provided for in this legislation. 

With these remarks, Sir, I support this 
measure and would deal with the other 
amendments tabled by me at the proper time. 

SHRIMATI MONA HENSMAN (Madras): 
Mr. Deputy Chairman, I count it a privilege to 
use and congratulate the Government on 
passing the Bill, but in congratulating the 
Government on this Bill, I would like to point 
out that while nobody can expect it to be 

quite a comprehensive measure, yet we must 
take what little corrections there may be in 
good faith. It seems interesting to me to make 
out that some of the details that were in the 
Bill that was shown to us before, have had 
very definite and good alterations made to 
them, and also there are some very interesting 
notes by some of the Members of the Select 
Committee who say they do not dissent from 
the Report, but wish to emphasise certain 
points which they would have liked to have 
had emphasised in the Bill. 

First of all, if you will allow me, I will 
make a few general observations on what I 
feel is the scope of the Bill and, in order to 
prevent my taking up time later when the 
clauses are brought up one by one, I will not 
mention now the separate clauses, but speak 
in general on the spirit of the provisions in the 
Bill, referring to the matter according to the 
pages they are on. I will not offend the law, 
but keep the discussions by saying all I have 
to say today. 

Now, one thing has, however, been brought 
into prominence since the Bill was last 
presented to us and that is that at certain stages 
of the Bill "fourteen years" is mentioned when 
I expected sixteen years, I thought that the Part 
C States, as some of the Part A and Part B 
States had done already, would be very 
anxious to follow the U.K. and other countries 
in making sixteen the definite age below 
which nobody shall be called anything but a 
juvenile. Now in this Bill it says, for instance, 
that a child of fourteen may be permitted to 
pay a fine if he is earning. Now, when the 
child is under sixteen, he certainly is a juvenile 
and preparation has been made in some of the 
homes, in some of the schools and in some of 
the places where the children are staying to 
allow them to do work, agricultural, weaving, 
carpentry and other forms of basic education 
work whereby they may earn and lay aside a 
little money; that money is not for the 
payment of fines, small or great, but for the 
day of their discharge. We have this method, 
Sir, in our State. There has been a very good 
provision made in the programme of the 
certified 
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schools whereby vegetables grown by the 
children are sold back to be used by them at 
less than the market prices, so the 
Government money allotted for their food 
goes further,, and the children are given that 
and they get good, cheap and fresh material to 
eat, as well as the money that is put by against 
their names. Different woven things are sold 
to the public—mats and towels and prints for 
this purpose. Here in this House one Member 
pointed out that basic trades should be 
introduced, such as smithy, carpentry etc. 
This could also be done, with profit to the 
Government and the children, for it makes 
them a self-respecting part of the nation. 

I now come to the question of begging as 
connected with juveniles. A suggestion was 
made by a Member of this House that an old 
gentleman who has no other means of living 
could take a child of nine or ten years and 
start begging, and he insisted that child should 
not be prevented from plying this nefarious 
trade as he was a bread winner for his aged 
relative. But, physically and morally, I 
maintain that this is not possible. In one of the 
minutes of dissent we notice that it has been 
suggested that a child which "has a parent or 
guardian who utilise the child for earning in a 
manner which affects the child morally or 
physically or who express their inability to 
exercise proper care or control over the child" 
should b^ kept in a home by the State. Now I 
ask you, Sir, and I ask the House whether it is 
not demoralizing and whether it is not against 
the welfare of the child to go and beg whether 
for an aged parent or for itself. In some parts 
of our country where I have been waiting at a 
ferry or waiting near a railway crossing I have 
seen children's homes set up, but I also saw 
that such children were begging and that the 
people who run those homes said, "Because 
the children while in their own homes used to 
be beggers and used to beg before they came 
to the home, let them continue to beg and earn 
so that the State's financial contribution to 
those homes might b?. augmented." Surely 
that is not what we are aiming at in this Bill.   
We 

wish these children to be taken into a scheme 
of rehabilitation so that they might lead a life 
in the same manner as other children do, 
where there would be regular teaching 
imparted to them,, where there would be 
scope for all sorts of recreation and other 
programmes for their rehabilitation, but not 
beggary. I would ask that this House does not 
permit begging at all to continue. If this 
begging as a "wage earner" is allowed, then 
surely there is nothing wrong if a man steals 
in order to keep his wife and children alive, or 
you may say that a woman can be unwomanly 
in her living in order to keep her husband and 
children alive. So what I mean to say is that a 
child should not be utilised by a parent or 
guardian for earning their living by the 
demoralising profession of beggary. 

Then, the police should always be' in mufti 
when handling these children. There should 
be a provision, in the Bill that the children's 
courts and the juvenile delinquents' courts 
should see that no police officer, no care-taker 
or welfare officer is present in uniform at any 
stage of the proceedings when the child also 
happens to be present, and also when 
escorting the child from one place to another. 
When the child after a court of enquiry is 
restored to the parent or guardian, the 
probation officer should keep in regular touch 
with such children and such children should 
be reported on at regular intervals  to  the  
proper     authorities. 

Now as regards the homes set up-by 
Government for these children though they 
are corrective institutions, they should be run 
from the point of view of making the children 
feel at home there, and not run in a manner 
that the child would think of escaping 
therefrom. Of course the older children 
sometimes may have-to have rather stern 
measures takert against them to keep them in 
order. The whole idea is to reform the 
children and to remember they are after all 
children. Therefore, I cannot  agree  with  one  
of  the  previous 
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House who mentioned the word 'criminal' in 
connectior with a child. There is no such thinj 
as a criminal child at all. It i: society which is 
criminal, which hai , denied the child the right 
and opportunity to lead a normal life under 
normal circumstances either economically or 
otherwise. So I support the phrase used in this 
Bill and say that the word 'offender' is all right. 
The child should not be called an 'accused' 
because he is not the accused. In all the cases 
and charge-sheets regarding these children I 
want the word 'offender' to be put in instead of 
even the word 'accused'. A child is not an 
accused in the sense of an adult being an 
accused—he is a juvenile offender, not even a 
delinquent. 

Nov/ these children, when they come back 
from the court, when they are sent to their 
homes and if those homes are at great 
distances, or miles away from the places 
where the courts are held, should go under 
proper escort. What I mean is that a woman 
should go with the girl and a man with a boy, 
but no escort should be in uniform and they 
should never be sent in such circumstances 
without a suitable escort. Nobody should get 
the impression that a young criminal is being 
taken, along the road by the police. 

Then there is no special provision tor those 
children who are economically in very sound 
circumstances, and rightly so, though I am 
afraid they should also be treated as neglected 
children. There may not always be 
economically neglected children to be cared 
for by the State, but the children who lack 
proper care or have no right precept or 
example set before them. In this connection, I 
may tell the House that I saw this morning in 
one of the leading papers of this country, on 
the leader page the news that Rita Hayworth's 
two children are probably 

going  to  be   brought  under  the  law by   
reason    of     their     neglect.     One child was 
born 8 years ago  and the other  only  4 years     
ago—both     are girls—and   Rita     
Hayworth,   as     we know,    lacks    nothing    
in    money or notoriety   (some     may call it 
fame) and is often envied by young girls— but 
they were kept in the charge of a governess; all 
the same the people living  near  them  and     
seeing  them every  day  perhaps  do     not  
consider these   children   are   being      
properly looked after, or properly brought up, 
and    since    they    may    be    brought under 
the    circumstances and clauses of a neglected 
child, members of the public   seem  to    have    
reported  the matter to the court for 
investigation. Therefore,  the people  who  live  
next door to many families in our country and 
who ought to    know the condition of the    
children in their neighbourhood may    well    
introduce       an enquiry  as  to  why     such     
children should not be brought under the law 
governing neglected    children.    What I want 
to impress upon the House is that it is not only 
the  children who are in economically bad 
circumstances that they     may     become    
neglected children, but even children who  are 
in very  good     homes     under     very 
excellent    circumstances      outwardly may  
also  suffer  neglect,     misunderstanding     
and       ill-treatment.       Of course,   these   
children  will   be   dealt with separately, I 
suppose—not under this particular    law    in    
a    juvenile court, because it may not fall 
within the   scope   of  this   Bill  to  judge   the 
offences against them but under some other   
law.     Their   cases,     of  course, may  not be  
brought     into  the  open by  reason  of  the  
fact  that  Government  is  not  being  called     
upon   to support them. 

Now, one of the Members in one of the 
minutes of dissent has talked about 
"victimised children". Surely victimised 
children should not come under a Bill like 
this. Surely it was an adult who victimised the 
child or who aided and abetted the 
victimisation of the unfortunate child. 
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&o a victimised child should be kept in as 
much privacy as possible in order to allow 
him or her to forget the circumstances of 
victimisation and so such cases should not be 
provided for in this Bill, and the juvenile 
court should not be expected to deal with 
such cases, except perhaps in camera. 

Now, Sir, I would say that private 
orphanages and schools are also a very good 
way of looking after these children. We have 
got in the State from which I come not only 
homes where the children can be sent, but also 
private institutions for the purpose of training 
them, to which Government gives certain 
amounts for their upkeep—perhaps Rs. 15 for 
children under ten and Rs. 25 for children 
over ten. Of course, I speak subject to 
correction, because the rates change according 
to the money market. Certain amounts are 
definitely given by the .Government for boys 
and girls to be kept in schools like the Avvai 
Home which Dr. IVTuthulakshmi Reddy runs 
and the Seva-Sadan where no discrimination 
is made on the ground of caste or creed, or 
any such thing and, nobody in the school, 
except the teachers know who is the 
delinquent and who is the child that has been 
brought there and paid for by Government or 
who is the child from the wealthy family or 
average family —all are treated alike. All the 
other children accept these children as one of 
themselves. Therefore, the private schools and 
the aided schools are also some of the best 
places where the delinquent children can be 
reformed to be like other children in society 
again, and reinstated in homes and families. 

I would emphasise the fact that homes run 
by the Government are very necessary for the 
implementation of this Bill, but other 
Members have already pointed this fact out, 
and so I will not dwell on that point any 
further. Special care should be taken to 
choose the people 

18 C.S.D. 

wno run tnese homes and if necessary they 
should also be trained. Special care should 
also be taken to see that such homes have 
advisory committees whereby every help is 
given to the boys and girls, while they are in 
the home and after they leave it. The whole 
House knows that boys when they are 10 to 
14 years old are extremely mischievous and 
have to be specially taken care of. In our part 
of the country, in Ranipet, there is a home run 
by the Government and the children stay there 
because they want to stay there. Sometimes in 
the juvenile court a child comes to me and 
says, "Send me to Ranipet". I say, 'Why do 
you want to go there?' and his reply is, 
because "There is football there; there is 
cricket; there are games." This is the sort of 
thing we want to encourage. We shall have to 
provide a good scheme of life for the children. 
We should see that the boys and girls enjoy 
life as well as get rehabilitated. Of course, in 
the case of younger children it is a pity to 
separate boys and girls, but I would leave this 
matter for the different States to determine. 
Study, planned recreation, good food and a 
good programme of physical exercises, 
games, gardening etc. should be provided in 
each school. 

With regard to these magistrates, I would 
like to emphasise the point made by the 
previous speaker. The magistrates need not 
be paid magistrates. I agree with him entirely. 
These have got their own duties on their 
shoulders and they will naturally not have the 
time to give to children's courts. Let me tell 
you, I have been in the, children's court in 
Madras since 1932. We are always three 
women there. Three women are there. I may 
say not because as one of the hon. Members 
maintained, two women may disagree, but 
because often one may have to be away for 
various reasons in her home, for reasons of 
convenience, etc. The three women are 
honorary magistrates having third class 
powers and 
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four days in a week from 9 o'clock to 1 
o'clock. We give 20 minutes to half an 
hour to each case as may be necessary, 
but the paid magistrates would always be 
having people waiting outside the 
doors— lawyers, members of the public 
and others—and how can you expect 
them to work out of office hours? They 
cannot work from 8 to 10 or 8 to 11. I 
would, therefore, certainly endorse the 
very sensible suggestion made by the 
hon. Member that honorary women 
magistrates with third class powers may 
be employed, women who would find it 
easier to give all their time and attention 
than salaried magistrates on the bench. 
This also ensures that every care is given 
to the children. When the children pass 
out of their hands, the honorary 
magistrates can also keep in touch with 
them in their homes, in the case of girls 
when they are married after they are 16 
years of age. Do not think that young men 
do not come forward to take these girls in 
marriage. They are well-trained girls and 
there is a waiting list of bridegrooms with 
the people who are in charge of such 
homes. But they have got to make very 
careful enquiries before they can give 
these girls in marriage to those persons 
who come forward to marry them. 

Coming to children's courts, they 
should be constituted as soon as possible. 
On page 4, it says, "Where no children's 
court has been constituted for any area", 
etc. It may be a year or two before they 
are constituted or this year's budget may 
not have made proper provision and 
during that period there may be no 
children's court, but I would urge that the 
Government insists that these courts 
should be established as quickly as 
possible. In the meanwhile the 
Government should keep an eye on those 
cases. 

Every help should be given to the 
remand homes. It is quite right that a 
child should be taken from the street into 
an institution through 

the remand home. When a child as 
apprehended, whether for being a 
destitute or for any other reason, such a 
child should be taken immediately to a 
remand home, some neutral place, where 
he or she can be fed and clothed and 
where he or she can wait till the case 
comes up. In certain cases, perhaps by 
accident or by design, we have cases 
where girls have spent a night in the 
police station and there have been terrific 
repercussions. I use the words with 
discretion, the fuss that has been made 
strikes terror to the hearts of those 
concerned, and proves deterrent to a 
repetition of this behaviour —and I am 
drawing attention to this fact so that this 
eort of offences may not be committed 
again. 

Then the Government talk about 
inquiries by competent court regarding 
neglected children. This should always 
be done by special officers. On page 6 it 
is mentioned that when the case comes 
up before the court the child and the 
parents may be called there and the 
probation officer who is the essential part 
of the machinery  should  also be  there. 

About the clause relating to un-
controllable children, when the com-
plainant says that if they do not listen to 
their mama or heed their papa, they may 
be sent to the home. What may happen 
is, a person who may make a faked 
complaint about a poor innocent timid-
looking child saying that this child is 
uncontrollable just because he wants to 
place the burden of its education on the 
State. Honorary magistrates have to 
exercise great discretion and send the 
probation officer at odd times and odd 
seasons to see whether this poor little 
innocent child is really uncontrollable or 
not. Of course, where the child is really 
uncontrollable it is very desirable that the 
child is sent to a place where it could 
have proper training and opportunities 
for education and be under other than the 
home influence. 
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like the words 'juvenile delinquents' to be 
changed into 'juvenile offenders'. When a 
child has committed an offence, 
information should be sent to the parent 
or guardian. He should be summoned or 
notice should be sent to him to appear in 
court where the child is to appear not 
only at the beginning of the case, but also 
at the end of the case, so that the parent 
or the guardian knows definitely what is 
to be done with the child, whether he is 
to receive back the responsibility of his 
training, whether the child is admonished 
and returned to the parents and home or 
whether he has to pay the fine for the 
delinquency of the child or have the child 
removed to a school. For instance, 
supposing a boy of 16 takes out a motor 
car and creates an accident in the street, 
killing someone. Then we would find it 
necessary to fine the parent, not the child. 
The child is bound over and corrected by 
the court. But the demand is made on the 
parent because the child was under his 
jurisdiction and he failed in his duty of 
looking after the child and virtually 
allowed the child to do this misdeed. On 
page 9, there is a reference to juvenile 
delinquents being kept in safe custody 
and this perhaps could be done in 
borstals. I would however leave it to the 
Government because the Government 
runs the borstals wherever they are, and a 
small percentage of childrea need the 
stricter life or discipline and correction. 

As for the powers of the competent 
courts, I would approve of the power of 
appeal to be retained. It is most useful, 
for with the best will in the world, the 
juvenile court may make a mistake in 
some cases. Either the child gives a false 
age or that given by the parent happens to 
be false and only a doctor can give the 
final verdict ■on this question. There was 
a case the other day where a child of very 
good birth was scolded by the parent with 
the result that the child ran away  and  
got into  a  remand  home. 

The probation officer could not detect 
that the child was lying because the child 
had given a string of inventions, and the 
child was committed in all good faith to a 
Government home by the three women 
honorary Presidency magistrates dealing 
with the case. Then the father came and 
brought a case in the High Court, for 
restoration of his child and he proved 
that the child had, by not telling the truth, 
laid itself open to the charge of 
delinquency! Surely an appeal should be 
allowed in such a case. The same may be 
the case about age of a juvenile. It is very 
difficult to determine the age of boys and 
girls as to whether they are 15 years of 
age or 16 years of age. For this purpose a 
competent doctor should be there and 
that opinion should be upheld by the 
court. 

I would not like to take up any more 
time of the House, for I know there are 
many other speakers. As the Government 
have themselves said, this is a model Bill 
and when it comes into force in the Part 
C States, I hope it will encourage the 
other States also to adopt this, and this 
House to pass this and implement the 
same, 

SHRI R. P. TAMTA (Uttar Pradesh) : 
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"lives in a brothel or with a prosti-
tute or frequently goes to any place 
used for the purpose of prostitution, or 
is found to associate with any 
prostitute or any other person who 
leads an immoral, drunken or depraved 
life;" 
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[For English translation, see Appendix 
VII, Annexure No^ 222.] 

SHRIMAH LAKSHMI MENON 
(Bihar). Mr. Vice-Chairman, before I 
commence my speech about the Bill I 
would like to express my strong protest 
against the aspersions cast on women 
magistrates by one    of     the 

previous speakers. If that hon. Member 
knew anything about the movement for 
child protection in this country or 
anywhere in the world, he would have 
realised that the whole movement was 
initiated by women and not by men. And, 
he also referred to his experience of 
women magistrates in Lucknow. I am 
sure he was not referring to any specially-
trained or specially-constituted women 
magistrates, but just to ordinary women 
picked up in order to satisfy a persistent 
demand that women should be associated 
with judicial work. I was in fact going to 
support his amendment to the effect that 
all the magistrates shall be women as far 
as practicable. But now I think I have to 
be more reasonable and content with the 
view that it is not a question of whether 
the magistrates should be men or women, 
but it is a question of whether the 
magistrates should be suitably trained 
people. 

SHRI B. GUPTA (West Bengal): I 
hope the remark of the hon. Member 
about women magistrates would not be 
made a ground for divorce! 

SHRIMATI LAKSHMI MENON: I am 
afraid I do not share the general 
enthusiasm for this Bill for a very simple 
reason. The Bill deals with two categories 
of children, the neglected and the 
delinquent. For one thing, no attempt is 
made to make a distinction between 
offence and crime. In other countries 
where legislation is framed for dealing 
with delinquent children, a differentiation 
is made between a criminal and a 
delinquent, i.e., a difference is made 
between crime and offence. But here all 
crimes or all offences, short of man-
slaughter, are included in the term 
'delinquent'. That is one of the chief 
objections to the Bill. 

And secondly, I am not in the habit of 
supporting nebulous schemes, ideas 
dealing with such important matters as 
protection, treatment and education of 
children. 
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Let us take the population of the Part C 

States. It is about 10 millions and we are 
told that the percentage of the population 
of the age group— 5 to 14—is about 23 
or 24 per cent. according to the census 
report of 1951. Now, I would like to ask 
the hon. the Mover of this Bill what 
percentage of these 2i millions of children 
of the school-going age are properly 
educated or educated in schools. The 
Government, instead of making provision, 
adequate and the right kind of provision 
for the education of children, goes on 
passing legislation dealing with mal-
adjusted, neglected, victimised, exploited, 
ill-treated and other kinds of children, and 
also the uncontrollable children —let me 
not omit it. Everybody admits—
everybody who has anything to do with 
education—that the first step towards 
civilisation in any community is the 
provision of adequate education. Now, in 
this country, unfortunately, we do not 
have provision for adequate education. If 
you go to any city or district headquarters, 
or any railway station, or any other place 
where people gather, the thing that strikes 
your eye is the huge mob of children of 
the school-going age, ill-clad, unkept, 
without any idea as to what they have to 
do, just running wild, sometimes begging 
and sometimes fighting. It happens not 
only in Part C States but all over India. 
Now, what has the Government done? I 
ask the Government —the Central 
Government as well as the State 
Governments—what have they done to 
deal with these children? These children 
are just being driven to the pavements, 
because there is no accommodation for 
them in their own homes and there is no 
provision by the State for their education. 
When a society sends its children away—
its school-going children—away to the 
pavements, it is preparing the ground to 
create delinquents, and, therefore, the 
responsibility of the State is not to 
introduce such kind of half-hearted 
legislation without any motive or purpose 
but to see    that    adequate    provision is 

made for the education of our young 
people. I say this with a sense of 
responsibility, because if we read about 
crime statistics, we will find that most of 
the crimes are committed by children 
between the ages of 8 and 16, and I am 
told that the peak age for crime is 13 and 
the peak age for offence is 16. The whole 
of this group belongs to the school-going 
age. 

Many speakers have mentioned about 
the causes of delinquency. I do not quite 
agree with all that my colleague, Mr. 
Bhupesh Gupta, had said about the 
socio-economic causes of crime. In one 
of the reported speeches of Mr. H. 
Brown—I think it was in Glasgow in one 
of the Scottish Universities—he has 
proved with a good number of examples 
from current British life that impeccable 
material conditions do not necessarily 
mean the absence of delinquency. He has 
also proved that in areas where there has 
been healthy and good housing, crime 
has increased whereas in the slum areas 
it has not increased to the same extent. 

SHRI B. GUPTA: In Mayfair in 
England crime is increasing among the 
rich! 

SHEIMATI LAKSHMI MENON: We 
have only to go through the crime 
statistics, in order to realise the truth of 
this observation of the United States of 
America, where the material conditions 
are better than anywhere else in the 
world, that it is only one of the 
contributory causes; it is not everything. 
A great Russian scientist has told us that 
the best way to train a child to live as a 
normal good citizen is to train its 
conditioned reflexes—what we call in 
ordinary parlance good habits. These 
good habits can be inculcated in the child 
by means of social restraints, by means 
of educational opportunities, by means of 
traditional systems of conduct and 
behaviour. Now, we are omitting all 
these things and instead, we are trying to 
bring in legislation 
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provide for anything, at all because everything 
is left to the discretion of the State Govern-
ments. As we all know, the States do not have 
any money for anything, nor has the Central 
Government for that matter, and the result is 
that we have a legislation which will surely 
decorate our Statute Book but will mean 
nothing as far as the problem is concerned. 
Having said that the need for education is the 
most important need as far as the prevention 
of crime is concerned, I would like to point 
out that this idea of creating an atmosphere of 
good living by means of sound education had 
been emphasised in this country many, many 
hundreds of years ago. If I remember aright, 
when Lord Buddha began his first sermon at 
Saranath, what he said was something like 
this: It is not by heredity that a man becomes a 
Brahmin or a savage but by his good actions 
and good conduct, emphasising thereby that it 
is environment and education that matter more 
than heredity. 

We are told that this Bill is a model Bill 
and that it is the result of the labours of a 
committee of experts. I had asked since then 
the hon. the Mover of this Bill to tell me the 
names of those experts, but as usual, the 
names were not available. They have just 
disappeared, and hence it is very difficult for 
me to point out whether any attempt has been 
made to study the statistics of crime since the 
partition. We are not supplied with any 
statistics, nor do we know how the inter-State 
repercussions are met by this particular Bill. 

One of the very important things which is 
contributing to the growth of juvenile crime 
in India is the employment of children in 
domestic service. This point has not been 
dealt with by any of the other speakers, and 
therefore, I hope you will allow me    to deal    
with    it at 

length.   Recently in    Purulia station which I 
visited,    I saw a little child being led along by 
a policeman. The child  must have  been     
between  the ages of 11 and 13, and there was    
a crowd  of people following the  child, 
laughing at him and making all sorts of 
comments.    I enquired of the boy. He had 
already been in jail for six months  and  he   
was   then  being  removed  to  his  village     
home by  the policeman.      I should    say that 
the policeman was very sympathetic and 
treated the child considerately.   When I asked 
the child what had led him to  this,  he  told     
me     that  he  was employed  in a house where 
he was not  paid his  salary for two months, 
and one   of   the   lads, maybe   one of the 
boys in the household asked him, "Why don't 
you steal some property and sell it and thus get 
your salary?" So, he decided to    steal his 
master's watch and sell it in the market and 
thus  realise     his salary.    Of  course, the   
crime   was   detected   before   the watch  was  
sold,  and     the  boy  was handed over to the 
police.     And the child was kept in the 
ordinary prison for six months.   The six 
months having  been     completed,  the  child 
was being led back to his native village. 
Nothing  was   done  to     enquire   into the 
culpability of the employer.   When children  
are  employed     in  domestic service, many 
attractions    are placed before them, and as 
everyone knows, children below the age of 14 
do not have  any  moral   sense     of  right  or 
wrong.    Even  older     people  do  not have it.    
They     often    like to  take advantage  of the  
amusements  which the members of the family 
participate in and from which they are 
excluded. He  finds  in  that     household     
other children of the same age group go to the 
cinema, go to school and have all sorts  of  
amusements,  and     this  boy does not have 
that opportunity.   After all, he may be poor but 
he is a child. But    he   is not given these 
opportunities.    Children    in    the    domestic 
services are treated so badly because there is 
no law which    could protect them—neither 
the     Young Offenders Law nor the Factories    
Act nor has 
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any other kind of law that we have for the 
protection of the young persons any validity as 
far as employment of children in domestic 
service is concerned. I am sure it would be a 
revealing thing if we could have a census 
taken of the number of children under the age 
of 14 years employed in domestic service in 
India. The whole of this morning I tried to read 
the Census Report to find out whether such 
information is available but unfortunately, it is 
not available. Perhaps that information would 
be too revealing and it is better that such an 
information is not available because I think it 
will set the country aflame. So, one of the 
things that we should do is to see that children 
are not employed in domestic service. All 
these things boil down to one thing i.e. if we 
want to protect children between the ages of 8 
and 14 or 8 and 16,4he State should take care 
of them, but how is the State to take care of 
normal children except by providing them with 
adequate educational facilities and free 
educational facilities? Not only free education 
because in England they have found that when 
children were given free lunches in the 
schools, the crime rate went down because 
hungry children steal more than well-fed 
children and when children were not hungry, 
they were not stealing and therefore, they got 
out of the control of the police. So what we 
want is not legislative measures because 25 
per cent, of the population belongs to that age 
group which is morally vulnerable and if the 
Stats is serious and wants to take care of these 
children, then the prime necessity, the prime 
need is to provide education and the proper 
kind of education in which the children can 
learn something without actually being 
starved. 

Much has been said about the influence of 
the cinema. Here I would like to tell the 
House an incident which was reported to me 
only last week. A certain child belonging to a 
well-to-^o family—rather a middle- 

class family—attending school suddenly 
disappeared from Madras after stealing some 
money from the family. This child was found 
as a vagrant in Bombay. The police caught 
hold of the child and while he was being put 
through the usual process, a very kind 
gentleman got into touch with the child and 
he asked him what it was that drove the child 
away from his comfortable home—and he 
was a vagrant without food in Bombay—and 
then a very astonishing thing came out, that 
he had seen Shanta Apte on the screen and he 
wanted to see her in person and he knew that 
she was in Bombay and so he came all the 
way to Bombay. And just before he left 
Madras, he was very indifferent to his studies, 
he used to run away from the classes, told a 
large number of lies in order to get out of the 
house, etc. Then this gentleman gave him an 
introduction to Shanta Apte, told her the 
circumstances of his decamping. Then Shanta 
Apte invited the child, gave him lunch, and 
gave him her autograph, and the child was 
perfectly satisfied. He went back to Madras 
and he has become an ideal student. 

SHRI RAJAGOPAL NAIDU (Madras) : 
Did Shanta Apte give him drinks? 

SHRIMATI LAKSHMI MENON • That is an 
unnecessary question. Nobody offers drinks to 
a child of 11. From this you will find how the 
cinema affects children who are emotional. 
They are in the adolescent stage. It is not a 
question of good or bad films. Bad films 
might be repulsive to certain children and 
good films might produce contrary reactions 
in the case of other children. The question is 
one of handling the child in the proper way in 
the children's homes. In this Bill there is 
nothing provided about the way children 
should be .handled. After all if a neglected 
child or delinquent child is to be caught by the 
police, the initial step is wrong. We don't 
associate kindness, gentleness or tenderness 
with the police although we say the police 
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to us and they are part of the country. I 
have seen policemen and policemen and 
none of them could qualify himself for 
this kind of task. What we should have is 
proper men and women, as Mrs. 
Hensman has suggested, not wearing the 
uniform, but people whose dress and 
habit will associate them with something 
more socially valuable and agreeable. 

Now, I would like to say something 
about the definition of the neglected 
child. The neglected child is very badly 
defined in this Bill because ill-treatment 
for instance, which is one of the features 
or one of the characteristics of neglect, is 
omitted. There are all sorts of elaborate 
definitions given about neglected child, 
e.g., a child which is found in the various 
places defined in the Bill. I think it 
should be made more comprehensive. 
Another thing is, all sorts of matters are 
dealt with in the rule-making powers, but 
nothing is said about the kind of training 
that should be imparted to the children in 
the schools. We have got the procedure to 
be followed in the children's court and 
other courts, in the children's homes, 
special schools, etc., but not the kind of 
training that should be imparted to the 
children in the schools. After all, if we 
want to form the right kind of reflexes of 
development and the right kind of habits 
so that the conduct of the children will 
conform to the right kind of adjusted life 
in society, then the curriculum that is to 
be followed is Kiore important. 
Something has been said about teaching 
them weaving and spinning and what not, 
but not how the child should be given 
moral instruction so that when we get 
him out of the school, he may be a good 
citizen andl his crime may not be a stain 
on hfm. 

There are many things to say and I 
hope I will get a chance to speak when 
the Bill is taken up for clause by clause 
consideration. I wish to say something 
about the paid and voluntary workers. If 
the State is serious and if this is going to 
be a 

feature of all the States, then I do not 
think that it can be left to voluntary 
workers. Voluntary work is all right 
when we have not got a State which is 
sympathetic to the needs of the State but 
we want to have trained social workers 
and people trained in the administration 
of Children's Acts to be in charge of 
courts and for expediting trials etc., then 
we must have paid workers. Wherever 
honorary magistrates have been 
appointed, the work has been very slack 
for one thing, that they are not properly 
educated in the administration of laws, 
and secondly, they think, "Well, it is 
voluntary work and why should I be in 
the court at the proper time? I am not 
paid." That is the attitude in our society. I 
don't think that I would attach the same 
kind of importance to voluntary 
workers—as one of the previous speakers 
had done. What we want, if the 
Government is serious, is to have proper 
institutions, properly trained people, men 
and women and also paid workers. Those 
days when social work could be done by 
voluntary workers are gone and nowhere 
in the world do we find that people are 
asked to do regular work on a voluntary 
basis and have that work effectively 
done. 

Now I come to the last point, i.e., the 
general ineffectiveness of this Bill. What 
does this Bill do? It is left to the 
discretion of the States. The State may do 
it, the State may have a court, the State 
may have this or that but once that 
ineffectiveness is cast away, everything 
becomes mandatory. How to remove this 
spirit of inaction which is propagated by 
this Bill? In the Gita it is said that one of 
the greatest sins is to be enamoured of 
inaction but in this Bill we find the 
glamour of inaction more than in any 
other legislative measure.    Thank you. 

SHRI KANHAIYALAL D. VAIDYA 
(Madhya Bharat): 
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SHRI R. C. GUPTA (Uttar Pradesh): 
Sir, so far as the object of the Bill is 
concerned, it is a very laudable and 
useful measure and nobody can possibly 
have any quarrel with it but the question 
is, whenever such a law is to be passed, 
one has to consider whether it would be 
properly enforced and whether there are 
ways and means available for enforcing 
it. 

MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: At this 
stage I would suggest to the hon. 
Member that he will please put forward 
new points and not repeat old arguments. 

SHRI R. C. GUPTA:    I    will    not 
repeat old arguments.   If the    Gov-
ernment had considered the financial 
aspect of this measure    and    made sure 
that it was all right from that point of 
view, I would    submit that a Bill of this    
type    would be immensely beneficial to 
the States concerned, but I feel that proper 
attention has not been paid to this aspect 
of the question.    In my opinion it is 
impossible especially for the smaller Part 
C States to finance    the homes which are 
envisaged in this Bill in a proper manner.    
It    would do great harm to the children if 
they are taken away from their own 
homes and sent to undesirable places.    I 
would submit that the homes    which are 
envisaged in this Bill would be nothing 
better than    ordinary    jails    if not 
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If the Government intends to take away 
the children from their homes the 
Government should provide better 
facilities than are available to them at 
their own homes, better surroundings 
than are available to them at their own 
homes and better education. This does 
not seem to be possible financially and 
therefore, this measure, if passed, will 
not do any good to the children. 

My second objection is this that in this 
Bill two different ideas have been 
jumbled together, the case of a 'neglected 
child' and the case of a 'juvenile 
delinquent'. These are two different 
problems. If the Bill were confined only 
to 'delinquents' I might have agreed that 
this might prove a beneficial measure, 
although even then it may not be possible 
for the Part C States to bear the financial 
burden thrown on them thereby. But the 
question of a neglected child is a very 
wide one and it would be much better if 
this question of a neglected child were 
left alone. This Bill if worked in the spirit 
in which it has been introduced would 
certainly be beneficial but what we find 
in the provisions of the Bill is that in the 
'observation homes' the juvenile 
delinquent and the neglected child would 
be put together for some time during the 
trial. Would it at all be desirable that the 
juvenile delinquent should be placed with 
the neglected child or vice versa"! There 
must be two different homes altogether. 
In fact the definition as given in this Bill 
of a 'neglected child' seems to me to be 
too wide. It would cover the case of a 
child who lives with his drunken father. 
A very good child will be punished for no 
fault of his and would be deprived of the 
company of his good mother and other 
relations and placed in these undesirable 
homes and taken away from the family 
home, simply because his father happens 
to be a drunkard. 

Take another case. Supposing the 
father is a drunkard and the mother is a 
saintly lady and the child is 8 or 9 years 
of age. Under clause 2(h) he will be 
considered to be a neglected child and he 
will have to be deprived of the company 
of his mother where he would have been 
looked after much better than in that 
home which is envisaged in this Bill. So 
the son is being punished for the fault of 
his father. The father is a drunkard and 
the son is good but he is being taken 
away from the family because the father 
is a drunkard. Similarly you will punish 
the parents for the fault of the bad sons. If 
the son is a bad character, if he has been 
caught for stealing, then fine may be 
imposed on the father. There seems to be 
two contradictory ideas put into this Bill. 

I would not take up much time of the 
House but I will again with all the force 
at my command submit that it would be 
much better for the Government to drop 
the provisions relating to neglected 
children and only deal with juvenile 
delinquents in this Bill. If they agree to 
deal with juvenile delinquents only, I 
would draw attention to the definition 
given in clause 2 (g). I submit that the 
Government should not treat the 
commission of any offence as an offence 
amounting to juvenile delinquency. 
Under the clause as it stands, even a boy 
who has been found guilty of an ordinary 
offence under section 323 or 352 I.P.C. 
could be dealt with as a delinquent. No 
purpose would be served by treating such 
a boy who has been convicted under 
section 323 I.P.C. as a juvenile 
delinquent. It should be made clear that 
offences contemplated in this clause are 
those which involve moral turpitude. 

There is another provision to which I 
would draw the hon. Minister's attention. 
In sub-clause (2) of clause 11, the last 
two lines have been added by the Select. 
Committee. . I would like to drop    those 
two lines 
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because it will encourage false appli-
cations by the enemies of the father of 
the children. If the police officer is 
satisfied that the information is not 
reliable why should he proceed with the 
case and report to the magistrate? What 
will happen if these two lines are retained 
is that even if the Sub-Inspector is of 
opinion that no case is made out for 
taking action under this clause, he will 
have to forward the complaint to the 
officer concerned and then some sort of 
a trial would be held and the parents and 
the boy would unnecessarily be harassed. 
So I submit that this amendment made by 
the Select Committee does not seem to 
be quite proper. 

Coming to clause 15 of the Bill, it 
relates to 'uncontrollable children'. I do 
not see any justification for this clause. 
There may be hundreds of reasons why 
the children may be said to be 
uncontrollable. Why should they be put 
in the same category of juvenile 
delinquents or neglected children? This 
clause requires reconsideration and if it 
is possible it should be dropped 
altogether. 

Under clause 38 power has been given 
to the State Government to discharge 
children even after an order of 
conviction or an order of committal to 
such homes has been passed. This power 
should be given to the courts trying the 
children because it will be very difficult 
to get such children who are inside such 
homes, released by moving the State 
Government and obtaining necessary 
orders for release. There may be 
hundreds of cases where after a short 
stay in such homes it would be in the 
interests of the children themselves that 
they should be released. This power 
should either be delegated to the district 
magistrates of the district concerned or 
to the court concerned so that it may be 
largely utilised for the purpose of 
release of children if they are 
subsequently found fit for release. There 
is one more point and it is with regard 
18 C.S.D. 

to the clause which requires contribution 
by parents. Mostly the children will be 
from the poor class and it would be a 
very hard thing for their parents to 
contribute towards the maintenance of 
such a child in the home. So this clause 
42 also requires reconsideration. 

I submit that in my opinion this Bill is 
impracticable and financially unsound. It 
will not be possible for the Government 
to substitute better homes than the 
children's own houses. Therefore, my 
suggestion is that this Bill should not be 
proceeded with. If necessary, two 
separate Bills dealing with neglected 
children and dealing with delinquents 
may be brought forward when enough 
finances are available. 

SHRI A. DHARAM DAS ( Pradesh): 
Mr. Deputy Chairman, I rise to support 
the Bill and in doing so, I congratulate 
the Government for having taken the 
earliest opportunity to take up this 
question of children. It is but right and 
proper that independent India should feel 
concerned with that section of our boys 
and girls which is being neglected or 
which is being brought up in criminal 
environments. It will be admitted that it 
is the responsibility of every family to 
see that children are offered full 
opportunities for the development of 
their faculties so that they may grow up 
into useful citizens of the country. All 
powers are inherent in a child but only 
those will come into full play which are 
fully developed. It is, therefore, our duty 
to see that our children are properly 
educated, properly trained and properly 
looked after. If a family fails in its duty, 
it becomes the duty of the school to 
supplement the training which the child 
has received at home so that there may 
be a harmonious development of 
physical, mental and moral aspects of the 
child's life. If the family and the school 
both fail in their duty, it becomes the 
responsibility of the social community to 
bring to bear on the family  and  the 
school  its  slow  but 
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[Shri A. Dharam Das.] sure influence 
so that young people trained by the co-
operative efforts of the family and the 
educational institutions may  be of high 
calibre and may    contribute    to    the     
physical, mental, moral, social    and    
spiritual welfare    of    our    society.      
If    the society also fails  in its duty it be-
comes the responsibility of the State to 
step in and to so arrange the upbringing,   
education   and   training of our children   
as   to   enable   them to grow   up   into   
men   and  women  of strong   character,   
capable   of contributing their full share in 
the building up of our new nation.    On 
account 

of the poverty and ignorance of our people 
and for other reasons which t need not be 
enumerated here, it has devolved on the 
State to take up the all round development 
of the child in its own hands. 

MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: The hon. 
Member may continue tomorrow. The 
House stands adjourned till 8-15 A.M. 
tomorrow? 

The Council then adjourned 
till a quarter past eight of the 
clock on Wednesday, the 28th 
April 1954. 


