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Commission   under  section 8 of   the  1 
Delimitation    Commission Act,    1952. 
[Placed in the Library, see No. S-153/  ' 53.] 

REPORT OF REHABILITATION FINANCE 
ADMINISTRATION 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER FOR 
FINANCE (SHRI A. C. GUHA): Sir, I lay on 
the Table a copy of the Report of the 
Rehabilitation Finance Administration for 
the half-year ended the 30th June 1953, 
under sub-section 
(2) of section 18 of the Rehabilitation 
Finance Administration Act, 1948. 
[Placed in the Library, see No. S-155/ 
53.] 

1. FIFTH ANNUAL REPORT OF BOARD OF 
DIRECTORS OF INDUSTRIAL FINANCE 

CORPORATION OF INDIA. 

2. STATEMENT SHOWING ASSETS AND 
LIABILITIES AND PROFIT AND LOSS 
ACCOUNT OF THE CORPORATION. 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER FOR 
FINANCE (SHRI A. C. GUHA): Sir, I lay on 
the Table a copy of each of the following    
papers, under    sub-section 
(3) of section 35 of the Industrial 
Finance Corporation Act, 1948: — 

(i) Fifth Annual Report of the Board of 
Directors of the Industrial Finance 
Corporation of India on the working of the 
Corporation during the year ending the 30th 
June, 1953. 

(ii) Statement showing the assets and 
liabilities of the Corporation at the close of 
the year and the Profit and Loss Account for 
the year. [Placed in the Library, see No. S-
154/53 for both.] 

THE    REHABILITATION    FINANCE 
ADMINISTRATION      (AMENDMENT) 

BILL,  1952 

MR- CHAIRMAN: We now take up for 
further consideration the Rehabilitation  
Finance   Administration   Bill. 

LT.-COL. J. S. MANN (PEPSU): Sir, We 
have before us the Rehabilitation Finance  
Administration   (Amendment) 

Bill presented  by the hon.     Minister and I 
would like to    say    something about  this.   
This    Rehabilitation    Finance 
Administration is a very useful organisation  
for    the    refugees    who have come from 
the West Punjab and the  East  Bengal  to   
India.   A   lot  of good   work,   in   settling   
the   refugees. has been done and it was a help 
which the  refugees,    who    came    
penniless, wanted.   The   Government    of    
India started this organisation to give them 
loans to rehabilitate and restart them in their 
business which they had lost. Sir,  there  are 
good  points  and  there are some defects also, 
which the Government   of  India,   should   
have    removed long before.   For instance,  
the loans  which  are  granted  to  the dis-
placed persons take such a long time that   in   
the  meanwhile   these  people who  apply for  
them    lose    all their hopes  for  getting any    
and    so  they cannot  start  their  business in    
time, whereas,   the    other   people     having 
money on this side start their    business,   
whilst  the   refugees   find   themselves   in  a  
hard  competition,    when the  loans  are  
subsequently    granted. Even now, I know 
several cases—being a    refugee    myself—
where      several applications    for    loan    
are    pending with   the  Rehabilitation    
Administration for the last one year or even a 
year and    a half.   These  applications are 
duly supported by the local authorities   and   
these  are  lying   with   the members of the 
Board for their sanction.   The  perslons   
appointed   on   the Committee   first   were   
quite      good people, and I do not blame the 
present ones!   They   had   some     
connections with  the  refugees,   as  they  
were  refugees themselves.    The    Chief    
Administrator was  a refugee;  the  members 
who  assisted him  were refugees and   thus' 
they   were   able  to   decide alfl.  cases   as  
quickly    as   possible.    I know     personally  
a  member  of  this Board, who was the 
President of the Congress   Committee  for   
about     four years.   He    knew    each    and    
every refugee from    the    West Punjab.    He 
was   somehlow  removed   and   another 
person  who was not  a displaced person was 
nominated in his place.    I do not know the 
cause of this  removal, but I <fe  know  that 
this    gentleman 



 

[Lt.-Col. J. S. Mann.] was helpful to the 
refugees. On the contrary, a gentleman, who 
is not a refugee himself, cannot understand 
the difficulties of the refugees and is 
therefore not likely to take pains and 
interests in their affairs. I would request the 
hon. Minister that the Board should consist 
of the refugees who know the people and can 
understand  the  difficulties  of the  refugees. 

Sir,  it  is     gratifying  to  know  that the  
loans   which  will    be    recovered from the 
refugees will be redistributed     among    the      
refugees.    I     must heartily    congratulate      
the    Government  on  this  move,  which   is  
indeed a facility for the people.   But, at the 
same  time,  these  loans,    which    the 
Government are    granting and which are 
subsequently to be recovered, the Government 
have decided, will be adjusted against their 
claims.    It is only in  the case of the urban  
loans  that the   Government  have   decided   
so.    I would very much like to see that the 
rural  loans  which   are    so    far   not 
included in this scheme should  also be 
included.   The Government should take early 
steps that theso rural loans are  also  included  
in the recovery to be adjusted  from  the    
rural    claims. The principle,  not  to  recover  
but  to adjust  against  the  claims,  should  be 
for all Tural and    urban    loans    and there 
should not be any    differential treatment.      
The  rural    people    are unable to write; they 
have no papers of their own;  they cannot go 
to the Press  and  they  cannot    place   before 
us their grievances and hardships. The 
Government should treat them at-par with  the  
urban  people,   because   the rural   people   
are   the   ones   that   are suffering heavily. 

The number of applications which the 
Finance Administration have with them for 
disposal—I quote from the flgure given by the 
hon. Finance | Minister—is about 8,000. Seven 
years I have passed; and seven years is a very 
long time; and within that time, they have not 
been able to dispose of these    applications.      
The    applicants 

have not been given loans and these people 
have been spending their time, money and 
energy in asking for this facility. You can 
yourself imagine that for the last six years 
these people have been asking for loans to es-
tablish their business and their home and the 
Administration have not been able to take a 
decision on their requests. If the 
Administration were to take the trouble of 
expediting the disposal of the applications, 
the refugees would be helped a very great 
deal in these hard times. 

Further,  Sir,  these    loans are    not easy to 
be  repaid.   These loans were granted to the 
people who had nothing. They had lost each 
and everything of theirs.   Very   hard   times   
have   come and    the    business      is    very      
dull and    even    the market    is    so    very 
tight.   Therefore, these people are not in a 
position to repay loans.   It should have been 
decided that the loanees may pay according to 
their facilities.   The rural people—I must 
repeat once again —have been hard  hit and  
should be allowed   to   repay      their   loans   
from their    claims    and    the    Government 
should  make    some    arrangement    in this  
connection.   Sir,    I    would    also like t0 
bring to the notice of the Government that the 
amounts of the loans are sent to the districts 
and to the provinces  by  the  Central     
Government, but,   the  people   in   authority   
in   the districts  and  the  provinces   are  not 
very helpful to the people in the distribution  of 
these  loans.   After  some time they return the 
loans to the Government of India and say that 
people are  not  interested  in  taking them.    I 
can say, Sir, that the refugees are in need of 
these loans in order to establish  themselves   
in   business,   but   the Heads of the 
Departments    concerned are not sympathetic 
towards them and are  not rendering all    
possible    help. The   applicants  have  to  
spend   almost 25  to 30 per cent,  from    their    
own pockets  to  take  the  loans.   So,    the 
Government should take suitable steps to see 
that the loans are granted within  as short a 
time    as  possible    and with as little trouble 
to them as they can  possibly  give.   With    
these    few 
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words, I would once again remark that the 
Government should remove the difficulties 
and improve upon the drawbacks in the matter 
of granting loans to the refugees. 

SHRI S. N. MAZUMDAR (West Bengal): 
Mr. Chairman, in this amending Bill the 
original Act is being sought to be amended 
mainly in three respects. That is, increasing the 
amount which the Central Government may 
advance to the Administration; then extending 
the period for the repayment of the loan from 
ten to fifteen years; and thirdly, incorporating a 
provision for the accounts of the Ad-
ministration to be audited by the Auditor-
General. But, Sir. I am sorry to say that 
although this amending Bill is being brought 
forward before this House after five years of 
experience of the working of the Rehabilitation 
Finance Administration, the Government has 
not paid any heed, properly speaking, to the 
complaints and criticisms made against the 
working of that Administration. 

Sir, I shall now deal with those criticisms 
against the Administration. It is true that these 
three amendments are there. These are quite 
welcome. I have no quarrel in that respect. 
But. it is expected of the Government to pay 
heed to the criticisms voiced not only by the 
refugees outside but also by the hon. Members 
in the Houses of Parliament. I shall take those 
noints one by one. 

First of all, Sir, I would like to say that the 
Rehabilitation Finance Administration is an 
autonomous body. There is practically no 
control over it by the Ministry of 
Rehabilitation save in laying down broad 
policies. Practically there is no control by 
Parliament over its functioning. Though there 
are a few Members of Parliament on the 
Advisory Body, yet that does not mean that 
Parliament has any control over the activities 
of that body. In this connection I may mention. 
Sir, that last year I wrote a letter to the 
Ministry of Rehabilitation  drawing their 
attention 

   to the fact that a particular    refugee who had 
applied for a loan for a very 
  long time had not till then got that I  loan 
although the loan had been sanctioned  and  
all the  necessary  forma-iities had been 
completed; still he was awaiting the   
payment   of   that loan. Of   course   the    
Ministry   was   good enough to refer my 
letter to the Rehabilitation  Finance 
Administration,  but in its  reply to me  it was 
mentioned that that  body was    an    
autonomous body and they were referring my 
letter to it.   And I have been told by the re-
fugee concerned  that after my taking interest 
in his case to see that justice was  done to     
him,  he  was  taken  to task by the officers of 
the Rehabilitation Finance Administration, 
with the tesult that the payment of the loan to 
him was    further    delayed    for    that 
reason.   Of course,  there  is  no proof 
because  these  gentlemen  who    resort, to 
such tactics do    not    provide    any proofs  
or  do  these things  in  writing. But   that   
gentleman,   that    particular refugee told me 
that he was  told by one of the officers of the 
Administration,  "Oh,  you  have  sought the  
help of a Member of Parliament; all right. let 
us see how soon you can get that loan."    So, 
Sir,  this is  the  nature  of the  autonomy.    
No  doubt,  there must be some sort of 
autonomy for its efficient  functioning;   I do 
not  object  to that, but there must be some 
sort of provision   for   some   control   over   
the Administration     by the    Ministry    of 
Rehabilitation  as  well   as  by    Parliament. 

Coming to the second Point of criticism. 
Sir, I would like to say that the expenses of 
the Administration are very heavy. During 
the last five years it has spent nearly 20 per 
cent, of the amount given to the refugees for 
administrative expenses. My figures are, Sir, 
that out of Rs. 5 crores actually given to the 
refugees a sum of Rs. 1 crore has been spent 
by the Administration as administrative 
expenses. Sir, I suggest here— of course I 
shall speak on it in detail during the clause by 
clause consideration of it—that a general rule 
should  be  laid   down  that  the  admi- 
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[Shri  S.  N.   Mazumdar.] nistrative 
expenses  should not exceed 10  per cent,  of 
the  sum  of the  loan actually advanced to the 
refugees. 

SHRI V. K. DHAGE (Hyderabad): Five 
per cent. 

SHRI S. N. MAZUMDAR: Yes, I am 
prepared to take that. However, my point is 
that administrative expenses should be cut 
down. Then, there are hish salaried officials. 

SHRI V. K. DHAGE. Sir, the Government 
rule is that the administration should be 
carried an wihin 5 per cent. 

SHRI.S. N. MAZUMDAR: I take that 
information from  the hon. Member. 

SHRI KISHEN CHAND (Hyderabad): The 
Bank charges are only li per cent. 

SHRI S. N. MAZUMDAR: There are 635 
employees in the Administration but only 
151 are Class IV employees and the salary of 
the Chief Administrator is Rs. 3,000 per 
mon&and he is also allowed to draw his 
pension from the Imperial Bank, where he 
was previously employed, so far as my infor-
mation goes. This point was pressed home in 
the course of several discussions in the other 
House and I do not like to take much time 
here by going through it, but still it does not 
mean that because 1 do not like t0 take much 
time. I am not putting any emphasis on it. 

Thirdly, Sir, the rate of interest which is 
charged from the refugees for the loans is too 
high. This Administration is not a 
commercial institution. Its purpose >s to help 
these uprooted people, these people who 
have been uprooted from thejr normal 
environments and their normal occupations 
due to no fault of theirs. It may be argued by 
my hon. friend there that the Act says that 
interest has to be charged not exceeding 6 per 
cent. I say this because I heard that the hon. 
Minister expressed some such view  in   the  
other  place.   I    do   not 

know whether he is prepared to agree to a 
reduction in the rate of interest. However, I do 
not want to anticipate him; I shall await his 
reply and then I  shall  have  my   say   on   
that  point. Here  I would  only say that the 
rate Of interest is far higher than the bank rate.    
I    have    been    receiving    complaints from 
the    refugees    that    the Rehabilitation      
Finance    Administration wants the loanees to 
insure their business  premises    for   
comprehensive insurance.      This    means    
that    they have t0 pay 6 per  cent, interest    
on the loan and 6 per cent, for insurance, 
which makes    the    loan    double   the 
amount  in   eight  years.   The  refugee who 
takes  this business loan,  for his business,    
has    to    maintain    himself, maintain  his  
family,  and  also     make provision   for   this   
interest     and     insurance.   These   loanees    
are    mostly small businessmen.    Mostly they 
have no resources, and I do not understand 
why this high rate of interest should be 
charged.   It is high time it is reduced from 
now on to 1\    per    cent. I have received 
many complaints from these refugees that it is 
very difficult for them to  pay this    interest    
soon after they obtain the loans.    It is quite 
well known that in these difficult days for 
industry    and    trade,    it    is    not possible 
for the small businessmen to establish their    
business    very    soon. They are beset with all 
sorts of difficulties.   The loans offered by this 
Administration,  instead  of being  a  help to  
them,   actually  obstruct   them   and prove  a  
burden  to  them.    So,   I  suggest that for the 
first four years this interest   should   not   be   
realised.      It may be realised after that.    
About the receiving of the loans, as I have 
mentioned earlier in my speech, there are 
many instances  where    the    refugees 
receWe  the  loans  only   after   a   long time 
after they send  in their applications,   the   
loans;   are   sanctioned   and all the necessary 
formalities are completed.   Even  then  these 
loans    come only in   driblets,     in     several     
instalments.    There  is  a long interval  bet-
ween these instalments, which  means a   lot 
of  hardship  to  these    refugees who   have   
no   resources   tn   fall   back upon.   The loans 
sanctioned    to them should be paid    to    
them    soon.      It 
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should be paid—at least two-thirds of the 
loans sanctioned should be paid— in the first 
instalment. Then as regards interest, my 
suggestion is that it should be realised only 
after four years, but these four years should be 
counted from the time the full amount of the 
loan has been paid to the loanee. Otherwise, it 
will provide no relief to him. 

Next, as regards the repayment of the loans, 
it is good that the amending Bill seeks to 
extend the period of return from 10 years to 
15 years, but this is not sufficient. My 
suggestion is that it should be extended to 20 
years. As I have said earlier, in these days it is 
very difficult for the small businessmen to 
establish themselves very soon not to speak of 
being in a position to repay the loans soon. 
Secondly, it is no use simply providing them 
with loans in a niggardly manner in driblets. 
Even if the full amount is granted to them, 
what is the actual position? The average 
amount of loan to a loanee has been only Rs. 
7.000. Now. we know that small industries are 
being ruined. The purchasing power of the 
people is falling, though my friends on the 
other side are in love with certain type of 
phrases as consumers' resistance and 
propensities and things of that sort. The real 
fact is that the purchasing power of the people 
is gradually falling. As a result of it, these 
critical conditions are being aggravated more 
and more. Only if the Government brings a 
comprehensive scheme for ameliorating the 
conditions of the people and includes 
rehabilitation in that scheme, then only 
something can be done, but about that also, I 
am very pessimistic, because the Government 
is not adopting proper methods of national 
reconstruction. About that, I do not like to talk 
much at this stage because this subieet has 
been discussed on other occasions on the flj°r 
of this House and we have offered our 
criticisms, but still I am compeled to point out 
certain things. The Plan which the 
Government has framed and the manner in 
which the Government is carrying out the Plan 
does not inspire confidence that even 

this Plan will be carried out. In November, 
1952 when the Five Year Plan was being 
discussed in this House and we raised the 
question of unemployment, the Government 
spokesman refused to recognise that there was 
any unemployment problem in the country. It 
was, according to them, residual 
unemployment resulting from the normal 
industrial process, but a few months 
afterwards in September 1953 they had to 
recognise the magnitude of the problem of 
unemployment, but they recognised it when 
there was no helping about it. The problem of 
unemployment loomed so large and in such a 
manner that they had to recognise it. Then the 
Government came forward with the sugges-
tion that the Five Year Flan should be 
amended. Since then we have heard so many 
plans about the extension of the Plan to 
provide employment, but in the meantime, 
there is more and more unemployment. When 
I raised the question of retrenchment, the 
Government spokesman simply refused to 
give any serious consideration to that point of 
view. When during the last session we said 
that a ban should be placed on all 
retrenchment, that suggestion was completely 
cold-shouldered on the ground that it was not 
productive. But may I remind them that by 
throwing people out of employment, they are 
only extending the vicious circle—more 
unemployment, less purchasing power, more 
unfavourable reactions on the market and 
more unfavourable  reactions  on  industry? 
3 P.M. 

But I don't think that this very 
patent fact leaves any impression on 
their conception or outlook. However, 
the facts cannot be denied. So they 
press themselves upon them and force 
them to take steps which could have 
been taken earlier if they only had a 
mind to listen to the suggestions from 
Jjhirf side tot the1 House. About re 
trenchment, when we suggested that a 
ban should be placed on retrench 
ment........  

MR. CHAIRMAN: Speak on the Bill. 

SHRI S. N. MAZUMDAR: I am ela-
borating to show why I have no con- 
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fldence in the Government drawing up a 
comprehensive scheme to fit in with the 
rehabilitation problem. So at least as a 
positive suggestion I offer this that the period 
of repayment of loan should be extended from 
15 to 20 years. Then there is a very important 
question about which this Amending Bill is 
completely silent, viz., section 15 of the 
original Act which provides for recovery of 
loans as arrears of land revenue which has not 
been brought in here. So I was unable to move 
any amendment to that section. But that 
provision to recover loans as arrears of land 
revenues is again a measure which causes 
serious hardships on these people whom this 
Act and this Bill is supposed to help. Because 
recovery of loans in the manner of arrear of 
land revenue means attachment of their 
belongings. There are cases when the house-
hold goodJ Of refugees have been attached. 
Surely this was not the intention of the 
Central Legislature when it passed the origi-
nal Act providing for rehabilitation of the 
refugees. At least I think Government should 
have come forward with an amendment to -
that section. The amendment should provide 
that only the commercial and business assets 
of the loanee can be attached but not h!s 
household goods. The head of the family 
should not be arrested because that throws 
these people into great difficulties. So it 
happens that because of these difficulties and 
hardships caused to the refugees by the terms 
on which loans are sanctioned a large number 
of loans which have been sanctioned have not 
been drawn upon. I have been told by many 
refugees that practically they have come to 
fear the prospect of taking loans from the 
Rehabilitation Finance Administration 
because of these hardships. That is the reason 
for the fact that even after sanctions have been 
made they have not been drawn upon and this 
fact was commented on even by a paper like 
the Eastern Economist which has no 
connection with us and which is as apart from 
us as heaven from earth. 

But Government has not paid any heed to 
those criticisms coming from quarters which 
are akin to them. 

Then there are many complaints about 
corruption and nepotism. These are well 
known. I don't like to take much time of the 
House by going into all these things but some 
have been referred here already by the 
previous speaker who himself is a refugee and 
who has felt some difficulties in this matter. 

These are the broad lines on which I think 
the original Act should have been amended 
and I would ask the hon. Deputy Minister, 
who is piloting the Bill, to consider whether 
he can do something so that the refugees can 
at least have some definite proof that the 
Rehabilitation Finance Administration is 
going to act for them and for their benefit. 

Before I sit down I will have to say that I 
have given notice of some amendments but I 
could not give them earlier. I think you will 
allow me to move these amendments. In 
connection with them I will speak later. 

SHRI PRITHVIRAJ KAPOOR (No-
minated): Mr. Chairman. Sir, I welcome the 
changes that have come before us. It appears 
that the period of loans has been extended 
from 10 to 15 years. It is a very welcome 
change and a very welcome step. There are so 
many other points too. I welcome them all 
because I know how enormous is the problem 
and I don't think in history we find anything 
like that has ever happened where people on 
such a scale had come after being uprooted 
and had been resettled. But while I went 
through all these steps that have been taken to 
rehabilitate the people who are uprooted. I 
have a very humble suggestion to make and 
that is that this work is that of a nurse, of a 
doctor and should be done in that spirit—the 
spirit of service. Unfortunately I have had 
some experience which is quite contrary to 
that spirit. Having had something to do with 
the 
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people wh0 came from that side from 1947 
onwards, I came in contact with some officers 
who were of the old regime. They were Rao 
Bahadurs, stinking of that spirit of the old 
regime—pardon me for saying that word. 
There was one instance in Bombay when 
people were being given tickets and slips to 
travel from one place to another where they 
could find some work for themselves. There 
was not enough money with the officer-in-
charge to give them for expenses on their 
way. I was doing some work in that line 
separately. So I came in contact with the 
officer-in-charge. Those people who were be-
ting given tickets were sient to me. There was 
something given t0 them so that they could 
live on the way and reach the spot they 
wanted to go to. The intentions of the 
Government ~were good but the way they 
were carried out was not satisfactory at all 
because that spirit of service was lacking—the 
spirit of the nurse, the spirit of the man who 
wants to heal the wounds. I met that 
gentleman of the old regime. 1 went to his 
office and he welcomed me and said, "Come 
in, sit down, Mr. Prithviraj. Look here. These 
refugees ifced to come and trouble me a lot. 
Now I have cleared all this atmosphere and I 
can sit now quietly. Won't you have a cup of 
tea?" These words saddened my heart and it 
hurt me to hear that. I said, "I had come to my 
Government but here I find the same spooks 
of the old Government left—some bits". He 
did not like my remarks. I said, "I am afraid 
you will not like my remarks but I would like 
you to change your attitude to these people. 
These are our people and you are not giving 
them doles, you are not doing them any 
favour. They have suffered because of this 
hoUocauslt. They have suffered due to no 
fault of theirs and as they are our people, it is 
our duty to approach them in that spirit of 
humility and service. On the contrary you talk 
about them as if they are jjfust beggars 
coming to your door. No. You should 
approach "them in the true Indian spirit." That 
is not the only one case. There are 98 C.S.D. 

so many other cases too. People have been 
badly treated; not that the Government wish it 
that way, but some of the people there, some 
of the old guards who are there^ somehow or 
other have not inculcated within themselves 
the spirit of free India, the spirit of the 
national Government, the spirit of Bapu, the 
spirit of our President, the spirit of our Prime 
Minister, the spirit of your good self, the spirit 
of every Tevered leader. And precisely 
because of that, they talk in tones that hurt, 
and hurt those people who have suffered, 
people who have lost their all. All that I have 
to say at this point is only this much. Six 
years have past, six long years. It was Oscar 
Wilde who said suffering lengthens the 
moments. These six years have been a very 
long period indeed. Why? I should have said 
seven years for even from 1946 people started 
pouring in from Bengal, later on from March, 
1947 people from the Punjab and Frontier 
Provinces came and later on from Sind and 
Kashmir. These seven years have been a very 
long period and a very painful period too. 
Government's intentions are good; but I 
would like the Minister in charge to make it a 
point to impress it upon the people who are 
working in this field that this is a different type 
of work, that it should be done in a spirit of 
service and of humility. Indeed, I believe all 
the work in the country today should be done 
in the true spirit of service and humility. We 
are a nation different from the other nations of 
the world in so many ways. But this spirit of 
humility has been our characteristic— a major 
characteristic of our nation. We believe in 
service even to our enemies. We welcome 
even an enemy. We welcome him 'n our 
homes. And here are our own people, our own 
kith and kin, our own flesh and blood, and 
some of us have been very rude to them. I 
appreciate the magnitude of this problem and 
I know it cannot be tackled in a day. I 
understand that materially more could not be 
done. I realise that. But I only wish and pray 
and hope and beseech these officers who have 
got to give this money. 
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[Shri Prithvirnj Kapoor.'J who have got to 
come in contact with these people and 
distribute these loans to imbibe the spirit of the 
Father of the Nation who on the 15th of 
August 1947 when we were here, was going 
about in East Bengal barefooted. Kanuben told 
me recently how every night, she used to pick 
out the thorns from the feet of the Father of 
the Nation. Every one of these officers must 
remember that and must imbibe that spirit and 
must feel that he is a leader, that he represents 
the Government, that he is the leader at the 
moment and should behave as the eye does to 
the body. If there is a thorn-prick anywhere in 
the body, if there is any hurt or knock or 
bump, it is the eye that sheds the tear and it 
should be, the leader that sheds the tear, that 
bears the pain. To each one of these officers it 
should be brought home again and again that 
he should approach this work in the right 
spirit. Even the peons standing outside the 
door of the officer, where the loans are being 
settled, where moneys are being given or 
received back and where anybody from these 
displaced persons come for any work, should 
take it upon themselves to do their work in all 
humility. 

I have one request to make to hon. 
Members sitting on those benches and it is 
this. In this question—of course it holds good 
in the case oi a11 questions, but particularly in 
this question, I have to request them to deal 
with the subject not in any party spirit, not 
with a view to making any points or scoring 
any points. No, they should and we all should 
do it in a spirit of service alone. And why? 
Because they have been suffering for seven 
long years. To such men if you just tell a rong 
word they lose their balance and that ig not 
what we want to do. We want to re-establish 
these displaced persons. For that not only 
material help that is being given or is going to 
be given or has been given but tome-thing 
more is necessary. Over and  above that,    
their    mental 

rehabilitation is essential and their 
mental balance its very eslsential. I 
have seen the other side of it too 
where people, just to establish their 
leadership—God alone knows why and 
for what end—go to them. They do 
not go there to serve these people 
but just to arouse them, to excite 
them, to make theim lose their balance: 
and people who have lost all and who 
have been suffering for long, easily 
lose their balance. Therefore, please 
issue a directive to all the people 
working under you in your parties, 
not to do any such ............... 

SHRI P. SUNDARAYYA (Andhra)r Better 
address these remarks to the other benches. 

SHRI PRITHVIRAJ KAPOOR: I address 
them to all the benches. 

SHRI P. SUNDARAYYA: You have started 
with us. There are those benches which refuse 
to do what you ask them t0 do. 

SHRI PRITHVIRAJ KAPOOR: I don't 
know what the hon. Member is saying, I 
would request him to be a little more audible 
if he really wants to convey anything to me; or 
he can say it at another time if he wants to tell 
me anything. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: You advise all benches 
to be humble. 

SHRI PRITHVIRAJ KAPOOR: Yes,, and I 
have already said that to all the government 
officials, from the highest to the lowest and 
the Minister alsp. To them all I have said the 
same thing. They must approach these 
suffering people in a spirit of service and 
humility. To my friends who are not Ministers 
also I make the same request and if there is 
resentment, it evidently shows that the thing 
hurts. Why? Is it because of a guilty 
conscience? 
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SHRI P. SUNDARAYYA: We have no 
guilty conscience. We cannot go on listening 
to this sort of thing. 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER FOR FINANCE 
(SHRI A. C. GUHA) : This side has not 
resented this advice. We actually welcome it. 

SHRI PRITHVIRAJ KAPOOR: This 
humbie  request I make ............... 

SHRI C. G. K. REDDY (Mysore): But 
what is the advice? 

MR. CHAIRMAN: That the officials 
should have a different psychological 
approach. 

SHRI PRITHVIRAJ KAPOOR: People go 
and address meetings in Bombay. I have seen 
it and I have attended so many meetings. I 
have been dealing with refugees in Bombay, 
not for a short time but for the last seven 
years. I have seen people just exploiting the 
position. I say. our people should not lose 
their balance. Some have lost it and have not 
regained balance. Many of these people have 
lost their all and come here and started doing 
things. Their children work when they should 
be studying. All these things have happened 
and we all know it. These people tried to re-
establish themselves. And it was our duty all 
along to. help them and my request to all is 
that we should approach these people in all 
humility and in a spirit of service and see that 
these people get re-established, that they get 
on their feet again, that they are UD and 
doing. 

[MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN in the Chair.] 

They are part of this nation and if any part 
is hurt or if any part suffers, then the entire 
country suffers. 

On this point again I have to request 
people on this side, on that side and the 
whole House to approach this subject in a 
spirit of service and in all humility. 

Thank you, Sir. 

SHRI B. C. GHOSE    (West Bengal): 
Although, Sir, the    provisions of this Bill 
have not evoked much opposition, the 
working of the Administration has been 
subjected to rather severe criticism.    I must    
confess that I do not know sufficiently about 
the administration of this     institution to offer  
any opinion as to its working.   I have tried, 
however,  to gather some information, and all 
that I can say is that taking by and large my 
report is that it has not functioned very badly 
considering the resources at its disposal.   I do 
not mean  to say that there  are  no  defi-
ciencies, that the    refugees have not suffered.    
If you take the figures that the  hon.   Minister  
himself  mentioned, you find that 40,000 
applications were received in September,  
1951, of which 8,000  are still  outstanding.    
That  by itself  would   be   sufficient   
condemnation of any institution unless we 
knew something about the conditions under 
which that body or institution had to function.    
The  fact  also that  applications were received 
at times and then closed—that    means, no    
applications were received—also goes against 
common     reasoning  because  there  might 
have been refugees who were in need of funds  
or money but     applications were  not  being  
received   during  that period.      The fact 
again that moneys were given in driblets also 
shows that the refugees  really were not  
assisted in the way or to the extent that they 
should have    been.    These are   valid 
criticisms against the way the Administration 
has worked.    But, there have been   
difficulties   to   which   I   do   not want to 
refer because that is not my main purpose 
today.    The main  difficulty I find in regard 
to this institution  is to fully comprehend  the 
purpose for which it has been established. 
What is this    institution for?    Would the 
Government kindly explain that to me?    Is it 
for the purpose of relief or is it intended to 
function as a financial institution?    
Originally, in 1948, when the Bill was 
brought before the Constituent   Assembly,   
MF.   Shanmukham Chetty who was piloting 
the Bill stated that there were two problems: 
first, 



 

[Shri B. C. Ghose.] there was the problem 
of the rural refugees—that was being taken 
care of by the Rehabilitation Department—
and. secondly, there was the question of urban 
refugees, people like professional men, 
traders, businessmen and small industrialists 
who had come over to this country and had to 
be set up in business again. Then he asked 
himself this question, namely, he said that it 
might be asked that if money is needed for this 
purpose there was the other institution which 
the Government was then considering to 
establish, namely, the Industrial Finance 
Corporation, and why could not people go and 
get funds from that institution? His reply was 
that the Industrial Finance Corporation, 
according to him, was meant for the larger 
industries, for big business but there was no 
institution to help smaller people, cottage 
industries, smaller industrialists and so forth 
and it was his idea that this Rehabilitation 
Finance Administration should be utilised for 
that purpose. Now, I should like to know from 
the hon. Minister whether this Administration 
has been utilised for that purpose. I can quite 
appreciate that at the very beginning the 
overwhelming question must have been to 
give assistance to the large number of refugees 
who were coming away under appalling 
conditions from Pakistan. At that time 
probably principles could not be adhered to; 
strict principles could not have been laid down 
as well; the question must have been a 
humanitarian question at that time and 
probably the idea that was behind the 
establishment of this institution could not have 
been given full effect to. But, time has elapsed 
since then; six years have gone by. I do riot 
think that if it was the purpose of this 
institution to rehabilitate business people that 
objective has been to a very large extent 
fulfilled. I do not deny that it has given 
assistance to a large- number of refugees; I do 
not deny that that has been a very laudable 
objective but if that is to be the main purpose 
of this institution let us not call it a 
rehabilitating institution; if it is not for 
purposes of offering relief only, for purposes 
of giving doles, for purposes of keeping 
people 

alive for some period of time but if ic is to be 
a successful institution for rehabilitating 
people in business, I shou'd have thought that 
the Government should make the purpose 
clear. If they want this institution to be 
primarily a financial institution then 1 think 
that either of two things can be done: firstly, 
this is not an institution, as at present 
organised, which can function as a financial 
institution with any great success. Nor can it 
set up people in business with any large 
measure of success. I do not know what its 
own record is. I should like to have 
information from the hon. Minister as to how 
much money has been paid out, how much of 
it he considers will be treated as bad debt and 
how many persons have really been 
successfully established in business. One great 
defect of this institution is that if a business 
loan is given that concern or that business 
cannot be kept constantly under review. This 
institution is mainly a loan giving institution, 
like a baniya or sahukor who gives a loan and 
all that it is concerned with is to get back the 
loan according to certain terms. Has it the 
machinery to see as to how people or the 
institutions that it may have financed—those 
people and those institutions —are 
progressing, as to whether the loans which 
have been given to them are sufficient and, if 
not sufficient, whether more money should not 
be given to them so as to make the unit more 
economic or enable them to tide over difficult 
periods? That is really what a financial 
institution should do. That function can be 
discharged by a body or an institution like a 
bank and I should therefore request the hon. 
Minister to consider this suggestion, namely, 
that if his primary purpose is to set up people 
in business, he should take advantage of the 
banking institutions, place the funds at the 
disposal of banking institutions, set up a Board 
to advise us as to what applications should be 
considered or should be admitted, lay down 
the conditions for the grant of loans but then 
let the banks take charge of the transactions 
and the loans and look after the parties. One 
advantage    will be that   these parties 
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will also have come in conttu I. with 
commercial concerns like banks and if and 
when the Rehabilitation Finance 
Administration will no longer be in existence, 
still then they would be looked after. 
Incidentally I should like to ask the hon. 
Minister: What is his idea about this 
organization? Is it going to be a permanent one 
or is it going to be for 15 years, as the period 
of the loan is being extended to 15 years? But, 
then, loans may be given even up to the 15th 
year. I do not know if it is the idea of the 
Government not to invite any more applica-
tions. Have they come to any decision on that? 
If applications are still to be invited, their 
examination will take time and loans may be 
given after some time. If the same rate of pro-
gress is maintained it may take two • or three 
years to consider those applications and allow 
loans so that in that case the Administration 
may be of a permanent character. I will have 
some-' thing to say on that presently. If the 
Government for any reason do not consider the 
suggestion that I have now given as acceptable, 
then the other alternative that I can suggest is 
to convert this institution into something like a 
Development or a Finance Corporation to look 
after or give loans to small people, to cottage 
industries and small industries and so forth, to 
function not as it is functioning now, but more 
or less on the lines on which say the State 
Finance Corporation or the Industrial Finance 
Corporation functions today because even then 
it will be able to do real service to the people 
that it may be assisting. It will have a 
permanent organisation of a permanent 
character. It will have people who will have, I 
presume, some experience in business, be able 
to sift applications and assist businessmen 
when they will be requiring loans. Personally I 
should prefer the first alternative, namely, that 
the Government should take advantage of the 
banking institutions which exist and offer the 
loans through those institutions because I 
believe that they are able to look after people 
better than Government institutions. 
Incidentally I may say here that one reason 
why today even, people, if they can, do not 

want to go to, say, the Industrial Finance 
Corporation or the State Finance Corporation 
but would prefer to have dealings with the 
banks is that the banks know business 
conditions and would be amenable to reason, 
that they are not hide-bound by rules and 
regulations. Another advantage is that a banker 
knows the people more than an institution like 
this can know. If you set up a small industrial 
corporation then it does not come into contact 
with the people in the ordinary course of 
business whereas a banker not only knows his 
client and customers but he knows the 
conditions of the market. He has information 
about the customers of other banks and in this 
way he has a general knowledge of the market 
and that knowledge is very useful in not only 
judging applications but also in looking after 
those applicants at a later period. I should not 
be understood to have stated that in giving 
loans or in examining applications for loans 
from refugees the standards should be the 
same as the bankers normally lay down. That 
would be simply absurd because people who 
have come from Pakistan cannot obviously 
offer the same type of security or satisfy the 
same conditions as laid down in the case of 
ordinary commercial loans. Therefore I have 
suggested that there should be a committee and 
that Government should lay down standards 
and those standards naturally should be very 
much more lax than the standards which 
bankers now enforce. Now, if therefore, as I 
suggest, this Administration is to function as a 
financial institution and is to prove useful, then 
the whole aspect of its working will have to be 
changed. But if the idea is that it is to function 
as a relief institution then of course I have 
nothing to say. I shall therefore again request 
the hon. Minister to give serious thought to the 
suggestions I have made and see whether the 
first alternative that I have placed for his 
consideration cannot be accepted. 

SHRI P. C. BHANJ DEO (Orissa): Mr. 
Deputy Chairman, Sir, in the days of  
democracy  that  we  have  with   us 
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[Shri P. C. Bhanj Deo.] 
the questions and problems of displace 
ment are always with us. Not only did 
the problems and affairs of displace 
ment arise with the partition of Ind a 
with which we are concerned this after 
noon on the floor of this House but Mr. 
Deputy Chairman, Sir, you are yourself 
aware that even in this House there 
have been problems of many displace 
ments. But whereas we can adjust 
our problems and affairs of displace 
ment by a mere adjustment of 
seats ....................  

SHRI B. C. GHOSE: After wrangling. 

SHRI P. C. EHANJ DEO: After 
friendly wrangling..................... 

SHRI S. N. MAZUMDAR: No wrangling. 

SHRI P.  C.     BHANJ     DEO: ............. the 
problems which face this nation and which 
are the outcome of the very serious step taken 
by the Congress Government in partitioning 
this country....:. 

SHRI H. P. SAKSENA (Uttar Pradesh): It 
was net the Congress Government. 

AN HON. MEMBER: It was only Congress 
Party then. 

SHRI C. G. K. REDDY: They had no 
husiness to accept partition. 

SHRI P. C. BHANJ DEO: ................are so 
serious, if one chooses to consider these 
matters seriously, that one has to see the 
amount of human suffering that millions of 
people are undergoing today in Bengal and in 
Punjab in order to understand the gravity of 
the problems in their full complexity. But 
when I see the solutions that the Government 
is attempting to bring about to this vital 
problem before us, to these innumerable 
sufferings of displaced human beings, I think 
I should agree with the hon. Minister 
opposite, who has introduced this Bill, when 
he described in another piac-j the Adminis-
tration in question as having a very shining 
surface. Indeed, Sir, it has a very shining 
surface, but then we must 

remember that all that glitters is not gold—
often you have heard that told. Yesterday he 
told us again that this Administration was not 
a bank nor was it an organization of the Re-
habilitation Ministry to give grants in the 
form of loans. It is indeed neither of them. It 
is an unholy mixture of the gold lust and the 
steel frame, and-the result, Sir, as can be 
expected, is most disappointing and, in many 
cases, injurious. 

Now in all this paradox with which 
the Government have flooded the coun 
try today I myself am at a loss to face 
this problem in its true perspective be 
cause as.the hon. speaker before me 
has quite rightly remarked, we do not 
quite understand the purpose which 
this Administration is meant to ob 
serve. As a purely financial institu 
tion, I am afraid I cannot congratulate 
the Finance Ministry on its creation in 
this field. In the realm of finance, Sir, 
I have always tried to point out to this 
House that unless our unproductive 
loans are taken from the capital side 
to- the revenue side of the Budget, we 
shall be surely facing a financial crisis 
in the no distant future, and this per 
petual demand on the part of the Fin 
ance Ministry to camouflage unproduc 
tive loans as productive ones by vari 
ous means and contrivances at its dis 
posal may be very soothing to the 
party to which the Finance Minister 
belongs in the short run but in the 
long run it is going to be disastrous 
to the future financial stability of this 
nation. These loans to the refugees 
which are given by the Administration 
in question and also given by the Cen 
tral Government to the various State 
Governments for rehabilitation purposes 
can in no way be termed as productive 
loans, where productive loans mean 
capital assets which are likely to draw 
interest and pay off amortization 
charges. But all this machinery has 
been devised in order to create the 
impression that loans of this type are 
productive loans and indeed, Sir, to 
many of my past questions to the Fin 
ance  Ministry in.  this  field...............  

MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: I thin* you 
are going into the larger issue. Pl« ::se 
confine your remarks to the Bill. 
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SHRI B. C. GHOSE: This is a small part of 
the larger issue. 

MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: You can wait 
till February when the Budget -comes up 
before the House. Now we are concerned on'y 
with the small Bill. 

SHRI P. C. BHANJ DEO: What I am 
driving at is ...........  

SHRI B. C. GHOSE: That small drops make 
an ocean. 

SHRI  P.   C.   BHANJ     DEO: ............that 
Ihese small drops not only make an 
ocean but that this Administration is 
a clear example of how financial mani 
pulations can present black into white 
and white into black. That has been 
the burden of my song always and 
that is still the burden of my song. 
But of course in order to be able to 
understand the Administration proper 
ly, as my friend here has said, we want 
more detailed information. He has al 
ready mentioned a number of them 
anticipating me in that field. I will 
only add that we should like to 
know.........  

SHRI A. C. GUHA: May I know •whom he 
is referring to? Mr. Ghose or Mr. Mazumdar? 

SHRI P. C. BHANJ DEO: Mr. Ghose, who 
preceded me. I should like to know whether 
the Administration has become a paying 
concern by itself, whether it has become self-
supporting or not. Unless it is going to be a 
paying concern, what is the use of the Indian 
Government keeping these white elephants? 
As far as I can understand, the Government is 
already wasting over a crore of rupees in 
maintaining this organisation. It is neither 
serving the purely financial side of our needs 
as it should nor the other side which Mr. 
Ghose was pleased to call the relief side. What 
I would like to stress here is the humanitarian 
side of the question. From the financial side it 
is a flop; from the relief side it is a cross 
between Shylock and charity. 

SHRI B. C. GHOSE: What did it pro-<luce1 

SHRI P. C. BHANJ DEO: That I will leave to 
imagination. In this field many suggestions 
have be* n made, the most constructive of 
which I consider to be the suggestion of the 
last speaker on this side of the House as far 
as the financial aspect is concerned. But my 
appeal to the Minister is that instead of 
looking at this question from the financial 
aspect only we should consider the whole 
matter from the human side. Human beings 
have been uprooted; our own flesh and blood 
have been uprooted from their homes by a 
cruel fate. They are drifting about here and 
there, seeking our sympathy and charity and 
what do we give them in their hour of need, 
in their shame and ery, in their time of 
difficulty? We choose to give them loans 
with interest and when it is suggested to the 
hon. Minister that the interest charged is too 
high, that 6 per cent, interest is too high, his 
reply elsewhere has been: "Oh, mind you, 
there is a rebate on it. If the  loanees pay  up  
their  loans  in 

 time they get one per cent, rebate. Hence the 
interest instead of being 6 

 per cent, becomes 5 per cent." I ask you, Sir, 
is this the right way to approach this 
questiori? It is quite obvious that in their 
circumstances the loanees in the difficulties 
under which they labour cannot pay their 
loans in the right time and hence that rebate 
of one per cent. as far as tangible human 
values are concerned, is quite useless. 

So, I have a suggestion t& make which may 
seem somewhat revolutionary. It does not 
come from a revolutionary party, it is true, but 
it is based upon commonsense; if the great 
Father of the Nation were only alive today, he 
would have supported the idea which I am 
putting before the 1   House today heart and 
soul, 

SHRI A. C.  GUHA: Namely? 

SHRI P. C. BHANJ DEO: My suggestion 
to the House and to the hon. Minister is that 
"Trust begets trust". Let the loans exist. I 
know it is not a sound financial proposition 
according to the tenets of pure finance about 
which I have been so long speaking in 
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[Shri P. C. Bhanj Deo.] this House. All this 
may sound nonsense from that angle. I am not 
speaking from the pure realms of the science 
of finance. I speak as a layman for greater 
human happiness. Let the loans exist. We are 
giving these loans knowing full well the 
present condition of loanees, knowing their 
plight. There is no guarantee except the moral 
guarantee. Can't we trust our own friends? 
Can't we trust our own people, thinking that 
men are endowed with conscience and that 
they will discharge the obligations they 
undertook to discharge in the interests of their 
fellow brethren? My experience abroad both 
in England and from what I have heard about 
America is this. From what I saw in England 
and from what I heard of things happening in 
America, it makes me double sure that if this 
courageous step were to be taken by the 
Government and its supporters, it would prove 
itself so lucrative, both in the moral sphere 
and also in the financial field, that the 
Government will not think twice before they 
repeat it. 

SHRI B. C. GHOSE: Has the hon. Member 
tried this step? 

SHRI P. C. BHANJ DEO: I am only 
mentioning it here. The various trust shops, 
the various trust restaurants which are being 
opened in America today come from the idea 
of a newspaper boy who suddenly got this 
flair of putting all the newspapers at the 
various corners of streets and putting a 
receptacle with a little notice, "Any one who 
wants such and such a newspaper may put so 
many cents in this receptacle and take a 
paper". 

SHRI B. C. GHOSE: You try it. 

SHRI P. C. BHANJ DEO: This has been 
done and you will be surprised to know that it 
is a tremendous success; so much so that trust 
restaurants have been opened, trust shops have 
been started and so on. On a similar pattern, 
scholarships have been opened in Great 
Britain where the scholarship is in the form of 
a loan but a loan without any condition. This 
is a loan which demands     the moral  insight  
of     the 

loanee to pay off the loans when he qualifies 
himself through the scholarship and begins to 
earn his living and so can wipe off the debt 
that he has incurred as a scholar. 

There are many voices here which give me 
great pain when they say, in a sarcastic 
manner, that an experiment which has been 
proved successful in other countries with very 
little past, very little moral integrity compared 
with this country's past and with this country's 
moral integrity,—that an experiment which 
has been successful in another country should 
be looked down upon and dubbed ridiculous in 
a country like our beloved motherland, with an 
ancient past, rich heritage and long devotion to 
truth and eternal things of life. If this is the 
attitude we are going to adopt towards our 
own fellow-men and towards our own country 
and its traditions, then the building up of India 
on any lasting foundation is indeed a dream. 
But I am not one of those who share the 
pessimism of my friends. I am optimistic and 
am willing to trust my own people and I am 
only putting it to the Government that in view 
of the fact that they are wasting money, 
making many wasteful experiments and trials, 
this scheme may also be given a trial so that 
we may not only be able to rehabilitate the 
refugees of West Punjab and East Pakistan but 
also rehabilitate our own social conscience 
which we seem to have lost in the process of 
bondage for the last one hundred or two 
hundred years and really succeed in building 
up-a greater India, a united India and a true 
India which will not be anything less in its 
devotion to truth than our great predecessors 
and the great Father of the Nation, who has 
been, through his own example in life, the 
torch-bearer in the fight for our freedom. This 
is my suggestion on the whole; if this 
suggestion is followed, all the officialdom, all 
the nepotism and corruption involved in 
everything will disappear. The hon. Minister 
has been pleased to say that these loans are 
grants in the form of loans. It is a very right 
warning. Let the form of loans exist in the 
spirit of grants to vitalise  the work  of the  
Government 



 

so that rehabilitation of refugees may truly 
be achieved without all these costs, without 
all the difficulties which this lop-sided white 
elephant of an administration is hardened 
with from all sides. 

SHRI C. P. PARIKH (Bombay): Sir, I rise 
to support this amending Bill, and it is 
necessary for me to go into the history of the 
Bill when the previous speakers have made 
some remarks on the Bill. The Act was 
passed in 1948 in which it is mentioned, in 
section 3, that this Administration is to give 
financial assistance on reasonable terms to 
displaced persons to enable them to establish 
themselves in business. 

4 P.M. 
Now,  Sir,  the  relief  side  has  been taken  

care  of by the     Rehabilitation Ministry.    
They have spent about Rs. 160    crores    for    
rehabilitating    the refugees from East and 
West Pakistan. Even after spending this 
amount Government are considering that the 
problem of East Pakistan is not fully solved.   
Therefore, Sir, I may say that on the relief   
side   the Government have tackled the 
problem of, refugees in a very remarkable 
manner and the other countries will have to 
see the way in which we have given relief to 
refugees in so many ways—educational 
grants, housing accommodation,    
maintenance allowances    and foreign    
scholarships, etc.    In this way large amounts 
have been  spent  and we have successfully 
solved     the problem  of settling     the 
refugees     in  our  country.    It was  a huge 
problem.    On  the  side  of West Pakistan we 
have solved this problem satisfactorily, but on 
the side of East Pakistan the  problem remains  
and  it is  under the serious  consideration of 
the Government.    The solution of the 
problem  cannot be to the satisfaction of all 
the     Members  from their own standpoint, 
but I think we have to look to  the  resources  
of  the  country  and according to the resources 
of the country we have  solved the     problem 
in the best possible manner. 

Now, Sir, coming to the other type of 
criticisems which have been levelled 

against the     Administration,  I  would like 
to submit that being members of the 
Administration we are responsible for all the 
criticisms that have been levelled    against 
the    Administration. The  Finance     
Ministry  is  responsible for shaping the 
policy of the Administration and for giving 
directives.    But we are quite bound to this 
House any time  to  give   explanations   that  
they require,  and the  criticisms  they offer 
will always be looked into by us with all  
care.     Three   Members   of  Parliament are 
on this body and one member is from outside 
on the non-official side.    Sir,  the first 
speaker  said  that when the refugee was a 
member, the applications were quickly 
disposed of. I think, Sir, he has not gone into 
the report  which  has  been   circulated   to 
the Members.    The disposal  of applications 
during the last 12 months has been  
remarkable     and that  was  the highest in 
the record of the Administration for the last 
four years.   I may submit, Sir, that the 
disposal of applications  numbering  65,000  
and  odd  is not an easy matter for the 
Administration unless they want to give 
loans in a haphazard manner without any in-j  
vestigation.    This is    not a    banking |  
institution.    As will be seen, Sir, we have to 
give assistance in a reasonable way.     We 
are not     asking for     any security; we are    
not asking for any I   mortgages; we are not 
asking for the terms  which  the banks 
demand.    We |  have     advanced loans in 
many cases |   even when the man had 
nothing with j  him.   I may say, Sir, that 
many per-j  sons  have   been  rehabilitated  
by  this measure. 

Now, Sir, coming to the banking system which 
Mr. Ghose has pointed out, 1  I   may   say,   
Sir,   that  if all this was ;   left to the banks to 
advance the loans, I think the    banks would 
have said. "We will do it but the cent, per cent i  
responsibility is yours." 

SHRI B. C.  GHOSE:  That has been !  
done now. 

SHRI C. P. PARIKH: In this amending Bill we 
are giving the powers to the banks that if they 
recommend loans I  and give them, the 
Administration will 
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[Shri C. P. Parikfa.] bear the losses up to 
the full extent. That is the word and that word 
is very significant. It is also to be seen 
whether the banks will go into field survey 
and whether the banks have any such 
organisation. I know, Sir, that the banks are 
not capable of doing this unless the parties are 
very solvent. I refuse to consider that any 
bank will come forward to go into field 
survey, look after the refugees, find out the 
things and recommend loans unless it is 
without any responsibility. And without 
responsibility anybody can do it. 

Now, Sir, with regard to the disposal of 
applications, I may say, Sir, that we have 
disposed of 57,000 applications and 8,000 
remain at present to be disposed of. And out 
of these 8,000 applications 4,00i have already 
been scrutinised in the field survey and have 
been sent to the Administration at the Head 
Office and those 4,000 applications we shall 
be disposing of in about two months. 

SHRI B. C. GHOSE: In how many years? 

SHRI C. P. PARIKH: If the hon. Member 
has a little more patience, I shall reply to all 
the points which he has referred. Now, Sir, the 
Administration was started in the year 1948 
and the applications were invited after that, 
and now it is only five years since then. I may 
tell this House that all the applications 
previous to the second lot of applications have 
been disposed of. The second lot of 
applications was invited from July to 
September 1951 and those applications are 
41,000 and odd. Now out of those 41,000 
applications 20,000 applications were sent in 
the last ten days. You will see, Sir, that if we 
want to scrutinise the applications, naturally 
field survey is tc be made. It is not like banks 
where the borrower comes to the bank and 
takes the advance. Here the applicant makes 
an application and the Administration has to 
send its staff to survey the position and get all 
the details from the applicant and see whether 
what he writes is correct or not, because when 

one wants to establish some business, 
premises have to be taken, power has to be 
there, then the location has to be ascertained; 
thus all these factors have to be investigated 
properly. When we have to investigate into 
these cases all over India, naturally it takes a 
long time to do that. The field surveyors have 
to travel 200 miles to find out a particular 
applicant because he is situated at a different 
place. The Administration has established 
seven branches, but even then it takes so much 
time to do these things. If we are prepared to 
have the staff four or five times that we have 
at present, what will happen. You must 
consider that the staff will be very temporary 
and the applications will not be so well 
scrutinised and those persons who are 
temporary will take no interest in seeing 
whether the loan that is to be advanced will be 
on reasonable terms or not. So, to investigate 
these things and to use wisely the power 
which this House has given us, we have to see 
that the survey is made from field to field, 
where the applicants are living and we have to 
see that all the facilities are there for starting 
business or industry. Over and above that, we 
also help the applicants quite unlike the banks. 
Banks never help the loanees, while I may 
point out here that this Administration writes 
to the State Governments, to give them pre-
mises, power connections, etc., and the 
Administration has always tried to use its 
influence to give all the facilities to the 
loanees. 

Now, a word about the staff. Now the 
repayments are to be spread over fifteen years. 
The instalments will naturally be divided into 
fifteen, and so this organisation, instead of ten 
years, has now to exist for 15 years, because 
we have already advanced about Rs. 7 crores 
and to recover that amount, some agency will 
be necessary for a period of fifteen years. The 
hon. Minister has foreseen the situation and 
said that if the banks do not utilise this 
amount of Rs. 3 crores, then this amount 
would go to the Administration in order that 
further loans may be given to displaced 
persons. 



355      Rehabilitation Finance    [ 25 NOV. 1953 ] Administration (.Amend-    356 
ment) Bill, 1952 

Now, as regards disbursements,  the -criticism  
is  that  the  loans  are  given in driblets, but the 
position has to be understood that, when loans 
are sanctioned, the applicants have to  give  a 
guarantor.    A  guarantor is  necessary because    
the    applicant   has    nothing because he is 
uprooted from his place. He has  to  say, "I am 
conducting my business in a bona fide    
manner and so     and so  is my surety."    All 
these conditions     have   to  be  fulfilled  and 
naturally  it     takes   time.    The  loans have 
naturally to be disbursed in such a way that all 
the conditions are satisfied,  and whenever all 
the conditions are  satisfied,  I  think there  has  
been no delay on the part of the Adminis-
tration,  and  if  there  has  been  delay in any 
case, Members can write to the Administration  
and  it will  be  looked into.    One  Member  
said that he had written to the Rehabilitation 
Ministry and they had sent it to the Adminis-
tration,  but  that  afterwards  his  complaint  
was  not  enquired  into.     I  can assure hon. 
Members that if any question  is  brought  to  
the  notice  of  the Administration,   we   will   
enquire   into it,  because it is our duty to 
enquire into Members' complaints.    It  is  only 
with the help of the Members that this 
Administration can be successful,  since, 
although the Ministry has made it an 
autonomous body, Members of Parliament 
have been taken on its executive as well as on 
its Advisory Board, and therefore, if we want 
the Administration to be very efficient and very 
competent,   I   think   Members   could   help 
the Administration a good deal. 

I now come to the question of recall •of 
loans. In fact, we have shown a good deal of 
sympathy in the matter of recovery of loans. 
We do not recall any loan unless it is 
absolutely necessary, because if we do not 
adopt the procedure of recalling loans, then 
what would happen is that even those who 
wish to pay will not pay. But some stringent 
procedure has to be taken in order to see that 
those who have the capacity to pay do pay. 
But whenever we are obliged to recall loans, 
we are being very generous as Mr. Kapoor 
has said,     and  we  have  even  offered     & 

m mthly instalment of Rs. 15. We have 
indeed tried to help these people us far as 
possible, but I may tell the House that some 
applicants have deceived the Administration 
also. They put in false statements and they 
have taken money for their personal use and 
put themselves in difficulties as also the 
Administration. The other loanees will also 
be cautious on that account. If we do not 
proceed against such persons, naturally we 
cannot tarry on the activities of the Adminis-
tration which this Act asks us to do. 

Now, Sir, on the question of expenses. At 
present the expenses are Rs. 18 lakhs a year 
and they are likely to go down when all the 
loans are disposed of. I can tell the House that 
the figures which were given by my hon. 
friend, Mr. Mazumdar, are not quite correct. 
He said that we have disbursed Rs. 5 crores 
and that we have incurred Rs. 1 crore 
expenses. In that Rs. 1 crore he must have 
seen that Rs. 30 lakhs are to cover risks of 
bad debts. That is not an establishment 
charge. We have therefore incurred during the 
period of five years that the Administration 
has been in existence only Rs. 65 lakhs as 
administrative expenses. We cannot do with 
less, if we want to dispose of the applications 
in the time desired by Members. We can 
reduce the staff only when ail the applications 
are disposed of, and then also a competent 
staff will be required for the collection of 
instalments. 

Then, another criticism was made that we 
have appointed certain persons on very high 
salaries. I have gone carefully into this matter. 
I must tell the House that this is a temporary 
service. People who had permanent jobs 
elsewhere have left those jobs and joined this 
organisation. When they leave their 
permanent appointments, naturally they would 
demand something more than they were 
getting, because here at any moment they may 
be discharged. So, only those who can stand 
on their own legs can come to this 
organisation. I can assure hon. Members that 
there has always been scrutiny about this, and 
if there are 



 

[Shri C. P. Parikh.] cases where Members 
think that we have paid high salaries, we will 
go | into those cases. In the House of the 
People some instances were given and we 
enquired into the matter. The hon. Member 
could give only five cases out of 600 people. 
We shall enquire into the whole position, and 
we shall rectify the position wherever we have 
been wrong. 

With regard to the staff, I might say that 
the staff is working without leave. Some of 
them have not had any leave for the last two 
years. One can see how the Administration 
is working. 

In regard to giving concessions to the 
refugees or treating them in a very lenient 
manner, that also we have tried to do. 
Previously interest and the first instalment 
we used to recover after two years. Now, we 
are not collecting the interest or the first 
instalment until three years. Three years is 
sufficient time for them to stabilise 
themselves in any industry or business. For 
the first three years they have to pay nothing. 
We are trying to help them in this way also. 
In certain cases,  where  we   are  certain  of 
their 

ilvency, we have dispensed with 
guarantors also. We have also said that the 
time between payment of the first instalment 
of the loan and the last instalment of the 
loan should not be  more  than  six  months.    
We  have 
also said that the repayment will start only 
after the full amount is paid, and 
that meets the objections raised by some 
hon. friend. 

We are going into the question of review 
also. Whatever applications have been 
rejected, we are reviewing them again. 
When further materials are collected and we 
think that the case warrants help, we are 
giving a loan. This review process is going 
on and no applicant will suffer on that 
account. Then we have also given the 
statement of enhancement. After the loan is 
given, if the applicant requires more money, 
then also we try to give him. We want to try 
to accommodate honest persons as far as 
possible.    If 

jthey are  carrying on  the  business or I the   
industry   and   if  we   have   given I them 
Rs. 10,000 and if they want more, iwe  are  
prepared   and  we   are   giving them Rs. 
10,000 or Rs.  15,000 more if  we think they 
will be rehabilitated and loan is safe. 

Now on this Administration there are 
members of the Advisory Board who have 
also rendered considerable assistance in 
carrying out the work which we are doing. I 
may say that in this Administration 
Government have also not appointed 
members of only one shade of opinion but 
have appointed members of all shades of 
opinion and out of those members whf-are 
existing, two of them are working with the 
refugees and one is a refugee himself. The 
fourth member is my-self who is not a 
refugee but of the others, two are working 
among the refugees and usually the interests 
of the refugees are looked after by them as 
much as possible. There are monthly 
meetings. We are scrutinising all cases 
before passing these loans and those 
meetings last for 6 hours or for two days or 
even three days. All attention is given and 
every loan is carefully scrutinised. 

With regard to East Pakistan we have 
some difficulties. With regard to West 
Pakistan there are verified claims and we are 
able to know the antecedents of the 
applicant easily. Therefore it has been easy 
for us to give loans to those who have come 
from West Pakistan but the position is rather 
difficult with respect to East Pakistan. We 
have to rely on the antecedents of the man 
according to what he gives and according to 
what is available from the side of the 
information that is available to us, which 
takes time. 

As regards self-supporting or other 
matters which one of the hon. Members has 
referred to I may say that this 
Administration is doing as far as possible in 
the matter. We shall be advancing loans to 
the extent of Rs. 12 crores. Out of that you 
will understand from the report which is 
before you   and   which   has   been   
circulated. 
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that SO per cent, only will be recovered and 
the rest will be gone. Therefore you will see 
that we are trying to give accommodation to 
the displaced persons as far as possible. The 
reason is that in West Pakistan the recovery 
will be sixty per cent, and in East Pakistan 
the recovery will be forty per cent, because 
in West Pakistan we have some more 
reliable data as re' gards verified claims but 
even though 'Government may lose fifty per 
cent, of the amount on this Administration, I 
think if fifty per cent, of the people receive 
this benefit and get rehabilitated, a great 
service will have been rendered to the 
displaced persons. If we look to the amount 
of good done to them, J think this loss will 
be considered negligible—looking to the Rs. 
ItiO crores which we have spent in other 
directions. 

Now I will come to the criticisms of the 
first hon. Member who made the suggestion 
that there has been differ-ence in treatment 
between urban and rural people. There has 
been no difference. I think there was 
difference in his mind on account of the 
compensation scheme which is there. Whe» 
ther the man is coming from rural or urban 
areas, we are treating them alike in the 
matter of giving loans. 

Then Mr. Mazumdar has said that the 
expenses are twenty per cent. I don't know 
his method of calculation. The expenses are 
to be taken on the loans that are outstanding 
or disbursements that are existing. The 
loans that exist at present are about Rs. 7 
crores on which we are spending annually 
Rs. 16 lakhs and that comes to 2J per cent. 
Therefore his mathematics of combining 
this with the amount of loan is against 
banking principles. He has also said that the 
insurance charges have to be paid at six per 
cent. rate. I don't know where he got the six 
per cent, rate, because insurance charges, I 
don't think, will exceed 1 per cent. Then he 
has recommended twenty instalments 
instead of fifteen. This Amending Bill is 
making a loan repayable upto 15 years 
instead of 10 years according to the original 
Act and this is a step <in the right    
direction 

because if we go over to 20 years, naturally 
we are making the man who receives the loan 
also lethargic in payments. If he has to pay 
Rs. 40 a month. I think every man who wants 
to carry on business or industry can very well 
pay that after a period of three years and if he 
does not do that, I think he is not carrying on 
the business or industry. Therefore extending 
the number of instalments will be useless. 

With regard to the staff of this 
Administration, Mr. Kapoor made some 
remarks but with regard to that, I should say 
that 95 per cent, of the people who are in the 
staff are refugees. 

SHRI C. G. K. REDDY: 98 per cent, 
according to the Minister. 

SHRI C. P. PARIKH: That is an im-
provement. I thank you. I am only giving a 
rough figure. 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: I also gave a rough 
figure. 

SHRI C. P. PARIKH: A considerable 
number of refugees are there and we take a 
man who is not a refugee only when we don't 
find a competent refugee. Therefore the 
human element or the nursing element is 
always there which can be seen. 

Now, with regard to a funny suggestion 
which has been made by one hon. Member 
that 'Let the loan be on trust', I should say that 
we have to consider whether we are in a 
position to place such trust and whether we 
can trust every body. I think we have trusted 
so many and if we have to trust seventy five 
lakhs of refugees, we have to consider whom 
to trust and whom not to trust.. Before 
making any suggestions, we have to consider 
them whether they can be implemented by the 
Ministry. 

With regard to the other points, it is for the 
Minister to say as regards policy because, 
whatever is laid down, we are trying to carry 
it out in our best way with the resources that 
are 
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[Shri C. P. Parikh.] given. You will see that 
the resources are raised from Rs. 7 crores to 
Rs. 14£ crores because Rs. 3 crores are also 
for utilization as loans. With regard to 
instalments, a great concession has been 
made. With regard to auditing, I welcome 
that. But with regard to the past, I may say 
that the foremost company in India was our 
auditor and therefore this House has nothing 
to fear that in the past we have not looked into 
the matter or the auditors have not looked into 
them. But if anything is required, we are quite 
prepared to go into the past as well as the 
present. The appointment of the Comptroller 
and Auditor General is therefore very good. 

With     these suggestions     and  comments,  
I  support  the  Bill. 

SARDAR BUDH  SINGH  (Jammu  and 
Kashmir): 
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[For English translation, see Appendix VI, 
Annexure No. 14.] 

SHRI KISHEN CHAND: We welcome this 
amending Bill in so far as it gives some relief 
but when we are considering this Bill we 
should go to the principal Act, the Rehabilita-
tion Finance Administration Act. and try to 
find out whether it is really bringing any relief 
to the poor refugees who have been uprooted 
from their places for no fault of their own. We 
have got to take very sympathetic action in 
their case, especially in the case of refugees 
from East Pakistan who have come at a time 
when there is great depression in our country 
and the opportunities for employment and 
rehabilitation are  much  smaller. 

I will point out to you. Sir, that the number 
of refugees from West Pakistan was about 65 
lakhs and the number from East Pakistan is 
over 35 lakhs: that means we have a problem 
of rehabilitating nearly a crore of people in 
this country. If you take four persons to form 
a family, it means that there are 25 lakhs of 
families who have got to be rehabilitated. One 
hon. Member pointed out that there were 
65,000 applications and that the task was 
stupendous. They take so much time that I 
fee! almost ashamed of this meagre help. This 
delay is one of the difficulties in obtaining this 
loan; delays are so great that only 65,000 
people have applied. Out of 25 lakhs of 
families. I would have expected at least 10 
lakhs of applications. For this loan, we should 
have had ten lakhs of applications, but we 
think 65,000 is a very big number. They 
received 40,000 applications and then stopped 
receiving them for two years. After two years 
again applications    were invited;    when     
about 

twenty five thousand applications were 
received they were stopped again. In this way 
we got 65,000 applications where we should 
have got really ten lakhs of applications. For 
one crore of people we offer seven crores of 
rupees as rehabilitation finance which work1; 
out to Rs. 7 per head and we are very proud of 
it! I feel almost ashamed of it. I think we have 
tackled these far-reaching and most difficult 
problems in such a meagre way that really 
instead of bringing any relief, most of the 
money given is frittered away in just 
collecting data and in administration and 
management. I should have thought. Sir, that 
this rehabilitation finance would have been of 
the scale of Rs. 100 crores. Then only would it 
be possible to bring real relief. An hon. 
Member has pointed out that we have spent 
about Rs. 160 crores on grants. Out of this, a 
sum of Rs. 60 crores has been spent on 
administration and only about Rs. 100 crores 
has gone to the people. It would be seen from 
every year's budget that we are sanctioning 
only Rs. 15 to Rs. 20 crores during the last 
five or six years and we could have given only 
about Rs. 75 crores or Rs. 80 crores for 
rehabilitating a crore of people. The whole 
thing is so ridiculously small that instead of 
bringing any relief, it really creates hopes in 
the minds of people and there is a great deal 
of frustration when these hopes are not 
fulfilled. Whose fault  is  ft? 

There were nearly six million Muslims who 
migrated from India and left behind their 
property. That property, if it had been sold in 
1948, would have fetched a very high price. 
Our Rehabilitation Ministry goes on from 
year to year, just sleeping over the problem 
saying that they are verifying the claim. I 
suppose, you know, Sir. that verified claims 
are for over Rs. 500 crores. The actual amount 
of property left behind by Indians in Pakistan 
is over a thousand crores nf rupees and our 
Government has been just delaying things. 
They have not been trying to rehabilitate 
them; thev are just giving the refugees small 
doles here and there. We are very proud of 
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giving these loans and we demand a 
guarantor. Where will the poor man bring a 
guarantor from and who wi'i stand as a 
guarantor without sonw consideration? 
Probably, the guarantor will take half the 
loan. Otherwise nobody will come forward to 
be tho guarantor. I think we should never ask 
Tor a guarantor. It is a great mistake to 
impose a guarantor, to ask another person to 
take up this responsibility. 

The Government is giving only seven 
crores of rupees. Mr. Parikh has pointed out 
that we are spending 18 lakhs of rupees on 
administration. So far we have advanced 5 
crores of rupees on which we will get, 
assuming that we get the entire amount of 
interest and the entire amount of the principal, 
about Rs. 25 lakhs every year as interest. The 
Government of India will take away 3 per 
cent., tha* means 15 lakhs. This will leave a 
balance of 10 lakhs of rupees provided the 
entire loan is recovered. If we take Mr. 
Parikh's figures, 50 per cent will be recovered 
out of the 25 lakhs of rupees, that is. 12J lakhs 
will be collected as interest and the Govern-
ment of India will take 15 lakhs of rupees as 
interest. That means that the interest 
recovered may not be sufficient to pay interest 
to the Government of India. Therefore this 18 
lakhs of rupees which is spent on the Admi-
nistration will be a burden on the capital. At 
this rate, in five years' time it will take up a 
crore of rupees and in twenty years nearly 4 to 
5 crores of rupees will be written off. When 
we are going to write off the entire principal 
in the shape of expenditure on Administration, 
why not change our method of administration, 
change our agency and change our attitude 
towards the refugees? I admire the courage of 
an hon. Member of this House who proposed 
that we should give it on trust. I think that is 
the correct approach. I do not. however, say 
that we should immediately adopt it but the 
attitude of mind should be that whatever we 
can recover should be considered as well and 
good. If we cannot recover the whole amount  
it does not matter be- 

cause we are going to spend away that money 
on Administration, under the garb of 
administration, a sum at the rate of Rs. 18 
lakhs every year and in twenty years the 
entire amount would be finished and the net 
result to the Government of India would be 
zero because the whole principal will be eaten 
up. Then why not let the refugees eat it up? If 
the amount is to be eaten up, I think the 
refugees are more deserving of it. 

Sir, I agree with the suggestion made by Mr. 
Ghose. He has pointed out that in our country 
where the refugees have gone all over the 
place, to hundreds and thousands of cities and 
the scrutiny agency is bound to be very 
expensive, why cannot we enter into an 
agreement with a bank which has got a large 
number of branches, that the entire amount of 
money be placed at the disposal of the bank. 
We can have a small advisory committee to 
give general directions. Then in the case of a 
bank we know that the normal expenditure of 
banking is about 1 per cent, to IJ per cent, of 
the working capital and therefore a bank will 
manage this fund of 7 crores of rupees for 
about 7 lakhs of rupees. So if we can give it or 
entrust it to a bank and ask it to advance the 
money, and instruct it that if after taking due 
care the money is not recovered in the normal 
course, it should be written off. If you entrust it 
to a bank I am sure. Sir, that banks will come 
forward and give most reasonable terms. They 
may come forward even in these days to do the 
work on half a per cent, because, after all, it is 
a question of rehabilitation of our own 
countrymen. Their normal work is going on 
and so they may not demand the full amount of 
their expenditure. So I will suggest to the hon. 
Minister that instead of setting up this 
complicated agency which is costing him 18 
lakhs of rupees a year and which eventually is 
going to eat up the entire capital, it will be far 
better if this work is entrusted to a commercial 
bank and v*e may ask it to take reasonable 
care and to make reasonable enquiries before it 
advances money. Besides we have got the 
whole 



 

[Shri Kishen Chand.] Rehabilitation 
Ministry and the Rehabilitation Ministry has 
got a very big staff which has gone into 
details of all claims. They have got all the 
records. Then why do we want another 
agency? If you do not want to entrust this 
work to a bank, why don't you give it to the 
Rehabilitation Ministry? Why set up another 
agency at a cost of Rs. 18 lakhs a year? I sub-
mit, Sir, that it has become a fashion, when 
some people have to be provided for, a new 
agency is created and a new mode of 
expenditure is evolved so that it may go on 
spending money on administration more than 
on relief and rehabilitation. 

Then, Sir, it has been pointed out by some 
Members that the rate of interest is too high 
and the period of repayment is too small. I am 
glad that the period of repayment is being 
increased from 10 to 15 years though I would 
like it to be at least 20 years, and during the 
first 5 years no instalment, either of principal 
or interest, should be asked for. Further, Sir, 
1953 has been a period of depression in in-
dustry and in trade and if any instalments are 
demanded in 1953 it is impossible for the 
loanee to repay it. What happens is that the 
Collector is asked to collect it as a land 
revenue collection. The Collector sends his 
men and they collect everything from the 
loanee, even his household goods. Is it fair, 
Sir? Is it fair that we take such drastic steps, 
not considering their economic condition and 
the troublous times through which they are 
passing? Keeping all these things in view I 
will humbly suggest to the hon. Deputy 
Finance Minister to be very careful in the 
management of this Rehabilitation Finance 
Administration. He should try to reduce the 
cost of administration, give every sort of 
facility to the loanee and remove the liability 
of the guarantor. 

With these words, Sir, I resume my seat. 

SHRI S. MAHANTY (Orissa): Sir, I have 
no intention to inflict a speech on the House 
at this time. Now, really tft+i\(Lf*Y there is 
nothing very much 

to say. The material aspects of this Bill are 
very simple. It wants to increase the funds at 
the disposal of the Administration from 
seven to twelve crores of rupees. It seeks to 
extend the period of repayment from 10 
years to 15 years and it also makes the very 
welcome provision to get the accounts of the 
Administration audited by the Comptroller 
and Auditor-General of India. These are very 
laudable objects. 

But.   Sir,   we   cannot   consider   this Bill 
torn from its    emotional context. j   Sir, as I 
say these words the memories of 1947 and 
1948 come before my eyes Truly     speaking,  I   
consider  that  the |   millions    of      homeless       
anonymous refugees are the real architects of 
our nation's freedom.    In their blood and tears 
alone our freedom has been consecrated. 
Therefore it is futile to entef into a rigmarole of 
technicalities  and consider   the   means   and   
methods   o) how     the  loans   should  be  paid   
and should  be  realised.    Sir,  I  think, we are 
now in the sixth year of the functioning of the 
Administration.  Critical opinions from both 
sides of the House ifcave been expressed over 
the manner in which the Administration has 
functioned.       It is no good  now offering 
excuses.    After all that has been said by the 
supporters of this measure, it has    yet to be     
explained,  how    an amount of 12 crores of 
rupees is going to  rehabilitate  the  urban  
refugees  ot Western  Pakistan  and  Eastern  
Pakistan. In West Pakistan alone, I am told the  
urban   refugees  have  left  behind 500 crores 
of rupees worth of property. By no stretch of 
imagination can you ask   us   to   believe   that   
12   crores   of rupees   is   going   to   
rehabilitate   those refugees      who   have   left   
behind   500 crores of rupees worth of 
properties. 

5 P.M. 
Sir, I can only add emphasis to what my 

hon. friend Mr. Kishen Chand has said that 
this amount ought to have been enhanced. If 
it has been left to me I would have made a 
levy for rehabilitation of refugees. The 
leaders of the present Government, for one 
moment at least, should bear in mind that 
they have been coronated on the skeletons 
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of those anonymous ones, those who have lost 
their lives in a great communal conflagration. 
Therefore they owe it to them to see that they 
are properly rehabilitated. It is no use now 
•entering into a rigmarole of excuses. 

Now, Sir, I take exception to the very 
principle that interest should be charged on 
these loans. I am told that there are industrial 
concerns in India who get loans from the 
Government of India interest-free. 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: What is it? 

SHRI S. MAHANTY: I know instances of 
industrial concerns who get loans interest-free 
from the Government of India. 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: Which are the concerns 
please? 

SHRI S. MAHANTY: I know of a shipping  
concern. 

SHRI KISHEN CHAND: Tatas have 
received loans free of interest. 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: Tatas have received a 
certain amount, but that is taken from their 
own profit and kept in a separate fund by the 
Government and that amount is advanced to 
them. It is not that any amount is given to the 
Tatas from the Government funds. Whatever 
accrues to the Tatas and from the Iron and 
Steel Company, the Government takes a 
certain portion of their profits and puts them in 
a separate fund to be advanced again to these 
Iron and Steel companies for their expansion 
work. As for the shipping companies, I think 
they do not get any lean free of interest. 

MR. DEPUTY CHAIRMAN: The hon. 
Minister may reply later on. 

SHRI S. MAHANTY: At any rate, so far as 
Tatas are concerned, it is an indirect loan, if it 
can be said that way. My point is if we can 
extend that much of concession to industrial 
concerns like the Tatas why not to refugees also 
on whose skeletons you have been enthroned. It 
is only they 

who have paid for freedom, not you. 
Therefore it is in the fitness of things that 
these should be interest-free loans. 

Now, coming to the Administration, I 
would not add to what has been said. But I 
was very much pained to hear what the hon. 
Mr. Parikh said. He says: 'The personnel of 
the Administration belong to the permanent 
staff, the permanent cadre of the Government. 
They are coming to do a great humanitarian 
work, namely, to administer seven crores of 
rupees for the benefit of the refugees. 
Therefore if a particular man was getting Rs. 
500 he should be paid Rs. 3,000.' Now, Sir, I 
am not going to name anybody. There is a 
gentleman. He wants his extension in the 
Administration. What does he do? There is 
another gentleman in the Finance Ministry. 
He therefore gets the latter's near cousin—
maybe a first cousin—and gives him a lift 
from Rs. 350 to Rs. 850—great humanitarian 
work indeed! I would not have taken part in 
this debate if such shameless excuses had not 
been adduced. 

Looking at the record of the Administration, 
8,891 applications have been disposed of out 
of 65,000 and odd applications received and 
out of which 44,000 applications were 
rejected. But rejection of applications is done 
prima facie without much enquiry. Probably 
the applicants did not conform to certain 
technicalities which were imposed. Therefore 
they were rejected prima facie. For these 
8,891 applications—whatever the number may 
be—that have been sanctioned, probably the 
Administration did put in some effort to 
satisfy themselves whether those loans, if 
sanctioned, could be realised or not. If it is the 
contention of the Administration, that they 
took this inordinately long time in the disposal 
of the applications because they wanted to 
satisfy themselves whether these loans could 
be made according to the conditions imposed, 
in that case will the hon. Minister please let 
this House know in how many cases the 
guarantors are not to be found now ? And if 
the guarantors could not be found and if the 
loans are going to be written off for 
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[Shri S. Mahanty.] which a provision of 
Rs. 30 lakhs is being made, how can you say 
consistent with what you have said earlier 
that the Administration took all possible 
steps in satisfying themselves that these 
loans would be realised? 

Now, though the Bill has got a very j 
laudable object, still it is inadequate, pitiably 
inadequate. It has never satisfied the refugees 
nor has it silenced the critics. All that it has 
done is that it has given a few extensions of 
tenure to certain superannuated gentlemen of 
the Government of India Secretariat. So with 
that record let us not show all our humanitarian 
pretentions for the refugees. 

Now, as has been pointed out earlier by 
many speakers, this Department should now 
be made a regular Government Department. 
We are now told that this is going to 
continue for another period of 20 years. 
From what I have seen of such autonomous 
bodies functioning in our country, I must say 
that if we want real efficiency and integrity, 
we should extricate this Administration from 
the present set-up and should place it at the 
disposal of the Rehabilitation Ministry. In 
that case, probably we might do away with 
many Class I officers without whom, I think, 
the Administration can run very smoothly 
and very efficiently. 

The next point that I want to make is that 
it is really very heartening to hear that very 
competent auditors were seized with the 
accounts of this Administration, tout now 
that there has been an occasion, to make the 
Government fee], that henceforth the 
Auditor-General and Comptroller of India 
should be entrusted with the auditing, I most 
humbly submit that the previous accounts 
also must be audited by the Auditor-General 
and Comptroller of India. That does not 
mean that I cast any aspersion on the 
auditors who have audited its previous 
accounts but my perusal of the Public 
Accounts Committee Reports on the various 
Governments Departments make me feel that 
public    criticism    can    only    be 

silenced when it sees before it a full report 
from the Auditor-General and Comptroller of 
India on its previous accounts. So, while 
giving my critical support to this Bill, I would 
once again urge that the hon. Minister should 
admit that the "humanistic touch" is entirely 
absent. By no stretch of imagination can 
people who had lost ,500 crores of rupees 
jworth of property be rehabilitated with 12 
crores of rupees. A sufficient slice will go in 
the form of salary and allowances of the 
personnel of the Administration and a large 
amount of money would also go in what is 
generally known as 'tips' to the men who are 
concerned in the Department. The amount 
should therefore be enhanced adequately. 
With these words, Sir, I conclude. 

[THE   VICE-CHAIRMAN     (SHRI    B.    C. 
GHOSE) in the Chair.] 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: Sir, I think the debate in 
this House has more or less been a sort of 
repetition of the debate in the other House. 
Criticisms about this Administration have 
been more or less the same, and there have 
been some good words also about the working 
of the Administration. I shall try to meet the 
points raised by tha various  Members. 

I think in one point the debate here is 
somewhat different from the debate in the 
other House, in that the scope of the 
discussion in this House has been somewhat 
wider than what it was in the other House. 
Members often referred to the partition, the 
consequences of partition and the responsi-
bility of the partition. One Member said that 
the Congress Government has partitioned this 
country. I may remind him that when the 
partition was effected there was no Congress 
Government. I take his corrected view that it 
is the Congress which partitioned the country. 
Though it is outside the scope of discussion. I 
hope you will allow me to give some reply on 
this point. 

I have, I think, some knowledge, and I may 
claim that I was in a way personally and 
intimately connected with the  politics   of  
those  days   when   the 



 

partition of the country was  effected 
Myself and some other friends of Ben 
gal   had   occasion   to   tour   many   dis-   i 
tricts   of   Bengal   and   we   had   found   J 
that some political parties, mostly re 
presented on the other side, their pre 
cursors  and    political    leaders,    were 
working up popular passion for parti 
tioning the country. We were denounc-   , 
ed at every public meeting and private   ' 
discussion and were described as trai 
tors, as we were opposed to partition. 
It was not at all true that the Cong 
ress caused partition.    As the leading 
political party. Congress    had to take 
the responsibility of the reality. Parti 
tion was forced upon the Congress by 
other  political    groups     and    parties, 
camouflaging under    different    names, 
and  activated .by    different    purposes 
and motives ...........  

SHRI P. SUNDARAYYA: Please name 
those parties. 

SHRI A C. GUHA: Your party was one. 
Then, Sir, I shall refer to another point 
which Shri Kapoor has mentioned. Artist 
that he is, what he mentioned was just in 
keeping with his own personality as an artist. 
He mentioned that this organisation and 
others dealing with refugees should 
approach this problem with a human and 
sympathetic outlook, and not from any 
political purpose. He also mentioned the lack 
of proper human appreciation, human 
sympathies, human touch, in our dealings 
with the refugees. In another capacity, as a 
private individual, as a social and political 
worker, as a Congress worker, I had 
occasion to move among the refugees and 
know about the refugees much more than 
perhaps most of the Members of this House. 
I know also how the miseries of these 
refugees were being exploited for purposes 
which I should consider to be debasing and 
undignified for any political worker. 

Sir, I should also like to refer here to the 
pathetic appeal made by Shri Kapoor for 
human approach and a human outlook, and 
human sympathies. I should like to take him 
to a period some ten years back when as a 
part of the war effort of the alien Govern- 

ment they produced famine in a part of our 
country which their own journal and their 
own organ, called 'man-made famine'. 
Similarly, it was a part of their war effort to 
undermine the morale of the country, to 
undermine the moral and human sense of the 
nation and many political parties were fully 
cooperating with this alien Government. Sir. I 
admit with shame that we as a nation, we as a 
whole have not the same moral sense, the 
same sense of human values which we are 
proud of having inherited from our past 
history and tradition and we have lost that. 
And, if this Administration is lacking in this, 
it reflects that we are lacking in our national 
character. I do not claim perfection for the 
Administration, or any corporate body or 
institution. These institutions can only reflect 
the character of ourselves as individuals. 
These organisations can be as good or as bad 
as we as individuals are good or bad and 
nothing more can be expected from these 
institutions or administrations. 

Then, about the officers; much has been 
said about them; and I do not want to make 
any plea of defence a.bout them individually. 
I can only say that most of them have been 
refugees; not only here but in other places 
also; in the Rehabilitation Ministry, most of 
the officers have been taken from the 
refugees. I admit that I have not got that 
amount of human sympathy that one refugee 
should have shown to another refugee. If 
something might have happened in this 
Administration, I do not like to gloss over the 
defects of this Administration. (Interruption.) 

As regards the working of the Ad-
ministration itself, Shri Mazumdar had 
quoted certain figures. I do not know where 
he had got those figures from. Out of Rs. 5 
crores given to the refugees, Rs. 1 crore, or 
20 per cent., according to his calculation, is 
the Administration  expenses. 

SHRI S. N. MAZUMDAR: I said that that 
was the complaint I received. 
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That is what you can call the administrative 
expenses of the entire organi-. sation. 
Members might have some misapprehension 
about the figure quoted sometime back in the 
other House; that was Rs. 90 lakhs, out of 
which near about Rs. 21 lakhs are provision 
for bad and doubtful debts. That can. by no 
stretch of imagination, be called 
administrative expenses. Similarly, such 
expenses like house-rent, stationery, postal 
charges etc., also should not ,come under 
administrative expenses as such. I am 
particularly pointing out this as some 
Member was complaining about this not only 
now but on previous occasions also. So the 
actual administrative expenses in the form of 
pay and allowances to the officers are only 
Rs. 64-26 lakhs and the amount disbursed is 
Rs. 7-02 crores. Calculated on this basis I 
think Shri Mazum-dar ought to be satisfied 
that it is well within his standard that the 
administrative expenses should not be more 
than 10 per cent. I think the figure would 
come to only about 9 Per cent.. or a little 
over that. 

Then, Sir, he has also said that out of 635 
officers 151 are class IV officers. I do not 
know what point is sought to be made out of 
these figures. I can give here. Sir, the break-
up of the administrative set up. Officers 
drawing a salary of over Rs. 600 are 21; 
officers drawing a salary of over Rs. 200 are 
148; 304 are clerks and 141 class IV 
officers. This Administration has to do a lot 
of outdoor work. I think much of its work is 
outdoor and office work is not the primary 
part of this organisation. So comparatively 
speaking there may be less class IV staff. 
Therefore, Sir, I do not know what point is 
sought to be made out by quoting these 
figures. 

Then, Sir, something was said about the rate 
of interest. I think I can only repeat here what  
have said in the other House, that the 
Government will examine the position and if 
possible it will reduce the rate of interest. 
When this Bill was originally passed in 1948, 
the market conditions were more favourable 
for a reduced rate of interest than they are at 
present. The bank rate then was 3 per cent. 
Now the bank rate is 34 per cent, and I think 
that even an established businessman cannot 
now get any loan from any bank at less than 7 
per cent, or even higher. So compared to the 
year 1948 the present market position is not in 
any way favourable for a reduction in the rate 
of interest. Anyhow, I mention this thing only 
to show that Parliament passed this Act in 
1948 fixing the rate of interest to be not 
exceeding 6 per cent, and it has been going on 
in that way so long. Now we shall try to see if 
we can reduce the rate of interest in  any way. 

Then there was something said about the 
recovery of Administration dues as arrears in 
land revenue. I think the Administration has in 
most cases waived the realisation of arrears. 
This method has been taken recourse to only 
when there has been a reasonable doubt about 
the bona fides of the refugee to pay the interest 
or the instalment. Anyhow, whenever any case 
of hardship has been reported to the Ad-
ministration, it has taken steps to relieve the 
distress, and in future also I think the 
Administration wij.1 take note of the 
sentiments expressed on the floor of the 
Council and of the other House and will see if 
any redress can be given in that respect. But I 
should also like to tell the hon. Members that 
the function of this Administration should be 
kept in mind when a certain suggestion is 
made. It is not that this Administration is to 
give any grants or relief. It gives loan with the 
expectation that the loan would be realised. 
The risk is also calculated that perhaps 50 per 
cent, or even more of the loan would not be 
realised. When the Administration is set up 
with this mental appreciation that about 50 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: If the hon. Member 
had read my speech of yesterday he would 
have got a better figure: 



 

per cent, of the loan might not be realised, I 
think the Members should be satisfied to see 
that the Administration or the Government 
would not be too harsh in realising its dues. 
In every case sympathetic ^treatment will be 
accorded and is being accorded. 

Then, Sir, you yourself mentioned 
something about giving over the whole thing 
to banks. I. think you also must have some 
experience of banks in Bengal and I do not 
know how far it would be possible to give the 
whole thing to the banks. Sir, here the 
provision has .been made that Rs. 2 crores 
would be left with the Administration and the 
chances may be given to some scheduled 
banks to advance loans to refugees already 
settled but °n the guarantee of the 
Government. So far the provision was that the 
Administration would guarantee only 50 per 
cent, of the loss. Now by this amending Bill 
we are extending the guarantee up to 100 per 
cent. So long no bank has taken any 
advantage of this offer. That in a way goes to 
show that the banks are not very anxious to 
help the refugees arid take any risk. Now with 
100 per cent, guarantee from the 
Administration some banks may come 
forward. But here I may mention that we shall 
be very careful about giving this facility to 
any bank. We can give the loan to some 
refugees and lose 100 per cent., but then we 
should be sure that the refugee is a suitable 
person and the loan is not going to be 
misused. But we cannot be so sure when we 
allow a bank to give loan to any refugee at the 
guarantee of 100 per cent, loss by the 
Government or the Administration. The bank 
may not select always the right sort of persons 
or the really deserving persons to be given 
these loans on the guarantee of the 
Administration. That aspect we shall always 
bear in mind and we shall see that these two 
crores of rupees are not misused. If we cannot 
find any scheduled bank working properly to 
utilise these two crores of rupees, then the 
Administration will have the authority to 
disburse this amount by itself to suitable 
refugees. If 100 per cent, loss is to be 
incurred, it is better that we take the risk   and 

incur the loss than allow some other parties to 
advance loans which may not always be to 
deserving persons. 

Then, Sir, you also mentioned something 
about the character and purpose of this 
Administration. Sir, I think yesterday I read 
out the objects and purposes of the original 
Bill that was passed by Parliament in 1948. 
Other Members also have mentioned some-
thing which has made me to think that there 
is still some amount of confusion in the 
minds of the hon. Members about the real 
purpose of this Administration. Some other 
Members have mentioned that out of one 
crore of refugees only 65,000 or" 67,000 re-
fugees have given their applications. But here 
I should state that this Administration is to 
cater only to refugees settled in industrial and 
commercial lines and not to rural and 
agricultural refugees. Thus we keep out a 
large block of refugees, because most of the 
refugees are rural, agricultural refugees. We 
leave them from the purview of this 
Administration. If you take the total number 
of non-agriculturist refugees and compare 
that figure with the number of applications, 
you will find that the number of applications 
is not poor. 

SHRI M. S. RANAWAT (Rajasthan): Can 
we get an idea of the number of agriculturist 
and non-agriculturist refugees? 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: I would not venture 
into any wrong figure, but I think the 
proposition of agriculturist refugees would be 
about 60 per cent, or may be more. 

Mr. Kishen Chand also mentioned that out 
of the Rs. 160 crores spent by the 
Rehabilitation Department, nearly Rs. 60 
crores might have been spent as 
administrative expenses. I think this figure is 
not only exaggerated but highly exaggerated. 

SHRI C. G. K. REDDY: Very highly 
exaggerated! 

SHRI P. SUNDARAYYA: What is your 
own figure? Rs. 30 crores? 
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SHRI A. C. GUHA: I do not deal with that; 
therefore I cannot give the exact figure. I do 
not like to quote any wrong figure but I can 
say this much that it is much below Rs. 60 
crores. If the hon. Member wants to get the 
correct figure, I will get the figure from the 
relevant authorities and give it to him. 

I think two Members including yourself, Sir, 
suggested or hinted that this Administration 
might be placed with the Rehabilitation 
Ministry, This has nothing to do with the 
Rehabilitation Ministry. Otherwise, I would 
not have come forward to move this Bill here. 
This Administration is functioning under the 
Finance Ministry, and as such, it has nothing to 
do with the Rehabilitation Ministry. The loan 
or aid .given by this Administration is not the 
only aid given to them for rehabilitation 
purposes. They get the usual and normal aid or 
loan or grant, whatever one may call them, 
from the Rehabilitation Ministry either as 
agriculturist refugees or as non-agriculturist 
refugees according to the scale fixed for each 
category of refugees. In addition to the aid 
they get from the Rehabilitation Ministry, this 
is a further aid given by this Administration to 
put the refugees in some industry or business. I 
would like to make it clear to hon. Members 
that they should not think that those who get 
aid from this Administration are not entitled to 
get other aids from the Rehabilitation Ministry. 
In addition to those aids, this is another 
machinery through which the Government has 
been advancing money for rehabilitating 
refugees in industry and commerce. Something 
has been mentioned here also about compensa-
tion. I think I should not touch that point 
because that has nothing to do with this Bill. 
Another grievance is about delay and that, I 
think, is more ' or less a thing of the past. As 
has been mentioned by Shri Parikh, in the last 
one year or eighteen months the disposal of 
applications has been rather rapid and the work 
is being done much more expeditiously than it 
was done 

2 or 3 years before. I think    I    have covered 
almost  all  the  points. 

SHRI P. C. BHANJ DEO: Is the Administration 
paying its way? i 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: Thank you. Shri Bhanj 
Deo has called this Administration as some 
unholy mixture—that it is a cross between 
Shylock and charity. That is a fine phrase. I 
don't know what he exactly means, but I think 
1 can quote two of his passages: "Unless it is 
going to be a paying concern, what is the use 
of the Indian Government keeping this white 
elephant?" This only shows that he has not 
really tried to understand the purpose of this 
Administration. This Administration is never 
•meant to be a paying concern. It is not a 
profit-making institution of the Government. 
It is an. institution meant for the purpose of 
helping the refugees and set up with some 
calculated risk or loss of about fifty per cent, 
of the-money advanced to the refugees. In the 
next sentence he urges the abolition of 
guarantor, the lowering of the rate of interest 
or giving the loan absolutely free of any 
interest. I cannot understand how his previous 
sentiments can be reconciled with this If this 
Administration is a cross between Shylock 
and charity. I don't know how I shall style his 
ideas about this Administration. 

SHRI P. C. BHANJ DEO: That is why I 
advised you to abolish it altogether. 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: One moment he wants 
this Administration to be a paying concern 
and the next moment he-suggests that there 
should be no guarantor, no interest, etc. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI B. C. 
GHOSE) :   He wants it to be abolished. 

SHRI P. C. BHANJ DEO: That was a point 
of information I wanted. As far as the 
Administration is concerned, I would like to 
root it out altogether. 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: You yourself suggested 
and some other Members SIBO 



 

mentioned whether any new applicat ions  are 
still to be invited. I think the Administration 
has recently passed a resolution that 
applications might be reopened for East 
Bengal displaced persons because after the 
period covered by the loan applications so 
lone accepted by the Administration, there 
have .been a large number of refugees 
coming from East Bengal. So it may be 
necessary to reopen applications for them. 
Some other Members have made some 
comparison between the rehabilitation work 
for the West Pakistan refugees and the 
rehabilitation work for the East Pakistan 
refugees. Yes. these are two categories. The 
refugees and the rehabilitation work, in these 
categories I can say, differ not only in degree 
but in quality. The problem is somewhat 
qualitatively different because on the western 
side the number of refugees that we have 
received . would be almost equal to the 
number of persons that have left India for 
West Pakistan. The outgoing and the 
incoming displaced persons on the western 
side were almost equal and so there was 
almost an equal amount of vacuum to receive 
the refugees who had come from the western 
side. But •on the eastern side there has been 
practically no vacuum. We have received 
about 35 lakhs and not more than some 4 to 5 
lakhs have migrated from West Bengal and 
Assam to East Bengal. That is the main 
reason why the problem is qualitatively of a 
different nature on the eastern side. Of 
course, there are other reasons also. And be-
sides all this, the exodus continued for a 
longer time and I may say even now there 
may .be a slow, but steady stream of refugees 
coming, and so it may be necessary on the 
Bengal side to reopen the applications. 

Sir. I think I have met practically ail the 
points in my humble way, though I do not 
know whether I have been able to satisfy all 
the Members. I request the House to accept 
my motion. 

LT.-COL. J. S. MANN: Is the hon. 
Minister going to adjust the rural and inrban 
loans on the same lines or not? 

Will he make one rule    or    different rules? 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: This Administration 
caters only for refugees who are to be settled 
in industrial and commercial lines and not 
those to be settled in agriculture. Rural 
refugees, in a general way, do not come under 
the purview of this Administration. The hon. 
Member probably is referring to the 
compensation scheme on which I am afraid I 
am not competent  to say anything. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI B. C. 
GHOSE):  The question is: 

"That the Bill further to amend the 
Rehabilitation Finance Administration 
Act. 1948, as passed by the House of the 
People, be taken into consideration." 

The motion    was adopted. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI B. C. 
GHOSE): We shall now take up the clause by 
clause consideration of the Bill. There are no 
amendments received. I may say here that Mr. 
S. N. Mazumdar sent in certain amendments 
to clause 4 which, were received today at 12-

45 P.M. although the Bill itself had been circu-
lated as early as the 19th of November 1953. 
Therefore, these amendments were not 
received in time and they are not accepted. I 
do not know whether Mr. Mazumdar would 
like to speak on this clause or not. Otherwise I 
shall put all the clauses of the Bill together. 
Do you want to speak on clause 4? 

SHRI S. N. MAZUMDAR: No, the general 
remarks that I wanted to make I have already 
made. 

Clauses 2 to 6 were added to the Bill. 

Clause 1, the Title and the Enacting 
Formula were added to the Bill. 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: Sir, I move: 

"That the Bill be passed." 

SHRI S. N. MAZUMDAR: Sir, I am sorry 
my amendments were not accepted for being 
moved. However. I stand 
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[Shri S. N. Mazumdar.] up at this stage to 
express in categorical terms my feeling that 
I have not been satisfied with the assurances 
that the hon. Deputy Minister for Finance 
who is piloting this Bill has given about 
sympathetic consideration of all the 
grievances. Apart from what we know of the 
past professions and performances of this 
Government, I would like to state that the 
attitude of my hon. friend has not been very 
helpful. In my speech I made certain 
positive criticisms and offered certain posi-
tive  suggestions. 

1 did not go into irrelevant things but my 
hon. friend tried to avoid the whole issue by 
bringing in not only irrelevant things but 
certain things which I think should not have 
been brought here because my hon. friend, I 
am afraid, forgot that he is not here at all to 
deliver a sermon on national character or on 
past history but to give replies to these 
positive suggestions. 

As regards the assurance which he has 
given, I like to say this much that my 
suggestion was that there should be a 
specific provision as regards the mode of 
recovery. As in the case of recovery of 
arrears of land revenue, the household 
goods of the loanees should not be included 
but only the commercial and .business 
assets should be attached. I do not know 
what stands in the way of not accepting that 
suggestion of mine. Secondly, as regards the 
rate of interest, my hon. friend has said that 
the Administration will now try to reduce 
the rate of interest. My suggestion was that 
a definite limit should be placed on the rate 
of interest. To that end, therefore, I tried to 
suggest a new amendment—which has not 
been accepted—that the rate of interest 
should  not   exceed   2§   per  cent. 

There are certain other suggestions of 
mine to which no reply has been given by 
the hon. Minister; for example, there was a 
suggestion that interest should not be 
realised for a certain period, say four years 
or five years after the full amount of the 
loan had 

been  obtained  by  the loanee.  I  want to 
know what his opinion is about that. 

The next suggestion was that arrangements 
should be made so that the refugee obtains at 
least 2/3rds of the loan in the first 
instalment. There have been delays and loans 
are given to them in instalments, driblets I 
shall say, between which a long period of 
time intervenes. I want to know whether he 
is prepared to accept that suggestion of 
mine. 

Lastly, Sir, the first point which I had 
raised in my speech was about the' 
autonomous character of this Administration. 
There, I stand corrected that this 
Administration is not under the. 
Rehabilitation Ministry but under the 
Ministry of Finance; that is not the important 
question. The important question I raised was 
that the Administration being autonomous, 
the Ministry only lays down general 
principles and' has no actual control over its 
working. in the actual carrying out of that 
policy, and Parliament has no control over the 
working of that Administration. Those points 
of mine have also not been replied to. 
However, in spite of its limitations, as this 
amendment really will provide some amount 
of benefit to the refugees, I am supporting it. 

I forgot one point. I also suggested* that 
the period of repayment of the-loan should 
be twenty years instead of fifteen. To this 
point also, the hon.. Minister has not replied. 

However, even though   my   amendment  
and  suggestions  have  not  been accepted,  I   
am   not   going   to   oppose-the Bill but I am 
going to support it because   it   offers   some   
relief   to   the refugees though  the rejection  of    
the1 suggestions really shows the policy of j   
the Government. It is not a    question 1   of 
finance; it is a question of rehabilitation.   That   
point   and   that   tone   I |   have  found  
missing  in   the  whole   of the speeches  of the 
hon.  Minister. 

SHRI RAMA   RAO    (Andhra):    Mr-f 
Vice-Chairman. I should like to make- 
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one  general  observation  at  the  third 
reading  stage  of  this  Bill. 

While congratulating the Deputy Minister 
on the lucid exposition he has made of the 
Bill's background and foreground, I should 
like the House to be warned against the 
temptation to think that we have reached the 
end of the road. The Rehabilitation Ministry, 
in the conditions of today and in the 
darkening perspective of tomorrow, must be a 
permanent feature of our National 
Government. It is on this basis that we should 
proceed with regard to the administration of 
this Bill. It is no use discussing the rate of in-
terest, the date on which interest should 
accrue, the manner in which the loans should 
be given, so on and so forth. 

It appears to me that there is something 
more than a mere formal contradiction 
between rehabilitation and the giving of 
grants. Is it an act of generosity? No. Is it an 
act of business? It very much looks like that. 
To whom are we giving these grants? It is to 
men who immolated themselves at the altar of 
national freedom. No business considerations 
should therefore be brought to a question of 
this character. I regret that, even as amended, 
the provisions of this Bill are not as 
satisfactory as they ought to be. Neither do I 
know what value these concessions will have 
in view of the increasing unemployment, and 
in view of the falling purchasing power. I 
should like the Government to consider these 
things in their further work of rehabilitation. 

We have been building our hopes on 
getting something out of evacuee property 
realisations, but actually today more Muslims 
are going out of India to Pakistan, perhaps 
under very foolish illusions. These have to be 
provided for there. The Government of Pak-
istan will therefore be less and less interested 
and will see to it that the new Muslim 
refugees who have come to India will get 
nothing out of the property they have left 
behind. Similarly, in view of what is now 
happening in Pakistan, the sort of Constitu- 

tion that is being made there and the manner 
in which the minorities are being reduced to 
second class citizenship, it is likely that 
there will ,be more immigrants into India 
and the refugee problem will take on a 
severe aspect, a serious aspect, maybe a 
disastrous aspect. The Rehabilitation Min-
istry will have to make plans for the future 
from now, so that if may not be caught 
unawares. 

We have done a magnificent job with 
regard to rehabilitation. Once I happened to 
travel in a plane with an American who said 
he had received doctorates from ten 
international universities. The refugee 
problem in Israel was very serious then. 
After referring to it he was full of praise for 
the great work that had been done in this 
country to relieve distressed refugees. We 
can feel proud that we have indeed done 
very well. But let us warn ourselves that the 
future is not going to be less serious than it 
has been. The time will not come soon for 
the winding up of the rehabilitation 
machinery. Let us gain by experience. Let us 
treat the unfortunate men and women that 
may be coming hereafter in larger numbers. 
Let us treat them more generously than we 
have done so that it may be said of us that 
having gained freedom for ourselves we 
have not forgotten them. That is a supreme 
political as well as a paramount national res-
ponsibility. 

SHRI S. BANERJEE (West Bengal): Mr. 
Vice-Chairman, Sir. I thought I would not 
intervene at this fag end of the debate but the 
speech which my esteemed colleague Shri 
Arun Chandra Guha who has been exalted 
now to the position of a Deputy Minister but 
with whom I had the privilege of working in 
the Congress for a long time delivered just 
now has provoked me to stand and speak a 
few words. In his speech delivered yesterday, 
if I remember aright, he began by saying that 
the refugees were the creation of partition and 
may I ask him who was the creator of that 
partition? He said just now that partition was 
there .but I   nobody knows how it came 
about. 



 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: I have not said 
.anything like that. 

SHRI S. BANERJEE: That was the 
implication. 

SHRI H. P. SAKSENA: You know the  
creator of partition. It was the Bengal :and the 
Punjab. 

SHRI P. SUNDARAYYA: And not the 
British Imperialism? 

SHRI S. BANERJEE: I would only ask him 
to remember that partition has been due to a 
compulsion of events, if I may quote a phrase 
so often used 'toy the Prime Minister—and 
those events were the creation of the Cong-
rress High Command in those days. 

SHRI  RAMA RAO:  No. no. 

SHRI S. BANERJEE: If anybody had .any 
doubt, I would ask him, and particularly the 
Deputy Minister for Finance, to look UD that 
book 'Mission With Mountbatten' and to look 
up also the pages of another book written by 
Shri Nirmal Kumar Bose "Days With 
Gandhiji". There you will find who was the 
creator of this partition as a result of which the 
refugees came into existence and the 
Rehabilitation Finance Administration came 
into being. He said that this Bill only deals 
with the refugees not of the rural areas  tout 
those of the urban areas who have taken to 
industry and commerce. He could not give us 
accurate figures. I would remind him and ask 
him whether he knows that the refugees who 
helped themselves in and around Cal-•cutta to 
build up huts of their own have not got a 
single pie out of this Rehabilitation Finance 
Administration even when they took to 
business and •commerce. Why? Because 
according to Government they have been 
unauthorised occupants of land. What could 
they have done? They came from East 
Pakistan. They came on the assurances which 
the Congress High Command :gave at the time 
of partition. On those assurances they came 
and they were driven from pillar to post and 
from post to pillar.    They had    nc    other 

way than to occupy those lands and build huts 
for themselves. I would ask him, "Why not 
extend the benefits of this Rehabilitation 
Finance Administration to those people who 
have taken to commerce and industry." 

PROF. G. RANGA (Andhra): What is the 
latest position? Are they being advanced any 
credit or not? 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI B. C. 
GHOSE): Let him finish. The Minister will 
answer later. 

SHRI S. BANERJEE: The Rehabilitation 
Department and this Rehabilitation Finance 
Administration do not give one pie to those 
people. They are helping themselves. And 
what, do the Government do? They send the 
police sometimes; they sometimes send the 
military also. I know the Minister will say that 
that is not his concern. I am concerned with 
the Rehabilitation Finance Administration. I 
would ask him to see his way to extend the 
benefits of this Rehabilitation Finance Admin-
istration    to those unfortunate people. Rs.   10    crores     have     been 6PM 

raised  to Rs.  14-5 crores.    I 
am reminded of a cartoon in Punch where it 
was said— a long, long time back—that "the 
more the British Empire expands, the more 
the Chamberlains will contract". Here, the 
more the Rehabilitation Administration fund 
expands, the more those officers who conduct 
this Administration will, perhaps, contract. I 
would ask him further that if he has found his 
way to extend the time limit of the repayment 
of the loan to fifteen years, why not be a little 
more generous and extend it to twenty year.3? 
If you really want to help the refugees, if you 
really do not want to oppress them in the 
matter of repayment of the loan given to them, 
give them easy instalments, give them such 
instalments in which they will be able to 
repay; do not oppress them. 

I will not take up the time of the House any 
longer. I confess that this Bill goes a little 
way towards the improvement of the 
refugees, and that it benefits an infinitesimal 
proportion of 
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the refugees who have taken to industry and 
commerce. Mr. Vice-Chairman, I  have  
done. 

SHRI KISHEN CHAND: The hon. the 
Deputy Minister, Finance has brought in 
extraneous matters by suggesting that the 
responsibility for partition did not belong to 
the Congress. 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: This matter has not 
been brought by me but by some other  
Member. 

SHRI KISHEN CHAND: If he had not 
brought this on record but had left it, 
it would have been another thing. In 
this connection, I will point out to him 
that in September 1946, a Government 
was installed in this country of which 
the hon. the Prime Minister was the 
leader. That Government consisted of 
at least six Congressmen and about four 
representatives of the Muslim League. 
That Government went on giving as 
surance to the people till the very last 
day that there would be no partition 
of India. If they had been wise enough 
and if they had told the people 
beforehand of the partition they would 
have taken enough precaution. There 
fore I say that the greater responsibili 
ty falls on the Congress Government 
and the Congress Party................  

SHRI C. G. K. REDDY: Why greater 
responsibility, all the responsibility, cent, 
per cent, responsibility. 

SHRI KISHEN CHAND: The Government 
should come forward with concrete 
proposals for the rehabilitation of these 
unfortunate people. I really want to draw 
your attention to the condition of the 
refugees from East Pakistan. These refugees 
have come mostly during the last three 
years, since certain new laws were imposed 
by the Pakistan Government. If you look 
into the composition of these refugees, you 
will find that majority of them consist of 
very small traders and petty shopkeepers 
who could not carry on their trade with 
honesty and dignity in Pakistan. And 
therefore the problem before the hon. 
Deputy Finance Minister is all the greater 
because he has got these    35 lakhs    of 
refugees 
98 C.S.D. 

who have come from East    Pakistan. 
The influx of population has not stop 
ped  even,  now;  even  now  there  is  a 
small   trickle.  Although  it  is  a  small 
trickle,  really speaking    it    may    be 
about 20,000 people who are still com 
ing from East Pakistan every month, 
and you know, Sir, that Bengal is a 
very    over-populated    State    in    our 
country. The density of population in 
Bengal is something like 1,100 persons 
per square mile.   If in such an   over- 
populated place, the refugees come in, 
the problem .becomes  more and  more 
serious, and therefore a much greater 
amount   has  to   be   provided   by   the 
hon. the Deputy Finance Minister for 
the  rehabilitation  of    these    refugees 
from East Pakistan. An hon. Member 
has pointed out that the amount    has 
been increased from Rs. 7 crores    to 
Rs. 14 crores. No, Sir, the amount has 
not been increased. It has been simply 
transferred from the amount which was 
going to be advanced by the scheduled 
banks  and  other  agencies.    All    that 
amount  has   been  brought  under  the 
Administration.    As Rs. 7 crores have 
already been disbursed, it leaves only 
a balance of Rs. 5 crores available for 
the rehabilitation of these 35 lakh re 
fugees from East Pakistan. I will there 
fore again submit    that the    amount 
should be increased. On a previous oc 
casion  I had asked the hon. the Fin 
ance  Minister  to   explain    how   these 
heavy administrative charges were go 
ing to be met. I had pointed out, Sir, 
that the difference between the interest 
payable to Government and the inter 
est charged from the refugees was only 
2 per cent. And if 50 per cent, of the 
capital  had to  be written    off,    that 
meant that the interest recovered from 
the  refugees  would  not suffice  to pay 
the  interest   charged   by   Government. 
I had asked the hon. Finance Minister 
that    if    the    administrative expenses 
which amounted to Rs. 18 lakhs had to 
be met out of the capital .....................  

SHRI A. C. GUHA: He is again misquoting. 
Tf is not Rs. 18 lakhs annually at all. During 
the last five years the administrative costs 
have been only Rs.  64 lakhs. 
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SHRI KISHEN CHAND: I stand subject to 
correction. Mr. Parikh and the hon. Finance 
Minister had said that last year the expense 
was Rs. 18 lakhs. I simply took that figure of 
Rs. 18 lakhs given by them. (Interruption.) 
My submission is that the figure of Rs. 18 
lakhs has been given in this House and it has 
not been controverted by anybody so far. And 
therefore on the basis of Rs. 18 lakhs I 
submit, Sir, that we will have to spend more 
out of the capital fund and in 20 years we will 
have spent the entire capital. I would 
therefore ask the hon. the Deputy Finance 
Minister to keep this point in view and give a 
suitable reply to it. Sir, I would reauest the 
hon. Minister that the amount be increased 
and greater facilities be given for the re-
habilitation of refugees from East Pakistan. 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: Sir, I think I should 
first take up the points mentioned by my old 
friend, Mr. Satyapriya Banerjee, He should 
have been more sure about the points 
mentioned by him. He mentioned that those 
refugees whom we call squatters' in Calcutta 
are not allowed any accommodation by this 
Administration. I think he should  verify  this  
statement. 

SHRI S. BANERJEE: I was told by these 
so-called sauatters that they do not receive 
any help from any Government  quarter. 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: This Administration 
makes no distinction between a refugee 
settled by the Government and a refugee 
settled .by himself. 

SHRI S. BANERJEE: I am glad that it is so. 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: That is the position so 
far as this Administration goes. 

SHRI P. SUNDARAYYA: We want to 
know the exact position. I was told in 
Calcutta when I was there that this 
Administration dees not give loans to those 
people whom the Government calls 
unauthorised occupiers of land. 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: That might apply to 
some other forms of loans but not to any loans 
from this Administration. He should make 
sure about the information he gets from these 
refugees. There are different forms of loans. 
There are different organisations for giving 
loans. There is a body called the "Refugee 
Business Rehabilitation Board", R.B.R.B. 
Then there are the ordinary Rehabilitation 
Ministry loans. There are so many 
machineries for giving loans to the refugees, 
but as far as this Administration goes, it does 
not make any distinction between a refugee 
settled by Government and a refugee  settled  
by  himself. 

SHRI P. SUNDARAYYA: Not settled by 
himself but the so-called unauthorised 
occupier of land. 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: If a refugee has a 
certificate and can show that he has been able 
to start any business or industry or had been 
in business in Pakistan, then he is entitled to 
get a loan from this Administration, of course 
under certain conditions. There is no .ban on 
any 'squatter' getting a loan from this 
Administration. 

Then Mr. Banerjee mentioned something 
about the responsibility for the partition. I do 
not think it will be fair for me to go into that. I 
am rather amused to learn that his forward 
march has been locked in the Mission with 
Mountbatten. He mentioned something about 
the book, "Mission with Mount-batten" 
written by the Private Secretary to Lord 
Mountbatten, giving the story of the part 
played by him. 

SHRI S. BANERJEE: Let him read also the 
other book by Nirmal Kumar Bose, Private 
Secretary of Gandhiji, "Days  with  
Gandhiji". 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: I had occasion to read 
that book but one may not have to arrive at 
some other conclusion  from  that  book. 

SHRI S. BANERJEE: Now that he has .been 
exalted into the position of a Minister. 



 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: No, never. I do not 
think I have changed my views on anything, 
not even about the refugees themselves. 

Mr.     Mazumdar     mentioned     some points 
about which he felt I had not replied. His main 
grouse is about autonomous bodies like this 
Administration. It   is  a  much  wider  issue.  
There  are quite a large number of    
autonomous bodies functioning  under the 
Government under special legislations passed 
by Parliament, to discharge some obligations 
and responsibilities of the Government.    
There   are  in   India   today more than 20 
such bodies. So, this is not the proper time to 
say something on  that.  I  can  only  say  that  
this  is the accepted policy of the Government 
and  endorsed  by  Parliament,    and  I have 
also reason to believe that it is supported by 
public opinion that some of  the  obligations  
and  duties  of  the Government   may   be   
discharged    toy autonomous  bodies.     As    
regards  the loans given in driblets, I think 
recently the Administration has made some 
improvement  on that  point also. The average 
amount of loan given by this Administration is 
Rs. 7,000. In individual cases it can go up to 
Rs. 50,000 and in case of    corporate    bodies   
the     loan amount  can  go  over  Rs.   50,000.   
But the  average  amount  given    may    be 
near about  Rs.  7,000. As  soon as the 
Administration is satisfied that the refugee has 
actually made all the necessary arrangements    
for    starting    the business,    immediately    
the    loan    is given,  not as before in long 
distance instalments. There has been some ap-
preciable  improvement  on  that  point in 
recent months. 

Then regarding recovery of loan, I have 
already mentioned this point that in cases of 
hardship reported to the Administration, I 
think I can give this assurance, that it will 
surely be sympathetically looked into and in 
regard to the period also. I know that in sever-
al cases recovery has been waived because of 
the distress that might have been caused to the 
refugee in case recovery was insisted upon. 

Shri Kishen Chand has again referred to the 
heavy administrative charges. I have already 
stated that the figure he  quoted is  not correct  
and only a few minutes  ago  I  quoted the 
figure which  is  about Rs.  64 lakhs     during 
these five years and even then one may 
contend  that  this   figure  is  not  comparable 
with the working expenses of a bank but I 
would then ask the hon. Member to realize the 
difficult nature of the work done by this 
Administration. In a Bank generally the 
number of applications is very limited and no-
body would apply to a bank for loan unless he 
is almost sure of getting a loan. The number of 
refusals in cases of applicants in a bank is very 
limited but as for the refugees, they are in such  
a  desperate  financial    condition that  almost    
everyone    would    think that he would be 
entitled to get a loan from this  Rehabilitation  
Finance  Administration    and   particularly    
when there was' a limited time fixed, when a  
target date fixed within which  the application 
is to be sent, almost every refugee made a rush 
to file an application and to see that he might 
not lose the off-chance of getting some loan 
from this Administration, So* the number of 
applications that have to be rejected  is 
inordinately high as compared to  those which 
have been  sanctioned loans toy the 
Administration. But even for  rejecting   the   
application,   it   has to go through all the 
formalities and enquiries.   So  every   rejected   
application has almost the same cost as the 
application   sanctioned.  If  we   simply 
consider the amount sanctioned in calculating 
the  administrative    expenses that would not 
be quite fair. The very nature of the work put 
on this Administration makes the 
administrative expenses  a bit higher    than    
in     other banks   or  Finance   Corporations. 

Shri Rama Rao has mentioned something 
about the refugees in general. I fully agree 
with him and I think the Government also has 
recognized the fact that this nation owes 
something to the refugees. It is a sort of 
vicarious sacrifice which they undertook and 
which has brought this independence;      
otherwise      ind?t>9ndenee 
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delayed for some time and I don't know what 
amount of human suffering would have been 
caused. Sir, I had occasion to live in Calcutta 
and in an area which had about 98 per cent. 
Muslims during the one year of Direct Action 
days. I know what amount of human 
suffering, human misery, what amount of 
sacrifice of human sense and values the 
nation had to undergo during those days. So I 
think the Government also recognizes that 
this nation owes something to the refugees. 
And it is in recognition of that that the 
Government have spent Rsi. 160 crores f on 
their rehabilitation and have started this Re-
habilitation Finance Administration. Again 
there is the scheme for giving compensation 
to the refugees. 

There is always a scope for something 
more and there is always the feeling that 
something more might have been done. But 
what should have been done has always to be 
limited by the financial position of the nation. 
It is according to our financial position that 
we have to provide money for the refugees. If 
it had been possible for th'e Government to 
provide more money for the refugees, I t»m 
sure everybody in the Government would 
have been only too glad to do that. And if in 
the future, the financial position enables the 
Government to do that, I can assure the House 
that this Government will certainly do it. This 
is borne out by the recent deci-•sion about 
giving compensation. Some may say that it is 
meagre compensation. Yes, I can admit that 
compared to what they have lost, individually 
and collectively, this sum is a meagre 
compensation. But I should like to remind the 
House that what we have achieved as regards 
rehabilitation, what we have done for the re-
fugees, compares favourably with the 
achievements of other countries. Recently I 
had occasion to meet a young German who 
himself is a refugee from Eastern Prussia, 
now a part of Soviet Union. He took care to 
go round some of the refugee townships and 
refugee colonies and  he himself told me  that 

compared to the conditions of the refugees in 
Germany, the position here was much better. 

SHRI S. N. MAZUMDAR: May I know 
whether it is the policy of the Government of 
India to consider East Germany as part of the 
Soviet Union? 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: If my hon. friend will 
only hear me. I have not sa^ East Germany; 
but I said Eastern Prussia, now part of the 
Soviet Union. 

SHRI S. N. MAZUMDAR: It is not part of 
U.S. S. R. 

SHRI A. C. GUHA: Yes, it is a part of 
U.S.S.R. I can only say that compared to the 
position of refugees in other countries, the 
position of the refugees here is much better. I 
do not like to be complacent. I do not like to 
say that we are content at what we have 
achieved. I am ready to admit that we should 
have done more. We might have done more, 
provided funds had enabled us to do that. 

Sir, I have nothing more to say. I think I 
have dealt with almost all the points that were 
raised and I request the House to pass the 
Bill. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI B. C. 
GHOSE) :   The question is: 

"That the Bill be passed." The  

motion  was   adopted. 

ALLOTMENT OF TIME FOR CONSI-
DERATION  OF THE SEA CUSTOMS 

(AMENDMENT) BILL, 1953. 

THE VICE-CHAIRMAN (SHRI B. C. 
GHOSE) : The next item that we have to take 
up is the Sea Customs (Amendment) Bill,  
1953. 

SHRI C. G. K. REDDY (Mysore): Sir, the 
Minister is tired and only five more minutes 
are left. 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER FOR FINANCE 
(SHRI A. C. GUHA): Is it much use taking it up 
now? 


