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be pleased to state the number of District 
Postal Superintendents appointed in the 
Madras Circle in 1952? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER FOR COM-
MUNICATIONS (SHRI RAJ BAHADUR J: 
Eight Postal Superintendents were appointed. 

SHRI T. V. KAMALASWAMY: How 
many of these Postal Superintendents are 
Graduates and how many are i.on-Graduates? 

SHRI RAJ BAHADUR: They all fulfil the 
prescribed qualifications. I presume they are 
all Graduates. 

SHRI T. V. KAMALASWAMY: Are there 
any maximum age limit and minimum 
number of years' service required for these 
posts? 

SHRI RAJ BAHADUR: Postal 
Superintendents recruited directly through 
competitive examination have got to fulfil the 
conditions prescribed for the all-India 
services, namely. I.A.S. and other services in 
the same cadre and for those who are 
promoted by selection through Departmental 
Promotion Committees, there is a relaxed age 
limit which is 40 or 45—I am subject to 
correction—but that is much higher than the 
age limit prescribed for the competitive 
examination. 

..SHRI T.. V. KAMALASWAMY: How many 
of these were appointed by direct recruitment 
and how many bjr promotion? 

SHRI RAJ BAHADUR: One Mr K. 
Ramamurthy was recruited direct through the 
competitive examination for Indian Postal 
Service, Class I, and ■one Mr. Raja was 
recruited as a war service candidate—and in 
his case I am not quite sure about the educa-
tional qualification—and the rest were alt 
selected through Departmental Promotion 
Committees. 

SHRI T. V. KAMALASWAMY: Is it a fact 
that people who have not put in the requisite 
number of years' service have been prormttd 
as -Postal 

Superintendents in preference to those who 
have put in even more than the required 
number of years' service? 

SHRI RAJ BAHADUR: I should like to 
know the specific case. I have got before me 
the terms of service that they have put in. 
They range from 2 O]  3 years to 20 years. 

SHRI VENKAT RAO: Have any scheduled 
castes been promoted or directly  recruited     
for  any  of    these 
posts? 

SRHI RAJ BAHADUR: I am not quite 
sure. I have not got the breakup  
eommunitywise  with  me. 

SHRI T. V. KAMALASWAMY: Is the 
Postmaster-Genera! usually consulted before 
having Departmental Promotion Committees? 

SHRI RAJ BAHADUR: Departmental 
Promotion Committees are composed 
of one of the members of the Public 
Service Commission and one or two 
Departmental   Head. The  Postmas- 
ter-General      is   hot   a     Departmental 
head. 

SHRI RAJAGOPAL NAIDU: In this 
particular case, has the Government of India 
selected only those persons who were 
recommended by the P.M.G., Madras, or did 
they select persons other than those 
recommended by him? 

SHRI RAJ BAHADUR: Essentially, the 
rule is that those recommended and 
nominated by the P.M.G. are considered but 
in order to ensure that there is no favouritism 
on the lower rung of the ladder. Departmental 
Promotion Committees have been authorised 
to examine cases of deserving persons not 
nominated or recommended by the P.M.G. 
but whose records have been quite brilliant. 

SHRI RAJAGOPAL NAIDU: Is there even 
one single name out of the 8 which have been 
recommended by the P.M.G.. and which has 
been approved by the Governmenf 0+ India* 
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