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t [THEFT OF ELECTRIC BULBS AND 
MIRRORS FROM TRAINS 

318. SHRI JAGANNATH PRASAD: Will 
the Minister of RAILWAYS be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the attention of Government 
has been drawn to the fact that electric bulbs 
and mirrors are stolen from the trains running 
from Delhi to Madras; and 

(b) if so, whether any stolen property was 
recovered and from where 
it was recovered?] 

|[THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF RAILWAYS (DR. RAM 
SUBHAG SINGH): (a) and (b). There has 
been no report about theft of mirrors during 
the current year from the trains running from 
Delhi to Madras. 11 bulbs were, however, 
reported missing in Delhi-Madras Janata 
Express at Vijayawada on Southern Railway, 
which could not be recovered.] 

TRAIN COLLISIONS 

319. SHRI JAGANNATH PRASAD: Will 
the Minister of RAILWAYS be pleased to 
state: 

(a) how many train collisions oc-cured 
during the period March, 1965 to October, 
1965; and 

(b) whether all such cases have been 
enquired into and action taken against persons 
responsible? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF RAILWAYS (SHRI SHAM 
NATH):  (a) Fifty-nine. 

 


