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SHRI ASHWANI KUMAR: Sir, it is nobody's case that all is well with the
electoral system. [ start it by saying that we need to purify the electoral processes
and rid the system of the influence of unaccounted wealth which is a reality. But it
is equally true that having been seized of this matter for a while the Election
Commission, in exercise of its disciplinary power, under Article 324 has taken
initiatives. These initiatives may not be fully adequate or may not be fully
sufficient. But the fear in the mind of the candidate that Hlection observers chasing
them in the Lok Sabha elections is certainly there. To that extent, the brazen use or
the open use of the excessive wealth has certainly come down to an extent. It is
not my case, however, that we can rest with our laurels. We need to move ahead.
We need to find the law that would be credible and effective and would certainly

ensure, over a period of time, the elimination of black money.
*284. The questioner (Shri N.K. Singh) was absent.
Financial assistance to Bihar for dams

*#284. SHRI N.K. SINGH: Will the Minister of WATER RESOURCES be pleased

to state:

(a) whether Government proposes to extend financial assistance to Bihar for

the construction of dams’ inundation canals on flood prone rivers;
(b) if so, the details thereof;

{c) whether Government proposes to undertake negotiations with Nepal for

arriving at an effective solution for the problem of flooding in the State; and
(d)y if so, the details thereof?

THE MINISTER OF WATER RESOURCES (SHRI HARISH RAWAT): {a) to {d)
A Statement is laid on the Table of the House.

Statement

(a) and (b) No such proposal for construction of dams’ inundation canals in

the State of Bihar has been received by the Government.

(c) and d) Yes, Sir. The Government of India has been having continuous
dialogue and negotiations with the Govemment of Nepal through various bilateral
mechanisms on matters related to flooding in the State of Bihar. An Indo-Nepal
Joint Ministerial Commission on Water Resources JMCWR) has been set up by

both the countries which is headed by Ministers of Water Resources. The first
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meeting of IMCWR was held on 15th February, 2012 wherein various issues related
to water resources Sector including construction of large storage reservoirs, like
Sapta Kosi and Pancheshwar Multi Purpose Project efc and flood management
issues of Bihar were discussed. Besides, flood related issues of Bihar are also
discussed in the meetings of Indo-Nepal Joint committee on Water Resources
(JCWR) which has so far met 7 times and is last meeting was held 24-25 January,
2013 at Kahthmandu.

In addition to above, there are 8 other Task specific Indo-Nepal Joint
Committees which also meet regularly and discuss various issues related to flood

management in the States bordering Nepal including the State of Bihar

Both the countries have already agreed for strengthening of the embankments
of Bagmati, Kamla, Lalbakeya and Khando rivers and to extend the embankments
along these rivers to higher ground in Nepal in order to control spilling of flood
water of these rivers. Besides, the flood protection works on Gandak and Kosi
projects in Nepal are already being maintained by Indian side. The bilateral
Committees also meet regularly to address the issues about implementation of these

works.
MR. CHAIRMAN: Questioner is not present. Let the answer be given.

sff IohT T Wl R, $H US @ 99 9F ¥ ugl 9wl fER & ged #
Sl IR U g 2 9 SR b deged v Afedl wwowi ey 9 & s
R B T 61 A VA B | =TT O N 1 < M T | IR | C [T )
T oo fem & fop 8w % Foivr % aw ¥ fErN wweN ¥ @Y uwe mw
TET gam &1 3=/ @& ¥ 'No such proposal for construction of dams' inunda-
tion canals in the State of Bihar has been received by the Government.! WY, I8
wad € P ST ¥ U I8 @l 98 ww o & f few ¥ 98t wae der
21 oMU e SUY o sifw Gvmmw @ ug, fe amm we WU @ g wEr ®
T 'Both the countries have already agreed for strengthening of the embankments
of Bagmati, Kamla, Lalbakeya and Khando rivers and to extend the embankments
along these rivers to higher ground in Nepal in order to control spilling of flood
water of these rivers." ®¥, &l Hdeld @ g3? Yg YRd 3R Aud & g 4
Uh ISy guslar & O W URg @l §YeR &b g URd @) Al B
ded I fou oM & @ U @ WEHR F GRT A @ Ao Foded 0F e
S8 v sHd WeR WRaR @ e w2 A8 o oui b A b wHsi
g o 99 Whsid ¥ d8d WER WeN UM ) 9 g8 i 1w o o
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HYPR Bl dF el & fb 3y q qul b dlg A d-bH § owHsid @vd & 99
HAsid & diq [y qw @l fba UWT od & Sk 9Wd de FHU g 21 ER
SUOUE B ST B ff R 8 s WReR J T aR ¥ e @ [RTs
fpar &, 4w @l PHRE fear & SR Had @l [HE fedr &1 dudAl sHGI
Wy & b 99 o S¥ b 9 by wHslar @Al & dl @ I WRaN 9y
TEE @ I PR Fe WPR Bl odl & S P WER I U@l B WG
4R Gl oul b g d gEslid Bl A PRl @?

MR. CHAIRMAN: Please, put your question.

sft Yofle uamr vt 99, U9 W uvd Y @ & Yodl 21 I8 SR
foepd Tad 81 BN TR @ e Sl S s WEN B A8 dd BT
2 fo g9 @om & fg o Qe & dw § dwr Rwr gl Ag dd SR @@l
fear & SR g9 wb d wed Bl 3R WER @l PHRIE el bl @ A
fpar WM SR s wWEl SR @ g, § A= 6 St § 9Fe awa @2

sft g v ey, § A wew ¥ UEH 4 aF AEar g 6 a8
UTlehdl b HE W U - a 3R U - b Al oy [ogd SEn " (e e “(a)
whether Government proposes to extend financial assistance to Bihar for the con-
struction of dams' inundation canals on flood prone rivers;". ¥, = 50 e @
e A8 e 8 SR &dl A1, 98l SR od &l difdre @ o8 @@ile qud
Hard gel M & fF dams' inundation canals M @ UEIE 82 A9 §HG I
4 98 wel € fb Twr i3 wdidd WeR edic § eqel wiwd T8l g3 o

2t wofig wawr Wt 9w, wEl d w21 . (SERE)...

MR. CHAIRMAN: Please, let him finish. Everybody listened to you in rapt

silence. Please, listen to him. ...(Interrupfions)...
oft rohlg yaT WSk R, . (CUaHT)...

st wler v W, § AT wew W ¥® oTRM awar g P SR TH %
Uid-a 3R Uiéb Bl 4 SR R F ve o 99 wWw dik 8 ysd ywl w2 fe
dams' inundation canals S @& Uwg g1 #9 Iw wsr & fo v4r www =4
feR wafic ¥ oW TE gsT B Wi WU WeRT ¥ S TaE oW 8§
(). Wl Uied, Al gy A8 gsl W e b MR § s wiedwd &
FH F AU FLET wEE W gU €, dF # SIUel Sud sgwd SWR Sarl A
3T U@ AET & A [W EE| ().
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MR. CHAIRMAN: Will you please stop arguing?

sft &fter wAE: [EY YW W . (QTAUH)..

MR. CHAIRMAN: Lock, if you are not satisfied with the answer, please, give
in writing that you have got a misleading answer. ...(Inferruptions)... We can go on

with the next question.
sit gfler waw wEiqw, § snudn diedwd digdr g1 (EEw)...

MR. CHAIRMAN: Please, just one minute Mr. Rudy, vou are taking up

precious time. ...(Inferruptions)...

SHRI RAITV PRATAF RUDY: But, he has not read his own question. His

answer is ...(Interruptions)...

MR. CHAIRMAN: If you are not satisfied with the answer, please give a

written representation.

ot wohla ya wSt ag 9a Nepa wWlerl a9dl 21 . (smaum)..

MR. CHAIRMAN: Please, don't take up precious time. There are other

questions to be taken up.

oft vl A v o e @ B @ WerR | (oa)..

MR. CHAIRMAN: Please, ...(Interruptions)... Look, you have taken five

minutes. [ am afraid, I cannot allow this.
oft wofla yao wst -

MR. CHAIRMAN: [ will go straight to the next question if you don't sit

down.
sft weflg Ao wst -
MR. CHAIRMAN: Mr. Rudy, please.

=t wollg wa wst ¢

MR. CHAIRMAN: If you wish to hear your own voice, you are welcome to
it.

sft wofta wao wt -

MR. CHAIRMAN: 3nq 3pR dfewpgs & & @ faRed § saw AR

*Not recorded.
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=t vl wa wst ¢

MR. CHAIRMAN: This is very ...(Inferruptions)...
ot <elT yao @t
MR. CHAIRMAN: None of this is going on record. Shri Shivanand Tiwari.

sit Rrme fart gieor, sAE| o = St 34 s SEe W wee TR
g b . (auE)..

sft UE= @ gHel A A S

it wumfa: s T 1 can take only one question at a time. Why are we

displaying this amazing impatience?

ot R foerd: waofa w@ie, o 930 St 9 @9a T 8 f6 Mm@
dl¢ U HHE 21 94 §HEl b guEE b fdy ey dsde evl &b fdu 9
afifrn fegwe &R Jua & i@ N T W 1 e A3 wfifa erft ma W &
2, BrEal 15 wradl, 2012 @l dob gs | wHula HElGw, gulw @) 99 @ (6
TS % 66 a8 O dg ff AT 9% WRT W AT Jug F fF ¥ 5 e
@ Bis wwsiar T8 gen, ed Ner @ siv 9w wew @ 9w ¥ qfad fad
S B 1 R O S =G5 O 2 | o 0 oz B |
T 10 @il & ovwE WeR d Sl wedl @ JEEF g 8 BN hHdl bl b
g & T SRgFER B Sl IbUM BT g, a8 AW U BMT 8 SR 99
JBEF Bl URUIS SY TheRl Rd &2 A H MUY Al Aredl gl

it gfer vaw wr, A el St @ oo 387 wEaEyt § s w® R
) Wt o <@ g sHifay wad sw oS @ @ife el @d ) ® osiv oaw
U & e gy WERY 6 g Awd W 9 FEEv %o fay 98w Ak
WS SR dgde fBU WM, wWEedcd Y oF b Hald W diddld @R IR 8
ST We A wew e fear 8 Sue fay Abrad wiila et @t
wff & el te dod @ gal &1 Wr, I9b widku 7 Akedl dad @) dod
9 g8 offl SUF S AN SIASIen cRe-wfgihe HCS @ W Yo g ®
Seife 9@ ge @l € fd 9 U dob & gal €1 Wy, 9 ad) afew W v
oF g8 § oY o Wb ft oW o @ 8 Yo g ¥l WY, Ahw 9om
& AlG AL Al s SN wWig Ray b e N UWelicd & b uwdd
U 3 AW wo ¥ wa S ww e @ € a@ife 98 ¥ 9@ @ ot
gt Mem § e o B 99dl 98 did fBRm o 4, 9l 98l Niudll ddisd
fopar <1 Wh| SUh SfdEn, Tew i ot Uhlde W SioREl WRd INGN WSy

*Not recorded.
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F oA d A U9 ud @laT 8 SUe ded Wdded &M @l B @Y Y@l gl
SEY AU TEE Bml PR 8 SR I Aud 6 drer RARw e 9 9g
gradia @t oftl a8 W asd € 5 39 oUW @ Wg yadsise fear @l

3@ S S ael fh fha JeEE g w5 ot 9% WER We b wu o #
& HId B4 24271 RIS Bl JBEE ISl @ &1 H e dd [HAlPR [dER
T 13655 RIS VYUY b ARl UM JORT £ WY, g oW bl U dghed HHal
g aiv figm % ufd @ W @ 5w TP @ JEum B 8 sufay sl
el A9 T AN 68993 @I WU UGUMHT AT Uws TSRl Umm % sfddd
fqu &1 sud SRy 78l 40 wodew ¢ A E S 12dff dgadl A @
WerR 9 ol uwiE YW g & WRd HRPR I UR JaRdyde [dar el

st U T @E 4%, U 9 smarell qledi gv oW WeR b Fudl e
§ ol qardl deedt € uRT Sw 3w 9 @ SFd 21 I §drn e s wid 242
RIS H THAH 92 U [M8R P BT & IS 200250 RIS PO A8l 8 A,
AN B T IHAE BT & @l Baedw we 9dtg & St 2

it wumEls U e B WHY W g W@l §, denl ¥ O gs il

ot o7 == T Arar, G Sl T s o d wel fb @il b9 |
I AT Wb W @ @ Py d0ed WER WReR & % AE mr 2
F A S & 99 9Ed g fF SR U B Wi ST § a1 @1 s AR
U sy dfl? gy, TR feEW WeR 39 o3 @ sifave 98 e=dt
d ® IR ANS W OU B gwm e

st gl WEE W, q@ TH P U v T CF B OUBA Gkl iR AR
W od qul ofl gR1 Tdd WHsn R B (cHeTE)...

st UW S @ MY ysd B

s gfter WA § 9w W A em wE g1 osOfay aw wE fF ER wer
T o T8 4 €, Ted 8l H OSW OSHEE %l §¥ el d9edl § SR @
oEd g fF WER WeR wEY nusen 49 W@ 8 SR ARG W Wl SRE
S Uoled Ui 8 W E 9 W fJgR ow W@ &1 39 9Hy guoll uuieid
UX EH SlfeE] urd HXBR b "R A[Eld by @ @ 3 gEe M Sl dre
geaee & gdeed E 99 u¥ W Aud WeN ¥ qadid @9 38 £ UG ST
govwe fafen & dodcy w A fER Wwer ik ' d9 # swdli ga |
2|

MR. CHAIRMAN: The Question Hour is over.



