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MR. CHAIRMAN: Now, Question Hour. Shri Bhaskar Rao Nekkanti.
...(Interruptions)...

DR. SANTANU SEN: Sir, ...(Interruptions)...

MR. CHAIRMAN: Please. ...(Interruptions)... ... (Interruptions)... No, no.
...(Interruptions)... 1 have not allowed you. ...(Interruptions)... 1 have not allowed
you. ...(Interruptions)... |1 have not allowed you. ...(Interruptions)... Nothing shall
go on record. ...(Interruptions)... Nothing should be recorded. ...(Interruptions)...
Nothing should be shown. ...(Interruptions)... You can't talk about Governor.
...(Interruptions)... You can't make slogans. ...(Interruptions)... This is not the way.
...(Interruptions)... | caution you ...(Interruptions)... Go back. ...(Interruptions)...
Nothing on Governor will go on record. ...(Interruptions)... Nothing will go on record.
...(Interruptions)... Nothing will be shown. ...(Interruptions)... It is unbecoming of
Members of Parliament. ...(Interruptions)... Governor's post is a constitutional post.
...(Interruptions)... You can't make slogans. ...(Interruptions)... Please go back to your
seats. ...(Interruptions)... Please go back to your seats. ...(Interruptions)... You are
saying 'down, down' to Parliament by doing this. ...(Interruptions)... No, no.
...(Interruptions)... Please go back to your seats. ...(Interruptions)... This is not the
way. ...(Interruptions)... You are denigrating the Parliament. ...(Interruptions)... Please
don't do it. ...(Interruptions)... You are denigrating the Parliament. ...(Interruptions)...
Nothing shall be reported. ...(Interruptions)... Nothing shall be shown, except what
the Chair is saying. ...(Interruptions)... Q.No.226. Shri Bhaskar Rao Nekkanti.
...(Interruptions)...

SHRI DEREK O'BRIEN: *

ORAL ANSWERS TO QUESTIONS
New medical colleges in Odisha

*226. SHRI BHASKAR RAO NEKKANTI: Will the Minister of HEALTH AND
FAMILY WELFARE be pleased to state:

(@ whether Government has set up new medical colleges specially in Odisha,
if so, the details thereof;

*Not recorded
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(b) whether Government has plan to set up medical colleges in aspirational

districts, in particular, Rayagada in Odisha, if so, the details thereof; and
(c) if not, the reasons therefor?

THE MINISTER OF HEALTH AND FAMILY WELFARE (DR. HARSH
VARDHAN): (a) to (c) A Statement is laid on the Table of the House.

Statement

(a) to (c) The Ministry of Health and Family Welfare administers a Centrally
Sponsored Scheme for "Establishment of new medical colleges attached with existing
district/referral hospitals”. Under Phase-1 of the Scheme, 58 districts in 20 States/
UT have been identified and approved. Total cost of establishment of one Medical
College is ¥189 crore to be shared by Central and States in the ratio of 60:40 (90:10
for NE/Special category States) including 5 new medical colleges in Odisha. Funds
to the tune of ¥7507.70 crore have been released to the State/UT Governments for
the approved medical colleges under the Scheme. As on date, 42 medical colleges

have become functional. Details are at Annexure-1 (See below).

Under Phase-Il of the Scheme, 24 new medical colleges in 8 States have been
identified. The total cost of establishment of one Medical College under this Phase
is Y250 crore to be shared by Central and States in the ratio of 60:40 (90:10 for NE/
Special category States). The State Governments have identified the locations on
Challenge mode. Out of 24 medical colleges, 22 have been approved till date
including one medical college in Odisha and funds to the tune of ¥2254.59 crore

have been released to the State Governments. Details are at Annexure-Il (See below).

The Phase-Ill of the Scheme has been approved by the Cabinet on 28.8.2019
to establish 75 more new medical colleges. The State/UT Governments have been
requested to send their proposals under this Scheme along with Detailed Project
Report as per Scheme guidelines for consideration by the Ministry. As on date, 59
medical colleges have been approved. No proposal has been received from

Government of Odisha. Details are at Annexure-111.
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Annexure-I
List of functional/Non-functional Medical Colleges

SI. No.  State/UT Districts Status

1 2 3 4

1 Andaman and 1  Port Blair Functional

Nicobar Islands

2 Arunachal Pradesh 2 Naharlagun Functional

3 Assam 3 Dhubri Not functional
4 Nagaon Not functional
5  North Lakhimpur Not functional
6 Diphu Not functional

4 Bihar 7  Purnia Not functional
8  Saran (Chhapara) Not functional
9  Samastipur Not functional

5 Chhattisgarh 10  Rajnandgaon Functional
1 Sarguja Functional

6 Himachal Pradesh 12 Chamba Functional
13 Hamirpur Functional
14 Nahan (Sirmour) Functional

7 Haryana 15 Bhiwani Not functional

8 Jharkhand 16 Dumka Functional
17 Hazaribagh Functional
18  Palamu (Daltonganj) Functional

9 Jammu and Kashmir 19  Anantnag Functional
20 Baramulla Functional
21 Rajouri Functional
2 Doda Not functional
23 Kathua Functional
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1 2 3 4
10 Madhya Pradesh 24 Datia Functional
2 Khandwa Functional
26  Ratlam Functional
27 Shahdol Functional
28  Vidisha Functional
29  Chindwara Functional
30  Shivpuri Functional
n Maharashtra 3l  Gondia Functional
12 Meghalaya 32 West Garo Hills (Tura) Not functional
13 Mizoram 3B Falkawn Functional
14 Nagaland 34 Naga Hospital Not functional
15 Odisha 35  Balasore Functional
36 Baripada Functional
(Mayurbhanj)
37 Bolangir Functional
38 Koraput Functional
39 Puri Not functional
16 Punjab 40  SAS Nagar Not functional
17 Rajasthan 41 Barmer Functional
42 Bharatpur Functional
43 Bhilwara Functional
44 Churu Functional
45  Dungarpur Functional
46  Pali Functional
47 Sikar Not functional
18 Uttar Pradesh 48  Basti Functional
49  Faizabad Functional
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1 2 3 4
50  Firozabad Functional
51  Shahjahanpur Functional
52 Babhraich Functional
19 Uttarakhand 53  Almora Not functional
20 West Bengal 54 Birbhum (Rampur Hat) Functional
5%  Cooch Behar Functional
5  Diamond Harbour Functional
57 Purulia Not functional
58  Raiganj, North Dinajpur Functional
Annexure-11
List of New Medical Colleges identified under Phase-1l for establishment
SI. No.  State Location Selected by State Government
1 2 3
1 Bihar 1 Sitamarhi
2 Jhanjharpur
3 Siwan
4 Buxar
5 Jamui
2 Jharkhand 6 Koderma
7 Chaibasa (Singhbhum)
3 Madhya Pradesh 8 Satna
4 Odisha 9 Jajpur
5 Rajasthan 10 Dholpur
6 Uttar Pradesh n Etah
12 Hardoi
13 Pratapgarh
14 Fatehpur
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1 2 3

15 Siddharthnagar (Domariyaganj)
16 Deoria
17 Ghazipur
Mirzapur
7 West Bengal Barasat

18
19
20 Uluberia
21
2
23

Arambagh
Jhargram
Tamluk
8 Sikkim 24 Gangtok
Annexure-111

List of medical colleges approved under Phase-1ll of the Centrally Sponsored
Scheme for 'Establishment of new Medical Colleges attached
with existing district/referral hospitals'

SI. No. State/UT Name of the Districts
1 2 3
1 Jammu and Kashmir (2) 1 Udhampur
2. Handwara (Distt. Kupwara)
2. Ladakh (1) 3 Leh
3. Rajasthan (15) 4. Alwar
5 Baran
6 Bansawara

7. Chittorgarh

8. Jaisalmer
9. Karauli
10. Nagaur

11. Shri Ganganagar
12. Sirohi




66 Oral Answers [RAJYA SABHA] to Questions
1 2 3
13. Bundi
14. Sawai Madhopur
15. Tonk
16. Hanumangarh
17. Jhunjhunu
18. Dausa
4, Uttar Pradesh (13) 19. Bijnaur
20. Kushinagar
21. Sultanpur
22, Gonda
23. Lalitpur
24, Lakhimpur Kheri
25. Chandauli
26. Bulandshahar
21. Sonbhadra
28. Pilibhit
29. Auraiya
30. Kanpur Dehat
3L Kaushambi
5. Tamil Nadu (9) 32. Tiruppur
33. Nilgiris
3. Ramanathpuram
35. Namakkal
36. Dindigul
37. Virudhunagar
38. Krishnagiri
39. Tiruvallur
40. Nagapattinam
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12.00 Noon

1 2 3

6. Karnataka (3) 41, Chikkamagaluru
42. Haveri
43. Yadgiri

7. Madhya Pradesh (5) 44, Rajgarh
45. Mandla

46. Neemuch
47. Mandsaur
48. Sheopur

8. Punjab (1) 40. Kapurthala

SHRI BHASKAR RAO NEKKANTI: Sir, I want to know from the hon. Minister
whether the Government has set up new medical colleges, especially in Odisha; if
so the details thereof. ...(Interruptions)...

MR. CHAIRMAN: Please go to your seats. ...(Interruptions)... This is not the

way. ...(Interruptions)... This is not the way. ...(Interruptions)...

DR. HARSH VARDHAN: Sir, in the Scheme for the upgradation of medical
colleges ...(Interruptions)... upgradation of District Hospitals to the Medical Colleges,
there have been three phases.

MR. CHAIRMAN: Nothing is going on record. ...(Interruptions)... Nothing is
being shown. ...(Interruptions)... Why are you wasting your energy and bringing
down the prestige of the House? ...(Interruptions)... Please go to your seats.
...(Interruptions)... Respect the House ...(Interruptions)... Maintain decency and
decorum. ...(Interruptions)...

DR. HARSH VARDHAN: Four are already..(Interruptions)... In the second
phase, one college has been approved for Odisha. .(Interruptions). We have no
request...(Interruptions)... Any proposal about new...(Interruptions)...

SHRI BHASKAR RAO NEKKANTI: Sir, the Government of Odisha has already
given proposal for two more colleges dated 07/11 ...(Interruptions)... &I & gam
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21 ...(Interruptions)... Tlex TR 28427 H [ ARG Bl &A1 TN 7T ...(IEM)...
IHF FW $& garsyl ...(Interruptions)...

DR. HARSH VARDHAN: As on today, we haven't received any request.
...(Interruptions)... But if you are saying that you have sent it ...(Interruptions)...
As on today, we haven't received any request from Odisha for this final.
...(Interruptions)... If they have sent it, it will be received by us and it will be
considered by the related Committee. ...(Interruptions)...

MR. CHAIRMAN: Shri Ram Chandra Prasad Singh. ...(Interruptions)... Please
don't obstruct other Members. ...(Interruptions)... Please go back to your seats.
...(Interruptions)...

St YW T ywe R A8iG, # oud Aieww [ WAl SN W (@), ST
aredl g & ..(@auH)... @8R d S 8 medical colleges €, I @d complete 8RI?

DR. HARSH VARDHAN: Sir, | have the full list of medical colleges.
...(Interruptions)... In the first phase in Bihar, colleges were sanctioned in Purnia,
Saran and Samastipur. ...(Interruptions)... As on today, none of them is functional.
...(Interruptions)... In the second phase, again, we have sanctioned medical colleges
in Bihar at Sitamarhi, Jhanjharpur, Siwan, Buxar and Jamui. ...(Interruptions)... These
are the five medical colleges which have been sanctioned in the second phase.
...(Interruptions)... As on today, there, we have no medical college for the final
phase. ...(Interruptions)... This is a 71-college phase. ...(Interruptions)...

SHRI DEREK O'BRIEN: Sir, one minute please. ...(Interruptions)...

MR. CHAIRMAN: No. ...(Interruptions)... I will not give even a second. Let
all these Members go to their seats first. ...(Interruptions)... What is this happening?
...(Interruptions)... You are misusing the forum. | have given you the liberty.
...(Interruptions)... Now, Shri Ghulam Nabi Azad. ...(Interruptions).. No conditions will
apply. ...(Interruptions)...

2 [ Tt IATAIS: HElG, YUY 2 H Usell qWI Sfacd Bl BHI DBl qwd
8U 3R BRUCH & $Hl &I S@d gY 894 < ¥ 58 medical colleges & oy
I W HEha Plerd B 198 TRl IUY 2 ARG @ % 9 fag 1w o #
AT @Ry HAT Sl Bl qG1S oA @edl g b S S Uiferll @l dAbs 3MR
qS Wl H Al o Il W, TAR WHI H I 58 Colleges sanction gV 9,
STH W 42 colleges 9 T B ...(QE)...
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Ug Bl H S Bl 9, .. (AGEM)... STHI 189 RIS BT A S I |...(ae)...
TAY B & Pietol H..(@UM)... 250 PRI$ IW A I I | . (@EEH)...

tTransliteration in Urdu script.
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it i emT AN Ao WY (@I9E)...

ST 89 qu: ofl Y Wol & Sl Blcloldl 8, S 325 RIS vud A S
g .(mau)... S 6 (e, [ Sk $ Blaoisl Bl 90:10 & ratio H
fear Smar 1 ..(@EYM)... 9 & 3fe} did! Bl 60:40 & ratio H fIIm Srm g
(FAIM)... R AFMCE &R e, . (FaUH).. 9 § ITPI @RT T Fhdl g
g ..(FFEM).. el 899 Annexure & 1T 1 attach fmam €1 (@ )...

MR. CHAIRMAN: Now, Shri Prasanna Acharya. ...(Interruptions)...

SHRI PRASANNA ACHARYA: Sir, as the question relates to establishment of
medical colleges, and medical colleges produce doctors, | would like to know this
from the hon. Minister. ...(Interruptions)...

SHRI DEREK O'BRIEN: *
MR. CHAIRMAN: No.

SHRI PRASANNA ACHARYA: What is the ratio of doctors in regard to
population of this country? ...(Interruptions)...

SHRI DEREK O'BRIEN: *

SHRI PRASANNA ACHARYA: Is it in conformity with the guideline formulated
by the World Health Organisation? ...(Interruptions)...

SHRI DEREK O'BRIEN: *

MR. CHAIRMAN: Except what the Chair permits, nothing else will go on
record. ...(Interruptions)...

SHRI DEREK O'BRIEN: *

SHRI PRASANNA ACHARYA: How many new medical colleges are required
to be set up in the country to improve the doctor-population ratio in a prescribed
time-frame? What is the initiative of the Government in this regard?

...(Interruptions)...

MR. CHAIRMAN: Mantriji, you please reply. ...(Interruptions)...

*Not recorded.
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31 'Y e W), WRd IR medical colleges # M.B.B.S. seats @I dgM &
Y, post graduation seats 1 FeM & Y 3R Slaed B HH I YRT HIA H
fae _.(amaum)... 39 ¥9d! W.H.O. standards & o oM & T M WX WX
TN &R I8l g .(IFEF)...

SHRI DEREK O'BRIEN: Sir, we are walking out in protest.

(At this stage some hon. Members left the Chamber)

ST 89 g SN fUsel Ui Wl H @ 28,000 MBBS @l Hied 3R @R
17,000 post graduation & ¥ed derlt T €1 . (@au™)... fUsd g | d 2,
S el W91, o2 SR a3 @l g9l gs, $9d d8d cled 157 medical
colleges faf%=1 phases # & fo99 & 58, SAd d1@ 4 AR 3¢t 75 colleges
Aspirational Districts & 3fG¥ €| SH® -1 BXd I existing medical college
g, 98 3R Ul MBBS seats 3fR post graduation seats @I d@M & foIg, as
per the norms of Medical Council of India, WRd WX&R &I proposal <ar &,
WH e B 9gM & oy R 120 FRIe TUY per seat 39 medical college
Pl support IRG <l Bl SHS K- < H 3A WHI 21 AIIMS different
phases of development & 3iex &, fo7 A & & 6 AIIMS already & &R 2
& 3R 9rdl |9 I7elI-3TaT phases of development H &1 1 WR&R @ S IISHT
g, S9&% d8d 9 UMM WX MBBS seats, post graduation seats, 7T medical colleges
3R existing district hospitals @I medical colleges # uRafid &= &1 & ¥

MR. CHAIRMAN: Now, Q.No. 227. Mantriji, you have to be brief and crisp.
Beneficiaries under Ayushman Bharat Scheme

*227. SHRI DIGVIJAYA SINGH: Will the Minister of HEALTH AND FAMILY
WELFARE be pleased to state:

(@ the number of people who have been benefited under Ayushman
Bharat Scheme in each of the States of the country since inception of the scheme;
and

(b) how much per capita relief has been given?

THE MINISTER OF HEALTH AND FAMILY WELFARE (DR. HARSH
VARDHAN): (a) and (b) A Statement is laid on the Table of the House.



